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1. INTRODUCTION 
This book provides an overview of the ways in which 
Europe offers support to tropical forests through aid 
and research. Each of the Member States' current 
programmes is examined, along with those of the 
various Directorates-General (DGs) in the European 
Commission which support tropical forestry. It is called 
a Sourcebook because it will probably be used more as a 
work of reference than as a book to read from start to 
finish. 

Its intended audience is threefold. Above all, its 
authors hope that it will be of value to the developing 
countries with which the European Union (EU) works. 
The book should make it simpler to understand the way 
in which aid to forestry is organised from country to 
country and within the Commission; it will indicate 
each donor's target countries for the funding of tropical 
forestry, and will suggest the particular interests of 
each. Contact points have been listed at the end of all 
chapters. 

The second potential audience for the Sourcebook is 
the body of donors outside Europe. Hopefully it will 
offer more familiarity with, and a better understanding 
of, European tropical forestry experience in an easily 
accessible form. 

Finally, donors within Europe are working interac­
tively with one another to an ever increasing extent, and 
are more often co-funders of the same projects and 
programmes than in the past. At the same time, the 
importance of forestry in the portfolio, aid delivery 
mechanisms, implementation strategies, and vision for 
the future may all vary greatly from donor to donor. 
The authors hope that European donors will find it 
useful, therefore, to read about one another's structures 
and programmes. Their combined financial strength in 
the tropical forestry sector represents the largest single 
block of aid for forestry available in the world: the 
European Community and Member States funded 
66.5% of all bilateral aid to forestry in 1993, and just 
under 40% of all aid in the sector (United Nations [UN] 
Economic and Social Council, 1996). This book should 
go some way to assessing the combined comparative 
experience of Europe as well. 

The Sourcebook has been prepared in close colla­
boration with the donors concerned, and each chapter 
represents the combined efforts of at least one in­
country Research Associate, and an ODI Research 
Fellow. The latter has in each case taken particular 
responsibility for the consistency and the comparability 
of each chapter with the others. After a brief review of 
the country's own forest history, and the history of its 
involvement in tropical forestry, each chapter analyses 
the structure of aid delivery, policy, the thematic and 
regional distribution of forestry projects, research and 
training, and project cycle management. Each chapter 
concludes with an examination of one or two key 
projects, or summarises project reviews conducted in­
country, and looks at future trends, 

This first chapter draws out some of the interesting 
comparative findings from the study, attempts an 
assessment of the totality of Europe's comparative 
advantage in tropical forestry, and identifies issues for 
the future. 
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2. SETTING THE SCENE: EUROPE'S 
OWN FOREST HISTORY 

Despite the enormous differences between temperate 
and tropical forests, Europe's own forest history 
encapsulates many of the issues which it has subse­
quently encountered in the tropics. At the same time, 
Europe took to the tropics not only its own experience 
in forest management, but also, hardly surprisingly, the 
political and institutional assumptions of the time. 

Most countries in Europe have an early history of 
slow domestic deforestation associated with agricultur­
al expansion, charcoal-based industries, and the in­
creasingly commercial use of timber. In some places, 
such as France, Germany, Belgium and the uit, demand 
on the forest from different groups led, five or six 
hundred years ago, to the development of rules which 
gave use-rights of varied kinds to different categories of 
people, and which managed forest to meet these uses 
through a variety of systems. Such systems often 
evolved where nobility and peasantry both needed 
access to the same resource. In other areas, such as in 
the Netherlands and in parts of northern Italy, local 
communities demarcated their own forests and evolved 
local associations to manage them. In Sweden and 
Finland individually-owned portions of forest were 
common. 

All over Europe, too, the opportunity to begin to 
restore forest cover through reforestation programmes 
and through natural regeneration arose only when 
pressure could be relieved through a switch to coal from 
fuelwood and charcoal, and through increasing urbani­
sation and agricultural intensification. 

Forestry practice and forestry education, particularly 
in Northern European countries, have been heavily 
influenced from the eighteenth century onwards by the 
experience of German foresters, who first developed 
inventory methods and silvicultural techniques for 
sustainable-yield forestry. The Danish/Norwegian king 
invited German assistance with Danish forests during 
the eighteenth century and France drew on German 
methods in part when establishing forestry training at 
the Ecole de Nancy in the 1820s. 

During the nineteenth and twentieth centuries these 
skills were put to intensive use in the tropics by those 
European countries which acquired colonies. One 
unplanned outcome of the colonial period in these 
countries was that a cadre of foresters grew up who 
specialised only in tropical forestry. The tradition 
continued over into the post-colonial period, and it 
has often been the case that those who opted for a 
career in tropical forestry and those who worked in 
forestry at home have had only limited contacts with 
one another. As a result, there have been periods when 
there have been very different sets of preoccupations in 
the two areas. In the tropics, key debates of the last 
fifteen years have centred on the conflicting needs of 
local communities and the State for forest products, and 
the management compromises needed to accommodate 
these. In Europe, with a far higher proportion of its 
inhabitants living in cities, debate and - at times -
tensions between forestry professionals and the general 
public have centred rather on the potential conflict 
between forests for production and forests for 
recreation. 
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It has been interesting to see these two stral)ds 
coming together, as debate since the Rio Conference in 
1992 has centred on broader definitions of sustain­
ability, and as environmental concerns have been 
increasingly raised simultaneously, both for forests at 
home and for forests in the tropics. 

The European Member States currently have widely 
varying proportions of forest cover, from those with 
relatively little, such as Ireland (8%), the Netherlands 
(9%) and the UK (11 %) through to Sweden with 55% 
and Finland with 75%. In all cases, in sharp contrast to 
the situation in developing countries, the proportion of 
forest cover is rising (see Table 1). 

3. THE HISTORY OF EUROPEAN 
INVOLVEMENT WITH TROPICAL 
FORESTRY 

Those countries with a colonial history (France, the 
Netherlands and the UK, and to a lesser extent Belgium, 
Germany, Italy, Portugal and Spain) developed an early 
expertise in tropical silviculture. 

Initially, there was considerable reliance on German­
educated foresters, as there had been in Europe itself. 
The Netherlands drew on German expertise in devising 
sustainable yield management systems for teak in Java. 
Britain appointed a German, Dr Dietrich Brandis, as the 
first Inspector-General of Forests in India in 1860. 
France's forestry school at Nancy based its curricula on 
German as well as its own experience. 

The early impetus for Dutch and Spanish interest in 
tropical forests grew originally out of their supremacy 
in seaborne commerce, their large ship-building indus-

Table 1: Forest Cover as a %of national land area in the 
European Member States 

Ireland 

Netherlands 

UK 

Denmark 

Belgium 

France 

Italy 

Germany 

Luxembourg 

Portugal 

Spain 

Austria 

Greece 

Sweden 

Finland 

8% 

9% 

11% 

12% 

22% 

27% 

29% 

29% 

33% 

36% 

45% 

46% 

49% 

55% 

75% 

(Source : Sourcebook chapters. and Eurofor, 1994.) 

tries and the disappearance of suitable timber supplies 
in Europe. The Dutch shipped timbers from Java and 
(later) Dutch Guyana back to the Netherlands. In the 
case of Spain, shipyards were established in colonies 
such as Haiti, the Philippines and Cuba. 

Colonial experience of tropical forest management 
can be said to have begun in South and South-East Asia, 
with Dutch management of teak forests in Java, 
German and British forest management in India and 
Burma, and French forest management in Indo-China. 
Lessons from these experiences were transferred to 
Malaya and East and West Africa during the British 
colonial period, and to Madagascar, West Africa and 
Equatorial Africa by the French. 

After the colonies gained independence, mady of the 
individuals who had been employed by colonial forest 
services transferred to work on newly emerging aid 
programmes. Indeed aid was seen, in the early 
independence years, as a temporary loaning of expertise 
to ex-colonies until they no longer needed it. A priority 
was consequently made of training in tropical silvicul­
ture, in sustained yield forest management, and planta­
tion production. Commercial links were continued, not 
only in areas where the logging of hardwoods was 
important, but also at times where intensive plantations 
could be raised, as in the case of Spanish companies' 
investment in the tropics for pulp and paper to supply 
the home market. 

Countries without previous involvement in tropical 
forests through colonies, developed an interest in 
tropical forestry through other routes. Both Finland 
and Sweden were major manufacturers and operators of 
forest logging and processing equipment for the home 
market, and became interested in the move towards 
industrial forestry in the tropics in the 1950s, 1960s and 
1970s. Out of these commercial links grew other 
interests. In the case of Finland, training became a 
strong area of expertise. In the case of Sweden, possibly 
because of its own strong domestic tradition of farm 
forestry, as well as its traditions of social concern, came 
an interest in 'Social Forestry' and its funding for many 
years of the Food and Agriculture Organization's (FAO) 
'Forests, Trees and People' programme. Denmark's 
experience of its own forest, which dwindled to a cover 
of only 3% at the beginning of the nineteenth century, 
and was then successfully rebuilt, led it to specialise first 
in domestic and then in tropical tree-seed production. 
Only very gradually, in the late 1970s and early 1980s 
did tropical forestry acquire the broader importance it 
has today. 

4 THE STRUCTURE OF AID 
DELIVERY TODAY 

4.1 Departments of development 
assistance 

The majority of countries have a central aid adminis­
tration programme. If there is a 'typical' pattern, it is 
that of an International Development Co-operation 
department located within the Ministry of Foreign 
Affairs. This is the pattern in Austria, Belgium, 
Denmark, Finland, Ireland, Italy, Luxembourg, and 
Sweden. It was the UK pattern until May 1997, and is 



the case with interesting variations in the Netherlands 
(see Table 2a.) 

Sometimes, by contrast, the Ministry of Foreign 
Affairs is given the responsibility of coordinating the 
aid efforts of a wide variety of other bodies as in the 
case of Portugal and - the most extreme example -
Spain, where there are up to 19 bodies which deal with 
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forestry and environment aid. Spain too, is unique in the 
complexity of its decentralised aid. Several regional 
governments run substantial aid programmes of their 
own (especially the Basque country, Andalucia, Navar­
ra and Cataluiia). Even local councils and individual 
parishes run small aid programmes with towns and 
villages in the developing world with whom they have 

Table 2a: Aid Delivery Structures for Forestry in the Member States 

(Source : Sourcebook chapters) 
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developed twinning arrangements. Similar twinni_ng 
arrangements are also encouraged in France. 

France's very large aid programme is still strongly 
influenced by its colonial history, with distinct budgets 
and aid arrangements under a Ministry of Co-operation 
for 'concentration countries' (pays du champs- mainly 
ex-colonies), a special Secretariat for Overseas Depart­
ments and Territories, and Ministry of Foreign Affairs 
management of aid to other countries. 

Only Greece and the UK (since May 1997), direct no 
aid through the Ministry of Foreign Affairs at all. 
Greece devolves management of its budget through the 
Ministry of National Economy to other appropriate 
Ministries (the Ministry of Agriculture in the case of 
forestry). The UK has a separate Ministry for aid, the 
Department for International Development. 

In Germany arrangements are complex, with the 
Ministry for Economic Co-operation and Development 
(BMZ) being the key institution responsible for 
formulating federal development policies, and mana­
ging 70% of the federal aid budget. Financial co­
operation (or capital assistance) and technical co­
operation are administered on behalf of BMZ by the 
German Development Bank (KfW) and the German 
Agency for Technical Co-operation (GTZ) respectively. 

In the case of the Commission, with its Directorates­
General in place of Ministries, aid delivery is structured 
in a way somewhat reminiscent of France. Its arrange­
ments for ACP (African, Caribbean and Pacific) and 
ALA (Asian and Latin-American) countries set the 
Commission apart from most of the Member States. 

The sheer size of the Commission is a second notable 
feature. There are relatively few forestry advisers (for 
the volume of money being spent) and these are 
therefore very over-extended. The work-load, and with 
the fact that the buildings of the different Directorates 

working in forestry are now located inconveniently far 
from one another, have meant that regular informal 
exchanges of ideas about tropical forestry are difficult 
to organise. 

Thirdly, while many Member States are internally 
organised around a pattern of fund-holding geographi­
cal desks with sectoral advisers working laterally with 
them all, it is rare to find structures comparable to the 
Commission's pattern, seen in DGs IB and VIII, of 
vertical and horizontal budget lines, run by desks and 
advisers respectively. That this pattern has caused 
tensions is hardly surprising. It has also had the 
unfortunate effect of weighing down advisers with 
budget-line duties, so that they have little time to offer 
advice to the desks, and may even be \seen as 
competitors rather than facilitators. (See Table 2b). 

4.2 The status of aid within government 
structures 

The status of the Government body responsible for aid 
implementation is important since it may potentially 
affect aid strategies, and, even more importantly, 
funding levels. Where, as in the majority of cases in 
Europe, aid is administered as part of a Ministry of 
Foreign Affairs or a similar body, it may be vulnerable 
to being used to achieve diplomatic goals as well as 
developmental ones. 

Several countries have therefore built in arrangements 
to give aid a stronger 'voice' within such a structure. 
The Netherlands has a special Aid Minister without a 
ministry; Sweden's Division for International Develop­
ment Co-operation has its own Minister even though it 
is located within the Ministry of Foreign Affairs; and 
the same arrangement is found in Denmark. Finland has 
a similar arrangement with a Minister specially 

Table 2b: Aid Delivery Structures for Forestry in the European Commission 

(Source : Sourcebook chapters on the Commission) 



responsible for both Development Co-operation and 
Environment. 

Other countries, such as Italy and Portugal, have 
Interministerial committees which meet regularly to 
plan aid policy. The Commission has likewise estab­
lished an inter-service steering committee, meeting two 
or three times a year both to discuss policy issues and to 
discuss forestry projects proposed for funding. Simi­
larly, several bilateral aid programmes have established 
professional support groups for forestry. DGIS in the 
Netherlands relies on such a group, drawn from tHe 
National Reference Centre for Nature Management 
(IKC) and the International Agricultural Centre (lAC). 
The Department for International Development (DFID) 
in the UK has a Forestry Professional Coordinating 
Group which meets quarterly with professionals from 
OFI, NRI, ODI, liED and WCMC. 

An interesting feature of an increasing number of 
countries is the extent to which the broader public are 
increasingly consulted about aid priorities. This may be 
within the context of all aid, as is the case with Italy's 
Consultative Committee and Denmark's National 
Resource Base links. But also, after Rio, and sometimes 
before, several countries (e.g. Finland and the UK) 
established Consultative Groups for the discussion of 
forestry and environmental priorities between govern­
ment and the general public. 

4.3 The administration of forestry 
assistance 

Most forestry assistance is the responsibility of the 
central aid-giving agencies of donor countries. Ninety­
five per cent of Belgium's sponsored tropical forestry 
activities come under the office of the Secretary of State 
for Development, for instance, and the majority of UK­
funded forestry projects come under the Department for 
International Development. In other countries, forestry 
is more widely dispersed. In the Netherlands, the 
Ministry of Agriculture, Nature Management and 
Fisheries is responsible for policy development, but 
the Ministries of Economic Affairs and of Housing, 
Spatial Planning and the Environment also have 
responsibilities for international forestry. France's aid 
structure also inevitably means that many different, 
relatively unrelated bodies are involved in forestry 
assistance. 

In countries with smaller aid programmes, responsi­
bility for sector aid often lies with the appropriate 
domestic ministry. The General Forestry Directorate in 
the Ministry of Agriculture is Portugal's main forestry 
aid representative, for instance, and Greek forestry aid 
is managed by the Department of Agriculture. Spain's 
tropical forestry is managed through a great diversity of 
government bodies. 

A further feature of funding often available to 
forestry, which reflects shifting priorities since UNCED 
in 1992, is that a number of countries have recently 
established separate budget lines to deal with global 
environmental issues such as biodiversity. These are 
often administered by departments other than those 
dealing with overseas development assistance to for­
estry. In Denmark the Environment and Disaster Relief 
Facility is administered by agencies in the Ministry of 
Environment and Energy, in collaboration with the 
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Ministry of Foreign Affairs. France's 'French Fund for 
the Global Environment' is administered by an inter­
ministerial Committee, and in the UK, the Darwin 
Initiative is administered by the Department of the 
Environment, Transport and the Regions (DETR). 

In the past, aid agencies often located forestry within 
agriculture departments. More recently, the trend has 
been for it to become more closely linked with the 
environment, as the previous paragraph attests. A 
second trend suggested by an analysis of country 
spending is that countries with smaller aid budgets 
have focused on the more agricultural aspects of 
forestry, while those with larger budgets have been 
able to tackle the larger and longer-endurin~ natural 
forest management issues. These have led inevitably to 
environmental considerations as well. 

The integration of forestry with other sectors some­
times makes it difficult to detect trends in forestry 
policy, and the level of forestry aid commitments. The 
exception occurs where countries have decided to 
dedicate a fixed sum to forestry and have to monitor 
disbursement rates. This occurred in Germany from 
1991, in the UK from 1989 to 1994 and in Austria from 
1993-95. A similar process is seen in the case of the 
European Commission's Tropical Forests Budget Line. 

The relative importance of forestry overall varies 
widely across the EU. The country with the largest 
proportionate contribution to forestry by far is Finland, 
followed by the Netherlands, Germany and Sweden. In 
volume terms the largest donors are Germany, the EC, 
the Netherlands, the UK, France and Sweden (see 
Table 3). 

Aid to the forestry sector has generally increased over 
the last decade, though this may not be a continuing 
trend. In Germany the proportion of state funding 
which goes to forestry and environmental activities has 
seen a fourfold increase since 1988. There was also a 
fourfold increase in the UK as a result of the Forestry 
Initiative (from 1989 until 1994) and funding rose in 
the early 1990s in the Netherlands. Portugal, on the 
other hand, has seen a decline in aid to the agriculture 
sector including forestry, from 3.7% in 1991 to 2.2% in 
1994. 

Overall forestry spending through the European 
Community aid programme has remained steady, with 
the exception of the Tropical Forestry Budget line itself, 
which grew from ECU 2m. in 1991 to ECU 50 m. in 
1992, and will remain at this level until at least 1999. 

The over-riding reason for the increased funding 
made available to forestry has been public concern 
about tropical forests within the donor countries. In the 
case of EC aid, it was primarily the concern of the 
European Parliament about tropical forests which 
increased the funds made available through the budget 
line created in 1991. 

4.4 Development personnel 
Tables 4a and 4b present information about the advice 
and arrangements for project implementation available 
to support forestry within each donor agency. 

Several of the larger donors are still able to maintain a 
cadre of specialist advisers in forestry and environment 
at headquarters level, as Table 4a indicates. These are 
Denmark, Finland, France, Germany, the Netherlands, 
and the UK. Sweden had such an adviser until 1997. 
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Other countries, such as Austria, Italy, Ireland Spain 
and Portugal, rely on advice from universities, specia­
lised research organisations, the national forestry 
service, consulting firms and NGOs. 

Those countries with tropical forestry programmes 
appear to make increasing use of their embassies in the 
developing world. Sometime this means simply attach­
ing staff from the specialist agency at headquarters to 
aid divisions at embassies (Belgium, Germany, Ireland, 
Italy, Sweden, the UK) but some countries have gone 
further and are now experimenting with the devolution 
of many aid management functions directly to the 
diplomatic service (Denmark, Finland). The Nether­
lands is experimenting with the devolved management 
of the aid programme at embassy level. In the case of 
the EU, Country Delegations play an important role in 
the selection and monitoring of projects. 

Few countries still maintain large numbers of 
technical co-operation employees, apart from France 
(500 for natural resource issues in concentration 
countries, of whom 25 specialise in forestry); Germany 
(115 GTZ employees working on forestry and con­
servation issues); and the UK (about 80 in forestry in 
recent years). 

The others rely on NGOs, consulting firms and 
universities, for the most part. Some countries have 
been able to retain specialist applied research bodies for 
tropical forestry implementation, such as Tropenbos in 

the Netherlands and CIRAD-Foret and ORSTOM in 
France. Other important components of the cadre of 
tropical forestry implementers in Germany, Ireland, 
Italy and the Netherlands, are the volunteer services. 
Finally a few countries have made strong efforts to 
involve wider civil society (what Denmark calls its 
'National Resource Base') in aid delivery: businesses, 
trade unions, local government, parishes and villages. 
Germany's political and church foundations are also of 
interest here. 
-- ~ The Europead Commission, apart from its small 
number of forestry advisers, relies heavily on commer­
cial European consulting firms for project implementa­
tion, in coordination with counterpart national co­
directors, and also on universities, NGOs and l-esearch 
bodies. 

4.5 NGOs and the forestry sector 
Several of the European Member States have found that 
NGOs in general have qualities and capabilities which 
cannot readily be matched in their bilateral aid 
programmes. Austria and Denmark note the ability of 
NGOs to educate the domestic public about aid issues. 
Italy runs a developing country volunteer service as an 
alternative to military service. Countries such as 
Belgium, Denmark, Ireland, Spain and the Netherlands 
have found, too, that NGOs can help them to simplify 
aid delivery. They may be able to work faster and more 

Table 3: Official Development Assistance in Europe to the Forestry Sector in 1995 (US$ million) 

Austria 767 1.10 (1993-95 only) 
0.11 (usually) 

Belgium 1 034 0.173 

Denmark 1 623 1.00 

Finland 388 4.6 

France 8443 0.45 

Germany 7 524 2.21 

Greece 1522 n.d4 

Ireland 153 0.253 

Italy 1 623 0.30 

Luxembourg 65 n.d4 

Netherlands 3 226 2.47 

Portugal 271 0.2 

Spain 1348 0.4 

Sweden 1 704 2.103 

UK 3 157 1.55 

EC 3860 2.2 

(Sources : 1 Organisation for Economic Cooperation and Development (OECD), 1996, p. 125 
2 data from Sourcebook chapters except where indicated 
3 data from Paper E/CN .17 /IPF/1996/ .. , presented to the Inter-Governmental Panel on Forests (IPF) II of the CSD, 
UN Economic and Social Council, 1996. (The percentages used in this paper were calculated in 1993 . 
The same percentage has been assumed for 1995 to produce the figure in column 3.) 
4 Forestry cannot be disaggregated from general oda (official development assistance) spending) 

8.4 
0.84 

1.7 

16.2 

17.9 

37.7 

166.3 

n.d 

0.4 

4.9 

n.d 

79 .7 

0.5 

5.4 

35.8 

49.0 

86.0 
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Table 4a: Sources of sectoral advice and of specialists for project implementation in the Member States 

flexibly than bilateral processes can, especially where 
large capable NGOs have been given block grants or 
framework agreements by the countries they belong to. 
NGOs are also valued where they have good local 
representation on the ground in developing countries, · 

(Source : Sourcebook chapters) 

for their ability to respond innovatively and monitor 
closely, and for reaching the poorest effectively. 

In response, many of the European Member States 
are now spending increasing percentages of their total 
bilateral aid budget through NGOs - indeed, Ireland's 
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Table 4b: Sources of sectoral advice and of specialists for project implementation in the Commission 

NGO budget is larger than its modest bilateral budget. 
Apart from Luxembourg (30%), Denmark (17%), and 
Sweden (11 %), however, typical NGO contributions 
still hover at under 10% with Finland, the Netherlands 
and the UK spending about 7-8%; Germany, Spain and 
Italy 5-6%; and France around 2%. But overall 
percentages continue to rise and several countries plan 
to increase allocations to NGOs. The DAC (Develop­
ment Assistance Committee of the OECD) average as 
recently as 1990 was only 2.8%. NGO projects tend 
also to be financed or co-financed at generous levels in 
many parts of Europe. Italy offers up to 100% funding; 
Austria, Belgium, Denmark, Finland, Germany, Ireland 
and Sweden fund at a 75-80% level; France and the UK 
offer co-funding at 50%. 

NGOs are beginning to have a more official role, in 
line with their growing institutionalisation as conduits 
for aid. Countries as diverse as France, Ireland, and Italy 
now give NGOs a seat at the table on national level 
Development Co-operation Committees. As a result, 
perhaps, several countries note tensions between NGO 
desires for independence and the government's desire to 
implement its own policies through their agency. 

Most NGOs tend to work in health, education, social 
services and general rural development. Although there 
are active lobbying NGOs such as Friends of the Earth 
raising environmental and forest issues in many 
countries in Europe, NGOs seem mainly to have 
avoided implementing forestry (except for farmer tree­
nurseries in rural development projects) because they 
see it as too long-term and expensive. Even those 
countries with strong forestry traditions and relatively 
large forestry programmes, do not necessarily have 
extensive NGO involvement in the sector. For example, 
80% of funding to Finnish NGOs was used for health, 
education and social services projects, and out of 348 
projects implemented through co-operation with Fin­
nish NGOs, only 20 dealt with forestry issues. How­
ever, Denmark, Ireland, Germany, the Netherlands and 
the UK seem to have NGOs which are a key part of 
bilateral forestry implementation. In the UK, 17% of all 
bilateral forestry funding is channelled through the 

(Source: Sourcebook chapters) 

NGO sector, while in the Netherlands the figure in 
1995 was 31%. 

Yet this only presents part of the picture. Many more 
countries in Europe mention the importance of NGO 
advice in the forestry sector than would appear to be 
funding much NGO forestry. The explanation no doubt 
lies partly in the fact that NGOs which specialise in 
rural livelihoods and rural development may offer 
forestry advice. It is also the case that many of the 
NGOs which campaign on behalf of tropical forests, 
and meet with aid donors at various national fora, do 
not implement forestry projects. Sometimes European 
NGOs rely more on EC funding than on bilateral funds. 
The World Wildlife Fund (WWF), Belgium, for 
instance, works on Congo basin conservation, forestry 
and certification issues through DGVIII-funded con­
tracts, issues with which the current Belgian bilateral 
aid programme has not been concerned. 

In the case of the European Community Aid, the 
Tropical Forests and Environment budget lines (B7-
6201 and B7-6200 respectively) managed by DG IB and 
DG VIII tend to prefer larger projects to fund because of 
their technical and administrative constraints. Average 
project size is over ECU 1 m.: suitable for consulting 
firms, but much too large for most NGOs. Projects of 
under ECU 1 m. and over ECU 250,000 are handled by 
these budget lines as 'small' projects. 

Project proposals below that figure, go to the NGO 
budget line, 'Community participation in actions in 
favour of developing countries, carried out by NGOs' 
(B7-6000). Here, average grant sizes are under ECU 
100,000- a tenth the size of the projects funded under 
B7-6200 and B7-6201. This budget line is managed 
from inside DG VIII, and covers all countries. The 
NGO budget line funded 42% of all tropical forestry 
projects between 1992 and 1996 (140 out of 333) 
though the total sum expended under these projects was 
only 4%. The trend since 1993 is for individual NGO 
forestry projects to become larger, and for fewer of 
them to be funded. 



4.6 Multilateral and multi-bilateral 
assistance 

In many Member States, the proportion of the aid 
budget which is disbursed through multilateral agencies 
is increasing. Nevertheless, the proportion of funding 
which goes to multilateral programmes varies quite 
widely across the EU, as Table 5 shows. Greece's 
bilateral commitments are abnormally low, leaving 
multilateral commitments to take up 76% of the total 
budget. Seven countries contribute between 40-50% 
multilaterally (including Finland, Denmark, UK and 
Belgium), while seven contribute 24-36% (including 
France, Netherlands, Sweden and Germany). Those 
countries which have relatively low aid:GNP ratios 
have proportionately higher multilateral commitments, 
as would be expected. But more generally, as the 
multilateral component of the aid budget has increased, 
countries have become more concerned to influence the 
policies of multilateral organisations. Denmark calls it 
'active multilateralism'. Spain has often tried to make 
sure that its multilateral EU contributions are mainly 
channelled to Latin America; DFID in the UK has 
seconded three social development advisors and two 
forestry advisers to multilateral organisations (including 
the Commission) to assist in policy development; and 
the Netherlands, Germany and Finland have all in turn 
also seconded a forestry adviser to the Commission. 
Donors who fund the Global Environment Facility 
(GEF), or CGIAR (Consultative Group on International 
Agronomic Research) centres such as the Centre for 
International Forestry Research (CIFOR) and the 
International Centre for Research in Agroforestry 
(ICRAF) maintain close links with their programmes. 

In the context of this understandable desire to see 
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substantial multilateral contributions well-spent, it is 
difficult to understand why the OECD has recom­
mended the phasing out of 'multi-bilateral ' or 'funds-in­
trust' arrangements. They offered important benefits for 
both larger and smaller donors. Larger donors such as 
Sweden and the Netherlands made major contributions 
to the FAO on these terms, as did Denmark to the 
United Nations Sudo-Sahelian Organization (UNSO), 
and were able to help shape the thinking of these 
multilateral organisations in important ways in the 
process. Some smaller donors such as Italy have in turn 
been able to gain exposure to current tropical forestry 
approaches through their multi-bilateral involvement 
with FAO. 

4. 7 Assisted credit scheme 
Some form of assisted credit scheme operates in several 
donor countries. Austria offers subsidised export credits 
to developing countries, to the benefit of Austrian 
exporters; Finland has its 'pre-mixed concessional 
credit' scheme; Portugal has an economic co-operation 
fund, and the UK ran its Aid and Trade Provision in co­
operation with the Department of Trade and Industry 
for many years. In Denmark and France, 50% of aid has 
been tied to the provision of the country's own goods 
and services; in Germany, 52%; and, topping the list, 
67% in the UK. Soft financial co-operation loans are 
made by Germany, Spain and Italy to countries with per 
capita incomes of under $2,800 p.a. Finland's credit 
arrangements (40% of the total) mainly benefit forest 
industries in Asian countries. Swedfund, in Sweden, 
puts up risk capital for joint ventures between Swedish 
and local companies, in countries with per capita 
incomes of under $3,000 p.a. 

These measures have been criticised both by the DAC 

Table 5: Aid Percentages spent bilaterally and multilaterally in Europe, 1995 ($ millions) 
. ;;:"'" .. ,, j~ ~'~~;,· :·'< 

Aid percentages Bilateral oda ., ·· Multilateral Total 

France 6429 (76%) 2015 (24%) 8443 (100%) 

Austria 560 (73%) 207 (27%) 767 (100%) 

Netherlands 2245 (70%) 981 (30%) 3226 (100%) 

Sweden 1189 (70%) 515 (30%) 1704 (100%) 

Luxembourg 43 (66%) 22 (34%) 65 (100%) 

Portugal 179 (66%) 92 (34%) 271 (100%) 

Germany 4815 (64%) 2709 (36%) 7524 (100%) 

Spain 816 (60%) 532 (40%) 1348 (100%) 

Finland 220 (57%) 168 (43%) 388 (100%) 

Ireland 88 (57%) 65 (43%) 153 (100%) 

Denmark 895 (55%) 728 (45%0 1623 (100%) 

UK 1670 (53%) 1487 (47%) 3157 (100%) 

Belgium 514 (50%) 520 (50%) 1034 (100%) 

Italy 806 (49%) 817 (51%) 1623 (100%) 

Greece1 
45 (24%) 144 (76%) 189 (100%) 

(Sources : 
1 

Data for Greece not available in OECD (1996) and taken from country chapter 
OECD, 1996, pps A21 -A22) 
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and by the general public in many countries, on !he 
grounds that such loans are always tied to benefits for 
companies in the lending country and may not be truly 
development-related, and stricter criteria are now used 
to assess the suitability of projects for this type of 
funding. Finland found that there was too little 
development content in proposals to its credit scheme, 
that it was poorly monitored, and that it skewed aid 
away from Africa towards Asia. It is now phasing out 
the scheme. The UK government undertook to abolish 
its Aid and Trade Provision in its November 1997 
White Paper. 

5. STRATEGY 

5.1 General development co-operation 
policies 

Most of Europe's donors currently have development 
co-operation policies which prioritize poverty reduc­
tion, sustainable livelihoods, social equality, the rights 
of women, and progress. Some, such as Austria, 
Denmark Finland, Germany, Portugal, Sweden, and 
the UK seek for respect for human rights in the 
countries to which they offer official development 
assistance, along with attempts to promote democracy, 
good governance, and popular participation in the 
political process. Some too, (e.g. Austria, Portugal and 
Spain) explicitly seek to promote peace through aid. 
Forces which shape policy congruence include DAC, the 

Table 6: Per cent of GNP spent on official development 
assistance by EU Member States 1994-5 

Country %c;tfG~,P 

Denmark 0.96 

Netherlands 0 .81 

Sweden 0.77 

France 0.55 

Belgium 0.38 

Luxembourg 0.36 

Austria 0 .33 

Finland 0.32 

Germany 0.31 

Ireland 0.29 

UK 0.28 

Portugal 0 .27 

Spain 0.24 

Italy 0 .15 

Greece 0.13 

EU Members : mean - 0.41 % 
median - 0.32% 

(Source: OECD, 1996, p. 125) 
Note: since data for Greece is unavailable in OECD, 1996, it is taken from the 
Greek cou nt ry chapte r. 

Development Assistance Committee of the OECD; UN 
and Bretton Woods institutions, and the Lome Con­
ventions. Since the UNCED Conference in Rio in 1992, 
almost all countries have, in addition, added an explicit 
policy commitment to environmentally sustainable 
development and resource protection. The European 
Union has had a formal policy towards developing 
countries only since 1992 (in the Maastricht Treaty of 
European Union). Three objectives are listed: sustain­
able economic and social development; the gradual 
integration of developing countries into the world 
economy, and the reduction of poverty. The Treaty 
also makes it legally obligatory to promote measures to 
deal with environmental problems. 

Several countries have produced Aid White P~pers in 
recent years: the Netherlands in 1990 and 1996; 
Denmark with the goal of assessing aid in the post 
Cold War period; Finland in 1993 when, in a context of 
dramatic budget cuts, it was necessary to defend and 
justify the very existence of aid; and the UK in 1997, 
after the election of the first Labour Government for 
eighteen years. The production of such documents 
demonstrates a continuing active engagement in devel­
opment co-operation. 

The other measure of commitment to development 
co-operation has conventionally been the percentage of 
GNP spent on official development assistance. There 
has been a general reduction in aid budgets during the 
1990s, and currently only three countries attain or pass 
the 0.7% ideal (see Table 6). 

5.1.1 Aid process and progress 
Initially, in the 1960s, the aid process, for those 
countries with a responsibility towards newly indepen­
dent ex-colonies, was conceived as a gap-filling exercise 
-providing personnel and other kinds of help until they 
were no longer needed. The 'trickle-down' theories of 
the 1960s and 1970s, which assumed that aid would 
supply missing investment and that industrialisation 
was the inevitable development path, fitted well with 
this view. Aid strategies were not evolved until the 
1970s and 1980s, whereupon country strategy papers 
were gradually developed which laid down what a 
particular donor's priorities were, and what perhaps 
recipient country priorities might be as well. 

Aid orthodoxy for many donors (Finland and Sweden 
describe this path) was initially to put individual experts 
in line functions (1960s); to support assistance through 
free-standing projects (1970s); and finally to move to 
larger programmes combining several projects or 
focusing on particular sectoral interests (1980s). In the 
1990s, these donors have encouraged a further shift in 
the aid relationship, to recipient country primacy in 
decision-making, and donor support only as requested 
with technical assistance and policy development. 

While sectoral preferences for funding still vary from 
country to country across Europe, certain broad aid 
trends in funding can be discerned. In recent years, 
many donors have reported a shift away from the 
provision of training, infrastructure, and support for 
agricultural intensification in high potential areas, 
towards a more profound engagement with poverty 
alleviation, and resource conservation. Projects have got 
smaller and more diverse as many donors have moved 
away from the funding of capital-intensive projects, and 



towards social and institutional capacity-building goa'ls. 
Those who fund forestry note that it requires long-term 
commitment, however. (Germany's average is seven to 
ten years for technical co-operation projects.) 

A further important shift has been the broader 
inclusion of social analysis into all kinds of projects, 
in acknowledgement that early projects did not always 
achieve development objectives, even where physical 
targets were reached. Several donors now incorporate 
social analysis into all project assessment. DFID (UK) 
social development advisors are involved from the 
earliest stages of the project cycle, and DIDC (Finland) 
requires institutional and participation analysis, as well 
as gender analysis, as part of baseline information 
collection. The degree to which this extends to forestry 
varies between countries, to some extent depending on 
the type of forestry project favoured. Efforts to integrate 
social considerations into forestry projects are being 
tried throughout Europe. So far, Finland and the UK are 
the only donors to have undertaken reviews or 
evaluations of the effectiveness of these attempts. 

5.2 Tropical forestry policy and strategy 
The earliest forest policies and strategies in Europe were 
concerned with what would now be regarded as a very 
narrow definition of forestry. Belief in industrialisation 
as the key to forest development and better livelihoods 
for the rural poor followed the FAO's Jack Westoby 
(Westoby, 1985) for much of the 1960s and 1970s. 
French, Dutch, Swedish and British policies in this 
period all stressed production, forest industry, inven­
tory, plantations, logging and the training of workers. A 
re-orientation to tropical forestry policies which ad­
dressed local livelihoods more effectively came later, the 
impetus for change coming from several different 
directions. 

5.2.1 Social policies in non-forestry aid 
Firstly, social policies and changes in development 
theory have been very significant. Forestry moved later 
than many other sectors from models of industrialisa­
tion as the source of wealth, towards theories based on 
sustainable livelihoods and the inter-linkage between 
social and ecological sustainability. Nevertheless, these 
shifts in tropical forestry thinking occurred far earlier in 
aid institutions, where the theories shaping aid in other 
sectors influenced forestry, than they did in forestry 
research institutions, where the discipline as a whole 
has been more isolated. 

5.2.2 Key international conferences, meetings 
and reports 

The second important sources of new strategy, cited by 
several donors, were various international conferences, 
meetings and reports. The most important for many of 
those interviewed for the country chapters, are set out 
in Box 1. 

5.2.3 The early role played by Sweden 
Sweden was a key actor in the shift towards a broader 
brief for forestry. It had seconded foresters to FAO in 
the 1960s to deal with tropical forestry issues, and had 
supported bilateral projects in Ethiopia, Tanzania and 
Vietnam in the 1970s. It consequently became aware 
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earlier than many other donors of the limitations of an 
industrial strategy for forestry, if benefit to local people 
was, at least in part, the aim. As a result, it committed 
Funds in Trust for the FAO/SIDA Forestry for Local 
Community Development Programme (FLCD), and 
helped to initiate the social, community and farm 
forestry projects of the 1980s. 
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5.3 Public pressure on governments for 
commitment to forests and the 
environment 

An important influence on policy has been public 
pressure on governments for commitment to forests 
and the environment, often articulated through cam­
paigning NGOs. These groups have by no means always 
prioritised sustainable livelihoods. 

Pressure for government support to tropical forests 
would seem often to have been triggered initially by ., 
events affecting the environment at home, which then 
led to concern for forests and the environment inter­
nationally. Public pressure for better nature conserva­
tion and management came about in Spain, for 
instance, because of the public's demand for better 
state control of forest fires, and more protected areas. 
The Nordic interests in the environment which led to 
the 1972 Stockholm Conference and to the Brundtland 
Commission, emerged from two directions - the 
consciousness of forest dependence in countries such 
as Sweden and Finland, and the consciousness of past 
forest loss in Denmark. In Germany, a government 
report on damage to domestic forests greatly sensitised 
the public, and also led to boycotts of tropical timber. 
The link is not always clear, though. In France, 
energetic debate about the use of domestic forests for 
recreation or production has not produced an equally 
general interest in the fate of tropical forests. In Italy, 
interest in tropical forests preceded interest in domestic 
forests. 

Several countries have responded to public interest in 
tropical forests very directly. In Austria, substantial 
funds were committed for a fixed period after Rio, which 
were focused above all on the rights of indigenous 
people, on small-scale timber extraction and on ecotour­
ism. The funds were spent bilaterally because the 
Austrian people wanted 'ownership' of funds and 
outcomes. Public pressure in Spain generally pushes for 
aid funds to be spent first in Latin America, and then in 
response to international events such as the Rwanda 
crisis. The majority of the larger funders of tropical 
forestry in Europe have established a regular Forum or 
Committee, at which NGOs and other members of the 
public can comment on tropical forestry strategy and 
policy and be involved in the planning process, and 
where they may be challenged on their failures. 

At one level, donors would argue that these pressures 
are healthy and helpful. At another, they exacerbate the 
tension between conservation and production priorities 
already seen in the Environment and Forestry debate. 
Because forests in Europe are increasingly used for 
recreation, the general public may be reluctant for the 
production needs of the developing world to be given 
due weight. For instance, the main author of the 
Sweden chapter notes that while in Sida ' ... assistance 
shall be targeted at the sustainable use of biodiversity', 
this is at variance with the valuing of biodiversity that 
prevails in forestry within Sweden. More dialogue with 
the public on these issues is clearly needed. 

This area is one where the Commission itself is as yet 
almost entirely in a vacuum. It hardly experiences 
public pressure on its activities in forestry or in anything 
else, dialogue is limited, and the need to respond to 
diverse concerns quickly is correspondingly minimal. 

5.4 Current tropical forestry policy in 
Europe 

Despite their interest in, and in some cases considerable 
commitment to tropical forests, Austria, Belgium, 
Greece, Ireland, Italy, Luxembourg, Portugal and Spain 
currently lack formal forest policies. Box 2 presents 
brief summaries of the forest policies of those Member 
States which have policies, together with the Commis­
sion's most recent policy position. 

5.5 The definition of forestry 
Varied attempts to define forestry underlie the figures 
for volume of forestry funding found in each country in 
Europe (see Table 3), and in each Directorate-General. 
Researchers have arrived at the best figures they were 
able using results generated by local coding systems, 
and by making judgements based on project title. In 
some cases there was no substitute for a project-by­
project estimate of the percentage of forestry activity 
each had contained, kindly carried out by an individual 
with a long institutional memory. It was rare to find 
anything comparable to the EC Tropical Forests Budget 
line where all projects funded within the envelope could 
be counted as forestry. 

In the case of Denmark, agroforestry, multipurpose 
tree-planting, soil and water conservation and forest 
management all come partly or wholly under forestry 
within the Ministry of- Foreign Affairs. Forestry and 
other environment projects are also found under a 
separate budget in DANCED in the Ministry of the 
Environment. France counts environment, forest con­
servation, nature reserves, wildlife, and biodiversity 
projects within its aid to forestry. Spain, on the other 
hand, uses the Spanish equivalent of the word forestry 
only to mean reforestation, and groups many of the 
activities which France classifies as forestry under an 
environment heading. 

Classification problems have a threefold origin. 
Firstly, forestry itself has changed and continues to 
change. Most countries that fund forestry projects now 
fund a broad array of activities which would not have 
been counted as forestry at all twenty years ago, but 
which are now in the tropical forestry mainstream. 
Secondly, what constitutes 'forestry' can occasionally be 
a contentious political matter as far as developing 
country partners are concerned: sectoral divisions can 
result in situations where important forest impacts are 
not acknowledged. Finally, it is quite clear that when 
funding expanded, as it did for forestry, it caused the 
definitions to expand as well. 

6. ENVIRONMENTAL POLICY 
Environmental issues came to prominence in the early 
1990s for most countries, before and after the United 
Nations Conference on Environment and Development 
in Rio de Janeiro in 1992. How high these issues have 
subsequently stayed on the agenda has varied from 
country to country. Countries such as Denmark and 
Germany, where public opinion on global environmen­
tal issues has been a constant political factor, have 
devoted much more of their aid budgets to the 
environment than those where such pressure is absent. 
This can be seen in a number of initiatives developed in 



support of the global environment. After the UNCED 
meeting, several countries established independent 
funds for the global environment, and also contributed 
to GEF directly. 

• France committed substantial funds to the GEF 
after Rio (FF 807 m.), and also endowed its own 
parallel fund. Since 1994 the Interministerial 
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Environment Fund, the FFEM has been in existence 
with funds of FF 440 m. 

• The Environment and Disaster Relief Facility of 
Denmark is expecting a commitment of 0.5% of 
GNP annually by the year 2002. The facility has a 
broad brief: it spends half its funds in developing 
countries, and half on 'green' rather than 'brown' 
environment issues. 
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• The Netherlands intends to create a fund of 0.1% 
of GNP for activities related to international 
environmental policy by 1999. 

• The UK's Darwin initiative is one of the smaller 
funds with a budget of £3 m. per year for 
collaborative projects to help conserve global 
biodiversity. 

Countries with budgets too small to set up independent 
funds, have nevertheless usually been able to contribute 
to the GEF. 

UNCED explicitly linked northern and southern 
environmental issues, and several European countries 
have also made commitments to increase forest cover, 
or to undertake conservation monitoring. These in­
itiatives are not directly considered here. However, they 
have perhaps had an impact on aid programmes in two 
ways. Firstly, as section 5.3 indicated, the public has 
tended to link concerns about environmental issues at 
home to pressure for particular kinds of actions in the 
tropics. Secondly, there has been a move by several 
donors to increase support for conservation projects 
through the aid programme. The Netherlands increased 
its funding for the conservation of tropical forests from 
2% in 1986 to 29% in 1992. Spain has increased 
spending on conservation at the expense of forest 
management initiatives and Germany also has an 
increasing number of conservation projects. This 
pressure is also reflected in the rainforest-oriented 
commitments of DG IB and DG XI. The environment, 
in short, is now a high aid priority for many countries. 

7. POLICY IMPACTS ON 
GEOGRAPHIC AND THEMATIC 
FOCUS 

7.1 The narrowing focus of aid 
Many donors, faced with a reduction in overall funding 
capacity, have in recent years reviewed their policies 
and now focus more sharply on strategy objectives. In 
so doing, they have reduced the total number of 
countries to which they give funding, and their number 
of primary co-operation countries (also known as 
programme, priority, 'pays de champ' or concentration 
countries) as the DAC Committee of the OECD has 
recommended. 

The criteria used for target country selection have 
also been formalised in many cases, and these now 
frequently include issues of democracy and human 
rights as well as the traditional poverty criterion. A 
further aspect of targeting being used by some aid 
agencies is only to support particular sectors within 
priority countries. Forestry remains a priority in all 
those Member States where it was important before. 

The degree of concentration on primary co-operation 
countries nevertheless varies. Portugal and Italy spend 
80% of bilateral aid on their concentration countries, 
but Finland only 44%. In the UK, 74% of forestry aid 
was disbursed in priority countries. The trend is likely 
to be for the increasing concentration of assistance on 
priority countries. 

The main countries currently (1995) funded by each 
of the Member States in Africa, the Mediterranean and 

Middle East, Asia, and Latin America and the 
Caribbean, are presented in Tables Ai, Aii, Aiii and Aiv. 

7.2 Geographic focus 
The tables in Annex I show several clear patterns. 
Firstly, poverty criteria are important: there are very 
few LLDCs (least developed countries) which do not 
have at least one European donor in this list. However, 
these criteria lead inexorably to a concentration on 
funding in Africa (Table Ai), followed by the poorer 
countries of other areas. Secondly, democracy and 
human rights criteria are having a major impact on the 
selection of countries to fund. Thirdly, there is strong 
donor loyalty to ex-colonies in the cases of France, 
Italy, the Netherlands, Portugal and to some e~tent the 
UK, and a strong loyalty to Latin America in the case of 
Spain. Fourthly, natural resource interests are clearly 
driving the wide-ranging donor interest that such 
countries as Indonesia and Brazil receive. Finally, 
Member States in southern Europe take a particular 
interest in the countries of the southern Mediterranean 
and the Middle East (Table Aii). 

The problem which donors may need to address in 
due course is that the same poverty criteria and human 
rights criteria lead to the same set of countries. The 
paradox may well be that the very countries with the 
least institutional capacity and fewest trained profes­
sionals are having to work with five to nine donors from 
the European Member States alone. Here is a case 
where better donor complementarity might well en­
gender better effects, for more recipient countries, with 
more successful outcomes. 

The countries where the overlap is greatest are as 
follows: 

West Africa: 

NE + E Africa: 
Southern Africa: 

Asia: 

Latin America: 

drylands - Senegal, Burkina Faso, 
Niger 
tropical moist forest - Cameroon 
Egypt, Ethiopia, Tanzania 
Mozambique, Zambia and 
Zimbabwe 
Bangladesh, China, India, Indonesia 
and Vietnam 
Nicaragua and Bolivia 

While India, China or Indonesia can no doubt absorb 
diverse donors, smaller countries may find it more 
difficult. 

Countries which have, overall, maintained the 
strongest interest in Africa are Belgi urn, Denmark, 
Finland, France, Ireland, Italy, the Netherlands, Portu­
gal, Sweden and the UK (see Table 7a). Latin America 
has in recent years been a particular focus for Austria, 
Belgium, Germany, the Netherlands and Spain, while 
Asia continues to engage the particular commitment of 
Denmark, Finland, Germany, the Netherlands and the 
UK. France, in addition to its support for Africa, 
Madagascar and Mayotte (Comoros) makes substantial 
commitments to its Pacific Island Departments, and to 
Vietnam and Indonesia in Asia. The picture for the EC 
is set out in Table 7b. 

7.3 Thematic focus 
Most donors in Europe have shifted the thematic focus 
of the issues they choose to fund, as the individual 
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Table 7a: The regional distribution of forestry aid for each European Member State (%of funds) 

(Source : Sourcebook chapters) 

Table 7b: The regional distribution of aid within the Directorates General of the Commission 

chapters in this book show, in line with the changes of 
approach and policy outlined in Section 5. The shift 
away from industrial production and processing and 
towards increased support to forestry with local people 
has been all but universal. Afforestation and agro­
forestry receive less support than they did, while 
sustainable forest management, collaborative forest 
management, and an interest in non-timber forest 
products have all increased. Since 1992, donors have 
also made a substantial financial commitment to 
conservation projects and rainforests. 

A further interesting shift is the extent to which 
support to forestry now consists of much more than 
mere implementation. It also involves support for the 
evolution of a forestry sector with the capacity to 
respond to the social and economic, as well as the 
biological conditions for sustainability. Table Sa 

(Source: Sourcebook chapters) 

illustrates current priont1es among Member States. 
Institutional and policy development is currently the 
lead issue being funded by these donors, followed by 
rural development forestry, conservation, research, and 
sustainable forest management. Afforestation and 
agroforestry, which might have led the list a decade 
ago, now come well below these other priorities in 
terms of donor interest. 

Most donor plans for the immediate future continue 
to prioritise a very similar ranking of issues, with strong 
strategic support at national level, more management 
roles for those who live near forests, more integration of 
forestry and sustainable livelihoods, and more conser­
vation. Some recognise potential conflicts of interest 
between poverty alleviation criteria and interests in 
tropical moist forest and environmental conservation 
objectives. 
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Table Sa: The Thematic distribution of forestry aid among the European Member States 

Notes: 
The percentages given here are based on financial commitments. 
France does not present thematic data in a way comparable with this figure. 
Luxembourg has only one project (forest management). 
Greece has no bilateral forestry projects . 

(Source : Sourcebook chapters) 

Table Sb: Thematic distribution of forestry aid management within the Directorates General of the Commission 

Table 8b depicts the position for the EC, where an 
even stronger focus on sustainable forest management, 
conservation, buffer zones and the like can be observed, 
together with some interesting funding for forest 
peoples, certification and timber issues. 

(Source: Sourcebook chapters) 

8. PROJECT CYCLE MANAGEMENT 
Shrinking donor funds have led not only to the 
concentration of resources, but also to a determination 
to ensure greater effectiveness and impact. At the same 
time - and this has especially been true of the forestry 
sector since it began to move into unfamiliar territory in 
order to try collaboration with local people in forest 



management and protected area management - blue­
print projects have constrained timely and innovative 
responses to challenges as they appear. The response of 
most donors in Europe has been to adopt the logical 
framework approach to project planning, which sets 
clear objectives, but allows evolution and adaptation of 
the means by which they are reached, and the indicators 
which will be used to monitor progress. 

Objectives-Oriented Project Planning (ZOPP) is 
closely associated with Germany, and has been used 
there since 1983. The methodology has been adapted to 
fit the needs of a variety of other countries, the UK using 
TEAM-Up, Belgium, Planification des interventions par 
objectifs (PIPO), and so on. Germany, and some of the 
other countries which have used the method for some 
time are already working on redesign to streamline and 
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simplify the process, and make it less costly, more 
flexible and a better communication and participation 
tool. 

Others are only just beginning to adopt the method in 
all projects. They have found the EC Project Cycle 
Management Manuals (Commission of the European 
Community, 1993) of great value for materials devel­
opment in their own countries. The Forest Sector 
Development Co-operation Guidelines (EC, 1996) are 
also beginning to be used and promoted, both inside 
and outside the Commission. 

Logical frameworks have proved to have a strong 
potential for harmonising donor inputs, and pairs of 
bilateral donors in Europe have already used them to 
simplify aid delivery to particular countriek in the 
forestry sector. 
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9. DONOR COMPARATIVE 
ADVANTAGE 

Europe's donors may be divided into three groups as far 
as their contributions to tropical forestry are concerned. 
The largest donors are Denmark, Finland, France, 
Germany, Netherlands, Sweden, UK, and European 
Community Aid. Belgium, Italy and Spain are medium­
sized forestry donors, while smaller programmes of 
support are provided by Austria (since the end of its 
Rainforest Initiative), Ireland, Luxembourg and 
Portugal. Greece funds forestry almost entirely 
m ul til a terall y. 

9.1 Research strengths 
Universities which offer degrees in which tropical 
forestry forms all or a substantial part of the degree 
exist in the UK, Sweden, the Netherlands, Finland, 
France, Germany and Spain. A brief summary of some 
of the main areas of country research expertise for 
development, and the main regional foci for this 
research, are given in Box 3. 

9.2 Other kinds of comparative advantage 
The eighty three countries in which the Member States 

currently fund aid programmes are tabulated in Annex I. 
Member State and EC funding priorities, and thus the 
areas in which they are currently increasing their 
capacity and experience, are set out in Tables 8a and 
8b. 

There are a number of other general and specific 
areas of European comparative advantage worth 
mentioning here. 

9.2.1 Colonial period experience 
A powerful factor in encouraging continuing support to 
tropical forests for some countries, has been a tradition 
to draw on which has continued since the colonial 
period. The strongest colonial experience is found 
among the French, the Dutch and the Brirtsh, with 
some experience in the case of Italy, Belgium and 
Portugal. Spanish links with Latin America are still 
strong. France has maintained the most stable and long­
term commitment to its old colonies. Germany is a 
special case. Although it did not have colonies after the 
first World War, its early expertise in forestry, and the 
important role of individual German experts in the 
evolution of British and Dutch colonial forestry 
practice, have been one factor encouraging Germany's 
continuing commitment to tropical forestry. 



9.2.2 Europe's own experience of people-
forest interactions 

A second factor of importance is the experience 
European countries can bring to forest-people interac­
tions in the developing world. All have experienced 
forest loss, the generation of legislation to curb it, 
conflicts between local people and the State and the 
solutions adopted, and much is well-documented. Other 
experience is relevant here too. There is, for instance, a 
strong democratic and participative tradition in the 
Netherlands, fostered in the past by the village canal 
and dyke-management associations, which have been 
such an essential part of the country's survival. 

Europe's most densely populated countries have had 
to incorporate many of their trees into farm landscapes. 
Less densely settled countries such as France have 
strong traditions of farmer and community manage­
ment of patches of forest. Countries with more 
extensive forested areas such as Finland and Sweden 
have, in addition to these, complex systems of permits 
for forest use rights for non-timber forest products and 
hunting; shifting cultivation was still practised in some 
areas until the 1930s. 

9.2.3 Specific skills 
Some of the country chapters indicate highly specialised 
home-based experience- such as Austria's in the fields 
of ecologically friendly timber extraction on steep 
slopes; mountain hazard mapping, and the biological 
stabilisation of erosion and its prevention in mountain 
areas, for instance. 

A few programmes offer specific implementation 
lessons. For instance, Ireland's support to a cluster of 
food security and environmental rehabilitation issues in 
Tanzania over a 1 0-18 year period, and its decade of 
support to forestry in the Sudan, offer an excellent 
example of a small donor with limited resources using 
them well in the natural resource arena. It achieved this 
by choosing only a few countries, by small, steady, long­
term investments, and by a clear topic focus. The inputs 
have led to strong experience in drylands forestry. 

9.3 Learning from programme experience 
Donor funding has little meaning, however generous, if 
no efforts are made to draw the lessons of success and 
failure from what is funded: they are the only means by 
which the link between the implementation of field 
projects and global-level policy processes can be forged. 
Ideally, field projects are the testing ground for new 
ideas and approaches, and the results, like research 
results, are made public and can affect policy in due 
course. But this does not always happen in every case. 

However, feedback mechanisms have been improving 
steadily in many of the Member States. Logical frame­
works and the objectives-oriented planning process 
have been in use for several years. The result has been 
robust process project methodologies which facilitate 
better monitoring and evaluation practice, and lead to 
better outcomes. The production of Guideline docu­
ments has been excellent in several countries and within 
the Commission itself. On the evidence from the 
individual chapters in this book, one of the most 
illuminating mechanisms for learning has been the 
comparative reviews undertaken by donors from time 
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to time, where a selection of completed projects are 
examined. Usually only the bigger donors have the 
resources to conduct these commendably frank reviews, 
but the insights they yield are important for everyone 
working in tropical forestry. Box 4 gives some examples 
of these. 

9.4 The contribution of the European 
Community 

The European Community's comparative advantage in 
tropical forestry is potentially immense. It has sub­
stantial financial resources, and aid delegations all over 
the world. That its ability to deliver high quality aid in 
the forestry sector has limitations is to do with 'the rapid 
build-up of aid funds in the early 1990s, unmatched by 
an adequate increase in technical or administrative 
support. Nevertheless, there have been some important 
achievements. 

DG Vlll has made great progress in recent years in 
developing a strategic orientation for the Tropical 
Forestry budget line. Its increased funding for policy 
studies has been valuable (e.g. a paper on logging in the 
Congo basin by Pacific rim countries) and has heigh­
tened the budget line's profile. Work on certification 
and on the operationalisation of the EU commitment to 
complementarity, coordination and coherence are also 
important. Finally, the recently produced Forest Sector 
Guidelines are being widely used. 

DG ffi's strategy for the future is to programme its 
share of the Tropical Forest budget line in more detail, 
concentrating more on participation, natural forest 
management, and trade and certification issues, and 
less on conservation. More consideration of equity 
issues may lead to a wider selection of countries for 
funding in Asia and Latin America in future. 

DG XI, too, is planning the development of a forestry 
strategy by the end of 1998. It has so far mostly funded 
small forestry and environment projects, many in the 
Amazon, on civil society issues. 

Research funded from DG XII currently lacks a 
tropical forestry research strategy to focus limited funds 
more effectively. A recent evaluation highlighted the 
problems of overloaded staff, with no time to assist 
with project preparation, or build links to other forestry 
funders in the Commission. It also noted the many 
research problems caused by financial delays. 

9.5 Donor collegiality 
Forestry donors probably first began to debate issues 
together and act in concert through the TF AP process 
and through International Tropical Timber Organiza­
tion (ITTO) meetings. In more recent years the Forestry 
Advisers' Group (FAG) has met regularly. Out of these 
initiatives, indirectly, came the formation of the 
European Tropical Forestry Advisory Group (ETFAG) 
in 1990. At first annually, and now biannually, forestry 
advisers meet as individuals to update one another 
about current initiatives, and to debate broader issues. 
The forging of informal working relationships through 
initially formal meetings has made it far more common 
for pairs of donors to share research under way at an 
early stage, or plan joint activities. As donors experi­
ment with different aid delivery mechanisms, they 
consult others, invite comment, learn from one 
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another's mistakes. At one level, there is a constant 
donor tendency towards convergence; at another, 
comparative advantage is constantly being recreated, 
and there is little danger from over-homogenisation of 
approach. The outcome has been, rather, an excellent 
learning environment. 

10. ISSUES AND TRENDS FOR THE 
FUTURE 

Issues of aid management strategy with which the 
European Member States and the Commission are 
currently grappling, or which they will shortly need to 
address, are dealt with in this final section. All have 
important implications for the future, and for Europe's 
contribution as a whole to support for tropical forests. 

10.1 Devolution 
Firstly, almost all governments have reduced the 
number of government employees who are involved in 
aid delivery, and are seeking partners for implementa­
tion among NGOs, Consultancy firms, universities, and 
through other arrangements. These changes are usually 
more to do with budget constraints and privatisation 
ideologies than with a belief that others will manage aid 
delivery better. Some countries have a strong commit­
ment to the involvement of civil society in aid, however, 
with aid delivery through region-to-region or town-to­
town twinning mechanisms, through trade unions, 
through support from small businesses in the north to 
similar small businesses in the south and from church to 
church. Nevertheless, the main mechanisms are NGOs 
and consulting firms, and each of these present 
particular problems in the aid context. 

10.1.1 NGOs 
The country chapters in this book make it clear that few 
NGOs, on the whole, have a strong track record in 
managing forestry projects other than rural develop­
ment projects with a small forestry component. Forest 
management projects are difficult practically - they 
demand very specific skills, they are costly, and they 
must endure for ionger than most NGOs would choose 
to be involved. More importantly, development NGOs 
are regarded with hostility and suspicion in some 
developing countries, and it has been easier for them 
to work in sectors such as mother-and-child health 
where they do not challenge government directly. In the 
case of forests (almost always state property), NGO 
approaches which prioritise local people's needs have 
often been seen as an unacceptable political challenge to 
the State, and proposals from them for institutional or 
policy change would be out of the question. It has been 
easier for donors with more money and more authority 
to make these challenges, or to experiment within a 
project context. 

The exception has been environmental NGOs such as 
WWF, whose approach has, paradoxically, sometimes 
strengthened government's ability to exclude local 
people from access to forests, and who often manage 
particular protected areas for long periods of time. 

1 0.1.2 Consulting firms 
Consulting firms manage many, probably the majority, 

of the tropical forestry projects which currently exist. 
But often their management model - that of timely 
delivery of physical outputs within budget - is more 
suited to a civil engineering firm building roads, than to 
support for what is currently a rapidly evolving and 
innovating sector. 

The themes which this chapter shows European 
donors are currently funding in tropical forestry -
policy and institutional development; collaborative 
forest management; sustainable forest management for 
a wider range of benefits than before; and the blending 
of conservation and development issues - require good 
facilitation skills, the capacity to implement flexibly and 
an interest in local people. Yet often consulting firms 
are conservative and old-fashioned. Their empl~yees do 
not get time to read, and they are often among the last 
to be exposed to new ideas and policies. Preoccupied 
with the need to secure the next contract, they may not 
be well placed to challenge the structures within which 
they work. In an era where flexible logical frameworks 
are becoming a more and more powerful tool, they need 
to be encouraged not to implement in the old blueprint 
way. 

There are ways round these problems, but they 
require much more investment from donor agencies in 
the form of training, briefing documents, seminars, and 
close interactive monitoring, than is usually offered at 
present. In the Nordic countries, an effort has been 
made to train consultants, and make them more 
familiar with government policies. A few consulting 
firms have a close relationship with in-house advisers, 
and are involved in all parts of the project cycle: not just 
implementation but often identification and evaluation 
as well. They effectively become additional advisers. 
But even they would say that there are problems with 
the current pattern, especially for field managers. 

The reality is that devolution to other implementing 
bodies has been seen as a cheaper option for govern­
ment development agencies than it really is. To be 
effective, more effort will have to be put into the 
planning and management of implementation by multi­
ple diverse parties, and to their continued exposure to 
new thinking in forestry. 

10.2 The relationships between budgets 
and outputs 

There are several issues here relevant to the manage­
ment of aid for forestry. 

1 0.2.1 The cost of forestry projects 
Firstly, the evidence from several countries in this book 
is that support to forestry in tropical moist environ­
ments is usually a long-term and complex business, 
expensive in terms of both money and aid management 
processes. Germany doubts that useful forestry projects 
can be delivered in less than 7-10 years. Not only do 
social economic and biological issues have to be 
addressed locally, but inevitable stakeholder conflicts 
involve both local and national-level issues simulta­
neously as well. Good quality field managers and a close 
donor advisory relationship with both the partner 
country and project managers is essential. 

The less costly, but no less long-term alternative is to 
fund integrated rural development projects in which 



tree-planting or forest management plays only a minor 
part, or to fund forest management in dryland areas 
where national and international interest in the forest 
resource is less, and complexities fewer. This is the path 
that Ireland has taken successfully. 

1 0.2.2 Aid volume for forestry 
A second issue is the volume of funds available and the 
organisational and administrative structures available 
to deal with them. In the case of Italy the Ministry of 
Foreign Affairs acknowledges that the country's aid 
budget grew too fast in the 1980s for its internal 
management structures to be able to keep up. Its control 
of aid quality was weak in consequence. Like other 
donors such as Finland and the UK, Italy has found that 
financial constraints have led to better quality aid 
because they brought aid volume back within the scope 
of good quality administration. 

The European Commission has had to deal with these 
issues as well. Its aid budget for forestry grew rapidly in 
the 1990s, but it has not been allowed to recruit more 
professional staff to help with the administration of 
these funds. Consequently, understanding of complex 
tropical forestry issues may be poor. These limitations 
in turn have led to the weak monitoring and evaluation 
of projects, limited opportunities to learn from previous 
projects, and thus a weak information base for future 
project selection. 

The Member States have tried to help by seconding 
National Experts to DG IB and DG VIII. DG VIII has 
decided to tackle some of its aid management problems 
in the forestry sector by contracting out aspects of 
project selection and management of the budget line to 
consultants. While this will lighten the work-load of 
over-burdened individuals within the Directorate, it is 
no alternative to a properly staffed, professional in­
house team which can develop funding strategically. 
And as section 1 0.1.2 showed, consultants themselves 
may not be able to deliver the most effective tropical 
forestry outcomes without a great deal more support 
than they usually get. 

Ideal project size is much debated inside the 
European Commission. Large projects are appraised, 
implemented and evaluated by consultancy firms, and 
thereby deal in a very satisfactory way with in-house 
staff shortages. While smaller projects are more 
effective, and use funds better, they are too manage­
ment-intensive at current staffing levels. More redesign 
for aid effectiveness may be needed. 

1 0.3 Institutional memory 
Poor institutional memory is a major problem in some 
agencies. Sometimes this may be the result of poor 
archiving of project documents. But in reality most of 
the chapters in this book relied for important informa­
tion on the memory of individuals who had been in post 
for some years. For although some countries now have 
their projects on a database, little information may be 
recorded beyond the title, date, type and total budget of 
the project. 

Yet there may be fewer of these individuals in the 
future, who can remember what went on before, 
because of changes in the way many European countries 
are currently organising aid delivery. This is sometimes 
because of over-frequent internal changes, but is also 
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increasingly structural. In the case of Finland, the fusing 
of the diplomatic and Co-operation streams in DIDC, 
and the alternation of individuals between one kind of 
job and another, may spell the end of institutional 
memory. The Netherlands is currently experimenting 
with the decentralisation of project cycle management 
in its entirety to its embassies. This model may succeed 
in the short run, while there are still individuals who 
can remember the old structure, and make the new 
work on that basis. But in due course there is a risk that 
programme coherence and mechanisms for institutional 
learning may weaken. 

10.4 Effective aid delivery and donor 
collaboration 

There are a variety of practical aid delivery issues which 
currently present obstacles to effective donor collabora­
tion. While country variation in choice of Ministry for 
forestry aid delivery does not present any difficulty, 
other choices require more adaptability. Projects funded 
by several donors often find that the heterogeneous 
payment schedules, reporting timetables and formats of 
different donors present them with time-consuming 
management tasks. It was railway timetables in the 
nineteenth century which provoked the need for 
governments to standardise time-zones rather than 
leaving every village to set its own time by the sun. 
Harmonisation of some quite minor details could 
greatly smooth the path of donor collaboration. 

10.5 Finding a way for larger and smaller 
donors to work together 

Looking at the country chapters, it is clear that the 
funding of tropical forestry has tended to be for the 
wealthier donors, for those with strong previous 
experience, or for those with strong forest industries 
inside their own countries. Yet several countries with 
smaller means and less experience would like to take 
more part in forestry initiatives - responding in part to 
the interests of the general public in their countries -
and would welcome and benefit from the co-funding of 
projects with larger donors. Such arrangements would 
make particular sense in countries where both parties 
already have some comparative advantage - such as 
language, or strong colonial experience in the case of 
the smaller donor, and strong recent tropical forestry 
experience in the case of the larger. Donor comple­
mentarity and coordination would improve greatly 
from such initiatives. 

1 0.6 The evolving relationship between 
forestry and environment 

The most important problem of all for donors is how to 
manage the as yet imperfect marriage between forestry 
and environment policy, and aid delivery. It is only six 
years since the Rio conference, and both theory and 
practice are still evolving. For the moment, the 
environment is the dominant partner, and donor 
funding has been pulled in the direction of conservation, 
to the potential detriment of livelihood and sustainable 
use issues in forestry. It is interesting to wonder whether 
the balance would have been the same if a forestry 
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convention had been signed at the same time as the 
Biodiversity and Climate Change Conventions. 

Several countries in our sample currently keep 
tropical forestry issues, as of old, in the Ministry which 
deals with tropical agriculture. But at the same time the 
Ministry of the Environment deals with both domestic 
and tropical environmental issues, inevitably including 
conservation aspects of tropical forests. In the case of 
EC aid there are currently parallel forestry and 
environment budget lines. 

It is clear that many of the issues currently being dealt 
with in this way will have to be harmonised in due 
course. Meanwhile, their separate handling in the aid 
mechanisms of the north sends the wrong signals to the 
developing country partners with whom they work -
where separate ministries and structures have in many 
cases also been established. 

Where the forestry sector might have been leading 
the way forward, it has too often been fighting a 
rearguard action. It has been slow to exploit its 
importance to changing values in society, even though 
it has accepted a constantly increasing role for local 
people, NGOs and other stakeholders. The need now is 
for dynamism and flexibility in both research and field 
practice, to utilise new environmental awareness in 
forestry, and to tackle issues in a more integrated and 
international way. The important opportunities for 
synthesis still lie ahead. 
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ANNEX 1 

Table A i: Main countries funded by European Member States in Africa, 1995 

(Sources : (i) OECD 1996, Table 42 'Major recipients of Individual DAC Members' Aid, 1994-95' Statistical Annex pps A70-A84; (ii) Data in Sourcebook Chapters) 
Donor Concentration or Programme countries 

• Other countries mentioned in the OECD top 1 5 aid recipients for each donor and in country chapter 
(*) Countries mentioned in the OECD top 15 aid recipients for each donor, but not in country chapter 

Country status by per capita income (from OECD 1996, Statistical Annex p.A 1 01) 
+ Least Developed Countries- per capita GNP < $675 in 1992 
+ + Lower Middle Income Countries- per capita GNP $676-$2 695 in 1992 
+ + + Upper Middle Income countries- per capita GNP $2 696-8 355 in 1992 



ANNEX 1 • 27 

Table A ii: Main countries funded by European Member States in the Mediterranean and Middle East, 1995 

(Sources :(i) OECD 1996, Table 42 'Major recipients of Individual DAC Members' Aid, 1994-95' Statistical Annex pps A70-A84;(ii) Data in Sourcebook Chapters) 
** Donor Concentration or Programme countries 
* Other countries mentioned in the OECD top 15 aid recipients for each donor and in country chapter 
(*) Countries mentioned in the OECD top 15 aid recipients for each donor, but not in country chapter 

Country status by per capita income (from OECD 1996, Statistical Annex p.A 101) 
+ Least Developed Countries- per capita GNP < $675 in 1992 
+ + Lower Middle Income Countries- per capita GNP $676-$2 695 in 1992 
+ + + Upper Middle Income countries- per capita GNP $2 696-8 355 in 1992 

Table A iii: Main countries funded by European Member States in Asia, 1995 

(Sources :(i) OECD 1996, Table 42 'Major recipients of Individual DAC Members' Aid, 1994-95' Statistical Annex pps A70-A84;(ii) Data in Sourcebook Chapters) 
** Donor Concentration or Programme countries 
* Other countries mentioned in the OECD top 15 aid recipients for each donor and in country chapter 
(*) Countries mentioned in the OECD top 15 aid recipients for each donor, but not in country chapter 

Country status by per capita income (from OECD 1996, Statistical Annex p.A 101) 
+ Least Developed Countries- per capita GNP < $675 in 1992 
+ + Lower Middle Income Countries- per capita GNP $676-$2 695 in 1992 
+ + + Upper Middle Income countries- per capita GNP $2 696-8 355 in 1992 
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Table A iv: Main Countries funded by Member States. in Latin America and the Caribbean, 1995 

(Sources:(i) OECD 1996, Table 42 'Major recipients of Individual DAC Members' Aid, 1994-95' Statistical Annex pps A70-A84;(ii) Data in Sourcebook Chapters) 
**Donor Concentration or Programme countries 
* Other countries mentioned in the OECD top 15 aid recipients for each donor and in country chapter 
(*)Countries mentioned in the OECD top 15 aid recipients for each donor, but not in country chapter 

Country status by per capita income (from OECD 1996, Statistical Annex p.A 101) 
• Least Developed Countries- per capita GNP < $675 in 1992 
• • Lower Middle Income Countries- per capita GNP $676-$2 695 in 1992 
• • • Upper Middle Income countries- per capita GNP $2 696-8 355 in 1992 
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1. INTRODUCTION 

1.1 The structure of the European Union 
European Community (EC) aid to tropical forestry, like 
all forms of EC development assistance, is strongly 
influenced by the structure of the European Union and 
by its political and financial procedures. Before discuss­
ing the manner in which tropical forestry aid is 
managed within the various Directorates-General, we 
need to review the structure and procedures of the 
Union and consider the ways in which these features 
affect the definition and administration of aid policy. 

The centre of power in the EU is the Council of the 
European Union. This consists of representatives of the 
European Member States and the Commission, the 
actual attendance varying according to the issue under 
debate. The highest-level body is the Council of the 
Heads of Government which meets twice yearly and 
formally approves the policies of the Union. The 
Council also meets periodically at Ministerial level. 
For example, the General Affairs Council deals with 
external affairs and is attended by the Foreign Ministers 
of the Member States, while Ecofin is attended by the 
Ministers of Finance (Bright, 1995: Chapter 2). 

The European Commission is the executive body, and 
is responsible for the drafting of legislation and 
resolutions in all areas, including development co­
operation, as well as the implementation of the major 
treaty obligations, and the administration of the annual 
budgets and funds. The European Parliament influences 
policy, supervises the work of the Commission, votes on 
its proposals, adopts the annual budgets and monitors, 
at a relatively high level, the management of EU policies. 

The normal work of the Commission is managed by 
Directorates-General- effectively, ministries- of which 
there are currently twenty-four. Development co­
operation is largely in the hands of DG IB (created in 
September, 1995, as an amalgam of four established 
DG I directorates, and dealing with 'External relations 
and co-operation with Southern Mediterranean coun­
tries, the Near and Middle East, Latin America, South 
Asia and South East Asia') and DG VIII ('Development, 
external relations and co-operation with ACP countries, 
the Lome Convention'). However, the activities of other 
Directorates-General may have relevance to develop­
ment issues (for example, the EC's sizeable food aid 
budget is partly managed by DG VI [Agriculture]). 

Structures for aid to tropical forestry 
Aid to tropical forestry does not fall squarely within any 
single Directorate-General, and is covered by several as 
part of their wider expertise. The relevant Directorates­
General are: 
DG IB External Relations (External relations and co­

operation with Southern Mediterranean 
countries, the Near and Middle East, Latin 
America, South/SE Asia) 

DG III Internal Markets and Industrial Affairs (Tim­
ber trade issues) 

DG V Employment, Industrial Relations and Social 
Affairs 

DG VI Agriculture (European agricultural policy) 
DG VIII Development (Development, external rela­

tions and co-operation with ACP countries, 
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the Lome Convention) 
DG XI Environment, Nuclear Security and Civil 

Protection 
DG XII Science, Research and Development 
DG XVI Regional Policy 

In the case of DG IB and DG VIII, tropical forest 
activities form part of the wider programme of 
development co-operation; in the case of DGs V, VI 
and XVI, involvement is limited to tropical forestry 
activities pertaining to the overseas departments of 
European Member States, particularly French Guiana. 
Since 1983, DGXII has had a fund specially allocated to 
science and technology development in the developing 
countries. 

1.2 EU Legislation and associated 
terminology 

The legislation of the Union is promoted through a 
series of legal instruments, including regulations, 
directives, opinions, communications, resolutions and 
recommendations. Each of these has a different level of 
legal authority, and is appropriate to a particular stage 
in the legislative process (see Box 1). 

2. OVERVIEW OF DEVELOPMENT 
POLICY IN THE EUROPEAN 
UNION 

A variety of institutions within the Union play a role in 
the formulation of policies on development co-opera­
tion. The European Council issues general directives on 
development co-operation policies. Decisions on the 
implementation of such policies are taken by the 
Council of Development Ministers. Other Councils -
for example, the General Affairs Council - may also be 
involved in relevant instances. 

Only since the Maastricht Treaty of European Union 
(1992) has the development policy of the Union been 
formally defined. The objectives of the Maastricht 
Treaty relating to developing countries are to foster: 

• sustainable economic and social development of 
the developing countries and of the most 
disadvantaged; 

• the smooth and gradual integration of developing 
countries in the world economy; 

• a campaign against poverty in the developing 
countries (Article 130u). 

It is a formal requirement for the EU to take account of 
these principles in forming all policies which are likely 
to affect developing countries. The Maastricht Treaty 
provides the primary policy tool by which the political 
goal of sustainable development can be addressed by the 
Union. Integration of environmental action became a 
legal obligation under the Treaty, which specifies that: 

Community Policy on environment shall contribute 
to ... promoting measures at international level to 
deal with regional or worldwide environmental 
problems ... (Article 130r1). Environmental protec­
tion requirements must be integrated into the defini­
tion and implementation of other Community 
policies (Article 130r2). 

• 
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Separate components of the development co-operation 
programme may also have their own distinct policy 
frameworks, as is the case with tropical forestry. 

Since Maastricht, it has been a formal requirement 
that the Union and its Member States seek comple­
mentarity in the execution of their aid policies. The 
meaning of complementarity is a matter of controversy, 
with some actors interpreting it to mean that the 
Commission should not attempt to intervene where 
Member States are already competent, others that the 
Commission should adopt a coordination role, while 
yet others advocate that Commission intervention 
should be confined to new areas of development aid 
such as the environment (Hewitt, 1994, p.20). 

3. THE EVOLUTION OF EC 
TROPICAL FORESTRY AID 

3.1 Forms of financial aid 
External relations between the Commission and its 
developing country partners are supported with a 
variety of forms of financial aid, but especially: 

• The budget lines voted by the Parliament and 
administered by the directorates general, particu-

lady, in the context of tropical forestry aid, DG IB 
and DG VIII. 

• Funds allocated to the European Development 
Fund (EDF) under the provisions of successive 
Lome Conventions. The Lome Convention is the 
major multilateral co-operation agreement be­
tween the EU and the developing world, and its 
co-signatories are seventy-one countries in the 
Africa, Caribbean and Pacific (ACP) regions. EDF 
funding commitments made under the respective 
Lome Conventions are the mainstay of co-opera­
tion with ACP countries. Included in the EDF 
arrangements are 'programmable' and 'non­
programmable' aid. The former refers to recipient 
country entitlements, as laid down in the national 
and regional indicative programmes, and the latter 
discretionary payments by the Commission on a 
case-by-case basis (Koning, 1997:130). Non-pro­
grammable aid includes ST ABEX (intended to 
stabilise the incomes of developing countries from 
key primary export commodities) and SYSMIN 
(which performs a similar role for minerals), as 
well as emergency aid, aid to refugees, interest rate 
subsidies and risk capital. About one-third of all 
EC development funds pass through the EDF. The 
goal of the Lome Convention is to promote the 
economic, cultural and social development of ACP 
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3.2 

states. Each successive Lome Agreement is given a 
particular thematic and sectoral emphasis. Among 
the objectives of the current Lome agreement 
(Lome IVbis, 1995-2000) is protection of the 
environment. 

Early efforts to develop strategic 
thinking 

Expenditure on tropical forestry activities within the 
European Union, as within the development community 
in general, has been strongly influenced by international 
concerns and events. 

The first attempts to develop thinking on forestry 
issues in a coordinated way arose out of the discussions 
leading to the publication, in 1979, of a draft document 
'Forest Policy in the European Community' (Bulletin of 
the European Communities Supplement 3/79). While 
this document did not lead to the formulation of an EC 
Forest Policy Resolution, as had been the original 
intention (Germany and the UK are said to have 
blocked the attempt, for fear that this might lead to a 
common forestry policy parallel to the Common 
Agricultural Policy [CAP] and infringe national sover­
eignty over forestry matters), it was agreed that a set of 
common principles and objectives would form part of 
each Member State's national policy. 

In the late 1970s, the EDF was the major source of 
funding for tropical forestry interventions, which were 
thus confined largely to members of the ACP group, 
through the channel of DG VIII. The EDF is, however, 
conditioned by its corresponding Convention, which 
meant that forestry initiatives tended to be components 
of programmes focusing on other concerns such as 
agriculture, trade or infrastructure, rather than a central 
focus of interest. This parallelled the situation in DG VI, 
in which forestry was dealt with as a sub-directorate of 
Agriculture, an institutional basis which followed the 
standard country-level model m the European 
Community. 

In the 1980s, interest in tropical forestry was initiated 
by a number of Member States, particularly Germany. 
This interest can be related to events on the interna­
tional scene, most notably the influential 1978 World 
Forestry Conference in Jakarta. In the 1980s, the 
European Community and its Member States were 
heavily involved in the development and support of two 
major international forestry initiatives: the Interna­
tional Tropical Timber Agreement (ITT A) and the 
Tropical Forestry Action Programme (TFAP).1 By 1986, 
pressure within the Community for the recognition of 
forestry concerns was such as to encourage the 
formation of a forum of interested professionals within 
DGs I, VI, and VIII aiming to establish a 'general 
forestry framework'. In 1989, a set of tropical forestry 

1. The EC mandate to intervene on international trade matters is 
enshrined in the Treaty of Rome, Article 115 of which states: 
'Member States shall, in respect of all matters of particular 
interest to the common market, proceed within the framework 
of international organisations of an economic character only by 
common action'. This provision has allowed the Community to 
become a signatory to the International Tropical Timber 
Agreement (Decision 424 of 1985), where it is represented by 
the Commission, acting alongside the Member States (WWF, 
1991:7). 

sector guidelines was drawn up by the DG VIII Forestry 
Advisor, and this led to the publication of an 
'Introductory Guide to Tropical Forestry Project 
Preparation'; this was not, however, widely distributed 
until 1992. 

3.3 Pre-UNCED tropical forestry aid 
strategy development in the EC 

Starting in the mid-1980s, a series of Communications, 
Resolutions and Reports began to be issued by the 
Council and Commission, signalling growing concern 
within the Community about the environment, and the 
growing political importance of tropical forestry issues. 
The main policy and legislative landmarks are \J:iscussed 
below and summarised in Table 1. 

Council Communication, 1986: 'Conservation des 
ressources naturelles et sur Ia lutte contre Ia 
desertification en Afrique' 

This Communication called for increased aid 
delivery for tropical forest activities in the African 
region. 

Commission Communication, 1988: 'Community 
Strategy and Action Programme for the Forestry 
Sector related primarily to actions to be taken in 
Member States' (COM 88/255) 

This Communication primarily focused on Eur­
opean forests but referred to 'technical and financial 
support of the Community for forestry projects in 
developing countries, which should be integrated into 
development programmes in a manner consistent 
with the principles and aims of the Community 
action programme for the conservation and rational 
utilisation of natural resources'. 

Council Resolution, 1989: 'The Greenhouse Effect' 
(COM89/C 264/ 1.3) 

This Resolution 'underlined the global dimension 
of the greenhouse effect and the need for the 
Community and the Member States to play their full 
part in the definition and implementation of a global 
response to the problem'. 

Commission Communication of 1989: 'The Conser­
vation of Tropical Forests: the role of the Commu­
nity' (COM (89) 410) 

This was the first major initiative in the specific 
area of tropical forests, and signalled the Commis­
sion's willingness to adopt a role in tropical forest 
conservation and management, independent of the 
activities of its Member States. A comprehensive 
document of 21 pages, the Communication outlined 
the context, causes, and consequences of deforesta­
tion, reviewed past and current efforts to combat 
deforestation, suggested remedies to improve the 
situation of tropical forests, and set out elements of 
a Community conservation strategy, including issues 
of development aid/co-operation, the timber trade, 
debt relief and the environment, and research/devel­
opment. It recognised the urgency of the deforesta­
tion crisis, and stated that 'the deforestation crisis is 
complex and not susceptible to simplified solutions. 
Actions must be taken simultaneously on many 

I 



34 • COMMON ELEMENTS OF EC TROPICAL FORESTRY AID 

Table 1: Main landmarks in the development of tropical forestry strategy development in the European Commission 

fronts'. It spoke in favour of investment and technical 
assistance priorities (in line with the TFAP project 
criteria), and of the need for institutional and fiscal 
reform within the forestry sector. FAO (through the 
TFAP) and the International Tropical Timber Orga­
nisation were identified as lead agencies in the 
implementation of a coordinated strategy at interna­
tional level. 

The Communication also stated that investment 
and technical assistance priorities should be 'forestry 
in land use', forest-based industrial development, 
fuelwood and energy, conservation of tropical forest 
ecosystems, and strengthening institutions. Under 
economic policies and national development plan­
ning, priority areas were listed as land reform, 
correcting inappropriate policy incentives both with­
in and outside the forestry sector, aid agency 
investment (including the development of strict policy 
guidelines) and integrating forest resource manage­
ment into national development planning. Under 
research, the priorities were to raise the generally low 
political and financial support for forestry research, 
to focus on 'rural forestry needs and alleviate rural 
poverty', and to ensure more effective integration of 
forestry and agricultural research. 

A later (1992) Communication adopted by the 
Commission from DG 1 K2 (External Relations) 
refers to the 1989 Communication as the starting 
point for discussions and actions to protect tropical 
forests. To the regret of the environmental lobby, 
however, the Communication failed to acknowledge 
the limitations of the TFAP, did not address issues 
relating to the impact of European trade and 
industrial policies on tropical forest management, 
and made little reference to the rights of indigenous 
and forest-dependent populations (WWF, 1991:4). 

Council Resolution, 1990: 'Tropical Forests: devel­
opment aspects' (COM[89] 410-final) 

This Council Resolution ratified the Commission 
Communication of 1989, and endorsed the need for a 
'world-wide coordinated strategy for tropical forest 
resources', stating that 'the success of this strategy 
requires increased attention to forestry aid policies in 
the donor countries, appropriate policies and institu­
tions in developing countries, and better coordination 
and additional resources from all donors'. The 
Resolution noted the need to double the level of 
donor resources devoted to forestry, and listed ten 
strategic priorities: 

• responsibility for tropical forests to rest at the 
national level, but donors should help countries 
develop their institutional capacity to engage in 
conservation strategies; 

• the TF AP was to be the basic framework for 
action; 

• support to countries adopting appropriate con­
servation policies, especially concerning land use 
policies, and legal, fiscal and institutional 
measures; 

• coherence and coordination of activities of the 
Member States and the EC; 

• geographical allocation of forestry aid to be 
coordinated through the TF AP mechanism, with 
priority to the poorest countries; 

• thematic support to be in accordance with TF AP 
priorities, especially concerning the integration 
of forestry activities with agriculture, fuelwood 
supply, protective reserves, sustainable forest 
management (SFM), and capacity building; 

• the importance of the social dimension of 
forestry, especially indigenous forest peoples; 

• involvement of NGOs in the TFAP process; 



THE EVOLUTION OF EC TROPICAL FORESTRY AID • 35 

• support to ITIO objectives, especially as con­
tained in the ITTO 'Guidelines for the Sustain­
able Management of Natural Tropical Forests'; 

• forestry research, especially in areas of SFM, 
non-timber forest products, biodiversity, valua­
tion of environmental services, and reinforcing 
research capacities of developing countries. 

While these documents indicate the potential role of 
the EC and some priority areas, they stop short of an 
operational strategy concerned with criteria for 
country selection, project type, etc. Although some 
of the 'new' dimensions appear (for example, the 
social dimensions, forest valuation and the potential 
of the timber trade), much faith was placed in the 
TF AP process in prioritising projects and countries, 
and forestry was still largely seen as part of a wider 
rural development or land use planning process. 

A study of tropical forestry activities in the 
Commission by International Forest Science Con­
sultancy (IFSC) in 1991 commented on the generally 
ad hoc response in the DGs to requests for assistance. 
It noted: 

It could be assumed from this that the projects 
which have been implemented have represented, to 
some extent, the priorities of the recipient coun­
tries. However, closer investigation suggests that 
this may not be the case, and that projects have 
been selected not for their relevance to the forestry 
sector, but for their relevance to other sectors 
which have been of priority to the Commission, 
such as agriculture or rural development'. (IFSC, 
1991:17- italics in original). 

A view that there was an 'absence of a clearly detailed 
policy and strategy', and that 'much of the assistance 
took the form of forestry components within inte­
grated rural development projects without being truly 
integrated in the activities- often being limited to the 
establishment of tree nurseries' (p.3) was put forward 
in the DG VIII Tropical Forestry Work Plan drawn 
up in 1991 by two national expert tropical foresters 
seconded to the Commission (Kriek and Robbins, 
1991:3). They recommended a series of measures 
aiming to strengthen the planning, implementation, 
training and research capacity of the tropical forestry 
programme, relating to ACP collaboration, interna­
tional action (TFAP, FAO, ITTO, FAO, UNCED), 
organisation of the Commission (inter-service co­
operation) and specialist staffing. 

Dublin European Heads of State (Council) Summit, 
1990 

The Dublin summit advocated the implementation 
of a Community action programme in favour of 
tropical forests and called for the Commission to 
elaborate proposals with regard to tropical forests, 
particularly in the Amazon region. The German 
Government, in particular, was instrumental both in 
Dublin in June and at the Houston G7 summit the 
following month, in pushing for common action on 
tropical forests, as a result of which the World Bank, 
in close co-operation with the EC, prepared a major 
pilot project in Brazil (the Brazil Pilot Programme). 
The extent of Germany's concern was reflected in the 

production of a 1,000-page report by the Bundestag 
(Enquete-Kommission, 1990) on the state of tropical 
forests. 

Parliament Resolutions, 1991 
In 1991, the European Parliament adopted a 

· number of resolutions on tropical forestry, which 
led to the creation of a tropical forestry budget line 
(see section 3.4). 

1 Commission Working Paper, 1992: ffi/205/96 
Prepared for the UN Conference on the Environ­

ment and Development (UNCED) in Rio de Janeiro, 
this commented that 'the central role of tropical 
forests in the sustainable development strategy gave 
new impetus to co-operation in the [tropical forestry] 
field' (p.1). 

3.4 Post-UNCED tropical forestry aid 
strategy development in the EC 

Lisbon European Heads of State Summit, 1992 
The Council of European Heads of State held in 

Lisbon in 1992, shortly after the Rio de Janeiro 
Conference, confirmed the Community's commit­
ment to carry out the decisions of UNCED, including 
the integration of Agenda 21 and the (non-legally 
binding) statement of Forest Principles into appro­
priate policies of the Community and its Member 
States, as a matter of urgency. In particular, the 
UNCED Conference stimulated the consultative 
process which led to the ultimate allocation of a 
specific tropical forestry budget line. 

The Community and its Member States adopted 
the UNCED Forest Principles, the Agenda 21 action 
plan and the Conventions on Biodiversity and 
Climate Change. According to the agreed principle 
of shared but differentiated responsibilities, they were 
committed not only to implement the UNCED 
agreement themselves, but also to provide financial 
and technical assistance to developing countries to 
help them to fulfill their own UNCED commitments. 

Memorandum to the Commission, 1992, 'Tropical 
forests: measures in the fields of trade, co-operation 
and the promotion of investment and technology' 
{Ade V /191 en) 

This was an internal document of the Commission. 
It made reference to the 1990 Dublin European 
Council and noted (p.2) that 'a considerable body of 
European public opinion is urging the Community to 
take action to protect the tropical forests. Parliament 
has issued numerous reports and resolutions calling 
for more active involvement on the part of the 
Community'. This Communication marked an in­
creasing emphasis on the use of the timber trade and 
new technology (such as geographic information 
systems and improved logging/processing methods) 
to 'send a positive signal' to encourage sustainable 
management. The idea was mooted in the Memor­
andum of using the Generalised System of Preferences 
to encourage sustainable management (ie. preferen­
tial tariffs for 'progressive' countries). It proposed the 
allocation of funds from the new tropical forests 

• 
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budget line to promote conservation of extstmg 
tropical forests (protected area management, fire 
prevention, etc.), improved logging techniques, sus­
tainable farming methods, and improved forest 
management. Overall, the Communication indicated 
something of a shift away from social and rural 
development forestry towards a more sectorally 
specific approach oriented to sustainable manage­
ment of closed forest areas. 

The Fifth Environmental Action Plan, 1993: 'To­
wards Sustainability' 

This was an EC-wide Environmental Action Plan, 
prepared by the 'global environment' unit in DG XI. 
While tropical forests are mentioned several times, 
they are not a major focus of the document. 

Commission Communication, 1993: 'Proposal for a 
Council Regulation (EEC) on Operations to Promote 
Tropical Forests' (COM(93)53) 

In January 1993, a 'Seminar on European Com­
munity Actions in favour of Tropical Forests' was 
held in Brussels to decide on the follow-up to the Rio 
Conference, to develop an EC tropical forest strategy, 
and to improve operational aspects of EC activities. 
Based on this Seminar and the earlier Commission 
Communication of 1989 and the Council Resolution 
of 1990, this Communication was presented to the 
European Council and Parliament. It proposed five 
main priority areas: 

• conservation of forests supported by analysis of 
the underlying causes of deforestation and 
measures to address them; 

• sustainable management of forests for the 
production of timber and other products; 

• involvement of local populations, including 
forest dwellers, in planning and implementation; 

• capacity building to address the needs for 
training, legislation and institutional strengthen­
ing in support of forest conservation; 

• strategic, adaptive and policy research in support 
of the above actions. 

The coordinating roles of TFAP and ITTO were again 
mentioned. 

Internal report on forestry, 1994: 'Draft Report on 
Forestry From the European Community to the 
Commission on Sustainable Development Interna­
tional Co-operation' (VDIIA/1/GD/D(94)10.16CSD 
Report) 

Written by the DG VIII forestry adviser, this report 
stated that the Commission should follow two main 
objectives: 

• to strengthen the foundations of sustainable 
development through building capacity to create 
an enabling framework for actors and processes 
involved in the forestry sector, through actively 
integrating the forestry issue into EU co-opera­
tion policy, and by accelerating on-going discus­
sions at the international level; 

• to make substantial investments in the forestry 
sector to achieve sustainable forest management, 
contribute to biodiversity conservation, fight 

climate change and create forest resources, 
improve timber marketing and trade from 
sustainable resources (especially through certifi­
cation), and to alleviate the conditions of 
indigenous and other forest-dependent peoples. 

The report goes on to discuss in greater detail several 
principles regarded as central to EU policy including 
the tracing and certification of timber, trade prefer­
ences for sustainable sources of timber, efficient 
harvesting and processing of timber, economic 
diversification, support for indigenous peoples and 
local communities, institutional strengthening, capa­
city building and research. It also indicates the shift to 
a more sector-specific focus, and can be s~en as a 
forerunner of the 1996 Guidelines for Forest Sector 
Co-operation (see below). 

Council Regulation, 1995: 'Operations to Promote 
Tropical Forests' (Regulation No. 3062/95} 

The Council's response to the 1993 Communica­
tion arrived in December 1995, and provided a legal 
basis for the Tropical Forests budget line (see below}. 
Article 2 laid down criteria for the definition of key 
terms, such as 'tropical forests' (to include all forests 
between the 30 degree latitudes, dry and secondary 
forests, as well as tropical moist forests}, 'conserva­
tion', 'forest peoples', 'sustainable management' and 
'sustainable development'. The Regulation supported 
strategic country-level processes, giving priority to 
eight main lines of action to promote forest 
management: 

• conservation and renewal of primary forest; 
• sustainable forest management 'but excluding 

commercial logging operations in primary tropi­
cal forests, except those which are community­
based'; 

• timber certification systems; 
• provision of information to forest people to 

facilitate their participation; 
• capacity building for local forest management 

and legislation; 
• strategic and adaptive research for conservation 

and sustainable management; 
• development of buffer zones; 
• development and implementation of forest man-

agement plans. 

The need for special emphasis on environmental 
services (ranging from local watershed protection to 
global effects such as climate change and loss of 
biodiversity} was also established in the Regulation. 
Again, the shift towards natural forest management 
and conservation was marked, and support for 
plantations and industrial forestry was explicitly 
excluded. From about 1992, this shift in the 
environment and development debate to a prioritisa­
tion within the forest sector and an increasing 
emphasis on tropical forests was partly the result of 
the influence of concerned MEPs, pressures from 
Member States (especially Germany and the Nether­
lands), and the growing influence of the European 
Tropical Forestry Advisers' Group (ETFAG). 



4. THE EVOLUTION OF FINANCING INSTRUMENTS IN TROPICAL FORESTRY AID • 37 

Lome IV bis, 1995 
Lome IV bis was signed in 1995 and gave formal 

recognition to the threat of deforestation, as well as 
to the need for joint intergovernmental action. 
Environmental objectives were listed as basic aims 
to be pursued by the ACP states with Community 
support. The Convention carried a requirement that 
all future projects should be subject to an environ­
mental assessment. It also included an important new 
Protocol (Protocol 10) on the sustainable manage­
ment of forest resources, similar to those laid down in 
the 1995 regulation. 

Guidelines for Forest Sector Development Co­
operation, 1996 

This three-volume set of publications, known in the 
Commission as the 'Manual', was coordinated by 
DG VIII and drafted by PARTICP GmbH, a German 
consultancy firm, based on discussions with a range 
of experts from different Member States including 
L TS International, SGS Forestry and the International 
Institute for Environment and Development (UK), 
Indufor Oy and Finnish Training Partners (FTP) 
International (Finland) and CIRAD-Foret (France), as 
well as workshops in the EU, a widely distributed 
questionnaire, inputs from ETFAG and an informal 
steering group of forestry experts in the EC. For a 
discussion of the Guidelines see DG VIII Chapter, 
Section 3.5. 

Table 2: Major EU funding sources for tropical forestry 

4. THE EVOLUTION OF FINANCING 
INSTRUMENTS IN TROPICAL 
FORESTRY AID 

The creation of a new budget line in 1982, 'Ecology in 
Developing Countries' (Article 946), provided one of 
the earliest sources of funds for tropical forests, through 
a budget line managed by DG VIIIIDG I. Actions on 
tropical forests were also funded under the 'Anti­
desertification' budget line (Article 958). 

Growing recognition of the environmental crisis and 
of the importance of tropical forests in environmental 
management led to the creation of two important 
budget lines in the early 1990s. In 199011,1 B?-5040 
'Environment in Developing Countries' replaced Article 
946, and was placed under the joint management of 
DG I and DG VIII. While not dedicated solely to the 
forestry sector, this budget line was an important source 
of finance for forestry projects until the development of 
the Tropical Forests budget line. In 1996, it was 
renumbered as B?-6200 

In 1991, the sectorally specific budget line B?-5041 
'Operations to Promote Tropical Forests' was opened 
with a budget of ECU 2 m., again under the joint 
management of DG I and DG VIII. In 1992, an annual 
allocation of ECU 50 m. was assigned to it and in 1996 
it was renamed 'Actions in Favour of Tropical Forests' 
and renumbered as B?-6201. Creation of this budget 
line (which owed much to the influence of the European 
Parliament) was the most significant event in the 
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Table 3: Forestry Aid by Directorate-General1992-6 and as a Percentage of EC Aid to Tropical Regionsa 1992-5 
(ECU m. committed) 

Forestry aid 

DG 1Bb 60.7 53.2 84.5 73.5 29.5 

DGVIIIC 44.3 22.3 20.8 17.7 33.7 

DGXIb 0.72 1.2 1.06 1.08 0.6 

DGXIIC 3.67 3.72 5.41 1.41 4.22 

Total forestry aid 109.4 80.4 111.87 93 .7 68.0 

Total EC Aid to Tropical Regionsd 4025 3956 4672 4207 n/a 

Forestry Aid as% Total Aid 2.7 2.0 2.4 2.2 n/a 

a) Comprises aid commitments to ACP countries, South Africa, Asia and Latin America, and excluding the Middle East. 
b) Source : data presented in this Sourcebook. 
c) Planistat, 1996 
d) Cox and Koning, 1997 

evolution of tropical forest actlvltles and signalled a 
clear recognition by the Union of the centrality of 
tropical forests in both conservation and development. 

Another very important budget line for tropical 
forestry activities has been the geographically-based 
'Aid and co-operation with Asian developing countries' 
(B7-3000), and to a much lesser extent 'Aid and co­
operation with Latin American developing countries' 
(B7-3010). These budget lines are managed by the 
geographical directorates in DG lB. 

In DG XI, the annual budget line 'Contribution to 
international environmental activities (B7-8110) is 
thematically based, focusing on support for interna­
tional conventions and other fora, workshops, confer­
ences, publications and small field projects in four main 
areas of global environmental action: forestry, biodi­
versity, climate change and the ozone layer. 

Funding under the research budget line of DG XII 
operates rather differently from the other budget lines. 
DG XII funds are made available periodically under 
'frameworks'. Under the present (4th.) framework 
(1994-8), support for tropical forestry is potentially 
available under the sub-rubric INCO-DC ['Scientific 
and Technological Co-operation with Developing 
Countries' (DC) of the rubric 'Co-operation withThird 
Countries and International Organisations' (INCO)]. 
There is, however, no budget earmarked for tropical 
forestry projects which must compete with other 
projects in the agriculture/natural resources sector. 

Funds for tropical forestry projects may also be made 
available through the National and Regional Indicative 
Programmes of the various phases of the European 
Development Fund. 

The tropical forestry aid commitments of the four 
main Directorate-Generals involved in forestry aid are 
presented in Table 3 for the period 1992-6, as well as 
the estimated total EC aid commitments to tropical 
regions (excluding the Middle East). During the 1992-5 
period, forestry aid varied between 2.0% and 2.7% of 
total aid commitments. For the period 1976-90, the 
average annual tropical forestry expenditure was ECU 
33 m., also about 2% of total EC aid (IFSC, 1991). 
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ACRONYMS 
ACP 
CAP 
CIRAD-Foret 

DG 
EC 
EDF 
EIB 
ETFAG 
EU 
FAO 

African, Caribbean and Pacific 
Common Agricultural Policy 
Centre de Co-operation lnternationale en recherche 
agronomique pour le developpement (Forestry 
Department), France 
Directorate-General 
European Community 
European Development Fund 
European Investment Bank 
European Tropical Forest Advisory Group 
European Union 
Food and Agriculture Organization of the United 
Nations 



FPT 
GIS 
IFSC 
liED 

ITTA 
ITTO 
LTS 
NGO 
NTFP 
SFM 
SGS 
STD 
TFAP 
UNCED 

WWF 

Finnish Training Partners International, Finland 
Geographic Information System 
International Forest Science Consultancy 
International Institute for Environment and 
Development 
International Tropical Timber Agreement 
International Tropical Timber Organization 
L TS International, Edinburgh, UK 
Non-Governmental Organization 
non-timber forest product 
Sustainable Forest Management 
SGS Silviconsult, Oxford, UK 
Science and Technology for Development 
Tropical Forestry Action Programme 
United Nations Conference on Environment and 
Development 
World Wide Fund for Nature 

Note on currency: on 1 September, 1997, US$ 1 was 
equivalent to ECU 1.09. 
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1. EVOLUTION OF DG IB'S 
INVOLVEMENT IN TROPICAL 
FORESTRY 

1.1 Evolution and present structure of 
Directorate GeneraliS 

The evolution of DG IB's involvement in tropical 
forestry aid reflects both its short history and the 
relatively recent attention given by the EC to non-ACP 
countries- especially Latin America. Formerly, Unit 2 
of Directorate K ('North-South Relations') in DG I 
('External Economic Relations') dealt with the environ­
ment as well as economic relations with international 
organisations. The first tropical forestry activities in 
Asia and Latin America (ALA) were thus initiated in 
DG IK 2. Since 1993, DG I has been gradually 
subdivided into three Directorates General. In 1993, 
DG lA ('External Policy Relations') was established to 
deal specifically with Eastern Europe, and in September 
199 5, DG IB was created with the title 'External 
Relations: Southern Mediterranean, Middle and Near 
East, Latin America, South and South-East Asia and 
North South-Co-operation'. In 1996, DG I was itself 
renamed 'External Relations: commercial policy and 
relations with North America, the Far East, Australia 
and New Zealand', while DG 1A became 'External 
Relations: Europe and the new independent States, 
common foreign and security policy and external 
missions'. Thus there are now three distinct but related 
Directorates General, DG I, DG lA and DG IB, each 
with a series of Directorates. The new DG IB is an 
amalgam of four of the original DG I Directorates and 
the new Directorate E- Finance and Resources. 

Figure 1 presents the main Directorates (rather than a 
complete organogram) of DG IB , with the sections of 
most significance for forestry capitalised. Directorates 
A, Band Care geographically based, while Directorates 
D and E are thematically or 'horizontally' based. Under 
the Geographical Directorates B and C, the two 
Technical Units (B4 and C4), and some of the 
'Geographical Desks', especially Unit C3, are most 
important for forestry. The Technical Units, interacting 
with the country desk officers, manage the projects 
funded under the Asia and Latin America (ALA) budget 
lines 'Financial and Technical Co-operation with Asian 
developing countries' (B?-3000) and 'Financial and 
Technical Co-operation with Latin American develop­
ing countries' (B?-3010)- referred to here as the ALA 
or 'geographical' budget lines. Most of the comments 
about the geographical budget lines in this chapter refer 
to the South and South-East Asia Directorate , or Asia 
for short, given the relatively low level of forestry 
commitments under the Latin American budget line (see 
section 4.2). Unit D4, under the 'horizontal' Directorate 
of North-South Relations, manages the 'horizontal' 
budget lines 'Actions in favour of Tropical Forests' 
(B?-6201) and 'Environment in Developing Countries' 
(B?-6200). 

1. This excludes China, Japan, Korea, Hong Kong, Macao and 
Taiwan, which come under DG I Directorate F. 

1.2 Development of EC forestry interest in 
the AlA region 

Until the international initiatives of the late 1980s and 
early 1990s, non-ACP countries appeared to be of 
secondary importance for EC forestry aid. However, a 
shift in regional priorities occurred at the end of the 
1980s. For example, the June 1990 European Council 
meeting in Dublin mandated the Commission to draw 
up concrete proposals for the Amazon region. The 1990 
Council Resolution suggests an important shift in 
sectoral priorities for the ALA region: 'in its future 
consideration of co-operation with developing countries 
in Asia and Latin America, the Council feels that greater 
emphasis must be placed on the conservation ~f tropical 
forests. . . . The Council notes with interest the 
Commission's intention to propose a programme for 
forest conservation with eight Amazonian countries' 
(COM (89) 410 final, p.3). 

Furthermore, the February 1992 Council Regulation 
on aid and economic co-operation with Asia and Latin 
America stated that 'protection of the environment and 
natural resources, and sustainable development, shall be 
long-term priorities. 10%, being the average of the 
necessary financial resources of the aid, for the period 
1991 to 1995, shall be set aside for projects specifically 
aimed at protecting the environment, in particular 
tropical forests' (EEC 443/92, Art. 5, p.2). A revised 
version of this Regulation (also 1992) confirmed that 
protection of the environment and tropical forests 
should be regarded as a specific component in aid and 
economic co-operation, rather than being subsumed 
under the term 'rural development'. 

2. STRUCTURE OF AID DELIVERY 

2.1 Evolution and management of 
horizontal budget lines 

The first actions in favour of tropical forests were 
implemented and financed under budget line 946 
'Ecology in Developing Countries' created in 1982. 
This budget line was relatively small and, up to 1993, 
was co-managed by DG VIII (the main manager), DG I 
K2 and DG XI. DG I K2's role was principally at the 
project identification stage, with some participation in 
monitoring and evaluation. Many of the projects 
funded were pilot projects, environmental studies and 
actions to stimulate international dialogue. 

In 1990, budget line B?-5040 'Environment in 
Developing Countries' replaced budget line 946. Biodi­
versity conservation was the main priority, but it was 
the main source of finance for forestry projects until 
ECU 50 m. were put into the Tropical Forests budget 
line in 1992. In 1996, budget line B?-5040 became 
B?-6200, as shown in Table 1. 

The budget line entitled 'Operations to promote 
Tropical Forests' (B?-5041) was created in 1991 with 
ECU 2 m. assigned to it. At first it was still mainly 
managed by DG VIII. In April 1992, a further ECU 50 
m. was added, and thereafter ECU 50 m. a year was 
shared between the two DGs -a level to be continued at 
least until 1999. The legal basis of the Tropical Forests 
budget line was developed in the 1995 Council 
Regulation 'Operations to promote Tropical Forests' 
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Figure 1: Simplified organogram of DG 18 showing the sections with main responsibility for forestry aid 
(capitalised) 
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(see section 3.1.1), and in 1996 it was renamed 'Actions 
in favour of Tropical Forests' (B7-6201 ). This chapter 
deals only with DG IB's share (about 70%) of this 
budget line. 

There is an important distinction between large (over 
ECU 1m.) and small (less than ECU 1m.) projects, and 
between the appraisal and management stages of 
projects financed under B7-6201. All projects are 
appraised in Unit D4, but most large, predominantly 
public sector projects are managed by the Technical 

Units of the geographical Directorates. The two 
exceptions to this have been the projects coming under 
the umbrella Pilot Programme of Brazil (PPB) and the 
second phase of an indigenous peoples' project in 
Colombia2

: in these cases, D4 has assumed responsi­
bility for the whole project cycle. 

2. The Conseroaci6n de Ia Amazonia y de su Media Ambiente 
(Conservation of the Amazon and its Environment- COAMA) 
project. 



Small project applications, mainly from NGOs and 
universities, but sometimes also from public sector 
institutions, are both appraised and managed by Unit 
D4, unless they are for less than ECU 300,000, in which 
case they are sent to the NGO budget line in DG VIII. 
The Tropical Forests budget line is very flexible in terms 
of who can apply for funding: national or regional 
governments, Northern or Southern NGOs, universi­
ties, and regional organisations. 

The Tropical Forests budget line is managed princi­
pally by two technical officers, both foresters with 
tropical experience, located in Unit D4 under the Head 
of Sector (Environment and Tropical Forests), who is a 
lawyer/economist by training. A further technical 
officer, a lawyer, manages two timber trade and 
certification projects. This officer is responsible for 
DG IB's 'timber certification dossier'. 

2.2 Evolution and management of 
geographical budget lines 

Budget line 930 financed the main proportion of 
tropical forestry activities in ALA countries until 
1990, when it was sub-divided into B7-3000 'Financial 
and Technical Co-operation in Asian developing 
countries' and B7-3010 'Financial and Technical Co­
operation in Latin American developing countries', 
henceforth called the Asian and Latin American budget 
lines respectively (see Table 1). A review of EC forestry 
aid in 1991 (IFSC, 1991) identified 15 projects over the 
period 1976-90 from budget line 930 with a total 
commitment of ECU 72 m. (ECU 4.8 m. per project). As 
already mentioned (Section 1.2), it was stipulated in 
1992 that 10% of the total ALA budget should be 
committed to environmental projects. 

In the case of the ALA or geographical budget lines, a 
process of consultation and negotiation based on 
country strategy papers drawn up by the country desk 
officers may lead to the inclusion of forestry projects. 
The ALA country desk officers, grouped into Units 1 to 
3 of Directorates B and C, deal with political and trade 
issues, inform and respond to the European Parliament 
and other DGs, develop country strategy papers, and 
play a consultative role in the development of projects 
with the Technical Units and the national or regional (in 
the case of Central America) EU Delegations. 

The main role of the Technical Units in the 
geographical Directorates is to manage the project 
cycle, support the country desk officers, and organise 
major mid-term reviews and evaluations. The Asia 
Technical Unit has an officer assigned to forestry 
projects, a biologist by training, while the Head of 
Social Development in the Latin America Technical 
Unit is a forester. 

2.3 Aid delivery mechanisms 
In the case of 'small' projects coming under Unit D4, aid 
delivery is in the hands of the funded NGO, university 
or state/private sector institution. 'Large' projects, 
whether from the geographical or horizontal budget 
lines, are appraised and evaluated by one of five (one for 
each main region) European Consultancy consortia3

, 

3. The current five consortia of consultants are Euragri 2, ACE, 
EURONET, ARCA and CEPT 
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Table 1. Timeline showing evolution of DG IB budget 
lines 

Horizontal budget lines 

Article 946 87-5040 87-6200 
Ecology in Environment in Environment in 
Developing Developing Developing 
Countries Countries Countries 

87-5041 87-6201 
Operations in Actions in 
favour of favour of 
Tropical Forests Tropical Forests 

i 

I I I I I I I I I I I 

1582 I 
I I I I I 

I 1!90 
I I I I 

1996 

Article 930 87-3000 
Financial and Technical Financial and Technical 
Co-operation with latin Co-operation with Asian 
America and Asia Developing Countries 
Developing Countries 

I 
87-3010 
Financial and Technical 
Co-operation in Latin American 
Developing Countries 

Geographical budget lines 

which competed successfully to form part of the 
'Framework Agreement'. For a specific task, the 
consultancy group has to submit several candidate 
experts for the Commission technical officer to decide 
between them. The Framework Agreement system 
applies only to short-term Consultancy inputs. 

Large projects are normally implemented by Eur­
opean consultancy firms, selected following a public 
tendering process, in partnership with counterpart 
institutions (normally government departments). The 
main exceptions to this are the Brazil Pilot Programme 
(see section 6.1 ), and some of the Amerindian projects 
on the Tropical Forests budget line which are executed 
or coordinated by European NGOs such as Ibis of 
Denmark and the UK Gaia Foundation. 

Field project management is shared by an EC co­
director (recruited by the consultants) and a counterpart 
co-director. The co-directors share the decision-making 
and accountability to the executing agency (the counter­
part ministry), the project steering committee, and the 
EC (including the EU Delegation). Each large project 
has a steering committee, composed of EC and national 
representatives, which approves the annual work plans 
and budgets, and provides institutional coordination 
and overall direction. 

2.4 Ratio of forestry budget to in~house 
forestry advisory staff 

Three technical officers provide most of the forestry 
advice in DG IB, leaving aside the forester in the Latin 
American Technical Unit, given the (relatively) insig­
nificant level of 'forestry' aid from B7-3010 (see section 
4.1). Total committed funds to 'tropical forestry' from 
1992 to 1996 from the four budget lines to ALA 

• 
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countries amounted to about ECU 300 m., or ECU 60 
m. per year. Thus tropical forestry budgetary commit­
ments averaged about ECU 20 m. per annum per 
technical officer. It should be noted that one of the 
forestry technical officers in Unit D4 was a 'national 
expert' seconded to the Commission by the British aid 
programme. DG IB also uses voluntary stagiaires as a 
means of supplementing staff resources. 

3. STRATEGY AND POLICY 

3.1 Tropical Forests budget line 

3.1.1 Legal basis: the 1995 Council Regulation 
As described in Chapter 2 (section 3.4), the December 
1995 Council Regulation 'Operations to Promote 
Tropical Forests' (Regulation 3062/95) stemmed from 
a number of earlier communications, especially the 
1993 Commission Communication (to the European 
Council and Parliament) 'Proposal for a Council 
Regulation on Operations to Promote Tropical Forests' 
(COM (95) 53). Section 3.4 of Chapter 2 also describes 
the main contents of the Council Regulation, but in 
view of their fundamental importance for this chapter, 
the eight priority action areas are repeated here: 

• conservation and renewal of primary tropical 
forest and biodiversity; 

• sustainable forest management 'excluding com­
mercial logging operations in primary tropical 
forests, except those which are community-based'; 

• definition and development of timber certification 
systems; 

• provision of information and support to forest 
peoples; 

• capacity-building, especially strengthening the le­
gal, policy, social and institutional basis for forest 
management and conservation; 

• strategic and adaptive research for conservation 
and sustainable forest management; 

• development of buffer zones; 
• development and implementation of forest man-

agement plans. 

The Regulation suggests a shift (from earlier legislation) 
to a more sector-specific focus which emphasises the 
promotion of natural forest management, while main­
taining the importance of 'defensive' biodiversity 
conservation. 

3.1.2 An emerging strategy in Unit 04 
Within DG IB, Unit D4 has the main responsibility for 
strategic thinking in the forestry aid programme. 
Initially project identification and selection on the 
Tropical Forests budget line was on the whole reactive 
or demand-driven. D4 responded to requests from 
governments and NGOs, rather than setting geographi­
cal and thematic criteria. This partly explains the bias to 
Latin America, where local capacity to present projects 
has been greater than in Asia. In the early years of the 
budget line, and in the absence of a legal basis, 'strategy' 
tended to reflect the development philosophies of the 
technical officers. In the 1991-2 period, two technical 
officers were recruited to manage the new Tropical 
Forests budget line, an agricultural economist and an 

ecologist. The economist tended to promote larger 
public sector and multi-institutional projects, while the 
ecologist concentrated on smaller 'bottom-up' NGO­
based projects. 

Several factors should be taken into account when 
considering the lack of an identifiable operational 
strategy, at least until1996, in DG IB's tropical forestry 
aid programme. First, this situation was common across 
the DGs; for example, Kriek and Robbins (1991) point 
out the 'absence of a clearly detailed policy and 
strategy' for tropical forestry in the EC in general. 
Secondly, the adoption of forestry aid responsibilities by 
DG IB and its forerunner DG IK has been a very recent 
development - it only took over the overall manage­
ment of the Tropical Forests budget line from DG VIII 
in 1993. Thirdly, the Tropical Forests budget line was 
launched in haste in 1992 with the minimum of 
operational procedures, and the constant pressure of 
project cycle management on the D4 technical officers 
has resulted in little time for strategic thinking and 
systematisation. But the situation is changing, and it can 
be argued that an operational forestry strategy is in the 
process of emerging, based on the 1995 Council 
Regulation and various instruments associated with it. 

Also, by 1996 two foresters had replaced the 
economist and the ecologist and, in consultation with 
the Head of Unit, had split up the ALA region 
geographically- one dealing with Asia and Brazil, the 
other with the rest of Latin America. They have been 
keen to systematise project cycle methodology, and to 
develop a more pro-active approach to project identi­
fication. An indication of this is an on-going initiative to 
clarify forest sector priorities in India. There are also 
moves to develop greater regional coordination and 
coherence among projects, for example through regio­
nal meetings bringing together EC projects. 

Various reports and internal papers from Unit D4 
indicate the direction of strategic thinking on the use of 
the Tropical Forests budget line. The Commission's 
1996 Working Paper (European Commission, 1996a), 
reporting to Parliament on the progress of the budget 
line, highlighted four main areas of activity over the 
1992-5 period: 

• sustainable management of protected areas; 
• support for indigenous forest peoples; 
• actions to promote timber certification; 
• information management and research (although 

this referred more to DG XII). 

It listed as future priorities: conservation and regenera­
tion of primary forests, sustainable management, timber 
certification, winning the backing of local communities, 
developing operational capacities, and strategic and 
applied research. Two particular areas for future focus 
were singled out: the timber trade and certification, and 
biotechnology. The report expected a shift in European 
demand to 'sustainably managed' tropical timber, 
stating that this could be 'a testing ground for 
environmentally compatible trade ... from 1998 the 
new scheme of generalised preferences will be backing 
up tropical countries' efforts by giving timber imported 
from sustainably managed forests improved access to 
the European market' (p.11). Central to this strategy 
would be the design and development of certification 
systems, and a more central role for the private sector. 



. The private s~ctor was also seen as having a key role 
m the area of biOtechnology development: it was stated 
that 'certain Community instruments - among them 
European Community Investment Partners (ECIP) -
should be able to help develop synergies between 
European firms and partners in the tropical countries' 
~p.12). The report also highlighted the importance of 
Improved coordination with EU Member States the 
evaluation of the budget line in 1997, and' the 
~evelop~ent of a tropical forestry strategy in associa­
tiOn wtth the 1996 Guidelines for Forest Sector 
Development Co-operation (see Chapter 4, section 3.5). 

An internal paper written by the D4 technical officers 
in 1996 (European Commission, 1996b) was of the 
opinion that the budget line had been too demand­
driven in the past, and that there was a need for a set of 
s~rategic objectives based on the 1995 Council Regula­
tiOn and for more systematic evaluation of projects. 
Outputs from this process should include a policy 
paper, the Financing Guide (see below) and a set of 
~elec~ion criteria for the aid programme. This paper 
Iden~tfied. some p~ss.ible strategic priorities, involving 
modificatiOn of extstmg (unformalised) priorities: 

• a more balanced geographical spread than the 
75%:25% Latin America:Asia division over the 
period 1992-6, taking account of the more severe 
deforestation and demographic pressures in Asia. It 
pointed out that past allocation had been biased 
because of 'the ability of certain regions or 
countries to comply with administrative require­
ments set by the Commission', coupled with the 
higher density of NGOs and EU Delegations in 
Latin America, and suggested that a strategy paper 
be commissioned to redress the balance· 

• clearer prioritisation of project type. The 1992-5 
spread of projects showed 'strict conservation 
initiatives and agroforestry' as the main priorities 
while actions to promote natural forest manage~ 
ment had 'not been significant.' It argued that more 
attention ~hould be given to the issues of logging 
and non-ttmber forest products (NTFPs), given the 
strong links to the welfare of local people, as well 
as to reafforestation to reduce the pressure on 
natural forests; 

• addressing the neglected potential for providing 
tropical countries and forest peoples with the 
capacity to make use of biotechnology applica­
tions, particularly in the fields of nutrition 
pharmacology and pest control; ' 

• rectifying the absence of the local private sector in 
DG IB's actions, particularly in the area of timber 
certification; 

• providing more policy and institutional support to 
Improve state organisational efficiency (often a key 
~onstraint to sustainable management); 

• mcreased funding of small projects in view of the 
desirability of working with local organisations 
before scaling-up, and as a way of working with 
isol~ted populations not covered by the larger 
proJects; 

• i~cr~ased funding of thematic projects with global 
sigmficance (for example, the CIFOR 'criteria and 
indicators for sustainable forest management' 
research project). 
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The 'Guide for the Financing of Projects Undertaken in 
Developing Countries' (European Commission, 1996c), 
also developed in Unit D4, lists five main types of 
projects to be financed: 

• initiatives and pilot projects likely to contribute to 
sustainable forest management and conservation· 

• analysis of the effects of projects, programm:s, 
strategies and policies on forests; 

• preparation of guidelines and instruments for 
sustainable development and environmental 
integration; 

• e~aluation of the 'conformity' of projects, strate­
gies and policies with sustainable development and 
conservation objectives; 

• institutional strengthening and capacity 
development. 

This appears to place a strong emphasis on the 
deve_lop~e~t of a firmer conceptual, methodological 
and InStitutional basis for tropical forestry interventions. 

F~nally, the ~Tropical Forest in Developing Countries 
ProJect Screemng Form for the Technical Committee' 
(European Commission, 1996d) is a project selection 
che~klist wh~ch aims to assist officials in screening 
~rOJects commg ~hrough the Tropical Forests budget 
lu~e .. The checklist covers whether the project falls 
Withm the terms of the 1995 Council Regulation· its 
'techni.cal quality',. including a log framework-;tyle 
analysts ~f t?e logtcal connections between the pro­
hie~, obJectives, outputs, activities and inputs; the 
quahty of stakeholder, social, gender, risk and sustain­
ability analysis; and a set of 'characteristics for 
prioritising' based on the project's potential in terms 
of its replicability, how much of a catalyst for other 
activities and how innovative it is, whether it tackles 
key forest issues, etc. Other factors to be considered 
include complementarity between EC and Member 
State actions, the poverty of beneficiaries and the 
visibility of EC actions. ' 

3.2 Strategic viewpoints from the 
geographical Directorates 

The geographical desks and Technical Units do not have 
a sectoral policy or strategy development role; this is, or 
sh~uld be, provided by the horizontal Directorate (i.e. 
Umt D4). Rather, the country desk officers in the 
geographi~al J?irecto!ates write the country strategy 
papers, With (smce mtd-1996) considerable inputs from 
the Technical Unit in the case of the Asia Directorate. 
The country strategy paper defines the sectoral scope for 
aid. 

Project identification on the Asia budget line has been 
more pro-active than on the other budget lines in DG IB 
(at least in the case of forestry). The Director and Unit 
Heads in D.ire.ctorate C decide on country priorities, 
and then, withm the boundaries of the country strategy 
papers, allow different sectoral interests to compete for 
the country's budget. The technical officer responsible 
for. forestry in the Asia Technical Unit regarded helping 
to mfl~ence the share of forestry in the country budgets 
as an Important role. 

Some country desk officers have also been able to 
~ncourage a more strategic and coordinated approach 
m forestry aid delivery. For example, the Forest Liaison 
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Bureau in Indonesia was set up to provide coordination 
and overview in the EC-Indonesia Forestry Programme, 
to encourage positive forest policies by the Indonesian 
Government, and to improve links with EU Member 
State bilateral programmes. 

3.3 Policy on project size 
In DG IB there is considerable backing for large projects. 
Several aid officials, in both the geographical and 
horizontal Directorates, mentioned the expediency of 
larger projects because project management by Com­
mission staff was not cost-effective for small projects. A 
'threshold' project size in relation to staff requirements 
was mentioned in a 1996 D4 internal circular.4 

The largest forestry projects have been on the Asia 
budget line; for example Indonesia has benefited from 
three projects in excess of ECU 25 m. (see section 6.3). 
D4 has also witnessed several large programmes in 
recent years, most obviously the Brazil Pilot Programme, 
the Central America Agricultural Frontier Programme, 
protected area projects in Peru and Venezuela, and the 
Treaty for Amazon Co-operation. While such projects 
are favoured because of their potential for a more 
strategic and intersectoral approach, D4 technical 
officers pointed out that smaller (less than ECU 1 m.) 
and more flexible NGO projects have tended to be most 
successful in the past, and play an important pilot or 
experimental role for larger projects. 

4. GEOGRAPHIC AND THEMATIC 
DISTRIBUTION OF FORESTRY 
PROJECTS 

4.1 Definitional issues 
In the absence of an in-house definition of 'forestry', the 
definition of a forestry project has largely followed the 
classifications used by ERM (1996) and Planistat 
(1997), resulting in a narrow definition of forestry in 
the case of the geographical budget lines, and a 
relatively broad definition in the case of the Tropical 
Forests budget line. 

In the case of the latter, it could be argued that many 
of the projects funded have had relatively minor 
'forestry' components. For example, several projects 
with Amerindian groups have been based on the 
hypothesis that their stability is key to forest conserva­
tion; thus the main emphasis has been on social and 
institution-building activities, although the project 
purpose is usually phrased in terms of forest conserva­
tion.There have also been one or two more purely 
'environmental' projects, such as a 1992 project to 
tackle mercury toxicity associated with gold mining in a 
forested area of Brazilian Amazonia. At first there was a 
somewhat fluid division between the tropical Forests 
and Environment budget lines, so that some 'forestry' 
projects were financed under the latter. It was a case of 
expediency as to which budget line had the finance 
available for a worthwhile project. 

The narrow and more traditional definitions used by 
ERM and Planistat of 'primary' forestry projects in the 

4. 'Criteria to determine priorities for Tropical Forest projects' 
(based on the 1995 Council Regulation), Chief of Unit, 04. 

regional ALA budget lines result in the exclusion of 
some important 'forestry' projects, which were classi­
fied as falling under other 'primary' environmental 
categories, such as 'land resource management', 'com­
batting diversification' and 'biodiversity conservation'. 
For example, the ECU 23.3 m. 'Afforestation of 
wastelands and agroforestry in Haryana' project (B7-
3000) was classified as 'land resource management'. 
There were also 17 projects with significant forestry 
components under the Latin America budget line (B7-
3010), mostly integrated rural development-type pro­
jects in the ECU 1-3 m. range, that did not fall into the 
primary category of forestry. Here the main exception 
to the Planistat/ERM classification is for the Environ­
ment budget line B7-6200; the budget line mattager in 
D4 identified a number of small and clearly identifiable 
forestry projects managed by DG IB 

4.2 Overview of tropical forestry aid 
before 1990 

According to the review of 'Tropical Forest Sector 
Activities 1976-90' (IFSC, 1991), total EC expenditure 
on 'tropical forestry' amounted to about ECU 400 m. 
divided between 256 projects; in 1988, tropical forestry 
represented about 1. 7% of total EC development aid 
(ECU 2.2 billion). Before 1990, projects in ALA 
countries were financed mainly under the budget lines 
930 'Financial and Technical Co-operation with Latin 
America and Asia Developing Countries' and 946 
'Ecology in Developing Countries' (see Table 1). 

4.2.1 Geographical budget line 930 
Under the ALA budget line 930, about ECU 71 m. were 
committed to 'tropical forestry' activities among 15 
projects, with an average of ECU 4. 77 m. per project. 
This represented about 1.5% of the total budget (about 
ECU 400 m. per annum) in this budget line (IFSC, 
1991). IFSC (1991) point out an important contrast to 
DG VIII projects - their longer time frames. Under 
budget line 930, the average length of project was six 
years as opposed to three years for Lome Convention 
projects. 

4.2.2 Horizontal budget lines 
Over the same period, the Ecology budget line 946 
financed some 17 tropical forestry projects with an 
average cost of only ECU 120,000 per project, 
representing about 15% of the overall budget. Another 
horizontal budget line in existence before 1992 was 
'Co-financing with NGOs' (Budget line 941 ), co­
managed with DG VIII and DG XI. IFSC (1991) 
reported that ECU 6 m. were expended on 50 tropical 
forestry projects over the period 1986-90. Unfortu­
nately there is no regional breakdown of this, but the 
same source comments (p.15) that there was a 'greater 
[than other horizontal budget lines] geographical spread 
of projects in Africa, South America and Asia'. 

4.2.3 Geographical spread 
Before 1990, Asia received considerably more tropical 
forestry aid than Latin America (see Table 2), while 
Kriek and Robbins (1991) reported that some 15% of 
total EC forestry aid went to 'Asia' and 4% to Latin 
America. 
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4.3 Overview of tropical forestry aid 
1990-6 

Table 2: EC forestry aid to Asia and latin America 
1976-90 

Table 3 presents the number of forestry projects and the 
budget committed to ALA countries in the four budget 
lines managed by DG IB (or its predecessors) over the 
period 1990-6. 

Figure 2 shows how rapidly DG IB's tropical forestry 
financial commitments increased in 1992, because of 
both the introduction of the Tropical Forests budget 
line and the increase in the Asia budget line. The other 
two budget lines have financed a few small projects but 
have been relatively insignificant in terms of 'primary' 
forestry projects, according to the ERM and Planistat 
definitions. From 1992 to 1996, almost ECU 300 m. 
were committed to forestry projects in ALA countries 
from the four budget lines. 

Asia excluding Pacific 

Pacific Asia 

Central America 

South America 

Caribbean 

Regional Latin America 

TOTAL 

53 .82 13 

21.94 5 

1.24 <1 

3.37 

8.97 2 

17.17 4 

398 100 

(Source : ISFC(1991) 

4.4 Projects funded by geographical 
spread 1992-6 

4.4.1 Distribution by region 
Figures 3 and 4 graph the number of projects and 

financial commitments to Latin America, Asia and 
'global' projects (ie, not destined for a particular region) 
over the period 1990-6. They show that while Latin 
America has dominated in the number of projects since 
1991, Asia received a higher financial commitment in 

Table 3: DG IB forestry aid by financial commitments and number of projects 1990-6 

B7-6201 Tropical 
Forests 

B7-600 Environment 

87-3000 Asia 

B7-3010 Latin 
America 

Total 

1.1 
(4) 

9.3 
( 1) 

10.4 
(5) 

2.2 
(5) 

2.2 
(5) 

33 .8 
(19) 

0.4 
( 1) 

25 .9 
( 1) 

0.6 
( 1) 

60.7 
(22) 

33.9 
(20) 

1.5 
(3) 

17.0 
( 1) 

0.8 
( 1) 

53.2 
(25) 

33.1 
(40) 

0.4 
( 1) 

51.0 
(3) 

84.5 
(19) 

40.0 
(26) 

0 .5 
(1) 

33 .0 
(2) 

73.5 
(28) 

29.5 
(20) 

29.5 
(20) 

170.3 
(99) 

6.0 
(15) 

136.2 
(8) 

1.4 
(2) 

314.0 
(124) 

Note: there are some minor discrepancies with the figures reported by Planistat (1997) due to the inclusion here of some Environmental budget line forestry projects, 
and an additional Asia budget line project 'Forest conservation and development of rural areas in Laos' (ECU 950,000 in 1995). 

Figure 2: DG IB forestry aid by financial commitment 1990-6 
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Figure 3: Regional distribution of DG IB forestry 
projects over time 1990-6 
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all years except 1991 and 1996. This is because the 
average size of the Latin American projects was much 
smaller (ECU 1.65 m) than the Asian projects (ECU 5.6 
m.). Most of the projects on the Tropical Forests budget 
line have gone to NGOs, which tend to be more 
numerous in Latin America; hence the average project 
size on the Tropical Forests budget line was ECU 
1. 72 m. compared with ECU 17.03 m. on the Asia 
budget line. 

Figures 5 and 6 present the distribution of projects 
and financial commitments among Brazil, Spanish­
speaking South America, Central America (including 
Mexico), Asia, and the global projects managed by DG 
IB in the four budget lines over the 1992-6 period. 
Figures 7 and 8 present the same for the Tropical 
Forests budget line. While Latin America had most 
projects and its share of the Tropical Forests budget line 
commitments was over 75%, with Brazil alone absorb­
ing 38% of the budget line, about 55% of DG1B's 
overall financial commitment went to Asia. 

4.4.2 Distribution by country 
Figures 9, 10, 11 and 12 present the country distribution 
of forestry financial commitments to South America, 
Central America, Asia and overall respectively. Figure 9 

Figure 5: Distribution of DG IB forestry projects by 
region 1992-6 

Figure 4: Regional distribution of DG IB forestry 
financial commitments over time 1990-6 
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shows that Brazil has dominated the South American 
region, mainly because of the PPB. Most of the other 
countries in Figure 9 belong to the Amazon region; 
these countries have also benefited from the regional 
Treaty of Amazonian Co-operation programme (ECU 
4.3 m. from B7-6201 and two small projects under B7-
3010). After Brazil, Colombia and Peru have been the 
main beneficiaries both in terms of projects (7 each) and 
financial commitments (over ECU 10m.). 

Figure 10 shows the importance in the Central 
American region of the regional ECU 11.6 m. Agricul­
tural Frontier Programme (PFA) approved in 1994. 
Costa Rica has had most projects ( 4) and funding (ECU 
6.9 m.), followed by Guatemala, Nicaragua and 
Mexico. Figure 11 shows how Indonesia (ECU 106 m. 
and 9 projects), Philippines (ECU 28m. and 3 projects) 
and Vietnam (ECU 21m. and 5 projects) have benefited 
most in the Asia region. The low representation of the 
Indian sub-continent is noticeable. This country dis­
tribution partly reflects the distribution and strength of 
the EU Delegations; for example, the absence of 
Delegations in the past in such countries as Sri Lanka, 
Malaysia and Cambodia, and the difficulties of working 
at the State level with a centralised Delegation in a 
country the size of India. 

Figure 6: Distribution of DG IB forestry financial 
commitments 1992-6 
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Figure 7: Distribution of DG IB Tropical Forests 
budget line projects by region 1992-6 
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Figure 9: Country distribution of DG IB forestry 
financial commitments to South America 
1992-6 

Brazil (47.09%) 

Figure 11: Country distribution of DG IB forestry 
financial commitments to Asia 1992-6 
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Figure 12 indicates that about 36% or ECU 106m. of 
DG IB's overall forestry aid was committed to 
Indonesia over the period 1992-6. As well as five 
projects from the Tropical Forests budget line, 4 very 
large projects were approved from the Asia budget line. 
Almost 20% was committed to Brazil over the same 
period. Thus the two countries with the largest tropical 
rainforest areas in their respective continents absorbed 

Figure 8: Distribution of DG IB Tropical Forests 
budget line financial commitments by 
region 1992-6 
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Figure 10: Country distribution of DG IB forestry 
financial commitments to Central America 
1992-6 

Honduras (4.46%) 

Costa Rica 
(26.04%) 

Figure 12: Overall country distribution of DG IB 
forestry financial commitments 1992-6 

well over half DG IB's forestry aid. The next most 
important beneficiaries in terms of financial commit­
ments were the Philippines (10%), Vietnam (7%), 
Colombia (5%) and Peru (3%). 
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4.5 Projects funded by type 

4.5.1 Before 1990 
Using the TF AP classification system, the IFSC review 
(1976-90) divided up overall EC tropical forestry aid 
expenditure as follows: 

Forestry in land use: 44% 
Forestry-based industrial development: 29% 
Conservation of tropical ecosystems: 15% 
Institutions: 9% 
Fuel wood/fuel energy: 3% 

Kriek and Robbins (1991:3) reported that 'much of the 
assistance took the form of forestry components within 
integrated rural development projects' . IFSC ( 1991) 
also reported that most of the projects funded by the 
ALA geographical budget line were orientated to 
forestry in land use, forestry-based industrial develop­
ment and research. For example, the projects in India 
were mainly orientated to agroforestry and watershed 
management, although a more sectorally specific project 
was the ASEAN Timber Technology Centre in Malaysia 
(IFSC, 1991). Projects funded under the Ecology budget 
line 946 were typically conservation area studies, 
technical assistance in conservation and public aware­
ness (IFSC, 1991). The majority of NGO projects 
funded under budget line 941 were orientated to rural/ 
community development or forestry in an agricultural 
context. 

4.5.2 1992-6 period 

Codification of forestry projects 
All the projects were coded, for convenience of analysis, 
against the eight priority 'fields of action' defined in the 
1995 Council Regulation (see section 3.1). In abbre­
viated form the classification was as follows (with the 
Regulation sub-section letter in brackets): 

• forest conservation (a); 
• (natural) forest management (b), including forest 

management plans (h); 
• certification (c); 
• forest peoples (d); 
• capacity-building (e); 

Figure 13: Distribution of all DG IB forestry projects 
by theme 1992-6 
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• research (f); 
• buffer zones (g); and 
• other, including reforestation and 'integrated forest 

development' 

The coding here follows, with one or two exceptions, 
that used by the ECO Consultancy team in its 1997 
evaluation of DG IB's tropical forestry aid programme 
(ECO, 1997), as it was felt that this coding was more 
accurate than that used by Planistat (1997). However, 
any categorisation is necessarily arbitrary, as the 
projects could often be fitted into two or more 
categories. For example, some of the Amerindian 'forest 
people' projects could have been classified under 
conservation, and vice versa. The aim was td find the 
classification which best fitted the main thrust of project 
activities. This was not always obvious from the project 
title, or even the project purpose. 

Figures 13 and 14 present the distribution of project 
type by the number of projects and financial commit­
ments among the four budget lines, while Figures 15 
and 16 give the equivalent breakdown for the Tropical 
Forests budget line. They show that the most important 
area of forestry aid has been in what might be termed 
the 'defensive' conservation approach, centring on the 
development and management of protected areas. This 
represented 40% of expenditure under the Tropical 
Forests budget line. If buffer zone projects are added, 
the conservation priority becomes even clearer. 

In a second rank of importance, at least in terms of 
the number of projects, have been capacity- building or 
institutional development projects, forest management 
projects, forest peoples (especially Amerindian projects 
in Spanish-speaking South America) and research. 
While there were relatively few natural forest manage­
ment projects, the high share (2 7%) of the financial 
commitments reflects the ECU 28 m. South/Central 
Kalimantan (Indonesia) Forest Production Programme 
funded under the Asia budget line. Taking only the 
Tropical Forests budget line (Figure 16), funding of 
forest management projects has been more modest 
(13%), while relatively little has been spent on timber 
certification initiatives. 

Figures 17 and 18 show the thematic distribution of 
the 73 'small' (average size about ECU 600,000) and 26 
'large' (average size a little under ECU 5 m.) Tropical 

Figure 14: Distribution of all DG IB forestry financial 
commitments by theme 1992-6 
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Figure 15: Distribution of DG IB Tropical Forests 
budget line projects by theme 1992-6 

Research 
(19.19%) 

Other (2.02%) 

management 
(9.09%) 

Forests budget line projects by theme. Further observa­
tions can be made about the institutional basis and 
project type according to project size. Small projects 
tend to be managed by north and/or south-based NGOs 
or university departments, while most large projects are 
in the public sector or come under multilateral 
organisations, except for some large Amerindian forest 
peoples' projects managed by European NGOs. 

The NGO projects in Latin America can be broadly 
divided into two main types: 

• larger projects (although generally not in excess of 
ECU 2 m.) aimed at conservation and sustainable 
development through a broad-based livelihoods, 
social and institutional approach, often with 
indigenous groups (as for example, the Integrated 
Programme for Indigenous Self-development m 
Ecuador); 

• smaller, more sector-specific, projects working in 
conservation, natural forest management, technical 
research (such as botanical studies), capacity­
building, policy oriented projects including the 
tackling of legal issues surrounding indigenous 
land rights, environmental education projects, etc. 

Several of the large public sector projects have been 
oriented towards the more 'defensive' conservation 
approach involving protected areas and institution 

Figure 17: Distribution of small DG IB Tropical Forests 
budget line projects by theme 1992-6 
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Figure 16: Distribution of DG IB Tropical Forests 
budget line financial commitments by 
theme 1992-6 
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building. There has also been a preference for large 
regional projects involving the coordination of activities 
in several countries oriented towards information 
exchange and policy debate (such as the Treaty of 
Amazonian Co-operation and the Agricultural Frontier 
buffer zone project in Central America). 

Figures 19 and 20 present the trend in project themes 
over time for the four budget lines and the Tropical 
Forests budget line respectively. These tables show that, 
while trends are erratic, the number of conservation 
projects has fallen slightly over time, and that buffer 
zone projects, although not represented in 1995, 
assumed an equal importance to conservation projects 
in 1996, possibly indicating a shift towards more 
participatory conservation strategies. The number of 
forest management projects rose to a peak in 1994 
before falling off; forest people projects peaked in 1993; 
and capacity-building projects have been consistently 
important and, like research projects, peaked in 1995. 

Figure 18: Distribution of large DG IB Tropical Forests 
budget line projects by theme 1992-6 
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Figure 19: Thematic distribution of DG IB forestry projects over time 1992-6 
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Figure 20: Thematic distribution of DG IB Tropical Forests budget line projects over time 1992-6 
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5. PROJECT CYCLE MANAGEMENT 

5.1 Project identification and appraisal 

5.1.1 Tropical Forests budget line 

Small projects 
The project preparation process (identification and 
appraisal) is very different for small {less than ECU 1 
m.) and large projects. Small projects are normally 
written, presented and carried out by the applying 
NGO, university or other institution, but can also be 
proposed by country desk officers and EU Delegations. 

In the past there was considerable flexibility in the 
format and process of presenting a project for funding, 
but this has now been standardised with the Financing 
Guide. The applicant should first present a two-page 
concept note with a draft logical framework and 

Forest peoples 

Certification 

- Forest management 

- Conservation 

indicative budget to Unit D4. The technical officers 
check the suitability of the projects against the 1995 
Regulation and its strategic objectives, and give the go­
ahead to the applicant to prepare a full proposal 
according to the Financing Guide. This stipulates that 
the proposal should include a logical framework; a 
context section (socio-economic, environmental, bene­
ficiaries, etc.); the project background (problem identi­
fication); objectives; expected results; a plan of 
implementation; a budget (according to a prescribed 
form); justification; and monitoring arrangements. The 
proposals are then sent to the national or regional EU 
Delegation, and to the relevant country desk officer for 
comments and approval. 

Small projects are selected and approved by a 
'Technical Inter-Service Committee' which meets once 
or twice a year. This is composed of staff concerned 
with tropical forestry issues in DG IB, DG VIII, DG XI 



and DG XII, the appropriate country desk officers, and 
external experts. Following modification in consulta­
tion with the applicants (which can take up to six 
months), a revised project proposal is drawn up and, 
when it is formally included in the annual programme, 
the D4 technical officer prepares a 'financial proposal' 
which is circulated for approval in DG lB. This includes 
a brief description, terms of reference, budget, Curri­
culum Vitaes, timetable and logical framework. About 
10 signatures (four from Directorate E) are then 
required to approve the financial proposal, spanning 
three DGs. The process of obtaining the necessary 
signatures normally takes about three months during 
the first half of the year, but is reduced to a few weeks 
towards the end of the year. 

Large projects 
The main differences between the treatment of large 
and small projects on the Tropical Forests budget line 
have been the use of consultants to appraise the 
projects, the division of project cycle management 
between the horizontal unit (D4) and the geographical 
Directorate Technical Units, and the project selection 
procedure. When the D4 Technical Officer identifies or 
receives a project idea or proposal of over ECU 1 m., 
which he deems to be within the scope of the 1995 
Council Regulation, he selects a team of consultants 
from the Consultancy consortia in the EC Framework 
Agreement to: 

• carry out a project identification mission to 
investigate the basic idea; and 

• undertake a project design mission, using the 
project cycle methodology set out in the 1993 
'Methods and Instruments for Project Cycle 
Management (PCM)' manual. The latter places 
considerable emphasis on the use of the logical 
framework. 

Another approach has been to fund a 6-12 month 
project preparation phase (for example, for the Agri­
cultural Frontier Project in Central America and the 
Pilon Lajas buffer zone project in Bolivia). 

In most cases, responsibility for large projects then 
passes to the appropriate Technical Unit in the 
geographical Directorates, which draws up a financial 
proposal. This is translated into the languages of the 
Commission (currently 11), and sent to the EU-based 
'Permanent Representative' of each Member State. The 
Member States have three months to give an opinion on 
the project, and a summary table of these opinions is 
sent to the relevant technical officer. Experts from 
Member States can ask written questions at this stage, 
obliging the Commission to make a written response. 
According to these responses, Member States are given 
the opportunity of changing their opinions. 

The proposal is then submitted to the ALA Commit­
tee, which has to provide a majority favourable opinion 
for the project to go ahead. The ALA Committee meets 
monthly and is composed of representatives of the 
Member States, the Director of DG IB D, the 
(temporarily co-opted) relevant technical officer and, 
as a non-voting chair, the Director-General of DG IB or, 
in his absence, the Director of one of the Geographical 
Directorates. The ALA Committee will often decide 
that more discussion or information is needed about a 
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particular project to approve it. Once the project is 
approved, a financial memorandum is drawn up and 
checked by the Directorates-General with financial 
responsibilities (XX and XIX), the specifications for 
technical assistance are developed by the Technical 
Units, and the tendering process for consultants can be 
started. 

The increasing tendency to co-fund projects with EU 
Member States has brought with it the advantage of 
wider consultation at the appraisal and design stages, 
for example with Austria and Denmark for COAMA III. 

5.1.2 ALA geographical budget lines (B-3000 
and B-3010) 

Almost all the forestry projects financed by the 
geographical budget lines have been large public sector 
projects. There are three main processes or instruments 
leading to project identification on the geographical 
desks: 

• country strategy papers: these have been intro­
duced gradually since 1992. They include a 
political, social and economic overview, and a set 
of sectoral priorities. The country desk officer takes 
the lead in preparing the country strategy paper, 
with support from the Technical Unit officers (at 
least in the case of the Asia Directorate), the EU 
Delegation and the host government. In the case of 
Latin America, some strategic guidance is con­
tained in a document prepared by the Head of DG 
IB B 'The European Union and Latin America: The 
Present Situation and Prospects for Closer Partner­
ship 1996-2000' (COM (95) 495 final). 

• Joint Commissions (Latin America) and Joint Co­
operation Committees (Asia): these take place on 
average about every 18 months, and tend to 
alternate between the recipient governments and 
Europe. In the case of Central America there is a 
Regional Joint Commission. These are essentially 
fora for project identification and negotiation 
between the Commission and the country's (or 
region's) 'civil society' as represented by Ministers, 
prominent NGOs, etc. In the case of Asia, there is a 
system of sub-Committees including forestry. 
These fora are backed up by annual 'inter­
Ministerial' (Commission and host country) meet­
ings, at which further dialogue on policies and 
projects can take place. 

• direct contact between ALA country institutions 
and Commission country desk officers, EU Delega­
tion officers, or technical officers in the Technical 
Unit. In the case of the most important ALA 
country programme with Indonesia, the first 
projects came out of a TFAP meeting attended by 
the country desk officer in 1992. 

In the case of the Asia Directorate, an important change 
took place in mid-1996 in the roles of the country desk 
officers and the Technical Unit officers. Up to 1996, 
country desk officers were primarily responsible for the 
project preparation stage with the Technical Unit taking 
over once a decision to finance a project was taken. The 
Technical Unit is now primarily responsible for the 
whole of the project cycle - in the same way as D4 is 
responsible for the smaller projects on the Tropical 
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Forests budget line - and now takes the lead in the 
project preparation stage, although the country desk 
officer is still primarily responsible for preparing the 
country strategy paper and is associated with project 
cycle management decisions. 

The project selection procedure then follows that 
described above for larger projects under the Tropical 
Forests budget line. 

5.2 Project implementation 
Projects stemming from the geographical budget lines 
are coordinated by the Technical Units in direct contact 
with the EU Delegations. Projects have both a European 
and national co-director, the latter selected by the 
counterpart institution (usually a Ministry). In the case 
of India there has been some resistance to European co­
directors. Each large project must also have a steering 
committee which is representative of the stakeholders, 
and is expected to promote inter-institutional coordina­
tion. The steering committee, EU Delegation and 
Technical Unit must all approve the Overall Work 
Plan, and the first two have to approve the Annual 
Work Plans (see also section 2.3). 

5.3 Monitoring and evaluation 
For larger projects, except those managed by D4, 
responsibility for monitoring lies with the Technical 
Units, while for the smaller projects on the Tropical 
Forests budget line, the D4 technical officers are 
responsible. For all projects, the project management 
unit must send in six-monthly reports, as well as a final 
report. These should report on activities and outputs, 
and on the achievement of project objectives. In the case 
of D4, these reports are forwarded to the country desks 
and EU Delegations. Several on-going Tropical Forest 
budget line projects have received a monitoring mission, 
or have one planned. Projects are sometimes visited by 
the better-staffed EU Delegations, but generally speak­
ing the monitoring system is passive. A particular 
problem for the portfolio of projects under the PPB is 
that relatively little project management information 
returns to Brussels; limited human resources in the 
Brazil EU Delegation mean that most project monitor­
ing is delegated to the World Bank and Brazilian 
institutions. Monitoring missions are regularly sent to 
the Asia budget line projects. 

A mid-term review or evaluation by a team of 
independent consultants can take place at the request 
of technical officers or project management units. 
Before 1996, few Tropical Forests budget line projects 
had been evaluated, but some evaluations took place in 
1996, and several more were programmed for 1997. In 
the case of the Asia budget line, all finished projects 
have been evaluated. 

While the Technical Units were reasonably satisfied 
by the quality of these evaluations, the D4 technical 
officers felt that the evaluations carried out by the 
Framework Agreement consultancies have been only 
moderately useful, with the reports tending towards a 
'politically correct' stance and sometimes lacking 
technical rigour. It also appears that some reports have 
not been well understood or widely read beyond a few 
individuals, and thus the main lessons have not been 
internalised across the Directorates. One of the pro­
blems for effective evaluation has been that most 

projects have lacked a logical framework, baseline data 
or quantifiable objectives. 

In the case of the Tropical Forests budget line, Unit 
D4 is legally bound to make an annual report to the 
European Parliament and the Council with 'an assess­
ment of the implementation of this Regulation' (Council 
Regulation, 1995, Art.12), and to make regular 
evaluation reports to the ALA Committee. The empha­
sis in the legislation on accountability has increased the 
difficulty for D4 of keeping up with the demands of 
project cycle management, strategic thinking and other 
practical actions. It should also be noted that DG IB has 
an evaluation unit with its own budget to carry out 
project evaluations. 

5.4 Constraints on more effective project 
cycle management 

The main constraints on more effective management of 
the project cycle, identified through discussions with 
technical officers in DG IB (especially those in unit D4 ), 
are inter-related. 

• Lack of human resources 

Insufficient time to devote to each project has some­
times resulted in hastily prepared proposals and 
minimal monitoring and evaluation, at least on the 
Tropical Forests budget line. Minimal administrative 
support has meant that basic tasks like filing are 
sometimes neglected. Country desk officers also said 
that they were over-burdened by their range of tasks 
and had found it difficult to commit sufficient time to 
project cycle matters. This is compounded by lack of 
support staff. For example, in 1992 the Indonesia Desk 
Officer had an assistant and full-time secretary. This 
was subsequently reduced to a part-time secretary. 
Following a period without secretarial support, he 
currently (early 1997) has 25% of a secretary's time. 

• Centralisation of project cycle management 

At present, project cycle management is highly centra­
lised, thus placing great pressure on the technical 
officers. Decentralisation of parts of the cycle to the 
regional level is favoured by most officers, but staffing 
levels in the EU Delegations are also inadequate; for 
example the Central America Delegation in San Jose, 
Costa Rica, has two technical staff covering some 200 
projects. Depending on the Heads of Delegation, there 
is scope for recruiting national staff, but this has not 
happened in some key countries like Brazil. Another 
possibility is to sub-contract some project cycle 
management activities to an outside organisation or a 
consortium of NGOs. One experience being monitored 
with interest by Unit D4 is the sub-contracting of the 
Dutch small forestry project portfolio to IUCN. 

• Poor understanding of technical issues by some 
staff 

Lack of technical understanding by some administra­
tive staff is regarded as a significant constraint in Unit 
D4. Senior DG IB and DG XI staff expressed the need 
to provide accessible information to those taking 
decisions at a higher level, so that they can be more 
aware of the likely impacts of their decisions. Also, 
within DG IB it was stated that there was a need for 



seminars to help staff think and work together, for 
example by focusing on the lessons of experience from 
the implementation of forestry projects. A 1996 series 
of seminars by D4 on environmental impact assessment 
has apparently proved useful in improving staff under­
standing and motivation. 

• Over-regulation and inflexibility 

The trend in the Tropical Forests budget line has been 
towards increasing standardisation of procedures and 
reduced flexibility. Until 1995 there were few rules or 
regulations; the technical officers who managed the 
tropical forests budget line from 1992 to 1995 were 
able to work in quite separate ways (systems, metho­
dology, procedures, etc). Up to 1995, it was possible for 
a small project to be approved on the basis of relatively 
little evidence, eg a 3-4 page proposal. This flexibility 
had both positive and negative aspects, as the lack of 
rigour and standardisation. Following a 1995 audit, D4 
introduced more rigorous and systematic project cycle 
procedures. 

In the case of the Asia budget line, the former 
flexibility in the system allowed the Indonesia country 
desk officer to put out tenders, commission studies by 
consultants and get project personnel appointed 
quickly. He was able to promote at least one major 
process-type project - the Leuser Development Pro­
gramme project (see section 6.3 ). While there is 
considerable support for process-type projects in DG 
IB, the increase in procedures by Directorate E (Finance 
and Resources) works against them. For example, there 
is limited financial flexibility once the financial proposal 
has been adopted: budgetary adjustments should not 
exceed 10% of the funding. Major modifications in 
project design can only take place with a reappraisal -
as happened in 1996 with a Philippines project. 
However, good relationships between technical and 
financial officers allow some flexibility in the system. 

While greater regulation of the Tropical Forests 
budget line was clearly necessary, some think this 
process has gone too far. There is a view that technical 
tasks might have been better facilitated by increasing 
administrative support to existing Directorates. Specific 
concerns include the separation of different parts of the 
project cycle between the horizontal and geographical 
Directorates (in the case of large Tropical Forests 
budget line projects), the number of signatures required 
for approving the financial proposal, and the time 
involved in translating financial proposals and other key 
documents into 11 languages. 

• Reliance on consultants in aid delivery 

Views on the effectiveness of the consultancy-based aid 
delivery mechanism are mixed, partly since the experi­
ence from project to project varies so much. One view is 
that the use of consultants can cause major delays in 
implementation, and that there have been problems 
caused by the conflicting opinions of European experts 
working on the same project. This view holds that the 
Commission should move towards giving greater 
responsibility for project execution to national institu­
tions, using European experts in an advisory rather than 
executive role, whilst ensuring thorough monitoring 
and financial control. 
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• Delays in implementation 

Following project approval, there can be considerable 
delays in implementation, especially (but not exclu­
sively) for larger projects. First, large projects are 
subject to financial negotiations with recipient countries 
which can take more than a year. The largest single case 
of 'frozen funds' has been the Brazil Pilot Programme, 
where negotiations were complicated by their tripartite 
nature (EC - World Bank - Brazil). Secondly, the 
tendering process and recruitment of acceptable Eur­
opean consultants for project management can be quite 
time-consuming, and setting up the project can take 12-
18 months. Thirdly, some large projects on the Tropical 
Forests budget line were hastily prepared it\ ·order to 
achieve commitment targets, resulting in financial or 
technical flaws that delayed implementation. Sometimes 
the delays have made it necessary to replan and 
reschedule a project. 

• A weak information basis 

A problem for Unit D4, in particular, has been the weak 
information base for monitoring the Tropical Forests 
budget line, and the rather passive monitoring of 
individual projects. These problems are being partially 
tackled by a number of studies: the project inventories 
undertaken by ERM (1996) and Planistat (1997); the 
evaluation of tropical forestry projects by ECO (end of 
1997); and the development of an EC tropical forestry 
projects database over the 1997-98 period (Overseas 
Development Institute). One particular constraint is the 
lack of 'objectively verifiable indicators' for the 
Tropical Forests budget line to monitor policy 
implementation. 

6. PROJECT REVIEWS 

6.1 The Pilot Programme to Conserve the 
Brazilian Rain Forest (PPB) 

EU interest in the PPB originated from a German 
proposal at the June 1990 Dublin Summit that the EC 
should 'analyse and prepare proposals for an appro­
priate Community programme to deal with the threat to 
the tropical rain forests, in consultation with the 
countries concerned, and in particular Brazil.' The 
Houston G-7 Summit in July 1990 then expressed its 
readiness to 'cooperate with the Government of Brazil 
on a comprehensive pilot programme to counteract the 
threat to tropical rainforest in that country. We ask the 
World Bank to prepare such a proposal, in close 
collaboration with the CEC [the Commission], which 
should be presented at the latest at the next economic 
summit.' These developments arose partly as a response 
to Brazilian requests for assistance, but also as a result 
of the resurgent green movement in Europe - especially 
Germany. Chancellor Kohl played a major role in 
pushing the PPB through these political processes and 
ensuring compliance of the Commission. 

Following several high-level meetings and technical 
field missions, a proposal for a US $1.6 billion 
programme over 5-6 years was made to the G-7 Heads 
of State at the London summit of July 1991. The World 
Bank and the Commission then formalised this into a 
first phase five-year project of $250 m. and the 
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establishment of a trust fund to ensure the main 
activities of the programme would be implemented, 
with the understanding that a second phase of the PPB 
would be negotiated once the first has been evaluated. 
This was approved at a meeting in Geneva in December 
1991, and the Rain Forest Trust Fund (to cover about 
20% of the expected costs over the first three years) was 
set up in March 1992 to be administered by the World 
Bank, which also had the task of coordinating the PPB. 
At the Geneva meeting, it was also agreed that projects 
recently launched or planned by several bilateral donors 
should be included as part of the PPB. 

The overall objective of the PPB is 'to maximise the 
environmental benefits of Brazil's rain forest consistent 
with Brazil's development goals, through the imple­
mentation of a sustainable development approach that 
will contribute to a continuing reduction in the rate of 
deforestation.' Specific objectives are to: 

• demonstrate the feasibility of harmonising eco-
nomic and environmental objectives; 

• help preserve genetic resources; 
• reduce global carbon emissions; 
• provide a new model of co-operation between 

developed and developing countries on global 
environmental issues. 

It is further stated that preservation of biodiversity, 
reduction in carbon emissions, and new knowledge 
about sustainable activities in tropical rain forests are 
global benefits which justify financial and technical 
transfers from the international community to Brazil. 

The PPB promotes 'structural' and 'demonstration' 

projects. Structural projects aim to: 

• address the institutional weaknesses which inhibit 
the consolidation and implementation of environ­
mental policy by strengthening public agencies 
involved in the conservation and management of 
natural resources, encouraging economically and 
ecologically appropriate investments, and monitor­
ing environmental impacts; and 

• respond to the need to improve knowledge of 
Amazonian ecosystems and the sustainable use of 
their resources, by strengthening the region's 
scientific and research base and enhancing environ­
mental education. 

Demonstration projects aim to develop or dissbninate 
alternative methods of natural resource management 
with high potential for replication, especially through 
the participation of local communities and NGOs in 
innovative local approaches. Support for extractive 
reserves is included in this category. 

Table 4 indicates the contributions of a range of 
donors to the PPB up to mid-1996. It shows that the EC 
contributed about 23% of the overall $252 m., and the 
EU altogether 79%. Germany was the biggest donor 
with 49%. Brazil's counterpart funding amounted to 
about 11% of the total cost, while local project partners 
also made some contribution, for example in the form 
of labour. After an initial contribution of ECU 12m. to 
the Rain Forest Trust Fund, the EC announced an 
annual contribution of ECU 10 m. over the first five­
year phase. Table 5 details EC contributions to the end 
of 1996. The largest single commitment was to the 

Table 4. Donor commitments to the PPB to mid-1996 (US$ millions)1 

Germany 19.4 105.4 124.8 29.4 

EC 14.1 43.4 57.5 22.8 

UK 2.3 7.6 9.9 3.9 

Netherlands 3.2 3.2 1.3 

Italy 3.9 3.9 1.5 

Sub-total EU 42.9 156.4 199.3 78.9 

Brazil 26.9 26.9 10.7 

USA 5.5 2 7.5 3.0 

Japan 6.8 6.8 2.7 

Canada 0.7 0 .7 0.3 

Not yet identified 9.3 9.3 3.7 

Interest earned 9.1 9.1 3.6 

Expenses 3 -7.1 -7.1 -2 .8 

TOTAL 57.9 194.6 252.5 100 

1 excluding bilateral funding for associated projects 
2 contributions to 22 July 1996 
3 includes coordination, administrative and International Advisory Group expenses and pre-investment studies 

(Source : World Bank. Undated) 



Natural Resources Policy project in 1995. It involved 
strengthening state environmental agencies, ecological 
and economic zoning, environmental monitoring, and 
environmental law enforcement and control. 

An important aspect of the PPB is the system of 
governance and organisation. The World Bank plays a 
lead role in coordinating the preparation of projects 
through its Brasilia-based Rain Forest Unit. Project 
implementation is the responsibility of the Brazilian 
Government, primarily through the Ministry of the 
Legal Amazon, and there are various mechanisms for -1 
the participation of NGO groups in decision-making 
and monitoring. An International Advisory Group, 
composed of 15 international experts including three 
Brazilians, provides technical guidance and monitoring, 
and the Participants' Annual Meeting brings together 
donors, Brazilian representatives, NGOs and the World 
Bank to review progress and make recommendations. 

However, an area of some dissatisfaction is that, 
while the EC considers it has, or should have, an 
important role (together with other major EU donors 
like Germany) in the running of the PPB, almost all the 
consultancy inputs have been handled by the World 
Bank, which has had a minimal financial input. 

Progress of the PPB and the Commission viewpoint 
A report from the EU Delegation in Brazil (Vasconselos, 
1996) expresses considerable optimism about the PPB, 
for example claiming that 'the first success of the PPB 
has been to open the door to previously marginalised 
groups to take part in what was previously a closed 
technocratic exercise. The benefits will be felt not only 
in (the) Amazon forest but will permeate the develop­
ment of the democratic process in Brazil as a whole.' 
One of the reasons for this optimism is the more 
supportive policy environment emerging under Presi­
dent Cardoso. For example the recent government 
paper, 'National Policy for the Integrated Development 
of the Amazon', includes a commitment to sustainable 
development as a 'new paradigm' for the Amazon 
Region; support for decentralisation, especially increas­
ing the role of the States, Municipalities and civil 
society; and the linking of social and environmental 
issues so that local communities can benefit. However, 
Unit D4 made the observation that conflicts between 
federal and State policies have complicated the decen­
tralisation process. 

After a slow start, the PPB appears to be making 
reasonable progress in terms of project implementation. 
By the end of 1995, six projects representing about two­
thirds of the Programme in terms of finance had been 
appraised, negotiated and put into operation. One view 
was that this progress has been due to strong on-the­
ground organisational capacity. Another factor has 
been the frequency of meetings between the main 
interested parties; according to the World Bank 
(undated), they meet more or less monthly in Brasilia 
to share information and exchange views on the PPB 
and project issues. DG IB claims that 'one of the 
programme's first achievements has been to inspire a 
new strategy for the development of Amazonia and to 
offer a practical example of international co-operation' 
(Commission Working Paper IB/205/96, p.3). At the 
same time there is some dissatisfaction about the level 
of EC visibility in the PPB. 

Table 5. 

1992 

1993 

1993 

1994 

1995 

1995 

1995 

1996 

1996 

1996 
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EC contributions to the Brazil Pilot Programme 
1992-6 

Rain Forest Trust Fund 

Direct Research and 
Centres of Scientific 
Excellence 

12 

4.8 

Demonstration Projects 4 

Extractive Reserves (4) 5 

Natural Resources Policy 1 ~ . 7 

Management, 2.6 
Monitoring and 
Evaluation of the PPB, 
and Formulation of New 
Public Policies 

EC Technical Assistance 0.23 

Environmental 5 
Education 

Directed Research 

EC Technical Assistance 

5 

2.3 

6.2 The COAMA Project 
The Conservaci6n de Ia Amazonia y de su Medio­
Ambiente (Conservation of Amazonia and its Environ­
ment- COAMA) project is one of only two (the other is 
the PPB) large projects managed, as well as appraised, 
by the horizontal unit (D4). This is because it is 
considered to be particularly important as an innovative 
grassroots approach to sustainable forest management 
and conservation by indigenous people. It is also an 
example of several projects financed under the Tropical 
Forests budget line, which (a) has very little in the way 
of forestry activities, and (b) is based on the assumption 
that supporting and strengthening indigenous societies 
is an effective means to forest conservation. 

The project purpose is forest conservation through 
support of Amerindian culture and institutions, micro­
project development, and provision of basic social 
services in order to provide a basis for indigenous 
demarcation and management of the rainforest. This 
process started by identifying urgent needs and support­
ing cultural identity in three small projects from 1989 to 
1992 (just over ECU 1 m.) which became known as 
COAMA 1. It continued through a series of micro­
projects with NGOs in the areas of education, health and 
legal support during COAMA II (1993-6) at a cost of 
ECU 2.5 m. Following an evaluation in April 1996, 
COAMA III (ECU 2.5 m. over three years) was approved 
in July 1996. It works with some 120 communities 
representing 20 ethnic groups in six Colombian Depart­
ments, mostly located along the main rivers. 

Among the key strategies of COAMA have been: 

• support to and consolidation of the Indigenous 
Territorial Entities, created as political­
administrative units as part of Colombia's policy 
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of decentralisation, and which have given indigen­
ous communities a significant level of political 
participation; 

• the multiple-agency (NGO) approach involving an 
'operational network of foundations', and coordi­
nated by Gaia-Bogota, whose Director is also the 
COAMA Director, and Gaia-London; 

• technical assistance methodology in which field 
officers 'accompany' indigenous communities in 
problem analysis and development of solutions. 

The recent evaluation of the project (Brackelaire and 
Rodriguez, 1996) presents a positive picture of progress 
achieved since 1990: 

• the 'big impact' of the micro-project development 
sub-programme was partly attributable to the 
confidence established with technical officers; 

• the legal support programme, with its educational 
emphasis, has been in great demand by indigenous 
organisations and has also had a 'big impact'; 

• the indigenous cultural education programme has 
made good progress in moving away from an 
'integrationist' public education system; 

• the health programme, by emphasising traditional 
medicine and community-based schemes of health 
promotion, 'has shown State bodies a clear 
alternative (to conventional approaches] to inter­
vene at the level of nutritional problems, this time 
from a traditional context that has also stimulated 
a process of cultural recuperation connected with 
farming practices.' 

This report had few criticisms of the project, except that 
relationships with state agencies and national indigen­
ous bodies have been mixed. It claims that 'the 
COAMA strategy has demonstrated its validity' and 
that 'the COAMA Foundations have developed parti­
cipatory methods which deserve to be shared with 
indigenous community initiatives in neighbouring 
countries.' Above all, 'the wealth of COAMA resides 
in its inter-institutional coordination ... in an area of 
the world where the work is generally carried out in an 
atomised way' (Brackelaire and Rodriguez, 1996). 

The importance of the COAMA project as a model 
for indigenous development and biodiversity conserva­
tion is noted in the wider literature, for example in a 
detailed study by Bunyard et al {1993). It demonstrates 
an 'alternative' approach to biodiversity conservation in 
indigenous areas to the market route {market-orientated 
forest management), which is being promoted by 
several donors in Latin America, with disappointing 
results due partly to conflicts of incentives between 
indigenous and market economy institutions (Richards, 
1997). Martin von Hildebrand, the COAMA Director 
and ex-Minister of Indian Affairs, believes that COA­
MA represents an approach more in tune with 
indigenous reciprocal logic (as well as with ethical 
arguments stemming from environmental economic 
theory): namely indigenous commitment to biodiversity 
conservation for national and international benefici­
aries, in exchange for legal, scientific and social support 

5. Based on interviews with the Indonesia Country desk officer, 
and the pamphlet 'The EC!Indonesia Forest Programme', DG 1], 
1996. 

by the international community (Bunyard et al, 1993). 

6.3 Evolution of the Indonesia portfolio of 
forestry projects 5 

Over the 1992-6 period some ECU 106 m. were 
committed to Indonesia, 86% of it from the Asia budget 
line. This represented about 36% of DG IB's forestry aid 
to ALA countries, and about 72% of the Asia budget 
line's forestry commitments. Following attendance at a 
TFAP meeting in Indonesia in February 1992, the 
Indonesia desk officer identified several projects he felt 
were worth supporting. He also initiated a close 
dialogue with the Ministry of Forestry, leading in May 
1993 to a set of 'Agreed Minutes' (signed 1hy the 
Minister) setting out some general principles for EC­
Indonesia forestry co-operation, including a government 
commitment to promote supportive forestry policies. 

The first project prepared and implemented was the 
multiple-project Forest Sector Support Programme 
approved in December 1992 at a cost of ECU 26 m. 
to the Asia budget line. The first project component 
{ECU 6.3 m.) involved introducing forest inventory and 
remote sensing into all the Provinces of Indonesia to 
complete the mapping of the country's forest resources, 
and to develop early warning fire alert systems. The 
second component was to develop a radio communica­
tions network in five provinces of Sumatra (ECU 
19.6 m.). A third component, financed this time from 
the Tropical Forests budget line, was the development 
of a fire prevention and control model in Sumatra's 
Selatan Province (ECU 4 m.). This involved analysis of 
the causes of fires and the development of conflict 
arbitration machinery, once it was diagnosed that 
providing fire fighting equipment was inappropriate -
an example of the benefit of close monitoring and 
flexibility in the system. 

Following a planning phase funded under the Tropical 
Forests budget line, which was critically important in 
identifying a sound institutional basis, the Leuser 
Development Programme project (ECU 32.5 m.) was 
approved in December 1994 under the Asia budget line. 
In an area of outstanding biodiversity importance and 
tourism potential, the Leuser Development Programme 
strategy is based on a two-pronged approach over an 
initial seven-year period: fixing and protecting the 
boundaries of the Gunung Leuser Park, and providing 
alternatives for the local population in farming, fishing, 
ecotourism, etc. in the buffer zones. It is regarded by the 
Commission as innovative for three main reasons: 

• management is being undertaken through a process 
of wide stakeholder consultation involving the 
Leuser Management Unit, national and local 
government, and local communities; 

• the development of a 'conservation concession' 
established by Ministerial decree; and 

• a financially autonomous management unit has 
been established to raise revenue from ecotourism, 
log royalties and other buffer zone projects, there­
by ensuring the financial sustainability of the 
conservation initiatives. 

To complement the conservation emphasis in the Leuser 
project, it was decided to develop a sustainable forest 
management project to tackle some of the problems in 



the commercial logging sector. Following a preparation 
phase (ECU 568,000), the South/Central Kalimantan 
Production Forest project was approved at a cost of 
ECU 28 m. in 1995. A major aim of the project is to 
develop sustainable forest management techniques 
through such activities as silvicultural research and 
demonstration, developing forest management plans, 
pilot projects with concessionaires and wood producers 
to increase local value-added from a smaller cut, 
reduction of wood waste, market research and product 
design development. Other activities involve developing 
audit systems, community participation in forest 
management, making progress towards timber certifica­
tion and labelling, and a series of training, extension 
and communication activities. An innovative aspect of 
this project is the involvement of the (European and 
Indonesian) private sector, not least in joint-financing of 
some of the project activities. Another is the mechanism 
which has ensured broad consultation among a wide 
range of stakeholders - especially the private sector and 
local communities. 

The Kalimantan project is also linked to the 1994-
approved Berau Forest Management Programme in East 
Kalimantan (ECU 9.2 m. ), initiated and funded by the 
Tropical Forests budget line. This project aims to 
transfer natural forest management silvicultural re­
search results to an operational scale. Finally the Forest 
Liaison Bureau project was approved under the Asia 
budget line in November 1995 as a forum for policy 
dialogue, to coordinate the EC Indonesia programme, 
raise awareness and facilitate donor (especially EU 
Member State) co-operation. 

There are several positive aspects to the Indonesia 
programme. First, it was based on policy dialogue at the 
highest level, culminating in the 'Agreed Minutes' 
which provided a sound political basis for the pro­
gramme. Secondly, the relative flexibility in the system 
allowed the development of a process project approach 
which has facilitated an innovative design (for example, 
in the Leuser Development Programme), and permitted 
important changes of direction when it was realised that 
the original project design was inappropriate (as in the 
case of the Sumatra fire control project). A third aspect 
of the Indonesia programme has been the considerable 
financial contribution of the host government. For 
example, the Indonesian Government has committed 
ECU 18 m. to the Leuser Development Programme, and 
ECU 6 m. to the South/Central Kalimantan project. A 
fourth aspect is the general complementarity of actions 
that have been taken under the Asian and Tropical 
Forests budget lines. 

7. CONCLUSIONS AND TRENDS 
The history of tropical forestry aid in DG IB is a 
relatively recent one. Tropical forestry projects in Asian 
and Latin American (ALA) countries are mainly 
financed from two budget lines, the Tropical Forests 
budget line, which was started in 1991 following 
considerable pressure from the German green lobby 
and the G-7, and the 'Asia' budget line. The total 
budget committed to tropical forestry in ALA countries 
from 1992 to 1996 was almost ECU 300m., some 56% 
of this from the Tropical Forests budget line, and 43% 
from the Asia budget line. 
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The aid delivery mechanism varies with project size. 
For smaller projects (less than ECU 1 m.) on the 
Tropical Forests budget line, the NGOs, universities 
and other private or public sector organisations 
requesting the funds are responsible for project im­
plementation. For larger projects, the Consultancy 
consortia in the Commission's Framework Agreement 
provide short-term appraisal and evaluation inputs as 
requested by technical officers, and European Consul­
tancy groups carry out the project (following a public 
tender process) with counterpart public sector institu­
tions. Technical officers managing the Tropical Forests 
budget line consider that the consultancy-based aid 
delivery system has had mixed results, and favour a 
move to more control by counterpart institutions, but 
with strict auditing and EC project advisers in a more 
advisory and less executive role. However, this position 
is not shared on the Asia budget line. 

It could be argued that the Tropical Forests budget 
line has lacked a clear operational strategy in the past, 
with mainly reactive project and country selection and a 
marked influence of key individual officers. However, 
based on the 1995 Council Regulation, which gave a 
legal basis to the Tropical Forests budget line and set 
out eight priority action areas, and the instruments 
being developed to support it, a more pro-active 
strategy is now emerging. This involves a shift away 
from viewing forestry mainly as part of a wider land-use 
system (as promoted, for example, in the TFAP 
process), 'defensive' conservation approaches, and 
agroforestry (these three areas dominated EC 'forestry' 
aid in the 1980s), towards a more participatory and 
sectorally specific approach in which increasing em­
phasis is placed on natural forest management, related 
trade and certification issues, and buffer zone manage­
ment. However, the 1992-6 project portfolio was still 
dominated by conservation-based projects. An empha­
sis on indigenous peoples has been fairly constant 
throughout the recent period. Another important trend 
has been towards large multiple-agency programmes 
like the Brazil Pilot Programme. 

The geographical distribution of DG IB forestry aid 
has slightly favoured Asia (about 55% of the financial 
commitments), but Latin America's share of the 
Tropical Forests budget line to ALA countries was 
about 76%, rising in 1996 to 90%. Country distribu­
tion was skewed towards the two countries with the 
largest tropical rainforest areas in their respective 
continents: Indonesia received about 36% of all DG 
IB's tropical forestry aid and Brazil about 18%. There is 
a concern in DG IB, mainly on the Tropical Forests 
budget line, about the equity aspects of tropical forestry 
aid. The 199 5 Council Regulation encourages local 
organisations to apply for funding, and other legisla­
tion6 states that aid should go mainly to the poorest, but 
it has been the wealthier Latin American countries, and 
within them the organisations best able to articulate 
demand and comply with procedures, which have 
secured most funding. A programmed study of forest 

6. For example, Article 4 of the 1992 Council Regulation 443/92, 
which governs the geographical ALA budget lines, states that 
•financial and technical assistance should be targeted primarily 
on the poorest sections of the population and the poorest 
countries in the two regions.' 
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sector needs in India, a country which had not 
previously benefited from the Tropical Forests budget 
line, indicates a move to a more pro-active project 
identification strategy and a desire to address the equity 
and regional imbalances. 

Another important trend has been towards larger 
projects, although the Asia budget line projects have 
been large throughout the 1990s. While larger projects 
are preferred by some because they may permit a more 
strategic sectoral {or cross-sectoral) approach to be 
adopted in a given country, it was clear that an 
important factor working against small projects {which 
some technical officers think represent a more cost­
effective aid strategy) has been a shortage of technical 
staff resources. 

On the Tropical Forests budget line, weak monitoring 
and evaluation, and the associated weak information 
base, were part of several interlinked factors constrain­
ing effective project cycle management. Specific con­
straints included the level of both technical and 
administrative human resources; centralisation of pro­
ject cycle management; poor understanding by some 
staff of technical issues; and over-regulation of proce­
dures leading to increasing inflexibility. On the positive 
side, project appraisal methods have become more 
systematised. In spite of these constraints, there have 
been some important success stories among the projects 
supported by DG IB, as is evident from the projects 
reviewed in Indonesia, Colombia and Brazil. The 
general level of satisfaction with these larger projects 
implies that there will be an increasing trend to large 
multiple-donor or agency projects. Finally, the size of 
the forestry aid programme demonstrates a strong 
commitment to forestry in DG lB. 
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Technical Unit B4; Richard Arndell, Adviser to the 
Director of Asia and South-East Asia (ex-Indonesia 
Desk Officer); Michel Lucas, Brazil Desk Officer; Karin 
Huybens, Honduras Desk Officer; and Nicholas de 
Joncheree, Principal Administrator, Central America 
Desk, Unit B 1. 

Note on currency: on 1 September, 1997, US$ 1 was 
equivalent to ECU 1.09. 
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1. DG VIII - EVOLUTION OF 
INVOLVEMENT IN TROPICAL 
FORESTRY 

1.1 The aid mandate of DG VIII 
As the Directorate-General responsible for Develop­
ment Co-operation with the African, Caribbean and 
Pacific (ACP) countries, DG VIII occupies an unusual 
position with regard to development aid. Not only does 
it control 'budgetary allocations' voted by the European 
Parliament to the respective development-related bud­
get lines, but it also has access to the so-called 'non­
budgetary funds' in the form of the periodic pledges 
which are made directly by the Member States to the 
European Development Fund. Unlike the budget lines, 
the EDF does not form part of the EC Budget and is 
thus outside direct Parliamentary control.1 Unusually, 
therefore, DG VIII action is conditioned not only by 
Commission-wide influences such as the Maastricht 
Treaty, but also by the bilateral and extra-budgetary 
financing arrangements associated with the multi­
annual Lome Conventions. 

DG VIII's geographical mandate reflects the history 
of the European Union and the colonial history of 
several of its Member States. The ACP versus non-ACP 
distinction is entrenched within the structure of the 
Commission's aid management (DG VIII vs DG IB), 
and was restated in the Maastricht Treaty, Article 130w 
of which affirms the special status of the ACP countries, 
in the framework of the ACP-EC Convention. While the 
future of the EU-ACP association is currently a subject 
of considerable debate (a Green Paper on this theme 
was published in 1997), the ACP countries remain 
important partners for the Commission, and are likely 
to remain so, in one form or another, well into the next 
century.2 

1.2 Structure of the Directorate 
DG VIII is divided into directorates, some of which are 
geographical and some technical (see Figure 1). There 
are three geographical (or 'vertical') directorates, and 
four directorates concerned with 'horizontal' (ie. 
technically-oriented and geographically cross-cutting) 
themes. 

(i) Geographical: 
The geographical directorates of DG VIII are: VIIUD 
West and Central Africa; VIIUE East and Southern 
Africa; and VIIIIF Caribbean, Pacific and Indian Ocean. 

Each geographical directorate is divided into Divi­
sions (or 'units') with narrower geographical responsi­
bilities. Desk officers are responsible for relations with 

1. The lack of parliamentary scrutiny of the EDF leads to 
complaints of a 'democratic vacuum' in the management of 
the Fund. 

2. The main issue of contention is the system of trade preferences 
given to ACP states, which is challenged both by competitor 
nations outside this grouping and by many economists who view 
the system as encouraging inefficiency. Post-Lome arrangements 
are likely to lead to modification or abandonment of preferential 
trading arrangements, possibly combined with a review of aid 
partnerships, to focus EC aid on the most needy countries of the 
developing world, regardless of their present affiliations. 

individual ACP countries or (where country commit­
ments are individually too small) groups of countries. 
The geographical directorates also include geographi­
cally-specific technical divisions. For example, each of 
the two Africa Directorates has two technical divisions 
covering 'Infrastructure' and 'Agriculture and Rural 
Development'. There is no technical division devoted to 
forestry for any geographical area. 

(ii) Horizontal: 
The horizontal directorates of DG VIII are: VIIUA 
Development policy; VIIUB Management of instru­
ments; VIIUC Finance; and VIIUG Sectoral implementa­
tion. The horizontal directorates are also divided into 
Divisions. The primary responsibility fot tropical 
forestry policy is held by Division VIIUA/1 ('Develop­
ment Policy, Sustainable Development and Natural 
Resources'). Although there is no career Commission 
official responsible for tropical forests, there is a 
tradition of appointing a forester to the Division from 
one or other of the Member States as a 'National 
Expert' (that is, a national civil servant seconded as a 
tropical forestry adviser). The occupant of this post is a 
key player in the development and implementation of 
the tropical forestry policy of DG VIII. Responsibilities 
of the post include: sectoral policy development; 
international representation and liaison; sectoral co­
ordination; documentation and information; project 
technical support; and budget line management (parti­
cularly the tropical forestry budget line). The Adviser is 
not involved in the direct field-level management of 
EDF projects, this being the responsibility of the Desks 
in Brussels and the Delegations overseas. 

Forestry is also covered by a number of other 
'horizontal' divisions, including those dealing with the 
environment and the ST ABEX fund, and features as a 
component of other technical sections such as agricul­
ture and research. However, the informing principle of 
DG VIII operations is an unequivocally geographical 
one, as is implicit in the Lome Convention signed with 
individual countries. As a result, horizontal issues such 
as forestry tend to be less well integrated into the 
functioning of the Directorate-General than are 'ver­
tical' (ie. geographical) concerns. 

Division VIIU All has responsibility for tropical 
forestry policy and also for guidance to desk officers 
and Delegations on priority sectors for allocation of 
funds from the EDF with regard to forestry and other 
sectors (environment, transport, habitat, etc.). Since 
1995, it has also been responsible for part of the 
expenditure under the budget line B7-6201 (formerly 
B7-5041) 'Actions in Favour of Tropical Forests'. This 
budget line was created in 1992. Previously, funding for 
tropical forestry was covered by the budget line B7-
6200 (formerly B7-5040), 'Environment (formerly 
'Ecology') in Developing Countries'. Access to funds 
under this rubric allows DG VIII to implement forestry­
related activities without having to pass through the 
relatively bureaucratic and slow-moving EDF proce­
dures. Formal responsibility for the management of the 
budget line (including reporting to the European 
Parliament) lies with DG lB. 
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1.3 The place of the ACP countries in the 
evolution of forestry aid 

In the 1970s, the financial protocol of the Lome 
Convention, the European Development Fund (EDF), 
provided the main source of funding to tropical 
forestry. As other sources of funding have become 
available to tropical forestry through the budget lines, 
so the EDF's relative importance has diminished. 
However, it still has important implications for tropical 
forestry, both in terms of funds earmarked for activities 
in key sectors of the national programmes of the partner 
countries, and, more generally, in terms of the forestry 
impacts of interventions in other sectors. 

2. SYSTEMS OF AID DELIVERY 
An understanding of the ways in which tropical forestry 
is handled within DG VIII requires consideration of the 
two different types of fund- the EDF, which has a long 
history and operates according to institutionalised, if 
rather complex, procedures, and the tropical forestry 
budget line, which has a much shorter history, and 
operates more flexibly. Management of the EDF 
involves close collaboration between the Commission 
and its ACP partners, while DG VIII/All has a fair 
degree of independence in its management of the 
tropical forestry budget line. 

2.1 The Lome agreements 
The first three Lome Conventions provided multi­
annual financial allocations, on a five-year cycle. The 
present Lome Convention, Lome IV, covers two 
successive funding periods (Lome IV and IV bis, each 
of five years) of ten years' overall duration (1990-99).3 

The introduction of phased programming into Lome 
IV was partly the result of problems in disbursing EDF 
funds. Slow and inadequate disbursement of funds has 
characterised previous generations of EDF protocols, in 
part because of the time-consuming and complex 
process of policy dialogue needed to identify country 
priorities and sectoral emphasis (Koning, 1997:132). 
Lome Conventions form contractual agreements be­
tween the EU and the ACP group. The EDF does not 
operate a deadline for spending its funds, so that if 
funds committed are not spent during the life of a 
particular EDF, they can be carried over into the next. 
Taking into account the programming of successive 
EDFs, it is thus possible to have a number running 
concurrently. All EDF funding, apart from funds 
managed by the European Investment Bank (EIB), is 
in the form of grants. 

2.2 Aid delivery through the EDF 
Aid delivery through the mechanism of the EDF 

3. The full list of the respective Yaounde (predecessor to Lome) 
and Lome agreements and their associated EDFs is as follows: 
Yaounde I (1963) EDF 1. 
Yaounde II (1969) EDF 2. 

(1970-75) EDF 3 
Lome I (1975-80) EDF 4. 
Lome II (1980-85) EDF 5. 
Lome III (1985-90) EDF 6. 
Lome IV (1990-2000) EDF 7 and 8 (Lome IV bis 

1995-2000). 
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involves two levels of action: the programming 
exercise which defines the overall character and level 
of funding of the various national indicative pro­
grammes (NIPs) and regional indicative programmes 
(RIPs), and the project formulation which converts 
each programme into a set of viable projects. Both of 
these form part of a single process of EDF project cycle 
management. 

For the purposes of this chapter the two stages can 
usefully be separated. The present section reviews the 
EDF programming exercise, indicating its main points 
of difference from budget line management, while a 
later section (Section 5) considers the remaining phases 
of project cycle management for both the EQF and the 
tropical forestry budget line. 1 

2.2.1 National and Regional Indicative 
Programming under the Lome 
Conventions 

During the process of ratification and signature of the 
Lome Convention, a programming exercise is carried 
out between the EU and each ACP government. The 
method of programming set out in the Convention 
involves several steps: 

(i) notice is given by the Commission of the amount of 
resources (both programmable and non­
programmable4) available to the country in 
question;5 

(ii) a strategy paper is then drawn up between the 
Commission and the ACP government, which is the 
basis for the negotiation of an aid agreement 
known as the National Indicative Programme 
(NIP); 

(iii) a contract document is signed on completion of the 
negotiations. 

The National Indicative Programmes for the individual 
signatories to the Lome Convention and the Regional 
Indicative Programmes for regional and sub-regional 
groupings fulfil a number of functions. They lay down 
development priorities, define focal areas of co­
operation, allocate the resources for meeting objectives, 
earmark projects and programmes and set out the 
timetables for implementation. 

There are currently 56 EU Delegations covering the 
70 ACP states. The Delegations act in a coordinating 
capacity in the negotiation of the NIPs. Each Delegation 
provides the Commission with a draft strategy paper 
based on its discussions with its associated ACP 
government. This covers the specific constraints and 
difficulties of the country in question, and recommends 
sectors or particular areas for EC intervention. 

4. Programmable aid includes a country's entitlements in the form 
of NIP, RIP and the Structural Adjustment Facility. Non­
programmable aid is allocated at the discretion of the Commis­
sion, on a case-by -case basis. It includes grants forST ABEX and 
SYSMIN, risk capital, interest rate subsidies, refugee aid and 
emergency aid. It accounted for 65% of EDF6 and 57% of 
EDF7 (see Koning, 1997: 129-30). 

5. The amount of programmable aid allocated to each country is 
based on a formula which takes into account criteria such as 
population, GNP per capita, external debt, and special 
circumstances (whether landlocked, an island state, a least 
developed country, etc.). 
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Initiation of the NIP has traditionally been a rather 
complex and opaque process, involving inputs from the 
host government, the Delegation and the Brussels desk. 
Pressure has been growing to increase the transparency 
of the negotiations, in order to generate a greater sense 
of host country ownership. 6 

Once the first draft has been agreed by the host 
government, it is passed by the Delegation to the 
Country Desk Officer in Brussels. There are likely to be 
several exchanges of views between the desk, the 
Delegation and the applicant government, and several 
revisions of the draft. Each programme is screened by a 
committee which includes representatives of the main 
fields of co-operation in DG VIII (the horizontal 
departments, sectoral experts, technical experts, rele­
vant geographical desk officers). The resulting pre­
programming document is then formally presented to 
the EDF Committee, which has responsibility for 
financial decisions and is made up of representatives 
of the EU Member States. Once approved, the pre­
programming document forms the basis for the official 
negotiations between the Commission and the relevant 
ACP government, leading to the preparation of the 
National Indicative Programme. Negotiations on the 
NIP usually take place during an overseas programming 
mission by officials from Brussels. 

2.2.2 Focal areas of co-operation 
Decisions concerning financial allocations to individual 
ACP states are made by the Commission and commu­
nicated to the recipient country governments. The latter 
are not directly involved in the determination of the 
financial commitments, such decisions being the sole 
responsibility of the Commission. A period of dialogue 
with each ACP partner then ensues concerning the 
character of the programme to be developed within the 
given financial envelope. According to the fundamental 
principles of the Lome Convention, it is through the 
programming exercise that each ACP government 
decides on the sectors that the NIP should support. 
The main areas of priority are known as the focal areas 
(sometimes referred to in the Commission as focal 
sectors or concentration sectors7

). The programming 
exercise also identifies the instruments or types of 
development assistance that are most appropriate to the 
country's development needs. Article 281 of Lome IV 
bis sets out the implementation procedures for the NIP 
and the information that the ACP partner must provide 
as regards the resources needed both for focal sector 
and support activities. 

Normally, there are not more than three focal areas 
of co-operation per country. These tend to be rather 
broadly defined; for example - to cite a number of 
recent cases - 'balanced and regular delivery of 
transport services', 'decentralised local community 
development', 'to address the needs of the majority 

6. Among the changes mooted has been the proposal that the first 
draft of the programming document should emerge from a joint 
Commission/government seminar. 

7. The equivalent term in French is domaine de concentration. 

8. The focal areas for regional programmes would be likely to have 
a clear regional focus - eg. 'regional economic integration and, 
in particular, increased intra -regional trade'. 

with regard to health and education', 'to develop 
agriculture while simultaneously protecting the envir­
onment'. 8 Focal areas tend to be those in which the 
recipient government wishes to see funds spent, and are 
not necessarily ones which the Commission or Delega­
tion would see as priorities. A variety of factors enter 
into the decision-making process, including the overall 
aid profile of the country in question, and the areas in 
which other donors are either already active or, 
alternatively, under-represented. The NIP Framework 
of Co-operation agreement for each country identifies 
the focal sectors, and indicates the percentages of the 
overall funding envelope to be devoted to each of them. 
It also identifies the percentage allocation to operations 
outside the focal areas.9 i 

Focal areas are not to be confused with 'cross-cutting 
themes'10 which all EDF programmes are required to 
take into account. There are four of these: sustainable 
social and economic development; the fight against 
poverty; integration into the world economy; and the 
observance of human rights and fundamental 
freedoms. 

2.2.3 Participation of ACP states 
In the early years, negotiations between the Commis­
sion and ACP states were largely restricted to con­
sideration of the individual merits of the projects which 
the latter wished to see financed. In recent years, 
particularly since Lome III, the Commission has 
adopted a more policy-oriented approach in its relations 
with ACP partners, encouraging the use of EDF funds 
for sectoral development and reform. The Structural 
Adjustment facility, which was introduced in 1987 and 
offers additional aid funds in response to certain 
performance criteria, has reinforced the policy focus. 11 

This has increased the demands placed on the Commis­
sion with regard to the fostering of policy dialogue, 
though there have been criticisms that the Delegations 
and country desks lack the necessary capacity to ensure 
that this occurs. 

2.3 The budget lines 
Projects funded from the Tropical Forestry budget line 
are handled quite differently from EDF programming. 
DG VIII has a considerable amount of discretion over 
the use of that portion of budget line funds which it 
controls. By and large, this discretion is exercised 
without reference to ACP governments. Creation of 
the budget line has allowed the Directorate-General to 
fund activities it regards as relevant to ACP forestry 
development but which recipient governments have 
proved unwilling to see funded from their own EDF 
allocations. Introduction of the budget line has also 
greatly increased the freedom of action of the Tropical 
Forestry Adviser, and, as will be discussed later, has 
allowed for the creative use of the DG VIII allocation in 

9. To give one example of the relative allocations: the NIP for 
Cameroon under Lome IV his allocates 50-55% of total funds 
to Focal Area No. 1 (Transport sector policy), 25-30% to Focal 
Area No. 2 (Decentralised local community development), and a 
maximum of 20% to Operations outside the focal sectors. 

10. Known in French as themes transversaux. 

11. The criteria of positive performance are both economic and 
political (for example, democratisation) -see Koning, 1997:133. 



support of a strategy aiming to heighten the profile of 
tropical forestry in EDF programming. 

2.4 Staffing and ratio of forestry advisers 
to financial commitment 

The Tropical Forestry budget line in DG VIII is 
managed by the Forestry Adviser (national expert) 
located in N1, under the Head of Division. Currently, 
one-third of the overall budget line is managed by this 
individual (at present (1997) ECU 19 m. per annum). 
Environment is also handled by a single Adviser, with 
responsibility for half of the overall environment Budget 
line allocation (currently ECU 15 m., shared equally 
between DG VIII and DG IB). Both of these are 
supported by two accounts officers with financial 
(budgetary) responsibilities. 

A number of other Units within the Directorate­
General may have competence over forestry matters, 
and deal with forestry as part of their wider brief, 
without being formally designated as such. At present, 
these include one staff member within the Division G3 
('Fisheries, livestock, agriculture research'), who man­
ages that part of the forestry budget line dealing with 
wildlife and protected areas; D6 ('Agriculture and rural 
development' Division of the Directorate for West and 
Central Africa), the brief of which inevitably impinges 
on forestry matters; E6 (the parallel Division to D6 
within the Directorate for East and Southern Africa); 
and F5 (a multi-disciplinary group 'Infrastructure, 
agriculture and rural development' within the Directo­
rate for the Caribbean, Pacific and Indian Ocean). 
There is also a small number of professional foresters in 
the Delegations. 

With' only one professional officer to promote and 
manage the forestry brief for the whole Directorate­
General, the staffing constraint which is apparent 
throughout the Commission is particularly evident in 
the area of tropical forestry. There is no explicit fund 
earmarked for tropical forestry under Lome (nor does a 
percentage rule apply to the ACP countries, unlike the 
regional budgets for Asia and Latin America which 
have a 10% environment allocation [see the chapter on 
DG IB] ). Lome IV his stands at ECU 14 billion (one­
third of all EU development funds). Expenditure on 
tropical forestry projects within the Lome envelope 
varies markedly from year to year. One recent estimate 
puts expenditure on tropical forestry from the EDF, 
over the period 1992-6, at ECU 46.22 m., though 
varying widely from year to year, with ECU 23.28 m. 
expended in 1992, but only ECU 889,321 expended in 
1993 (Planistat, 1997:28). Average expenditure under 
Lome in this period was ECU 9.24 m. Overall tropical 
forestry related expenditure by DG VIII in the period 
1992-6, including EDF and three budget lines (tropical 
forestry, environment and NGO) has been estimated at 
ECU 138.73 million (ibid). Using this figure, the 
professional responsibility of the Tropical Forestry 
Adviser can be said to be of the order of ECU 28 
million per year, of which about half has been under the 
Tropical Forestry budget line, B7-6201. However, 
much of the responsibility for the non-B7-6201 
expenditure is indirect. 
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2.5 Management of NIPs/RIPs 
The National Indicative Programme defines the overall 
framework of EDF funding to a particular country. 
Realisation of the Programme is through the vehicle of 
individual projects. Identification of projects is the joint 
responsibility of the recipient government and the EC 
desk officer, supported by the EU in-country Delega­
tion. Project proposals are screened by the EDF 
Committee which meets monthly. There is no internal 
review procedure at present, although DG VIII is in the 
process of introducing a new committee, the Quality 
Support Group (QSG), which will screen projects prior 
to their presentation to the EDF Committee. The 
mandate of the QSG will be to help officials improve 
preparation and appraisal of EDF operation~~ and thus 
improve the 'quality, relevance, viability and sustain­
ability' of EC aid. The Group will have eleven members, 
representing the various sectoral and geographical 
Divisions of DG VIII, and it will be chaired by the 
Head of Directorate A (Development Policy). Previous 
attempts to introduce similar screening bodies met with 
rather limited success, due, it is said, to opposition from 
country desk officers opposed to the heightened 
influence which such a grouping would give to the 
policy units (Koning, 1997:139). 

Management responsibility within the Commission 
for all phases of NIP and project identification rests 
with the Geographical Country Desk. Feasibility studies 
and financing arrangements are also the responsibility 
of the desk. During the implementation phase, respon­
sibility within the Commission for supervision of 
project execution passes from the desk to technical 
units. Where appropriate technical units exist within the 
geographical directorates (viz. 'Agriculture and rural 
development' and 'infrastructures'12

), authority will 
normally be retained within the directorate. In other 
cases (for example, 'health' and 'education and train­
ing'), responsibility passes to another directorate, 
normally Directorate G; 'Sectoral implementation'. 

In-country supervision of projects (for example, 
tendering procedures and drawing up contracts) is the 
joint responsibility of the Delegation and the recipient 
government. An important role in such procedures is 
played by the National Authorising Officer (NAO), a 
Minister of the recipient government, who acts as the 
contact point with the Commission, and represents the 
government in matters concerning the EDF programme. 

2.5.1 Channels and beneficiaries of DG VIII 
funds 

As outlined in Article 3.2 of the Council Regulation 
3062/95 of 1995 (see Section 3.4, below): 

The recipients of aid and partners in co-operation 
may include not only states, regions and overseas 
countries and territories but also decentralised 
authorities, regional organisations, public bodies, 
local or traditional communities, private industries 
and operators, including cooperatives and non­
governmental organisations and representative 

12. These two sectoral units are separate entities within Directorates 
D and E, though combined as one 'Multidisciplinary group' 
within Directorate F. 



72 • DG VIII 

associations of forest peoples, which include the 
conservation of tropical forests among their objec­
tives or regular activities. 

The types of partners engaged in budget line activities 
tend to reflect the European dimension of the Commis­
sion's work. A range of European Consultancy firms, 
national and international NGOs and charitable orga­
nisations, and universities/consortia has received fund­
ing, sometimes in partnership with counterparts in the 
recipient countries and regions. Horizontal projects are 
not necessarily linked to any one country or region. 

The range of partners under EDF co-operation tends 
to be very broad and may include small, medium and 
large private sector organisations, banks, NGOs and 
community associations, as well as government depart­
ments and agencies, and public services. Management 
may involve local and expatriate consultancy firms and 
direct contract staff. Selection of partners is subject to 
strict tendering and contract procedures, as laid down 
in the EDF financing regulations. 13 As a general rule, 
only EU and ACP persons, companies and public or 
semi-public agencies can participate in EC/ACP tenders 
under the EDF, and equipment and plant must also be 
of EU or ACP origin. Tendering procedures vary 
according to the size of the contract, with the largest 
contracts involving international calls for prequalifica­
tion. For smaller projcts or provision of services, rules 
of restricted tender are likely to apply, with invitations 
being restricted to Consultancy companies on the official 
EC/ACP registers. Primary responsibility for the tender­
ing procedure, as well as for project management lies 
with the ACP country, particularly the National 
Authorising Officer, acting in association with the EC 
Country Delegation (see section 5). 

2.6 Strengths and weaknesses of the DG 
VIII approach 

The strengths of the DG VIII approach, as it now 
operates, derive from its relative freedom from political 
influence. Aid delivery by DG VIII is less influenced by 
national foreign policy or commercial interests than are 
the bilateral EU aid programmes (Bainbridge and 
Teasdale, 1996). Once the size of the EDF has been 
established, DG VIII has relative autonomy over the 
programme on the EC side. 

2.6.1 Integration of sectoral priorities 
At the level of sectoral integration, however, existing 
structures and procedures present a mixed picture. 
While the more established development objectives are 
reasonably well accommodated in EDF aid, integration 
of the newer sectoral priorities (such as forestry and the 
environment) is arguably rather poor (Koning, 1997: 
142). This can be attributed to a number of factors: the 
time lag between priority identification and the dis­
bursement of aid (so that the newer aims have not yet 
been fully taken on board); the demanding nature of the 
emerging themes; and also the tendency to concentrate 
attention on deliverable outputs, such as infrastructure, 

13. See: 'The User's Guide to Tenders and Contracts Financed by 
the EDF', Commission Document DG VIII/151/94-EN (revised 
10/96), Brussels, May, 1994. 

at the expense of complex and cross-cutting social 
objectives. The consultancy mode in which most EC aid 
is managed similarly encourages a conservative bias, as 
does the complexity of EDF aid management. The 
principle of partnership which is central to the Lome 
Conventions also means that recipient governments 
have considerable discretion in their choice of priority 
sectors for their NIPs, and external concerns may thus 
be rather difficult to promote. 

At the same time, the structure of the Directorate­
General is itself unconducive to the integration of 
innovative sectoral themes, including tropical forestry. 
DG VIII's organisation is primarily along geographical 
lines, and the integration of horizontal ,issues is 
inherently problematic. Neither geographical desks 
nor delegations are particularly responsive to DG VIII's 
technical priorities, and serious constraints of staffing, 
together with the wide geographical and thematic 
coverage of EC international representation, compound 
the difficulties. 

2.6.2 Tropical forestry in DG VIII 
With regard to the specific issue of the integration of 
tropical forestry into development priorities, DG VIII 
programming is unsatisfactory from a number of points 
of view. The major issue concerns the points of entry for 
forestry into EDF structures. The process of drawing up 
NIP/RIPs tends to be rather cumbersome, and domi­
nated by geographical interests. The two key levels of 
implementation- the Country Desk Officer in Brussels 
and the Delegation in the ACP countries- are primarily 
managerial appointments, without defined sectoral 
competences linked to their geographical postings. 
EDF regulations do not commit the Directorate-General 
to any specific level of funding for tropical forestry, 
beyond those specified in the focal areas. These rarely 
identify forestry as a priority.14 

In order for forestry matters to be adequately taken 
into account in the processes of project identification, 
there is need for early recognition of key sectoral 
concerns by the programming authorities. This rarely 
happens in practice. Delegation and desk staff have 
generally lacked skills in the forestry sector, and the 
massive workload of the sector specialists has prevented 
them from intervening in ED F programming either early 
enough or with sufficient commitments of time. 
Forestry is felt to have been rather poorly represented 
in the NIP/RIPs of the 8th EDF, even in those instances 
where it might have been expected to have been a major 
priority. 

While responsibility within the Commission for 
project management normally transfers from geogra­
phical desks to technical units in the execution phase, 
the desks may hesitate to involve Division A/1 
('Sustainable development and natural resources') in 
day-to-day management issues, on the grounds that 
A/1 's brief is primarily policy-oriented. Valid as this 

14. For example, forestry is not a focal area for Cameroon or 
Uganda under the 8th EDF, despite the fact that these two 
countries have important forest resources, although transport 
sector policy is; on the other hand, forestry is a focal sector for 
the Comores, which is not a major timber producer. Forestry is, 
however, a focal sector for the RIP for Central Africa, an area 
which includes Cameroon. 



may be, All is the sole Division in DG VIII with a 
specific mandate for tropical forestry, and the unit best 
able to promote tropical forestry perspectives in EDF 
programming. 

2.6.3 Tropical forestry - the definitional issue 
The issue of the limited integration of tropical forestry, 
as a thematic area, into EDF procedures is important 
not only in its own right (in that forestry is, or should 
be, a major area of Commission intervention in all those 
ACP countries with important forest resources) but also 
in relation to the issue of environmental impacts. There 
are two particular areas of concern. In the first instance, 
forestry may well figure as an important, if subsidiary, 
component of actions in other sectoral areas, in which 
the proper management of the forestry component is 
essential for project success. And secondly, because of 
the extent to which forestry is influenced by extra­
sectoral issues (infrastructural development, trade 
policy, fiscal reform, policy on land conversion and 
settlement, etc.), interventions in other areas may have 
major impacts on the forest sector. In such cases, 
seemingly peripheral issues of definition and classifica­
tion may well prove crucial to the recognition of 
forestry impacts. As yet, management procedures with­
in DG VIII are arguably some way from addressing 
these cross-sectoral issues. However, with the increas­
ingly strategic deployment of a dedicated Tropical 
Forestry budget line, as well as certain procedural 
innovations, there is growing potential for a more 
integrated and coherent approach. 

2.6.4 Strategic use of the budget line 
DG VIII/All's response to the minor role of tropical 
forestry within the EDF programming procedures has 
been to adopt an increasingly strategic orientation. In 
some cases (for example, in relation to work on the 
evolution of the international timber trade), the budget 
line is being used to help define EDF policy. In other 
instances (for example, studies on timber certification), 
budget line projects are used as pilot activities, the 
intention being to bring them to a stage of potential 
replicability, at which point they can be absorbed into 
the funding procedures of the EDF. The aim in both 
cases is to heighten the profile of tropical forestry within 
the Directorate-General, and to ensure that forest 
impacts become a central concern in all of its aid 
allocations. 

2.6.5 Procedural innovations 
At the same time, DG VIII management has also 
recognised the need for greater harmony between 
policy and implementation, and recent changes in 
decision-making procedures reflect a desire to strength­
en the policy and sectoral implementation units. 
However, these procedures continue to work within 
the constraints of staffing shortages and of the 
partnership principle enshrined in Lome, and on both 
counts the Commission has limited ability to impose its 
will. 

Efforts are increasingly being made to integrate EDF 
management and VIII/All policy at the structural level, 
to the benefit of tropical forestry. For instance, the 
setting up of the Steering Committee of the Tropical 
Forestry and Environment Budget Lines, which com-
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prises the Heads of Directorates of DG VIII and 
representatives of DGs IB and XI, indicates a move 
towards greater transparency and coordination with 
other services. The Steering Committee (officially the 
'Inter-Service Committee') meets two or three times a 
year to discuss the projects proposed for funding, and 
representatives give views on projects that fall within 
their geographical/technical portfolio. The minutes of 
the meeting are circulated, as are details of the status of 
budget line programming. A Background Note was 
circulated in June 1996 outlining the purpose of the 
budget lines, and proposing further 'in house' contribu­
tions in the form of projects (Background Note of 
4/6/97). 

3. STRATEGY AND POLICY 
As the importance of tropical forests has grown within 
the Commission, so have the accompanying DG VIII 
structures to deal with them. This section outlines the 
strategic approach being developed in DG VIII to 
promote the theme of tropical forestry, in the face of the 
organisational and management constraints set out 
above. 

3.1 Past strategy 
Until the early 1990s, there was a fairly ad hoc 
approach to forestry issues in DG VIII, and forestry 
was generally dealt with as a sub-component of broader 
activities, such as rural development. Tropical forest 
projects and interventions were supported from diverse 
funding sources (for example, the budget line B?-5040: 
Ecology in Developing Countries), without any over­
arching strategy or policy. 

With the growth in environmental awareness in the 
1980s, and especially since the UNCED Conference in 
1992, there has been an increase in the capacity­
building of Commission services, in terms both of 
increased funds and of policy orientation. There has 
also been an increase in strategic thinking, and policies 
with clearer operational/practical applications. 

The period of the late 1980s, in which the awareness 
of environmental problems in general and tropical 
forests in particular, came increasingly to the fore, was 
accompanied by increased activity and reflection within 
DG VIII. Pressure from the European Green Movement 
was particularly influential. Commission responses 
tended to be high in good intentions but with only a 
limited operational aspect. The 1989 Communication, 
'The Conservation of Tropical Forests: The Role of the 
Community', for example, put its main emphasis on 
support for programmes external to the Commission, 
the FAO-supported Tropical Forests Action Programme 
and International Timber Trade Organisation, despite 
pressure from the environmental movement for a 
greater internal policy orientation, and some misgivings 
as to the effectiveness of the chosen agencies (WWF, 
1991:1). 

The 1991 review of tropical forestry sector activities, 
which was undertaken by the International Forest 
Science Consultancy (IFSC), marked a recognition by 
the Commission of the growing importance of aid 
funding to the tropical forestry sector, and an acknowl­
edgement of the inadequacy of its existing approach. 
The review made a number of recommendations, 
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including the need for an overall strategy and the 
development of guidelines for staff of the Commission 
and Delegations on the identification and formulation 
of projects so as to ensure its effective implementation. 

3.2 Tropical forestry in the period 
1992-1995. 

The 1992 UNCED Conference led to significant 
changes in the overall legal and policy environment 
for tropical forestry aid. All signatories (the Commis­
sion included) were obliged to implement the under­
takings of Agenda 21, as well as meet the legally 
binding provisions of the Biodiversity, Climate Change 
and Desertification Conventions. The Commission was 
also involved in ongoing discussion processes concern­
ing, for example, the possibility of a legally binding 
instrument for forests to build on the (non-binding) 
UNCED Forest Principles. The Commission took on a 
number of responsibilities and legal obligations with 
regard to Tropical Forests, at the level of both internal 
policy and international processes. The former in­
cluded the programme of the Fifth Environmental 
Action Plan, 'Towards Sustainability', launched in 
1993 (EC, 1993b), which dealt with policy and actions 
relating to the environment and sustainable develop­
ment, and the latter, inputs into the UN Commission 
on Sustainable Development and its offspring, the 
Intergovernmental Panel on Forests (IPF). These 
changes have led to a greater focus on monitoring 
and reporting activities, and to the development of 
more complex systems to classify project commitments 
and justify activities, in tropical forestry and 
environment. 

The period leading up to, and immediately following, 
the UNCED Conference signalled a much-increased role 
of the Commission as an actor on Tropical Forest 
issues. The period was characterised by a proliferation 
of Resolutions, Communications and other legal 
instruments aimed at putting Tropical Forests on the 
agenda in practical, as well as theoretical, terms. 

In terms of follow-up to UNCED, the major actions 
internal to the Commission were: 

(i) The 'Seminar on European Community Actions in 
Favour of Tropical Forests', held in Brussels in 
January, 1993, to take stock of the Rio Conference 

(ii) The opening of the (previously agreed but not yet 
active) Tropical Forestry budget line (B?-5041/ 
6201) and the introduction of the corresponding 
Regulation. 

(iii) The negotiation of Protocol 10 to the Lome 
Convention. 

Again, in seeking to understand such developments, a 
separation has to be made between issues relating to the 
EDF and those relating to the budget line. 

3.3 Forestry and the programming of 
NIP/RIPs 

Over the years the Lome Convention has been gradually 
modified to give priority to activities which are likely to 
promote sustainable forestry and conservation. For 
example, Article 4 of Lome IV (1990) emphasises the 
need for development to be 'based on a sustainable 

balance between its economic objectives, the rational 
management of the environment and the enhancement 
of natural and human resources'. 

Article 14 indicates, among priorities in the main 
areas of co-operation, that: 

Co-operation shall entail mutual responsibility for 
preservation of the natural heritage. In particular, it 
shall attach special importance to environmental 
protection and the preservation and restoration of 
natural equilibria in the ACP States. Co-operation 
schemes in all areas shall therefore be designed to 
make the objectives of economic growth compatible 
with development that respects natural equilibria and 
brings about lasting results in the service of man. 

In the framework of efforts to protect the environ­
ment and restore natural balances, co-operation shall 
help promote specific operations concerning the 
conservation of natural resources, renewable and 
non-renewable, the protection of ecosystems and the 
control of drought, desertification and deforestation; 
other operations on specific themes shall also be 
undertaken (notably locust control, the protection 
and utilisation of water resources, the preservation of 
tropical forests and biological diversity, the promo­
tion of a better balance between urban and rural 
areas, and the urban environment). 

A new section on the environment was introduced into 
Lome IV (Articles 33-41). Article 33 set out the 
objective of EU support with regard to environmental 
issues, including forestry. It stated that: 

the protection and the enhancement of the environ­
ment and natural resources, the halting of the 
deterioration of land and forests, the restoration of 
ecological balances, the preservation of natural 
resources and their rational exploitation are basic 
objectives that the ACP States concerned shall strive 
to achieve with Community support, with a view to 
bringing an immediate improvement in the living 
conditions of their populations and to safeguarding 
those of future generations. 

Lome IV bis was signed in 1995 and gave formal 
recognition to the threat of deforestation, and to the 
need for joint intergovernmental action on the part of 
both ACP and EU Member states. Environmental 
objectives were listed as basic aims to be pursued by 
ACP states with EU support. The Convention carried a 
requirement that all future projects should be subject to 
an environmental assessment. For the first time, tropical 
forests were included as a specific and discrete topic in 
the form of a Protocol to Lome IV bis: Protocol tO 'on 
sustainable management of forest resources'. This 
summarises concern for tropical forests, and states that 
'special priority shall be given to actions which support 
and encourage the efforts of ACP States and their 
organisations to preserve, re-establish and use sustain­
ably their forestry resources, including the fight against 
desertification' (Para 2). 

Protocol 10 sets out a number of priority areas within 
tropical forests where efforts should be concentrated, 
such as: 

• the conservation of endangered tropical forests and 
their biodiversity; 



• the development of buffer zones; 
• the sustainable management of forests destined for 

the production of timber and other forest 
products; 

• afforestation and reforestation; 
• institution building; 
• strategic and adaptive research; 
• improved planning at local, national and regional 

levels; 
• the improvement of timber trade and marketing 

from forests under sustainable use; 
• the certification of forest management and forest 

products; 
• improved access to and transfer of technology and 

technical co-operation, to help attain the objective 
of sustainable development (Para 4 ). 

These suggest areas favoured for joint action between 
the EU and the ACP states within the EDF negotiations. 
Protocol 10 does not, however, commit any funds 
specifically to forestry, nor does it oblige the signatories 
to the Convention to implement its aims. 

Focal sectors 
A new requirement was included in Lome IV bis, to the 
effect that focal sectors should be selected to put 
'emphasis on poverty alleviation and sustainable devel­
opment' [Article 281 para 2(b)]. This may be expected 
to increase the profile of tropical forestry within ED F 
programming, albeit indirectly. 

Tropical forests may be identified as a focal sector 
where indicated by development criteria. Collectively, 
the various forest-related Articles of the Convention 
and the Protocol would suggest the relevant criteria to 
be: 

• large numbers of people relying on forests; 
• unique or endangered biodiversity; 
• high deforestation; environmental problems stem­

ming from deforestation; 
• danger of loss of livelihoods; 
• high profile of forest revenue in national income; 

high-level political backing for addressing forest 
problems. 

In principle, if one of these criteria applies, then 
integration of forestry into the country's NIP should 
be considered (see: 'Sector Programming of the 8th 
EDF'). 

Integration of forestry into NIPs might also be 
indicated even if there is no awareness or readiness in 
an ACP country. This is the case when there is a risk of 
losing unique ecosystems, areas of biodiversity or of 
social and cultural heritage, where preservation is of 
global interest. In such a situation, the desk officer in 
Brussels is likely to have a key role in deciding whether 
or not to press for an appropriate modification of the 
NIP. 

3.4 The Tropical Forestry budget line 
The creation of the Tropical Forestry budget line in 
1991-2 attests to the greater recognition now being 
given to the problems facing tropical forests. Its aim is 
to 'support operations to promote the conservation and 
sustainable management of tropical forests and their 
associated biological diversity'. Its fields of application 
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are outlined in Article 4 of Council Regulation No. 
3062/95 of 1995. Article 4(e) of the Regulation focuses 
on the need for actions centred on 'capacity-building to 
address the need for training schemes for local 
populations, forest managers and researchers, for 
legislation for increased political and social support 

· and institutional strengthening, and for organisations 
and associations active in forest conservation'. There 
are eight priority areas: 

• conservation of primary tropical forests and their 
biodiversity and renewal of tropical forests which 
have been damaged; 

• sustainable management of forests designed for the 
production of timber and other products.\ 

• definition and development of certification systems; 
• provision of prior information to forest peoples 

(identification, planning and implementation of 
actions); 

• capacity building; 
• strategic and adapted research policy aimed at 

supplying the knowledge required for the conser­
vation and sustainable management; 

• development of buffer zones to assist the conserva­
tion or regeneration of tropical forests; 

• development and implementation of forest man­
agement plans aimed at conserving tropical 
forests. 

3.5 Present strategy on tropical forests 
A series of influences has thus converged in recent years 
to heighten the profile of tropical forestry both generally 
within the Commission and specifically in DG VIII. 
Some of these influences have been Commission-wide. 
These include internal pressures (for example, the 
implications of the IFSC 1991 review) and external 
ones (the UNCED Conference, for example, and the 
increased public interest in tropical forestry and 
environmental issues over the last decade). Others have 
related to influences specific to DG VIII (for example, 
the desire to introduce sectoral expertise into the 
management of the EDF). Collectively, these influences 
have led to the formulation of the EC strategy on forest 
sector co-operation. 

The EC strategy 
The overall objective for the strategy is that 'sustainable 
forest development should lead to a reduction and, in 
the long run, to a cessation of further destruction of 
irreplaceable resources'. 

The approach of EC Forest Sector Development Co­
operation is to ensure that 'individuals and communities 
dealing with forests and forestry, and society at large, 
benefit in an equitable way from forest-related products 
and services which are produced on a socially, 
economically and environmentally-sound basis'. 

This will be achieved by promoting sustainable forest 
management, in line with international principles, in a 
decentralised and participatory manner and according 
to a livelihoods perspective that gives due recognition of 
the interrelationship between forests and other land 
uses. 

The underlying assumption behind the approach is 
that 'deforestation is rooted in a complex web of social, 
economic and institutional problems, and it is 
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commonly accepted that (the origins of the) problem 
largely lie outside the forests'. 

The principles of forest sector co-operation 
The need for all aid management staff to take fully 
into account the complexity of the influences on the 
condition of the forest sector, and the extent and 
importance of out-of-sector influences, has been 
underlined in a set of guiding principles which 
underpin the strategy and are intended to be applied 
by all EC staff involved in forest sector development 
co-operation. These concern the economic, social and 
environmental dimensions of sustainable development 
(see Box 1). 

DG VIII Forestry Instruments 
DG VIIIIN1 has developed a range of tools to support 
DG VIII's forestry strategy. This is based on the 
recognition that a sound legal framework (the Regula­
tion, Protocol 10, etc.) is not, by itself, sufficient to 
result in the achievement of the key objectives, and that 
there is need for active engagement with priority topics 

through a range of instruments. Two of these in 
particular - the forthcoming Communication to Coun­
cil and Parliament and the 1996 Guidelines for Forest 
Sector Development Co-operation - will provide the 
context for assistance and policy dialogue in the forestry 
sector. The Regulation, which was due to be presented 
in late 1997, will review present strategy on tropical 
forests and seek to incorporate innovative develop­
ments. The Guidelines seek to heighten the profile of 
tropical forestry within the Commission and provide 
non-specialist staff with a set of accessible principles to 
facilitate project appraisal from the perspective of forest 
impacts (see Box 2). The complete range of instruments 
is shown in Table 1. 

4. PROJECTS FUNDED BY REGION, 
TYPE AND SIZE 

The inventories of tropical forestry projects made by 
IFSC (1991) and Planistat-Europe (1997) indicate that, 
between 1978 and 1995, a total of approximately 766 
projects relating to tropical forestry and timber have 
been supported by the Commission, to a value of ECU 
867m. A total of 256 projects to a value of ECU 397m. 
were supported in the period 1978-90 (IFSC), and 510 
projects to a value of ECU 470m. in the period 1992-6 
(Planistat). 15 This section reviews the pattern of 
expenditure by funding source, as one indication of 
programme coverage. 

4.1 Analysis of projects supported in the 
last two decades 

4.1.1 Questions of classification 
Since forestry can be a component of actions in other 
sectors, there are problems of both identification and 
categorisation when dealing with the analysis of 
interventions by the Commission in the field of forestry. 
Particularly problematic is the identification of a 
forestry sub-component of a broader programme (for 
example, an agricultural or road-building programme) 
which is coded according to the major activity codes. 
The coding for projects funded under EDF and budget 
lines is not harmonised: 

• Until 1996 EDF projects were classified by 
economic sectoral focus, and several technical 
codes. From March 1996 they have been classified 
using DAC codes. 

• In the case of the budget line, there is no consistent 
coding. Budget line projects tend to be coded by 
those who directly manage them, and are not 
therefore necessarily complementary one with 
another. 

Information for this section has been drawn from two 
sources - the inventories of tropical forestry projects 
made by IFSC (1991) and Planistat-Europe (1996). 
These use different systems of classification of forestry 
projects and of what constitutes 'forestry'. Specific 
problems which have arisen through the use of these 

15. The year 1991 is not fully covered under either classification, 
and data for this year are thus missing from most of the 
following analysis. 
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Table 1 Forestry Instruments 

inventories have been: the fact that the year 1991 was 
not fully covered by either inventory; differences in the 
scope of the studies; inconsistency of coding; differences 
in approach to classification of projects with a 
secondary forestry component, and different ways of 
recording the funding of such projects. Planistat's 
overall estimates of forestry commitments, for example, 
are based on projects funded by DGs XI and XII as well 
as DGs IB & VIII, and also funds committed to forestry 
activities within projects with a different overall 
purpose (provided that the forestry component is 
evident from the project title). The IFSC study (1991) 
included projects in five directorates general - DGs I, 
VI, VIII, XI and XII. Projects were identified as 

(Source : DGVIII/A/1) 

'forestry' on the basis of DG VIII's 'PIC' project 
information system; all projects listed in Section 37 of 
this system ('forestry') were included in the grouping, as 
were 33 other projects (from 270 potential projects) 
which the IFSC considered, on the basis of their PICS' 
classification, to have 'significant forestry activities' 
(IFSC, 1991:4).16 

16. A third study of interest is the 1996 inventory of environment 
and forestry projects by ERM. However, this study excludes 
both DG XI or XII, and codes only by primary purpose (ERM, 
1996:p.26). The ERM classification is thus more restrictive than 
either of the other two, as far as forestry is concerned. 
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Figure 2 Funding commitments for tropical forest 
activities by DG VIII, 1976-96 
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Figure 3 Number of tropical forest projects in DG VIII 
funded by year, 1976-96 
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Figure 4 DG VIII- Commitments for tropical forestry activities by year, 1976-96 
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4.1.2 Total expenditure on forestry projects 
Figures 2 and 3 show the aggregated amount from all 
sources committed to tropical forest activities by DG 
VIII, and the total number of projects funded, in the 
period 1976-96. 

Figures 4 and 5 present the amounts of funds 
committed to forestry activities over the period 1976-
96 and 1976-95 respectively. 17 These indicate the 
changes in the pattern of funding over the years, with 
the creation of the tropical forestry budget line being 
the first source of funding explicitly for forestry 

17. A distinction needs to be made between funds committed and 
funds spent as there is often a major difference between the two. 
Payment rates in the period 1992-6 vary between 7% (1996, 
payments to date) and 63% (1992), with an average of 37% 
overall. In genera l, the smaller the project size, the higher the 
payment rate (Planistat, 1997:52). Except where otherwise 
indicated, figures in this section concern commitments rather 
than payments. 

(Source: Planistat 1997; IFSC 1991). 

projects. The high variability in commitments, year on 
year, evident in the aggregated figures (Figures 2 and 3), 
is reflected in the individual commitments for the major 
funding sources. It is clear that the relative importance 
of the EDF as a source of funding for tropical forest 
initiatives has diminished since the introduction of the 
dedicated budget line. The amounts spent under the 
NGO and Environment budget lines have always been 
small, but expenditure under the NGO budget line has 
increased significantly in recent years, and the number 
of projects funded under this budget line (though not 
their size) is now superior to that for any other 
source.18 

18. This is partly due to the fact that the NGO budget line covers all 
ALNMED as well as ACP countries; all geographical areas 
covered by the NGO budget line are included in the data for 
Figures 2-5. 
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Figure 5 DG VIII- Number of forestry projects fund~d by source and by year, 1976-95 
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4.1.3 Geographical spread of projects 
(DG VIII -all sources) 

The 1991 IFSC study revealed an uneven distribution of 
countries receiving aid for tropical forests. The ACP 
group as a whole received a total for the sector of ECU 
296m. in the period 1978-91, which represents 74% of 
the global total. 53 ACP countries were eligible for aid 
for tropical forests. Within this group, aid was very 
unevenly distributed. For example, Senegal was allo­
cated 11 projects over the period, Ethiopia 9 and Cote 
d'Ivoire, 8. Expenditure for one country, Cote d'Ivoire, 
was ECU 56 m. - 19% of the total - while some 
countries received no aid at all (see Table 3 ). 19 

By the period 1992-6, the overall distribution had 
changed significantly, with a total of 45 ACP countries 
receiving aid (out of 75 recipients, globally) although 
this represented only 22.3% of the overall aid volume. 
The largest aid recipient for tropical forestry within the 
ACP grouping was now Nigeria, which received a total 
of ECU 13.129 m. for four projects, representing 3.5% 
of total disbursements. In terms of numbers of projects, 
aid was still very unbalanced, with Burkina Faso 
receiving a total of 22 projects, Kenya 13 and Cote 
d'Ivoire 12 (against an overall average of 4.3 projects 
per recipient). 

19. At a global level (not restricted to ACP countries only, nor to 
DG VIII funding): only 63 of the 115 countries eligible for EC 
aid in the period 1976-90 benefited from projects in the sector; 
10 of these received a total of ECU 253m. (hence, an average of 
ECU 25.3 m./country) whereas the remaining 53 countries 
received a total of ECU 90m. (ie. an average of ECU 1.7 m.l 
country). Of the 10 largest recipients, 9 were in the ACP 
group(the other country was India). These 9 countries (Ivory 
Coast, Gabon, Nigeria, Ethiopia, Fiji, Zaire, Senegal, Tanzania, 
Uganda) received a total of ECU 197m. aid (an average of ECU 
22 m./country) . (IFSC. 1991:9, Table 5) 

(Source: IFSC 1991) 

Coverage by national income 
Total commitments to ACP countries by GDP divide 
between low-income and middle-income countries as 
follows: low-income ACP countries - 13.4 % of total 
expenditures for tropical forestry (all countries); mid­
dle-income ACP countries - 8.9% of total. The 
relationship between geographical allocations to ACP 
countries and their levels of GDP in the period 1992-6 
is explored further in Table 4. 

These figures require some interpretation. In the first 
instance, account must be taken of the commitment of 
ECU 13m. (3.5% of total forestry expenditure) to 4 

Table 2 Expenditure by region, 1978-91 (ECU m.) 

Africa Eastern 43 .219 11 

Horn of Africa 21.698 5 

Africa Southern 4.537 69.45 

Africa Regional 2.178 2.18 

Africa Western Coastal 51 .882 13 

Africa Western Central 44.000 11 

Africa Western Sahel 28.329 7 

Africa Western West 94.758 192.97 24 

Asia Pacific 21 .937 21.94 5 

Latin America Caribbean 8 .965 8 .97 2 

Rest of World and Global 76 .29 20 

TOTAL 397.774 100 

(Source : IFSC, 1991) 
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Table 3 Countries receiving the largest proportion of · 
aid for tropical forestry (ACP Region), 1978-91 

Regional 63 .348 19 5 

Cote d'lvoire 56 .094 8 2 

Gabon 35.814 7 3 

Nigeria 32.868 6 2 

Ethiopia 20 .338 9 2 

Fiji 15.5 4 3 

Zaire 13.788 8 5 

Senegal 12.497 11 3 

Tanzania 11 .76 6 2 

Uganda 10.918 4 

SUB TOTAL 292.925 82 

%of world 69% 32% 
total 

(Source : IFSC, 1991) 

projects in one low-income country (Nigeria). Secondly, 
there are also indications of uneven distribution of 
absorptive capacity. Relative expenditure on low­
income countries increases progressively as the average 
size of grants declines, and the number of projects 
increases proportionately. 

4.2 Non-budgetary funding 

4.2.1 European Development Fund (EDF) -
financial allocations 

The total funds available under the various EDF 
protocols (all sectors) are indicated in Figure 6. Funds 
committed to tropical forestry under the EDF are 
indicated in Figure 7. 

Figures for expenditure on tropical forests under each 
EDF show the importance of this source to be declining 

Figure 6 Total funds available under the Lome 
Conventions, 1975-2000 (all sectors) 
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(Source : OECD Development Co-operation Review Series). 

relative to overall forestry funding by the Commission, 
both in terms of amounts spent, and in numbers of 
projects funded. 

4.2.2 EDF projects - type and geographical 
spread 

According to the 1991 IFSC study, much of the 
expenditure during the 4th EDF was concentrated on 
the development of forest-based industry (75% of total 
funding) either in terms of resource development/ 
management or in the provision of ancillary services 
and infrastructure. Twenty-six countries benefited (41 
projects), the majority being on the African mainland, 
at an average cost of ECU 0.83m. per project. 

The 5th EDF involved 50 projects to a total of ECU 
49.1m., at an average cost of ECU 0.98m. These 

Table 4 Tropical forestry commitments relative to per capita national income (ACP as a proportion of global 
expenditure), 1992-6 

A B 

100 5.1 

ECU >10m. 

48.2 28.1 

ECU 1-10m. 

75 .5 54.7 

ECU <1m. -•·-···· -~-""~-• '·"-'"'~""--.-.•·.--.·w•"" 

A = %of ACP funding within the income category 
B = %of total funding within the income category 
C = %of ACP funding, overall 

c 

15.7 

33.9 

10.5 

D A B c D 

4/57 

3.5 (E) 

68/155 51 .8 30.2 36.5 28/155 

15.7 (E) 

71/1 17.8 3.4 18/114 

3.1 (E) 

(Source: Planistat, 1997) 
D = Number of projects as a proportion of total number of projects within 

category 
E = ACPfunding, as%oftotalfunding (all incomecategories),ACPand all other 

states 
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focused particularly on forestry development in the 
Pacific Region, especially Fiji, which received, respec­
tively, 37% and 32% of the total volume of funding. 
Forestry in land use figured as a growing area of 
investment (38%), although forest-based industry re­
mained important (46%). The former was represented 
by integrated rural development schemes or forestry in 
agriculture or associated with anti-desertification mea­
sures in arid regions. 

In the 6th EDF, average expenditure per project 
increased greatly (42 projects for a total investment of 
ECU 145.67m., at an average cost of ECU 3.47m.), and 
there was a significant increase in the funding for 
regional projects. There were 3 such projects, amount­
ing to 31 % of the overall funding, and costing, 
respectively, ECU 24m., ECU 20m. and ECU 0.6m. 
The two large projects aimed at conservation and 
sustainable use, while the third was concerned with 
raising public awareness of deforestation. The overall 
trend in project funding continued to be away from 
forest-based industrial development towards forestry in 
land use and conservation. Forest in land use now 
figured as 55% of the total, with conservation and 
protection projects as 34%. 

Using its rather different definition of 'tropical 
forestry projects', the 1997 Planistat review identifies 
a total of 37 projects funded under EDF7, for a total of 
ECU 46.22m., with an average cost per project of ECU 
1.25m. In terms of the TFAP classification, the focus 
was particularly on strengthening institutions ( 31% of 
the total volume), followed by conservation projects 
(8%). The movement away from industrial develop­
ment continued under EDF7. The very low showing for 
this (category 2) under both EDF6 (1.85%) and EDF7 
(2.21 %), and the prominence of conservation under 
EDF6 (34.39%), is perhaps surprising, given the 
reported low levels of concern in many developing 
countries for conservation issues, and the greater 
interest in production. However, the large component 
of 'uncoded' projects (58% of the total) limits the utility 
of the EDF7 classification. These data are summarised 
in Figure 10. 

4.3 Non-programmable aid 
Less important sources of non-budgetary funding for 
tropical forest projects are non-programmable aid funds 
such as ST ABEX and SYSMIN which fall within the 
EDF and which can, rather exceptionally, fund actions 
with a forestry component. 

4.3.1 STABEX 
ST ABEX is a scheme for the stabilisation of export 
earnings for internationally marketed commodities. 
Timber is a STABEX product, but not a major one. 
According to IFSC (1991), 7 STABEX projects were 
funded in ACP countries in the period 1985-91 (all in 
Cote d'Ivoire or Western Samoa) as compensation for 
price fluctuations of wood in the rough.20 In both 
countries, the documentation indicates that the funds 
were being put back into forest-based industrial 
development and sustainable resource use. The number 

20. In line with the role of ST ABEX as a compensatory fund, the 
size of these grants relates to the estimated losses of export 
receipts in the wood sector in the previous year. 

Figure 7 The percentages of total EDF funds 
committed to tropical forests 
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I 
Figure 10 EDF funding by TFAP category (ECU m.) 

EDF 4 Funding by TFAP Category 
4 (8.47%) 

EDF 6 Funding by TFAP Category 

4 (34.39%) 

EDF 5 Funding by TFAP Category 

EDF 7 Funding by TFAP Category 
1 (1.08%) 

(2.21%) 

5 (31 .00%) 
No Code (57.98%) 

1 (55.29%) 

TFAP categories : 1 = forestry in land use; 2 = forest-based industrial development; 3 = fuelwood/wood energy; 
4 = conservation of tropical forest ecosystems; 5 = strengthening of institutions. 

of forestry-related initiatives funded under these rubrics 
was notably small, while costs were relatively high. 
Average cost per project in the period stood at 
ECU 9.2m. 

In the period 1992-6, only one ST ABEX operation is 
recorded as pertaining to tropical forests. This was a 
grant of ECU 4.7m. to Cote d'Ivoire (1992).21 

4.3.2 SYSMIN 
The other non-programmable ACP fund is SYSMIN. 
This is intended for countries depending on mineral 
exports and provides compensation for losses of export 
earnings in the minerals sector. Environmental work 
can be initiated under this fund although, since 
SYSMIN interventions are classified by their dominant 
mining codes, it is difficult to identify projects of this 
type which have a forestry component. Records do not 
indicate eligible SYSMIN projects for the period 

21. It is possible that this inventory is incomplete in relation to 
ST ABEX investments. For example, a 1995 review of STABEX in 
the Solomon Islands indicates that 6 projects were funded in the 
forestry sector in the period 1988-93, with a total value of c. ECU 
6m. The funding mechanism was, however, an indirect and 
retrospective one (as was possible under Lome III but not under 
Lome IV), and this may account for the failure of the Planistat 
evaluation to register the payments. See: the report 'Solomon 
Islands: ST ABEX Evaluation Study' of the Delegation of the 
European Commission in the Solomon Islands (December, 1995). 

Table 5 Numbers of tropical forestry projects funded 
underSTABEX,1985-9 

No of projects 3 2 0 

Figure 11 Funds committed to tropical forestry 
projects under STABEX, 1985-9 (ECU m.) 
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Table 6 Tropical forestry commitments by source-
1992-6 (ECU) 

EDF-7a 

87-6201 (tropical forestry)b 

87-6200 (environment)b 

87-6000 (NGOs)b 

•> ACP states only 
bl all states 

37 

179 

8 

140 

1 ,249, 105 

1,366,971 

440,922 

98,522 

1985-9. Only one eligible SYSMIN activity is recorded 
for the period 1992-6, for a tree planting scheme in 
Niger, in connection with the protection of a mining 
road against water and wind erosion (ECU 42,000).22 

4.4 Budgetary funding 
The principal source of budgetary funding for tropical 
forest projects is the budget line B7-5041/B7-6201 
which is tailor-made for forest projects. Other budget 
lines may fund tropical forest projects, or projects with 
a tropical forest component, but only as a sub­
component or theme. These budget lines include 
B7-6000 (Co-financing with NGOs) and B7-6200 
(Environment in developing countries). 

Average size and number of tropical forestry projects 
funded under the three main budget lines (all Directo­
rates-General), for the period 1992-6, by comparison 
with EDF7 projects, are shown in Table 6. 

4.4.1 87-6201 (ex-87-5041) Actions in favour 
of tropical forests 

This budget line is jointly managed by DG VIII and 
DG IB. ECU 50m. is available annually in the period 
1996-9 (according to the 1995 Council Regulation 
3062/95 of 1994). The percentages of the available 
budget held by DG VIII in the period 1992-7 are 
indicated in Table 7. Trends in expenditure under the 
budget line by DG VIII are shown in Figures 12 and 13. 

Funding priorities 
The EC classification provides one indication of 
funding patterns. While significant year-to-year fluc­
tuations warn against over-confidence in the identifica­
tion of trends, some degree of patterning can be 
discerned. Conservation projects were clearly strongly 
favoured in the aftermath of the 1992 UNCED 
Conference. In 1993, 64% of all commitments under 
the Tropical Forestry budget line were for conservation 
projects, and the proportion rises to 82% if 'Buffer-zone 

22. A further investment is likely in New Caledonia in 1997, 
supporting tree planting at sites of former mining operations (as 
a French overseas territory, New Caledonia is not a member of 
the ACP group, but is nevertheless eligible for SYSMIN grants 
under a parallel arrangement). A project is also under 
preparation in Guinea Conakry, to finance oil palm plantations. 
Both of these are regarded primarily as investments in the 
mining sector, however (both are concerned with rehabilitation 
of former mining areas), and not as 'forestry projects' as such. 

Table 7 Commitments to tropical forestry projects by 
DG VIII, as a proportion of total commitments, 
under the Tropical Forestry budget line, 
1992-7 (%) 

% 
[of ECU 
50m.] 

33.6 29 30.6 20 30 38 

Figure 12 Commitments under the Tropical Forestry 
Budget Line, DG VIII, 1992-6 
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Figure 13 Number of projects funded under the 
Tropical forestry budget line by DG VIII, 
1992-6 
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development' projects are included. In 1996, the 
proportion in these two categories fell to 12%. A high 
profile for conservation is not unexpected, given the 
importance of this interest in Europe. Conservation is 
reported to be a major concern of European parlia­
mentarians, whose responsibilities include scrutiny of 
the budget line. 'Sustainable Management of Forests' 
figured strongly in 1996, though less so in previous 
years. 'Research' has figured strongly throughout, 
though account may need to be taken here of the 
inclusive nature of this particular code. 
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Comparison of expenditures under the EDF and the 
budget line is potentially of interest, in that the portion of 
the budget line controlled by DG VIII is said to have been 
used increasingly to support the development of EDF 
policy. However, this comparison is made difficult by the 
fact that the EDF is classified only by TFAP categories 
(see Figure 10), whilst the most detailed classification for 
the budget line is by the EC codes (Figure 14). In 
addition, a high proportion of recent projects in both 
instances is 'non-coded' under the TF AP codes (Plani­
stat, 1997)- respectively, 58% of EDF7 and 38% of the 
budget line. In both cases, however, conservation has 
been well represented in recent years (EDFs 6 and 7, 
budget line post-1992). Capacity building figures more 
strongly in EDF7 than in the budget line (except for 
1992). A high profile for capacity building is to be 
expected with the EDF, given its public service 
orientation, though the relatively low showing for this 
category under the budget line is perhaps unexpected 
given the perceived importance of institutional issues in 
European policy circles. Again, however, the fact that 
there are such wide variations in the patterns of 
expenditure, in relation to both EDF and budget line, 
cautions against too confident an assessment of trends. 

4.4.2 Funding under other budget lines 
Before the creation of the Tropical Forestry budget line, 
other budget lines were important sources of funding 
for projects focusing on tropical forests, or with an 
important tropical forestry component. These still 
retain some association with the sector. 

The most important are: 

941/6000 'Co-financing with NGOs', 
became B7-6000- 'Community 
participation in actions in favour 
of developing countries, carried 
out by NGOs'. 

946/5040/B7-6200: 'Ecology in developing CQt,mtries' 
(subsequently, B7-5040 and then 
B7-6200: 'Environment in 
developing countries'). 

87-6000- Co-financing with NGOs 
The B7-6000 budget line covers all developing coun­
tries, not just the ACP group. It is managed by DG VIII. 
Compared with other budget lines, it funds a large 
number of projects, but at a relatively low average cost. 
The overall trends in funding under this budget line are 

Figure 14 87-6201: Tropical forestry budget line- relative commitments by EC Code, 1992-6 {DG VIII) 

1992 

1994 

EC Codes 

a = 

b 
c = 

Conservation of primary tropical forests 
and their biodiversity 
Sustainable management of forests 
Definition and development of 
certification systems 
Information to forest peoples 
Capacity-building. training , institutional 
strengthening 
Research 
Buffer-zone development 
Development and implementation of 
forest management plans 

e (65%) 

b(2%) 

e(4%) 

1996 

1993 

a(64%) 

1995 



PROJECTS FUNDED BY REGION, TYPE AND SIZE • 85 

Figure 15 Number of tropical forestry projects 
funded (all countries) under budget line 
87-6000,1981-96 
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evident from Figures 15 and 16.23 

Since 1993, the relative size of projects funded under 
the NGO budget line has increased (Figure 16), while 
the number has progressively declined (Figure 15). The 
average project size has stayed modest, however, relative 
to other budget lines, and the number of NGO projects 
is still high relative to the total commitment of funds. 
Over the period 1992-6, the budget line funded 42% of 
all tropical forestry projects, in terms of numbers ( 140 
projects out of a total of 333 ), though the total sum 
expended was less than 4% of the total (ECU 13, 
793,108 out of a total of ECU 359,838,435). The 
average grant sizes in each case were ECU 98,522 (NGO 
budget line) and ECU 1,080,596 (all projects) respec­
tively- thus the average NGO grant was only 9% of the 
overall average for all tropical forestry projects.24 

In terms of geographical distribution, ACP countries 
have received significantly more project awards than 
ALA over the last 5 years. The average grant size in each 
case is very similar (Table 9). 

In terms of commitments for forestry projects under 
this budget line, there has been a steady increase in 
funding over recent years, with a major change of scale 
occurring in the mid-1980s, at the time of the Africa 
famine and growing interest in NGO activities among 
the European public. Following a familiar pattern, there 
was also a significant increase in funding under this 
budget line in 1993, in the immediate aftermath of the 
UNCED Conference. 

946187-6200: Ecology in developing countries/ 
Environment in developing 
countries 

The EN946 (Ecology) budget line became B7-5040 
(Environment in Developing Countries) in 1992. Until 
the creation of the dedicated Tropical Forestry budget 

23 . These statistics refer to the budget line as a whole, not merely to 
the ACP countries. 

24. The figures for overall forestry commitments in this paragraph 
refer to all tropical forestry projects in the Commission, not 
merely to DG VIII. 

Figure 16 Commitments to tropical forestry projects 
(all countries) under budget line 87-6000, 
1981-96 
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Table 8 Average size of tropical forestry projects (all 
countries) under budget line 87-6000, 
compared to the average size of all tropical 
forestry projects, 1992-96 (ECU m.) 

87-6000 : 0.066 0.065 0.081 0 .112 0.462 

compare : 
all forestry projects 1.177 0.626 0.993 0 .992 0.856 

(Source : Planistat, 1997) 

Table 9 Geographical distribution of projects, NGO 
budget line, 1992-6 (ECU) 

ALA Region 

ACP Region 

48 

92 

4,602,800 

9,190,308 

95,891 

99,895 

(Source : Planistat, 1997) 

line (B7-5041/6201), EN946 was a significant source of 
funding for tropical forestry projects. The 946 budget 
line was co-managed by DG VIII, DG I and DG XI. 
Since the creation of the Tropical Forestry budget line, 
it has funded fewer mainstream forestry projects, and 
focused increasingly on allied topics such as biodiver­
sity. Funding to ACP states under this budget line is 
shown in Figures 17 and 18. Its annual budget has 
varied as follows: 1993, ECU 30m.; 1994, ECU 20m.; 
1995, ECU 13m.; 1996, ECU 15m. 

The new Environment budget line is jointly managed 
by DG IB and DG VIII, so the amounts available to DG 
VIII are only a proportion (currently 50%) of the 
overall total available. 

Total commitments to tropical forestry projects in the 
ACP countries under these budget lines in the period 
1986-96 are given in Table 11. It is evident that only a 
small proportion of the commitments under the budget 
line are nowadays used for projects which can be 
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Table 10 BL 6000- NGO forestry projects of ACP & ALA states (ECU) 

1981 17,000 

1982 12,000 

1983 9,000 

1984 261,000 

1985 17,000 

1986 54,000 

1987 712,000 

1988 868,000 

1989 861,000 

1990 na 

1991 na 

1992 730,194 

1993 1,586,258 

1994 2,336,396 

1995 2,423,362 

1996 2,114,098 

classified as 'tropical forestry'. The only significant 
investments in tropical forestry projects in the ACP area 
in recent years, under this budget line, were in 1993, in 
the aftermath of the UNCED Conference. 

5. PROJECT CYCLE MANAGEMENT 
The Commission has greatly increased the rigour of its 
project management procedures in recent years. An 
'integrated approach to Project Cycle Management' was 
introduced in 1992 (EC, 1993a), and the use of the 

Figure 17 Ecology/Environment Budget Lines: 
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16 496,622 10 

4 1,121,473 3 

(Source : Planistat, 1997) 

Logical Framework is now routine. These innovations 
followed extensive criticism of Commission procedures, 
with lack of clarity of project management being 
frequently cited as a major cause of poor performance. 

Increased efforts are also being expended on staff 
training in an attempt to upgrade the skills of the 
Commission's mainly generalist staff. Short training 
courses are now available for headquarters personnel, 
and training and applied workshop activities have also 
been arranged in beneficiary countries. The develop­
ment of new tools- guidelines, handbooks and training 

Figure 18 Ecology/Environment budget lines: 
funding to ACP States only 
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programmes on particular sectoral issues - forms an 
integral part of the process. An extensive programme of 
staff training and awareness creation is now under way 
within the Commission, based on the Forest Sector 
Development Co-operation Guidelines, Volumes II and 
III of which are largely concerned with project cycle 
management and provide detailed checklists and work­
ing materials. 

5.1 Phases of the project cycle 
The Project Cycle involves six distinct phases: program­
ming, identification, formulation, financing, implemen­
tation and evaluation. Procedures for each phase differ 
according to whether the project is funded from the 
EDF or the budget line. 

Under ED F arrangements, the NIP negotiations are 
crucial, with the characteristics - and the limitations -
earlier discussed (see section 2.5). Indicative program­
ming involves the establishment of general guidelines 
and principles for co-operation between the Commu­
nity and each ACP state. This covers sectoral and 
thematic matters and sets out a number of the ideas for 
projects which might be taken up during the term of the 
financial protocol. The detailed sequence of operations 
and responsibilities for project implementation under 
Lome IV is given in Table 12. 

The 1995 Regulation states that co-financing with 
Community Member States and other bodies is desir­
able to encourage greater coordination (Article 5). 
However, to date, Member States' inputs to EDF 
project proposals have been limited to information 
provided to the internal review committee. 

Budget line arrangements are much more ad hoc. 
Proposals are submitted to the Commission by inde­
pendent agencies (NGOs, research institutions, etc.), 
either directly or via a Delegation overseas. Less often 
(though increasingly), terms of reference for a project 
are drawn up by DG VIII staff (either within policy 
units or the geographical desks). Project proposals are 
judged partly for their conformity with the Regulation 
and with the norms and standards laid down in the 
Guide for Financing Projects. Projects must be pre­
sented in Logical Framework format. First selection is 
carried out by the Commission services, according to 
the criteria of the budget line. Opinion is sought from 
the relevant Desk, Delegation and technical services. 
Requests are presented to the Steering Committee for 
advice, and proposals are then accepted or rejected or 
sent back for amendment. 

In the case of a project conceived in DG VIII or a 
project design prepared by consultants, a bid for tender 
is made for the selection of the implementing organisa­
tion. A contract is drawn up, outlining the terms of 
reference and budget, and this is signed by the 
Commission and its partner. 

As regards forest sector development co-operation, a 
series of nine interlinked (and sometimes overlapping) 
themes provide an analytical framework to ensure that 
project cycle management is adapted to the needs of 
different types of forests and different actors within 
them. These nine themes are summarised in Table 13. 

Social Impact Analysis and Environmental Appraisal 
procedures are both built into forest sector development 
co-operation. Projects are categorised into five classes as 
regards social impact, and four classes as regards 
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Table 11 Ecology/Environment budget lines (946 & B/L 
6200)- tropical forestry funding (ACP states 
only) 1986--96 (ECU) 

1986 

1987 

1988 635,000 4 

1989 480,000 5 

1990 33,000 2 

1991 na na 

1992 12,532 

1993 2,255,300 3 

1994 233,000 

1995 313,000 

1996 350,000 

(Source : IFSC,1991; Planistat, 1997 

Table 12 Lome IV project implementation process for 
programmable funds 

(Source : Koning, 1997 : 138) 

41 
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Table 13 Themes in Project Cycle Management in Forest Sector Development CCH>peration 

Policy, Legal & 
Institutional 
Framework 

Conservation 
of 
Ecosystems 
and of 
Biodiversity 

Sustainable Creation of 
Forest Forest 
Management Resources 

Harvesting, 
Processing, 
Marketing, 
Trading 

Certification Forestry 
Education 
and Training 

Forestry­
Related 
Research 

Forestry Info 
and 
Communication 

(Source: Guidelines for Forest Sector Development Co-operation, Forests in Sustainable Development, 
Volume 1 Strategic Approach, 1996, European Commission DG VIII) 

environment (the classes differing according to whether 
or not the intervention is likely to have a positive, 
neutral or negative impact, and the magnitude of the 
effect). In each instance, the classification provides a 
trigger to further action; this might include calling on 
specialist advice or specific requirements for manage­
ment. Social and environmental appraisal principles and 
procedures are reviewed in Volume I of the Forest 
Sector Guidelines (see section 4.1). 

5.2 Evaluation 
Since the UNCED Conference and the introduction of 
Tropical Forestry budget line, the responsible services 
have become more and more subject to critical 
questions from inside and outside the Commission 
concerning the utilisation of funds available for forestry 
projects and the relevance of funded projects to the 
objectives of the budget line, as well as, more generally, 
the Lome and Maastricht agreements. Despite consider­
able strengthening in recent years, the effectiveness of 
evaluation procedures is still widely questioned. The 
external orientation of the key scrutiny methods (EDF 
committee and in-country management within the ACP 
partners), as well as the lack of adequate resources and 
the heavy reliance on external consultants, have all been 
cited as weakening learning capacity. 

The EDF allocates money specifically for evaluations, 
mid-term reviews and final reports; desk officers and 
Delegations are responsible for the straightforward 
cases, and the Evaluation Unit for the more difficult 
situations. All EDF projects are evaluated on comple­
tion. Impact evaluations (end-of-project plus a specified 
period) are not currently built into the financing 
agreements for individual projects, though these are 
occasionally undertaken using the Evaluation Depart­
ment's own budgeted resources. There are also broad 
process evaluations at country programme level. Ac­
cording to the Lome Convention, evaluations have to be 
done jointly with the ACP country. This has resulted in 
a greater participation of developing countries in 
project evaluations than is the case with most interna­
tional donors. 

The monitoring of the national indicative pro­
grammes is primarily the responsibility of the (ACP) 
National Authorising Officer and the EU delegate. The 
monitoring of EDF projects has frequently been 
criticised as weak. Staff shortages in both the Delega­
tions and DG VIII, the paucity of staff experienced in 
evaluation, the lack of suitable information, preoccupa­
tion with administrative and financial duties (particu­
larly the management of consultants) and lack of 
adequate mechanisms for feedback into decision­
making processes are said to account for many of the 

difficulties (Cracknell, 1989). 
In line with a requirement of the Regulation of 1995, 

the Tropical Forestry budget line is being t valuated 
1997 by an external European consultancy due to 
report in April 1998.25 

6. PROJECT REVIEWS 
Some general shifts in focus can be identified in the 
Commission's approach to tropical forestry, such as a 
growing recognition of the 'social dimensions' of 
projects, involving greater participation of local popu­
lations and other stakeholders. There has been a move 
away from exclusion-oriented preservation strategies 
towards sustainable management and development 
involving local communities. The number of policy­
oriented studies has also increased, focusing on such 
themes as the clarification or elaboration of particular 
policies, research into policy areas, and ways of 
operationalising policy. Recent policy studies have 
included an investigation of the changing pattern of 
the international timber trade, particularly that asso­
ciated with increased logging activities in the Congo 
Basin by companies based in the newly industrialised 
countries of the Pacific rim (WWF, 1997), and the 
drawing-up, testing and training, of the Guidelines, as 
discussed above (Box 2). 

The budget line is also being used to fulfil interna­
tional and internal obligations on tropical forests. For 
instance: 

• The Convention on Climate Change identifies 
deforestation as a major source of greenhouse 
emissions. A study has been commissioned on C02 

sequestration by reforestation to mitigate climate 
change. This investigates the role of reforestation 
as a carbon sink, and considers the potential for 
joint implementation by the EU and ACP countries 
of appropriate initiatives (B7-6201/96.01 ). 

• Timber certification - see Box 3 
• The consolidation of knowledge (as called for in 

the Council Regulation of 1995), and the drive to 
greater coherence, complementarity and coordina­
tion of the aid activities of the EU Member States, 
as laid down in the Maastricht Treaty.26 

• The development of a regional approach in the face 

25. According to the 1995 Tropical Forest Regulation, Article 12 ' In 
1997 the Commission shall submit to the European Parliament 
and the Council an overall assessment of operations to promote 

· tropical forests financed by the Community'. 

26. The ODI project, one component of which is production of this 
Sourcebook, forms part of this initiative. 



of new threats to tropical forests. This is being 
achieved through the promotion of policy dialogue 
between stakeholders (including high-level policy 
dialogue, as in the case of the Congo Basin 
initiative and the World Commission on Forests 
and Sustainable Development) and international 
training activities. The Congo Basin initiative is 
briefly reviewed in Box 4. 

7. CONCLUSION 
Like many international donor agencies, DG VIII has 
been forced to adapt rapidly to the increased prominence 
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given to tropical forestry in recent years. The manner in 
which this has occurred has been influenced by a large 
number of factors, some internal (the management 
structure of the EDF, for example) and some shared, to 
a greater or lesser degree, by all Directorates-General 
within the Commission. Though the place of tropical 
forestry within the aid programme of DG VIII remains 
problematic in many ways, significant progress has been 
made in developing a strategic orientation, which 
engages not only the technical departments but also 
the geographical line management. 

One illustration of the extent of the advances which 
have been made is provided by progress on the 
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recommendations of the 1991 IFSC report. This report 
presented a series of recommendations for improved 
coordination, including the development of an overall 
strategy for the Commission for tropical forestry; 
guidelines for headquarters and Delegation staff on 
the identification and formulation of projects in line 
with this strategy; guidance on appropriate budgetary 
provisions; improved coordination of the programmes 
of the various directorates-general; better liaison with 
multinational agencies, Member States, associated 
states and NGOs; and enhanced capacity for monitor­
ing and evaluation. 

All of these issues have been addressed, with DG VIII 
playing a significant part. Influential policy documents 
such as Protocol 10 of Lome Nbis, the Strategy Paper, 
the 1995 Regulation and the forthcoming Regulation 

have been agreed and promulgated. Support documents 
and activities such as the Guidelines for Forest Sector 
Development Co-operation and its associated training 
and awareness-raising programme have been prepared 
and undertaken. These, together with the increased 
policy orientation of the budget line, have all served to 
heighten the profile of tropical forestry within the aid 
activities of the Commission, particularly in support of 
the EDF. 
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1. EVOLUTION OF INVOLVEMENT 
IN TROPICAL FORESTRY 

1.1 The evolution of DG XI and present 
structure 

In 1972, the European Council recognised the need to 
take measures to protect and improve the environment 
at the grassroots level, and therefore set up a small 
'environment and consumer protection service' within 
DG III, the DG responsible for industrial policy and the 
internal (EU) market. In 1981 this 'service' was raised to 
the status of Directorate-General XI. In response to the 
growing body of EU environmental legislation, as well 
as the need to develop new instruments and 'adminis­
trative structures for environmental management', DG 
XI was restructured in 1989 and renamed 'Legal Affairs 
and Implementation, Relations with other Institutions 
and the future EEA 1, Finance and Contracts'. 

In 199 5, DG XI was again renamed as 'Environment, 
Nuclear Security and Civil Protection', and restructured 
into five Directorates as shown in Figure 1. Unit D4, 
'Global aspects of the environment: climate change, 
geosphere and biosphere' - normally referred to as 
'Global Environment' - is responsible for forestry 
activities. 

1.2 The evolving role of DG XI in forestry 
activities 

Initially the actions of the DG III 'environment service' 
were restricted to attempts to influence international 
organisations such as FAO (through the TFAP) and 
ITIO, and support of forestry activities though these 
organisations. With the 1989 restructuring, the 'Global 
Environment' budget line B4-3046 was created in 
response to the growing desire to undertake global 
environmental actions. The budget line was later 
renamed 'Contribution to International Environmental 
Activities' and renumbered B7-8110, and is jointly 
managed by Units D4 and A4, 'International Affairs, 
Trade and Environment'. B7-8110 is used mainly for 
supporting international fora, workshops and small­
scale field projects in the four main areas of global 
environmental action: forestry (all types of forest, but 
predominantly tropical forest); biodiversity; climate 
change; and the ozone layer. 

However, management of the budget line is sub­
sidiary to the main roles of DG XI, and especially Unit 
D4, which have been to develop EC policy and strategy 
in these four areas, prepare the Commission's political 
position at international fora, and to represent it at 
these fora. Unit D4 coordinated the production of 
'Towards Sustainability - A European Community 
Programme of Policy and Action in relation to the 
Environment and Sustainable Development' (European 
Commission, 1992), a statement of EC strategy on 
global environment issues. 

Unit D4 was also responsible for writing the 
Commission's official long-term environmental plan: 
'Programme of Policy and Action in Relation to 
Environment and Sustainable Development'. It has 
taken an active part in the initiatives stemming from 

1. European Environment Agency 

UNCED: the Inter-Governmental Panel on Forests 
(IPF), the Commission for Sustainable Development 
(CSD), and the international Conventions through the 
various Conferences of the Parties. It is particularly 
concerned with the process leading to a possible Forest 
Convention. Mention should be made of the close 
collaboration with the other DGs, especially DG IB, for 
example, in their mutual interest in the Brazil Pilot 
Programme, and through participation of the Unit D4 
General Administrator in the Inter-Service Steering 
Committee on Forests. 

2. STRUCTURE OF AID DELIVERY 
Budget line B7-8110 is divided among Units A4, AS 
'Technical Co-operation with Third Countries', D2 
'Nature Protection, Coastal Zones and Tourism' and 
D4 (see Figure 1). Each Unit puts forward an annual 
proposal of intended actions and a budget. The 
Resources Group of DG XI, consisting of the Director 
General, the Deputy Director General, the Assistant of 
the Director General, the Directors of the five Directo­
rates and the Head of Unit A2 (Finance), decides on the 
distribution of the funds at the end of the year (but can 
change it in mid-year), although in practice the 
proportion going to each Unit is fairly constant. 

According to its official objectives (EC Official 
journal 1996, p.1581), Unit D4 uses its share of the 
budget line to support small-scale projects in the field, 
as well as workshops, seminars, conferences and 
publications, with the objectives of: 

• safeguarding the ozone layer; 
• influencing the relationship between energy and the 

environment, especially in terms of global 
warming; 

• protecting forests; 
• protecting biodiversity; and 
• influencing other global environmental issues, 

including desertification and the 'population en­
vironment relationship'2 

There is no fixed budget for tropical forests under 
budget line B7-8110, since the budget has to support all 
of these action areas, and is subject to internal DG XI 
negotiations. Table 1 shows the total budget, the 
proportion going to D4, and the proportion spent on 
forestry projects. A large proportion of the budget goes 
on 'statutory contributions', i.e. to meet on-going 
commitments like annual support to the Biodiversity 
Convention Secretariat (ECU 30,000), and support for 
the Berne and Vienna Conventions on international 
trade and the environment, as well as actions within DG 
XI itself, for example to develop DG XI's 'Strategy on 
Forests' over the 1997-8 period. Unit D4 has most 
flexibility in terms of using its share of the budget for 
forestry projects. In fact most of the flexible share of the 
budget has been spent on forestry and biodiversity 
projects. This has been because this part of the budget 
line has been mainly demand-led3

, and there have been 

2. This objective is due to be removed from the EC Official Journal 
in 1998. The only action was a project on Antarctica in 1992. 
Responsibility for these actions has been passed to the 
Environment budget line B7-6200. 

3. Although once, in 1993, a call for proposals was put out. 
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Figure 1: Organogram of DG XI: Environment, Nuclear Safety and Civil Protection (abbreviated version) 
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few project requests dealing with climate change or the 
ozone layer. 

ECU 1 m. per advisor per year. 

At the appraisal stage, aid delivery has been in the 
hands of the D4 'General Administrator' in charge of 
the budget line, who since 1991 has been either a 
forester or a geographer. Project implementation has 
tended to be mainly in the hands of North-based 
institutions, especially universities, international NGOs 
and research organisations, as these have been the main 
budget line applicants (see section 4.4). 

In-house technical responsibility for forestry cur­
rently rests with the D4 General Administrator, an 
experienced tropical forester from Peru. The ratio of the 
budget to in-house forestry expertise is a little less than 

(Main source: personal communication, D4 adminis­
trative assistant) 

3. TROPICAL FORESTRY 
DEVELOPMENT STRATEGY 

3.1 Past strategy 
Because of its limited budget, B4-3046 became (more 
or less by accident) the budget line for small projects 
which would have 'fallen through the net' of DG I and 
DG VIII with their preference for larger projects. 
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Table 1. DG XI forestry commitments: distribution of 87--8110 budget to 04 and forestry projects 1991-6 (ECU) 

B7-8110 3,690,000 

D4 share 

Forestry 1,027,772 724,325 

* Projects approved to November 1996. 

4200,000 

2,380,000 

1 '196,302 

4,200,000 

2,350,000 

1,056,997 

4,200,000 

2,597,750 

1 ,083,197 

4,400,000 

1,944,000 

560,430* 

Initially (until 1990) it was used to fund meetings, 
workshops, studies, publications and field projects 
which dealt with climate change and the ozone layer. 
Forestry projects only came in from 1991 as a result of 
the EC-wide pressures discussed in Chapter 2. Funding 
of forestry was also significantly increased following the 
1992 UNCED Conference. 

• 3.2 Current and future strategy '4IIIIIM 
In 1996 Unit D4 produced a strategy papt r entitled 
'Philosophy of Budget Line B7-8110' (Ruiz Murrieta, 

Until 1996, Unit D4 of DG XI did not have a 
strategy document which specified the objectives of its 
budget line, and decisions concerning project selection 
and regional distribution were at the discretion of 
individual budget line managers. The emphasis up to 
1995 reflected a concern for issues related to trade and 
the environment, especially as regards the 'strategic' 
actions - conferences, studies, workshops, etc. Also 
there was an observable regional influence in project 
distribution when the budget line was managed by a 
French forester (an increase in Francophone projects in 
1991 and 1992), and by a Portuguese geographer 
(Brazil had most projects and expenditure in 1993 and 
1994). In 1995, the latter left for a long-term technical 
assistance assignment to the Brazil EU delegation to 
work on the Brazilian Pilot Programme. This was 
financed from the B7-8110 budget line. The current 
General Administrator took over in September 1995. 

The main emphasis of past forestry interventions 
under B7-8110 has been in the areas of: 

• sustainable natural resource management both 
inside and outside protected areas, focusing in 
particular on new approaches like extractive 
reserves and community reserves; 

• support to local communities and indigenous 
peoples; and 

• policy development (D4 General Administrator, 
personal communication). 

More than half of all the activities financed have 
involved conferences, workshops and publications (see 
section 4.2). The system has been predominantly 
reactive in the sense that the direction of the budget 
line has largely depended on the nature of the 
applications for funding received. However, it is clear 
that there is (or has been) sufficient flexibility for DG XI 
to define its own projects. There have also been several 
attempts to encourage DG XI financing of the Global 
Environment Facility (GEF). The absence of an EC 
representative on the GEF Board in 1995 and 1996 
resulted in a reluctance to approve the funding 
involved; from DG XI as a whole, this was ECU 3 m. 
in 1995 and ECU 7 m. in 1996. 

1996), to be applied from the end of 1996 onwards. 
This outlines the following priority areas for forestry: 

• projects, studies or meetings producing outputs 
aimed at supplying the knowledge required for 
developing the EC's long-term strategy, especially 
on global forestry issues, to 'assure EU leadership 
in the negotiations under international agreements 
and other relevant international fora'; 

• projects promoting the implementation of articles 
relevant to forests contained in the International 
Conventions, as well as implementation of the 
eleven elements of the work programme of the 
IPF; 

• projects promoting certification, criteria and in­
dicators, regional strategies, national forest plans, 
networks and/or any other major instruments for 
the conservation and sustainable development of 
forests, taking into consideration the economic, 
environmental, social and cultural dimensions of 
forestry as well as the participation of all the main 
stakeholders; 

• projects promoting indigenous peoples' rights to 
their territories and natural resources, traditional 
management practices, and indigenous participa­
tion in project design and national land-use 
planning. 

In practice, this will mean that a more strategic and 
'global' approach will be adopted than hitherto, with an 
enhanced interest in: 

• activities that will help the EC develop its position 
in international fora; 

• policy development at the national, regional and 
international levels; 

• support to forestry activities related to the inter­
national Conventions; and 

• support to indigenous peoples. 

In addition to the above, the following indications were 
given on the future direction of DG XI's actions by the 
D4 General Administrator: 

• DG XI projects will in future overlap less with 
activities supported by DG IB and DG VIII, 
particularly by supporting themes which are of 
lower priority for other DGs or which complement 
priorities on other budget lines, for example, initial 
strengthening of indigenous peoples' organisations, 
NGOs, etc., which can be supported on a larger 



98 • DG XI 

scale through the Tropical Forests budget line (B7-
6201); 

• the funds will be distributed more equally among 
the three main geographic regions (in 1996 no 
further projects were approved for Brazil); 

• DG XI will extend its support of networks of 
NGOs and community-based organisations 
(CBOs), especially in indigenous and marginalised 
communities. It supports the African Forest Action 
Network (AFAN), currently comprised of NGOs 
from Francophone Africa but to be extended to the 
whole of Africa. It has also supported the Grupo de 
Trabalho Amazonico (GTA), a network of ap­
proximately 400 NGOs and CBOs. Supporting 
local organisational capacity of the 'civil society', 
especially in Central Africa, will form an important 
part of D4's future strategy; 

• Unit D4 is particularly interested in supporting 
regional initiatives like the Association of Amazo­
nian Universities (UNAMAS) and the Central 
American Alliance for Sustainable Development, 
and in efforts to develop South-South coordination 
- for example, building links between regional 
initiatives in the areas of forest policy development 
and 'social forestry' curriculum development; 

• Unit D4 will fund a smaller number of projects 
(about 10 per year instead of 20-30) with an 
increase in the size of project, mainly because of 
lack of staff; 

• D4 will become more pro-active in project selec­
tion by encouraging particular organisations to 
request funding; 

• D4 plans to develop a Strategy on Forests by the 
end of 1998. 

Most of the pressure for change in DG XI's strategy has 
come from within the EC - especially the discussions in 
the Inter-Service Group on Forests (personal commu­
nication, D4 General Administrator). 

3.3 Strategy and policy development in 
the area of the timber certification 

DG XI has an important role in shaping the EC's 
position on timber certification and to this end has a 
technical officer working in Unit D4, an economist 
(with a trade policy background) who is a seconded 
national expert in post since 199 5. This DG XI officer 
works closely with the DG I 'Trade and Environment 
Unit'4 responsible for negotiating the EC trade position 
at the World Trade Organization (WTO), and specifi­
cally with WTO's Trade and Environment Committee, 
and in other multilateral negotiations (e.g. EC-Merco­
sur, EC-ASEAN), as well as with a DG VIII official who 
represents the EC at liTO meetings. The Unit D4 
General Administrator represents the Commission at 
meetings of the Intergovernmental Panels on Climate 
Change and Forests and has prepared position papers 
for these. 

One of the main tasks of the DG XI General 
Administrator has been to try to identify an EC/EU 
position on certification. This has involved a continuous 

4. DG 1 Unit: Multilateral commercial policies and questions 
relevant to WTO and OECD. 

process of consultation (rather than negotiation) be­
tween the different stakeholder interests represented in 
the EC, which range from European industrial concerns 
(represented in DG III), European forestry management 
(DG VI), the internal EU market (DG XV) and consumer 
policy (DG XXIV), to the research (DG XII), sustain­
able development (DG VIII and DG IB) and global 
environmental (DG XI) concerns. Representatives from 
all these DGs are invited to meetings of the Inter-Service 
Group on Certification, which meets two or three times 
a year. The DG XI officer is the overall coordinator of 
the Group and tries to maintain a balance between all 
the interests, rather than pushing a particular view­
point. There have also been several meetings of the 
'National Experts' Group on Timber Certification' 
involving representatives from the Member States. 

Building on these sets of meetings, the DG XI officer 
was responsible for a 1996 Commission Staff Discus­
sion Paper 'EU Policy Options on Forest and Timber 
Certification'. This internal Commission paper presents 
useful background analysis and discusses the pros and 
cons of four options open to the EU: reliance on market 
forces (but facilitating their action); actively contribut­
ing to the development and definition of certification 
standards; establishing a voluntary EU-level certifica­
tion scheme; and other instruments, including the use of 
preferential tariffs, promotion of forest management 
plans, national forest plans, forest registration and a 
global forest convention. 

In terms of the direction of the debate on ways to use 
the timber trade to encourage sustainable forest 
management, there has been a clear shift in the EU 
from a 'stick' to a 'carrot' approach. In the early 1990s 
various Member States, or green lobbies within them 
put forward trade-related proposals involving import 
bans and consumer boycotts with the objective of 
discouraging unsustainable logging in the tropics; for 
example a proposal by the Netherlands and Austria to 
ban the import of 'non-sustainably' produced tropical 
timber, and proposed Dutch legislation for compulsory 
certification of timber by 2000. 

The realisation that such measures are illegal, 5 

counterproductive or impractical has left two main 
possible instruments: voluntary certification- there have 
been several recent Member State (Germany, Nether­
lands, Denmark) initiatives to develop certification 
schemes; and the use of preferential tariff levels, as in 
the proposed EC Generalised System of Trade Prefer­
ences. EU legislation permits discretionary tariff reduc­
tions when suppliers follow the liTO Guidelines on 
sustainable forest management. While this is pro­
grammed to become operational in 1998, there is some 
debate as to whether it represents a trade barrier and so 
contravenes international trade legislation. The pro­
posed levels of tariff reduction are not yet known but 
will be partly dependent on the degree of processing. 

Within the EU, the position has been generally 
against the certification of European forests. This has 
been due partly to the fear of possible high costs of 
certification if these are not passed on to the consumer, 

5. Owing to the principle of non-discrimination in WTO trade 
rules, i.e. a product cannot be refused access because of its being 
assigned a particular characteristic (European Commission, 
1996, p.7). 
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Table 2. Distribution of DG XI forestry projects by region 1991-6 

Global 10 9 

Regionalb 2 3 

South America 2 5 

Central America 

Africa 4 3 

Asia 2 

Total 20 20 

• up to November 1996 
b involving two or more countries in a region . 

especially for small production forests (down to 1 ha in 
Portugal, for example). This is a concern shared by 
some tropical producer countries which also see 'eco­
labelling' as a new trade barrier. Another major 
European fear is that timber products will become less 
competitive than non-timber products if significant 
costs are passed on to the consumer. 

The 04 certification technical officer also uses funds 
from budget line B7-8110 to promote understanding of 
the process and feasibility of certification, for example 
through some small 'tracing' projects. As well as several 
important certification initiatives coming under OG VIII 
(see Box 3 in the chapter on OG VIII), there are two OG 
IB projects financed under the Tropical Forests budget 
line: the CIFOR study 'Testing Criteria and Indicators 
for the Sustainable Management of Forests' co-financed 
by Germany, USAIO and Ford Foundation; and a Forest 
Stewardship Council project involving training and the 
promotion of national consultation processes in several 
countries in Latin America and Asia. There is also a 
market study of Arabatsis spp. under OG VI, which is 
attempting to gauge how much consumers are prepared 
to pay for certified timber and to shed light on the 
impacts of certification. 

4. 

4.1 

PROJECTS FUNDED BY REGION, 
TYPE AND SIZE 

Definition of forestry 
A broad interpretation of the term 'forestry' was used 
for OG XI. Many of the projects involved wider 
activities which in some way aim to develop, either 
directly or indirectly - for example through projects 
focusing on indigenous peoples' issues- the knowledge 
basis or institutional capacity for forestry (and biodi­
versity in general) conservation and management. 

4.2 Geographical distribution 
Table 2 presents a breakdown of the 114 forestry 
projects approved for funding since 1991, classified 
according to the regional classification used in Unit 04. 
Figure 2 indicates that over half the projects have been 
either global or regional. These have often been 
workshops, conferences and research studies directed 
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at global forestry issues, but particularly in the Amazon 
region. Including country-specific projects, 33 projects 
have been directed at the Amazon region. Of the 53 
non-global/regional projects, South and Central Amer­
ica received over 60%. 

Over the 1991-96 period, ECU 5.6 m. was com­
mitted to these 114 projects. Figure 3 presents the 
regional distribution of these financial commitments. 
This emphasises further the large share of South 
America especially in comparison with Asia and Africa. 
Figures 4 and 5 present the distribution of projects and 
financial commitments from B7-8110 among the main 
receiving countries over the 1991-6 and 1991-5 periods 
respectively, leaving aside the regional and global 
projects. These data show Brazil to be the main 
beneficiary of this budget line, especially in terms of 
financial commitments - almost ECU 1.6 m. over the 
1991-6 period. Other significant beneficiaries (ranging 
between ECU 88,000 and ECU 220,000) were Cote 
d'Ivoire, Gabon, Colombia, Cameroon, Peru, Mexico 
and French Guyana. This partly reflects the influence of 
budget line managers and the greater organisational 
capacity in Latin America to make requests. 

4.3 Project type 
In Table 3, the 114 tropical forestry projects are divided 
between field projects (54) and non-field or 'strategic' 

Figure 2: Distribution of DG XI forestry projects by 
region 1990-6 

Central America 
(4.39%) 

South America 
(24.56%) 

Asia (5.26%) 

Global (36.84%) 

Regional (16.67%) 



100 • DG XI 

projects (60): the latter included 28 studies and 
information diffusion projects (publications, films, 
videos, etc); 27 workshops, seminars and conferences; 
and 5 projects supporting the development and im­
plementation of international Conventions. Recently 
there have been fewer studies and information diffusion 
projects, and more projects in support of international 
conventions. Up until 1996 there was a trend towards 
more field projects, but in 1996 only one of the seven 
projects was a field project. Table 3 indicates that 

Figure 3: Distribution of DG XI financial 
commitments to forestry by region 1991-6 
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Global (37.01%) 

Figure 4: Distribution of DG XI forestry projects 
between countries 1991-6 
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Figure 5: Distribution of DG XI forestry financial 
commitments by country 1991-5 
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sustainable forest management and biodiversity con­
servation-related projects have maintained a consistent 
importance, bearing in mind the drop in the number of 
overall projects over the last two years, and a down­
ward trend from the early 1990s in projects on 
indigenous people, timber and energy issues. 

Table 3 and Figure 6 show that the most common 
types of projects were associated with sustainable forest 
management, including non-timber forest products 
(SFMINTFPs), and biodiversity conservation/environ­
mental protection, including extractive reserves. These 
two categories accounted for 60% of all projects and 
63% of field projects. Next in importance were 
education, training and consciousness-raising projects, 
indigenous peoples, and social and participatory aspects 
of forestry, including local institution building (mainly 
field projects). There were also 9 timber related projects 
(industry and trade aspects), none of which were field 
projects. 

4.4 Distribution of projects by type of 
organisation 

Table 4 and Figure 7 present the distribution of projects 
by the type of organisation requesting and implement­
ing the projects. They show that academic and research 
institutions, and national and international NGOs (the 
latter tailing off markedly over the last two years) have 
been the main beneficiaries of the budget line, absorbing 
between them 86% of the projects. There is a view in 
DG XI that, at least until 1995, there were too many 
'strategic' projects being carried out by Northern 
academic and research institutions, with only a limited 
impact on forest conservation and local livelihoods. 
Almost three quarters of the organisations have been 
based in the North, and among them France (26 
projects), UK (15 projects), the Netherlands (13 
projects), and Belgium (9 projects) have been most 
prominent. While in 1996 no projects were funded for 
organisations based in these four countries, 5 of the 7 
projects were in favour of North-based organisations. 
Of the 30 developing country organisations supported, 
13 have been Brazilian and 8 have been in Francophone 
Africa. 

Table 4 disguises an important trend towards a 
greater proportion of the commitments to developing 
countries. Up to 1992, over half of the finance 
committed was to be expended in 'the North'; in 
1993 and 1994 there was an approximately equal 
budgetary distribution between the North and develop­
ing countries, but since 199 5 budgetary control has 
been very strict- about 80% of the budget must now be 
spent in the developing country. 

4.5 Size and duration of projects 
Project size under B7-8110 has been small in compar­
ison with the other DGs. Financing is limited to 50% of 
total project costs for field projects and 30% for 
'strategic' projects up to about ECU 60,000 and ECU 
25,000 respectively - although, legally, there is no 
maximum project size. The fall in the number of 
projects over time (Table 2) has led to a slight increase 
in the size of project: from 1991 to 1994, the average 
project size was ECU 45,000, while over the 1995-6 
period it has been almost ECU 66,000. In 1996 the 
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Table 3. Distribution of DG XI forestry projects by themes 1991-6 

SFM/NTFPs1 5 2 9 7 3 17 25 

Biodiv./env. 7 10 9 6 4 2 17 9 
protection 

Education/ 2 4 3 9 
training 

Indigenous 2 3 2 5 4 
peoples 

Social forestry/ 2 2 2 7 2 
participation 

Timber/trade 4 2 2 9 

Agroforestry 2 2 2 5 2 

Energy 2 

Total 20 20 27 22 18 7 54 60 
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1 Sustainable forest management including non-timber forestry products. 

average project size was ECU 80,000. Since the strategy 
is to finance fewer projects, this trend is set to continue. 
By their nature, many of the projects have been very 
short. Workshops, seminars, etc., may last only a few 
weeks, while even the field projects generally have a 
duration of no more than one year. 

5. PROJECT CYCLE MANAGEMENT 

5.1 Application 
Since DG XI's budget line is less well-known than those 
of the other DGs, those submitting a proposal to DG XI 
have usually had personal contact with one of the 
present/former administrators in charge of the tropical 
forests budget lines, at international meetings, during 
project missions, etc. They are often re-directed to DG 
XI from DG IB and DG VIII. While, in theory, 
proposals should come through the EU Delegations, in 
practice they are sent directly to DG XI. They can be 

made at any time. 
Since 1995, the system in DG XI has become more 

organised; proposals are now made using standard 
application forms. Proposals must now include: a letter 
of request; a technical description of the project; a 
budget; confirmation of additional/provisional income 
by co-financiers of the project (if not, the co-financing is 
regarded as pending); information about the applying 
organisation; bank references; a copy of the document 
specifying the organisation's legal status; financial 
statements for the previous two years; and details of 
previous contracts with the EC. While a logical frame­
work is not mandatory, some NGO applicants have 
submitted their proposal with one. 

5.2 Appraisal and approval procedures 
The project must correspond with the budgetary criteria 
set out in the latest version of the EC Official Journal, 
and be in accordance with the recently developed 
'Philosophy of budget line B7-811 0' (Ruiz-Murrieta, 

Table 4. Distribution of DG XI projects by implementing organisations 1991-6 

Government 2 5 
agencies 

International 3 6 
organisations 

Regional NGOs/other 3 5 
organisations 

Academic and 8 9 9 8 2 2 38 
research institutions 

International NGOs 12 3 4 4 24 

National NGOs 7 9 7 12 36 

- -""~ ~ ~\~~,.;.:.~~:;,~~{.;.,_.~. 
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Figure 6: Distribution of DG XI forestry projects by 
theme 1991-6 

I 

Energy (1.75%) 
Agroforestry (6.1 

Social forestry/ 
participation 
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peoples 
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Biodiversity/environmental protection (22.81 %) 

Figure 7: Distribution of DG XI forestry projects by 
implementing organisations 1991-6 

Government agencies (4.39%) 
International organisations 

(5.26%) 
Regional NGOslother 

(4.39%) 

1996). The project must either be located in a 
developing country or, as in the case of a workshop in 
Europe, involve participants from developing countries. 

Proposals are subject to a technical evaluation; in the 
case of tropical forestry projects, this is carried out by 
the General Administrator in Unit D4. Other advisers in 
Unit D4 are called in according to the nature of the 
proposal, such as those involved with international 
negotiations, timber certification, and biodiversity. If 
the proposal is basically acceptable, Unit D4 asks the 
applicant to modify it. In general, projects need 
considerable modification to be acceptable (personal 
communication, D4 General Administrator). 

Project proposals received under B?-8110 are tech­
nically approved within DG XI. The chain of approval 
is as follows: 

• D4 General Administrator 
• Director of DG XI D 
• Deputy Director-General of DG XI 
• A2 Financial Unit (to prepare a provisional 

contract) 
• Deputy Director-General of DG XI 
• DG XX Financial Control 
• DG XIX Budget 
• Receiving organisation (to sign contract) 
• A2 Financial Unit 

The whole procedure usually takes about a year to 

complete, but can be speeded up when a high quality 
proposal is received (personal communication, D4 
General Administrator). 

5.3 Monitoring and evaluation 
Up to the present, D4 technical staff have had little time 
for monitoring and evaluating the projects. Interim and 
final project reports have also been of poor technical 
quality. Until 1996, no project had been subject to an 
evaluation. However, this situation is expected to 
change from 1997, both with the more strategic 
approach being developed and with the decision to 
fund fewer projects (Ruiz Murrieta, 1996). 

5.4 Constraints to more effective project 
management 

Apart from the lack of monitoring and evaluation, the 
main problem perceived in D4 is the high percentage 
(over 50%) of non-EC contract staff. This situation 
results in a high turnover rate among seconded national 
experts and contracted staff, and therefore a consider­
able proportion of staff at any one time being at some 
point on the learning curve or using up the time of 
more permanent staff in the closer staff supervision 
required. 

6. PROJECT PROFILES 

6.1 Research and development of natural 
resources of indigenous communities 
in the Ucayali Region (RENACO), Peru 

This project approved in 1994 was a research study 
implemented by Paris University and aimed at promot­
ing sustainable natural resource management in the 
Peruvian Amazon. The main activities were to under­
take an inventory of natural resources, and research 
indigenous peoples' (Shibibo and Cunibo) knowledge of 
NTFP uses, mainly for nutrition and medicinal pur­
poses, and traditional forest management systems. 

The project resulted in a description of the nutritional 
and medicinal uses of more than 100 plants, and 
generation of knowledge on the cultural and spiritual 
aspects of traditional forest management. The EC 
contribution (ECU 49,820) comprised 48% of the total 
cost and was mainly spent on travel expenses and daily 
allowances for the Paris University staff involved. It was 
considered a successful project by the D4 General 
Administrator. 

6.2 TREES 
The TREES project (Tropical Ecosystem Environment 
Observation by Satellite) was established in 1991 as a 
joint activity between the EU Joint Research Centre 
(JRC) in Ispra,6 and the European Space Agency (ESA), 
with the objective of collecting and analysing satellite 
data sets over tropically forested areas, and developing 
new approaches to the monitoring of forest cover. The 
TREES I project (1991-4), managed by DG XII, resulted 
in the first global tropical rain forest classification map 

6. The EU Joint Research Centre in Ispra has been part of DG XII, 
but became independent in 1995. 



with a 1 km resolution covering Africa, Latin America 
and South-East Asia. It was co-financed by the 
European Parliament Fund (EPF) and DG XII (MTV7 

Unit Programme). 
The second phase (TREES II, 1995-9), which is 

mainly managed by Unit D4 of DG XI, aims to develop 
a prototype 'operational Tropical Forest Information 
System' which will continuously monitor changes in 
forest cover. It will pay particular attention to 
deforestation 'hot spots' which can then become the 
focus for intensive and detailed observation, leading to 
more accurate data on the 'causes' of deforestation. 
There is a strong emphasis in the project on diffusion of 
the information to an 'identified community of users'. 

The budget allocated to TREES II is approximately 
ECU 9 m., most of this coming from budget line B6-
79208 (Activities de soutien scientifique et technique 
aux politiques communautaires sur une base concur­
rentielle) in DG XI and approved under the 'Competi­
tive Support to the Commission' budget line of the IVth 
Framework Programme. DG XII contributed ECU 
235,00 in both 1995 and 1996. 

7. CONCLUSIONS 
The main roles of DG XI are representation of the EC at 
international environmental fora such as the CSD, the 
IPF, and the international Conventions, and the 
development of EC global environment policy. Manage­
ment of the budget line 'Contribution to International 
Environmental Activities' (B7-8110) is therefore not its 
main activity. Unit D4 - known as 'Global Environ­
ment' - is responsible for the share of the budget line 
going to forestry and biodiversity projects. A consider­
able share of the budget line goes on supporting the 
international fora already mentioned. Another impor­
tant role of DG XI is representing the Commission's 
position on timber certification at the appropriate 
international fora,9 and coordination of EC and wider 
EU consultation on certification issues, although devel­
oping a consensus position on this is problematic 
because of the diversity of stakeholder interests among 
the DGs. 

Using a broad interpretation of 'forestry', over the 
1991-6 period some ECU 5.6 m. were committed to 
114 small forestry projects (an average of just under 
ECU 50,000 per project}. Forestry and biodiversity 
compete with other global environmental 'sectors' such 
as the ozone layer, climate change and global warming, 
but in practice there has been little demand for the 
latter. At the appraisal stage, aid delivery has been in 
the hands of the Unit D4 General Administrator, who 
since 1991 has been either a forester or geographer. 
Project implementation has tended to be mainly in the 
hands of North-based institutions, especially universi­
ties, international NGOs and research organisations, as 

7. Monitoring of Tropical Vegetation (MTV) is pan of the Space 
Applications Unit at the EU Joint Research Centre. 

8. The B6-7920 budget funds activities only after a call for tender 
has been made, and is shared with other DGs. TREES II was the 
only tropical forestry related project in DG XI to be funded from 
it. 

9. Except mo, for which DG VIII provides the representative. 
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these have been the principal budget line applicants, but 
support in the future will be orientated more to South­
based CBOs, NGOs and their networks. 

Over half the projects financed have been 'strategic' 
or non-field projects involving meetings, workshops, 
research studies, networks, publications, etc., although 
the recent trend has been towards more field projects. 
The emphasis for both field and non-field projects has 
been on sustainable forest management, including non­
timber forest products, and biodiversity or forest 
protection. Wherever possible, support has been given 
to innovative approaches like extractive and community 
reserves, to local communities and indigenous peoples, 
and to policy development, especially wpere such 
activities help the EC develop its position ih interna­
tional fora. 

More than half the projects have been global or 
regional rather than country-specific, and over half of 
these have been directed at the Amazon region. In 
addition, Brazil has been the main beneficiary of the 
country-specific commitments, followed by Franco­
phone African and other Amazonian countries. It is 
clear that the General Administrators managing the 
budget line have had considerable influence in this 
regional distribution. Future priorities for the budget 
line include, as well as a more even regional distribution 
(no projects were approved for Brazil in 1996), fewer 
and larger projects which will complement rather than 
imitate projects from the other DGs. There will also be 
more support for promoting the local organisational 
capacity of 'civil society', especially in Africa, for 
indigenous peoples, for certification and for activities 
which will feed into the knowledge base for a long-term 
EC forestry strategy and help DG XI develop its 
position at international fora. DG XI is due to develop 
a 'Strategy on Forests' by the end of 1998. 
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ACRONYMS 
AFAN 
CBO 
CIFOR 
CSD 
DG 
EC 
EEA 
EPF 
ESA 
EU 
FAO 

GEF 
GTA 
IPF 
JRC 
mo 
MTV 
NGO 
NTFP 
OECD 

SFM 
TFAP 
TREES 

UNAMAS 
UNCED 

US AID 
wro 

African Forest Action Network 
Community-based Organisation 
Centre for International Forestry Research 
Commission for Sustainable Development 
Directorate-General 
European Community 
European Environment Agency 
European Parliament Fund 
European Space Agency 
European Union 
Food and Agriculture Organization of the United 
Nations 
Global Environment Facility 
Grupo de Trabalho Amazonico 
Inter-Governmental Panel on Forests 
Joint Research Centre 
International Tropical Timber Organization 
Monitoring of Tropical Vegetation 
Non-Governmental Organisation 
Non-timber forest product 
Organization for Economic Cooperation and 
Development 
Sustainable forest management 
Tropical Forestry Action Plan 
Tropical Ecosystem Environment Observation by 
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Association of Amazonian Universities 
United Nations Conference on Environment and 
Development 
United States Agency for International Development 
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1. EVOLUTION OF DG XII'S 
INVOLVEMENT IN TROPICAL 
FORESTRY 

1.1 Establishment of the Framework 
Programme on Science and 
Technology for Development 

In 1980 the Second United Nations Conference on 
Science and Technology for Development drew atten­
tion to the need for a greater research and development 
effort to improve the living conditions of the world's 
poorest populations (European Commission, no date). 
The resulting Vienna Programme of Action had two 
main objectives: to strengthen the scientific and 
technical resources of developing countries and to 
reorganise the existing procedures governing interna­
tional relations in the field of science and technology 
(European Commission, 1989). These provided the 
background for a Resolution by the Council of 
Ministers, dated 18 November, 1980, which underlined 
the importance of developing research capacities 
oriented particularly towards food crop production in 
developing countries, and the need to promote com­
plementarity between research centres in the European 
Community and in developing countries (European 
Commission, 1989). 

Following this, in 1982, the Council of Ministers 
adopted, for an initial period of three years (1983-6), a 
Framework Programme of Science and Technology for 
Development (STD). Managed by Directorate-General 
XII for Science, Research and Development, this 
programme provided support for research in the two 
critical areas of tropical agriculture, and tropical 
medicine, health and nutrition (European Commission, 
1989). The first phase (STD1) concentrated on promot­
ing the existing tropical research capacity in European 
institutions. It was evaluated as having been successful, 
fulfilling its aims through high quality projects (Wilson 
et al., 1988). The demand was such that only 60% of 
the proposals which were considered 'worth funding' 
could actually be supported. The Evaluation Committee 
(see section 6) therefore recommended that the pro­
gramme be continued for a second framework period 
and with an increased budget. 

1.2 STD2 and STD3 
The increased budget of the second Framework 
Programme (SID2, 1987-91) was justified by the 
recognition that developing countries 'are hard hit by 
the economic crisis and [that] budgetary restrictions at 
national level seriously threaten allocations to agricul­
tural research at a time when demographic trends make 
it necessary for them to be increased' (European 
Commission, 1994a). 

SID2 and SID3 continued with the same general 
objectives and research themes. They gave more 
emphasis, however, to previously neglected sectors such 
as production systems and - in response to the 
Commission's commitments in various international 
fora - to sustainable management of the environment 
(European Commission, 1996a). None of the SID 
Framework Programmes had a specific budget line for 
tropical forestry. Forestry-related projects were funded 

as part of agriculture, and particularly within the 
following subsectors: improvement of agricultural pro­
duction; conservation and better use of the environment; 
and production systems (European Commission, 1989). 

1.3 The Fourth Framework Programme 
(I NCO-DC) 

Following the ratification of the Maastricht Treaty on 
European Union in 1992, all Community activities in 
the field of research, technological development and 
demonstration were brought together within the 'Eur­
opean Community Framework Programme for Re­
search and Technological Development (RTD)'. The 
fourth Framework Programme, which was adopted in 
1994 with a duration of five years (1994-8), comprises 
four activities: 

(1) RTD and demonstration programmes; 
(2) co-operation with third countries and international 

organisations (INCO); 
(3) dissemination and exploitation of results; 
(4) stimulation of the training and mobility of 

researchers. 

Activity 2, also known as 'INCO', aims to add value to 
Community RTD through targeted co-operation with 
activities external to the Community (European Com­
mission, 1996b). It is further subdivided into three 
parts: 

A. Scientific and technological co-operation in Europe 
B. Co-operation with non-European industrialised 

third countries 
C. Scientific and technological co-operation with 

developing countries 

Research related to developing countries is funded 
within the third of these parts, commonly abbreviated 
as 'IN CO-DC'. Its principal aim is to enable developing 
countries 'to be associated with the generation of 
knowledge and innovative and appropriate technologies 
necessary for the solution of their specific problems and 
to reach a sustainable development level' (European 
Commission, 1996b). Its main objectives are: 

• to promote the role of relevant high quality RID in 
development and economic co-operation; 

• to encourage scientific collaboration between 
Europe and developing countries, among develop­
ing countries, and within Europe; 

• to help reinforce and maintain RTD capacities, 
including human capital in developing countries; 

• to contribute to maintaining a competence in 
Europe in scientific sectors of mutual interest and 
in those pertinent to problems of developing 
countries; 

• to capitalise on the experience gained during the 
implementation of previous Community Science 
and Technology co-operation activities; 

• to take into consideration the political obligations 
of the Union and the recommendations of interna­
tional fora such as the Rio Conference (UNCED -
Agenda 21) concerning research in developing 
countries. 

The general objectives of INCO-DC are wider than 
those of its STD forerunners. It includes activities 
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previously implemented under the umbrella of econom­
ic co-operation policy such as the programme of 
International Scientific Co-operation (bilateral co-op­
eration in RTD fields of interest to a non-EU country) 
and AVICENNE (regional RID co-operation with non­
EU Mediterranean countries in fields of mutual interest 
to the entire Mediterranean region). It places greater 
emphasis on funding activities that support or comple­
ment other EC policies and the Community's political 
commitments (such as those arising from the UNCED 
Conference). 

The focus of INCO-DC is on regional issues of 
mutual interest to the collaborating agencies. It will, 
however, support the involvement of developing coun­
try scientists in topics of global importance that extend 
beyond regional boundaries and need to be dealt with in 
a global context. These issues include the assessment 
and conservation of natural resources, the greenhouse 
effect, pollution, desertification, control of urban 
growth, pandemics and communicable diseases (Eur­
opean Commission, 1996b). 

The thematic content of INCO-DC is considerably 
broader than that of the preceding STD programmes 
and covers four sectors, each of which has a dedicated 
budget: 

• sustainable management of renewable natural 
resources, with subsectors on policy research, basic 
natural resources and research on ecosystems; 

• sustainable improvement of agriculture and agro­
industrial production, covering production sys­
tems, applied socio-economic sciences, post har­
vesting technologies, crop production, animal 
production and silviculture; 

• health; 
• additional sectors of mutual interest, which include 

information and communication technologies, 
non-nuclear energy, biotechnology, materials and 
production technologies (European Commission, 
1996b). 

Forestry research can be funded under three of the 
above sectors, with slightly different emphases. Within 
the natural resources sector, the ecosystems subsector 
funds research on natural forests, including, for 
example, such topics as biodiversity assessments and 
genetic studies, and also agroforestry and the socio­
economic aspects of buffer zone management. Within 
the agriculture sector, the silviculture subsector focuses 
particularly on man-made forests and forest industries. 
Lastly, the additional sectors of mutual interest may 
also offer funding opportunities for topics such as 
remote sensing, biomass (fuelwood) production and 
processing, or genetic engineering of trees (Official 
journal, 15 March 1996). 

2. STRUCTURE OF AID DELIVERY 

2.1 Budget allocation 
For STD1, STD2 and STD3, the Council of Ministers 
was responsible for adopting each Framework Pro­
gramme together with its budget. Since the ratification 
of the Maastricht Treaty (1992), this is now the joint 
responsibility of the Council and the European Parlia­
ment. Together they allocate the total Framework 

budget and determine how it is to be split between the 
different areas (such as INCO) and activities (e.g. 
INCO-DC). Within INCO-DC the distribution of the 
budget to the four sectors (natural resources, agricul­
ture, health, and additional sectors) must also be 
approved by both the Council and the Parliament 
(European Commission, 1996b). There is no budget 
specifically earmarked for activities related to tropical 
forestry. Forestry proposals must, therefore, compete 
with other proposals in each of the relevant sectors. 
Beese (no date) has suggested that the initially low levels 
of funding for tropical forestry were due to the small 
number of proposals received rather than the prioritisa­
tion of other sectors. 

Advice is provided by the INCO Regulato~ Com­
mittee, consisting of representatives of the Member 
States (often from the Ministry for Research or the 
Ministry for External Relations). This Committee meets 
on an ad hoc basis whenever new decisions concerning 
the Programme need to be taken. Its advice feeds into 
the preparation of a work programme by the Commis­
sion (DG XII), which must then be endorsed by the 
Committee. 

Each Framework Programme has several calls for 
proposals (see section 5.1) and it is the responsibility of 
the officers in DG XII to divide the programme budget 
equally among these (three in the case of INCO-DC). 
DG XII has about 30 people working on INCO-DC, of 
whom 16 are professionals. Only one of these is 
concerned (part-time) with tropical forestry projects. 

As can be seen from Table 1, each Framework 
Programme has had a bigger budget than its predeces­
sor. The volume of funding for agricultural research has 
also risen from ECU 30m. (STD1) in 1983 to ECU 126 
m. (INCO-DC) in 1994. As a proportion of the total, 
however, funding for agriculture has declined from 
75% to 60% over the same period. Nevertheless, 
forestry funding has increased both in terms of value 
(from ECU 2.2 m. in STD1 to ECU 15.8 m. in STD3), 
and as a proportion of the total Framework budget 
(from 5.5% in STD1 to 13% in STD2 and STD3). 

2.2 Co-funding 
All projects supported through the Framework Pro­
grammes are co-funded, with the Commission's con­
tribution not normally exceeding 50% of the total 
project costs. Project proposers are expected to match 
the funding provided. Where the accounting procedures 
of a collaborating institution are not able to identify the 
exact project costs (e.g. proportions of salaries, capital 
and maintenance costs), the Commission will pay up to 
100% of any additional incremental costs incurred. 
These may include additional staff needed for the 
project, capital equipment, direct running costs (e.g. 
travel, computing) and indirect overhead costs that are 
necessary to support the research (European Commis­
sion, 1996b). 

2.3 Accompanying measures 
A fund for accompanying measures is included in 
INCO-DC under the 'Additional Sectors of Mutual 
Interest'. Consisting of about ECU 2.5 m. per year, it is 
used to finance meetings, networks, liaison with 
international organisations, training and dissemination 
of results (European Commission, 1996b). The only 



3. STRATEGY AND POLICY • 109 

Table 1: Total budgets (in ECU m.) of successive Framework Programmes and the amounts and percentages dedicated 
to agriculture and forestry 

STD 1 ( 1983-86) 40 30(75%) 2.2 7% 5.5% 

STD2 (1987-91) 80 50(63%) 10.4 28% 13% 

STD3 (1991-94) 124 73 (59%) 15.8 22% 13% 

INCO-DC (1st Call, 1995) 59 39(66%) 4.8 12% 8% 

INCO-DC (1994-98) 209 126 (60%) 
-~: 

(Source : Data calculated from DG XII Archives) 
• The agriculture budget includes all forestry activities. In the case of INCO-DC, the figure comprises money spent under the subsectors 'natural resources' and 
'agriculture', both of which fund forestry projects. 

act1v1ty related to tropical forestry that has been 
financed through this fund is the European Tropical 
Forest Research Network (see section 6). 

3. STRATEGY AND POLICY 

3.1 Definition of 'research' 
The definition of research given in the information 
package accompanying the Call for Proposals (Eur­
opean Commission, 1996b) emphasises two conditions: 

• projects must be pre-competitive, i.e. the research 
results would require further development to 
produce marketable products or processes; 

• projects should be innovative, representing a step 
forward in the state of the art and including 
substantial original work. 

Both these conditions ensure that the Framework 
Programme funds pure rather than applied research. 
INCO-DC covers scientific research activities but does 
not fund technical assistance and the supply of 
infrastructure, nor the unilateral transfer of technology 
or demonstration projects. For these and other applied 
research activities there are more appropriate sources of 
funding, such as the various budget lines in DG IB and 
DG VIII, with which INCO-DC aims to collaborate. 

3.2 Definition of 'tropical forestry' 
A definition of tropical forestry does not exist within 
DG XII. Beese (no date) states that 'the orientation of 
forestry research under the STD programme is not the 
result of strategic selection after receiving proposals'. 
Similarly, the evaluation of the STD2 programme noted 
that 'the subject areas covered . . . merely reflect the 
submission of proposals rather than a defined policy of 
priorities' (Nelson et al., 1992). 

Thus, the exact types of projects funded within the 
forestry sector are at least partially dependent on the 
scientific officer in charge of tropical forestry. Origin­
ally this officer was an agricultural economist, followed 
from 1992 to 1994 by a microbiologist and, most 
recently, by an industrial forester. The latter classified 
all projects dealing with 'woody plants' as projects on 
tropical forestry. This approach is in line with the 

current inclusive approach to forestry, covering every­
thing from shrubs to non-timber forest products. 

It is this broad definition of forestry that has been 
used in calculating the data relating to forestry projects 
in this chapter. For this it was necessary to examine the 
summaries of all funded projects and subjectively assign 
them to a 'forestry' or 'non-forestry' category. In so 
doing, forestry was considered to include all activities 
from agroforestry and natural forest management to 
tree breeding and physiology (see section 4.4). 

3.3 Tropical forestry strategy 
The lack of a definition of tropical forestry is probably 
related to the fact that there is no fund specifically 
earmarked for this sector, nor a strategy relating to 
tropical forestry research. In response to a recommen­
dation by the STD2 evaluation panel, a policy on EC 
research is under preparation. A first draft was 
proposed to the Council in December 1996. However, 
this policy deals more generally with agriculture and 
provides little specific guidance on forestry. Potentially 
the most relevant document is the 199 5 Council 
Regulation on 'Operations to Promote Tropical For­
ests', but its effect on the Programme objectives and 
content has yet to be ascertained. 

As will be seen in section 4.4, the projects funded 
under the three SID Framework Programmes were 
heavily weighted towards research on mycorrhiza and 
genetic improvements of single tree species, the latter 
being predominantly economically · important species 
such as coconut and date palms, or species useful for 
wood production and soil conservation. This was in line 
with the Frameworks' emphasis on improving the food 
supply in developing countries and their resulting focus 
on agricultural production. 

With the start of STD2 (1987-91), many of the 
projects stated that one of their main objectives was to 
achieve the 'sustainable use' of particular resources. 
This may have been in part as a result of the STD1 
evaluation, which required that all agricultural propo­
sals should include an assessment of their potential 
environmental impact (Wilson et al., 1988). There was 
no obvious change in the types of project funded, 
however, until the present INCO-DC Framework 
Programme, which has taken on board many of the 
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Figure 1 Mean number of partners per forestry 
project 
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(Source: Based on DG XII archives; 
European Commission, 1989, 1994a, 1995, 1996a) 

issues highlighted by the UNCED Conference in 1992. 
As already outlined in section 1.3, INCO-DC now 

includes a sector on the sustainable management of 
renewable natural resources in addition to the original 
agriculture and health sectors of the STD Programmes. 
Its focus is on promoting the conservation and use of 
natural resources in ways that are ecologically, econom­
ically and socially sustainable (European Commission, 
1996b). Judging by the first Call for Proposals (1995), 
under which seven forestry projects have been funded, 
there has been a complete move away from the relatively 
'pure' genetics and mycorrhiza projects of the SID 
Programmes to more 'applied' research (see section 4.4). 

The time-lag between changes in the international 
debate on forestry and their impact on the funding 
priorities of the STD and INCO-DC Programmes can in 
part be explained by the fact that the specific objectives, 
work programme and budget are decided at the 
beginning of each Framework Programme (Official 
Journal, 15 March 1996). It is difficult, therefore, 
quickly to adapt the direction of the research thrust in 
response to regional and global developments. The 
officers responsible for INCO-DC do have a certain 
amount of flexibility, however, as new priorities within 
the scope of the overall Programme objectives are set 
for each Call for Proposals (European Commission, 
1996b). Furthermore, the timely evaluation of each 

Framework Programme allows appropriate action to be 
taken for the subsequent Programmes (Nelson et al., 
1992). Thus the recommendation by the STD1 evalua­
tion team that support for tropical forestry research 
should be increased, did result in more than a doubling 
of the proportion of funding going to forestry in STD2 
(see Table 1). 

4. ANALYSIS OF PROJECTS BY 
REGION, TYPE AND SIZE 

4.1. Number of projects 
As shown in Table 2, the number of projects }elated to 
tropical forestry increased from 16 (STD1) to 33 
(STD2) and 34 (STD3). Under the first Call for 
Proposals of INCO-DC seven forestry projects were 
selected for funding out of a total of 71 projects in the 
agriculture and natural resources sectors. This propor­
tion is slightly lower than in the previous two Frame­
work Programmes but may still be increased in the 
second and third Calls for Proposals. 

4.2 Number and type of partner 
institutions 

As can be seen from Figure 1, the number of partners 
collaborating on forestry projects has been increasing 
steadily from STD1 to INCO-DC. Under STD1 all 
projects focused on bilateral North-South partnerships, 
mirroring the traditional form of Member States' co­
operation. The increase under STD2 was due to the 
incorporation of more North-North links into projects. 
Thus 85% of STD2 projects involved more than one EU 
Member State, compared with only 25% in STDl. 
From STD3 onwards, the involvement of at least two 
EU organisations and one partner institute has been a 
requirement (European Commission, 1994b). !NCO­
DC goes even further and favours projects with more 
than one Southern participant (European Commission, 
1996b), such that, in the seven projects funded in the 
first Call for Proposals, the ratio of European to 
developing country partners is about 1:1. 

The successive Frameworks have seen a gradual 
improvement in the quality of the North-South partner­
ships within projects. Under STD1 several projects 
included developing country institutions which were, in 
fact, the local 'branch' of the EU partner (European 
Commission, 1989). Others had contracts that did not 

Table 2: Number of agriculture and forestry projects in successive Framework Programmes 

Agriculture proposals received 

Agriculture projects funded 
(including forestry) 

Forestry projects funded 

1280 

228 

16 

1632 

179 

33 

1283 

157 

34 

669 

71 

7 

(Source : Based on DG XII archives; European Commission, 1994a, 1996a) 
• Under INCO-DC 'agriculture' is taken to include both the 'natural resources' and 'agriculture' sectors, as forestry projects can be funded under both . 
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Figure 2 Origin of EU partner institutions in forestry projects 
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Note : Where two or more institutions from the same country have participated in the same project, they have been counted separately. 

specify how the money would be distributed between 
the partners (Nelson et al., 1992). This may have been 
because of the initially weak research capacity of many 
Southern institutions, resulting in projects which were 
initiated and defined by the EU partner rather than 
being the result of true collaboration. From STD2 
onwards this situation improved, and from STD3 on all 
contracts have had to contain detailed information 
about the distribution of money among the participants 
and have required the partners to be non-affiliated 
(European Commission, 1996b). In all four Framework 
Programmes universities and research organisations 
have received the largest share of funding for tropical 
forestry research, while government and non-govern­
mental organisations have played only a minor role. 
The majority of projects have been and still are 
proposed by European research institutes (Nelson et 
al., 1992). 

4.3 Geographic spread of partner 
institutions 

4.3.1 European partners 
Figure 2 shows the distribution of EU project partners 
in the successive Framework Programmes. Under the 
initial STD1 Programme, 15 out of a total of 21 
participants were French, with the remainder being 
British or German. Since then, research groups from 
most of the EU Member States have participated in a 
number of projects, although French and British 
institutions account for over half the total number of 
forestry project participants to date. This is likely to be 
primarily attributable to the colonial history of these 
two countries and their resulting larger number of 
tropical research specialists. As projects are selected 
with regard to their scientific quality, DG XII prefers to 
fund ten high-quality projects proposed by the same 
country rather than ten projects of a lower quality 
proposed by several countries (Beese, no date). 

4.3.2 Southern partners 
The programme differentiates four regions within the 
South: Asia, Africa, Latin America and the Mediterra­
nean region. Over half of the developing country 
participants in forestry-related projects to date have 
been from Mrica (Figure 3), with Senegal (16 projects) 
and Cote d'Ivoire (12 projects) receiving a particularly 
large share of funding. The dominance of African 
countries represented in the projects is not because of a 
preference for collaboration with Africa but results from 
the low number of Asian and Latin American partners in 
the proposals submitted (Beese, no date}. The high 
percentage of Francophone West African countries is 
probably correlated with the dominance of French 
research institutes participating in the programme. 
Within Asia it is Malaysian and Indian institutes which 
have been most actively involved (6 projects each), 
while Brazilian institutes have been the most frequent 
participants (10 projects) from Latin America. 

Figure 3 Distribution of developing country partners 
in tropical forestry projects (1983-1995) 
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Recently the number of projects with more than o.ne 
Southern partner has been increasing. In these projects 
South-South links are almost entirely between institutes 
in the same country or region, and only rarely involve 
institutes from more than one region. 

4.4 Thematic spread 
There has been no official categorisation of the forestry­
related projects funded by the Framework Programmes 
so far. The thematic analysis in Table 3 is based, 
therefore, on project summaries provided by the 
applicants (DG XII archives; European Commission, 
1989, 1994a, 1995, 1996a). The different research 
themes have broadly been grouped as being 'pure' or 
'applied' in nature. Projects listed under pure research 
deal with single species, their genetic improvement, 
their physiology, etc., and mostly aim to improve the 
production of woody biomass. This type of project was 
clearly predominant in the early Framework Pro­
grammes, and still made up the majority in STD3. 
Nevertheless, by the time of STD3, nearly half the 
projects could be classed as 'applied' and were more 
concerned with forest ecosystems as a whole. The latter 
is the only kind of project that has been funded under 
the first Call for Proposals of IN CO-DC, indicating that 
there has been a clear shift in priorities. To what extent 
this shift is the result of a policy decision in DG XII or 
merely reflects a shift in the type of proposal being 
submitted is unclear (see also section 3.3). 

Table 3: Thematic content of forestry-related projects 

4.5. Project size and duration 
As shown in Figure 4, the average size of forestry 
projects has quadrupled over the period of the four 
Framework Programmes, rising from ECU 136,000 
(STD1) to ECU 682,000 (INCO-DC). The largest 
project funded under STD1 (worth ECU 400,000) was 
smaller than the smallest project funded under !NCO­
DC (nearly ECU 500,000). In part this increase in scale 
is accounted for by the greater number of partners 
involved in recent projects. The amount received per 
partner has only risen from around ECU 57,000 (STD1) 
to ECU 99,000 (STD3), and even dropped slightly to 
ECU 90,000 in the first Call for Proposals of IN CO-DC. 

In general, it is the EU partners who receive the 
largest share of project budgets. This is expla\ ned by a 
number of factors (J. Kreysa, former DG XII scientific 
officer in charge of forestry, pers. comm., 1996): 

• salaries of EU researchers tend to be two or three 
times higher than those paid in developing 
countries; 

• travel expenses for developing country researchers 
to come to Europe are usually included in the 
budgets of their EU partners; 

• equipment costs are often included in the budget of 
the project coordinator (usually in the EU), because 
the export of research equipment is tax-free and 
therefore cheaper than equipment purchased in the 
developing country. 

The average duration of projects has increased from 30 
months (STD1) to 40 months. The great majority of 

(Source: DGXIIarchives; European Commission, 1989, 1994a, 1995, 1996a) 



5. PROJECT CYCLE MANAGEMENT -INCO-DC • 113 

projects - over 90% - are funded for either 36 or 48 
month periods. · 

5. PROJECT CYCLE MANAGEMENT 
- INCO-DC 

5.1 Calls for proposals 
Under INCO-DC there have been three Calls for 
Proposals (1995, 1996 and 1997), each one specifying 
research priorities covered by the work programme. 
Calls are usually made in March and proposals have to 
be submitted by September. They are evaluated by the 
following February and contracts for successful projects 
may be signed from June onwards (European Commis­
sion, 1996b). 

5.2 Eligibility requirements 
The proposal must fall within the scope and objectives 
of the work programme and respond, in particular, to 
the terms set out in the current Call for Proposals. All 
proposals must involve at least two non-affiliated 
participants from different Member States or one 
participant from a Member State and one participant 
from a state associated with the Programme (Iceland, 
Liechtenstein, Norway, Israel). Projects must have at 
least one participant from a developing country and 
preference is given to proposals involving at least two 
non-affiliated participants from developing countries in 
the same region. Projects are expected to demonstrate a 
significant and balanced level of participation between 
all partners (European Commission, 1996b). Proposals 
can be submitted by industrial firms (of any size), 
universities and higher education institutions, research 
organisations, governmental organisations, NGOs, etc. 

5.3 Evaluation and selection of proposals 
DG XII staff verify the eligibility of the proposals 
received. Each proposal then undergoes a confidential 
scientific evaluation by three independent experts, 
chosen from an 'expert data-base' of highly reputed 
scientists, most of whom have been recommended by 
members of the INCO Regulatory Committee. During a 
period of three weeks about 200 experts evaluate the 
proposals with regard to their technical feasibility and 
their scientific relevance. The expert evaluation pro­
duces a shortlist containing about 40% of the original 
project proposals. 

After the scientific evaluation, 32 regional experts 
(eight for each of the four regions of Asia, Latin 
America, Africa and the Mediterranean) from develop­
ing countries are invited to assess the relevance of the 
proposals for their region. This consultation further 
reduces the shortlist to about 20% of the original 
proposals (European Commission, 1996b; J. Kreysa, 
pers. comm., 1996). This shortlist is subject to external 
consultation with international organisations and other 
donors engaged in the funding of projects in the South. 
These organisations investigate whether the same or a 
similar project is being, or has recently been, funded, 
and whether there are related projects in the region. 

Parallel to the external consultation, an internal 
consultation with Commission services concerned with 
RTD activities in the South (DG IB, DG VIII) takes 

Figure 4 Average funding (ECU) per forestry project 
and partner institution 
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place. The internal consultation process is comparable 
with the external. Its additional goal is to confirm that 
the project proposals comply with DG IB's and DG 
VIII's agreements with developing countries (e.g. the 
Lome Convention). Although demonstrating a commit­
ment to better collaboration between different parts of 
the Commission, the internal consultation is often slow 
and produces little response. 

At the end of the consultation process, DG XII staff 
rank the proposals and prepare a final shortlist. In 
addition to the prime concern about scientific quality, 
the main criteria for project evaluation are: 

• feasible and convincing objectives; 
• innovative, original work; 
• precompetitive nature; 
• realistic scientific, technical and economic benefits 

for the Southern country, as well as a European 
dimension to demonstrate the mutual interest of 
the partners; 

• ability for high quality management; 
• evidence of impact on sustainable development and 

coherence with EC or Member States' development 
activities in the region; 

• interdisciplinary approaches where appropriate 
(European Commission, 1996b). 

A Management Committee, consisting of representa­
tives of all the DGs concerned, meets to examine the 
evaluation process and comment on the final shortlist. 
Based on this, DG XII staff make a definitive selection. 

5.4 Contracts and payments 
The successful applicants are then able to negotiate 
their contracts, providing more detailed financial 
information, including the distribution of funding 
between partners, and submitting an appropriate 
technical annex (the 'project description') for inclusion 
in the contract. The Commission may require modifica­
tions (technical, financial) to the proposal and the 
whole procedure may take some months to be 
completed. The technical annex is an important part 
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of the contract as it defines which research tasks are. to 
be accomplished by each of the contracting parties, as 
well as fixing a timeframe for the activities. It also 
provides the baseline against which progress reports are 
assessed by DG XII staff in order to take decisions 
about continued funding of the project (European 
Commission, 1996b). 

The project coordinator is responsible for the 
submission of reports, consolidating and summarising 
the work of all the contractors. Technical progress 
reports and cost statements must be submitted to the 
Commission every 12 months and at the end of the 
project. 

All payments are made in ECU via the project 
coordinator. An advance payment of approximately 
40% of the total EC support is made within two months 
of the signature of the contract by all the contracting 
parties. Subsequent payments are normally made 
annually within two months of the approval of the 
progress reports. A retention (10% of the EC contribu­
tion but not more than ECU 500,000) is withheld until 
all final documents (technical and financial) have been 
received and approved by the Commission (European 
Commission, 1996b). This payment procedure can pose 
difficulties for smaller research organisations with 
insufficient reserves to cover their costs in advance. 
Problems arise in particular because of the delays which 
can occur between the approval of the interim progress 
reports and the release of the next tranche of funds by 
the Commission (Nelson et al., 1992). Small organisa­
tions may also be hard pushed to find the necessary 
resources to cover the cost of preparing the proposal. 

5.5 Monitoring and evaluation 
During the early STD Framework Programmes the 
scientific officers had time to visit each of the current 
projects at least once a year. Under the INCO-DC 
Programme, however, the workload of the scientific 
officers is much greater and there is less time for 
monitoring, to the extent that some projects are never 
visited. Monitoring and evaluation must, therefore, be 
achieved by reading progress reports and through 
meetings with the project coordinators who generally 
come to Brussels once or twice during the project's 
lifetime (J. Kreysa, pers. comm., 1996; Nelson et al., 
1992). In exceptional cases the Commission may ask an 
independent expert to undertake further an~lysis of a 
particular project. 1 

6. PROGRAMME EVALUATIONS 

6.1 Evaluation procedures 
Each Framework Programme has been subject to an 
independent external evaluation. Ideally these are 
meant to be scheduled so that their conclusions and 
recommendations can feed into decisions about the 
following Programme. This was achieved for both 
STD1 and STD2. The evaluation report of STD3, 
however, is still outstanding. 

The evaluation of each Programme is organised by 
the evaluation unit of DG XII and carried out by an 
independent panel of experts. In the case of STD 1 the 
panel consisted of three agricultural and two medical 
experts (Wilson et al., 1988), while five agricultural and 
four medical scientists were called upon to evaluate 
STD2 (Nelson et al., 1992). Each evaluation consisted 
of meetings with Commission staff, reviews of a sample 
of projects (20% for STD1 and nearly 40% for STD2) 
based on their progress reports and, in some cases, on­
site visits. In the case of STD2, a questionnaire was also 
sent to project coordinators and participants. 

The main objective of the STD1 evaluation, which 
took place before most of the projects had been 
completed, was to review the Programme as a whole 
and make recommendations for its future (Wilson et al., 
1988). The STD2 evaluation focused both on individual 
projects and on issues associated with the Programme as 
a whole (e.g. whether the promotion of scientific co­
operation between EU Member States and developing 
countries had been achieved; how significant the 
programme was in terms of strengthening European 
research capacities; and how relevant it was to the 
economic and social development of developing coun­
tries) (Nelson et al., 1992). 

Projects in STD1 were evaluated on the basis of the 
following criteria: importance of problem; expected 
impact; scientific quality; efficiency; importance to a) 
food self-sufficiency, and b) promotion of medicine, 
health and nutrition; originality; complementarity; and 
collaboration. The first three criteria were prioritised. 
Quality was assessed as excellent, good, fair, poor or 
unacceptable. Over 85% of the 85 projects reviewed 
were considered to be 'good' or 'excellent' in terms of 
addressing important issues, having a good expected 
impact and being of sound scientific quality. 'Effi­
ciency' and 'collaboration' were more often rated as 
being 'poor' or 'unacceptable'. The evaluation criteria 



used for individual projects are not given in the STD2 
report. 

6.2 Programme achievements 
Both evaluations reached many of the same conclusions. 
The STD Programme was praised for being well 
designed and extremely cost-effective (with adminis­
trative costs being kept as low as 5% ). It improved the 
research capability of developing countries through the 
input of additional resources to their institutions, and 
played a particularly important role in contributing to 
staff development through training. The Programme 
was considered to have made the Community more 
widely known and had a positive effect on its image in 
developing countries. Both evaluations recommended 
that the Programme be continued with increased 
funding in order to overcome the financial constraints 
that had led to some excellent projects having to be 
rejected. 

6.3 Constraints and recommendations 
While the STD1 evaluation had commended the small 
and focused nature of projects funded by the Pro­
gramme, the STD2 evaluation considered that these 
were too costly in administrative terms. This was 
particularly true, given the inadequate staffing levels 
which severely limited the ability of Programme officers 
to provide advice on project preparation and to monitor 
and evaluate projects. The second evaluation recom­
mended both an increase in the number of Commission 
staff and the establishment of external expert panels to 
strengthen the monitoring and follow-up of projects. It 
highlighted particular dissatisfaction amongst project 
participants about the delays that could occur in the 
transfer of funds from the Commission, leading to a 
situation in which Northern institutions regularly had 
to provide bridging funding to their Southern partners. 

Both evaluations highlighted shortcomings in the 
nature of the collaboration between Northern and 
Southern partners. Individual responsibilities needed to 
be better defined and efforts made to ensure that 
linkages were of 'mutual benefit in the spirit of true 
partnership' (Wilson et al., 1988). The STD2 evaluation 
recommended that planning and review meetings for all 
partners should be budgeted for and enforced in all 
projects. 

With respect to thematic priorities, the STD1 evalua­
tion noted that the balance between technical areas was 
good. Within agriculture, however, it recommended a 
change in emphasis away from improving 'food self­
sufficiency', with its narrow focus on food crops, 
towards achieving 'food security', which would include 
projects dealing with important non-food crops such as 
cotton, trees and forests. On the whole it was 
recommended that greater multi-disciplinarity be pro­
moted in projects, a feature considered to be particularly 
important for tackling the complexity of agricultural 
problems. While the STD 1 evaluation praised the 
diversity of projects funded, the STD2 evaluation 
thought that too many subjects were being covered 
with insufficient attention being given to identifying 
research thrusts. It noted the absence of a clearly 
defined EC policy on research in agriculture and health, 
as well as a lack of procedures for allocating resources 
between the two sub-programmes (see section 3). 
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Both evaluations emphasised the need to ensure that 
all research was in accordance with international ethical 
standards. It was recommended that agricultural 
projects should be screened with respect to their 
contribution to sustainable agricultural production 
and their effect on the ecological stability of a particular 
habitat. 

7. CONCLUSION 
Since 1983 four successive Framework Programmes for 
Research and Technological Development have success­
fully funded a large number of tropical forestry research 
projects, bringing together EU and developil'\g country 
institutions in mutually beneficial partnership's. 

Research funded through DG XII differs from that 
funded by the development budget lines in DG IB and 
DG VIII in that it is meant to be fundamental rather 
than applied. While there is some collaboration among 
the DGs on project selection, the different project cycle 
methodologies mean that there is relatively little scope 
for linking DG XII research projects to development or 
research projects funded by other DGs. In part this is 
also because of the small number of staff responsible for 
the Framework Programme. The resulting weak man­
agement capacity is particularly problematic in that it 
hampers effective project monitoring and evaluation. 

Between the first STD1 Framework Programme and 
the current INCO-DC Programme, projects have 
become larger both in total funding volume and in the 
number of research collaborators. After an initial trend 
towards increasing the number of European partici­
pants, a balance now seems to have been reached with 
approximately equal numbers of Southern and EU 
partners. Projects as a whole have also become more 
multi-disciplinary in nature, reflecting the recommenda­
tions of international fora such as the UNCED 
Conference in 1992. 

Within the forestry sector, projects have seen a 
complete shift away from the early focus on individual 
species and woody biomass production to a concern 
with forest ecosystems and the role of trees in multi­
faceted production systems. The Programme could be 
much improved, however, through the development of 
an EC strategy on tropical forestry research to help 
focus the limited funds more effectively. Planning 
forestry research would also be facilitated by the 
introduction of defined procedures for allocating 
budgets between the various thematic sectors of the 
Framework Programme, with the possibility of ring­
fencing an amount for tropical forestry. 
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DG V, DG VI and DG XVI 
David Brown 

THE STRUCTURAL FUNDS 
The European Community has a number of programmes 
aimed at the development of disadvantaged areas and 
sectors within the territories of the European Member 
States. These exist to promote the overall harmonious 
development of the Member States of the European 
Union, and to encourage their 'convergence' in econom­
ic terms. The most important of the programmes brings 
together four separate funds, known collectively as the 
Structural Funds. These are the European Regional 
Development Fund (ERDF); the European Social Fund 
(ESF), the European Agricultural Guidance and Guar­
antee Fund (EAGGF), and the Financial Instrument for 
Fisheries Guidance (FIFG) .1 For the period 1994-9, the 
Structural Funds have at their disposal a total allocation 
of Ecu 141.4 71 billion. Management of the Funds is the 
collective responsibility of DG V (Employment, Indus­
trial Relations and Social Affairs), DG VI (Agriculture), 
and DG XVI (Regional Policies). 

Structural Funds are available as non-reimbursable 
grants, on the basis of co-financing ('part-financing') 
with the relevant Member States. The level of co­
financing depends on the objective of the programme, 
and is up to a maximum of between 50 and 85%. There 
are five sets of priority objectives: 

Objective 1: 

Objective 2: 

Objective 3: 

Objective 4: 

Objective Sa: 

Objective Sb: 

Structural adjustment of regions 
whose development is lagging 
behind 
Economic conversion of areas 
seriously affected by industrial 
decline 
Combatting long-term 
unemployment and facilitating 
integration into working life of 
young people and those 
threatened with exclusion from 
the labour market 
Preventive measures to combat 
unemployment associated with 
industrial change 
Structural adaptation of 
agriculture and fisheries 
Economic diversification of 
vulnerable rural areas 

The relevance of the Structural Funds in the present 
context relates to the few overseas territories of the 
Member States located in the tropics. The main ones are 
the four overseas Departements of France, Martinique, 
Guadeloupe, Reunion and Guyane, all of which have 
the same legal status as any other French departements. 

Only Guyane (French Guiana) possesses any major 
forest resources. The review which follows is restricted 
to this one territory. A brief description of the place of 
forestry in the economy of Guyane is provided in Box 1. 

1. The French acronyms are respectively: FEDER, FSE, FEOGA 
and IFOP. 
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SUPPORT FROM THE STRUCTURAL 
FUNDS TO GUYANE 
Forestry in Guyane is eligible for support from the 
Structural Funds in relation to Objective 1, on the basis 
of its relatively low per capita GDP (only 46% of the 
GDP of metropolitan France, and 58% of the European 
average). 75% funding is available to Guyane from the 
Funds, with the remaining 25% being contributed by 
the French Government. 

Guyane presently receives support from all the four 
constituent funds (EDRF, ESF, EAGGF and FIFG). In 
relation to tropical forestry, the main direct investment 
from the Funds has been the sum of Ecu 2.879 m. over 5 
years (1994-9)2 under the EAGGF, awarded to the 
Office Nationale des Forets to cover management costs 
and equipment for the creation of a sustainably­
managed production forest of 550,000 ha. Activities 
include inventory, demarcation, sylvicultural manage­
ment and single-purpose road construction. Counterpart 
funds are being provided by France (Ecu 1.97 m.) and 
the timber industry (Ecu 0.60 m.). A number of other 
activities have forestry components, including tourism 
development in forest areas, for which Ecu 0.7 m. is 
being provided from the ERDF; research on tropical 
forest ecosystems (Ecu 9.7 m. from the ERDF); and 
human resource development (Ecu 35.8 m. from the 
ESF). Additional investments from the Funds which may 
have important forestry impacts include the Ecu 24m. 
invested by the ERDF in road building programmes. 

REFERENCE 
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