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1 . From adoption 
of the 1980 budget 
to the preliminary 
draft for 1981 

1.1.1. There are two important develop­
ments in July-the budgetary procedure, 
interrupted in December 1979 after Parlia­
ment had rejected the 1980 draft budget out­
right, was completed and the Commission 
presented the preliminary draft 1981 budget. 

The 1980 budget 

1.1.2. On 9 July the President of Parliament 
declared, in accordance with Article 203 (7) 
of the EEC Treaty, that the general budget of 
the European Communities for 1980 had 
been adopted, 1 thus winding up a procedure 
which, since the summer of 1979, had taken 
a number of twists and turns. 

On 16 May 1979 the Commission adopted 
the preliminary draft of the budget for 19802 

and addressed it to the budgetary authority 
on 14 June.3 On 11 September the Council 
established the draft budget,4 making a 
number of cuts in the Commission's prelimi­
nary draft. 

At the part-session from 5 to 7 November5 

Parliament, at a first reading, debated and 
voted on the 1980 draft budget, restoring 
-under its own power of decision-various 
appropriations cut by the Council. The 
House also passed a resolution spelling out 
the conditions which had to be satisfied 
before. it could adopt the budget. 

Scrutinizing the budget at a second reading 
on 23 November/ the Council confirmed its 
intention of adhering strictly to the maximum 
rates for non-compulsory expenditure, fixed 
in accordance with Article 203, thus allowing 
only some of Parliament's amendments for a 
sum almost equivalent to its margin of man­
ceuvre. 

At the end of the second reading at the 
December part-session Parliament, maintain-
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ing that the conditions it had specified had 
not been satisfied, voted by a qualified major­
ity to reject the draft budget outright. 

After the vote President Jenkins assured the 
House that the Commission would do all it 
could to resolve the crisis. 7 In accordance 
with the Treaty the Commission took all the 
necessary steps to enable expenditure to pro­
ceed month by month from 1 January 1980, 
under the provisional-twelfths scheme.8 

On 14 February the Commission accordingly 
presented to Parliament new budget propos­
als to get the procedure under way again/ 
following which the Council addressed a new 
draft general budget to Parliament on 20 
June. 10 This was examined at special sittings 
held on 26 and 27 June, when the House put 
in a proposal for a modification and a 
number of amendments. 11 

On 30 June the Council accepted the amend­
ments but rejected the proposed modifica­
tion.12 

Finally, on 9 July Parliament, by a very large 
majority, rejected two motions for resolu­
tions before it-again calling for outright 

' Points 2.3.6 and 2.3.70; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980; OJ L 
242 of 15.7.1980. 
' Bull. EC 5-1979, points 1.5.1 to 1.5.12 and 2.3.98. 
' Bull. EC 6-1979, point 2.3.61. 
• Bull. EC 9-1979, point 2.3.78. 
' OJ C 302 of 3.12.1979; Bull. EC 11-1979, points 
2.3.6 to 2.3.9 and 2.3.71. 
' Bull. EC 11-1979, point 2.3.72. 
' OJ C 4 of 7.1.1980; Bull. EC 12-1979, points 2.3.4, 
2.3.5 and 2.3.95. 
' Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.3.96. 
' Bull. EC 2-1980, points 1.5.1 to 1.5.5, 2.3.10 and 
2.3.49. 
'" Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.3.44. 
" OJ C 187 of 24.7.1980; Bull. EC 6-1980, points 
2.3.20 to 2.3.24 and 2.3.45. 
" Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.3.46. 
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rejection of the budget-thus winding up the 
budgetary procedure for 1980.1 

Preliminary draft general 
budget for 1981 

1.1.3. On the same day that Parliament's 
President declared the 1980 budget adopted 
(9 July) the Commission approved the pre­
liminary draft budget of the European Com­
munities for 1981, which it addressed to the 
budgetary authority on 14 August.2 

This budget presents several original features, 
the first being its sheer size: with appropria­
tions for commitment of some 21 731 million 
EUA and appropriations for payment of 
some 20 051 million EUA, it is substantially 
bigger than the 1980 budget-by 25.48% 
and 27.85% respectively.2 

These increases are not as heavy as they seem 
when one considers the general crisis -situa­
tion surrounding the 1980 budgetary proce­
dure and the cuts that this entailed. Thus cer­
tain expenditure carried over from 1980 will 
inevitably have to be covered in 1981. 
Another new feature derives from the forth­
coming enlargement of the Community-the 
1981 budget will have to cater for the needs 
of a ten-member Community. 

Two other factors play a decisive part in 
determining the size of the budget. The first is 
the financial effect of the agricultural deci­
sions adopted by the Council on 30 May,' 
and the second is the effect on the budget of 
the Council's decisions of 30 May concerning 
the British contribution.3 The budgetary 
repercussions of both will have their full 
impact on the 1981 budget. 

The resultant growth in budgetary expendi­
ture will have obvious implications for the 
resources to be deployed. The Community is 
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immediately up against the problem of the 
exhaustion of own resources, a problem 
which the Commission has raised repeatedly, 
beginning with the publication in 1978 of 
'Financing the Community budget-The way 
ahead'.4 However, in the present political cir­
cumstances, the Commission considers that 
the preliminary draft budget for 1981 must 
stay within the 1% VAT limit, even if this 
means that the budget cannot provide for all 
that is politically desirable. The Commission 
is therefore proposing to limit overall expen­
diture to available resources, while keeping a 
safety margin of some 550 million EUA. 

Structure and growth 
rate of the budget 

1.1.4. With an overall volume of a little 
over 20 000 million EUA (in payment 
appropriations) the 1981 budget would 
appear to be about 28% bigger than the 
1980 budget. 

A distinction must, however, be made bet­
ween the rate of increase of compulsory and 
non-compulsory expenditure, in particular 
for structural purposes. For the former cate­
gory the rate would be 21% and for the latter 
45%. This reflects the Commission's determi­
nation to secure a more balanced structure of 
the budget for as long as the proportion of 
spending on agriculture continues to absorb 
60 to 70% of the funds available. In accord­
ance with its instructions from the Council, 

' OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
Point 2.3.71. 

' Bull. EC 5-1980, points 1.1.1 to 1.1.9. 
' Supplement 8178 - Bull. EC; Bull. EC 11-1978, 
points 1.2.1 to 1.2.3 and 2.3.93. 
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the Commission will be making a searching 
appraisal of this problem between now and 
June 1981. 

Although the rates of increase of recent years' 
general budgets look large (between 21 and 
23% from 1977 to 1979), the volume of the 
Community budget as a proportion of the 
aggregate GDP of the Member States has 
scarcely changed-from 0.79% in 1978 to 
0.81% in 1981. The Community budget and 
the national budgets compare in the same 
way. The Community budget corresponded 
to 2.6% of the aggregate national budgets in 
1978 and to 2.4% in 1980; in 1981 the ratio 
will be much the same. 

The main budget headings 

Support for agricultural markets 

1.1.5. At almost 13 000 million EUA, farm 
price support (EAGGF Guarantee Section) is 
12% up on 1980 (roughly 11 551 million 
EUA). This is a slightly larger increase than in 
1980 but a marked improvement on previous 
years, when the average annual increase 
(1975 to 1979) was 23%. These amounts 
allow for foreseeable short-term develop­
ments on both the Community and the world 
market but disregard the potential impact of 
decisions to be taken on farm prices and 
related measures for 1981/82. 

Despite the relatively moderate growth rate, 
agricultural intervention expenditure still 
accounts for the lion's share of the prelimi­
nary draft budget, so much so that revision of 
expenditure programmes and prudent finan­
cial management are now imperative. 

The increases in appropriations for the other 
sectors are relatively moderate for 1981, 
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though the level of foreseeable expenditure is 
still high for beef and veal, wine and fruit and 
vegetables. Finally, the Council Regulation of 
27 July on the common organization of the 
market in sheepmeat and goatmeat,' origi­
nally approved on 30 May/ will generate 
expenditure of 225 million EUA in 1981 (as 
against 50 million in 1980). 

Expenditure for structural purposes 

1.1.6. As regards expenditure for structural 
purposes, meaning the Regional Fund, the 
Social Fund and the EAGGF Guidance Sec­
tion, and also the supplementary measures 
for the United Kingdom under the Council 
Decision of 30 May 1980/ the Commission 
is proposing 4 369.3 million EUA in commit­
ment appropriations and 3 055 million EUA 
in payment appropriations. Commitment 
appropriations for the three major Funds are 
29.8% higher than in the 1980 budget. 

European Regional Development Fund 

1.1. 7. In nominal terms, the increase for the 
ERDF alone is almost 37% (from 1165 to 
1 600 million EUA in commitment appropri­
ations), but this sum includes a quota for 
Greece equal to 15% of the total Fund. Since 
the actual amounts available for the other 
Member States will not be reduced to provide 
the funds for this Greek quota, the overall 
volume of the Fund has to be expanded. 
When allowance is made for inflation (reck­
oned at 9.6%) the 1 600 million EUA gives in 

' OJ L 183 of 16.7.1980. 
' Bull. EC 5-1980, point 2.1.54. 
' OJ C 169 of 9.7.1980; Bull. EC 6-1980, points 1.2.4 
and 1.2.5. 
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real terms an increase of 7%. The Commis­
sion is proposing 800 million EUA (including 
20 million EUA for non-quota operations) in 
payment appropriations. 

Social Fund 

. 1.1.8. For the Social Fund the two main 
targets for operations remain young people 
and workers in regions in difficulty. Given 
the present budgetary situation, the Commis­
sion is proposing 1 000 million EUA in com­
mitment appropriations (up 10%) and 710 
million EUA in payment appropriations. 

Measures to assist the United Kingdom 

1..1.9. These consist of a payment under the 
adjusted financial mechanism, which, accord­
ing to present estimates, will be 469 million 
EUA (i.e. a net contribution of 380 million 
EUA) and supplementary measures worth 
1 074 million EUA, which includes an ad­
vance of 100 million EUA on the sum due for 
1982 (i.e. a net contribution of 880 million 
EUA). 

In addition, a compensatory repayment of 25 
million EUA will be made to Greece, which is 
not involved in these arrangements. 

Other priority sectors 

Development aid 

1.1.10. The Community and the Member 
States have undertaken to supply 1 650 000 
tonnes of cereals as food aid, compared with 
1 287 000 tonnes in 1980. Of this quantity 
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927 000 tonnes will be supplied by the Com­
munity as such, an increase of more than 
200 000 tonnes over the 720 500 tonnes 
under the 1980 budget. 

Cooperation with non-associated developing 
countries (Art. 930): the Commission is 
proposing 210 million EUA in commitment 
appropriations for 1981, i.e. what it planned 
at the outset (the 1975 proposal stipulated a 
gradual increase from 100 to 200 million 
EUA between 1976 and 1980), which is fully 
justified by the needs of the countries con­
cerned and by the fact that this Community 
aid is now well established. 

Special aid for Turkey: the Commission 
proposed that the 75 million EUA of special 
aid, approved by the Council in April 1979, 
be split into 40 million EUA for the 1980 
budget and 35 million EUA for the 1981 
budget. Accordingly, 35 million EUA has 
been entered as a payment appropriation for 
1981. 

Financial cooperation with Portugal: the 
overall volume for the 1980, 1981 and 1982 
budgets is 235 million EUA; the Commission 
is proposing 50 million EUA in payment 
appropriations for 1981 and 90 million EUA 
in commitment appropriations. 

1.1.11. For certain sectors which are still 
regarded as requiring priority attention, the 
Commission has not been able, in the present 
circumstances, to enter appropriations in its 
preliminary draft for the implementation of 
policies for which the Council does not 
appear prepared to institute a legal base in 
the near future. This applies notably to vari­
ous aids for the coal industry, support for 
transport infrastructure and assistance for 
industrial conversion; at this stage, these 
items are only token entries in the prelimi­
nary draft. 

Bull. EC 7/8-1980 
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Inclusion in the budget 
of lending and borrowing 
operations and the EDF 

1.1.12. The Commission's proposal of June 
1978 for amendments to the Financial Regu­
lation to enable borrowing and lending oper­
ations to be included in the budget is still on 
the Council's desk. The Commission feels 
that these operations have taken on such 
importance that a decision is now imperative, 
and it has therefore drawn up the preliminary 
draft once again on the assumption that a 
favourable decision will be taken. As in the 
past, the Commission has set aside Chapters 
90 and 91 of the budget for the future inclu­
sion of the EDF. 

Revenue 

1.1.13. In the light of estimates for the 
other own resources (customs revenue and 
agricultural levies), a VAT rate of 0.95% will 
be necessary to provide revenue to cover total 
expenditure of 20 051 million EUA. The mar­
gin available before the 1% VAT limit is 
reached is roughly 550 million EUA. 

Bull. EC 7/8-1980 

2. Community 
trade policy 
towards Japan 

1.2.1. In a communication sent to the 
Council on 17 July the Commission proposes 
a complete rethinking of Community trade 
policy towards Japan. On the basis of an 
analysis of the present unsatisfactory state of 
EEC-Japan relations, it outlines an overall 
strategy aimed at achieving a greater degree 
of cooperation in the mutual interest of both 
parties. 

The approach suggested is designed to pre­
vent a growing exacerbation of relations with 
Japan-especially over the quantitative 
restrictions still maintained by Member States 
-while offering the best chance of securing 
increased access to the Japanese market. It 
should enable the Community to harness its 
joint bargaining power to that end and at the 
same time ensure a competitive future for key 
industries on world markets in the 1990s. 

The present situation 

1.2.2. The Commission's analysis starts 
from the observation that the Community's 
trade relations with Japan are unsatisfactory. 
The Community's present trade arrangements 
with regard to Japan are embodied in a 
patchwork of separate national trade restric­
tions which are more a relic of the 1950s 
than a Community policy for the 1980s. Cer­
tain Member States (United Kingdom, 
France, Benelux) have bilateral safeguard 
clauses derived from past trade agreements 
with Japan, while Italy has a right of deroga­
tion for a number of items which have been 
liberalized with regard to Japan. 

Most Member States also maintain residual 
quantitative restrictions on Japanese goods, 
also derived from past bilateral agreements 
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with Japan. Some of these restncnons are 
applied selectively to a number of countries 
including Japan but not against other major 
industrialized trading partners, while a few 
discriminate against Japan alone. Finally, 
there are a number of informal arrangements 
restricting imports from Japan, negotiated 
annually at national level, notably by certain 
industries. 

This situation is unsatisfactory for a number 
of reasons. First, the present arrangements 
are discriminatory and are a source of grow­
ing resentment in Japan quite out of propor­
tion to the economic importance of the trade 
restrictions. Second, they represent a gap in 
the common commercial policy, in the sense 
that there is no unified Community policy in 
relation to quantitative import restrictions, 
while voluntary restraint arrangements of 
equal or greater importance are negotiated on 
a separate national basis. Separate national 
negotiations mean that other countries can 
play Member States off against each other, 
squandering the combined strength of the 
Community and leading to a less effective 
defence of its interests. Divergent national 
trade policies also lead to requests for protec­
tion against indirect imports under Article 
115 of the EEC Treaty, thus compromising 
the achievement of a single market, which is 
the Community's first raison d'etre. 

Lastly, differences in national treatment of 
imports from Japan are bound to lead to dis­
tortion of conditions of competition within 
the Community and to a partitioning of 
national markets which will damage the 
future prosperity of large sectors of Com­
munity industry in the 1990s. These need to 
be competitive internationally, not just in a 
single national market. The present situation 
is calculated to undermine the prosperity of 
European industry and to increase unemploy­
ment. 
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A Community strategy 

1.2.3. As we enter the 1980s, the Commun­
ity is dealing with Japan on the basis of 
guidelines set in the early 1960s. Given the 
past performance and future potential of 
Japan as the third economic power of the free 
world, it is in the Community's interest to 
develop a greater degree of cooperation with 
that country stretching over the whole range 
of areas of mutual concern. This aim is hin­
dered, however, by the maintenance of 
national protectionist measures. 

Efforts have to be made on both sides with a 
view to removing existing restrictions on 
trade. On the Community side, in addition to 
the indispensable restructuring of industry 
there should be a political willingness to start 
phasing out the discriminatory quantitative 
restrictions. This would also imply consider­
ing the possibility of reviewing the individual 
safeguard clauses applicable to Japan. Japan 
also needs to make essential concessions, e.g. 
as regards the extremely severe quantitative 
restrictions on leather goods and the high 
tariffs on processed agricultural products and 
various other goods. 

The sectors of Community industry involved 
in the liberalization of imports from Japan 
vary considerably in sensitivity. Some quan­
titative restrictions could be removed fairly 
easily, while others could be eliminated pro­
gressively on a basis of reciprocity. In a 
limited number of cases where serious indust­
rial and social difficulties would otherwise 
occur as a result of Japanese competition, 
and where large adjustments are required, it 
may be necessary for the Community to seek 
agreement for the temporary restraint of 
Japanese exports to allow time for the 
restructuring of European industry. Restraint 
would only be sought in exceptional cases, 
for a limited period (generally two to four 
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years), would be subject to a Community 
undertaking to proceed to liberalization on a 
Community-wide basis within a specified 
period and would be accompanied by specific 
restructuring measures. 

An element of industrial cooperation would 
form part of the matters to be discussed with 
Japan, including such aspects as closer con­
tacts between branches of European and 
Japanese industry, questions of investment 
(both Japanese in Europe and European in 
Japan) and possibilities of collaboration in 
joint ventures in other countries. A further 
opening-up of the Japanese market to Com­
munity exports would also contribute to the 
strengthening of commercial and industrial 
ties. 

Indeed, it is impractical to envisage a fully 
satisfactory trade relationship with Japan 
-with its highly individual and dose Gov­
ernment-industry and interindustry links 
-without industrial cooperation as a major 
component. Some of the major problems are 
only superficially reflected in trade flows; 
they are in essence industrial. But discussions 
on specific industrial problems cannot effec­
tively take place unless in the context of an 
overall Community strategy towards Japan. 

1.2.4. An initial discussion of the Commis­
sion communication took place at the Coun­
cil meeting of 22 July. The Commission will 
continue its examination of the questions 
raised by the document concerned, in dose 
cooperation with the appropriate Council 
bodies, with a view to determining what 
specific measures should be taken. 

Bull. EC 7/8-1980 

3. Dismantling 
of intra-Community 
barriers 

New Commission approach 

1.3.1. In its proposal of 25 August that the 
Council adopt a procedure for the provision 
of information in the field of technical stan­
dards and regulations, the Commission, fol­
lowing a judgment by the Court of Justice, 
outlined a new strategy in its fight against 
barriers to the free movement of goods 
within the Community. 

Moving beyond the strictly technical aspect 
of various national regulations or standards, 
and faithful to the policy it has been follow­
ing for more than ten years, it is once again 
fighting the resurgence of the old protection­
ist attitude in the Member States that is tan­
tamount to the re-erection of barriers within 
the common market. 

As part of this effort the Commission first 
wrote to the governments of the nine 
Member States and to Parliament on the 
implications of the judgment given by the 
Court of Justice on 20 February 1979 in Case 
120/78 (Cassis de Dijon) 1 and then proposed 
to the Council new measures 2 to supplement 
the 1969 General Programme on the 
Removal of Technical Barriers to Trade.3 Its 
actions are in line with the policy that the 
Commission had already recommended in 
January 1980 in its communication to the 
European Parliament.4 

Why a new approach? 

1.3.2. The reasons underlying the Commis­
sion's position are set out in the explanatory 

1 Rewe-Zentral AG v Bundesmonopolverwaltung fUr 
Branntwein (1979) ECR 649; OJ C 87 of 3.4.1979; Bull. 
EC 2-1979, point 2.3.53. 
' OJ C 253 of 1.10.1980. 
1 OJ C 76 of 17.6.1969. 
• Bull. EC 1-1980, points 1.3.1 to 1.3.6. 
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memorandum to the proposal on technical 
standards and regulations it sent to the Coun­
cil in August: 

'The Commission is concerned by the develop­
ments which have taken place in the field of tech­
nical barriers to trade in the Community in recent 
years. 

For more than 15 years it has been endeavouring 
to remove such barriers between the Member 
States. The free movement of goods is one of the 
principles underlying the Community, just as the 
creation of a single market is an indispensable ele­
ment of the projects it seeks to promote in various 
fields. 

In 1968, the Commission sent the Council a prop­
osal for a general programme on the removal of 
technical barriers to trade. Since this was adopted, 
it has regularly submitted proposals for directives 
designed to implement the programme; it monitors 
the correct implementation by the Member States 
of directives already adopted and itself adopts 
directives designed to bring Community legislation 
into line with technical developments. 

It is now apparent that measures taken in this 
field, with the assistance of the Member States and 
the two sides of industry, have formed an ade­
quate economic basis in several industrial sectors 
which has enabled them to increase competitive­
ness in relation to their competitors in non­
member countries. 

Nevertheless, prevailing economic trends have not 
always induced the Member States to continue 
their efforts to create the necessary Community 
basis from which the various branches of industry 
could meet competition from non-member coun­
tries. In some cases even, several Member States 
seem tempted to erect de jure or de facto barriers 
around their own markets by exploiting the tech­
nical requirements and standards Jaid down in this 
field at national level. 

This approach would constitute a danger if it were 
to persist since, as a result of similar measures 
taken by the other Member States, it would lead 
the industries concerned to fall back and concen­
trate on their national territory, thereby preventing 
consumers from enjoying the benefits of 
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economies of scale and the effects of competition 
within a unified market. 

If European industrialists cannot take advantage 
of the "Community dimension" to increase pro­
duction, they are at a disadvantage compared with 
competitors who already have access to a vast 
market. Their export opportunities are reduced, 
with resultant adverse effects on the economies of 
all the Member States. 

With the machinery available to it at present, the 
Commission feels unable to achieve its goal of 
halting this development. This highlights the need 
to supplement the measures already taken.' 

Decisions of the Court of Justice 

1.3.3. In its new approach, necessitated by 
trends in recent years, the Commission is sup­
ported by Court of Justice decisions. 

The Court has held that technical regulations 
relating to goods which impede the market­
ing of products legally manufactured and 
sold in another Member State may be 
adopted only if they are necessary to meet 
essential requirements and have an objective 
in the public interest of which they constitute 
the main guarantee. 

More precisely, the main principles identified 
by the Court, particularly in its judgment of 
20 February 1979 in Case 120/78, concern­
ing the interpretation of EEC rules on free­
dom of trade can be summarized as follows, 
as set out by the Commission in its January 
1980 communication: 

'1. Any rules liable to hinder, directly or indi­
rectly, immediately or in the future, intra­
Community trade constitute a violation of the 
,rules of Articles 30 et seq. of the EEC Treaty. 

2. As regards commercial and technical regula­
tions more particularly, the Court stipulated that 
any product legally manufactured and sold in a 
Member State must in principle be admitted to the 
market of any other Member State. 

Bull. EC 7/8-1980 
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3. Even if such rules apply indiscriminately to 
home-produced and imported products, they can 
only create barriers if these are necessary in order 
to satisfy mandatory requirements, are in the gen­
eral interest, are the main guarantee of that gen­
eral interest and if that general good is more 
important than the requirement of free movement 
of goods which is one of the basic rules of the 
Community. 

The definition of obstacles to freedom of trade 
prohibited by Articles 30 et seq. of the EEC Treaty 
a~ given by the Court is very broad. It can be used 
to seek out and to proceed more efficiently against 
new non-tariff barriers which hinder free trade 
within the Community often hidden in or dis­
guised as a variety of rules and regulations. 

The law as stated by the Court, notably in its Cas­
sis d.e Dijon judgment, means that Member States 
may control marketing conditions as regards their 
own products but not for products imported from 
other Member States.' 

An approach based on the guidelines 
described would make it possible henceforth 
to put a stop to the application of a large 
number of national regulations in so far as 
these hinder trade between the Member 
States. Such an approach would, at the same 
time, make it possible to safeguard the special 
problems of each Member State and to 
ensure that these are known to and under­
stood by Community consumers while still 
ensuring that the latter have a choice of a 
very wide range of products. 

The Commission's new proposal 

1.3.4. The proposal for a Council Decision 
laying down a procedure for the provision of 
information in the field of technical standards 
and regulations supplements the action 
already taken under the resolutions contained 
in the 1969 General Programme. The aim is 
to obtain and disseminate better information 
on national technical standards and regula-
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tions in preparation and to institute arrange­
ments for managing this information so as to 
rule out any harmful effects on the movement 
of goods. 

As is clear from the wording of the proposal, 
the Decision is to apply mainly to industry, 
where these problems have become particu­
larly acute; most, if not all of the activities of 
national and European standards institutions 
are in this field. However, a distinction has to 
be made between standards drawn up by 
standards institutions and technical regula­
tions adopted by governments. 

The Commission proposal stipulates that the 
programmes of national standards institu­
tions be submitted to the Commission and to 
the Member States. This must be done in a 
form allowing them to be compared so that 
they can be studied in detail. The mere fact 
that information on standards which are 
being drafted is available in sufficient time to 
enable industry in other Member States to 
prepare for their introduction can, in itself, 
eliminate a large proportion of the barri~rs 
which they would otherwise create. 

Technical regulations, because of their legally 
binding nature, are even more likely to create 
barriers than are standards. In recent years, 
some Member States have created serious 
adaptation problems for manufacturers in the 
rest of the Community by changing their reg­
ulations at very short notice. 

In presenting this proposal, the Commission 
hopes that its adoption will not only ease the 
task of departments tackling technical bar­
riers to trade by preventing the creation of 
such barriers but also, and above all, will 
expedite the achievement of the free move­
ment of goods, an essential condition for the 
establishment of the internal market. 
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4. Agreements 
between the 
Community 
and Romania 

1.4.1. The ties between the Community and 
Romania will be strengthened further follow­
ing the signing of two agreements in Buchar­
est on 28 July-one on trade in industrial 
products and the other on the establishment 
of a Joint Committee. 

Both the Romanians and the Community rep­
resentatives stressed the importance of these 
two complementary agreements when they 
were signed; their conclusion comes after 
years of continuous cooperation. The Com­
munity delegation, which was on its first offi­
cial visit to Romania, was received during its 
stay in Bucharest by Mr Ceausescu, President 
of the Republic, and had talks with members 
of the government. 

Developments in relations 
between the Community and Romania 

1.4.2. Relations between the Community 
and Romania date from 31 January 1972, 
when Mr Burtica, Romania's Foreign Trade 
Minister, asked the Community authorities to 
include Romania in the Community's 
generalized system of preferences and was 
given a favourable response; as a result, the 
Community has granted tariff preferences to 
Romania since 1 January 1974, and over the 
years an increasing number of products have 
been covered by the GSP. 

Before the bilateral trade agreements between 
the Member States and Romania were due to 
expire, at the end of 1974,1 the Community 
sent Romania an outline agreement which 
constituted an offer of negotiations to con­
clude a trade agreement with it-an offer 
which had been made to all the other State­
trading countries as well. 1 

Although Romania did not take up this offer 
immediately, contacts between the Romanian 

16 

Community - Romania agreements 

and Community authorities were stepped up 
with a view to discovering ways of reaching 
mutually satisfactory solutions to the various 
trade problems arising. 

Sir Christopher Soames, Commission Vice­
President at the time, visited Bucharest in 
January 1976,2 and a Romanian delegation 
led by Mr Stanciu, Deputy Minister of Fore­
ign Trade, visited the Commission in July 
1977.3 When Mr Haferkamp visited Buchar­
est in February 1978, a far-reaching exchange 
of views took place and the broad lines of a 
programme were worked out, the aim being 
to achieve, slowly but surely, objectives 
which were increasingly becoming joint goals 
over the years. 

Although Romania has been a member of 
GATT since 1971, following the negotiation 
of an Accession Protocol (which took four 
years, the Community being represented by 
the Commission), it became clear that this 
multilateral framework could not, on its 
own, meet the complex requirements of 
expanding trade relations. 

Romania was the first East European country 
with which the Community concluded an 
agreement on textile products, covering the 
period 1976-77. A second, five-year agree­
ment, which entered into force on 1 January 
1978 (as did similar agreements with more 
than 30 other textiles-exporting countries),4 

was initialled on 16 December 1977. The two 
parties have stated on several occasions that 
these agreements are operating smoothly. 

1 Bull. EC 11-1974, points 1301 and 1302; point 2333. 
Bull. EC 1-1976, point 2336. 

1 Bull. EC 7/8-1977, point 2.2.76. 
• Bull. EC 12-1977, points 1.2.1 to 1.2.3. 
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Romania's example has been followed by 
Bulgaria, Hungary and Poland. 

In connection with the measures taken to 
meet the steel crtsts, the Romanian 
authorities gave a favourable response to the 
request made by the Commission at the end 
of December 1977 for arrangements to be 
negotiated with the Community's main steel 
suppliers. 1 As a result of the negotiations, a 
steel arrangement was signed in May 1978 
which was valid for that year. 2 It was 
renewed for 19793 and 1980.4 There are simi­
lar arrangements with Bulgaria, Hungary, 
Czechoslovakia and Poland. 

Romania entered a new phase in its dialogue 
with the Community with the dispatch of a 
note verbale, dated 24 July 1978, in which 
the Romanian authorities proposed the con­
clusion of an agreement on trade in industrial 
products other than textile and steel products 
and an agreement on the establishment of an 
EEC-Romania Joint Committee. 

Once the Council had adopted negotiating 
directives on 6 February 1979,S negotiations 
were started with Romania for the two agree­
ments and were successfully completed after 
six rounds, spread over the period between 
February 19796 and June this year/ The 
agreement establishing the Joint Committee 
was initialled on 8 February last,8 and the 
final version of the agreement on trade in 
industrial products on 27 June/ 

The substance of the agreements 

1.4.3. These two agreements are particu­
larly important both from the point of view 
of the volume of trade covered by the indust­
rial agreement and as regards the terms of 
reference of the Joint Committee. 
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The conclusion of the industrial agreement, 
which alone covers two-thirds of trade bet­
ween the Community and Romania, fills out 
the legal framework which is necessary if 
trade is to develop smoothly between the two 
parties. If the textile agreement and the steel 
arrangement are included, 90% of trade bet­
ween the Community and Romania is now 
bound by contract. 

Although agricultural products are not 
covered by a bilateral agreement, there have 
been technical arrangements for certain pro­
ducts since the end of the 1960s. As the terms 
of reference of the Joint Committee are of a 
general nature, the Community will be able 
to adopt a uniform approach in its trade pol­
icy vis-a-vis Romania. 

Agreement establishing a joint Committee 

1.4.4. The Joint Committee between the 
Community and Romania constitutes an 
institutional framework within which the two 
parties, meeting at the highest possible level, 
will be able to discuss any trade issues of 
mutual concern, such as the trends and struc­
ture of trade, trade promotion, exchanges of 
information on structural guidelines for those 
areas in the economies of the two parties 
which have an impact on trade, and ways of 
exploiting the complementary aspects of the 
respective economies. 

1 Bull. EC 12-1977, points 1.1.1 and 1.1.2. 
' Bull. EC 5-1978, point 2.2.41. 
1 Bull. EC 1-1979, point 2.2.12. 
' Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.2.12. 
1 Bull. EC 2-1979, point 2.3.25. 
• Bull. EC 3-1979, point 2.2.71. 
' Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.2.75. 
' Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.2.70. 
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The Joint Committee will also see that the 
agreements function properly and may 
recommend solutions to any mutual prob­
lems relating to trade. The agreement setting 
up the Committee has been concluded for an 
unlimited period; it may be denounced at any 
time with six months' notice. 

Agreement on trade 
in industrial products 

1.4.5. The agreement on industrial products 
(other than textile and steel products) is 
based on the principle of reciprocity of 
advantages and obligations and includes the 
following provisions: clause providing for 
goodwill in implementation of the agreement; 
undertaking by the Community to accord the 
highest possible degree of liberalization; 
liberalization of certain products and opening 
of import quotas for products which have not 
been liberalized; safeguard clause; Romanian 
undertaking to expand and diversify pur­
chases in the Community, etc. This agree­
ment, which is valid for five years, is auto­
matically renewable every year. 

The concessions made by each side can be 
summarized as follows: 

The Community: 

• agreed to bind ex1snng liberalizations 
bilaterally and undertook to apply to 
Romania in future any liberalization mea­
sures generally applied in respect of GATT 
member countries; 

• undertook to abolish or to suspend, as 
from 1 January 1981, a number of specific 
quantitative restrictions. The various types of 
measures contemplated concern imports into 
the Community worth approximately 43 mil­
lion EUA; 
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• agreed that the import quotas to be 
opened each year in respect of Romania will 
be the subject of consultations within the 
Joint Committee beforehand. On average, 
quota volumes will be increased by nearly 
20% for 1981 (generally speaking, the 
annual increases agreed as part of the unila­
teral import arrangements were around 7%); 

• lastly, new import possibilities were cre­
ated for products which the Romanians 
might want to export (tableware, newsprint, 
ornaments, etc.). 

Romania, for its part undertook, in return for 
the Community concessions, to expand its 
imports at least at the same rate as its pur­
chases from the other member countries of 
GATT. This increase in imports of products 
originating in the Community will take into 
account the growth rates set by Romania's 
economic development plans, the growth of 
its foreign trade and the market competitive­
ness of Community products. 

The two parties also agreed to a safeguard 
clause which will enable whatever measures 
proved necessary to be adopted immediately. 

The Community accounts for a large share of 
Romania's foreign trade. In 1978, 19% of 
Romania's overall trade was with the Com­
munity, and with a 52% share the Commun­
ity is Romania's biggest Western indus­
trialized trading partner. 

Economic and political 
implications of the agreements 

1.4.6. The importance, the economic impli­
cations and the political significance of the 
agreements were stressed at the signing cere­
mony in Bucharest on 28 July in speeches 
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delivered by Mr Burtica, Deputy Prime 
Minister and Minister of Foreign Trade and 
International Economic Cooperation, for 
Romania, and by Mr Thorn, President of the 
Council, and Mr Haferkamp on behalf of the 
Community. Extracts from their speeches 
follow. 

Mr Burtica 

1.4.7. ' ... The new life which is to be injected 
into the Romanian economy over the five-year 
period between 1981 and 1985, the start of which 
coincides with the entry into force of our agree­
ments, creates a favourable climate for the promo­
tion and diversification of economic relations bet­
ween Romania and the EEC member countries. It 
is our desire that these countries should have an 
even more important place in our foreign trade. Of 
course, this does not depend entirely on Romania. 
The level of technical and market competitiveness 
and the scope for the promotion of Romanian 
exports, particularly of manufactures, are crucial if 
we are to secure the means to pay for our imports. 

We would like to foster stable forms of trade in 
the long term, promote mixed investment com­
panies in various fields, step up our cooperation 
with the Community member countries on other 
markets and strike a balance in our trade. 

We do not intend to achieve this equilibrium by 
importing less, but by promoting trade in both 
directions, so that the balance of trade and the 
balance of payments can be stabilized at the high­
est possible level. ... '' 

Mr Thorn 

1.4. 8. ' ... The main, if not essential, characteris­
tic of the industrial agreement is that it does not 
merely state principles, but contains real, tangible, 
economic substance in the form of immediate mea­
sures and specific commitments for the future. As 
regards liberalization, the Community has 
endeavoured to go as far as possible to meet the 
Romanian demands in spite of a difficult economic 
situation. As soon as the agreement enters into 
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force the Community is prepared to make access 
to its market much easier for a number of major 
Romanian exports, thus showing its determination 
to take Romania's development needs into consid­
eration. 

The agreement establishing the joint Committee 
provides us with a particularly valuable instrument 
to guide our relations which we have lacked so far. 
Concluded for an unlimited period, it creates a 
permanent institutional framework with general 
terms of reference and will mean that a com­
prehensive, uniform approach can be adopted 
towards our economic and trade relations at the 
highest level. The joint Committee will not only 
have to ensure that the three existing sectoral 
agreements function properly, but will also have to 
come up with any suggestions it considers might 
further the harmonious development of our rela­
tions. 

Today's ceremony does not mark the end of a pro­
cess but the beginning of the new life which we 
intend to inject into our cooperation. 

In this respect, the agreements which we have just 
signed show that by tackling the problems realisti­
cally and practically, by avoiding dogmatism and 
formalities, it is possible to lay the foundations of 
the sort of cooperation which benefits both sides 
and takes into account the specific characteristics 
of the ind.ividual parties and their socio-economic 
situations ... .'' 

Mr Haferkamp 

1.4.9. Mr Haferkamp said in his speech 
that the signing of the two agreements was an 
important event. He hoped it would be taken 
note of elsewhere and that its example would 
be followed. He also said: 

' ... These agreements are important both econom­
ically and politically. They prove that where there 
is goodwill on both sides it is also possible to 
establish normal, systematic relations between 

' Unofficial translation. 
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States or groups of States which have different 
economic and social systems . 

... These agreements provide our bilateral relations 
with a solid, institutional basis which will enable 
them to thrive and flourish in the future. 

With the agreements which we are to sign today 
we are breaking new ground. But we must not 
forget that there have been good relations between 
Romania and the individual Member States of the 
European Community for a long time. 

There have also been relations for some time bet­
ween Romania and the Community as a whole. 

Thanks to the imagination, the strong political will 
and the patience shown by the two sides, we have 
succeeded in our enterprise and are to confirm this 
today with our signatures .... '' 

' Unofficial translation. 
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1. Building 
the Community 

Economic and monetary policy 

Economic and monetary union 

New Community borrowing 
and lending instrument 

Second tranche of borrowings: 
400 million EUA 

2.1.1. On 15 July the Council (Economic 
and Financial Affairs), acting in the context 
of the basic Decision of 16 October 1978' in 
which it empowered the Commission to con­
tract loans totalling 1 000 million EUA for 
the purpose of promoting investment within 
the Community, decided to authorize a 
further tranche of borrowings amounting to 
400 million EUA. The relevant Decision was 
formally adopted by the Council on 22 July.2 

The Commission's request for authorization 
to contract a second tranche under the NCI 
(new Community borrowing and lending 
instrument, or 'Ortoli facility') was laid 
before the Council on 29 January;3 the 
amount requested was 500 million EUA, 
matching that of the first tranche, authorized 
in May 1979.• Because of certain differences 
of view between delegations, a compromise 
solution was adopted on 15 July: 80% of the 
second NCI tranche, i.e. 400 million EUA, 
will be released immediately, on the same 
bases as the previous 500 million EUA. A 
decision on the remaining 100 million EUA 
will be taken in the light of the discussions 
which the Council is to hold in October on a 
possible extension of the scope of the loans. 
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Economic situation 

Policy to be followed in 1980 and 
preparation of public budgets for 1981 

Communication from the Commission 

2.1.2. On 7 July the Commission sent the 
Council a communication on the economic 
policy to be followed in 1981 and on the pre­
paration of public budgets for 1981. This 
document, which gives a provisional assess­
ment, will be followed by an overall report 
on the economic situation in the Community 
and the policies to be pursued in 1981, which 
the Commission is to transmit to the Council 
and to Parliament in the autumn. The new 
document will contain more precise 
guidelines for each country so as to take 
account of their particular situations. 

2.1.3. The text of the communication pre­
sented on 7 July, in preparation for the 
Council meeting on 15 July, is given below, 
only a few passages being omitted. 

'Economic trends and prospects 

2.1.4. Following a period with comparatively 
favourable growth performance (3.4% on average 
for the years 1976 to 1979), a slowdown of 
economic activity is now under way in the Com­
munity. As a consequence of the deflationary 
impact of the 1979/80 oil price increase (estimated 
at 150% from end 1978 to 1 July 1980), the Com-

' OJ L 298 of 25.10.1978; Bull. EC 10-1978, point 
2.1.10. 

OJ L 205 of 7.8.1980. 
' OJ C 54 of 4.3.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.1.1. 
' OJ L 125 of 22.5.1979; Bull. EC 5-1979, point 2.1.7. 
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munity's real gross domestic product is expected 
to decline from the first to the second half of 
1980, but may for the year as a whole show an 
increase of about 1' I 2%. 

The currently available data suggest that expansio­
nary forces may regain some strength in the course 
of 1981. Private consumption, which is likely to 
stagnate in most of 1980, should recover under the 
impact of the acceleration in real disposable 
incomes resulting from a slowdown in price 
increases relative to nominal incomes. Moreover, 
the process of inventory adjustments, which is 
exerting a highly deflationary impact in 1980, 
should come to an end and be succeeded in the 
second half of 1981 by a more normal rate of 
inventory formation. Exports, notably to the 
OPEC countries, should remain a factor of buoy­
ancy both in 1980 and 1981. On the whole, the 
growth of gross domestic product is expected to 
exceed 2% in the second half of 1981, but the 
average increase over 1980 may amount to only 
'/2 to 1%. These forecasts are, however, the aggre­
gate result of relatively divergent growth perform­
ances within the Community, with the United 
Kingdom expected to see a decline of GDP both in 
1980 and 1981, whereas other Member States will 
experience more buoyant conditions. 

Given that the slowdown of economic growth 
coincides with a relatively large, in part demo­
graphically determined, increase in the labour 
force, an extension of unemployment is unavoid­
able despite the fact there is still a shortage of skil­
led labour in many industries. 

The price increases for raw materials and fuels are 
now being reflected strongly in retail prices; in 
some Member States, this has sparked off a new 
wave of compensatory income adjustments, 
whereas others have succeeded to some extent in 
stemming the secondary effects. For the Commun­
ity as a whole, the deflator of private consumption 
is expected to rise by more than 12% in 1980 
(partly reflecting, however, increases in indirect 
taxes). In the course of next year, the rate of price 
increases should get back into single figures but 
may for the year on average (over 1980) remain 
above 10%. The difference between the lowest 
and the highest inflation rates should be reduced 
somewhat compared to the 15 percentage points 
expected for 1980, but the underlying rate of infla-
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tion would remain 5 points higher in Italy and the 
United Kingdom than the Community average, 
and 3'/2 points higher in Ireland. 

A high degree of divergence would seem likely to 
prevail in the field of general government borrow­
ing requirements, expected to amount to dose to 
12% of GDP in Ireland and Italy and around 8% 
in Belgium, with the Community average exceed­
ing4%. 

For the Community as a whole the deficit on the 
current external account is expected to exceed 
28 000 million ECU in 1980 and to decrease to 
some 22 000 million ECU in 1981 (including the 
estimated impact of the oil price increases decided 
in June 1980). Two countries (France and the 
United Kingdom) are expected to see a sharp 
improvement in their current external balances, 
whereas, on present policies, the other countries 
would seem likely to experience only little change 
or (in the case of the Netherlands) a deterioration. 
The current external deficit of the Federal Repub­
lic of Germany is expected to amount to about 
half the total deficit for the Community both in 
1980 and in 1981; its financing is not expected to 
present major problems, whereas the deficits envis­
aged for Denmark (4% of GDP), Ireland (7%) and 
Belgium (5%) are a source of preoccupation. 

Policy issues for the Community 

2.1.5. Once again the Community is confronted 
with the economic consequences of a major 
increase in the price of oil, creating new balance of 
payments disequilibria, acceleration of inflation, 
additional structural problems and real income 
loss for all citizens. Moreover, a surplus is 
expected to remain for several years on the current 
account of the balance of payments of the oil­
exporting countries, increasing thereby consider­
ably the tasks to be solved by the international 
monetary and banking system. 

In the opinion of the Commission, the Community 
is not necessarily condemned to an extended 
period of economic stagnation. However, balanced 
economic growth and a strengthening of employ­
ment opportunities cannot be obtained at the pre­
sent rates of inflation. A reduction in the rate of 
increase in prices and wages is therefore a main 
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condition for a lasting improvement of economic 
prospects. Given, moreover, the gravity of supply 
constraints in the field of energy, the persistent 
shortage of skilled labour in key growth sectors 
and the obsolescence of parts of the capital stock, 
a temporary slowdown in the rate of expansion of 
economic activity seems unavoidable. Enterprises 
and consumers need some time to adjust to a new 
set of relative costs and prices, and attempts to 
force through a stronger rise in demand would 
carry a heavy risk of an acceleration in inflation, 
additional constraints on the supply of oil and 
other raw materials and external financial difficul­
ties. 

The Commission insists, in particular, upon the 
importance of the formulation and implementa­
tion of a vigorous energy policy as a support of 
growth. Such a policy, aimed notably at energy 
saving and increased domestic energy production, 
should be accompanied by a strengthening of the 
structural base of the economy through an 
increase in the investment propensity and supply­
oriented policies. 

The Community is now faced with the danger that 
strongly divergent price and wage movements may 
reduce its cohesion in a period with major chal­
lenges. The rates of price increases in member 
countries, which in April 1979 ranged from 3.3 to 
13.9% over a year earlier, in April 1980 ranged 
from 6 to 22%. Ratios of public sector deficits to 
GOP are, in some countries, two to three times 
larger than the Community average. In some coun­
tries increases in relative unit labour costs have 
resulted in a deterioration of the external account 
in addition to the impact from the oil price 
increase. The diversity of price developments, 
budget balances and external balances is such that 
the general policy guidelines for the Community 
must be interpreted for each individual Member 
State in the light of its special situation and pos­
sibilities. 

In the opinion of the Commission the need for a 
rapid reduction in the degree of divergence justifies 
a certain ranking of priorities in Member States' 
economic policies. In countries where general 
economic conditions as described above diverge 
significantly from the Community average, highest 
priority must be given to measures of adjustment. 
Such measures should reduce aggregate demand 
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through reduction in government borrowing 
requirements, but should also remove factors of 
inflation and external disequilibrium operating on 
the supply side, such as productivity and cost con­
ditions. Quick results are difficult to obtain in this 
field, but all possibilities to dampen the price/wage 
spiral should be exploited. A higher degree of con­
vergence of price/wage movements in the Com­
munity would in particular be facilitated if the 
rules of operation of the strong formal or informal 
indexation mechanisms, which exist in some 
Member States, were modified in such a way as to 
exclude the effect of external price shocks or other 
temporary factors like increases in indirect taxa­
tion, without reducing the level of protection of 
the lower income groups. Such measures of 
economic adjustment would partly improve the 
overall external position of the Community, and 
partly be reflected in the external accounts of 
other member countries, where fundamental con­
ditions are more stable. The latter countries should 
be ready to accommodate the consequences, on 
their balance of payments, of adjustment policies 
corresponding to the general objective of reducing 
divergence within the Community. 

.. . While the basic policy stance in most Member 
States appears appropriate in view of the circum­
stances, a degree of flexibility may be required in 
the face of the uncertainties concerning cyclical 
developments over the coming year. A major 
recession could do considerable damage to the 
economy in terms both of real performance and of 
accentuation of cost pressures. If the slowdown of 
economic growth over the coming months should 
prove more pronounced than hitherto anticipated, 
governments should therefore be prepared at least 
to accommodate the budgetary consequence of a 
loss of tax receipts. 

To conclude, then, there is no credible alternative 
to maintaining the present policy stance for the 
Community as a whole. Some flexibility in 
demand management would, however, be called 
for if the slowdown of activity in 1980 and 1981 
proved to be much more pronounced than now 
envisaged. Member States with high budget 
deficits and/or external financial problems should 
in any case pursue efforts to reduce imbalances 
without delay. More emphasis should be given in 
all countries to supply policies and, notably, 
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policies to economize energy and reduce depend­
ence upon imported oil. 

Close surveillance and coordination of economic 
policy within the Community-notably of mone­
tary policy in the framework of the EMS-remain 
a key element in stabilization efforts and could 
contribute importantly to a slowdown in the rate 
of inflation and to a reduction in the degree of in­
flation divergence, necessary conditions for a 
strengthening of longer-run prospects for growth 
and employment.' 

Conclusions of the Council 

2.1.6. On the basis of the .communication 
from the Commission, the Council, at its 
meeting on 15 July, held its second quarterly 
examination of the economic situation in the 
Community in accordance with its Decision 
of 18 February 197 4 on the attainment of a 
high degree of convergence of the economic 
policies of the Member States of the Euro­
pean Economic Community. 1 The press 
release put out after the meeting stated: 

'The Council held a detailed exchange of views 
which enabled the members of the Council inter 
alia to outline the latest developments of the 
economic situation in their countries and to indi­
cate the economic and budgetary measures already 
taken or envisaged. 

In conclusion, the Council noted that at this stage 
there was no need to amend the economic policy 
guidelines for 1980 adopted by the Council in 
December 1979' and confirmed at its meeting on 
17 March 1980, 1 and that the Member States had 
taken the measures necessary to comply with these 
guidelines.' 

2.1.7. On 9 July Parliament adopted a 
resolution on the economic development of 
the Community in the first half of 1980 and 
the implementation of the Council's Decision 
on convergence.4 
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Monetary Committee 

2.1.8. The Monetary Committee held its 
263rd meeting in Brussels on 16 July, with 
Mr Haberer in the chair. It continued its 
work both on the issues raised by the recycl­
ing process and on the transition of the Euro­
pean Monetary System to its institutional 
phase. In the framework of its regular 
reviews of the policies pursued in the 
Member States, the Committee also 
examined the economic and monetary situa­
tion in the Netherlands. 

2.1.9. The Working Party on the Harmoni­
zation of Monetary Policy Instruments met 
on 22 July, with Mr Kjaer in the chair, and 
continued its examination of the Green Paper 
on Monetary Control issued by the UK 
authorities. 

Economic Polley Committee 

2.1.10. The Economic Policy Committee 
held its 95th and 96th meetings in Brussels in 
July in preparation for the Council's second 
examination of the economic situation in the 
Community. On 2 July it met in its reduced 
'short-term' composition, with Mr Cortesse 
in the chair, and examined the present 
economic situation and the short-term out­
look for the Community; on 3 July it met in 
its reduced 'budget' compostion, with Mr 
Wagner in the chair, and discussed the 
budget guidelines for 1981. 

1 OJ L 63 of 5.3.1974; Bull. EC 2-1974, point 2201. 
' OJ L 17 of 23.1.1980; Bull. EC 10-1979, points 2.1.3 
and 2.1.4. 
1 Bull. EC 3-1980, points 2.1.5 and 2.1.6. 
• Points 2.3.11 and 2.3.12; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
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Internal market 
and industrial affairs 

Free movement of goods 

Technical standards and requirements 

2.1.11. On 25 August the Commission 
transmitted to the Council a proposal for a 
Decision setting up an information procedure 
for technical standards and requirements. 1 

Removal of technical barriers to trade 

Industrial products 

2.1.12. On 22 July the Council adopted a 
Directivel relating to rear-view mirrors for 
two-wheeled motor vehicles with or without 
side-car and to their mounting on such vehi­
cles.3 Two-wheeled vehicles with a maximum 
design speed not exceeding 100 kmlhour will 
have to be equipped with one rear-view mir­
ror, while two-wheeled vehicles with a higher 
maximum design speed and all those with a 
side-car will have to be equipped with two 
rear-view mirrors. Parliament had delivered 
its opinion on this proposal on 11 July.4 

2.1.13. On 22 July the Council also 
adopted a Directive2 amending the Directive 
of 4 June 19735 relating to the classification, 
packaging and labelling of dangerous prepa­
rations (solvents). • 

2.1.14. On 15 July the Council adopted a 
Directive! on the approximation of the laws 
of the Member States relating to ammonium 
nitrate-based fertilizers with a high nitrogen 
content.8 
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Foodstuffs 

2.1.15. On 15 July the Council adopted a 
Directive on the approximation of the laws of 
the Member States relating to the exploita­
tion and marketing of natural mineral 
waters. 2 This Directive specifies the few treat­
ments that water can undergo before bottl­
ing, lays down strict bacteriological standards 
for ensuring that the water is of satisfactory 
quality and stipulates the specific labelling 
requirements that are necessary for consumer 
information.9 The annual Community pro­
duction of natural mineral water affected by 
this Directive exceeds 7 000 million litres. 

2.1.16. On 8 July the Commission adopted 
a Directive laying down the Community 
method of analysis for the official control of 
the vinyl chloride monomer content in mate­
rials and articles which are intended to come 
into contact with foodstuffs. 10 

2.1.17. On 25 July the Commission 
adopted a Directive relating to the Commun­
ity method of analysis for determining the 
erucic acid content in oils and fats intended 
to be used as such for human consumption 
and in foodstuffs containing added oils or 
fats. 

1 Points 1.3.1 to 1.3.4. 
OJ L 229 of 30.8.1980. 

1 OJ C 30 of 7.2.1980; Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.1.8. 
' Point 2.3.16; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
' OJ L 189 of 11.7.1973. 
• OJ C 25 of 31.1.1978; Bull. EC 12-1977, point 
2.1.10. 

OJ L 250 of 23.9.1980. 
" OJ C 16 of 23.1.1976; Bull. EC 12-1975, point 2117. 
' OJ C 69 of 11.6.1970; Bull. EC 7-1970, point 3. 
"' OJ L 213 vf 16.8.1980. 
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2.1.18. On 11 July Parliament delivered its 
opinion• on four Commission proposals relat­
ing respectively to a special Community cer­
tification procedure for products originating 
in non-member countries, 2 powered industrial 
trucks/ protective structures for certain con­
struction planr and methods of testing the 
biodegradability of non-ionic surfactants.5 

This last proposal was also the subject of an 
opinion adopted by the Economic and Social 
Committee/ which in addition voted on the 
proposals relating to safety belts for motor 
vehicles.7 

Business law 

Economic and commercial law 

2.1.19. The draft Convention on bank­
ruptcy, winding-up, arrangements, composi­
tions and similar proceedings, which was 
drafted in 1970 and completely renegotiated 
with the new Member States, 8 was transmit­
ted by the chairman of the group of govern­
mental experts to the President of the Council 
and, with a view to obtaining their opinions, 
to the Permanent Representatives of the 
Member States and the President of the Com­
mission. 

The Convention is intended to supplement 
the Brussels Convention of 27 September 
1968 on Jurisdiction and Enforcement of 
Judgments in Civil and Commercial Matters, 
which has been in force between the six origi­
nal Member States since 1 February 1973, 
was amended by the Luxembourg Conven~ 
tion of Accession of 9 October 1978, but 
does not cover bankruptcy and similar pro­
ceedings. 9 These Conventions are based on 
Article 220 of the EEC Treaty. 
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The Bankruptcy Convention lays down the 
principle of the unity and universality of the 
bankruptcy. Consequently, decisions relating 
to the opening and conduct of one of the pro­
cedures referred to in the Convention and 
listed in a Protocol annexed thereto will be 
recognized and enforced automatically 
throughout the Community. The debtor's 
power to deal with his property will cease 
immediately while the decision will not take 
effect vis-a-vis third parties until eight days 
following its publication in the Official Jour­
nal of the European Communities. 

The Convention lays down rules of direct 
jurisdiction. Proceeedings will have to be 
opened in the country in which the debtor's 
centre of administration is situated or, in the 
absence of such a centre, in the country in 
which he has an establishment. These rules 
are supplemented by provisions intended to 
prevent conflicts of jurisdiction. 

The law applicable, is, as a rule, that of the 
State in which the proceedings are opened. A 
few exceptions have, however, been provided 
for, e.g. in regard to secured rights, special 
prefer~ntial rights and the effects of the bank­
ruptcy on contracts of employment. Rules of 
uniform law have been introduced as regards 
set-off and proof of a spouse's claim to prop­
erty. Three variants are proposed regarding 

' Point 2.3.16; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
OJ C 54 of 4.3.1980; Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.1.5. 

' OJ C 165 of 2.7.1979; Bull. EC 5-1979, point 2.1.13. 
• OJ C 104 of 28.4.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.1.7. 
' OJ C 104 of 28.4.1980; Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.1.6. 
' Points 2.3.52 and 2.3.53; OJ C 230 of 8.9.1980. 

OJ C 87 of 9.4.1980; Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.1.7. 
' Seventh General Report, point 145. 
' OJ L 304 of 30.10.1978; Bull. EC 10·1978, point 
2.1.21. 
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the validity as against the general body of 
creditors of clauses containing a reservation 
of title, namely a uniform law provision 
whereby the law of the State in which the 
bankruptcy has been opened must recognize 
the validity of such clauses in the event of 
bankruptcy, a conflict of laws rule whereby 
the law of the State in which the property is 
situated applies, and application of the law of 
the State in which the bankruptcy has been 
opened under the present state of the law. 

In civil and commercial matters, creditors 
who have general preferential rights, includ­
ing employees, will be able to assert their 
claims against each of the subestates for 
accounting purposes formed in the various 
countries to enable the assets to be distri­
buted. Rules dealing with the computation 
involved have been incorporated. On the 
other hand, preferential rights granted in 
respect of tax and similar debts remain 
limited to the country in which the debt was 
incurred. 

The Convention does not deal with the crimi­
nal aspect of bankruptcies. 

Jurisdiction to interpret the Convention, 
which is to be concluded for an unlimited 
period, is conferred on the Court of Justice of 
the European Communities. 

The Convention will also apply to insurance 
companies as soon as the Directive that is 
being prepared on the special compulsory 
winding-up of such companies enters into 
force. 

The drawing up of a draft Community Con­
vention in such a difficult and complex field 
is a major achievement. The Convention will 
make it possible to safeguard under the best 
conditions the equality of creditors and to 
strengthen the security of intra-Community 
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trade and of all transactions in that sphere. It 
contains original solutions which are capable 
of forming the basis of a more extensive har­
monization of Member States' laws by means 
of Community legal instruments. 

Public contracts 

2.1.20. On 22 July1 the Council amended 
and supplemented as regards certain con­
tracting authorities its Directive of 21 
December 19762 coordinating procedures for 
the award of public supply contracts.3 

The purpose of this new directive is to adjust 
the relevant Community rules in order to 
take into account the entry into force on 1 
January 1981 of the Agreement on Govern­
ment Procurement concluded under the 
Tokyo Round and, more particularly, to 
incorporate into the intra-Community 
arrangements those provisions of the Agree­
ment which appear to be more favourable to 
tenderers. 

Small busii18SS6s. Business cooperation. 
Distributive trades 

Business Cooperation Centre 

2.1.21. On 29 July the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council the sixth and seventh 
annual reports on the activities of the Busi­
ness Cooperation Centre (BCC) in 1978 and 
1979 respectively.4 

' OJ L 215 of 18.8.1980. 
' OJ L 13 of 15.1.1977; Bull. EC 12-1976, points 1401 
to 1405. 
' OJ C 287 of 17.11.1979; Bull. EC 11-1979, point 
2.1.11. 
' Bull. EC 7/8-1978, point 2.1.23. 
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During these two years, the BCC maintained 
a high level of activity in putting small- and 
medium-sized businesses in different countries 
in contact with each other at their specific 
request (36 bilateral or multilateral agree­
ments were concluded). 

Parallel to its handling of specific requests for 
contact with potential partners, and within 
the terms of reference assigned to it by the 
Commission, the BCC has turned its atten­
tion in the last two years to blanket or selec­
tive action in the following sectors: banking, 
subcontractor fairs, hospital medical equip­
ment, hotel furnishing and bronze founding. 

As regards its responsibilities, the BCC notes 
in its reports that the enlargement of the 
Community will create new requirements to 
which attention must be turned now in order 
to prepare small businesses in the applicant 
countries for integration into the economy of 
the Nine. This important new requirement 
will mean reducing the BCC's activities 
within the Community as now constituted 
and in respect of non-member countries. In 
this connection, the BCC intends to organize 
joint contacts on a sectoral or regional basis 
between industrialists in the Community and 
from prospective Member States which are at 
comparable levels of development in order to 
prepare the business circles concerned for 
future practical cooperation. The BCC also 
considers that the experimental exchanges of 
information with certain countries outside 
the Community should be discontinued in 
view of the unsatisfactory results. 

In conclusion, the BCC states that in its opin­
ion its future activities should develop along 
the following principal lines: widest possible 
support for small firms in the three applicant 
countries in their efforts to adjust to condi­
tions in Community markets, and mainte­
nance of certain clearing-house facilities for 
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small firms in the Community to help them 
make contact with potential partners in other 
Member States. 

Industry 

Steel 

Market situation and anti-crisis measures 

2.1.22. The steel market situation con­
tinued to deteriorate in July and August. 
There were a number of reasons for this: a 
drop in orders from certain industries (espe­
cially automobiles and building), a fall in 
exports, companies not strictly honouring 
their commitments as regards deliveries, 
which has tended to distort the market, and 
an increase in production costs. 

The effect of the 1980 anti-crisis measures 
was therefore diminished over the first half of 
the year. In its communication to the Council 
in July, the Commission consequently felt 
obliged to emphasize the seriousness of the 
situation and to recall the measures which 
had to be adopted were this trend to con­
tinue. 

One of these measures, which have been, and 
continue to be, discussed by the Commission 
on one side and the producers on the other, is 
for a balanced reduction in output to be 
undertaken, involving such quantities as 
would enable any worsening of the situation 
to be faced up to. 

After consulting the Council on 22 July and 
the ECSC Consultative Committee on 4 
August, the Commission took certain deci­
sions on minimum prices on 4 August. It 
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decided' to suspend the minimum prices in 
operation for hot-rolled wide strip (coils) and 
to extend the suspension of minimum prices 
for concrete reinforcing bar and merchant 
bar, which had expired at the end of June, to 
the end of the year. It was clearly understood, 
however, that the Commission could rein­
troduce minimum prices for these products or 
certain categories thereof should the market 
situation deteriorate. 

Other measures are being prepared by the 
Commission with a view to supplementing 
the existing provisions, should it prove neces­
sary to face up to a deterioration in the 
market. 

* 

2.1.23. On 11 July Parliament delivered its 
opinion2 on the communication from the 
Commission on the social aspects of the 
restructuring of the steel industry and the 
revised draft of a Commission Decision con­
cerning the creation of special temporary 
allowances to assist workers in the iron and 
steel industry under the Community restruc­
turing plan.3 

Industrial loans 

2.1.24. The Commission decided under 
Article 54 of the ECSC Treaty to grant loans 
of: 

• FF 255 million to Central Siderurgique de 
Richemont to help finance the updating of its 
plant; 

• LIT 25 000 million to Cantieri Navali 
Riuniti, Genoa, to help finance a programme 
to modernize and restructure the Ancona 
shipyard. 
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Textiles 

2.1.25. On 1 August the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council its report on the appli­
cation of the Council Regulation of 20 
December 1979 on Community aid for 
industrial restructuring and conversion oper­
ations in the man-made fibres sector.• 

The Commission observes that during the 
period 1977-79, the Community's main pro­
ducers of man-made fibres have reduced their 
capacities for all the principal textile fibres by 
325 million tonnes. 

It also states that in pursuance of the 1979 
Regulation it has granted 16 aids totalling 
13 982 785 EUA in respect of nine conver­
sion projects, five diversification projects and 
two restructuring projects, enabling 7108 
jobs to be saved or created. 

2.1.26. On 17 July Commission officials 
and representatives of the textiles and clo­
thing sector held an initial discussion of the 
problem of access to the market in countries 
with which the Community has signed bila­
teral agreements under the Multifibre 
Arrangement. This meeting follows the 
undertaking given by Mr Davignon on 13 
June during the last consultation with the 
representatives of Comitextil and the Euro­
pean Clothing Manufacturers Association.5 

2.1.27. On 24 July, in the context of the 
regular consultations between the Commis­
sion and trade unions representing the tex­
tiles and clothing industries, a working meet-

' OJ L 203 of 5.8.1980. 
' Point 2.3.14; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
1 Bull. EC 7/8-1979, point 2.1.41. 
• OJ L 326 of 22.12.1979; Bull. EC 12-1979, point 
2.1.17. 
' Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.1.19. 
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ing took place with the European Textile 
Trade Union Committee. 1 The parties con­
cerned discussed in detail the results of the 
first two years' operation of the Multifibre 
Arrangement and the terms on which it could 
be renewed. To this end, the Committee 
would send a paper to the · Commission, 
which would examine it during a forthcom­
ing bilateral consultation. 

Customs union 

Economic tariff matters 

Tariff quotas 

2.1.28. On 22 July the Council adopted 
two Regulations1 opening, allocating and 
providing for the administration of Commun­
ity tariff quotas for 'Sijivovica' plum spirit 
(falling within subheading ex 22.09 C IV a) 
of the Common Customs Tariff) and certain 
tobaccos (falling within subheading ex 24.01 
B) originating in Yugoslavia (1980). 

On the same day it adopted Regulations3 

increasing the volume of the Community 
tariff quotas for 1980 in respect of: 

(i) ferro-silicon falling within subheading 
73.02 C of the Common Customs Tariff; 

(ii) ferro-silico-manganese falling within sub­
heading 73.02 D; 

(iii) ferro-chromium containing not more 
than 0.10% by weight of carbon and more_ 
than 30% but not more than 90% by weight 
of chromium (super-refined ferro-chromium) 
falling within subheading ex 73.02 E I; 

(iv) ferro-chromium containing not less than 
4% by weight of carbon and falling within 
subhe~ding ex 73.02 E I. 
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Origin ·of goods 

2.1.29. On 31 July the Commission sent a 
proposal to the Council supplementing and 
amending the Regulation of 20 March 19784 

on proof of origin for certain textile products 
falling within Chapter 51 or Chapters 53 to 
62 of the Common Customs Tariff and 
imported into the Community and on the 
conditions for the acceptance of such proof, 
and creating a Community research and 
investigation group. 

The proposal stems from one of the three 
themes of the Commission communication to 
the Council of 17 March on textile problems 
associated with the question of origin mark­
ings. 5 It calls for stronger Community means 
of combating fraud relating to the origin of 
textile products along the lines advocated in 
the Commission communication. 

Competition 

Restrictive practices, mergers and 
dominant positions: specific cases 

Permissible forms of cooperation 

Sulphur buying pool 

2.1.30. On 9 July the Commission took a 
decision under the competitition rules 

' Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.1.22. 
OJ L 196 of 30.7.1980. 

' OJ L 191 of 25.7.1980. 
' OJ L 84 of 31.3.1978; Bull. EC 3-1978, point 2.1.21. 
' Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.1.28. 
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authorizing, for a period of eight years, 19 
companies responsible for the bulk of the 
United Kingdom and Ireland's sulphuric acid 
output to continue to buy imported raw sul­
phur by means of a joint buying pool. 

However, the Commission insisted on a 
number of amendments to the pool rules 
since the version notified to the Commission 
contained restrictions which infringed the 
competition rules as contained in the EEC 
Treaty. First, exclusivity of purchase whereby 
all pool members were obliged to purchase 
their total requirements of imported sulphur 
for sulphuric-acid-making purposes through 
the pool; this restriction was particularly sig­
nificant since the members of the pool 
account for just over 80% of sulphuric acid 
output in the United Kingdom and 100% in 
Ireland. The pool's status as exclusive sup­
plier to its members has now been termi­
nated. Members may buy up to 75% of their 
total needs elsewhere, the pool still purchas­
ing at least the remaining 25%. 

This percentage allows the pool to maintain 
the strength of its negotiating position with 
the major suppliers, of whom there are only 
eight worldwide, including the only EEC pro­
ducer, SNEA in France. The continuation of 
the cost and distribution benefits generally 
obtained through membership of the pool 
and particularly by those with small sulphur 
requirements is thus also ensured. Since sul­
phur accounts for up to 80% of the produc­
tion costs of sulphuric acid, these cost savings 
are reflected in the price paid by consumers 
of sulphuric acid and of the many products in 
the manufacture of which sulphuric acid is 
required. 

In addition the restrictions on use and resale 
of sulphur previously imposed on pool mem­
bers have been abandoned. 
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This decision by the Commission has made 
dear under what conditions and to what 
extent a joint buying pool, with members of 
widely differing sizes, which accounts for the 
bulk of output in two Community Member 
States and is faced with a small number of 
world suppliers, can be permitted in terms of 
the EEC competition rules. 

Metal containers 

2.1.31. The Commission will not object, 
under the Community competition rules, to 
the proposed exchange of shareholdings bet­
ween Camaud SA of France and Metal Box 
Ltd of the United Kingdom. 

During 1979, Camaud transferred all its 
facilities, subsidiaries and shareholdings in 
the metal container industry in France, Bel­
gium, Italy and Spain to a company called 
Carnaud Emballage. Metal Box will similarly 
transfer its metal container interests in Italy, 
Greece and Portugal to a company in the 
Netherlands called Metal Box Europe, itself a 
subsidiary of Metal Box Nederland BV. 

Heads of agreement between the two con­
cerns envisage an exchange of shareholdings 
so that Metal Box Nederland will hold a 
20% interest in Camaud Emballage, and 
Camaud Emballage a 40% interest in Metal 
Box Europe. The two concerns have also 
agreed to coordinate their research and 
development projects on technology relating 
to the machinery for, and the manufacture of, 
metal containers, although each will retain its 
own research and development establish­
ment. Originally, it was also planned that 
Camaud and Metal Box would be entitled to 
representation on the boards of Metal 'Box 
Europe and Carnaud Emballage respectively 
in proportion to their shareholdings. 
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The Commission's opinion, put to the par­
ties, was that beyond the agreed technical 
cooperation, the proposed financial and per­
sonnel interlinking might induce the parties 
to exert influence on their respective decision­
making processes and coordinate not only 
their research and development projects but 
also their investment projects, production 
plans and pricing policies. In view of the 
importance of each group in the highly con­
centrated European metal container market, 
such a situation did not appear likely to be 
eligible for exemption from the prohibition of 
restrictive practices laid down in Article 85(1) 
of the EEC Treaty. 

The two parties have since given an under­
taking to the Commission, for a period of 
three years after the exchange of shares, not 
to exercise the voting rights attached to Car­
naud Emballage's shareholdings in Metal Box 
Europe and to Metal Box Nederland's share­
holdings in Carnaud Emballage, except in 
those cases where French law makes it neces­
sary for a minority shareholder to vote, and 
not to nominate representatives of the minor­
ity shareholder to the boards of directors of 
these companies. 

In view of these measures taken by the par­
ties, the Commission no longer considers it 
necessary, in present circumstances, to inter­
vene against the proposed exchange of share­
holdings between the two groups. It will look 
again at the situation at the end of the three­
year period. 

Distribution 

Duty-free ·sales 

2.1.32. On 22 July the Commission 
decided' that, on the facts known to it, there 
were no grounds for it to act under the com-

Bull. EC 7/8-1980 

Competition 

petition rules of the EEC Treaty with regard 
to the standard agreement notified by The 
Distillers Co. Ltd (DCL) on the basis of 
which subsidiaries of that company supply 
Scotch whisky for consumption free of duty 
and taxes. The 41 subsidiaries of the DCL 
group have concluded agreements of this type 
with around 500 victuallers in the Com­
munity. 

The main activity of victuallers is duty-free 
trade, i.e. the supply of products intended for 
duty-free consumption, in particular to inter­
national shipping lines and airlines and 
embassies, in accordance with the conditions 
and limits laid down by law. The standard 
agreement in question imposes no obligation 
on the victualler other than that of selling the 
whiskies supplied on the basis of this agree­
ment only to customers who are known or 
may be supposed to use them for consump­
tion free of duty and taxes. This obligation 
has to be passed on to all subsequent pur­
chasers. Naturally, a victualler is thereby pro­
hibited from supplying whiskies supplied on 
the basis of this agreement to wholesalers, 
supermarkets, retailers or final consumers 
who sell or consume products on which duty 
and taxes have to be paid. The provision of 
supplies to such purchasers is, however, not 
normally one of the activities of victuallers. 
Consequently, the obligation in question does 
not in practice form a genuine obstacle to the 
freedom of action of victuallers in carrying 
out their normal activities and does not con­
stitute a significant restriction of competition 
within the meaning of Article 85(1) calling 
for action on the part of the Commission. 

The Commission will be in a position to con­
sider, in the light of this decision, a number 
of agreements of the same type concluded by 
other producers of spirituous beverages. 

' OJ L 233 of 4.9.1980. 
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Joint ventures 

Coating of cold-rolled sheet 

2.1.33. On 24 July the Commission 
authorized, pursuant to Article 66 of the 
ECSC Treaty, the joint establishment by 
Arbed SA, Luxembourg, and Cockerill SA, 
Seraing, of an undertaking known as Gal­
valange Sari at Dudelange, Luxembourg. The 
main activity of the new undertaking will be 
the operation of a dual-purpose line for coat­
ing both faces of cold-rolled sheet. Initially, 
annual production capacity at Galvalange 
will be of the order of 100 000 tonnes of Gal­
valum sheet-i.e. sheet coated with a zind 
aluminium alloy-or aluminium-coated 
sheet. 

Each of the founder companies will subscribe 
half of the initial LFR 200 million capital of 
Galvalange and the administrative organs of 
the new company-Board of Directors and 
Board of Auditors-will consist of equal 
numbers of Arbed and Cockerill representa­
tives. 

This project-which forms part of the plan 
for restructuring the Belgian steel industry 
-will probably lead to capital expenditure of 
the order of LFR 1 300 million, which is 
likely initially to provide 80 jobs in the south 
of Luxembourg, an area particularly affected 
by the recession in the steel industry. 

State aids 

Regional aids 

Ireland 

2.1.34. On 15 July the Commission decided 
to raise no objections under Articles 92-94 of 
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the EEC Treaty to measures proposed by the 
Irish Government. The latter informed the 
Commission on 6 May of its plans for the 
withdrawal of Export Sales Relief (ESR) and 
of the supplementary depreciation allowance 
of 20% available in respect of plant and 
machinery in the designated areas. 

The Commission had made known its objec­
tions to both these aids because of their 
operating characters and, in the case of ESR, 
its export character. Under ESR manufactur­
ing companies could claim full exemption 
from corporation tax on profits derived from 
export sales for a period of 15 years and par­
tial relief on a diminishing scale for a further 
five years. The relief terminates in 1990 
regardless of the number of years for which a 
company has benefited. 

Under the plans notified to the Commission 
these aids will no longer be offered from 1 
January 1981. Companies that have already 
qualified for ESR may, however, continue to 
benefit from that system. Any further offers­
of ESR made before 1 January 1981 will be 
conditional on the companies concerned 
commencing their investment projects by 30 
June 1981. The same arrangements will 
apply to Shannon Relief-the relief similar to 
ESR available within the Shannon Free Air­
port Zone. 

United Kingdom 

2.1.35. On 28 July the Commission 
authorized the United Kingdom Government 
to introduce the changes it wished to make to 
its main regional aid scheme, 1 which it had 
ndtified as required under Article 93(3) of the 
EEC Treaty. The changes are aimed at 

' Bull. EC 9-1979, point 2.1.30. 
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upgrading certain areas of the United King­
dom affected by steel redundancies. These are 
the labour market regions of Scunthorpe in 
Yorkshire and Humberside, and Newport, 
Pontypool and Port Talbot in Wales. This 
regrading will lead in each region to an 
increase in the intensity of aid and, in the 
case of Scunthorpe, Newport and Pontypool, 
to the Community aid ceiling of 20% laid 
down in the 1979 principles of coordination1 

for the United Kingdom intermediate areas 
being exceeded. 

In its favourable assessment, the Commission 
bore in mind that in these areas, which are all 
highly dependent on steel, which accounts for 
between 20 and 45% of male employment, 
unemployment is higher and per capita 
income lower than the national and Com­
munity averages. Moreover, the many new 
redundancies that are to occur shortly in vari­
ous steelworks will inevitably boost unem­
ployment figures still further. 

The Commission therefore considered the 
planned regradings to be justified and 
granted a derogation from the principles of 
coordination for the areas in question subject 
to compliance with the 30% aid ceiling 
applicable to development and special 
development areas in the United Kingdom. 

Federal Republic of Germany 

2.1.36. On 31 July the Commission decided 
to extend to new measures taken by the Ger­
man Government the procedure provided for 
in Article 93(2) of the EEC Treaty, which it 
had previously initiated2 against certain mea­
sures in the German Regional Aid Scheme 
(Joint Task for the Federal Government and 
the Lander for the Improvement of Regional 
Economic Structures-Gemeinschaftsaufgabe 
'Verbesserung der regionalen Wirtschafts-
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struktur'). The scheme takes the form each 
year of a general plan consisting of a number 
of action programmes concerning develop­
ment areas. The procedure was initiated in 
respect of the sixth General Plan, including 
the granting of aids in certain areas. 

Having examined the changes brought about 
by the seventh, eighth and ninth General 
Plans (the latter being currently in force), the 
Commission established that, by altering the 
numerical criterion for the eligibility of 
assisted areas, the German Government had 
extended the assisted areas to five new areas 
without abolishing the granting of aid in the 
old areas and had thus increased the percen­
tage of the population assisted from 34% to 
36%. 

The Commission therefore felt it necessary to 
reassess the total amount of assistance 
granted both under the 'Joint Task' and 
under the aid programmes of the Lander and 
came to the conclusion that, in view of the 
socio-economic situation of the Federal 
Republic of Germany compared with that of 
the other Member States, the total amount of 
aid granted was unjustified. 

The Commission therefore expressed reserva­
tions regarding the granting of aid in five 
assisted areas, which, as they did not satisfy 
the abovementioned criterion for eligibility, 
should lose their assisted area status as from 
1 January 1981. 

Moreover, since the aid provided for in the 
'Joint Task' will be applied on a.new basis as 
from 1 January 1981, the Commission 
informed the German Government that it 
would reassess all the labour market regions 

' 0 J C 31 of 3.2.1979; Bull. EC 11-1978, point 2.1.34. 
Bull. EC 1-1979, point 2.1.35. 
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of the country after the new indicators used 
were available. 

Netherlands 

2.1.37. On 31 July the Commission reached 
a decision on the changes the Netherlands 
Government intended to make to the invest­
ment aid scheme for Lelystad and to its 'IPR' 
regional aid scheme.1 

The former scheme, which was authorized by 
the Co(Dmission in 1974, introduced a pre­
mium for each new job created in Lelystad, a 
new town in Oostelijk Flevoland, an area 
reclaimed from the sea in the 1960s. The 
proposed change consists in an increase in the 
premium. As the increase is intended solely to 
offset the fall, as a result of 'inflation, in the 
value of the premium since it was created, the 
Commission decided not to oppose it. 

The 'IPR' scheme covers the three northern 
provinces, part of Overijssel and Limburg 
and a number of development poles in the 
rest of the country. The assistance takes the 
form of a capital subsidy and a mixed pre­
mium. The proposed change is intended to 
increase by 10% until the end of 1980 the 
level of these aids in eight areas in the pro­
vinces of Groningen, Drenthe and Limburg. 

An assessment of the socio-economic situa­
tion of the areas in question showed that, 
although maintenance of the aids was jus­
tified, an increase in their level was not. 
Since, however, in five of the areas concerned 
the whole of the regional aid granted has · 
already reached the 20% ceiling (in net grant 
equivalent) laid down in the 1979 principles 
of coordination, 2 the increase there will be 
practically nil. Consequently, the Commis­
sion did not consider it necessary to oppose 
it. 
On the other hand, in the other three areas 
(Veendam, Delfzijl and Uithuizen) in the 
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Dutch part of the ·German-Dutch Ems­
Dollard region where regional aid has never 
exceeded 16.8% net grant equivalent of 
investment, the proposed increase would 
have been larger. After comparing the socio­
economic situation of these areas with that of 
the whole of the Netherlands and of the 
neighbouring parts of the Federal Republic of 
Germany, the Commission concluded that it 
had not worsened in recent years. Moreover, 
the level of regional aid granted on both sides 
of the frontier was similar. The Commission 
therefore felt that an increase in 'IPR' aid was 
unjustified and instituted against it the proce­
dure provided for in Article 93(2) of the EEC 
Treaty. 

Environmental aids 

Community approach 

2.1.38. On 4 July the Commission pro­
longed for six years until 31 December 1986, 
subject to certain adjustments, the Commun­
ity approach to State aids in environmental 
matters which it had introduced in 1974.3 In 
a memorandum to the Member States, the 
Commission had laid down the criteria it 
would use during a transitional period in 
applying Articles 92 et seq. of the EEC Treaty 
to aids concerned specifically with protection 
of the environment. It stated that aids aimed 
at promoting the introduction of regulations 
intended to ensure effective environmental 
protection and accelerate the application of 
the 'polluter pays' principle could benefit 
from the derogation provided for in Article 
92(3) (b) of the EEC Treaty (aid to promote 
the execution of a project of common Euro-

' Bull. EC 5-1978, point 2.1.28. 
OJ C 31 of 3.2.1979; Bull. EC 11-1978, point 2.1.34. 

' Bull. EC 11-1974, point 2115. 
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pean interest) for a period of six years ending 
on 31 December 1980. 

An analysis of the way the situation has 
developed showed that this transitional 
period was too short to attain the desired 
objectives. The Commission therefore sup­
plemented the guidelines contained in the 
1974 'approach' as follows: 

• the aids may be granted during a new 
transitional period from 1 January 1981 to 
31 December 1986; 

• aid may be granted at a rate not exceeding 
15% of the value of the investment aided. 
The amount of aid will be calculated as a net 
grant equivalent in accordance with the joint 
evaluation method currently used by the 
Commission and described in its communica­
tions to the Council on regional aids; 1 

• only undertakings having installations in 
operation for at least two years before entry 
into force of the standards in question may 
qualify for assistance; 

• the Member States must send to the Com­
mission an annual report on their environ­
mental protection programmes involving 
State aids. This will enable the Commission 
to monitor closely the granting of aids and to 
examine their effects on competition and 
intra-Community trade. 

State monopolies 
of a commercial character 

Manufactured tobacco 

France 

2.1.39. Continuing the infringement pro­
ceedings previously instituted/ the Commis-
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sion sent a reasoned opinion to France on 17 
July stating that, by maintaining certain mea­
sures that are incompatible with Articles 30 
and 37 of the EEC Treaty, France has failed 
to fulfil its obligations under those Articles. 

Financial institutions 
and taxation 

Financial Institutions 

Banks 

2.1.40. On 11 July the Commission 
organized a meeting of the Committee of 
Credit Associations, which was set up in 
October 1979 on the Commission's initia­
tive. 3 The following topics were discussed: a 
preliminary draft Directive on the harmoniza­
tion of the annual accounts of banks and 
other credit institutions; a working paper on 
possible harmonization in the housing credit 
sector; the use of the ECU in private transac­
tions; the new measures proposed by the 
United States with regard to foreign banks. 
The problems of changing Irish pounds in 
banks in the major centres of the Community 
countries were also discussed. 

Insurance 

Motor vehicles - third-party insurance 

2.1.41. On 7 August the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council a proposal for a Direc-

' OJ C 111 of 4.11.1971; OJ C 31 of 3.2.1979. 
Bull. EC 12-1978, point 2.1.46. 

' Bull. EC 10-1979, point 2.1.36. 
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rive on. the approximation of the laws relat­
ing to insurance against civil liability in 
respect of the use of motor vehicles. 1 

This proposal is designed to supplement the 
Council Directive of 24 April 1972/ known 
as the 'green card' Directive, and takes up the 
harmonization process already started by 
seeking to reduce-on specific points-the 
differences between the various Member 
States' systems of compulsory civil liability 
motor insurance. This harmonization is of 
particular interest to drivers of vehicles 
travelling within the Community, whose civil 
liability cover may at present vary according 
to the country visited; it will also make for 
increased protection for road accident vic­
tims, by ensuring that they benefit from an 
equivalent, if not equal, guarantee regardless 
of which Member State the accident takes 
place in. 

The proposal deals with the extent of the 
insurance (damage covered, amounts guaran­
teed, abolition of the exclusion of members 
of the family of the insured person or person 
who is liable) and compensation where there 
is no insurance. It does not concern the rules 
governing civil liability per se. It is to be 
incorporated in national law by 31 December 
1982 at the latest. 

Employment and social policy 

Employment 

Voluntary part-time work 

2.1.42. On 22 July the Commission trans­
mitted a communication to the Council on 
voluntary part-time work for the attention of 
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the Standing Committee on Employment. 
This is the first document to be generated by 
the Commission's work on the adaptation of 
working time, in accordance with the Council 
Resolution of 18 December 1979. 1 

Its aim is, firstly, to present a picture of the 
current situation and trends in part-time 
work and, secondly, to lay down guidelines 
for Community action in this field. These 
guidelines are designed to achieve the follow­
ing objectives: to remove discrimination in 
connection with part-time work so as to 
obviate all forms of special treatment; to cre­
ate part-time job opportunities for workers 
who desire them; to promote new forms of 
part-time work under certain conditions. 

Community action should have the following 
among its aims: establishing the principle of 
minimum thresholds for membership of 
social security schemes (e.g. minimum 
number of hours of work or level of earnings) 
(to be fixed in such a way that full-time 
workers are not placed at a disadvantage); 
introducing the principle of equal treatment 
under labour law between full- and part-time 
workers, having regard to the shorter hours 
worked; recognition of the right of part-time 
workers to priority treatment as regards vac­
ancies which occur in the firm for full-time 
jobs matching their qualifications; recogni­
tion of the right of part-time workers to par­
ticipate actively and passively in the represen~ 
ration machinery of the firm; these rights 
should be taken into consideration when 
determining the number of staff employed. 

The establishment of minimum Community 
standards should leave scope for more far-

' OJ C 214 of 21.8.1980. 
' OJ L 103 of 1.5.1972. 
' OJ C 2 of 4.1.1980; Bull. EC 11-1979, point 2.1.41; 
Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.1.59. 
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reaching provisions to be laid down via col­
lective agreements or legislation. 

Flexible retirement 

2.1.43. On 17 July the Commission trans­
mitted a communication on the Community 
approach to flexible retirement to the Coun­
cil for the attention of the Standing Commit­
tee on Employment. The communication-a 
follow-up to one of the points in the Council 
Resolution of 18 December 1979 on the 
adaptation of working time1-suggests an 
approach comprising three guiding principles 
on which a more coherent policy in this field 
could be based, and incorporating both social 
and economic objectives. The first two 
guidelines, prompted by considerations of 
social protection, are designed to ensure both 
greater freedom to choose the age of retire­
ment (flexible retirement) and an opportunity 
for a gradual transition from working life to 
total inactivity (phased retirement). 

The aim of the third guideline is to direct the 
implementation of the other two in the light 
of the economic situation, taking account, in 
particular, of the present employment prob­
lems. 

Vocational training 

2.1.44. The Advisory Committee on Voca­
tional Training, which met in Brussels on 2 
and 3 July, examined in particular the prob­
lems relating to new technologies and voca­
tional preparation. The speakers on the first 
theme stressed the importance of the reper­
cussions of new technologies on employment 
and on vocational training. With respect to 
vocational preparation, the Committee 
studied a report by the Commission on the 
implementation of its Recommendation of 
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6 July 19772 on this topic. In particular, it 
emerges from this document that more than a 
million young people benefited from voca­
tional preparation schemes in 1978. 

Sectoral measures 

Readaptation aid for workers 
in the ECSC industries 

2.1.45. In July, acting under Article 
56(2) (b) of the ECSC Treaty, the Com­
mission decided to contribute a total of 
6 196 000 EUA towards readaptation aid for 
15 319 workers affected by the closure or 
running down of coal mines and iron and 
steel plants in the Federal Republic of Ger­
many, France and the United Kingdom. 

2.1.46. On 11 July Parliament gave its 
opinion3 on the Commission communication 
on the social aspects of the restructuring of 
the steel industry and on the draft decision on 
the introduction of special temporary allow­
ances to help workers in the iron and steel 
industry.4 

Equal treatment of men and women 

2.1.47. On 23 July the Commission decided 
to take action5 under Article 169 of the EEC 
Treaty against six Member States for in­
fringement of the Directive of 9 February 

1 OJ C 2 of 4.1.1980; Bull. EC 11-1979, point 2.1.41; 
Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.1.59. 
' OJ L 180 of 20.7.1977; Bull. EC 7/8-1977, point 
2.1.40. 
1 Point 2.3.14; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
• Bull. EC 7/8-1979, point 2.1.41. 
' Point 3.3.1. 
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19761 on the implementation of the principle 
of equal treatment for men and women as 
regards access to employment, vocational 
training and promotion, and working condi­
tions. 

2.1.48. The Community participated with 
observer status at the World Conference on 
the United Nations Decade for Women, held 
in Copenhagen from 14 to 30 July.2 

European Social Fund 

Annual report 

2.1.49. There was a further deterioration in 
the employment situation in 1979: the aver­
age number of unemployed increased from 
5.97 million in 1978 to 6.04 million in 1979, 
thus reaching an unprecedented level in the 
Community. This is the principal fact emerg­
ing from the Eighth Report on the Activities 
of the European Social Fund (financial year 
1979), submitted by the Commission to the 
Council on 6 August 1979. 

Applications for Social Fund assistance 
related to a total of almost 1 317 million 
EUA, corresponding to 160% of the Fund's 
overall budget resources. Applications con­
cerning women, initially low, far exceeded 
the budgetary allocation by the end of the 
year. Although the situation is less unbal­
anced, all things considered, than that in 
1978, the selection criteria laid down in the 
Guidelines for the Management of the Euro­
pean Social Fund for the period 1979-813 

nevertheless had to be strictly applied. These 
Guidelines, laid down by the Commission 
after consultation with the Social Fund Com­
mittee, once again favoured programmes 
linked to the most viable job prospects, this 
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criterion being flexibly interpreted in the case 
of the least developed regions. 

Most of the assistance granted went towards 
furthering the original aims of the Fund, 
namely promoting the vocational training 
and re-employment of workers. However, 
nearly 12% of the Fund's resources were 
allocated to two types of aid recently intro­
duced: job creation for young people and for 
the less developed regions. The number of 
persons benefiting from programmes 
approved in 1979 is estimated at 1.36 mil­
lion, a third greater than in the preceding 
year. 

The proportion of Fund assistance granted to 
operations in the five absolute priority 
regions-Greenland, French overseas depart­
ments, Ireland, Northern Ireland and the 
Mezzogiorno-was maintained at a high level 
this year, reaching 37.8% as compared with 
37.6% in 1978 and 25% in 1977. The sub­
stantial increase since 1977, arising from the 
10% higher rate of intervention for these reg­
ions (which came into effect on 1 January 
1978)/ is due to the level of priority accorded 
to them in the Guidelines for the Manage­
ment of the Fund. The proportion of Fund 
resources allocated to operations in ERDF 
(European Regional Development Fund) reg­
ions totalled 85.1% in 1979 as against 
79.2% in 1978 and 76% in 1976. 

Considerable progress was achieved during 
1979 on payments from the Fund, which 
amounted to 596 million EUA, or more than 
twice the sum paid in the previous year. The 
Commission considers, nevertheless, that the 
available appropriation could be more effec-

' OJ L 39 of 14.2.1976. 
' Point 2.2.39. 
' OJ C 116 of 19.5.1978; Bull. EC 4-1978, point 
2.1.42. 
• OJ L 337 of 27.12.1977 (Regulation 2895/77). 
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tively employed if fuller use were made of the 
new payments system introduced on 1 Janu­
ary 1978 under Council Regulation (EEC) 
No 2894/77. 1 

New aid measure proposed 
for workers in the 
shipbuilding industry 

2.1.50. On 1 August the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council a proposal for a Regu­
lation1 designed to enable the European 
Social Fund to introduce a new type of aid 
for workers in the shipbuilding industry who 
leave the industry as a result of reorganiza­
tion. This measure would be confined to 
workers in the higher age groups for whom 
there is generally little or no likelihood of 
finding new jobs, and would be based on 
Article 5 of the Council Decision of 1 Febru­
ary 1971,3 

The new scheme thus proposed would, at the 
outset, be limited in its scope and experimen­
tal. The rules governing it would be as 
follows: 

• The measure is intended to cover expendi­
ture for income support, whether or not such 
expenditure falls within the domain of social 
security. National authorities will be free to 
determine how the amount paid towards this 
aid will be funded from among the different 
sources of financing of such expenditure, it 
being understood that unemployment benefit 
cannot be the subject of Fund assistance. 

• With a view to concentrating the aid on 
those categories for whom training and re­
employment measures are less pressing, it is 
proposed that payment should be restricted 
to workers aged over 55, on condition that 
they do not enter the labour market after 
leaving the shipbuilding sector. Thus, in line 
with the experimental nature of the action, it 
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is envisaged that some 2 000 to 3 000 persons 
leaving the shipyards in 1980 and 1981 will 
be the beneficiaries. 

• The maximum amount of Fund assistance 
will be 4 500 EUA per person, increased by 
10% in the case of operations in certain 
priority regions. 

2.1.51. On 24 July the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council a proposal4 for a Deci­
sion to extend by two years the Council Deci­
sions enabling the Social Fund to assist work­
ers in the textiles and clothing sector, migrant 
workers, young people under the age of 25 
and women.5 

Living and working conditions 

Housing 

2.1.52. The Commission approved the dis­
tribution among ECSC industrial areas of the 
30 million EUA drawn against the special 
reserve and the former pension fund of the 
ECSC for the implementation of the first in­
stalment (1979-81) of the ninth ECSC low­
cost housing programme. This aid will help 
finance the construction or modernization of 
about 10 000 dwellings by means of reduced 
interest loans. 

2.1.53. Under the sixth, seventh and eighth 
programmes (first and second instalments) 
providing loans for the construction of low­
cost housing for workers in the ECSC indus-

1 OJ L 377 of 27.12.1977 (Regulation 2894/77). 
2 OJ C 218 of 26.8.1980. 
1 OJ L 28 of 4.2.1971. 
' OJ C 214 of 21.8.1980. 
' Bull. EC 12-1977, point 2.1.71. 
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tries, the Commission approved construction 
projects for a total amount of 485 952 EUA. 
This sum was allocated to finance the con­
struction of 117 dwellings in France, Ireland, 
the Netherlands and the United Kingdom. 

Health and safety 

Health protection 

2.1.54. On 15 July the Council formally 
adopted the Directive1 amending previous 
Directives laying down the Basic Safety Stan­
dards for the protection of the health of 
workers and the general public against the 
dangers arising from ionizing radiation. 2 This 
Directive updates the existing provisions in 
this field in the light of currently available 
scientific and technical knowledge as formu­
lated by the International Commission on 
Radiological Protection. 

2.1.55. On 15 July the Council also for­
mally adopted a Directive on health protec­
tion standards for sulphur dioxide and sus­
pended particulates in the air3 and a Resolu­
tion on transboundary air pollution by sul­
phur dioxide and suspended particulates. 4 

2.1.56. In the conclusions of its fourth 
progress report, which the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council on 8 July, the Advisory 
Committee on Safety, Hygiene and Health 
Protection at Work highlighted the fact that 
it had been able to assist in the successful 
completion of some important Commission 
activities and, in particular, had participated 
actively in the preparation of the framework 
Directive on the protection of workers from 
harmful exposure to chemical, physical and 
biological agents at work. The Committee's 
impact on the Commission's work in connec­
tion with occupational safety, medicine and 
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toxicology increased in significance during 
1979 owing to the opinions it delivered on a 
number of proposals for directives and the 
own-initiative opinions it had given in the 
areas within its terms of reference. 

2.1.57. On 25 July the Commission decided 
to provide financial support totalling 
1 130 400 EUA for nine research projects 
under the fourth research programme on 
industrial hygiene in mines, which it 
approved on 13 June 1978.5 These projects 
relate to the control and monitoring of the 
environment and factors affecting the envi­
ronment and hygiene. 

2.1.58. The Commission-in cooperation 
with the International Federation for 
Hygiene, Preventive Medicine and Social 
Medicine and with the International Union 
for Health Education-held an international 
symposium in Luxembourg from 2 to 4 July 
on the role of the physician in health educa­
tion, which was attended by many public 
figures, including Mrs Veil, the President of 
Parliament. This symposium, which is in line 
with the activities launched by the Commis­
sion in the field of health education in the 
aftermath of the Council meeting on health 
of 16 November 1978, was aimed at con­
tributing, through joint consultation, to the 
development at Community level of a 
strategy for preventive behaviour by the gen­
eral public. 

* 

2.1.59. On 11 July Parliament delivered its 
opinion6 on the Commission proposal of 

1 OJ L 246 of 17.9.1980. 
OJ L 187 of 12.7.1976. 

1 Point 2.1.71; OJ L 229 of 30.8.1980. 
' OJ C 222 of 30.8.1980. 

OJ C 159 of 5.7.1978; Bull. EC 6-1978, point 2.1.49. 
• Point 2.3.16; OJ C 197 of 14.8.1980. 
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1 February for a Council Directive concern­
ing electrical equipment for use in potentially 
explosive atmospheres in mines susceptible to 
firedamp. 1 

2.1.60. During its 2-3 July session the 
Economic and Social Committee delivered its 
opinion1 on the draft proposal for a Directive 
laying down basic measures for the radiation 
protection of persons undergoing medical 
examinations or treatment. 3 

Regional policy 

Coordination and programmes 

Regional Policy Committee 

2.1.61. The Regional Policy Committee, 
meeting from 9 to 11 July, delivered a 
favourable opinion on 19 major infrastruc­
ture projects submitted for assistance from 
the European Regional Development Fund. It 
completed its examination of matters relating 
to the effectiveness of Member States' reg­
ional aids, heard a statement on the full 
structural plan for the north of the Nether­
lands and agreed on a simplified procedure 
for transmitting annually in a single docu­
ment information on national regional 
development programmes, together with 
statistical surveys. 

With a view to Greece's forthcoming acces­
sion to the Community, the Committee dis­
cussed regional problems and regional policy 
in Greece with a delegation of Greek officials. 
It also held an initial discussion on the future 
rules for the ERDF. 
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Financial Instruments 

European Regional Development Fund 

Fifth ERDF annual report 

2.1.62. On 29 July the Commission 
adopted its fifth annual report-covering 
1979--on the activities of the European Reg­
ional Development Fund, for transmittal to 
Parliament, the Council and the Economic 
and Social Committee. 

This is the first report drawn up under the 
Fund rules as amended by the Council Regu­
lation of 6 February 1979;4 the main change 
was, of course, the establishment of a 'non­
quota' section to enable specific measures to 
be taken. 

In the report, the Commission describes how 
the fields of action of Community regional 
policy developed in 1979, and gives details of 
Fund assistance. In that year, the Commis­
sion adopted 410 grant decisions totalling 
962 million EUA for 2 835 investment pro­
jects. Of the amount committed, 28% went 
to industrial and service activity projects, 
creating or maintaining 79 000 jobs, and 
72% went to infrastructure projects. Pay­
ments made in 1979 were 513 million EUA. 

In its conclusions, the Commission notes that 
it faced practical difficulties in administering 
the Fund because so many grant applications 
reached it only in the second half of the year. 

' OJ C 104 of 28.4.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 
2.1.27. 

Point 2.3.54; OJ C 230 of 8.9.1980. 
' Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.1.71. 
' OJ L 35 of 9.2.1979; OJ C 36 of 9.2.1979. 
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It would like applications to be spread more 
evenly over the year in future. 

The Commission stresses that Fund assistance 
and national expenditure on regional 
development must be complementary. It 
regrets that it has not received from all 
Member States the information needed to 
assess to what extent Community assistance 
has-been additional to national spending. 

In 1979 the United Kingdom was the first 
Member State to make use of the facility 
available under the Fund Regulation for 
receiving aid by way of an interest rebate on 
loans granted by the European Investment 
Bank. 

The Commission again stresses that the Reg­
ional Fund is only one instrument of regional 
policy which, by its very nature, is concerned 
with everything affecting the regions. The 
impact of the Fund cannot be judged in isola­
tion but only in the context of the regional 
implications of all the Community's financial 
instruments and policies. The effort to pro­
mote integrated regional development opera­
tions in 1979 has dearly demonstrated the 
advantages of a coordinated approach, in 
spite of the problems. 

ERDF assistance-'non-quota' measures 

2.1.63. At its meeting on 22 July the Coun­
cil agreed to five specific Community regional 
development measures which the Commis­
sion had proposed in October 1979.1 These 
measures, the first under Article 13 of the 
ERDF Regulation ('non-quota' measures), are 
designed to cushion the regional impact of 
implementing certain Community policies 
(enlargement, the steel industry, shipbuilding 
and energy) and to help to improve the 
economic and social situation of certain bor-
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der areas. Thus, over a period of five years, 
the 'non-quota' section of the ERDF is to 
make available a total of 220 million EUA, 
broken down as follows: 

(i) 120 million EUA in the French regions 
bordering Spain and in the Mezzogiorno to 
remedy the consequences of enlargement; 

(ii) 43 million EUA in certain areas of the 
United Kingdom, Belgium and Italy (Naples) 
affected by the restructuring of the steel 
industry; 

(iii) 17 million EUA in certain areas of the 
United Kingdom affected by the restructuring 
of the shipbuilding industry; 

(iv) 16 million EUA in the mountain areas 
of the Mezzogiorno to promote the use of 
new forms of energy; 

(v) 24 million EUA in the border areas of 
Ireland and Northern Ireland. 

The measures planned are designed to meet 
the specific needs of the regions or areas con­
cerned: developing small- and medium-sized 
businesses, small craft industries and rural 
tourism; promoting innovation; redeveloping 
run-down industrial sites; developing alterna­
tive sources of energy. They represent a new 
approach: the emphasis has been placed less 
on traditional aid in the form of capital and 
more on 'aids to initiative' (market studies, 
advice to firms, management of tourist 
accommodation, etc.) which are not eligible 
for assistance under the ERDF quota section. 
Also, they will be financed not as individual 
projects but in the form of whole program­
mes submitted by the Member States and 
approved by the Commission following con­
sultation of the Fund Committee. 

' OJ C 285 of 15.11.1979; Bull. EC 10-1979, point 
2.1.63. 
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Fund Committee 

2.1.64. The European Regional Develop­
ment Fund Committee, meeting on 15 and 16 
July, gave its opinion on the draft decisions 
for aid from the Fund under the third alloca­
tion for 1980. It also continued its discussion 
on differentiated rates of ERDF assistance for 
infrastructure projects and considered a 
number of matters of principle connected 
with the financing of projects. 

Conversion loans 

2.1.65. The conversion loans paid in July 
and August by the Commission under Article 
56 of the ECSC Treaty totalled 35.34 million 
EUA. 1 Three undertakings benefited from 
these loans. 

2.1.66. Under the same Article, the Com­
mission also decided to grant the following 
two conversion loans: 

(i) 35.6 million EUA (approximately FF 210 
million) to Societe mecanique automobile du 
Nord (SMAN), a subsidiary of the Peugeot­
Citroen group, for the construction of a gear­
box plant on the Trith Saint-Leger industrial 
estate. The loan is to enable this company to 
provide a minimum of 2 500 jobs, with prior­
ity to be given to former employees of the 
mining and steel industries in the Nord-Pas­
de-Calais region. Activity in this region was 
for a long time dominated by coal and steel 
industries which are now affected by the 
recession. There is consequently a need for 
measures to revive and reorganize the area, 
making possible the development of activities 
in sectors other than steelmaking. 

(ii) 5.85 million EUA (approximately LFR 
235 million) to General Motors Luxembourg 
Operations SA, Bascharage, Luxembourg, to 
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help finance investment projects that will cre­
ate new jobs for redundant workers in the 
Luxembourg steelmaking area. The factory 
manufactures special tooling that will be used 
exclusively by the other General Mo~ors sub­
sidiaries for car assembly. All the products 
made at Bascharage will be sold to General 
Motors works in Europe. 

2.1.67. Lastly, the Commission has 
obtained the Council's assent to the granting 
of conversion loans totalling 89.89 million 
EUA.2 

Environment and consumers 

Environment 

Prevention and reduction 
of pollution and nuisances 

Fresh- and sea-water pollution 

Water for human consumption 

2.1.68. On 15 July the Council formally 
adopted3 the Directive relating to the quality 
of water for human consumption which it 
had approved on 30 June. 4 

1 Point 2.3.80. 
Point 2.3.81. 

1 OJ L 229 of 30.8.1980. 
' Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.1.72. 
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Discharge of heptachlor and chlordane 
into the aquatic environment 

2.1.69. In a communication transmitted on 
22 July, the Commission informed the Coun­
cil of its intention not to submit specific 
proposals on heptachlor and chlordane under 
the Directive of 4 May 1976 on pollution 
caused by certain dangerous substances dis­
charged into the aquatic environment.' 

The studies carried out have shown that, as 
they are used at present, these substances 
pose only a slight threat-and one that is in 
any case likely to diminish-to the aquatic 
environment. 

Protection of the Rhine 

2.1.70. On 7 and 8 July the Commission 
took part in a conference organized in Kehl 
by the European Trade Union Confederation 
on the subject of the pollution of the Rhine. 
After a debate involving members of the 
European Parliament, representatives of con­
federations in regions bordering the Rhine 
and the Commission, a declaration was 
adopted emphasizing the importance of the 
efforts so far made, especially at Community 
level, and proposing to the European 
authorities guidelines and a list of priority 
actions for securing the required increase in 
the quality of the Rhine waters. 

Air pollution 

Sulphur dioxide and suspended particulates 

2.1.71. On 15 July the Council adopted 
formally the Directive2 on air quality limit 
values and guide values for sulphur dioxide 
and suspended particulates and the Resolu­
tion 1 on trans boundary air pollution by these 
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pollutants, both of which it had agreed on 30 
June.4 

Protection and rational 
use of land, the environment 
and natural resources 

Fauna and flora 

2.1. 72. A proposal for a Regulation on the 
implementation in the Community of the 
Convention on International Trade in 
Endangered Species of Wild Fauna and Flora 
was sent to the Council by the Commission 
on 29 July.5 The aim of the proposal is to 
incorporate the legislative, regulatory and 
administrative provisions of the Member 
States into a common system which can be 
applied to the Community as a whole. The 
Convention seeks to protect some 1 720 ani­
mal species and many plant species through 
strict control of international trade. 

Improvement of the environment 

Information and education 

2.1.73. The annual meeting of teachers 
from the Community network of pilot 
schools in the field of environmental educa­
tion was held in Luxembourg from 6 to 9 
July. Those attending studied the work done 
during the 1979/80 school year and in par­
ticular the three teaching units prepared by 
the schools on the man-made environment 

' OJ L 129 of 18.5.1976. 
OJ L 229 of 30.8.1980. 

' OJ C 222 of 30.8.1980. 
• Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.1.70 and 2.1.71. 
' OJ C 243 of 22.9.1980. 
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and the cultural heritage; recreation and the 
environment; and energy production and 
conservation. The teachers also prepared 
schemes for 1980/81 which will lead to the 
development of new themes such as the 
impact of man on his environment and the 
protection of water resources (use, abuse, 
waste, etc.). 

Discussions with the Canadian 
and American administrations 

2.1.74. As part of the programme of bila­
teral cooperation on environmental matters, 
Commission representatives met federal and 
provincial Canadian officials in Ottawa on 7 
July. 1 A similar meeting was held in Washing­
ton from 23 to 25 July between representa­
tives of the Commission and the United 
States.1 

Consumers 

Physical protection 

Toy safety 

2.1.75. The proposal for a Directive on the 
safety of toys/ adopted by the Commission in 
April, 4 was transmitted to the Council on 3 
July. 

Information, education and representation 

2.1.76. Parliament5 and the Economic and 
Social Committee6 each delivered an opinion 
in July on the Commission proposal of 13 
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February for a Council Directive on the 
approximation of the laws of the Member 
States relating to textile names.-

Agriculture 

Economic aspects of the common 
agricultural policy 

Agri-monetary measures 

2.1.77. Because of the steady improvement 
of sterling on the exchanges in July and 
August, the monetary compensatory amounts 
for the United Kingdom were altered several 
times. A slight weakening of the lira also led 
to a change in the monetary compensatory 
amounts for Italy. 

Prices and markets 

Prices 

2.1.78. In the fruit and vegetable sector the 
Commission on 14 July fixed the reference 
prices for sweet oranges and mandarins for 
the 1980/81 marketing year. 8 

1 Point 2.2.52. 
Point 2.2.49. 

1 OJ C 228 of 8.9.1980. 
' Bull. EC 4-1980, point 2.1.53. 
' Point 2.3.16; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
' Point 2.3.55; OJ C 230 of 8.9.1980. 

OJ C 63 of 13.3.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.1.34. 
' OJ L 181 of 15.7.1980. 
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Market organizations 

Market situation; specific measures 

Pigmeat 

2.1.79. Unexpectedly, Community produc­
tion of pigmeat has tended, since the spring, 
to outstrip demand. This has accentuated the 
normal· seasonal variation in prices and has 
led the Commission to take specific market 
support measures. Private storage aid was 
granted at the end of May;1 these measures 
were then extended until the end of June2 and 
have applied again since Au81Jst.3 

The situation on the pigmeat market was also 
discussed by the Council in July; it was 
agreed to examine all aspects of the situation 
in detail in September, including the aspects 
relating to trade with non-member countries, 
on the basis of a report to be made by the 
Commission. 

Beef and veal 

2.1.80. In the beef and veal sector, activities 
in July and August concerned mainly mea­
sures for the day-to-day management of the 
market. However, the Commission did adopt 
several special measures during this period: it 
reintroduced4 the refunds, suspended in 
June,S on exports of pure-bred breeding cattle 
to the Soviet Union; it adopted implementing 
Regulations6 in respect of three sorts of pro­
ducer premium-two of these (the calving 
premium and the premium for the slaughter -
of certain beef cattle) are being continued for 
a further 12-month period, and the third (the 
premium for the retention of suckler herds) is 
granted under a new system applicable for 
the first time in the 1980/81 marketing year. 
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Olive oil 

2.1.81. On 22 July the Council, for the first 
time, adopted a set of measures to promote 
the consumption of olive oil in the Commun­
ity/ Under the basic Regulation the following 
steps may be taken: dissemination of know­
ledge, particularly regarding the various 
grades of olive oil; market research to 
increase olive oil consumption in the Com­
munity; advertising and promotion to stress 
the quality of olive oil and to indicate the 
products in which it is used; research work; 
special sales at reduced prices to certain 
categories of consumer. 

Wine 

2.1.82. The final balance for the 1978/79 
wine-growing year-sent to the Council by 
the Commission on 16 July-shows that, 
compared with the previous year, overall pro­
duction increased by about 10.2 million hec­
tolitres; end-of-year stocks increased by 
about 1.8 million hectolitres. 

2.1.83. In view of the size of extstmg 
stocks, which could cause problems at har­
vest time, on 14 July the Commission 
adopted a Regulation introducing aid for the 
restorage of table wine in respect of which a 

1 OJ L 114 of 3.5.1980. 
' OJ L 132 of 29.5.1980. 
1 OJ L 196 of 30.7.1980. 
• OJ L 174 of 9.7.1980. 
' OJ L 153 of 21.6.1980; Bull. EC 6-1980, point 
2.1.98. 
• OJ L 184 of 17.7.1980. 
' OJ L 192 of 26.7.1980. 
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storage contract was concluded in the 1979/ 
80 wine-growing year. 1 

2.1.84. In addition, to deal with marketing 
difficulties in the Armagnac production reg­
ion, the Council, in a Regulation of 22 July/ 
decided on advance application of the system 
of temporary abandonment premiums3 in 
respect of certain areas under vines in that 
region. 

2.1.85. On 15 July the Council also 
extended4 the deadlines for the distillation of 
table wine.1 

New common market organizations 

Sheepmeat 

2.1.86. The Regulation on the common 
organization of the market in sheepmeat6 was 
to have effect, as we have seen/ once the vol­
untary restraint agreements being negotiated 
with exporting countries were implemented. 
On 22 July Mr Gundelach reported to the 
Council on the current state of negotiations 
following his visit to New Zealand. 8 

The press release issued at the end of the 
Council meeting stated: 

'The Council ... took note of the Commission's 
intention to conduct the necessary negotiations 
with the other supplier countries concerned at the 
earliest opportunity. Following its discussions, the 
Council agreed that the proceedings and negotia­
tions ... should be carried out very rapidly, so that 
the Commission could submit its proposals in 
good time for the Council to adopt a position at 
its meeting on 29 and 30 September, in order to 
allow the Community rules governing the common 
organization of the sheepmeat markets to enter 
into force on 1 October 1980.' 
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Structural policy 

2.1.87. The amendments to the Directives 
on structures and the new measures which 
the Commission proposed in March 19799 

may well be adopted by the end of the year. 
In a discussion on the subject at its meeting 
on 22 July the Council reviewed progress to 
date. 

Some of the measures proposed in 1979 have 
in fact already been adopted; 10 since then, 
other measures have been proposed; the mea­
sures at present under discussion by the 
Council and likely to be adopted shortly are 
as follows: 

• implementation of the decisions of principle 
limiting investment aid in the milk and milk pro­
ducts and pigmeat sectors; 

• an overhaul of the Directives of 17 April 1972, 
including a special effort to assist young farmers; 

• a common measure to improve beef and veal 
production structures in Italy; 

• integrated development programmes for the 
Western Isles of Scotland, the department of 
Lozere and the Belgian province of Luxembourg; 

• specific measures to improve agricultural 
structures in Northern Ireland; 

• the development of agriculture in the French 
overseas departments. 

' OJ L 181 of 15.7.1980. 
' OJ L 195 of 29.7.1980. 
' OJ L 57 of 29.2.1980; Bull. EC 12-1979, point 
2.1.105. 
• OJ L 185 of 18.7.1980. 
' OJ L 62 of 7.3.1980; Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.1.75. 
• OJ L 183 of 16.7.1980. 
' Bull. EC 5-1980, point 2.1.54. 
' Point 2.2.56. 
• OJ C 124 of 17.5.1979; Bull. EC 3-1979, points 1.3.1 
to 1.3.15. 
•• Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.1.106. 
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Pr~ucer groups 

2.1.88. On 15 july the Council adopted a 
~egulation 1 supplementing its Regulation on 
producer groups and associations thereof, 2 

notably in the olive oil sector. 

2.1.89. On 31 July the Commission 
adopted two Regulations. 1 The first concerns 
the economic activity of producer groups and 
lays down rules relating to minimum area, 
turnover and volume of production and the 
minimum number of members. The second 
concerns the definition of the actual forma­
tion and operating expenditure of producer 
groups and associations thereof; this expendi­
ture serves as the basis for calculating the aid 
granted by Member States. 

New measures 

2.1.90. On 14 july the Commission sent to 
the Council a proposal for a Directive on the 
development of agriculture in the French 
overseas departments. • This proposal was 
motivated by the fact that the Directive on 
farm modernizations cannot be implemented 
properly in these departments, the agricul­
tural development of which is in any case lag­
ging well behind. 

2.1.91. On 4 july the Commission amended 
its proposal for a Regulation6 on a common 
measure to improve the conditions under 
which agricultural products are processed 
and marketed in Northern Ireland, by includ­
ing the pigmeat sector. The Economic and 
~ocial c?~mit~ee had requested this change 
m an opmton gtven at its 2-3 July session. 7 

2.1.92. At the same session the Committee 
also endorsed7 the Commission proposal of 
12 june8 for a Council Regulation concerning 
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the acceleration of agricultural development 
in the less-favoured areas of Northern 
Ireland. 

Agricultural legislation 

Veterinary legislation 

2.1.93. On 25 july the Commission deter­
mined the animal health conditions and vet­
e.rinary certification for the importation of 
fresh meat from the following countries: 
Australia, Brazil (State of Rio Grande do 
Sui), Canada, Finland, Norway, New Zea­
land and Sweden. • 

2.1.94. On 20 August the Commission 
proposed to the Council that financial aid be 
given for the eradication of African swine 
fever in Sardinia. 1" 

Animal protection 

2.1.95. In 1978 about 326 million laying 
hens produced 1 000 million eggs in the 
Community. The exceptionally low consumer 
price of this foodstuff, having regard to its 
nutritional value, was achieved only by 
developing highly efficient intensive rearing 
systems. At present about 90% of laying 

' OJ L 186 of 19.7.1980. 
OJ L 166 of 23.6.1978. 

' OJ L 203 of 5.8.1980. 
' OJ C 211 of 19.8.1980. 
' OJ L 96 of 23.4.1972. 
' OJ C 176 of 15.7.1980; Bull. EC 6-1980, point 
2.1.109. 
· Point 2.3.56; OJ C 230 of 8.9.1980. 
' OJ C 179 of 17.7.1980; Bull. EC 6-1980, pomt 
2.1.109. 
' OJ L 234 of 5.9.1980; OJ L 236 of 9.9.1980; OJ L 
233 of 4.9.1980. 
"' OJ C 232 of 10.9.1980. 
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hens in the Community are reared in battery 
cages. The intensive nature of such types of 
stockfarming makes it necessary to reconcile 
the preservation of food resources with the 
need to protect animals from unnecessary 
suffering: these were the main conclusions set 
out by the Commission in a communication 
to the Council of 15 July. 

At its meeting on 22 July the Council 
adopted the following resolution on the sub­
ject: 'The keeping of layer hens in cages must 
be subject to compliance with minimum stan­
dards and criteria established in order to 
ensure the protection of these animals. 
Appropriate rules for this purpose should be 
adopted by the Council ... before 1 
November 1981.' 1 

Seeds and propagating material 

2.1.96. On 15 July the Council adopted a 
new Decision concerning the equivalence of 
field inspections carried out on seed­
producing crops in non-member countries 
and the equivalence of seeds produced in 
non-member countries. 2 

COndmonsofcompeUUan 

2.1.97. Applying Articles 92 to 94 of the 
EEC Treaty, the Commission decided to 
make no comment at present on the follow­
ing aid measures notified by the Federal 
Republic of Germany for the Lander of:. 

• Hesse, to help young farmers to take over 
their farms and continue to modernize them, 
because the measures will promote develop­
ment; 

• Baden-Wiirttemberg, on investment aid 
for farm alterations; the Commission may, 
however, reconsider its position at a later 
date (Article 93(1)); 
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• Baden-Wiirttemberg, for investments to 
reduce odours from stock farms; 

• Schleswig-Holstein and Hamburg, for 
investment projects to reduce the consump­
tion of oil used to heat greenhouses. In par­
ticular, these measures provide for the con­
version of existing installations into systems 
using alternative energy sources, the use of 
heat recovery systems and insulation of the 
refrigerating plant used to store horticultural 
products; 

• Schleswig-Holstein, for investments in 
dung storage and reduction of odours. 

2.1.98. The Commission also decided to 
make no comment on the measures notified 
by: 

• Belgium, amending the rules for granting 
aid premiums in the horse-rearing sector; 

• Denmark, amending the conditions for 
granting State-guaranteed loans and interest 
subsidies to farmers affected by drought in 
1975 and 1976. The economic and financial 
situation in Denmark has deteriorated greatly 
since then and the beneficiaries have been 
unable to overcome their difficulties; 

• Denmark, on an increase in the tax on the 
production of eggs for consumption and 
chickens intended for fattening. The yield 
from this tax, which is used to finance the 
work of the Poultry Committee and research, 
contributes to the durable development of the 
sector; 

• Italy, for the region of Veneto, in a gen­
eral agricultural support bill (given the Italian 
authorities' amendments to the bill). This'pro­
vides for a set of measures to be implemented 
over the period 1979 to 1982 in the follow­
ing sectors: irrigation and land develop-

' OJ C 196 of 2.8.1980. 
OJ L 240 of 12.9.1980. 
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ment, improvement and modernization of 
land structures, fodder production and use of 
abandoned land, stockfarming, horticulture, 
fruit growing, olive growing and wine grow­
ing, land development in hill and mountain 
areas, fisheries. The Commission may, how­
ever, review at a later date certain types of 
aid provided for in the bill; 
• Italy, for the region of Lombardy, on the 
recognition of producer groups and associa­
tions thereof under Act No 674/78, which 
provides among other things for subsidies to 
enable these organizations to carry out pro­
grammes of research, information, study and 
quality control; 
• Luxembourg, in the wine growing sector 
pursuant to the Grand-Ducal Regulation of 
30 March 1979 giving effect to the Act of 30 
November 1978 promoting modernization in 
agriculture. In particular, the measures 
involve investment aid for certain wineries 
which suffered losses as a result of bad 
weather in 1978 and 1979. 

Hothouse horticulture 

2.1.99. Further to the report it had sent to 
the Council in June• on the distortions of 
competition in hothouse horticulture, the 
Commission transmitted to the Council on 
17 July a communication and a proposal for 
a resolution on the harmonization of energy 
costs in the sector. 

Fisheries 

Resources 

lntemsl aspects 

2.1.1 00. The Council meeting on fisheries 
held in Luxembourg on 21 July dealt with a 
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number o.f new proposals from the Commis­
sion with a view to attaining general agree­
ment on fisheries policy before 1 January 
1981, in line with the commitment made by 
the Council on 30 May.2 In the area of 
resource conservation, the proposals covered 
the distribution of catch quotas in 1980 and 
various technical measures. A communication 
was also presented to the Council on access 
to resources. 

The Council confined itself to reviewing the 
Commission's general approach and did not 
begin negotiating the details. The method the 
Commission proposes for working out 
quotas on the basis of the criteria set out in 
the Council declaration of 30 May (tradi­
tional fishing activities, the special needs of 
regions particularly dependent on fishing, 
loss of catch potential in the waters of non­
member countries was favourably received in 
general except by two delegations. The Ger­
man delegation strongly objected to the 
weighting given by the Commission to the 
different criteria because it felt the import­
ance of the loss of catch potential in the 
waters of non-member countries had been 
downgraded to the detriment of the German 
deep-sea fishing fleet. The French delegation 
criticized the method of spreading burdens 
that resulted from the preferences granted to 
some regions under the 'Hague agreement'. 

In view of the lack of progress on framing 
internal policy, the interim arrangement for 
conserving stocks was extended to 31 
October.3 The Council agreed to hold a meet­
ing in late October or early November to 

' Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.1.115. 
Bull. EC 5-1980, point 1.1.8. 

' OJ L 198 of 31.7.1980. 
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negotiate the fisheries policy in its entirety. 
Meantime, the Council's next meeting, 
scheduled for 29 September, would be 
devoted in the main to conservation mea­
sures. 

2.1.101. On 10 July the Court of Justice 
delivered a judgment against the United King­
dom with regard to three national conserva­
tion measures introduced in 1978.' These 
concerned regulation of fishing the Mourne 
herring stock, limits on herring fishing off the 
Isle of Man and enlargement of the area off 
north-east Scotland in which Norway pout 
fishing is banned. The Commission, which 
took the view that these measures raised a 
number of issues of principle regarding Com­
munity rules and the obligation on Member 
States to cooperate with the Community 
institutions, had referred the matter to the 
Court on 27 February 1979 under the proce­
dure laid down in Article 169 of the EEC 
Treaty.2 

2.1.102. On 23 July the Commission 
approved a Belgian national conservation 
measure banning herring fishing in the North 
Sea and eastern English Channel. 

External aspects 

2.1.103. At its 21 July meeting the Council 
was not able to adopt the Regulation dealing 
with the conclusion of an outline agreement 
with Spain because of a reservation expressed 
by the Irish delegation. 

2.1.1 04. On a proposal from the Commis­
sion, which had held consultations with Ice­
land and Norway on 15 and 16 July, the 
Council accepted the principle that Icelandic 
and Norwegian vessels should be authorized 
to continue fishing in the Community zone 
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off the east coast of Greenland established on 
1 June. The Regulation authorizing Icelandic 
vessels to fish for capelin in that zone was 
adopted on 11 August.3 

2.1.1 OS. Now that the International Coun­
cil for the Exploration of the Sea has revised 
its scientific assessment of levels of herring 
stocks in the Skagerrak and Kattegat, consul­
tations were held on 17 July between the 
Community, Norway and Sweden on the one 
hand and between the Community and Swe­
den on the other which resulted in agreement 
between the delegations to raise the TAC and 
stock allocations. 

Markets and structures 

Common organization of the market 

2.1.106. In July the Commission adopted a 
number of Regulations fixing: 

• the conditions and procedures for recog­
nizing, and withdrawing recognition from, 
producer organizations. The Regulation 
alters the conditions on which producer 
organizations may be recognized, with the 
aim of improving market supply. It also 
introduces conditions for the recognition of 
associations of producer organizations;4 

• export refunds in the fishery products sec­
tor for frozen mackerel (Whole or filleted), 
salted mackerel and dried salted saithe. The 
refund amounts have also been reduced 
slightly; 

' Point 2.3.49. 
Bull. EC 2-1979, point 2.1.67. 

' OJ L 212 of 15.8.1980. 
• OJ L ZOO of 1.8.1980. 
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• reference prices for carp in the 1980/81 
marketing year. The year starts on 1 August 
1980 and ends on 31 July 1981. On the basis 
of price movements in the Community, refer­
ence prices have been raised by 5% for the 
period from 1 August 1980 to 30 November 
1980 .and by 3% for the period from 1 
December 1980 to 31 July 198}.1 

Structures 

2.1.107. On 22 July the Commission sent 
several structures policy proposals to the 
Council, based on the principles it set out in 
its communication to the Council dated 12 
June. 2 The proposals concern: 

• a system for: encouraging experimental 
fishing and coQperation in joint fisheries ven­
tures; 

• a common measure to restructure, moder­
nize and develop the fisheries and aquacul­
ture sector; 

• the coordination and encouragement of 
research in the fisheries sector.1 

At the same time the Commission informed 
the Council of its intention to set up a 
framework for national aid to the fisheries 
sector. 

These various proposals represent a further 
step in the process of implementing a struc­
tures policy in the fisheries sector which the 
Community has been engaged in since 1971. 
They take into account the effects on the sec­
tor of the introduction of exclusive economic 
zones since 1977 and the precarious state of 
many fish stocks in the Community zone, and 
are designed to make fishery and aquaculture 
undertakings strong enough to face up to 
international competition, to ensure equitable 
living standards for communities living by 
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fishing and to provide consumers with mar­
ket supplies at reasonable prices. 

In order to help Community fishery under­
takings to cope with the drop in available 
resources, the Commission proposes first of 
all that a redeployment scheme should be 
instituted, particularly in the field of deep-sea 
fishi.ng, so as to cut back fishing in traditional 
fishing grounds and to provide employment 
for vessels which would otherwise be laid up. 
The scheme would be designed to encourage 
experimental fishing inside or outside Com­
munity waters with the aim of identifying 
new fishing grounds and new types of fishing 
and, secondly, to encourage joint ventures in 
non-member countries. 

Despite the adjustments already made, the 
constant need to modernize and renew fish­
ing fleets and the need to develop aquaculture 
remain highly important. This is why the 
Commission further proposes that the interim 
scheme already introduced for inshore 
fisheries• should be continued and extended 
to cover all fishing fleets and that it should 
be placed in the context of pluriannual pro­
grammes to be drawn up by the Member 
States. 

The Commission also proposes that national 
research programmes should be coordinated 
and that Community research programmes 
should be set up, to be financed from the 
Community budget and covering specific 
fields of general concern such as aquaculture, 
fishing methods and the processing and pre­
serving of fishery products. 

' OJ L 198 of 31.7.1980. 
Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.1.119. 

' OJ C 243 of 22.9.1980. 
' OJ L 211 of 1.8.1978. 
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Finally, the framework for national aid which 
the Commission envisages would ensure 
greater compatibility between measures plan­
ned by Member States and those adopted at 
Community level. 

2.1.108. On 9 July the Commission issued 
a Regulation 1 to implement the Council Reg­
ulation of 27 June 19802 which extends until 
31 December 1980 the interim common mea­
sure for restructuring the inshore fishing 
industry carried out in 1978 and 1979. The 
implementing Regulation lays down the rules 
for submitting applications for EAGGF aid 
for investment projects in this sector. Such 
applications must reach the Commission 
before 1 October 1980. 

2.1.109. In connection with State aid in the 
fisheries sector, the Commission decided on 9 
July to institute the procedure laid down in 
Article 93(2) of the Treaty with respect to: 

• aid for the purchase of fuel introduced in 
Italy for 1980; 

• aid to keep vessels from being laid up and 
maintain fishermen in employment intro­
duced in France for 1980; 

• aid for producer organizations introduced 
in the United Kingdom for 1980; 

• aid for producer organizations planned by 
the Land of Schleswig-Holstein for 1980 and 
1981. 

The Commission considers that the sole effect 
of these aid measures is temporary cash flow 
relief for the recipient undertakings and that 
they have a direct effect on competition with­
out in any way contributing towards slim­
ming down, reorganizing and restructuring 
-in short, developing-the fisheries sector; 
the Commission therefore regards them as 
not compatible with the common market. In 
the context of the review procedure it has 
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asked the Member States concerned to sub­
mit their comments on its finding. 

The Commission has decided, however, not 
to oppose the granting of investment aid to 
fisheries undertakings in the Federal Republic 
of Germany. It will be disbursed in the form 
of a single premium in 1980. 

Transport 

Inland transport 

Infrastructure 

Infrastructure investment 

2.1.110. On 11 July Parliament gave its 
opinion3 on the Commission's amended pro­
posal sent to the Council in February on sup­
port for projects of Community interest in 
transport infrastructure. 4 

Approximation of structures 

Improving the situation of the railways 

2.1.111. On 11 July Parliament adopted a 
resolution on the Commission's report to the 
Council on measures to be taken to promote 

' OJ L 187 of 21.7.1980. 
' OJ L 167 of 1.7.1980; Bull. EC 6-1980, point 
2.1.125. 
' Point 2.3.17; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
• OJ C 89 of 10.4.1980; Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.1.79. 
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the integration of railway undertakings at 
Community level.' 

Technical aspects 

2.1.112. On 22 July the Council formally 
adopted the Directive on summertime 
arrangements, z to which it had agreed in 
June.' 

Operation of the market 

Access to the market 

2.1.113. On 29 July the Commission pro­
posed4 to the Council that it amend its Regu­
lation of 16 December 19765 on the Com­
munity quota for the carriage of goods by 
road between Member States, which states 
that 'the Council ... shall decide, by 30 
November of each year, on any increase in 
the Community quota'. The Commission is 
proposing, for 1981, that the number of such 
authorizations be increased by 25% and 
further, that authorizations be allocated to 
Greece to allow its operators to take part, 
from 1 January 1981, in transport activities 
carried out under Community authorizations. 
The extra 25%, which would bring the total 
volume of the Community quota up to 4 788 
authorizations, is to be shared out evenly on 
the basis of the quotas allocated to the 
Member States in previous years. 

2.1.114. On 22 July the Commission pro­
posed to the Council that it amend three of 
its Directives on admission to the occupation 
of (a) road haulage and (b) road passenger 
transport operator in national and interna­
tional road transport operations and on (c) 
the mutual recognition of diplomas, certifi-
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cates and other evidence of formal qualifica­
tions for goods haulage operators and road 
passenger transport operations. These pro­
posals were based on Article 146 of the 
Greek Act of Accession and are designed par­
ticularly to amend the three Directives so that 
operators already in business in Greece retain 
rights acquired on terms comparable with 
those granted to transport operators in the 
present Member States when effect was given 
to Directives. 

Transport rates and conditions 

2.1.115. Meeting on 4 July, the Road Haul­
age Committee set up by Article 16 of the 
Council Regulation of 12 December 19776 on 
the fixing of rates for the carriage of goods 
discussed and adopted the second report 
-which is to be sent to the Council and the 
Governments of the Member States-on the 
development of the international road haul­
age market in the Community in 1977 and 
1978. The Committee also continued to look 
into methods of controlling the compulsory 
tariffs introduced by the Regulation and 
deciding on appropriate penalties. 

2.1.116. From 22 to 24 July discussions 
were held between representatives of the 
Commission, the scrap trade in France and 
the Federal Republic of Germany, the Italian 
steel industry and the railways, all of which 
are affected by difficulties in rail transport to 

' Bull. EC 4-1979, point 2.1.90. 
' OJ L 205 of 7.8.1980. 
' Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.1.133. 
• OJ C 220 of 28.8.1980. 
' OJ L 357 of 29.1~.1976. 
' OJ L 334 of 24.12.1977. 
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Italy. Various ways of making short-term 
improvements to the situation were dis­
cussed. 

Sea transport 

2.1.117. When, on 15 May 1979, it 
adopted its Regulation1 concerning the ratifi­
cation by Member States of, or their acces­
sion to, the United Nations Convention on a 
Code of Conduct for Liner Conferences, the 
Council decided to urge the other OECD 
countries adopting the Code to follow the 
Community's policies (applying the Code to 
developing countries but keeping the com­
mercial organization of liner transport within 
the OECD). In this connection, the Commun­
ity sent a trade delegation to Japan from 9 to 
14 July for discussions with the Japanese 
authorities. These discussions proved 
extremely fruitful and will be continued. 

Air transport 

2.1.118. On 10 July Parliament adopted a 
resolution on the development of a coordi­
nated European air traffic control system. 2 

2.1.119. On 3 July the Economic and Social 
Committee gave its opinion 1 on a Commis­
sion Memorandum on the development of air 
transport services. • 

Advisory CommiHee on Transport 

2.1.120. The Advisory Committee on 
Transport met in Brussels on 3 July and com­
pleted its examination of a draft report on 
energy and transport; this will be adopted, 
after drafting changes, in September. 
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Formulating and Implementing 
a Community energy policy 

Energy 

2.1.121. The achievements of the Commun­
ity energy policy and its future prospects 
were reviewed in a communication from the 
Commission to the Council on 14 July which 
was later published as a brochure. 

This describes the Community's contribution 
to the efforts made to solve the energy prob­
lem and reduce oil imports. The communica- · 
tion, which was also sent to Parliament for 
information, contains a survey of Community 
achievements in energy research and develop­
ment, including the activities of the Joint 
Research Centre and JET, since January 
1977. This report points out a number of 
positive achievements. The action taken by 
the Member States and the Community 
shows that there is now agreement on the 
broad outlines of the common energy policy 
which emerged from the European Council in 
Venice.5 Since 1973 the Community's 
dependence on imported energy has fallen 
from 63% to 54%. Some 7% to 8% of 
energy, the equivalent of 70 million tonnes of 
oil, has been saved each year. Internationally, 
the agreement among the leading indus­
trialized nations to limit oil consumption and 
oil imports is a success. The document states 
that, while the Community is making pro­
gress in the right direction, much remains to 
be done, especially in investment in the 

1 OJ L 121 of 17.5.1979; Bull. EC 5-1979, point 
2.1.120. 

Point 2.3.13; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
1 Point 2.3.57; OJ C 230 of 8.9.1980. 
' Supplement 5179 - Bull. EC. 
' Bull. EC 6-1980, points 1.1.1 to 1.1.13. 
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energy sector, which will have to increase 
from 50 000 million to 100 000 million EUA 
by 1990 to keep oil imports at their present 
level. Finally, the report emphasizes that it is 
only through a coordinated price and taxa­
tion policy that the use of oil can be reduced 
and energy saved. 

Specific problems 

Energy saving and rational use 

Demonstration projects 
for energy saving 

2.1.122. The Commission has received 
more than 300 applications in response to its 
second invitation for proposals' under the 
Council Regulation of 12 June 19782 on the 
granting of financial support for demonstra­
tion projects in the field of energy saving. 

After consulting the appropriate Advisory 
Committee on Programme Management, the 
Commission decided to grant financial sup­
port to 60 projects. The Community con­
tribution will be 27 140 000 EUA out of a 
total investment of about 88 million EUA. 

Rational use of energy 
in industrial enterprises 

2.1.123. On 29 July the Commission 
decided to address to the Member States a 
recommendation on the rational use of 
energy in industrial enterprises. 1 This recom­
mendation was made in the light of the 
Council Resolution of 9 June 1980,4 which 
invited the Member States to take energy­
saving measures in all sectors, including 
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industry. The Commission recommends that 
the Member States: 

• promote, in the context of their program­
mes for the rational use of energy, the setting­
up of consultation and technical assistance 
services, particularly for small- and medium­
sized undertakings, based on the 'energy bus' 
principle. 

The 'energy bus' is designed, according to the 
Canadian model,' to perform on-site energy 
audits in firms, in order to give practical 
advice on the rational use of energy. The bus 
is equipped with a computer, measuring 
instruments and video display units and man­
ned by an engineer and a technician. During 
the advisory visit, which on average lasts one 
day, the firm's energy use pattern is analysed 
by means of the on-board computer and the 
potential energy savings are identified. 

• promote solutions capable of being incor­
porated into a Community information and 
evaluation system set up at the Ispra Estab­
lishment of the JRC. 

Oil and gas 

Support for technological 
development projects 

2.1.124. On 22 July the Commission, act­
ing under the Regulation of 9 November 
1973,6 sent to the Council a proposal for 

' Bull. EC 11-1978, point 2.1.108. 
' OJ L 158 of 16.6.1978; Bull. EC 6-1978, point 
2.1.116. 
' OJ L 239 of 12.9.1980. 
' OJ C 149 of 18.6.1980; Bull. EC 5-1980, pomts 1.4.1 
to 1.4.5. 

Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.2.56. 
' OJ L 312 of 13.11.1973. 
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financial support totalling about 28 million 
ECU over the period 1980-82 to 34 oil and 
gas projects. This proposal, the sixth part of 
a programme which began in 1974 is 
designed to spur technological advances 
directly concerned with exploration, develop­
ment, storage and transport which will 
increase the security of the Community's 
energy supplies. The support granted 
amounts to between 30% and 40% of the 
total cost of a project. Between 1974 and 
1979 some 183 million EUA has been spent 

·on support for 168 projects. 

The latest list of projects which the Council is 
asked to approve includes five projects to 
increase the recovery rate which, if successful, 
would considerably increase the Commun­
ity's reserves, and a number of projects con­
cerned with production from marginal fields, 
the improvement of seismic data and their 
interpretation and the improvement of under­
water construction and maintenance techni­
ques. 

Nuclear energy 

Uranium prospecting 

2.1.125. On 25 July the Commission 
approved the allocation of the 9 million EUA 
earmarked for assistance to uranium pros­
pecting programmes in Community countries 
in 1980. 

The Commission accepted 12 of the 20 
requests submitted. The countries making 
successful applications were the Federal 
Republic of Germany, Ireland, Italy and the 
United Kingdom. This is the fifth part of a 
programme, based on Article 70 of the 
Euratom Treaty, which began in 1976. 
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New sources of energy 

Geothermal energy 

2.1.126. Under the Council Regulation of 
12 June 1978' the Commission published a 
second series of notices2 inviting applications 
for financial support for demonstration pro­
jects to exploit geothermal energy. In 
response, 33 proposals were received. After 
consulting the appropriate Advisory Commit­
tee on Programme Management, the Com­
mission decided to assist 17 projects by con­
tributing 10 040 000 EUA towards the total· 
investment of about 132 million EUA. 

Research and development, 
science and education 

Science and technology: 
priorities and organization 
of the common policy 

2.1.127. In a communication, together with 
a report, it transmitted to the Council on 25 
July, the Commission made proposals bear­
ing mainly on ways and means of intensifying 
the Community's R&D efforts. 

Entitled 'The common policy in the field of 
science and technology: priorities and organi­
zation', this communication is the Commis­
sion's answer to one of the requests made by 
the Council in the 'conclusions' it adopted on 
20 December 1979 on the general guidelines 
for the common research policy. 1 These 

1 OJ L 158 of 16.6.1978; Bull. EC 6-1978, point 
2.1.117. 
' Bull. EC 11-1978, point 2.1.109. 
1 Thirteenth General Report, point 435; BulL EC 12-
1979, pmnt 2.1.153. 
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guidelines had been prepared during the 
Council meeting on research held on 22 
October. 1 

After a detailed study, the Commission, fol­
lowing the principle that it is preferable not 
to introduce radical changes but rather to 
rearrange a system that has developed over 
the years and is functioning satisfactorily, 
proposes that the following guidelines be 
adopted: 
• that during the period 1981-85, 80% of 
Community R&D expenditure should be 
concentrated on fields of absolute priority in 
the sectors of energy, raw materials, the envi­
ronment and agriculture and in certain 
industrial sectors; 
• that the indirect-action and concerted­
action programmes should be combined into 
sectoral programmes as an initial step 
towards an overall multiannual outline pro­
gramme, since this would help to reduce the 
number of programme decisions and to 
streamline the procedures; 

• that procedures should be streamlined 
through the more systematic introduction of 
the principle of 'rolling programmes' in order 
to render more efficient the transition from 
one multiannual programme to the next 
when an extension is justified; 

• that various internal measures should be 
taken to strengthen the links between direct­
and indirect-action research projects, more 
specifically in fields where the two types of 
project coexist. 

This communication from the Commission 
will be followed by a second one dealing with 
the other areas in which the Council's 'con­
clusions' of 20 December 1979 called upon 
the Commission to take action, including the 
assessment of the possible impact of Com­
munity R&D on certain horizontal policies. 
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Science, research and development 

Genetic recombinations 

2.1.128. On 4 August the Commission 
transmitted to the Council a draft recommen­
dation . to the Member States concerning the 
registration of recombinant DNA (deoxy­
ribonucleic acid) work. 2 

The main objective of the proposal is to cre­
ate a permanent inventory within each 
Member State of all R&D activities involv­
ing the transmission, by biochemical means, 
of heritable material between different species 
that are separated from each other in the 
natural state by reproductive barriers. The 
Commission considers that such activities can 
give rise to certain risks to man and his envi­
ronment which, although probably very 
slight-and even purely conjectural at the 
present time-nevertheless should not be 
ignored. 

The Commission proposal therefore provides 
for a permanent inventory to be kept within 
each Member State on work involving recom­
binant DNA and on related safety measures. 
Its adoption by the Council would therefore 
make it possible to keep a constant watch on 
the situation within the Community and to 
take any measures required as a result of new 
and unforeseen developments. To this end, 
the draft recommendation reiterates the need 
regularly to analyse, revise and, where neces­
sary, modify national and Community provi­
sions in the light of scientific progress and 
acquired experience. 
This draft recommendation replaces the 
proposal for a Directive which the Commis-

' Bull. EC 10-1979, point 2.1.135. 
OJ C 214 of 21.8.1980. 
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sion transmitted to the Council on 5 
December 1978,1 at a time when the state of 
knowledge did not make it possible to con­
clude that the hazards which could result 
from certain activities involving recombinant 
DNA were slight. 

Scientific and Technical 
Research Committee 

2.1.129. At its meeting on 15 July the Sci­
entific and Technical Research Committee 
(CREST) delivered a favourable opinion on 
the content of the proposal for a multiannual 
(1981-84) programme in the field of scientific 
and technical training and education/ which 
the Commission transmitted to the Council in 
May. It also continued its discussions on the 
proposal for a five-year (1981-85) indirect­
action R&D programme in the field of 
biomolecular engineering, 1 which the Com­
mission presented in January. In addition, the 
Committee embarked on an examination of 
two other Commission proposals relating 
respectively to a multiannual (1981-85) indi­
rect-action R&D programme on the envi­
ronment (environmental protection and 
climatology)4 and to the creation of a Euro­
pean advanced machine translation system 
(EUROTRA). I 

Eufopean cooperation in the field 
of scientific and technical research 
(COST): four new projects 

2.1.130. On 24 July the representatives of 
the Member States and of the European non­
member countries concerned signed four joint 
declarations of intent on the implementation 
of the following research projects, which 
were prepared under COST :• 

• phased-array antennas and their novel 
applications (COST project 204), signed by 
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the representatives of Italy, the United King­
dom, Finland and Sweden; 

• influence of the atmosphere on radiopro­
pagation on satellite-earth paths at frequen­
cies above 10 GHz (COST project 205), 
signed by Belgium, Denmark, France, Italy, 
the United Kingdom, Finland, Sweden and 
the European Space Agency (ESA); 

• maize as the basis of the complete feed in 
intensive animal production (COST project 
82), signed by Belgium, Denmark, the Federal 
Republic of Germany, the Netherlands, Swit­
zerland and Sweden; 

• early weaning of piglets (COST project 
85), signed by Belgium, Denmark, the Federal 
Republic of Germany, the United Kingdom, 
Switzerland and Sweden. 

Multlannual programmes 

Uranium exploration and extraction 

2.1.131. On 15 July the Commission sent 
the Council a proposal for a Decision adopt­
ing a second four-year (1981-84) indirect­
action programme of research and develop­
ment in the field of uranium exploration and 
extraction/ Like the 1978-80 programme,8 of 
which it constitutes a continuation and an 
extension, the second programme has a 

' OJ C 301 of 15.12.1978; Bull. EC 12-1978, point 
2.1.153. 
' OJ C 143 of 12.6.1980; Bull. EC 5-1980, point 
2.1.91. 
' OJ C 28 of 5.2.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.1.73. 
• Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.1.152. 
' Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.1.165. 
' OJ L 39 of 15.2.1980. 
' OJ C 191 of 29.7.1980. 

OJ L 72 of 14.3.1978; Thirteenth General Report, 
point 420. 
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twofqld objective: to increase the Communi­
ty's uranium self-supply potential and to 
develop techniques that the Community 
industry can use in its worldwide operations. 

On the one hand the programme thus pro­
posed would enable research projects cur­
rently in progress to be completed and new 
projects corresponding to the most recent 
needs to be launched; on the other hand it 
would allow the results obtained under the 
present programme to be applied on a pilot 
scale. The Commission's programme pro­
posal, for which the upper limit of expendi­
ture committed is 8 million EUA, was 
endorsed by the Scientific and Technical 
Commi~ee at its 28-29 April' meeting. 

Thermonuclear fusion 

2.1.132. On 1 August the Commission 
transmitted to the Council a communication 
on the status of the JET project together with 
a proposal for a Decision adjusting the Com­
munity's financial contribution to the JET 
Joint Undertaking in line with changes in 
economic conditions. 2 These documents, 
based on the JET Council's conclusions-in 
particular on that increasing the cost esti­
mates for the construction phase of the pro­
ject (basis performance) from 201.25 million 
EUA at January 1979 prices to 263.1 million 
EUA at January 1981 prices-provide for the 
upper limit of the Community's expenditure 
commitments on JET under the 1979-83 
programme on thermonuclear fusion 1 to be 
increased from 145 to 195 million EUA. This 
communication was also transmitted to Parli­
ament. 

Paper and board recycling 

2.1.133. On 2 July the Commission pro­
posed• that the Council extend by one year, 
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i.e. to the end of 1981, without increasing the 
appropriation, the present ( 1978-81) indirect­
action programme of research and develop­
ment in the field of paper and board recycl­
ing. 1 This extension should enable the current 
research projects to be completed and their 
results to be assessed. 

* 

2.1.134. During its plenary session of 2 and 
3 July, the Economic and Social Committee 
delivered a favourable opinion on the pro­
posal for a five-year (1981-85) indirect-action 
programme in the field of biomolecular 
engineering, • which the Commission pre­
sented to the Council on 22 January. 7 

Advisory Committees 
on Programme Management (ACPM's) 

2.1.135. At its meeting on 29 and 30 July 
the ACPM responsible for the programme on 
climatologyR discussed the 160 proposals sub­
mitted to the Commission in response to the 
call for tenders9 published on 4 March. The 
Committee gave a favourable opinion on the 
signature by the Commission of an initial set 
of 40 contracts representing a total Commun­
ity contribution of approximately 3 million 
EUA. 

2.1.136. The ACPM responsible for infor­
matics met at Ispra on 2 and 3 July. It discus-

' Bull. EC 4-1980, point 2.1.86. 
' OJ C 220 of 28.8.1980. 
' OJ L 72 of 18.3.1980; Bull. EC 3-1980, point 
2.1.110. 
' OJ C 180 of 18.7.1980. 
' OJ L 107 of 21.4.1978; Bull. EC 4-1978, point 
2.1.99. 
' Point 2.3.58; OJ C 230 of 8.9.1980. 
- OJ C 28 of 5.2.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.1.73. 
' OJ L 12 of 17.1.1980; Bull. EC 12-1979, point 
2.1.161. 
" OJ C 54 of 4.3.1980. 
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sed a presentation of the actiVIties of the 
Joint Research Centre concerning both the 
past and the present programmes and 
approved the future orientation of the work. 
In particular, the Committee stressed the 
importance of the various aspects of specific 
support for the Commission's sectoral 
activities. The ACPM also delivered its opin­
ion on the allocation of resources to the three 
sectors of activity provided for in the infor­
matics programme (teleinformatics, Eurocopi 
and ESIS) and recommended that working 
parties be set up with the task of keeping 
these activities under review and submitting 
their conclusions to the ACPM. 

Education 

Education Committee 

2.1.137. On 15 July, following the 27 June 
meeting of the Council and the Ministers of 
Education meeting within the Council, 1 the 
Education Committee examined the consequ­
ences of the gradual introduction of new 
information technologies for education. It 
requested the Commission to review the situ­
ation and make an inventory of existing 
documentation in the Community with the 
cooperation of a specialized correspondent in 
each country. Once this information is com­
piled the Committee can embark on its work 
in this area. 

Scientific and 
technical information 

Three-year plan of action 

2.1.138. The Committee for Scientific and 
Technical Information and Documentation 
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(ClOST) delivered a favourable opinion on 
the Commission's intention to prepare a third 
three-year 1981-83 plan of action on infor­
mation. The objectives of this third plan 
would be to consolidate and extend the 
Euronet telecommunications network and 
widen the range of services offered by Diane. 
By providing for the creation, on a coopera­
tive basis, of new information services and 
the development of a genuine Community 
market for information, it should stimulate 
the development and utilization of new infor­
mation technologies. Its overall budget is esti­
mated at 16.5 million EUA. The draft third 
plan of action will be submitted to CREST 
and the Community's proposals will be trans­
mitted to the Economic and Social Commit­
tee and Parliament; the Council is due to take 
a decision during the first few months of 
1981. 

2.1.139. The Committee also delivered a 
favourable opinion on an initial list of 35 
projects selected from the 260 tenders 
received by the Commission in response to its 
invitation to submit proposals2 for the 
development of new STID systems in the 
Community. The Commission will sign con­
tracts with the public or private organizations 
thus selected stipulating the details of its 
financial support for the establishment of 
these new systems. 

Euronet 

2.1.140. The Euronet-Diane network has 
been operational for some six months/ and 

' Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.1.148. 
' OJ C 298 of 29.11.1979; Bull. EC 4-1980, point 
2.1.94. 
· Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.1.98. 
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m<:>re ~han 1 ~00 organizations are already 
usmg Its serv1ces. Some 20 information ser­
vices, accessible through the network are 
offering users access to more than 120' data 
bases. co~t~ining in~ormation in a wide range 
of sc1entlf1c, techmcal, economic social and 
legal fields. More than 200 b;ses will be 
accessible before the end of 1981. 

Dissemination of research results 

2.1.141. An initial module of the Auto­
mated System for the Processing of Addresses 
a.nd Pu.bli~ations (SAGAP) is now opera­
tional: 1t IS a programme for processing an 
address file that will contain nearly 250 000 
units for Brussels and Luxembourg. The sys­
te~ _was devel~pe~ with the aim of providing 
efflc1ent orgamzat1on of the circulation and 
commercial distribution of all the Commis­
sion's publications, including scientific and 
technical reports. It will enable orders to be 
registered, subscriptions and stocks to be 
man.aged and invoicing and accounting to be 
earned out. At the same time the introduc­
tion of data-processing techni~ues in some of 
the Commission's Information Offices is 
intended to enable them to utilize this 
scheme. 

2.1.142. In order to give the public greater 
access to the results of Community research, 
a. data base called EABS, covering the same 
fields as the periodical Euroabstracts can 
now be accessed in the conversational ~ode 
through the Euronet-Diane network. At the 
time of writing, EABS contains approxi­
mately 18 000 references to articles com-. . ' mumcat10ns, reports, monographs, confer-
ence records, etc. arising from Community 
research programmes. 
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2. Enlargement 
and external 
relations 

Enlargement and 
bilateral relations 
with applicant countries 

Greece 

2.2.1. Following discussions in the Council 
on 21 July, its President, Mr Thorn, sent a 
letter to the Greek Minister for Relations 
with the European Communities, Mr Kon­
togeorgis, regarding the measures taken by 
Greece to restrict imports. He emphasized the 
ef~ects these ~estrictions were having on cer­
tam Commumty exports and pointed out that 
they came at a time when Greece was shortly 
to become a member of the Community. He 
further expressed the Community's firm hope 
that the measures would be lifted and that 
steps would be taken to put the Greek 
economy on a sounder footing. It will be 
recalled that the anti-inflationary measures 
adopted by the Greek Government at the end 
of November1 had been discussed at length in 
the EEC-Greece Association Committee-2 and 
during the visit Mr Kontogeorgis paid to 
Brussels in June.' 

Portugal 

Accession negotiations 

2.2.2. The third meeting of the accession 
negotiations at ministerial level took place in 
Brussels on 22 July. 4 At the meeting, chaired 

' Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.2.1. 
' Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.2.1; Bull. EC 3-1980, point 
2.2.1; Bull. EC 4-1980, point 2.2.1. 
' Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.2.2. 
• Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.2.4. 
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jointly by Mr Thorn, Luxembourg's Foreign 
Minister and President of the Council, and 
the Portuguese Deputy Prime Minister and 
Foreign Minister Mr Freitas do Amaral, the 
Community delivered a progress report on 
the conference, noting that the only two sec­
tors not yet tackled were agriculture and 
fisheries and that a good deal of preparatory 
work would be needed before the Commun­
ity's position could be settled. This work 
would proceed according to schedule so that 
the problem identification exercise could be 
completed. For the other sectors, it was the 
Community's firm intention to work out the 
broad outlines of solutions to be put to Por­
tugal in the course of the negotiations as and 
when this became possible. 

The Portuguese delegation made a similar 
statement, observing that since the remaining 
differences had now been identified and ana­
lysed, the foundations were laid for the sub­
sequent phase during which agreement could 
be forged. 

2.2.3. On the occasion of the ministerial 
meeting the Community also informed Por­
tugal of its decision to grant the requests for 
'pre-accession' aid made by Portugal at the 
meetings of the EEC-Portugal Joint Commit­
tee in January 1979 and April this year. 1 

Within the limits of its budgetary resources, 
the Community will be providing the country 
with aid between now and accession as a 
contribution to specific measures to enable 
the Portuguese economy to tie in smoothly 
with that of the EEC. This aid will take the 
form both of investment loans from EIB own 
resources and of money drawn from the 
Community budget in accordance with 
arrangements and criteria still to be decided. 
The Council will take a decision on the size 
of the aid package and the implementing 
arrangements as soon as possible, so that as­
sistance can start before the end of the year. 
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Taking note of the Community statement, 
Mr Freitas do Amaral again stressed the im­
portance Portugal attached to the implemen­
tation of these pre-accession measures, which 
were in the interests of both sides, and 
emphasized the need for a quick Community 
decision to give effect to the aid pledge. 

The Commission and the Portuguese delega­
tion continued their scrutiny of Community 
secondary legislation in July, dealing with 
institutional, budgetary and staff regulations 
matters, agriculture, statistics, data program­
ming and aerospace and external relations. 

Spain 

Accession negotiations 

2.2.4. The fifth session at ministerial level 
of the negotiations for Spain's accession took 
place in Brussels on 21 July.2 The Commun­
ity delegation was led by Mr Thorn, Presi­
dent of the. Council, and the Spanish delega­
tion by Mr Calvo Sotelo. 

Views were exchanged on the work done to 
date and the further progress of the negotia­
tions. 

It was noted that only two sectors had not 
yet been tackled: agriculture and (as regards 
the Community) fisheries - two essential 
areas. A good deal of preparatory work would 
be needed before the Community's position 
could be settled, and this would proceed 
according to schedule. Other sectors, might 
need to be examined in greater depth. It was 
the Community's firm intention to work out 
the broad outlines of solutions to be put to 
Spain as and when this became possible. 

' Bull. EC 1-1979, point 2.2.4; Bull. EC 4-1980, point 
2.2.6. 
2 Bull. EC 4-1980, point 2.2.7. 
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The Community delegation presented docu­
ments on right of establishment and 
Euratom; the Spanish delegation presented a 
memorandum on fisheries. 

2.2.5. The Commission and the Spanish 
delegation continued their scrutiny of Com­
munity secondary legislation in July, conclud­
ing the first round with agriculture. 

EEC-Spain bilateral relations 

Euratom-Spain Cooperation Agreement 
on controlled thermonuclear fusion 

2.2.6. On 14 July Mr Calvo Sotelo, Minis­
ter in charge of Spain's relations with the 
Community, and Mr Brunner put their signa­
tures to a cooperation agreement linking 
Spain for the first time to Euratom's pro­
gramme of research into controlled ther­
monuclear fusion. 1 

The agreement is designed to allow the 
exchange of scientists between the Commis­
sion and its associates and Spain in order to 
direct and develop Spain's fusion programme 
along lines compatible with Euratom's with a 
view to a fuller association, particularly in 
the light of Spain's future membership of the 
Community. 

Commercial policy 

Application of the results 
of the Multilateral 
Trade Negotiations 

Agreement on Government Procurement 

2.2.7. On 22 July, acting to transpose into 
Community legislation the Tokyo Round 
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agreements, the Council amended2 its Direc­
tive of 21 December 1976 coordinating pro­
cedures for the award of public supply con­
tracts.1 

A number of problems concerning access to 
Community public supply contracts for pro­
ducts originating in non-member countries 
were dealt with on the same day in a Council 
resolution, a Commission statement and a 
joint statement by the Council and the Com­
mission. 4 The Geneva Agreement on Govern­
ment Procurement is to come into force on 1 
January 1981. 

Implementing the common 
commercial policy 

Import arrangements 

Easing of restrictive measures 

2.2.8. Under the Council Decision of 27 
March 1975 on unilateral import arrange­
ments in respect of State-trading countries,' 
the Commission took the following measures 
to relax import restrictions: 

Italy-Czechoslovakia: exceptional opening of 
a quota for the importation of industrial sew­
ing machine heads;6 

Federal Republic of Germany-China: open­
ing of a quota for the importation of spades 
and shovels;7 

1 Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.2.10; OJ L 190 of 
24.7.1980. 

Point 2.1.20; OJ L 215 of 18.8.1980. 
1 OJ L 13 of 15.1.1977. 
' OJ C 211 of 19.8.1980. 
' OJ L 99 of 21.4.1975. 
' OJ C 210 of 16.8.1980. 

OJ C 240 of 18.9.1980. 
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Italy-Albania/Czechoslovakia/China: excep­
tional opening of quotas for the importation 
of various textile products; 1 

Italy-Poland/German Democratic Repub­
lic/Hungary/Czechoslovakia: exceptional 
opening of a number of quotas for the impor­
tation of various products; 

Italy-Poland: exceptional opening of a quota 
for the importation of electric typewriters; 1 

Italy-Romania: exceptional opening of a 
quota for the importation of excavators; 

Italy-German Democratic Republic: excep­
tional opening of a quota for the importation 
of seamless tubes; 

Italy-Czechoslavakia: exceptio~al opening of 
a quota for the importation of bearings and 
parts thereof; 

Italy-Hungary: exceptional opening of a 
quota for the importation of 'Sisomicina';2 

Italy-Czechoslovakia/Hungary: exceptional 
opening of quotas for the importation of 
synthetic rubber and plastic waste; 

Trade protection 

Anti-dumping measures 

2.2.9. The Commission decided to initiate 
anti-dumping/anti-subsidy procedures con­
cerning the following imports: vinyl acetate 
monomer originating in the United States;' 
mechanical watches and mechanical watch 
movements originating in the USSR;4 styrene 
monomer originating in the United States; 1 

furfural originating in the Dominican Repub­
lic, Spain and the People's Republic of 
China;• edible and pharmaceutical gelatine 
originating in Sweden! 
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2.2.1 0. -The Commission also imposed pro­
visional anti-dumping duties on the following 
imports: certain chemical fertilizers originat­
ing in the United States;7 certain polyester 
yarn originating in the United States. 8 

2.2.11. On 28 August the Council amen­
ded9 its Regulation of 29 January 198010 

establishing a definitive anti-dumping duty 
on imports of lithium hydroxide originating 
in the United States and the Soviet Union. 

Sectoral commercial policy measures 

Iron and steel products 

Arrangements with non-member countries 

2.2.12. Consultations were held with the 
following countries on the basis of the 
arrangements concluded on trade in iron and 
steel products between the Commission and 
non-EEC countries: Czechoslovakia on 3 and 
30 July, Bulgaria on 14 July, Norway on 24 
July and Spain on 28 July. The functioning of 
the arrangements and the way in which they 
had been administered were examined, with 

' OJ C 240 of 18.9.1980. 
OJ C 225 of 4.9.1980. 

' OJ C 169 of 9.7.1980. 
' OJ C 181 of 19.7.1980. 

OJ C 185 of 26.7.1980. 
OJ C 219 of 27.8.1980. 
OJ L 212 of 15.8.1980. 

' OJ L 231 of 2.9.1980. 
" OJ L 228 of 30.8.1980. 

'" OJ L 23 of 30.1.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.2.6. 
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particular reference to observance of the price 
rules and the quantitative assessment of 
imports into the Community. 

2.2.13. A meeting took place on 6 August 
between representatives of the Commission 
and of the Polish authorities, pursuant to the 
arrangement regarding trade in ECSC iron 
and steel products. 

The Commission drew the attention of the 
Polish side to the difficult situation on the 
steel market in the Community and the rest 
of the world. The trend of imports from 
Poland was then discussed, including the 
question of indirect imports; the Commission 
took note of Polish requests to see an increase 
in the volume of exports to certain Member 
States. 

Autonomous measures 

2.2.14. On 28 July the Commission pro­
posed a provisional countervailing duty on 
certain seamless tubes of non-alloy steels 
originating in Spain. 1 

Textiles 

Multifibre Arrangement: 
report on two years' operation 

2.2.15. In a communication transmitted to 
the Council on 18 July the Commission drew 
up an initial report on trends in the textile 
trade and the textile industry following two 
years.' operation of the Multifibre Arrange­
ment (MFA) on the basis of the textile policy 
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objectives laid down by the Community in 
1977.1 

The purpose in drawing up this report was to 
prepare the Community's position in the dis­
cussions to be held before the end of the year 
on future arrangements governing interna­
tional trade in textiles. Under the terms of the 
MFA the Textiles Committee set up under 
GATT is to meet not later than one year 
before the expiry of the Arrangement at the 
end of 1981 in order to consider whether it 
should be extended, modified or discon­
tinued. 

The Commission recognized that it was dif­
ficult to draw firm conclusions at this stage 
concerning the operation of the MFA and the 
bilateral agreements and arrangements, or 
regarding the future position of the textile 
industry in the Community. It considered, 
however, that it could be predicted that when 
the present MFA expired at the of 1981 it 
would not be possible to return to trade 
arrangements in the textiles sector governed 
solely by the GATT general provisions. 

The first conclusion to be drawn from exami­
nation of the trend of trade in textiles was 
that the Community textile policy had 
brought about a reduction in growth rates 
and stabilized the trend of imports from the 
countries concerned and that the global ceil­
ings had been observed. The Commission 
also noted that the bilateral agreements and 
arrangements concluded by the Community 
with non-member supplier countries had con­
tributed to this stabilization of the growth in 
imports and that the administration of the 
bilateral agreements and arrangements had 

' OJ L 196 of 30.7.1980. 
Bull. EC 12·1977, points 1.2.1 to 1.2.3. 
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on the whole been satisfactory, despite some 
difficulties. 

Common arrangements for imports 

2.2.16. On 15 July the Council amended1 

its Regulation of 21 December 19781 on 
implementation within the Community of the 
bilateral agreements concluded between the 
Community and certain developing countries 
on trade in textiles. 

The effect of this amendment was to clarify 
and confirm the competence of the Textile 
Committee (composed of Member States' 
representatives and chaired by a Commission 
representative) to deal with requests from 
supplier countries for adjustment of the allo­
cations among Member States. However, 
where such transfers raised problems of 'par­
ticular economic importance' to one or more 
Member States, the Commission would refer 
proposals for amendment of the allocation 
direct to the Council. 

Application of existing 
agreements and a"angements 

2.2.17. In spite of several consultative meet­
ings,' Indonesia and the Community were 
unable to reach agreement on the level of 
quantitative limits on exports of trousers, 
blouses and shirts to the United Kingdom. 

Consequently, in accordance with the provi­
sions of the textile agreement signed on 4 
September 1979 between Indonesia and the 
Community, the Commission adopted on 11 
July a Regulation4 subjecting imports into the 
United Kingdom of trousers, blouses and 
shirts (categories 6, 7, 8) originating in 
Indonesia to provisional quantitative limits in 
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1980. While deciding to impose provisional 
quantitative limits, the Community stressed 
that it was still ready to negotiate with 
Indonesia a mutually acceptable solution con­
cerning exports of the three categories of tex­
tile products in question on to the United 
Kingdom market. 

2.2.18. Under the EEC-Egypt bilateral 
agreement on trade in textile products, the 
Community held consultations with Egypt 
which led to a compromise solution on quan­
titative limits on Egyptian exports of T -shirts 
and table linen on to the United Kingdom 
market. At its meeting on 22 July the Council 
confirmed the Community's agreement on 
the solution adopted.' 

Jute and coir 

2.2.19. On 22 July the Council adopted a 
Regulation6 concerning the arrangements for 
importation into the Benelux countries of jute 
yam originating in Thailand/ The new rules 
enable the voluntary restraint commitment 
entered into by Thailand (limitation of 
exports of jute yam to the Benelux market at 
annual levels specified up to the end of 1983) 
to be put into effect within the Community. 

1 OJ L 185 of 18.7.1980. 
' OJ L 365 of 27.12.1978; Bull. EC 12-1978, point 
2.2.45. 
1 Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.2.20. 
• OJ L 182 of 16.7.1980. 
' OJ L 207 of 9.8.1980. 
• OJ L 198 of 31.7.1980. 

Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.2.23. 
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North-South relations 

2.2.20. The problems involved in relations 
between Community and other industrialized 
countries and developing countries were at 
the centre of international discussions at the 
United Nations General Assembly special ses­
sion on development which opened in New 
York on 25 August. 1 

* 

2.2.21. In an own-initiative opinion2 deliv­
ered on 2 July, the Economic and Social 
Committee said it 'believes that development 
cooperation policy must be chiefly concerned 
with promoting economic and social progress 
in the LDCs. The Committee therefore urges 
the Community to conclude a "social agree­
ment" with all countries with whom it has or 
may conclude cooperation agreements'. 

Generalized preferences 

Scheme for 1981-85 

2.2.22. The Commission has adopted a 
proposal for transmittal to the Council 
regarding the system of generalized tariff pre­
ferences for the period 1981-85 and concern­
ing their application in 1981 to certain pro­
cessed agricultural products, all manufac­
tured and semi-manufactured industrial pro­
ducts and also to certain primary or first­
stage industrial products originating in 
developing countries. This will be the first 
European Communities GSP scheme to be 
implemented under the enabling clause 
approved during the Multilateral Trade 
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Negotiations, which supersedes the need for a 
waiver from GATT as was required during 
the initial ten-year period of application of 
the Community's GSP that ends this year. 

The proposals put forward by the Commis­
sion stem directly from its communication to 
the Council of 7 March' putting forward 
possible guidelines for the application of the 
GSP in the period after 1980, and they also 
make provision for the first time for the 
application of the GSP by Greece, which 
accedes to the Community on 1 January 
1981. As regards such fundamental features 
of the GSP as product coverage, tariff treat­
ment and list of beneficiaries, the Commis­
sion proposals envisage continuity with the 
present system. The Commission also believes 
that the autonomous legal status of the GSP 
must be maintained and that the Communi­
ty's GSP will need to be applied for a further 
20 years, with the framework of the scheme 
being recast every five years, but with the 
possibility of annual adjustments for the pre­
ferential limits. 

The main changes which the Commission 
proposes should be made in the system for 
the period 1981 to 1985 are concentrated in 
the arrangements for industrial products 
other than textiles and are aimed at simplify­
ing the machinery for administering the sys­
tem while at the same time achieving greater 
differentiation in the advantages granted to 
different beneficiary countries; this would 
ensure that for those products where the 
Community cannot contemplate unlimited 
preferential entry, countries genuinely depen­
dent on preferential access would be allowed 
the widest access compatible with the 
economic situation. Furthermore, the Com-

1 Point 2.2.34. 
OJ C 230 of 8.9.1980. 

1 Bull. EC 3-1980, points 1.4.1 to 1.4.7. 

Bull. EC 7/8-1980 



Development 

mission has sought to bring about greater 
transparency and, related to this, greater sec­
urity in using the preferential advantages, 
which should encourage better use of the 
GSP. In future, therefore, products should be 
divided into only two categories-products 
subject to control and non-sensitive products. 
Within the first category only those countries 
w~ich have been identified as strongly com­
petitive in particular products will be subject 
to strictly controlled quotas, while other 
countries will have to face no more than the 
possibility of indicative ceilings being applied. 
As regards the administration of the system 
the Commission has, , moreover, proposed 
that it be delegated the authority to take 
routine decisions on such matters as the 
adjustment of the annual quantitative limits 
under an appropriate management proce­
dure. 

The Commission has also proposed that 
seven primary or first-stage industrial pro­
ducts be brought under the arrangements for 
industrial products and that the bans on 
China and Romania for certain products 
should be lifted. As for textiles the Commis­
sion suggests that the new arrangements 
brought into operation only at the beginning 
of this year should be extended for a further 
year in the first instance to enable their effec­
tiveness to be properly evaluated before any 
changes are considered. With regard to 
agricultural products, the Comm.ission has 
proposed the inclusion of one additional pro­
duct-Basmati rice-whose importance to 
Pakistan was recognized during the negotia­
tion of the 1976 Commercial Cooperation 
Agreement (levy-free quota of 7 000 tonnes 
proposed) and further tariff reductions on 19 
products already included in the GSP. 

For the least developed countries, the Com­
mission has proposed that the virtually com­
plete liberalization under the GSP, i.e. duty-
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free entry for all products and no preferential 
limits except for three agricultural products, 
be maintained and that the list of eligible 
countries be brought up to date in line with 
the United Nations' own modifications. 

Commodities and world agreements 

Tropical timbers 

2.2.23. The Fifth Preparatory Meeting on 
Tropical Timbers held a further session in 
Geneva from 7 to 18 July. 1 It reached conclu­
sions in the following three areas: reafforesta­
tion and forest management, research and 
development, and improved market informa­
tion. 

A paper on the practical implementation of a 
reafforestation programme will be drawn up 
by UNCTAD, FAO and the World Bank and 
presented to the Sixth Preparatory Meeting. 
A highly qualified intergovernmental group 
of experts is to submit a list of specific prior­
ity research and development projects to the 
Sixth Meeting; studies being carried out by 
UNCTAD and FAO with a view to making 
trade information comparable and creating 
an optimum market information flow will be 
submitted to an intergovernmental group of 
experts, who will in turn make recommenda­
tions to the Sixth Meeting. 

The Community took an active part in the 
deliberations and its general positive 
approach to forward-looking, effective pro­
posals contributed to the meeting's success, 
which augurs well for a future international 
arrangement on tropical timbers. 

' Bull. EC 10-1979, point 2.2.22. 
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Cocoa 

2.2.24. On 11 July the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council a communication stres­
sing the political importance of resuming the 
negotiations for the conclusion of an Interna­
tional Cocoa Agreement, after the repeated 
failures which had resulted in the 1975 
Agreement not being renewed when it 
expired in March. 1 

As regards the UNCT AD Secretary-General's 
consultations with the Community, and sub­
sequently with the consumer countries as a 
whole, the Commission in its communication 
proposed that the Council should decide that 
the Community was ready to participate in 
these consultations to assess the chances of 
such an agreement being concluded rapidly. 

On 22 July the Council discussed the attitude 
to be adopted by the Community in future. 

Several ministers of African ACP producing 
countries, which provide the Community 
with 90% of its cocoa supplies, visited Brus­
sels to meet the President of the Council and 
Mr Cheysson in order to make their views 
known to Community representatives before 
the next meeting in Geneva. 

Tin 

2.2.25. A representative of the EEC 
attended the nineteenth session of the Inter­
national Tin Council under the Fifth Interna­
tional Tin Agreement in London on 15 and 
16 July. 

The market situation was described as calm, 
and the statistics are now showing a tendency 
towards a slight surplus. The Tin Council 
received a report from its Economic and Price 
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Review Panel and agreed that the situation 
should be kept under review. The first offer­
ings of surplus tin from the US strategic stock 
to the US market were made under the new 
surplus sales programme on 1 and 15 July, 
but all bids were rejected and no tin was sold. 

The informal consultations aimed at getting 
the negotiating conference on the Sixth Tin 
Agreement reopened, are being pursued. 2 

Aid to non-associated 
developing countries 

2.2.26. As part of a Community aid plan 
for Zimbabwe,' the Commission decided on 
23 July to finance a reconstruction project 
for that country under financial and technical 
aid to non-associated developing countries. 

The project, involving the reconstruction of 
infrastructure in the tribal trust lands, is part 
of a multiannual national programme to set­
tle refugees in the country and get the 
economy on its feet again. The EEC contribu­
tion, which amounts to 4 million EUA, will 
provide equipment for repairs to roads and 
tracks (1.25 million EUA) and for the recon­
struction of cattle dips (2.75 million EUA). 
This financial aid is in addition to the food 
aid (250 tonnes of skimmed milk powder) 
and emergency aid (8 million EUA) alreac-lv 
granted by the EEC to Zimbabwe. 

1 Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.2.23. 
' Bull. EC 5-1980, point 2.2.19. 
' Bull. EC 5-1980, point 2.2.23; Bull. EC 6-1980, point 
2.2.35. 
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Food aid, emergency aid 
and ex~ptlonal aid 

Food aid 

Increasing the effectiveness 
of food aid 

2.2.27. On 1 August the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council a communication on 
ways of increasing the effectiveness of food 
aid. It .proposes integrating the standard 
programme more closely in the overall 
development activities of recipient countries 
while at the same time improving the means 
of responding to unforeseen events. Accord­
ing to the Commission, this should also make 
it possible to programme aid on a multian­
nual basis, use food aid for building up 
stocks in recipient countries and supply pro­
ducts other than cereals, skimmed milk pow­
der and butteroil as food aid. 

Emergency aid 

2.2.28. On 22 July the Council agreed to 
the emergency food aid proposed by the 
Commission for the countries in the Horn of 
Africa and neighbouring countries, namely 
Ethiopia, Somalia, Djibouti, Sudan, Kenya 
and Uganda. This is in response to aid ap­
peals from several governments in the region 
and from international organizations on 
behalf of refugees and drought victims in 
desperate straits. This aid involves 8 000 ton­
nes of skimmed-milk powder, 1250 tonnes 
of butteroil and 1 000 tonnes of sugar. 
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Exceptional aid 

Emergency aid 

2.2.29. On 8 August the Commission 
decided to grant aid of 200 000 EUA to the 
'Boat for Vietnam' organization to help fund 
their assistance programme for refugees in 
th~ China Sea, following a request by that 
organization which chartered a ship, the Cap 
Anamur, to try and pick up refugees in the 
South China Sea. 

2.2.30. On 19 August it also granted excep­
tional aid amounting to 400 000 EUA 
(300 000 EUA to the Catholic Relief Services 
and 100 000 EUA to the League of Red Cross 
Societies) for the purchase and distribution of 
essentials to the victims of Hurricane Allen in 
Haiti. 

Relations with non-governmental 
organizations 

2.2.31. Between 1 January and 31 August 
this year the Commission departments com­
mitted a total of 6 674 400 EUA to cofinance 
85 projects in developing countries presented 
by 44 NGOs. 

2.2.32. The Commission also contributed 
184 695 EUA to ten programmes undertaken 
by ten NGOs to educate public opinion in 
Europe on development matters. 
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International organizations 
and conferences 

United Nations 

General Assembly 

Committee of the Whole 

2.2.33. The United Nations Committee of 
the Whole held its third substantive session 
from 23 June to 4 July to prepare the agenda 
and procedures for the 'global negotiations' 
provided for by General Assembly resolution 
34/138;' the preceding session took place in 
May.2 

Despite strenuous efforts by the participants, 
the Committee .did not succeed in reaching 
agreement on the matters at issue. Indeed it 
was only at this session that the Committee 
began detailed discussion of the question of 
negotiating procedures (covering such deli­
cate aspects as the nature of the final result of 
the negotiations, the extent to which it would 
be binding and relations between the central 
negotiating body and the United Nations 
specialized agencies, both during and after 
the negotiations). 

However, the prevailing impression is that, at 
least so far as the agenda is concerned, a con­
sensus of opinion is within reach on a good 
number of items: the Community spokesman 
expressed this view at the closing meeting of 
the session, adding that the Community 
remained ready to continue its efforts with a 
view to narrowing the gap between divergent 
points of view. 
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Special session: North-South Dialogue 

2.2.34. The eleventh special session of the 
United Nations General Assembly, which was 
devoted to development questions, was held 
at United Nations headquarters in New York 
from 25 August to 15 September. This ses­
sion was to clear the way for the opening of 
the North-South 'global negotiations' and the 
adoption of an international strategy for the 
third development decade. Because of the 
failure to reach agreement, both these matters 
were passed on to the thirty-fifth regular 
session. 

2.2.35. The ground was prepared for the 
negotiations by the Committee of the Whole, 
which in the course of three sessions had suc­
ceeded in narrowing the gap between the var­
ious positions but had failed to reach agree­
ment on the procedures and the agenda for 
the negotiations. An ad hoc Committee has 
taken over the work of finalizing the text on 
the strategy. 

On 18 March the Council, on the basis of a 
Commission communication, had established 
guidelines for the position to be adopted by 
the Community in the preparatory phase of 
the negotiations.3 The European Council, at 
its meeting in Venice on 12 and 13 June,4 had 
stressed the crucial importance of the North­
South Dialogue for the stability of interna­
tional relations. 

In a communication sent to the Council on 
15 July, the Commission put forward new 
proposals for establishing and expressing a 
common position to be adopted by the Nine. 

' Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.2.43. 
Bull. EC 5-1980, point 2.2.29. 

' Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.2.20. 
' Bull. EC 6-1980, points 1.3.2 and 1.3.3. 
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On this basis the Council approved on 22 
July the guidelines for the common position 
to be adopted by the Community and the 
Member States in the General Assembly. It 
pointed out that the General Assembly resol­
ution constituted a whole, the various com­
ponents of which had to be dealt with in a 
coherent and balanced manner, that a com­
prehensive and detailed approach was needed 
to the energy question and that a suitable 
balance should be maintained between the 
central negotiating body and the specialized 
agencies. 

On 27 August the Nine also held a ministe­
rial meeting in New York, attended by Mr 
Cheysson, to finalize the common position on 
questions still outstanding, notably the level 
of official development aid. 

2.2.36. Most of the speakers taking part in 
the general debate at the special session refer­
red to the need to reform the existing 
economic order, to improve the situation of 
the developing countries, notably the least 
developed countries, and to make changes in 
the functioning of international financial 
institutions. 

The Community posltwn was presented by 
Mr Thorn, President of the Council; while 
emphasizing the constraints of the present 
economic situation, he stated that the North­
South Dialogue was of exceptional import­
ance for the stability of international rela­
tions. He appealed for the effective participa­
tion of all countries in the global negotiations 
and affirmed that the Community possessed 
the will to compromise which was necessary 
if outstanding questions were to be settled. 
Referring to the strategy, he stressed that it 
must provide an effective framework for the 
indispensable medium- and long-term adjust­
ment of international economic structures. 
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The three weeks of discussions on the global 
negotiations were entirely taken up with 
questions of procedure, which were generally 
regarded as being the priority issues. The 
Community, which had put forward specific 
proposals at the preparatory stage, made an 
active contribution to the discussions. 

By the end of the session there was virtual 
agreement on certain points of the outline 
procedure, particularly the proposal for a 
preliminary United Nations conference to lay 
down guidelines for the negotiations (with 
the negotiations themselves being left in the 
hands of the appropriate specialized agen­
cies), the concept of a concluding agreement 
which the parties would undertake to imple­
ment and the idea of consensus, which was to 
apply in respect of the entire body of the 
negotiations. However, agreement was not 
reached on the real powers of the conference 
in relation to the specialized agencies, the 
stumbling block being the conception held by 
the Group of 77 of the powers of the confer­
ence, which, in their view, should 'conduct' 
the main negotiations and should also have 
the right to examine-and even re­
examine-the results arrived at by the vari­
ous agencies. 

The Community, in company with all the 
industrialized countries, continually urged the 
need to preserve the powers of the existing 
agencies, principally those set up under the 
Bretton Woods agreements. In the closing 
stages of the special session the chairman of 
the Working Party on the global negotiations 
put forward a compromise text which, 
though still offering a slightly ambiguous 
definition of the conference's powers, was 
acceptable to all but two of the Community's 
Member States, the position of these two 
being aligned on that of the United States. 
The text was also acceptable to the Group of 
77. In view of the failure to reach a consen-
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sus, the special session referred the whole 
question of the global negotiations (proce­
dure and agenda) to the thirty-fifth regular 
session. The Community stated that it con­
tinued to attach high importance to the pro­
posed global negotiations and would con­
tinue to work for their success. 

The thirty-fifth session of the Assembly will 
also have to take a decision on the develop­
ment strategy, the draft which was completed 
at the special session but not formally 
adopted. 

To sum up, the failure of the eleventh special 
session of the General Assembly to carry out 
the twofold task it had been given dearly 
reflects the importance of what is at stake in 
the global negotiations and hence the diffi­
culty of devising a format that will accommo­
date the interests and ideas of the -various 
partners. 

Economic and Social Council 

2.2.3 7. The summer session of the United 
Nations Economic and Social Council was 
held in Geneva from 3 to 25 July; it ended 
with the adoption, mostly by consensus, of a 
large number of resolutions concerning the 
work of the United Nations system and other 
issues. The session was dominated by the 
question of international assistance for 
refugees, displaced persons (notably in 
Somalia, Ethiopia and elsewhere in Africa) 
and other victims of disasters arising from 
non-natural causes, and the issue of special 
economic assistance for certain countries. 

Another important resolution was that con­
cerning food problems. This text invites all 
countries to make efforts to avoid protection-
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ist policies on food imports and stresses the 
urgent need for a new International Wheat 
Agreement. 

In the industrial cooperation field the Council 
approved the programme of work adopted 
for UNIDO by the Industrial Development 
Board in May this year. 1 The Council thus 
gave its approval to the permanency of the 
system of consultations which will act as a 
forum for organized contacts and consulta­
tions between developed and developing 
countries in various industrial sectors. 

A resolution on the role of transnational 
companies in the establishment of the new 
international economic order was adopted by 
consensus but a second resolution on their 
activities in South Africa was adopted by 
majority vote, with Member States of the 
Community voting against or abstaining. 

During the general debate the representatives 
of the Presidency and the Commission made 
statements on behalf of the Community. The 
Commission representative gave a description 
of the various forms of Community aid to 
developing countries and commented on the 
negotiations in progress within the UN sys­
tem, particularly those relating to preparation 
of the global negotiations on international 
economic cooperation for development.2 He 
thought that during the preparatory meetings 
positions had come closer together on the 
content of the agenda in the areas of energy, 
food, transfer of resources and industrializa­
tion. 

' Bull. EC 5-1980, point 2.2.31. 
Point 2.2.35. 
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United Nations Conference 
on the Law of the Sea 

2.2.38. The Third Conference on the Law 
of the Sea held the second part of its ninth 
session in Geneva from 28 July to 29 August. 
The Conference concluded its work by pub­
lishing a revised version (the third) of the text 
which has now been given the title 'Draft 
Convention on the Law of the Sea (unofficial 
text)'. 
This draft incorporates the progress made in 
the fields of 'general provisions', 'final 
clauses' and the sectors covered by the three 
commissions, notably by the commission 
dealing with Part XI of the Convention, relat­
ing to 'the international zone. A tenth session 
of the Conference will be required, however, 
before the Convention is signed in Caracas in 
September 1981. The Drafting Committee 
will have to meet in New York for a few 
weeks (January-February 1981) in order to 
harmonize the different language versions of 
the text and a regular session of six weeks 
has been planned for the conclusion of the 
negotiations. This regular session could take 
place in New York. At the ninth session, the 
Community kept up its contacts with non­
member countries concerning the participa­
tion clause, which will be on the agenda at 
the next session. 

As in the general discussion at preceding ses­
sions, the Netherlands spoke on behalf of the 
Community and each Member State referred 
to the Community's need for the inclusion in 
the future Convention of a clause authorizing 
the accession of the Community as such. 

World Conference of the United 
Nations Decade for Women 

2.2.39. The Community participated in the 
World Conference of the United Nations De-
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cade for Women, which was held in Copen­
hagen from 14 to 31 July. In a statement to 
the Conference, Mr Vredeling, Vice-President 
of the Commission, r~ferred to the progress 
made in the Community and to the obstacles 
encountered with regard to the abolition of 
sex discrimination in employment. The 
Community delegation included two Mem­
bers of Parliament. 

General Agreement 
on Tariffs and Trade (GA TI) 

Textiles Committee 

2.2.40. The GATT Textiles Committee met 
in Geneva on 8 and 9 July to examine the 
report' of the Textiles Surveillance Body (TSB) 
on the variations contained in bilateral textile 
agreements from the provisions of Annex B 
to the Multifibre Arrangement (MFA) and 
the report of the working party on restruc­
turing measures. 

The Indian delegate, speaking on behalf of 
the exporting countries, stressed in particular 
that a balance must be observed between the 
right to take safeguard measures and the obli­
gations deriving from Annex B to the MFA, 
that a return should be made as speedily as 
possible to normal application of the MFA 
and that the importing countries should 
continue their restructuring programmes. 

The Community representatives drew atten­
tion to the persistence of difficulties in the 
textile industry and pointed out that after 
two years it was still too early to make a val­
id assessment of the effects of the restruc­
turing operations. The Commission has, 
moreover, reported along these lines in a 
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communication to the Council on the func­
tioning of the MFA.' 

At the end of its discussions the Committee 
agreed to continue the work of preparing the 
ground for the major review of the function­
ing of the MFA taking particular account of 
production growth since 1973 and of produc­
tivity and employment. The Committee also 
agreed that the report on restructuring mea­
sures should be supplemented by contribu­
tions from the participating countries not re­
presented in the report and should be backed 
up by a study and evaluation of all the infor­
mation obtained. 

Committee on Tariff Concessions 

2.2.41. The Committee on Tariff Conces­
sions, which was set up after the Tokyo 
Round to supervise the updating of tariff 
lists, ensures that cuts are made in customs 
duties and provide a forum for discussion 
and issues relating to customs duties, met on 
7 July. After examining the progress made in 
ratification and implementation, the Commit­
tee adopted detailed procedures for establish­
ing an integrated system to simplify the up­
dating of all tariff concessions. 

In the light of the growth of certain tariff re­
classification procedures (notably in the Uni­
ted States) involving the danger of increases 
in duties for products falling within bound 
tariff headings, the Committee agreed to ask 
the ~A~ Sec~etariat to carry out a study 
deahng m particular with procedures to be 
followed. Lastly, there was support from ma­
ny coll:ntries for the proposal that the study 
on tanff matters should be carried a stage 
further by extending it to countries other 
than those which provided the basis for tariff 
data in the Tokyo Round. 
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Working Party on the accession 
of Greece to the Community 

2.2.42. The GATT Working Party set up to 
examine the Act of Accession of Greece to 
the Community in the light of the provisions 
of the General Agreement met on 24 June 
and 14 July. It carried out an initial examina­
tion of the effects of accession, on the basis of 
the replies given by the Community and 
Greece to questions posed by non-member 
countries. 

Committee on Technical Barriers to Trade 

2.2.43. The Committee held a further meet­
ingl on 22 July to examine whether the Code 
on technical barriers to trade could be ap­
plied in the dispute between the Community 
and the United States concerning the latter's 
exports of poultry to the United Kingdom. As 
the Committee failed to reach a consensus, 
the United States decided to raise the matter 
before another GATT body. There was also 
some discussion of the possible accession of 
Bulgaria to the Code. 

Committee on Trade and 
Development (CTD) 

2.2.44. The CTD held a further meeting3 on 
10 July. The discussion ranged over the fol­
lowing topics: implementation and applica­
tion of Part IV of the General Agreement; 
comprehensive examination of the trend of 

' Point 2.2.15. 
Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.2.47. 

' Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.2.45. 
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international trade; liberalization of trade; 
restructuring measures. A temporary subcom­
mittee (to function until the end of 1981) was 
set up on the trade of the least developed 
countries. The CTD subcommittee which had 
been given the task of examining measures of 
protection affecting the developing countries 
held its first meeting on 1 and 2 July. At this 
meeting, reference was made to certain safe­
guard measures taken by the Community. 

Consultations 

2.2.45. On 17 July the Commission sent a 
report to the Council on the progress of the 
GAIT Article XXIII-I consultations on Uni­
ted States exports of synthetic fibres, which 
the Commission has been conducting with 
the American authorities since October 1979. 
At its meeting on 22 July the Council took 
note of this report and called on the Commis­
sion to pursue the consultations vigorously. 

Organization for Economic 
Cooperation and Development 

Steel Committee 

2.2.46. The Commission took part in a 
meeting of the OECD Steel Committee in 
Paris on 22 and 23 July. The meeting exam­
ined the situation of the steel industry in the 
Community, Spain, Portugal and Switz­
erland. The Committee also discussed the 
OECD symposium which was held in Paris 
on 27 and 28 February' and examined its 
programme of activity for 1981. 
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EFT A countries 

Switzerland 

2.2.47. In preparation for Greece's acces­
sion to the Communities on 1 January 1981, 
additional protocols to the free trade agree­
ments between the EEC and the ECSC and 
Switzerland, and also a supplementary proto­
col extending the ECSC additional protocol 
to Liechtenstein, were signed on 17 July.1 

Norway 

2.2.48. At the invitation of the Norwegian 
Government the Commission President, Mr 
Jenkins, paid an official visit to Norway on 3 
and 4 July. He was received in audience by 
HM the King and had talks with the Prime 
Minister, Mr Nordli, the Foreign Minister, 
Mr Frydenlund, the Minister for Finance, Mr 
Kleppe, and senior officials from a number of 
government departments. 

The conversations covered two main areas: 
first, a review of the state of economic and 
trade relations between Norway and the 
Community; second, developments in the 
Community and their impact on Norway. It 
was noted that trade and economic relations 
had developed in a very positive way and that 
the wish to extend cooperation to new areas 
existed on both sides. Mr Jenkins underlined 
that the Community wished to strengthen its 
ties with the Scandinavian countries at the 
same time as the Community was being en­
larged by the accession of Greece, and later 
on Portugal and Spain. 

' Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.2.45. 
Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.2.56. 
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United States 

2.2.49. As part of the cooperation on the 
environment' established between the 
Commission and the United States in 1974, a 
bilateral meeting was held in Washington 
from 23 to 25 July. At this meeting views 
were exchanged on the state of the environ­
ment in the Community and in the United 
States and on the policies being pursued; the 
delegations also took stock of the application 
of the Toxic Substances Control Act, the 
Directive of 18 September 19792 amending 
for the sixth time the Directive of 1967' on 
dangerous substances, and the bilateral coop­
eration on the problem of noise. In this 
sphere, the two delegations examined the 
positive results of the comparative work on 
methods of measuring the noise from 
compressors and it was agreed that the re­
sults would be published this autumn. 

The two delegations also examined the prob­
lems of transboundary pollution, such as acid 
rains and chlorofluorocarbons. 

2.2.50. On 11 July Parliament adopted a 
resolution4 on relations between the EEC and 
the United States concerning iron and steel.' 

Canada 

2.2.51. A Commission delegation went to 
Ottawa from 21 to 25 July to discuss certain 
problems concerning relations between the 
Community and Canada. The discussions 
centred on proposed Canadian legislation on 
trade marks (which would have important ef­
fects for European registered designations of 
origin) and on the policy of the Canadian 
Provincial Liquor Control Board. Other top­
ics, including Canadian restrictions on 
footwear imports and anti-dumping action 
taken against Community firms which were 
trying to import a certain type of electric gen-
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erator, were.raised when the delegation visit­
ed senior Canadian officials. 

2.2.52. A further bilateral meeting between 
the Commission and Canada was held in Ot­
tawa on 7 July as part of the cooperation on 
the environment established in 1975. It was 
followed by discussions with the representa­
tives of the federal and provincial authorities 
in Quebec and Ontario. This meeting and the 
ensuing discussions enabled a wide-ranging 
exchange of views to be held on the state of 
the environment in the Community and in 
Canada. The many subjects dealt with inclu­
ded: the problem of pollution of the aquatic 
environment, in particular the dumping of 
toxic substances; procedures for environmen­
tal impact studies; oil pollution; waste; cli­
matology; and chlorofluorocarbons. 
The two parties paid particular attention to 
the control of chemicals and atmospheric pol­
lution-in particular the problems of acid 
rain and the effects of an increase in coal pro­
duction; it was agreed that cooperation on 
these two matters would be stepped up in 
view of the work in progress on chemicals at 
the OECD and also the implementation of 
the Convention on Long-range Transboun­
dary Air Pollution signed in Geneva in Nov­
ember 1979.6 

Japan 

2.2.53. On 17 July the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council a communication re­
examining the Community's trade policy vis­
a-vis Japan.' 

1 Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.2.39. 
OJ L 259 of 15.10.1979. 

1 OJ 196 of 16.8.1967. 
• OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
' Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.2.51. 
' Bull. EC 11-1979, point 2.1.59. 
' Point 1.2.1 to 1.2.4. 
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2.2.54. Mr Haferkamp represented the 
Commission at the ceremonies organized in 
Tokyo on 9 July following the death of the 
Prime Minister, Mr Ohira. He had discus­
sions with a number of leading Japanese fig­
ures and with ministers from several other 
countries during his visit. 

Australia 

2.2.5~. On 15 July Mr Gundelach had 
discussions in Canberra with the Australian 
Deputy Prime Minister, Mr Anthony, and the 
Minister for Primary Industries, Mr Nixon. 
Discussion was concentrated on agricultural 
topics: the negotiation of a voluntary res­
traint agreement for Australian sheepmeat 
exports to the Community; imports of frozen 
beef for processing under the Community's 
1980 balance; the Community's sugar policy 
and the world sugar market. It was agreed 
that further discussions would take place on 
these subjects in the coming months. 

New Zealand 

2.2.56. Mr Gundelach visited New Zealand 
from 15 to 18 July for discussions with the 
Prime Minister, Mr Muldoon, and other 
members of the Government. The principal 
item considered was the terms of the volun­
tary restraint agreement for New Zealand 
sheepmeat exports to the Community. A 
substantial measure of agreement was rea­
ched. New Zealand butter exports to the 
Community were also discussed. 
At the Council meeting (Agriculture) on 22 
July Mr Gundelach reported on his talks with 
the New Zealand authorities. In the case of 
the voluntary restraint arrangement for 
sheepmeat, although the majority of delega­
tions could accept the results achieved, 
France and Ireland raised a number of issues. 
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It was agreed that the matter would be con­
sidered further at the Council's next meeting. 
As regards New Zealand butter exports in 
1980, the Council agreed-on a proposal 
from the Commission transmitted on 4 July 1 

-to amend the terms on which New Zealand 
currently enjoys access to the United King­
dom market (by increasing the amount of 
revenue to New Zealand, expressed as a per­
centage of the intervention price, given a 
20 000 tonn6 reduction in New Zealand 
exports in 1980). 
However, because of a reservation on the 
part of France, it was not possible to give ef­
fect to the proposal as yet. 
Still with regard to butter, the Commission 
also transmitted to the Council on 4 July a 
proposal concerning the extension of New 
Zealand butter imports on special terms 
beyond 31 December 1980. 1 

Mediterranean countries 

Financial aid 

2.2.57. On 7 August the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council a communication on 
the renewal of the Community's financial aid 
to the Maghreb countries (Algeria, Morocco 
and Tunisia), the Mashreq countries (Egypt, 
Jordan, Lebanon and Syria), Israel, Malta 
and Cyprus. 
The Community is linked to these countries 
by a series of cooperation agreements under 
which it is committed to providing them with 
financial aid, up to certain ceilings, for a 
specified period expiring on 31 October 
1981. The purpose of this communication is 
to establish the guidelines which the Commu­
nity should follow in fixing the amount and 

' OJ C 193 of 31.7.1980. 
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terms of its financial aid to the ten countries 
for a further period and to formulate appro­
priate negotiating directives for the Commis­
sion. 

Cyprus 

2.2.58. On 7 August the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council a communication on 
the transition to the second stage of the EEC­
Cyprus Association Agreement, together with 
a recommendation for a decision authorizing 
negotiations to be opened with Cyprus. The 
transition to the second stage would come 
about in 1981, but the gradual establishment 
of customs union, which is the final goal of 
the Association Agreement, would only begin 
on 1 July 1984, to be completed five years 
later in 1989. 

Yugoslavia 

2.2.59. The Interim Agreement between the 
European Economic Community and Yugo­
slavia on trade and commercial cooperation, 
and the Interim Protocol for the advance im­
plementation of financial cooperation, 1 en­
tered into force on 1 July.2 

Developing countries 

ACP States and OCT 

ACP-EEC Convention 

Accessions 

2.2.60. On 16 July the Commission trans­
mitted to the Council a report on the prelimi-
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nary discussions which took place in Brussels 
on 26 June with a delegation from Zim­
babwe, together with proposals for drawing 
up special directives to negotiate an agree­
ment with the Republic of Zimbabwe for its 
accession to the second ACP-EEC Conven­
tion of Lome.' 

At its meeting on 22 July the Council confir­
med the fundamental importance which it at­
tached to Zimbabwe's accession to the Lome 
Convention. 4 

Export earnings 

Stabex 

2.2.61. On 2 July the Commission took the 
following transfer decisions for 1979: 

• Under the export earnings stabilization 
system introduced by the Lome Convention : 

Recapaent 
ACP State 

Benin 

Cape Verde 
Central 
African 
Republic 
Chad 

Gambia 
Gambia 

Product 

Cotton, not carded or 
combed 
Bananas 
Cotton, not carded or 
combed 

Cotton, not carded or 
combed 
Groundnut oil 
Groundnut oilcake 

Amount 
on EUA 

349 246 
429 352 

3 846 980 

2 664 588 
3 999 947 
1 026 143 

' OJ L 130 of 27.5.1980; Bull. EC 2-1980, points 1.2.1 
and 1.2.3. 
' OJ L 139 of 5.6.1980. 
' Bull. EC 4-1980, points 1.4.1 to 1.4.6; Bull. EC 
5-1980, point 2.2.53. 
' At its 15-16 September meetmg the Council approved 
new negotiating directives. 
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Guinea-Bissau Groundnuts, shelled 
or not 2 480 509 

Madagascar Vanilla 2 845 088 

Mali Groundnuts, shelled 
or not 3 894 154 

Sudan Groundnuts, shelled 
or not 27190125 

Swaziland Iron ore 4 365 532 
Tonga Vanilla 58 632 

Uganda Cotton, not carded or 
combed 3 806 872 

Uganda Tea 3 093 453 

60 050 621 

• Under the export earnings stabilization 
system set up by the Council Decision on the 
association of the OCT to the EEC and by 
the Lome Convention : 

Rec1paenr 
ACP State 

Comoros 
Dominica 

Cloves 
Bananas 

Product 

European Development Fund 

Amount 
m EUA 

431155 
2 892 944 

3 324 099 

2.2.62. In July and August the Commission 
decided to finance projects involving a total 
cost of 45 644 000 EUA, broken down as 
follows: 

Industrialization 
Rural production 
Water engineering, urban 
works, housing 
Exceptional aid 
Other 
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(EUA) 

10 980000 
7 844 000 

12 320 000 
10500000 
4 000 000 

45 644 000 

State-trading countries ................. 

StatEt-trading countries 

Romantia 

2.2.63. On 28 July the Community and Ro­
mania signed two agreements in Bucharest, 
one 0111 trade in industrial products and the 
other on the setting-up of a joint committee. 1 

These texts were negotiated between Feb­
ruary 1979 and June this year; the first was 
initialled on 8 February2 and the second on 
27. June. 1 

Council for Mutual 
Economic Assistance 

2.2.64. As suggested by_ Mr Haferkamp in a 
letter dated 27 March to Mr Faddeyev, Secre­
tary oJ: the Council for Mutual Economic As­
sistan<:e (CMEA), a second meeting of the 
expert-level drafting committee took place in 
Geneva in July (the first was held on 4 and 5 
March): The committee continued drafting 
an agreement between the CMEA and the 
Community, which had been started at the 
previous session, and among other things 
started looking at certain points of disagree­
ment between the parties. The committee was 
unable· to complete its work owing to lack of 
time, :md Mr Haferkamp has therefore pro­
posed, in a telex dated 29 July, that the 
experts should meet again in October. The 
CMEA agreed, and the meeting is to begin in 
Geneva on 15 October. 

1 Points 1.4.1 to 1.4.9. 
Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.2.70. 

1 Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.2.75. 
• Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.2.64. 
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Diplomatic relations 

2.2.65. The President of the Council and 
the President of the Commission received 
Their Excellencies Mrs Carmen Yvonne Par­
ris and Mr Alfred Raoul, who presented their 
letters of credence in their capacity as Heads 
of the Missions of Jamaica and of the Peo­
ple's Republic of the Congo respectively to 
the European Economic Community, with ef­
fect from 23 July.' 

They also received Their Excellencies Mr 
George R.E. Bullen (Grenada), Mr Jean­
Louis Psimhis (Central African Republic), Mr 
Hasan Abu Nimah (Hashemite Kingdom of 
Jordan) and Mr Abdel-Aziz Hamzaoui (Re­
public of Tunisia), who presented their letters 
of credence in their capacity as Heads of their 
respective countries' Missions of the Euro­
pean Communities, again with effect from 23 
July.' 

The new Ambassadors of Jamaica, Central 
African Republic, Congo, Jordan and Tunisia 
succeed Mr Donald B. Rainford, Mr Nestor 
Kombot-Naguemon, Mr Alphonse Ongagou­
Datchou, Mr T aher Masri and Mr M'hamed 
Essaafi, who have been assigned to other du­
ties. Mr Bullen is Grenada's first Head of 
Mission to the Communities, and his ap­
pointment brings the number of diplomatic 
missions to the Communities to 118. 

European political cooperation 

Declaration by the Nine following 
the ASEAN ministerial conference 

2.2.66. On the occasion of the political 
cooperation meeting in Luxembourg on 2 

84 

Political cooperation 

July the Presidency released the following 
statement concerning the conference of 
foreign ministers of the members of the Associ­
ation of South-East Asian NatioQs, which took 
place in Kuala Lumpur on 25 and 26 June: 

'The nine governments of the European Commu­
nity, bound to the ASEAN governments by deep 
and growing ties of friendship and cooperation, 
have followed with close attention and interest the 
outcome of the meeting of the Ministers of Foreign 
Affairs of the ASEAN countries held in Kuala 
Lumpur from 25 to 26 June. 

The nine governments of the European Commun­
ity wish to express their support for the principles 
which inspired the work and the results of that in­
ternational meeting. They consider that these prin­
ciples are in keeping with those contained in the 
joint statement on political issues which was ap­
proved by the Ministers of Foreign Affairs of the 
EEC and ASEAN in Kuala Lumpur on 8 March 
1980.' 

On this basis, the nine governments of the Euro­
pean Community intend to reaffirm their joint 
commitment with the ASEAN countries for world 
peace, international cooperation and understand­
ing, economic development, social justice and hu­
man rights and their joint conviction that all gov­
ernments should base their international conduct 
on principles embodying the respect for sovereign­
ty, territorial integrity, the independence of States, 
the non-resort to force or threat of the use of force 
and non-interference in the internal affairs of other 
States. 

Therefore the nine countries of the European 
Community, together with the ASEAN countries, 
have repeatedly expressed their deep concern cau­
sed by the Vietnamese intervention in Cambodia 
and warned against the danger that the conflict in 
that country might spread to other countries in the 
region. They join the ASEAN governments in de­
ploring the violation by Vietnamese troops of the 

' OJ C 204 of 9.8.1980. 
Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.2.66. 
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territorial integrity and national sovereignty of 
Thailand, which has resulted in an increase in ten­
sion, may constitute a threat to the stability of 
South-East Asia as a whole and causes still further 
grief and suffering to populations already tried. 

The nine countries of the European Community 
subscribe to the appeal launched by the United 
Nations Secretary General for the re-establishment 
in the area of the peace and stability necessary for 
the continued implementation of humanitarian aid 
programmes which recently received new impetus 
from the international meeting in Geneva of relief 
assistance to the Cambodian people.'' 

Special ministerial meeting 

2.2.67. A special political cooperation 
meeting at ministerial level was held in 
Luxembourg on 4 July with Mr Thorn in the 
chair. Mr Genscher, Foreign Minister of the 
Federal Republic of Germany, reported to his 
colleagues on the visit of Chancellor Schmidt 
to Moscow on 30 June and 1 July, and on 
the Chancellor's talks with Mr Brezhnev. 

Ministerial meeting 

2.2.68. A political cooperation meeting at 
ministerial level was held in Brussels on 22 
July, complementing the Council meeting on 
foreign affairs. The political cooperation 
meeting was devoted in the main to the posi­
tion to be adopted by the Community at the 
UN General Assembly special session on the 
Palestine issue and the finalization of Mr 
Thorn's contact mission, following upon the 
declaration on the Middle East issued by the 
European Council at its Venice meeting on 
12 and 13 June. Mr Thorn's mission took 
him to Tunisia (29-30 July), Israel (31 July-
1August), Lebanon (4-5 August), Syria (6-7 
August), Jordan (7-10 August), Kuwait (19 
August), Iraq (20 August), Saudi Arabia (23 
August) and Egypt (30-31 August). 
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Stand taken by the Community 
on the Palestine issue before 
the United Nations General Assembly 

Address by Mr Thorn 

2.2.6~'. Speaking on 24 July at th"e UN Ge­
neral Assembly special session on the Pales­
tinian problem, Mr Thorn, President of the 
Coundl and of European political coopera­
tion, made the following statement on behalf 
of the Community: 

'The nine member countries of the European 
Community, on whose behalf I have the honour to 
addres1; you today, have watched with distress the 
developments taking place in this tormented re­
gion. They deeply regret the hardening of positions 
on both sides, whereas only dialogue and a spirit 
of und·erstanding can clear the way to peace. 

They have frequently made known their views be­
fore this Assembly through a joint spokesman or 
the heads of the individual delegations. 

They consider today that it is more important than 
ever that Europe should make itself heard and 
work in a more concrete way for a return to peace. 
That i:; the aim of the declaration issued on 13 
June' by the nine countries of the European 
Community after the European Council meeting at 
Venice. 

Quite clearly-and I should like to stress this 
point--the statement by the nine member coun­
tries of the European Community is fundamentally 
rooted in their concern to promote and encourage 
a comprehensive solution to the Israel-Arab 
conflict. In this connection the Nine are deter­
mined to encourage all positive initiatives what­
ever their sources. 

But tht~y consider that the close traditional ties and 
common interests binding Europe to the Middle 
East compel them to enter the search for a peace­
ful sol11tion. 

' Bull. EC 5-1980, point 2.2.4. 
Bull. EC 6-1980, point 1.1.6. 
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Too much passion, suffering and hate has accumu­
lated in a land which had seemed promised a fut­
ure of concord and fraternity between its peoples. 
It is time for an end to the language of violence 
and for all the parties to start talking to one 
another as equals. And it is time to move from 
rhetoric to the negotiation of terms and arrange­
ments for restoring peace. 

It is in this context that the declaration issued at 
Venice is to be regarded. There must be an end to 
ambiguities and a coming to terms with the reali­
ties which we have been only too inclined to fudge 
hitherto. Those realities are the State of Israel and 
the Palestinian people. The solution to the Middle 
Eastern problem lies in reconciling these two es­
sential. realities and enabling them to coexist. 

In the view of the nine member countries of the 
European Community, two fundamental principles 
rule the search for a comprehensive peace settle­
ment: 
• the right to existence and security of all States 
in the region, including Israel; 

• justice for all the peoples, which implies recog­
nition of the legitimate rights of the Palestinian 
people. 

Everything follows logically from this basic re­
quirement. Firstly, as set out in the Venice declara­
tion, "all the countries in the area are entitled to 
live in peace within secure, recognized and guaran­
teed borders. The necessary guarantees for a peace 
settlement should be provided by the UN by a de­
cision of the Security Council and, if necessary, on 
the basis of other mutually agreed procedures. The 
Nine declare that they are prepared to participate 
within the framework of a comprehensive settle­
ment in a system of concrete and binding interna­
tional guarantees, including (guarantees) on the 
ground". 

Secondly, "a just solution must finally be found to 
the Palestinian problem, which is not simply one 
of refugees. The Palestinian people, who are 
conscious of existing as such, must be placed in a 
position, by an appropriate process defined within 
the framework of the comprehensive peace settle­
ment, to exercise fully their right to self­
determination". 

The negotiations which are to lead to a compre­
hensive peace settlement will be based on the 
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recognition and implementation of Israel's right to 
existence and security and the right of the Pales­
tinian people to self-determination. Within the fra­
mework of the settlement Israel will have to put an 
end to the territorial occupation which it has 
maintained since the conflict of 1967. Under such 
a settlement it will also be possible to define fron­
tiers for the State of Israel which will be interna­
tionally recognized and guaranteed. 

The Nine are convinced that no comprehensive 
and lasting peace settlement is possible in the Mid­
dle East if the occupation of territories by force 
continues. 

They are also convinced that the Israeli settlements 
constitute a serious obstacle to the peace process. 
Likewise recognizing the special significance of the 
question of Jerusalem for all the parties concerned, 
they will not accept any initiative designed to 
change that city's status, and stress that any agree­
ment on its status should guarantee freedom of ac­
cess to the Holy Places for everyone. 

The Nine consider the renunciation of violence a 
precondition for constructive negotiations. It is 
necessary to create a climate of trust, which is vital 
if a just and equitable solution is to be found to 
the conflict in the Middle East. 

Those are the bases and principles upon which the 
member countries of the European Community 
will endeavour to seek a peace settlement. These 
principles apply to all the parties concerned, and 
that includes the Palestinian people and the PLO, 
which will have to be involved in the negotiations. 

The Nine have decided to establish the necessary 
contacts with those parties to find out how they 
stand and to determine, in the light of the outcome 
of the consultations, what form an initiative on 
their part might take. 

The day before yesterday the foreign ministers of 
the European Community approved the detailed 
arrangements for the round of contacts which I am 
to have the privilege-and also the grave responsi­
bility- of conducting personally in my capacity as 
current President of the Council. I will be setting 
off shortly, and the Nine are aware that the 
contacts with all the parties concerned will be im­
bued with the feelings of friendship and coopera­
tion which characterize the traditional links 
between Europe and the Middle East. 
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I have just indicated the standpoint and concerns 
of the nine member countries of the European 
Community on the conflict in the Middle East. It 
is on that basis that those countries will be partici­
pating in this session. Unfortunately they do not 
feel that the draft resolution which has been distri­
buted contributes to the search for a comprehen­
sive, just and lasting solution which they advocate. 

As you are aware, the Nine have always supported 
Security Council resolution 242, and continue to 
do so vigorously. They recognize that the resolu­
tion has shortcomings, particularly with regard to 
the Palestinian people, and they have made their 
attitude on that point known several times. Never­
theless, despite that failing, the basic principles set 
out in resolution 242 remain fundamentally rele­
vant to any settlement of the conflict. It would 
therefore be essential for any resolution adopted 
during this session to refer explicitly to resolution 
242 and not to contradict it, as would be the case 
if Israel were simply exhorted and invited to nego­
tiate without being offered the necessary guaran­
tees for its existence. 

The Nine will determine their votes in this session 
in accordance with the general criteria I have just 
indicated. But I should like to express the hope 
that the results of this session will ultimately 
contribute to pacification rather than confronta­
tion. 

The Nine are convinced that only through negotia­
tion can peace be restored to a region which has 
suffered all too greatly from bloody strife. 

In conclusion, I should like to emphasize the will 
of Europe, as an independent, unanimous and 
committed political force, to work in a concrete 
way for a return to peace, and to do this we must 
create a climate of trust, in other words abandon 
all extremist positions. I shall be calling upon all 
those I meet to show understanding and engage in 
dialogue, in the conviction that this will pave the 
way towards peace.' 

The Nine abstain 
in the vote on the resolution 

2.2. 70. On 30 July the Nine abstained from 
voting on the resolution submitted to the UN 
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General Assembly special session on the 
Palestinian question. Luxembourg's Perma­
nent Representative to the United Nations 
made the following statement: 

'Only a few days ago Mr Gaston Thorn put to this 
Assembly the position of the Nine,' and in particu­
lar described the general criteria set down in the 
Venice Declaration of 13 June as indispensable to 
a comprehensive, just and equitable peace in the 
Middl•= East, to which the countries of the Euro­
pean Community attach vital importance. 

Since the resolutions, by virtue either of what they 
contain or of what they omit, are not in accor­
dance with the Venice Declaration or Security 
Council resolution 242, they obviously cannot be 
accepted as they stand by the Governments of the 
Nine. 

The Nine intend to put their whole weight behind 
this diUicult task, and they feel that their tradition­
al ties of friendship with all the countries of the 
Middl•: East justify an initiative on their part. The 
nine member countries of the European Commun­
ity did not wish to prejudice in any way the round 
of contacts to be undertaken shortly by their cur­
rent P1·esident. 

The Nine abstained from the vote because they did 
not wish to pass judgment on the substance of the 
reso!Uitions. Their position, I repeat, was stated in 
the Venice Declaration. By voting as they did, they 
wished to demonstrate clearly their intention not 
to pass judgment on the eve of the talks which the 
head of their delegation is to hold with all parties 
in a full and friendly manner.' 

Ministerial meeting 

2.2. 7.1. On the occasion of the UN General 
Assembly session the Foreign Ministers of the 
Nine met in NewYork on 26 August for a 
political cooperation meeting to discuss the 
situation in Poland among other items. 

' Point 2.2.69. 
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2.2.72. On 11 July Parliament adopted four 
resolutions' on the following European politi­
cal cooperation issues: aid for refugees in the 
South China Sea; the plight of the refugees, 
particularly the children among them, in the 
Horn of Africa; frontier incidents between 
Vietnamese troops from Cambodia and Thai 
troops in Thailand; and the severe violations 
of human rights and international law by the 
Argentinian military junta. 

1 Point 2.3.15; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
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3. Institutional 
and political matters 

Institutional developments 
and European policy 

Action to be taken on the report 
by the Three Wise Men 

2.3.1. At an informal meeting on 22 July on 
the sidelines of the Council meeting (Foreign 
Affairs), the Ministers considered a draft 
report on the report prepared by the Com­
mittee of Wise Men. Following a brief 
exchange of views, the Ministers referred the 
report back to the Permanent Representa­
tives, who had originally prepared it. The 
Ministers expect to clear the matter finally at 
their mid-September meeting.' 

Three European figures-Me Biesheuvel, Mr 
Dell and Mr Marjolin-were instructed by 
the European Council (Brussels, 4 and 5 
December 1978)2 to prepare the Report on 
the European institutions which they offi­
cially submitted to the Dublin European 
Council on 29 and 30 November 1979.3 They 
were asked to produce specific proposals to 
ensure the smooth operation of the Com­
munities on the basis of and in compliance 
with the Treaties, including their institutional 
systems, and progress towards European 
Union. 

Since November 1979 the main points of the 
report by the Three Wise Men have been 
studied by the Permanent Representatives, 
the State Secretaries for Foreign Affairs of the 

1 When they met in the Council on 15 and 16 Sept­
ember, the Ministers of Foreign Affairs approved the 
report for the European Council concerning the report of 
the Committee of Wise Men. 
' Bull. EC 12-1978, point 2.3.1. 
1 Bull. EC 11-1979, points 1.1.11, 1.5.1 and 1.5.2. 
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Nine-at an informal meeting held at Varese 
on 8 February'-and also by the Foreign 
Ministers at informal meetings on 17 March2 

and 22 July. 

Relations between Parliament 
and the Economic and Social Committee 

2.3.2. Closer cooperation between Parlia­
ment and the Economic and Social Commit­
tee was called for by the Presidents of the two 
institutions at the Committee's session in 
Brussels on 2 and 3 July. 

Mrs Veil, President of the European Parlia­
ment, hagan by emphasizing that this was the 
first time in the Community's history that a 
President of Parliament had been invited to 
address the Economic and Social Committee. 
She saw her visit as a sign of the will of the 
Economic and Social Committee and of Parli­
ament, while respecting each other's auton­
omy and specific character, to work together 
towards strengthening the Community in the 
difficult times they were traversing. 

Parliament, she said, wanted to cooperate 
more closely with the Economic and Social 
Committee, as recommended in the report of 
the Three Wise Men. The aim of such coop­
eration would be to improve the quality and 
speed of the Community's work, and its prin­
ciple should be respect for the autonomy of 
each of the bodies. Mrs Veil considered that 
it would be neither realistic nor in accordance 
with the Treaties (nor with the principle of 
autonomy of the institutions) to contemplate 
any division of labour between ESC sections 
and Parliament Committees. 

On the other hand, there was a lot to be said 
for stepping up the exchange of information. 
Moreover, it would be highly desirable, when 
an ESC opinion had been delivered on a text 
submitted to Parliament, that this opinion be 
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known about and examined in Committee 
and in plenary. The fact that rapporteurs of 
Parliament's Committees can on occasion use 
an opi111ion delivered by the Economic and 
Social Committee to cast new light on their 
own r•eports could be a great advantage 
whether the opinion was unanimous, which 
was a valuable indication, or contained a 
stateme:nt of the minority view. 

For bo1·h practical reasons and as a matter of 
principlle, it would not be in the interests of 
either the Economic and Social Committee or 
Parliament to over-formalize mutual con­
tacts; some kind of 'method' should probably 
be introduced taking account of the work 
programmes of the two institutions. In con­
clusion., Mrs Veil stated that it would be 
advantageous for flexible, orderly working 
relationships to be established between the 
two assemblies. 

Mr Vanni, Chairman of the Economic and 
Social Committee, welcomed Parliament's 
desire to strengthen its relations with the 
Committee, for this was something the ESC 
also desired. He stressed his conviction that 
on this basis, and without procedural compli­
cations but with an organization permitting 
contacts to be better maintained, it would be 
possible to develop them fruitfully in the 
interests of the Community. 

Mr Valflni summed up relations between the 
two institutions in the following way: speedy 
exchanges of specific information and 
documc!ntation; Committee members being 
asked to address Parliamentary Committees; 
contacts between Parliamentary Committees 
and ESC sections. If some of the ESC's meet­
ings w1ere of special interest to Parliament, 

' Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.3.1. 
1 Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.3.1. 
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representatives of the Parliament's Secretariat 
would always be welcome to attend. He also 
spoke of the extremely beneficial annual 
meetings between representatives of business 
and labour interests in the Nine and the ACP 
States, organized under the auspices of the 
Joint Committee of the ACP/EEC Consulta­
tive Assembly. 

Rules of Procedure 

2.3.3. The Economic and Social Committee, 
meeting in plenary session on 2 and 3 July, 
adopted by a large majority (127 votes for, 2 
against and 3 abstentions) certain changes to 
its Rules of Procedure designed to improve 
the way in which it operates and to make the 
purpose of its work clearer. The changes 
were formally approved by the Council on 23 
July. 

A member of the Committee who is unable to 
attend may arrange to be represented by an 
alternate for the proceedings of the study 
groups to which he belongs. The alternate 
must be a national of the same Member State 
and belong to the same category of economic 
and social activity as the Committee member. 
He is to carry out the same duties in the 
study groups as the member whom he 
replaces. Moreover, when one of the groups 
formed within the Committee or one of the 
categories of economic and social activity 
represented in it unanimously disagrees with 
the conclusions reached on a matter submit­
ted to the plenary session, its position can be 
summarized in a brief statement to be 
appended to the opinion when the debate has 
been concluded by a roll-call vote. 

2.3.4. On 16 July the Commission sent a 
letter reminding the Council of its proposal 
of 2 October 1970 concerning the position of 
members of the Economic and Social Com-
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mittee. The proposal-to which the Council 
has not yet reacted-is that, where members 
of the ESC have not been replaced on the 
expiry of their term of office, they are to 
retain their functions until their successors 
have been appointed. It was prompted by the 
fact that, on several occasions, it had not 
been possible to complete the appointments 
procedure in time, with a continuity problem 
arising in consequence. 

Institutions and organs 
of the Communities 

Parliament' 

Part-session in Strasbourg 
from 7 to 11 July 

2.3.5. Having scarcely risen from its budget 
debates in June, Parliament was meeting 
again from 7 to 11 July, its main task being 
to adopt the 1980 budget, which in fact it did 

' This repon was prepared from Le point de Ia session 
published by Parliament's Secretariat. The complete texts 
of the resolutions adopted by Parliament are reproduced 
in OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980, and the repon of proceedings 
is contained in OJ Annex No 259. The political groups 
of members are indicated in brackets by the following 
abbreviations: Soc = Socialists; EPP = European People's 
Party - Christian Democratic Group; ED = European 
Democratic Group; Com = Communists and Allies; Lib 
= Liberals and Democrats; EPD = European Progressive 
Democrats; Ind = Group for the Technical Coordination 
and Defence of Independent Groups and Members; NA 
= Non-affiliated. The countries of origin are indicated as 
follows: B = Belgium; OK = Denmark, D = Federal 
Republic of Germany, F = France, IRL = Ireland, I = 
Italy, L = Luxembourg, NL = Netherlands, UK = United 
Kingdom. 
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on 9 July. This part-session proved to be very 
'technical'; this was reflected even in the gen­
eral debates, like the one on the programme 
of the Luxembourg Presidency, as well as in 
those focusing on specific aspects of transport 
or social policy, while international political 
issues took up only a small part of the pro­
ceedings. 

Since its election by direct universal suffrage 
Parliament has been trying to reform its inter­
national organization: several amendments to 
its Rules of Procedure have already been 
adopted. These had to do with the appoint­
ment of Quaestors,' the formation of Groups, 
speaking time, the conditions governing the 
use of urgent procedure and amendments to 
the agenda. 2 Pending a general overhaul of 
the Rules of Procedures Mr Luster (EPPID) 
presented a report on the amendments to the 
urgent procedure and explanations of vote, 
which was dealt with in what at times 
became a very sharp debate. Most speakers 
recognized that there had to be a compromise 
between safeguards for the individual rights 
of members and the need for the House to 
conduct its business efficiently. Opinions 
nevertheless often differed on where to draw 
the line. When the proposed amendments 
were put to the vote on 9 July, though 
approved by the majority of votes, they were 
not adopted since this required the support of 
the majority of members. 

Budgetary matters 

1980 budget 
(9 July) 

2.3.6. After two proposals to throw out the 
1980 budget had been rejected, the President, 
Mrs Veil, declared thilt the general budget of 
the Communities for 1980 had been finally 
adopted 3 
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Presenting their proposals for rejection of the 
budget, Mr Balfe (Soc/UK) and Mr Pannella 
(lnd/1) tried to rally the members who were 
dissatisfied with the new draft established by 
the Council in June;4 they contended that the 
new version offered nothing more than the 
draft rejected by Parliament in December 
1979.5 This stand might have won the sup­
port of certain Groups, notably the Socialists, 
who found the draft altogether inadequate, 
and the Italian Communists, whose spokes­
man, Mr Spinelli, claimed that the budget did 
not serve the interests of the Community and 
offended the dignity of the House. But as a 
majority of the Socialist members felt that in 
the circumstances it was unwise to support a 
motion for rejection, the Group abstained. 
The Italian Communists, considering the 
budget to be a double-edged weapon, also 
voted against the rejection proposals, which 
were therefore dismissed by an overwhelming 
majority. 

1981 budget 
(10 July) 

2.3.7. The 1980 budget scarcely adopted, 
Mr Tugendhat presented the preliminary 
draft for 1981, which the Commission had 
adopted on 9 July.6 

He presented it as a transitional budget. The 
Council had set the Commission the task of 
examining the structural changes to be made 

' Bull. EC 9-1979, point 2.3.6. 
Bull. EC 11-1979, point 2.3.12. 

' Points 1.1.1 to 1.1.13; OJ L 242 of 15.9.1980. 
' Bull. EC 6-1980, points 2.3.44 and 2.3.46. 
' Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.3.95. 
' Points 1.1.1 to 1.1.13 and 2.3. 70. 
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to Community policies in order to secure a 
better balance in the financing of those 
policies. The Commission intended to get the 
job done by June 1981. Meanwhile, it was 
going to hold on to what had been attained 
without launching any new policies or mak­
ing any major changes in existing ones and 
without prejudging proposals which might be 
forthcoming in 1981 concerning new own 
resources. 
The first reactions of Mr Lange (Soc/D), the 
Chairman of Parliament's Committee on 
Budgets, were favourable. But afraid that in 
the 1981 budgetary procedure the same prob­
lems would arise as those encountered in 
1980, he warned that the Community could 
not be reduced to a farming Community. 

Programme of the Luxembourg Presidency 
(8 July) 

2.3.8. Two topics stood out in the address 
by Mr Thorn, the new Council President. 
One was energy and the other development. 
During the years ahead the Community must 
direct its efforts first at greater economy in 
the use of energy and then at finding other 
sources of energy to replace oil. Turning to 
the problem of development Mr Thorn stres­
sed the importance of the contractual re­
lations between the Community and the 
developing countries under the Lome Con­
vention and of reactivating the North-South 
Dialogue and the Euro-Arab Dialogue. 
Mr Thorn also dealt with other problems. On 
enlargement he said that the pace of the 
negotiations must not be allowed to slip. On 
economic policy the Community must seek 
closer convergence of economic performance, 
balance Community operations and the 
financial burdens, and give careful thought to 
the question of own resources. 

Other points emphasized by the Council Pres­
ident: work on the transition to the second 
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stage of the EMS (creation of the European 
Monetary Fund) must continue; the battle 
against inflation remains the prime objective; 
the Social Fund and the Regional Fund must 
work in better harmony; the dialogue with 
the two sides of industry, particularly within 
the Standing Committee on Employment, 
must be amplified. 

The second half of Mr Thorn's statement was 
devoted to political cooperation. The Madrid 
Conference constituted one of the major con­
tacts with the East and must not be broken 
off, despite Afghanistan, which raised serious 
questions about the Soviet conception of 
detente. Mr Thorn stressed the importance of 
the Venice declaration on the Middle East 
and the contacts which the Luxembourg Pres­
idency would have to make to determine 
what kind of initiative the Nine could take in 
the Middle East. 

2.3.9. The spokesman for the Socialist 
Group, Mr Glinne (B), endorsed Mr Thorn's 
views on enlargement, the North-South 
Dialogue, the Euro-Arab Dialogue, develop­
ment strategy, the Madrid Conference and 
the Middle East, but nevertheless criticized 
the President's statement on several counts 
and, in particular, on the nature of the energy 
policy envisaged. He reiterated the emphasis 
laid by the Socialists on the problems of 
safety. 

Mr Scott-Hopkins (EDIUK) found that Mr 
Thorn's very comprehensive statement be­
spoke good intentions but lacked precision. 
The energy problem was indeed a priority; 
admittedly, Europe was in danger of running 
short, but the problems of nuclear safety 
were not to be underestimated. Concrete 
plans must therefore be put forward within 
the next six months. On the budget side the 
European Democrats would no longer agree 
to an excessive share of the 1981 budget 
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expenditure being allotted to agriculture. The 
Luxembourg Presidency must make a start on 
restructuring the common agricultural policy. 

After contesting the results achieved so far by 
the Council Presidency and pointing to the 
inability of the Community institutions to 
bring out genuinely new policies, Mr Berlin­
guer ( Com/1) described the role that Europe 
ought to be playing on the world scene. The 
only really important action to emerge from 
political cooperation was the European in­
itiative in the Middle East. But even that, he 
said, fell short of what certain Member States 
had done. International tension (Iran, 
Afghanistan) could prompt the Community 
either to support present American 
strategy-a strategy of reprisal and trial of 
strength-or to end the escalation of dashes 
between major powers. We must insist on 
respect of human rights but never break off 
the dialogue. With the Madrid Conference 
almost upon us the Nine must define a posi­
tive and openminded strategy with the aim of 
securing detente and Parliament must be kept 
informed of what was being done. 

Mr Lecanuet (EPPfF) believed that the Com­
munity needed to improve its image. The 
international situation was too serious to 
allow Europe to display its weaknesses and to 
alienate public opinion completely by pro­
cedural wrangling. A solution must be found 
to the dilemma of how to preserve what the 
common agricultural policy had achieved 
without increasing public expenditure, while 
maintaining ceilings on resources. The 
Member States would not agree to financial 
transfers unless the new policies defined at 
Community level were dearly more effective 
and more economical than at national level. 

Mr Lecanuet went on to point out that 
Europe was at the centre of a double divi­
sion: East-West and North-South. In the 
event of conflict Europe would be the first 

Bull. EC 7/8-1980 

Parliament 

casualty. It was in any case vulnerable in the 
matter of its supplies. Europe must therefore 
assert itself as an essential partner, for exam­
ple, for the developing countries or within the 
framework of the North-South Dialogue. But 
to acquire the status of a leading player on 
the international stage two conditions must 
be fulfilled: Europe must speak with a single 
voice and must conduct a coordinated 
defence policy in order to ensure its own 
safety. 
Mr Rey (Lib/B) once again questioned the 
Community mechanisms. The Council, he 
said, had a particularly difficult task, since 
more than any other institution it was subject 
to strong national pressures. The principle of 
taking decisions unanimously was a tiresome 
habit which would paralyse the Community 
of Twelve. The present practice must be 
changed by establishing a list of decisions to 
be taken by majority, particularly those 
within the compass of well-established 
policies. Mr Rey's last point was that it was 
not for the Foreign Ministers to run the Com­
munity's internal affairs. The Community 
must now be 'governed' and no longer 
'negotiated'. Such 'governance' was, there­
fore, the responsibility of the Ministers of 
Economic Affairs. The Community's internal 
cohesion must be strengthened, said Mrs 
Dienesch (EPDIF), who also wondered 
whether the Nine were, really and truly, 
showing a European spirit. The role of the 
Council derived directly from the Treaties 
and did not diminish the role of Parliament. 
There must be an end to the perpetual snip­
ing between the European institutions. The 
Commission, for its part, was not making 
enough concrete proposals. The Community 
had no medium-term bearings. As for 
enlargement, there could be no saying 'yes' 
one day and 'no' the next. 
Mr Piquet (Com/F) felt that Mr Thorn's 
statement was no more than a rehash of the 
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guidelines adopted by those before him. The 
economic crisis was not to be spoken of only 
in terms of inflation but also in terms of 
unemployment. Mr Piquet protested against 
the imports of coal. What would be the price 
of enlargement? The negotiations must all be 
stopped. 

2.3.1 0. Replying to the various speakers, 
Mr Thorn pointed out that the first statement 
by the Council President was inevitably gen­
eral and did not in any way prejudge future 
debate. Though energy saving was the prime 
objective, the scope was nevertheless limited. 
It was therefore necessary to fall back on sub­
stitutes. Community coal output must be 
maintained and increased, but in view of the 
risk of becoming less competitive in the 
manufacture of derived products any protec­
tionist policy was out. Mr Thorn reminded 
the House that the budget served to put into 
effect policies determined within the Com­
munity and not to dictate them. We must 
repudiate the thought of fair return. Yet 
politicians could not be blamed for consider­
ing things in terms of advantages and draw­
backs for the citizens of each Member State. 
The right balance must be struck within the 
Community so that advantages and draw­
backs were fairly spread. 
In conclusion, Mr Thorn called for continua­
tion of the East-West Dialogue. The Nine 
would be going to the CSCE meeting in Mad­
rid, but the dialogue would obviously be very 
difficult after the invasion of Afghanistan. 
For there to be a valid dialogue the Commun­
ity must take a firm stand on the basics and 
be united in its action. 

Economic situation 
(9 July) 

2.3.11. Presenting his report on the 
economic situation during the first half of 
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1980 and the problem of economic conver­
gence, Mr von Bismarck (EPPID) focused on 
two points: Europe was consuming more 
than it produced; it was living beyond its 
means. Inflation must be contained and stab­
ility restored to prices, which meant that 
much more effective use must be made of the 
coordination and consultation mechanisms 
for determining economic policy. 

Speaking for the Socialist Group, Mr Delors 
(F) rejected the report and proposed three 
lines of action instead of the remedies sug­
gested, which he felt would lead to a slump. 
He wanted more forceful structural action for 
energy and industry, the floating of a major 
Community loan in ECUs as a prop for the 
economy and a plan for solidarity. Apart 
from this 'internal' policy Europe must shoul­
der its economic responsibilities at interna­
tional level by taking the initiative: the 
world's financial and monetary turmoil had 
to be sorted out and, in particular, a new 
public international institution set up to recy­
cle the petrodollars and break the vicious cir­
cle of 'cheaper dollars-dearer oil'. 

Mr Beumer (EPPINL) called for united action 
to combat inflation, which was, moreover, a 
factor behind further increases in the price of 
oil. To this end a coordinated incomes policy 
should be envisaged and indexing should be 
limited with due consideration for the most 
underprivileged social categories. But care 
must nevertheless be taken not to deflate too 
strongly. The Commission should make 
proposals which could be discussed by the 
two sides of industry. The Community was at 
present suffering from a lack of decision. 

Mr Hopper (ED/UK) called for 'economic 
cooperation' on the lines of the 'political 
cooperation'. At present the multiple discus­
sions went on either at too high a level, 
where they were often superficial, or in too 
technical terms. The Finance Ministers 
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should therefore meet in economic coopera­
tion but without taking decisions by 
majority. 

Mr Bonaccini ( Com/1) contended that with 
the Community struggling in a very severe 
crisis which was causing unprecedented 
unemployment, the deflationary policy pro­
posed in Mr von Bismarck's resolution would 
never get the European economy moving 
again. The two crucial questions were still 
principally employment and investment. 

Mr de Clercq (Lib/B) maintained that 
national efforts must be coordinated by creat­
ing conditions favourable to economic 
development, of which monetary stability 
was one. The EMS has worked fairly well 
during its first year of operation. Thought 
must now be given to the second stage. 

Mr Poncelet (EPDIF) declared that the worse­
ning economic situation demanded urgent 
action: measures to combat unemployment; 
coordinated steps by the Member States 
against escalating interest rates; development 
of investments to promote exports; industrial 
readjustment geared to saving energy and 
safeguarding the environment. It was not 
enough to control expenditure on energy; 
resources must be pooled and a coherent 
price policy applied. Against competition per­
verted by certain non-member countries, 
Europe must protect its economy, as the 
United States and Japan were doing. 

Many other speakers, including Mrs Castel­
lina (/nd/1), Mr de Goede (NA/NL), Mr 
Rogers (Soc/UK) and Mrs Castle (Soc/UK), 
opposed the motion for a resolution in Mr 
von Bismarck's report. Mr Pranchere 
(Com/F) described the report as worthless. 
His solution was to boost the consumption of 
the masses by raising incomes, developing 
public services and improving working condi­
tions. 
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Sir Brandon Rhys-Williams (ED/UK) called 
for the establishment, in accordance with the 
Treaties, of a single market for capital, credit 
and investment, which meant that all the 
Member States would have to lift the controls 
on capital movements within the Com­
munity. 

In his reply for the Commission Mr Ortoli 
stressed that the EMS compelled closer coor­
dination of policies; coordination had indeed 
been strengthening over the last few months; 
without prejudice to the main role which the 
Member States still had to play, Europe could 
conduct a number of joint operations, for 
instance on energy and in the recycling of 
petrodollars. 

The 'battle against inflation' was not just a 
slogan; it was a sine qua non of social justice 
and employment. There was not necessarily 
one single remedy; the attack must be 
mounted on a fairly broad front. The Com­
mission did not envisage making any signifi­
cant changes to the options it had proposed. 

2.3.12. Winding up the debate, Mr von Bis­
marck elllphasized that this r<:port eschewed 
deflation but aimed to effect a shift from con­
sumption towards investment. The report, 
with very slight amendments, was adopted by 
the House. 

Air traffic 
(10 July) 

2.3.13. The air traffic control system in 
Europe was a dangerous anachronism, 
declared Mr Janssen van Raay (EP.P/NL), 
rapporteur for Parliament's Committee on 
Transport. Air traffic control, split into 
national compartments, exemplified a mis­
taken idea of national sovereignty and was 
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altogether ineffective. In setting up Eurocon­
trol by the International Convention of 1960, 
the signatory countries had instituted a sys­
tem full of promise. It was to ensure the 
safety of air traffic at European level mainly 
through joint organization of air traffic ser­
vices in the upper air space. But with the 
exception of Belgium, Luxembourg and the 
Federal Republic of Germany the Member 
States had not transferred powers of control 
to the 'organization, whose futui·e now looked 
very uncertain. 

Though great progress had in fact been made 
in air safety, there was still room for 
improvement. A stop must be put to the 
enormous waste of fuel and facilities due to 
lack of coordination and underutilization of 
highly efficient installations. 

The rapporteur therefore deplored the ten­
dency to 'renationalize' this sector and urged 
that the authority of Eurocontrol be reaf­
firmed. 

Mr Janssen van Raay went on to propose the 
creation of an integrated 'airflow­
management' system. 

During the debate all the speakers, except Mr 
Martin (Com IF), agreed that the activity of 
the Eurocontrol agencies must continue and 
develop and called upon the governments of 
the Nine to honour the commitments they 
made in signing the 1960 Convention. 

Thus, Mr Albers (Soc/NL) threw the full 
support of the Socialist Group behind the 
report, pointing out that the matter was 
urgent since the Convention was due to be 
renewed in 1983. Mr Notenboom (EPPINL)­
urged the national parliaments to put 
pressure on the governments. 

Mr Cottrell (ED /UK) declared that Eurocon­
trol 'threatened to founder on the reef of 
national rivalry'. He also pointed to the lack 
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of cooperation between the military and civil­
ian sectors. 

Mr Berkhouwer (Lib/NL), who also tabled a 
motion for a resolution urging the Council 
and Commission to present proposals 
immediately for establishing a coordinated 
and effective air safety system at European 
level, maintained that the European MPs had 
a duty to come out clearly as Europeans on 
this issue. Pressure must be put on the 
national governments by holding public hear­
ings and insisting on knowing what was hap­
pening. 

Mr Carossino ( Com/1) highlighted the 
immediacy of air safety problems and urged 
that the report serve as the basis for a 
broader debate on transport policy in 
Europe. Many speakers, notably Mr Moor­
house (ED/UK) and Mrs Roberts (ED/UK), 
condemned the waste caused by the present 
air traffic control conditions in Europe. Mr 
Combe (Lib/F) pointed to the advantages, 
particularly financial, of a single management 
system. 

Lastly, Mr Seefeld (Soc/D) believed that 
Eurocontrol ought to be an integral part of 
the Community system and that the govern­
ments ought not to destroy what had already 
been achieved towards European integration 
in the way of air traffic control. 

At the end of the debate Parliament adopted 
the resolution contained in Mr Janssen van 
Raay's report. 

Aid for steelworkers 
(10 and 11 July) 

2.3.14. In 19791 the Commission proposed 
the introduction of special temporary allow-

' Bull. EC 7/8-1979, point 1.1.41. 
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ances to help steelworkers affected by the 
Community's programme for reorganizing 
the industry. After a statement by Mr Peters 
(Soc/D), approving the measures, the House 
held a searching, at times quite heated, 
debate which covered three aspects of the 
matter: the actual social measures proposed 
by the Commission to aid steelworkers, the 
overall plan that the Commission was con­
ducting to restructure the industry and the 
financing of the social measures. 

The social measures were on the whole not 
contested, though opinions were sometimes 
qualified. Though no speaker found fault 
with the provisions concerning early retire­
ment, those concerning shorter working 
hours were a source of argument. Demanded 
by the Socialists and Communists, they were 
attacked by many speakers from the EPP, 
European Democratic and Liberal Groups, 
for whom the paramount consideration was 
to restore the European industry to a sound 
competitive position from which to tackle the 
world crisis, rather than merely to manage 
and share out the little that was available. 
The same speakers stressed the need for a 
panoply of sufficiently flexible measures 
which would respect, in particular, the auton­
omy of the two sides of industry. Mr Calvez 
(Lib IF) emphasized this when he faulted the 
Peters report for privileging certain parties. 

The discussion on the social measures not 
unnaturally prompted various statements 
about the problem of reorganization in gen­
eral. The speakers of the EPP, European 
Democratic and Liberal Groups, while con­
tending that the European steel industry 
should adapt to the modem world, by and 
large felt that the Community policy for the 
industry should be fitted into an overall 
industrial policy. Some speakers, among them 
Mr van der Gun (EPPINL) and Mr Barbi 
(EPPII), wanted to see the steel measures 
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extended to other industries hit by the crisis. 
Others, notably in the Socialist and Com­
munist Groups, sharply attacked the Com­
munity and the Commission, Mr Boyes 
(Soc/UK) claiming that the anti-crisis plan 
was fanning the crisis and Mr Oehler (Soc/F) 
and Mr Ansart (Com/F) that it had seriously 
weakened the French steel industry. 

The financing of the social measures was con­
sidered in a report by Mrs Hoff (Soc/D), who 
contended that it was sufficient to enter a 
contribution to the ECSC in the EEC budget 
in order to execute this expenditure. The 
Commission does not share this opinion and 
considers that this requires a legal basis and 
consequently a decision by the Council, for 
which it submitted a proposal on 18 April. 1 

Important as this aspect of the matter may 
be, particularly where interinstitutional rela­
tions are concerned, the debate in the House 
focused more on the question of the 
amounts involved. While Parliament had ini­
tially provided 30 million EUA for this opera­
tion, it did not adopt that sum in the final 
budget and the Council for its part had 
refused it. Speaking for the Commission, Mr 
Vredeling considered that, since the expendi­
ture was non-compulsory, Parliament bore a 
share of the responsibility because it had not 
stood by its original position. This was in 
reply to Mr van Minnen (Soc/NL), who had 
accused the Commission of weakness. 

Following an oral question put by Sir Fred 
Catherwood (ED/UK) and other members on 
the matter of the anti-dumping complaint 
lodged by US Steel, a motion for a resolution 
with request for an immediate vote was 
tabled with the support of the principal 
Groups. The resolution emphasized that the 

' OJ C 118 of 13.5.1980; Bull. EC 3-1980, point 
2.3.68. 
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Community was complying with the GA TI 
anti-dumping code and called on the US Gov­
ernment to ask US Steel to withdraw its anti­
dumping procedure• and start urgent negotia­
tions with the Commission. The resolution 
went on to stress that if such an agreement 
could not be reached and if the American 
Government infringed the GA TI provisions, 
the EEC should immediately take appropriate 
countermeasures. 

For the Commission, Mr Davignon wei­
coined the consensus reached and undertook 
to see that in the negotiations with the United 
States everything was done to find ways and 
means of safeguarding the US export market 
for European firms. 

At the end of these debates Parliament passed 
three resolutions on: 

(i) the social aspects of the restructuring of 
the steel industry and the draft decision con­
cerning the creation of special temporary 
allowances; the resolution was based on a 
substantially amended version of the Peters 
report; 
(ii) the proposal for a Decision with regard 
to contributions to be granted to the ECSC 
out of the general budget of the European 
Communities: Mrs Hoff's report was 
adopted after deletion of the paragraphs 
which stated that the entry of appropriations 
into the budget constituted an adequate legal 
basis and would thus have implied rejection 
of the Commission's proposed Decision; 

(iii) the firm attitude which should be taken 
towards the United States concerning the 
anti-dumping action by US Steel. 

Political cooperation 

2.3.15. During Question Time for the 
Council and the Foreign Ministers meeting in 
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political cooperation, Mr Thorn replied to 
members who were concerned, in particular, 
about respect for human rights. Dealing with 
a question from Mr Penders (EPPINL) and 
Mr Israel (EPDIF), who asked him what was 
the common position of the Ministers for the 
Madrid meeting of the Conference on Secur­
ity and Cooperation in Europe, Mr Thorn 
explained that there was indeed a common 
position on both substance and procedure. 
The proposals of the Nine focused on the 
military and humanitarian aspects, in particu­
lar the respect of human rights. However, 
most of the Member States of the Nine were 
opposed to institutionalizing committees in 
order to avoid a bureaucratic set-up on the 
perimeter of the CSCE. 

To Mr Israel, who made the point that the 
UN and UNESCO had accredited certain 
non-governmental organizations, Mr Thorn 
said that it was not possible in the context of 
the Helsinki agreements to accredit the 
'supervisory committees' for application of 
those agreements. 

On 11 July Parliament adopted a resolution 
on the 'serious violations' of human rights 
and international law by the Argentine 
regime, in which it urged the Commission 
and Council to undertake a critical study of 
economic and trade relations between the 
Community and Argentina. 

Resolutions were also passed on aid to 
refugees in the South China Sea; the border 
incident between Vietnamese troops from 
Kampuchea and Thai troops in Thailand; the 
dramatic situation of the refugees, especially 
the children amongst them, in the Hom of 
Africa. 

* 

' Bull. EC 3-1980, point 2.2.51. 
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2.3.16. Parliament approved various Com­
mission proposals concerning the removal of 
technical barriers to trade. The House 
emphasized that Council Directives on the 
approximation of the laws of the Member 
States should be issued only when essential. 
The proposals approved concern: 
(i) rear-view mirrors for two- or three­
wheeled motor vehicles;' 
(ii) roll-over and falling-object protective 
structures for certain construction plant;2 

(iii) electrical equipment for use in poten­
tially explosive atmospheres in mines suscept­
ible to fire-damp;3 

(iv) textile names:4 the Commission was 
asked to clarify certain provisions; 
(v) methods of testing the biodegradability 
of non-ionic surfactants;5 

(vi) powered industrial trucks:6 Parliament 
requested several amendments to the pro­
posal, particularly in regard to the date of 
application of the measures envisaged; 
(vii) a certification procedure for products 
originating in non-member countries:7 Parlia­
ment considered that this procedure should 
be used only in exceptional cases and made 
some further suggestions to that effect. 

2.3.17. In connection with transport policy 
Parliament approved the proposal for a Reg­
ulation on support for projects of Commun­
ity interest in transport infrastructures;8 it 

Table 1 - Council meetings in july 

Number, place 
and date of Subject President 

meetmg 

651st Economic Mr Santer, Luxem-
Brussels and bourg Minister of 
15.7.1980 financial Finance 

affairs 
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urged the Commission to include sea and air 
transport infrastructures in this programme. 
In a resolution passed on 11 July Parliament 
gave its opinion on the Commission's report 
to the Council 9 on the objectives to be pur­
sued in the long term and the measures to be 
taken to promote partial or total integration 
of railway undertakings at Community level: 
the Commission was asked to undertake 
further studies in this field and submit a 
further report at an early date. 

Council 

2.3.18. The Council held four meetings in 
July. The table below lists the number, date 
and place of each meeting, the names of the 
Council President and Commission represen­
tatives and the main items of business. The 
footnotes refer to the points in the Bulletin 
where a more detailed account is given of 
decisions taken, agreements reached, posi­
tions adopted and questions discussed. 

1 OJ C 30 of 7.2.1980; Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.1.8. 
' OJ C 104 of 28.4.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.1.7. 
1 OJ C 104 of 28.4.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 
2.1.27. 
• OJ C 63 of 13.3.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.1.24. 
' OJ C 104 of 28.4.1980; Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.1.6. 
' OJ C 165 of 2.7.1979; Bull. EC 5-1979, point 2.1.13. 
' OJ C 54 of 4.3.1980; Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.1.5. 
' OJ C 89 of 10.4.1980; Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.1.79. 
' Bull. EC 4-1979, point 2.1.90. 

CommiSSion Main Items of business 

Mr Ortoli, Examination of economic situation. 
Vice-President Discussion of Commission com-

munication on economic policy to 
be followed in 1980 and on prepar-
arion of public budgets for 1981. 1 
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Table 1 ((continued) 

Number, place 
and date of 

meeting 

652nd 
Luxembourg 
21.7.1980 

653rd 
Luxembourg 
22.7.1980 

654th 
Brussels 
21 and 
22.7.1980 

100 

Subject 

Fisheries 

Agriculture 

Foreign 
affairs 

President 

Mr Helminger, 
State Secretary in 
the Luxembourg 
Ministry of Foreign 
Affairs, Foreign 
Trade and Cooper-
ation 

Mr Ney, Lux em-
bourg Minister of 
Agriculture, Viticul-
ture, Waters and 
Forestry 

Mr Thorn, Luxem­
bourg Minister of 
Foreign Affairs 

Commisston 

Mr Gundelach, 
Vice-Preisent 

Mr Gundelach, 
Vice-President 

Mr Jenkins, 
President; 
Mr Natali and 
Mr Haferkamp, 
Vice-Presidents; 
Mr Cheysson, 
Mr Giolitti, 
Mr Davignon 
and 
Mr Tugendhat, 
Members 

Council 

MaiO Items of bus1ness 

Community loans. Release of the 
second tranche under the NCI. 2 

Internal aspects. Wide-ranging 
exchange of views on conservation 
of fish stocks, catch quotas for 
1980, access areas and structures.' 
Extension of interim decision on 
conservation of fish stocks until 31 
October 1980. 

Poultry farming. Agreement on 
resolution concerning protection of 
layer hens in cages. • 

Structural policy. General discus­
sion on package of measures.' 

Relations with New Zealand. Posi­
tion adopted on draft agreement 
reached and referendum by Com­
mission and New Zealand, amend­
ing voluntary restraint arrange­
ments in sheepmeat. Amendment of 
existing import arrangements for 
New Zealand butter.• 

Spain. Preparation for meeting at 
ministerial level of negotiating con­
ference/ 

Greece. Agreement on reply con­
cerning import curbs in Greece. • 

Portugal. Decision to grant aid bet­
ween now and accession and prep­
aration for meeting at ministerial 
level of negotiating conference. • 

Romania. Decision to sign two 
agreements negotiated by Commis­
sion.111 

Brazil. Decision to sign cooperation 
agreement in near future. 
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Table 1 (continued) 

Number, place 
and date of 

meeting 
SubJect 

' Points 2.1.2 to 2.1.5. 
Point 2.1.1. 

' Pomt 2.1.100. 
4 Pomt 2. 1.9 5. 
s Point 2.1.87. 
• Point 2.2.56. 
7 Point 2.2.4. 
8 Point 2.2.1. 
9 Point??? 
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Council 

MJm Items of bustness 

EFT A countries. Council took note 
of report by Permanent Representa­
.tives Committee summarizing the 
development of cooperation. 

United States. Council took note of 
Commission report on progress of 
consultations with United States 
under GAIT." 

Regional Development Fund: non­
quota projects. Five specific Com­
munity regional development pro­
jects approved.' 2 

North-South Dialogue. Approval of 
guidelines for common position of 
Community and Member States at 
forthcoming special session of UN 
General Assembly on development 
problems.'' 

Cocoa. Discussion concerning 
future Community attitude.'• 

Zimbabwe. Conformation of funda­
mental importance attached by 
Council to accession of Zimbabwe 
to Lome Convention." 

japan. Discussion of Commission 
communication concerning review 
of Community trade policy vis-a-vis 
Japan.'• 

Iron and steel. Consultation on sus­
pension of minimum prices for rein­
forcing bars, merchant bars and 
wide hot-rolled strip." 

10 Points 1.4.1 to 1.4.9. 
11 Point 2.2.45. 
" Point 2.1.63. 
11 Pomt 2.2.34. 
14 Point 2.2.24. 
" Point 2.2.60. 
,. Pomts 1.2.1 to 1.2.3. 
" Pomt 2.1.22. 
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Commission 

Activities 

2.3.19. The Commission held four meetings 
in July, each with a very full agenda. These 
meetings were devoted in large part to 
exchanges of views or the continuation of 
work in progress. Many decisions were 
taken, nevertheless, the main one being the 
adoption of the preliminary draft budget for 
1981. 

The Commission also took a series of mea­
sures to restructure its departments following 
the Spierenburg and Ortoli Reports and 
within the framework of the actual entry of 
Greece into the Community on 1 January 
1981. 

Decisions taken; memoranda 
and proposals adopted 

2.3.20. The main memoranda or proposals 
adopted by the Commission and sent to the 
Council concerned the accession negotiations 
with Portugal (agriculture); assistance from 
the European Social Fund for young people, 
women, migrant workers, and workers in the 
textile industry; the harmonization of energy 
costs in the horticultural sector; financial aid 
to the Maghreb and Mashreq countries, 
Israel, Cyprus and Malta; proof of origin of 
certain textile products. 

Exchanges of views; policy debates 
and work in progress 

2.3.21. The Commission held a wide­
ranging policy debate on the conclusions to 
be drawn from the judgment of the Court of 
Justice in the Cassis de Dijon case. It also 
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studied drafts concerning the scheme of 
generalized tariff preferences for the period 
1981-85; the new data-processing tech­
nologies, telecommunications and microelec­
tronics; informing and consulting workers 
employed by multinational firms. It also held 
exchanges of views on: the role and preroga­
tives of the Committees; consultations with 
the United States within the framework of 
GATT with regard to man-made fibres; anti­
crisis measures in the steel sector; the comple­
tion of the first stage of the Association 
Agreement with Cyprus. 

Relations with workers' 
and employers' organizations 

2.3.22. In the course of preliminary consul­
tations with the trade unions, experts from 
the European Trade Union Confederation 
discussed toxic agents, the influence of new 
technologies on working conditions and 
changes in working hours. 

Representatives of the Trade Union Commit­
tee: Textiles, Clothing and Leather met Com­
mission staff to discuss the 1979 report on 
the Multifibre Arrangement.1 Trade union 
organizations were informed of the draft for­
ward programme for steel for the fourth 
quarter of 1980. 

Leaders of the European Youth Forum met 
Mr Brunner to discuss the work of the Forum 
on illiteracy, exchanges of young people and 
education for leisure. 

Court of Justice 

2.3.23. The proceedings of the Court of Justice, 
reported rather succinctly up to now in the Bull-

' Point 2.2.15. 
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etin-in the form of a summary table of new cases 
and judgments•-will in future be examined in 
greater depth. 

The monthly table published since Bulletin 1-1980 
will now be supplemented by an examination of 
the case law of the Coun, or at least of its princi­
pal judgments, at regular intervals. 

This issue of the Bulletin contains the first exami­
nation of the Coun's main judgments, covering 
the period 1 January to 30 June 1980. Judgments 
delivered by the Coun during the second half of 
this year will appear in Bulletin 12-1980 and from 
1981 onwards an examination will appear quar­
terly. The monthly table of new cases and 
judgments-to be supplemented by this 
examination-will, of course, continue to appear 
in its existing form. 

Examination of judgments delivered 
between 1 January and 30 June 1980 

General 

2.3.24. For the first time the Court has 
refused to give a ruling on questions put to it 
by a national court. 2 The case at issue 
involved a clause contained in a contract of 
sale between private persons to the effect that 
any tax imposed by the authorities on a con­
signment of liquor wines in France and con­
trary to the rules of Community law must be 
borne by the buyer. Observing that the object 
of the parties to the main action was to sec­
ure condemnation of the French tax arrange­
ments by means of proceedings instituted 
before an Italian court between private per­
sons who were agreed as to the object to be 
attained, the Court regarded the dispute 
referred to it as artificial and held that its sole 
function was to provide Community courts 
with interpretations they required for resolv­
ing genuine disputes. To give a ruling on 
arrangements of the type described would, in 
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the Court's view, undermine the appeal pro­
cedure available to individuals, of which they 
had not availed themselves when the tax was 
imposed by the French authorities. It remains 
to be seen whether this approach implies a 
general change in the case law of the Court 
or whether it is to be applied in special cir­
cumstances only. 

2.3.25. In a case involving failure by a 
Member State to incorporate a number of 
Council directives into its national law within 
the prescribed periods/ the Court had occa­
sion to define clearly the obligation imposed 
on Member States by the third paragraph of 
Article 189 of the EEC Treaty. Replying to 
the argument that the national requirements 
of the State in question were in any case less 
stringent than the Community rules and that 
no barriers would be set up against the 
importation of products covered by the direc­
tives, the Court held that a Member State 
cannot fulfil its obligation under the third 
paragraph of Article 189 of the Treaty simply 
by according de facto recognition to or show­
ing administrative tolerance for the require­
ments of a directive. The directives in ques­
tion, which provide for Community type 
approval of various types of motor vehicles 
and agricultural tractors to be granted by 

• For more detailed information, see the texts published 
by the Coun of Justice in the Official Journal and in the 
European Coun Repons and the publications of its 
Information Office (e.g. the annual synopsis of the work 
of the Coun or the information quanerly). 
' CJEC 11 March 1980, Case 104/79 (Foglia v 
Novello), not yet reponed; see also in this connection 
CJEC 22 November 1978, Case 93/78 (Matteus v 
Doego) [1978] ECR 1978, in which the Coun held inad­
missible cenain questions concerning the substantive 
conditions for the accession of the new Member States. 
' CJEC 6 May 1980, Case 102179 (Commission v 
Kingdom of Belgium), not yet reponed. 
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issuing a certificate of conformity for indi­
vidual vehicles, were such that they needed to 
be transposed into national provisions having 
equal legal value with those governing the 
supervision and approval of motor vehicles. 
This requirement would not be imposed sim­
ply in the interests of clarity and legal cer­
tainty but would also assist all producers 
established in the common market. Nor did 
the Court accept the argument that the direc­
tives in question contained clear and precise 
rules and thus satisfied its decisions on the 
dire.ct effect of directives. 1 While it was true, 
the Court held, that it had acknowledged the 
right of interested parties to invoke a direc­
tive before the courts against a Member State 
which had failed to incorporate that directive 
into national law within the time specified, 
this did not justify a Member State's failure 
to adopt within the appropriate time limit 
implementing measures adapted to each 
directive. The case thus clearly shows that the 
direct effect of a directive can be invoked 
only against States and not by the Member 
States themselves. 

2.3.26. The Court also delivered a number 
of judgments within the context of the com­
mon agricultural policy which have impor­
tant general implications. Thus, for example, 
it refused an application for interim measures 
submitted by the Commission in connection 
with an infringement procedure initiated 
against a Member State for its failure to com­
ply with a judgment of the Court by main­
taining in force restrictions on imports of 
mutton and lamb. 2 

The Court considered it unnecessary to order 
the removal of these restrictions since that 
was already implicit in its earlier judgment 
requiring the Member State in question to 
adopt measures for terminating the infringe­
ment.3 

104 

Court of Justice 

2.3.27. The Court also had an opportunity 
in three joined cases arising from an earlier 
judgment concerning the definition of the 
date for fixing import levies on beef and veal4 

of explaining the retrospective effects of the 
interpretation of a Community provision 
given in proceedings based on Article 177 of 
the Treaty.5 The Court held that the provi­
sion as interpreted in a judgment of the Court 
may, and indeed must, be applied by the 
national court to legal relationships existing 
before the judgment was given. It is only 
exceptionally and for reasons of legal cer­
tainty that the Court may be moved in the 
same judgment to restrict the right of relying 
on the provisions. 6 

In this judgment, and in some others, the 
Court also availed itself of the opportunity of 
defining the rules applicable to proceedings 
instituted before national courts for the pay­
ment or reimbursement of Community 
charges or subsidies. If, for example, follow­
ing an earlier erroneous interpretation of 
Community law, proceedings are instituted 
by a national authority for the payment of an 
import levy which should have been col­
lected5 or the reimbursement of an export 
refund7 or denaturing premium8 which should 

' In particular, CJEC 5 April1979, Case 148/78 (Rattt) 
[1979] ECR 1629. 
' CJEC 28 March 1980, Case 24/80R and 97/80R 
(Commission v French Republic), not yet reported. 
' CJEC 25 September 1979, Case 232/78 (Commission 
v French Republic), not yet reported. 
• CJEC 15 June 1976, Case 113/75 (Frecasettt) [1976] 
ECR 983. 
' CJEC 27 March 1980, Cases 66, 127 and 128/79 
(Meridionale Jndustrie Salumi Vasanelli, Ultrocchr), not 
yet reported. 
• For example, CJEC 8 April 1976, Case 43/75 
(Defrenne v Sabena) [1976] ECR 455. 
' CJEC 5 March 1980, Case 265/78 (Ferweda), not yet 
reported. 
' CJEC 19 June 1980, Cases 119 and 126/79 (Lip­
pische Hauptgenossenschaft, Westfiilische Central 
Genossenschaft v BALM;, not yet reported. 
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not have been paid, or by a trader for the 
recovery of a monetary compensatory 
amount that should not have been levied, 1 in 
the absence of Community rules on the sub­
ject, which the Court described as 'regret­
table', the Court held that procedural matters 
such as time limits and entitlement to the 
payment of interest remained within the 
domain of national legislation. It is also the 
responsibility of the national authorities to 
resolve substantive questions such as the 
effect of the passing-on of a charge on entitle­
ment to its reimbursement, and the relevance 
of a trader's good faith in relation to a 
demand for reimbursement of a subsidy paid 
but not due. These judgments are similar to 
those delivered by the Court in the course of 
proceedings brought by individuals against 
national authorities for the recovery of 
national taxes held to be contrary to Com­
munity law such as discriminatory duties on 
alcohol2 of charges for health inspections 
having equivalent effect to customs duties. 3 

The same reservations apply to them as in the 
case of national charges-that is to say, 
national law must not discriminate according 
to whether there is or is not a Community 
aspect, nor make it impossible in practice to 
exercise rights conferred by Community law. 

Customs union 

2.3.28. The Court heard cases on outward 
processing, 4 the nomenclature of the Com­
mon Customs Tariffs and the valuation of 
goods for customs purposes. 6 With regard to 
the latter the Court decided two important 
cases concerning imports into the Commun­
ity of goods being transferred between differ­
ent parts of a group of companies. In Case 
111/79 the national court asked inter alia 
whether in such a case the 'price paid or pay­
able' for the goods could be taken as their 
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customs value in accordance with Article 9. of 
Regulation No 803/68 and, if not, what 
method of valuation could be used. The 
Court replied that this price could only be 
taken as the value of the goods when that 
price was not influenced by any commercial, 
financial or other relations existing between 
the parties. If such influence did exist, the 
customs value could be calculated on the 
basis of the resale price of the goods less the 
storage and other expenses borne by the 
purchaser-reseller within the customs terri­
tory of the Community and less an appropri­
ate profit margin. 

In Case 65/79, on the other hand, the cus­
toms authorities of a Member State con­
sidered that the purchase price paid for goods 
by a subsidiary company based in that 
Member State to its parent company in Swit­
zerland had been artificially inflated in order 
to export capital improperly to Switzerland. 
On a reference for a prelimary ruling the 
Court was asked in particular whether the 
Community rules on the valuation of goods 

' CJEC 12 june 1980, Case 130/79 (Express Dairy 
Foods v Intervention Board), not yet reported. 
' CJEC 27 February 1980, Case 68/79 Uusf}, not yet 
reported. 
' CJEC 28 March 1980, Case 61/79 (Denlulvif}, not 
yet reported. 
• CJEC 20.3.1980, Case 118/79 (Knauf Westdeutsche 
Gipswerke v Hauptzol/amt Hamburg-jonas), not yet 
reported. 
' CjEC 26.2.1980, Case 54/79 (Hako-Schuh Dietrich 
Bahner v Hauptzoll4mt Frankfurt am Main Osf}, not yet 
reported; CJEC 20.3.1980, Case 87/79 (Bagusat v 
Hauptzol/amt Berlin-PackhofJ, Cases 112-113/79 (Ein­
kaufsgesellschaft der Deutschen Konservenindustrie v 
Hauptzollamt Hamburg-Waltershof and Hauptzoll4mt 
Bad Reichenham, not yet reported; CJEC 3.6.1980, Case 
135/79 ( Gedelfi v Hauptzollamt Hamburg-jonas), not 
yet reported. 
' CJEC 14.2.1980, Case 84/79 (Meyer-Uetze v Haupt­
zol/amt Bad Reichenal~, not yet reported; CJEC 
13.3.1980, Case 111/79 (Caterpillar Overseas v Belgian 
State), not yet reported; CjEC 24.4.1980, Case 65/79 
( Chatain), not yet reported. 
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for customs purposes and the Agreement of 
22 July 1972 between the EEC and Switzer­
land1 permitted customs authorities to value 
the goods at a sum lower than the invoice 
price. The Court held that these instruments 
did not empower customs authorities to do 
this, but added that Member States should 
combat the problem of improper exports of 
capital by other means, such as fiscal or 
financial measures, which were not yet sub­
ject to Community action. 

2.3.29. The Court also decided two cases 
on taxes of equivalent effect to customs 
duties. In Case 61/792 it held that the direct 
effect of Article 13(2) EEC meant that sums 
imposed contrary to that provision could be 
recovered even for the period prior to a rul­
ing of the Court to that effect under Article 
177. However, national laws barring actions 
for recovery where unjust enrichment to the 
plaintiff would ensue were compatible with 
Community law. 

2.3.30. In Case 30/793 the Court built on 
its case law on the levying of taxes of equiva­
lent effect to customs duties on imports from 
non-member countries.4 On a reference from 
a national court it was held that the directive 
in question5 authorized a Member State to 
levy a charge to cover the costs of public 
health inspection of imports of poultrymeat 
from non-member countries even if equiva­
lent inspections had been carried out and 
equivalent charges levied in the exporting 
non-Member State. However, if such inspec­
tions at the external frontiers of the Com­
munity were out of all proportion to the 
objective sought or if the charges clearly 
exceeded the cost of these inspections, they 
would be prohibited by Regulation No 
2777/75 on the common organization of the 
market in poultrymeat. 
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2.3.31. The Court was also called upon to 
rule on the compatibility of certain national 
measures with Articles 30 to 36 EEC. 6 Of 
these cases the most important was Case 
788/79, the first in which the Court has had 
occasion to confirm its leading judgment in 
the Cassis de Dijon case. 7 The case concerned 
the lawfulness of a national decree prohibit­
ing the marketing of vinegar other than wine 
vinegar, whether domestic or imported. The 
defendants in the main proceedings had been 
prosecuted for selling apple-based vinegar 
imported from another Member State con­
trary to the provisions of this decree. In line 
with its judgment in Case 120/78, the Court 
held that national measures restricting 
imports fell foul of Article 30 unless they 
were necessary to satisfy mandatory require­
ments such as public health, the fairness of 
commercial transactions and consumer pro­
tection. Since it found no such justification 

' Regulation (EEC) No 2840/72; OJ L 300 of 
31.12.1972. 
' C]EC 27.3.1980, Case 61/79 (Amministrazione 
Finanze dello Stato v Denkavit Jtaliana), not yet 
reported. 
' CJEC 22.1.1980, Case 30/79 (Land of Berlin v 
Wiger), not yet reported. 
• In particular, CJEC 28.6.1978, Case 70m (Simmen­
thal v Amministrazione delle Finanze) (1978] ECR 1453; 
Twelfth General Report, point 548. 
' Directive 71/118 on health problems affecting trade 
in fresh poultrymeat: OJ L 55 of 8.3.1971. 
• CJEC 26.2.1980, Case 94/79 (Vriend), not yet 
reported; CJEC 27.2.1980, Case 55/79 (Commission v 
Ireland), not yet reported; CJEC 24.4.1980, Case 65/79 
(Chatain), not yet reported; CJEC 26.6.1980, Case 
788179, (Gilliand Andres), not yet reported. 
' CJEC 20.2.1980, Case 120/78 (Rewe-Zentralev Bun­
desmonopolverwaltung fUr Branntwein), [1979] ECR 
649; Thirteenth General Report, point 615. 
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here, the Court ruled that the prohibition in 
question infringed Article 30. 

ECSC 

2.3.32. The Court delivered judgment in 
two cases covered by the ECSC Treaty.• The 
object of the proceedings was to obtain the 
annulment of individual decisiqns taken by 
the Commission imposing fines on the 
applicants-steel undertakings-for selling 
concrete reinforcement bars at less than the 
minimum prices fixed by general decisions 
(962/77/ECSC and 3000/77/ECSC). The 
applicants had applied for either the annul­
ment or a declaration of the inapplicability of 
these general decisions and, as a subsidiary 
claim, the reduction of the fines imposed. The 
Court rejected the applications as a whole 
but reduced three of the fines for reasons spe­
cially connected with the cases in question. 

In its judgments the Court rejected in particu­
lar complaints as to form and substance 
against the general decisions, and pleas of 
legitimate defence, force majeure or necessity; 
legitimate defence could not be relied upon 
against a lawful act. The majority of produc­
ers adapted their procedures as a result of the 
decisions. 

It is interesting to note that the joining of 
twelve actions brought by Italian, German, 
French and Belgian firms gave the Court an 
overall perspective of the divergent interests 
at issue and enabled it to reaffirm that the 
fixing of the level of minimum prices and the 
difference in charges-which, of themselves 
were not excessive-arising from the mea­
sures complained of by the various firms was 
a consequence of the principle of solidarity 
between all ECSC undertakings. 
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Competition 

2.3.33. During the period under considera­
tion the Court decided two important cases 
concerning the Commission's powers under 
Regulation No 17.2 

In the first of these, the Court's Order of 17 
January 1980 in Camera Care Ltd v Com­
mission (Case 792/79R) established the Com­
mission's power to order interim measures of 
protection in competition procedures under 
the EEC Treaty, a power which is not 
explicitly mentioned in Article 2 of Regula­
tion No 17.3 The Court, however, relying 
once more on the doctrine of implied powers, 
found that the Commission's power to order 
an end to infringements under Article 3 of 
Regulation No 17 could become ineffectual 
or even illusory if this power could only be 
exercised on a definitive basis, at the end of 
the various procedural steps laid down else­
where in that Regulation. Therefore, the 
Commission's powers under Article 3 include 
the power to take interim measures which are 
indispensable for the effective exercise of its 
functions and, in particular, for ensuring the 
effectiveness of any decisions requiring 
undertakings to bring to an end infringe­
ments. 

' CJEC 18.3.1980, Joined Cases 154, 205, 206, 226, 
227, 228, 264178, 31, 39, 83 and 85/79 (SpA Ferriera 
Valsabbia and Others v Commission); CJEC 18.3.1980, 
Joined Cases 26 and 86/79 (Forges de Thy-Marcinelle 
and Manceau SA v Commission), not yet reported. 
' Council Regulation No 17 of 6.2.1962: OJ 13 of 
21.2.1962, p. 204. 
• Such power is to be found in Article 66 of the ECSC 
Treaty; see also National Carbonising Company Ltd v 
Commission, Case 109/75R [1975] ECR 1193. 
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The Court bound the exercise of this power 
by the Commission to a number of condi­
tions: the case must be urgent; if no measures 
are taken a situation will result which is 
likely to cause serious and irreparable dam­
age to the party concerned, or which is intol­
erable for the public interest; the measures 
must be of a temporary and conservatory 
nature; before the measures are adopted, the 
parties concerned have a right to a hearing, 
and are generally protected by the safeguards 
of Regulation No 17; the decision ordering 
interim measures must be in a form which 
can be attacked before the Court of Justice. 

2.3.34. The second case which concerned 
the Commission's powers concentrated upon 
the investigations without previous warning 
which the Commission can order under Arti­
cle 14 of Regulation No 17. The Court ruled 
that unlike Article 11 of Regulation No 17, 
which obliges the Commission to ask an 
enterprise for information before adopting a 
legally binding decision ordering it to pro­
vide it, Article 14 does not prescribe such a 
two-stage procedure and that the Commis­
sion can adopt a decision ordering an investi­
gation right away! 

The case is also interesting for the way in 
which it handles the question of fundamental 
rights. The applicant in the case had com­
plained that a surprise investigation, such as 
had been ordered here, infringed its funda­
mental rights, in particular its right to priv­
acy. Here the Court did not restrict itself to 
restating its decision in the Nold case, 2 but 
referred to paragraph 2 or Article 8 of the 
European Convention on Human Rights 
(right to privacy), which says that interfer­
ence with this right is permissible if it is in 
accordance with the law and is necessary in a 
democratic society in the interests of, for inst­
ance, the economic well-being of the country. 
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The Court found that the powers granted the 
Commission by Article 14 of Regulation No 
17 satisfied these conditions. 

2.3.35. In a third case3 the Court pro­
nounced upon what constitutes a proper 
notification of an agreement under Article 5 
of Regulation No 17 and Article 4 of Regula­
tion No 27.4 The Court said that an agree­
ment can be considered as properly notified 
in its entirety if the complete text has been 
annexed to the notification form, even if only 
some of the articles of the agreement are 
referred to in the form, provided that the 
description given in the form gives an accu­
rate rendering of the clauses which, at the 
time, were considered most important. In the 
matter of a voluntary relaxation of the 
notified agreement followed by a later return 
to the original terms of the notification, the 
Court, following the Commission, did not 
take a very strict approach. It said that the 
reintroduction of a certain category of pro­
ducts which had been temporarily excluded 
was covered by the effects of the original 
notification. 

Tax discrimination 

2.3.36. In 1978 the Commission made four 
applications to the Court under Article 169 
of the EEC Treaty for declarations that 

' CJEC 16.6.1980, Case 136/79 (National Panasonic v 
Commission), not yet reported. 
' CJEC 14.5.1974, Case 4/73 U. Nold, Kohlen- und 
Baustoffgrosshand/ung v Commission) [1974] ECR 491 
at 507. 
' CJEC 20.3.1980, Case 106/79 { Vereniging ter Bevor­
dering van de Be/angen des Boekhandels and Others v 
Eldi Records BY), not yet reported. 
• Commission Regulation No 27, OJ 35 of 10.5.1962, 
as amended. 
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France, Italy, Denmark, and the United King­
dom had failed to fulfil their obligations 
under Article 95 with regard to the differen­
tial t.axa~on applied to alcoholic beverages. 
The mfnngements observed by the Commis­
sion applied particularly to excise duties 
levied by France, Italy and Denmark on 
spirits imported from other Member States 
and the tax discrimination practised in the 
United Kingdom between beers and light 
wines imported from other Member States. 
~he ju~tification for lodging the four applica­
tions Simultaneously was the pressing need to 
secure the free movement of the alcoholic 
beverages in question which were economi­
cally mutually dependent (due firstly to the 
fact that they were produced in the same 
way, i.e., were fermented like wine and beer 
or distilled like spirits, and secondly to the 
interrelationship between the wine and wine­
based spirits markets). 

In its judgments the Court laid down the con­
ditions for implementing Article 95 on this 
subject. Referring to the similarity between 
sp~rits the Court pointed out that, leaving 
as1de the question of the basic raw materials 
(wine alcohol, cereals, fruit, etc.) or certain 
SJ?ecif~c uses (consumption as aperitifs or 
d1gesnves), these beverages undeniably offer 
flexibility in their consumption and have suf­
ficient properties in common to provide the 
consumer, at least in certain circumstances 
with an alternative. 1 That being so, the Cou~ 
did not consider it necessary, for the purpose 
of resolving the dispute to rule on the exist­
ence of similarities between all spirits, where 
all of them, without exception, compete at 
least partly with domestic products which are 
accorded preferential tax treatment. In doing 
so the Court implicitly acknowledged that 
under the first and second paragraphs of 
Article 95, once it has been established that 
domestic and imported products are similar 
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or compete, the tax arrangements applied to 
them must be the same. 

With regard to the relationship between the 
provisions of Article 95 and those of Article 
99 on the harmonization of national tax 
laws, the Court ruled out any possibility of 
subjecting compliance with the prohibition 
on tax discrimination laid down in Article 95 
to the implementation of the harmonization 
programme provided for in Article 99. The 
Court stated in this connection that Articles 
95 and 99 have separate objectives, the first 
be.in~ intended to eli~inate immediately dis­
cnmmatory. or protective tax practices, while 
the second 1s designed to minimize barriers to 
trade arising from differences between 
":ational tax systems even where the applica­
tion of these is not discriminatory. 

While the Court, in the proceedings instituted 
against France, Italy and Denmark, held that 
there had been failure to fulfil the obligations 
under Article 95, it made an interlocutory 
order in the proceedings against the United 
Kingdom. It did not at this stage in the pro­
ceedings consider itself in a position to rule 
on the United Kingdom's alleged failure to 
fulfil its obligations, and requested the parties 
to the proceedings to examine the question at 
issue in greater depth and to submit their 
findings to it before 31 December 1980. It 
must be stressed, however, that the Court 
had no hesitation in recognizing that the 
United Kingdom tax arrangements revealed a 
protective tendency in relation to imports of 
wine into the United Kingdom. Referring to 

' CJEC 27.2.1980, Cases 168/78 (Commission v 
F!"ench Republic), 169/78 (Commission v Italian Repub­
ltc), 170/78; (Commission v United Kingdom) and 
171/78 (Commission v Kingdom of Denmark), not yet 
reported; see also CJEC 27.2.1980 Case 69/79 Uust), 
not yet reported. 
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the relationship between the taxes on beer 
and wine, the Court stated that of the tax 
criteria proposed by the parties, the only one 
that would allow a sufficiently objective com­
parison to be made was to evaluate the tax 
vis-a-vis the alcoholic strength of the bever­
ages in question. 

Free movement 
of persons and services 

2.3.37. The Court was called upon to inter­
pret Articles 8 and 9 of Directive 64/221. 1 A 
party against whom a deportation order has 
been made may exercise all the remedies 
available to. nationals in respect of acts of the 
administration regardless of which court has 
jurisdiction in the matter. The remedies sus­
pend the acts and confer on the court the 
power to determine the urgency of the mea­
sure only if this possibility exists for acts of 
the administration. The appeal procedure 
provided for in Article 9 must, save in cases 
of emergency, be exercised prior to the deci­
sion ordering deportation and cannot restrict 
the right of appeal to the courts. A deporta­
tion order may be executed as soon as the 
party has been notified of the opinion, but he 
is entitled to remain in the territory suffi­
ciently long to appeal to the courts. 

The Court was again called upon to interpret 
Article 9 of Directive 64/221/EEC in the San­
tillo case. 2 After stressing the directly applic­
able nature of the provision the Court 
explained that the 'competent authority' to 
be set up for the purpose of giving its opinion 
must be independent of the decision-making 
authority and so constituted that the person 
concerned has a right of defence before it. In 
order to constitute an opinion under Article 9 
such opinion must be sufficiently proximate 
in time to the final decision. 
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2.3.38. The Court gave two rulings on the 
transmission of foreign broadcasts in the con­
text of freedom to provide services.3 It held 
that all television broadcasts are subject as 
such to the rules of the Treaty governing the 
provision of services, and extended this to 
include transmission by cable television. 
However, in order to benefit from freedom to 
provide service it must be determined 
whether the main components of the 
activities in question are carried on within 
one Member State. Freedom to provide ser­
vices does not prevent a Member State from 
laying down rules governing certain activities 
and thus imposing obligations that are 
specific to the person providing the service, 
provided such rules are justified on the 
grounds that they protect the general interest. 
They must also apply without distinction as 
to nationality to all who are established there 
and must apply only to persons who are not 
already subject to a similar requirement in 
another Member State. The Court thus held 
compatible with Articles 59 and 60 of the 
Treaty a law prohibiting the transmission of 
advertisements by television, and the right of 
the assignee of the performing right of a 
cinematographic film to rely on that right 
against the distributor of a film broadcast in 
another Member State by a third party with 
the consent of the original holder of the right. 

Social security 
for migrant workers 

2.3.39. The interpretation and application 
of Regulations Nos 1408/71 and 574/724 

' CJEC 5 March 1980, Case 98/79 (Pecastaing v Bel­
gian State), not yet reported. 
' CJEC 22 May 1980, Case 131/79 (Reginav Santillo), 
not yet reported. 
1 CJEC 18 March 1980, Cases 52179 and 62179 (Pro­
cureur du Roi v Debauve and Others and Coditel v Cine 
Vog Films and Others), not yet reported. 
• OJ C 138 of 9.6.1980 (consolidated versions). 
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continue to give rise to numerous references 
for preliminary rulings, thereby offering the 
Court the opportunity of reaffirming and 
amplifying its existing case law. This, as is 
well known, has always accorded preference 
to an interpretation of the provisions 
examined which reflects the objectives of 
freedom of movement for persons and the 
general scheme of the regulations. 

Among the solutions adopted, the first that 
should be noted are those defining Member 
States' powers to lay down rules. The Court 
thus held that it is the responsibility of each 
Member State to determine the conditions 
governing the right or obligation to belong to 
a social security scheme or a given branch of 
such a scheme. The only requirement is that 
no Member State may discriminate between 
its own nationals and those of other Member 
States.1 It is also for the States to determine 
the consequences of an erroneous affiliation. 
The Court also held that it is permissible for 
the Member States to create separate social 
security schemes with special conditions of 
membership according to the type of contin­
gencies to be covered or benefits provided/ 
and that Community rules do not preclude a 
State from granting a worker more favour­
able social benefits than those it is required to 
provide under Community provisions. 3 

2.3.40. The range of persons covered by the 
Community rules (the meaning of 'worker' in 
Article 1 (a) (ii) of Regulation No 1408/71) is 
to be interpreted in the broad sense. The 
Court explained that a person who is entitled 
under the law of a State to benefits covered 
by Regulation No 1408/71 by virtue of con­
tributions previously paid compulsorily does 
not lose his status as a 'worker' within the 
meaning of the same Regulation by reason 
only of the fact that at the time when the 
contingency occurred he was no longer pay-
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ing contributions and was not bound to do 
so.4 

The Court also had to rule on the provisions 
of Regulation No 1408/71 governing the 
non-overlapping of benefits. In the matter of 
family benefits for the dependent children of 
pensioners, the judgment of 12 June 1980 in 
Case 733/80 (Caisse de compensation des 
allocations familiales v La T erza) allowed the 
Court to extend the rule laid down in the 
Rossi judgmenrs concerning Article 79(3) of 
Regulation No 1408/71 to the application of 
Article 77(2) of that Regulation. Unlike the 
former provision (suspension clause), the 
rules in Article 77 (2) appeared as conflict 
rules. They determined the law applicable for 
the granting of family benefits. Their princi­
pal effect is that a worker who qualifies for a 
pension in several Member States and who is 
resident in one of those States receives family 
benefits under the law of that latter State. 
Taking the objectives of Article 48 of the Tre­
aty as a basis, however, the Court held that 
this provision must be interpreted as meaning 
that entitlement to family benefits in a State 
in whose territory a pensioner is resident does 
not preclude entitlement to higher benefits 
previously acquired in another Member State. 

In a similar context the Court held that Arti­
cle 8 of Regulation No 574/72 on the grant­
ing of maternity benefits, while worded as a 
rule concerning the applicable law, also came 
within the framework of provisions seeking 

' CJEC (Third Chamber) 24.4.1980, Case 110/79 
(Coonan v Insurance Officer): previously CJEC 
12.7.1979, Case 266/78 (Brunoriv Landesversicherungs­
anstalt Rheinprovinz) [1979] ECR 2705. 
' CJEC 24.4.1980, see note above. 
' CJEC (First Chamber), 10.1.1980, Case 69/79 (]or­
dens-Vorsters v Bestuur van de Bedrijfsverem"ging voor 
de Leder- en Lederverwerkende Industrie), not yet 
reported. 
• See CJEC (Second Chamber) 22.5.1980, Case 143/79 
(Walsh v National Insurance Officer), not yet reported. 
' CJEC 6.3.1979, Case 100178, [1979] ECR 831. 
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to prevent unjustified overlapping of 
benefits.1 

With regard to unemployment benefits, A~­
cle 68(1) of Regulation No 1408/71 apphes 
as a principle only where the law of the com­
petent State calculates them on the basis of 
the previous wage or salary. Account must be 
taken solely of the wage or salary received ~y 
the party concerned in his last employment m 
that State. However, if that person has been 
in his last employment in that territory for 
less than four weeks, the benefits are calcu­
lated on the basis of the normal wage or sal­
ary corresponding, in the place whe.re the 
employed person is residing, to an equ1valent 
or similar employment to his last employ­
ment in the territory of another Member 
State. A special problem arises in relation to 
unemployed frontier workers in that, by way 
of exception to the general rule, the Ia~ 
applicable to them is not that of the State m 
which they were last employ~d but that .. of 
their State of residence (Article 71 (a) (u)). 
The objective is to ensure that workers 
receive unemployment benefits proportional 
to the wage or salary they received . at the 
time they become unemployed. Th1s rule 
must be applied to frontier workers. The 
Court held accordingly that Article 68 (1) 
must be understood as requiring unemploy­
ment benefits for frontier workers to be cal­
culated on the basis of the salary or wage 
received in respect of the last employment in 
the Member State in which the worker was 
employed immediately prior to becoming 
unemployed. 2 

2.3.41. It should be noted finally that the 
Court was again called upon to rule on the 
meaning of the law of t~e Member S.tates;1 
sickness benefits;3 the nght of parties to 
receive benefits on a provisional basis pend­
ing final payment of their benefits under Arti­
cle 45 of Regulation No 574/72;4 the con-
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ditions for the application of Articles 27 and 
28 of Regulation No 3 on aggregation and 
benefits·5 the circumstances in which 'sup­
plemen;ary periods' are to be taken into con­
sideration when applying Article 46 of Regu­
lation 1408/71 (coordinated payment of pen­
sions payable under the legislation of several 
Member States;6 the possibility of receiving 
unemployment benefit in a Member State 
after a period of residence in another State 
(Article 69(2) of Regulation No 1408/71)7 
and the submission of applications and the 
lodging of claims with the competent institu­
tions.1 

Equal pay for men and women 
(Article 119 of the EEC Treaty) 

2.3.42. In its judgment of 27 March 1980 
in Case 129/79 (Macarthys v W. Smith), the 
Court reaffirmed a decision first given in the 
Defrenne judgment of 8 April 19768 con­
cerning the effects of Article 119 of the 

' See CJEC (Second Chamber) 22 May 1980, Case 
143/79, cited above. 
2 CJEC 28 February 1980, Case 67/79 (Fellinger v 
Bundesanstalt fiir Arbeit), not yet reported. 
• CJEC (First Chamber) 10 January 1980, Case 68/79, 
cited above. 
• CJEC (Third Chamber) 14 February 1980, Case 
53179 ( ONPTS v Damiani), not yet reported. 
' CJEC (Third Chamber) 12 June 1980, Case 1/80 
(FNROM v Salmon), not yet reported. 
• CJEC 26 June 1980, Case 793/79 (Menziesv Bundes­
versicherungsanstalt fiir Angestellte), not yet reported. 
' CJEC 19 June 1980, Joined Cases 41, 121 an~ 
796/79 (Testa, Maggio and Vitale v Bundesanstalt fiir 
Arbeit), not yet reported. 
' CJEC 8.4.1976, Case 43175 (Defrenne v Sabena) 
[1976] ECR 455. 
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Treaty. The Court of Appeal, London, re­
ferred to the Court of Justice the case of a 
woman who, having been employed as a 
stockroom manageress by a wholesale dealer 
in pharmaceutical products, complained of 
discrimination in pay because her predeces­
sor, a man, whose post she took after an 
interval of four months received a higher sal­
ary than she did. 

Article 119, the Court held again, applies 
directly, and without the need for more 
detailed implementing measures on the part 
of the Community or the Member States, to 
all forms of direct and overt discrimination 
which may be identified solely with the aid of 
the criteria of equal work and equal pay. The 
principle of equal work, the Court considered 
in these circumstances, is not confined to 
situations in which men and women are con­
temporaneously doing equal work for the 
same employer. 

The question was also asked whether it is 
possible for a woman to claim solely on the 
basis of Article 119 not only the salary 
received by a man who previously did the 
same work for her employer but also, more 
generally, the salary to which she would be 
entitled were she a man, even in the absence 
of any man who was concurrently perform­
ing, or had previously performed, similar 
work. The Court said no. 

This proposition would involve indirect and 
disguised discrimination, the identification of 
which implies the prior elaboration of criteria 
of assessment by Community and national 
legislative bodies. Comparisons, in cases fal­
ling within the scope of the direct application 
of Article 119, are confined to parallels 
which may be drawn on the basis of concrete 
appraisals of the work actually performed by 
employees of different sex within the same 
establishment or service. 

Bull. EC 7/8-1980 
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Agriculture 

2.3.43. The Court delivered more then 20 
judgments in cases arising out of the common 
agricultural policy. As usual, monetary ques­
tions comprised the largest sector. Indeed, 
one of the bases of the whole agri-monetary 
system came under dose scrutiny in an action 
brought by an English farmer against the 
Council for damages for fixing the value of 
the green pound over a period at an allegedly 
discriminatory rate.• This application was 
however dismissed for want of proof of dam­
age without the Court having to enter into 
the question of substance. The Court was 
also called upon to consider from the mone­
tary aspect the validity of Community rules 
for the charging of import levies on orange 
juice. 2 Because of the conversion rates applied 
at the time these rules had the effect of charg­
ing levies on orange juice imported into one 
Member State whereas the same orange juice 
could be imported free of levies into other 
Member States. The Court was able to 
resolve this problem by interpreting the rules 
in the sense that no levy should be imposed 
on imports of orange juice where it was 
established that such imports would in other 
Member States not be subject to levy. 

The impact of 'force majeure' was yet again 
reviewed by the Court, this time in the con­
text of the granting of monetary compensa­
tory amounts. 3 Distinguishing its previous 
decision in the context of accession compen­
satory amounts• the Court held that, notwith-

' CJEC 4.3.1980 Case 49/79 (Pool v Council) not yet 
reported. 
' CJEC 3.6.1980 Case 135/79 (Gedelfi v HZA Ham­
burg-jonas) not yet reported. 
' CJEC 5.3.1980 Case 38/79 (Nordmark v HZA Ham­
burg-jonas) not yet reported. 
' CJEC 11.7.1978 Case 6/78 (Union franf(lise des 
Cerea/es v HZA Hamburg-jonas) [1978] ECR 1675. 
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standing that goods are accidentally des­
troyed (e.g. by the sinking of a ship) on route 
from one Member State to another, they are 
not entitled to benefit from the full monetary 
compensatory amounts as if they had arrived 
at their destination. 

2.3.44. A suspected fraud concerning 
import levies on butter formed the back­
ground to infringement proceedings brought 
by the Commission against Italy for refusing 
to associate the Commission with control 
measures in the context of the Communities' 
own resources system.' The Court accepted 
that the Commission's powers of supervision 
could be exercised as soon as the own 
resources had been 'established' but held that 
Community rules did not require the Italian 
administration to pass on to the Commission 
privileged information relating to criminal 
proceedings (secret d'instruction). 

The Court was also called upon to rule on 
the validity of the Community rules applic­
able in the case of loss of an export licence 
document giving entitlement to a prefixed 
refund. 2 These rules, which do not permit the 
issue of a replacement licence with the same 
entitlement, were upheld by the Court in the 
light of the risks and difficulties which could 
result from an alternative system. 

Once again the Court had to examine the 
compatibility with Community law of 
national rules on production and trading in 
cultivated plants. 3 Referring to its previous 
case law in this field, the Court held that 
national rules which require a trader in chry­
santhemums to be affiliated to a public body 
are incompatible with the common organiza­
tion of the market and with the Treaty rules 
on the free movement of goods. 

2.3.45. Structural measures were, excep­
tionally, the subject of a request for a prelim-
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inary ruling, in which the Court was asked to 
interpret the Directive on the modernization 
of farms, and in particular the extent to 
which the Directive requires Member States 
to make provision for appeal against 
administrative decisions taken in this field.4 

Recalling that the Directive requires the 
establishment of systems which fulfil certain 
global criteria for structural reform but leaves 
their organization to national law, the Court 
held that the Directive does not have any par­
ticular requirements with regard to means of 
appeal. 

Convention of 27 September 1968 
on jurisdiction and Enforcement 
of Judgments in Civil and 
Commercial Matters 

2.3.46. If the place of performance of a 
contractual obligation has been specified by 
the parties in a clause which is valid accord­
ing to the national law applicable to the con­
tract, the court for that place has jurisdiction 
to deal with disputes relating to that obliga­
tion, under subparagraph (1) of Article 5, 
irrespective of whether the formal conditions 

' CJEC 10.1.1980 Case 267/78 (Commission v Italian 
Republic) not yet reponed. 
' CJEC 26.6.1980 Case 808/79 (Pardint) not yet 
reponed. 
' CJEC 1.2.1980 Case 94/79 ( Vriend) not yet reponed. 
• CJEC 6.5.1980 Case 152/79 (Lee v Minister for 
Agriculture) not yet reponed. 
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provided for in Article 17 have been 
observed. 1 

2.3.47. The second paragraph of Article 1 
excludes matrimonial arrangements. The 
Convention applies, on the other hand, 
according to the Court, to an interim mainte­
nance allowance and compensation payment 
awarded in divorce proceedings. 2 

2.3.48. Judgments granting provisional or 
protective measures which are given without 
the party against whom they are given having 
been called upon to appear and which are 
intended to be enforced without having previ­
ously been served do not come within the sys­
tem of recognition and enforcement laid 
down. in Title III of the Convention (Articles 
27, 36, 46 and 47).3 

According to the second paragraph of Article 
I of the Protocol to the Convention a clause 

2.3.49. New cases 

Case 

Free movement of goods 

Court of Justice 

conferring jurisdiction may not be considered 
to have been expressly and specifically agreed 
upon by a person domiciled in Luxembourg 
unless that clause, besides being in writing as 
required by Article 17 of the Convention, is 
mentioned in a provision which is specifically 
and exclusively devoted thereto and which 
has been specifically signed by the party 
domiciled in Luxembourg; in this respect the 
signing of the whole of the contract does not 
in itself suffice. It is not, however, necessary 
for that clause to be mentioned in a docu­
ment separate from that constituted by the 
written instrument of the contract.4 

1 CJEC 17 January 1980, Case 56/79 (Zeiger v 
Salinitrt) not yet reported. 
' CJEC 6 March 1980, Case 120/79 (Cave/ v Cave/) 
not yet reported, see also CJEC 27 March 1979, Case 
143/78 (Cavelv Cave/) [1979] ECR 1055. 
1 CJEC 27 May 1980, Case 125/79 (Denilauler v 
Couchet Freres) not yet reported. 
• CJEC 6 May 1980, Case 784/79 (Porta/easing v Pre­
stige International) not yet reported. 

Sub1ect Type of act1on 

Case 155/80 - Criminal pro­
ceedings against S Oebel, Wies­
baden1 

Must the effects of S 5 of the German Working 
Hours in Bakeries Act be regarded as measures 
equivalent to quantitative restrictions on im­
ports or quantitative restrictions on exports? 

Article 177 of the 
Treaty 

Customs union 

Case 158/80 1. Rewe- Duty free importation of goods purchased tax- Article 177 of the 
Handelsgesellschaft Nord mbH, free on board ships during excursions on the Treaty 
Hohndorf; 2. Firma Rewe-Markt high seas (Butterfahrten). Tariff classification of 
Steffen, Kiel v Hauptzollamt Kiel' goods contained in travellers' personal luggage 

I OJ C 184 of 22.7.1980. 
' OJ C 192 of 30.7.1980. 
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Case Type of actu m 

Case 160/80 Smuling-De Tariff classification of 'Keltrol', a thickener Article 177 of the 
Leeuw BV, Rotterdam v Inspec- manufactured on an industrial scale from maize Treaty 
teur der invoerrechten en accijn- starch 
zen, Rotterdam 1 

Case 170/80 - Einkaufsgesell- Tariff classification of cherries preserved in a Article 177 of the 
schaft der deutschen Konserven- mixture of alcohol and water originating in Treaty 
industrie GmbH, Berlin v Haupt- Yugoslavia 
zollamt Bad Reichenhall' 

Competition 

Case 172/80 - G Zoehner, Ro­
senheim v Bayerische Vereins Ro­
senheim1 

Taxation 

Case 154/80 - Staatssecretaris 
van Financien v Cooperatieve 
Aardappelen bewaarplaats GA, 
Heinikenzand' 

Agriculture 

Does the debiting by a bank of a charge on 
transfers of funds within the Community 
constitute an infringement of Articles 85 and 
86 of the EEC Treaty? 

Article 177 of the 
Treaty 

Can a cooperative association operating a refri- Article 177 of the 
gerated potato storage depot and offering its Treaty 
members storage of potatoes free of charge 
claim that this facility is covered by the concept 
of 'consideration' in Article 8(a) of the second 
VAT Directive? 

Case 152/80 -Societe Debayser Validity of Article 2(1) of Regulation (EEC) No Article 177 of the 
and Others v Fonds d'Interven- 1608/74 of 26 June 1974 Treaty 
tion et de Regularisation du Mar-
che du Sucre and Others' 

Case 159/80 - Firma Wunsche 
& Co KG, Hamburg v Bundes­
anstalt fiir landwirtschaftliche 
Marktordnung, Frankfurt 
(Main)' 

Case 169/80 - Administration 
des Douanes v Gondrand Freres 
SA and Garancini SA • 

I OJ C 207 of 12.8.1980. 
OJ C 219 of 27.8.1980. 

I OJ C 210 of 16.8.1980. 
• OJ C 192 of 30.7.1980. 
< OJ C 180 of 18.7.1980. 
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Application for the interpretation of the term Article 177 of the 
'flakes of sorghum' contained in Article 5 of Treaty 
Regulation (EEC) No 141/64 on the system go-
verning processed products derived from 
cereals and from rice 

Application of Regulations (EEC) Nos 804/68, Article 177 of the 
823/68, 1053/68 and 1054/68 on agricultural Treaty 
levies with regard to the tariff heading of a 
French cheese 
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Case SubJect Type of actoon 

Case 176/80 - Maizena GmbH, 
Hamburg v Council' 

Application for the annulment of Article 2 of Article 173 of the 
Regulation (EEC) No 1592/80 fixing for the Treaty 

and 
Case 179/80 - Roquette Freres 
SA, Lestrem Lille v Council> 

Fisheries 

Case 180/80- J Crujeiras Tome 
v Procureur de Ia Republique 
fran~aise 1 

and 
Case 181/80 - Procureur Ge­
neral at the Cour d' Appel, Pau 
and Others v S Arbelaiz Ema­
zabel1 

European Development Fund 

applicant a production quota in the sugar and 
isoglucose sectors 

Validity, having regard to prior international 
obligations, of a number of Community regula­
tions on fisheries requiring a licence to be held 
by Spanish vessels fishing in the French econo­
mic zone 

Article 
Treaty 

177 of the 

Case 182/80 - Firma HP Gauff Refusal by the Commission to employ the ser- Articles 175 and 215 
lngenieure GmbH & Co KG, vices of this firm for projects in ACP countries of the Treaty 
Niirnberg v Commission' 

Infringements 

Case 171/80 
Italian Republic" 

Commission v Failure to implement Council Directive Article 
76/769/EEC of 27 July 1976 on dangerous Treaty 
substances 

169 of the 

Case 177/80 - Commission v Failure of Margarine, Prepared Fats and Other Article 169 of the 
Kingdom of Belgium' Edible Fats Act to comply with Community Treaty 

legislation 

Disputes between the Community and its staff 

- against Parliament and the Commission: 167/80' 
- against the Commission: 156/80;• 161 and 161 R/80;' 162 and 162 R/80;' 163 and 163 R/80;' 
164/80;8 165/80;8 168/80;8 173/80;9 174/80; I 175/80;1 178/80. 10 

' OJ C 219 of 27.8.1980. 
' OJ C 242 of 20.9.1980. 
1 OJ C 246 of 23.9.1980. 
• OJ C 212 of 20.8.1980. 
' OJ C 235 of 11.9.1980. 
• OJ C 196 of 2.8.1980. 
7 OJ C 233 of 11.9.1980. 
' OJ C 207 of 12.8.1980. 
' OJ C 214 of 21.8.1980. 

"' OJ C 232 of 10.9.1980. 
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Case 

Convention on Jurisdiction and 
the Enforcement of Judgments in 
Civil and Commercial Matten 

157/80 - Criminal proceedings 
against S E Rinkau, Gelsenkir­
chen' 

166/80- Peter Klomps, Meijel v 
K Michel, Neuss' 

Judgments 

Date and case 

Free movement of penons 

SubJect 

Refusal to grant right of audience to a Dutch 
lawyer, representing a German national prose­
cuted for the illegal possession of a radio trans­
mitter, as counsel for the accused 

Application for interpretation of Article 27(2) 
of the Convention. Dispute concerning service 
of a Zahlungsbefehl (order for payment) and a 
Vollstreckungsbefehl (writ of execution) on the 
defendant 

Held 

Court of Justice 

Type of .u:tmn 

3.7.1980, 157/79- Regina v S Pieck' The phrase 'entry visa or equivalent requirement' 
covers any formality for the purpose of granting 
leave to enter the territory of a Member State 
which is coupled with a passport or identity card 
check. The issue of a special residence document 
has only a declaratory effect. A Member State 
may not require a Community national to pos­
sess a general residence permit nor punish him 
for failing to obtain a special residence permit 

Customs Union 

11.7.1980, 798/79 - Hauptzollamt Koln-Rheinau v 
Firma CHEM-TEC, lnhaber BH Naujoks• 

' OJ C 192 of 30.7.1980. 
' OJ C 210 of 16.8.1980. 
1 OJ C 186 of 24.7.1980. 
• OJ C 207 of 12.8.1980. 
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The expression 'breathing appliances (including 
gas masks and similar respiraton)' also includes 
simple filter masks which, although covering on­
ly the mouth and the nose, serve as protection 
against toxic chemical products, dust, smoke and 
fog and which are intended to be used once only 
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Date and case 

Competition 

10.7.1980- Cases: 
253/78 - Ministere public v B Giry and Guerlain SA;' 
1179 - Procureur de Ia Republique v P Celicout and 
Parfums Rochas SA;' 
2/79 - Procureur de Ia Republique v Y P Lanvin and 
Lanvin Parfums SA;' 
3/79 - Procureur de Ia Republique v A A Favel and 
Nina Ricci Sari;' 
37/79- Anne Marty SA vEstee Lauder SA;' 
99/79 - 1. Lancome SA, 2. Cosparfrance Nederland 
BV v 1. Etos BV, 2. Albert Heyn Supermart BV;' 

10.7.1980- 811179- Amministrazione delle Finanze 
dello Stato v Ariete SpA, Rome2 

Court of Justice 

Held 

Community law does not prevent the application 
of national provisions prohibiting a refusal to sell 
even where the agreements relied upon for the 
purpose of justifying such refusal have been clas­
sified by the Commission. An official letter from 
the Commission stating that there are no 
grounds for it to take any action in respect of 
certain agreements does not bind the. national 
courts 

The recovery of sums levied is not contrary to 
the provisions of Community law on the estab­
lishment of a system ensuring that competition is 
not distorted in the common market 

10.7.1980, 30/78 - The Distillers Company Ltd, Application dismissed. The applicant was or­
Edinburgh v Commission 1 dered to pay the costs, including those of the in­

terveners 

Social security for migrant workers 

9.7.1980, 807/79 - G Gravina and Others v Landes­
versicherungs Anstalt Schwaben 1 

Infringements 

Entitlement to benefits payable by the State in 
whose territory an orphan resides does not re­
move the entitlement to higher benefits pre­
viously acquired under the legislation of another 
Member State 

8.7.1980, 49/80 - Commission v Kingdom of Order for removal from the register 
Belgium• 

10.7.80, 152/78- Commission v French Republic' 

' OJ C 199 of 5.8.1980. 
' OJ C 202 of 7.8.1980. 
1 OJ C 196 of 2.8.1980. 
• OJ C 204 of 9.8.1980. 

Bull. EC 7/81980 

France has failed to fulfil its obligations under 
Article 30 of the EEC Treaty. It was ordered to 
pay the costs. (Advertising for alcoholic bev­
erages) 
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Date and case 

10.7.80, 32/79- Commission v United Kingdom' 

Economic and Social Committee 

Held 

The United Kingdom has failed to fulfil its obli­
gations under the EEC Treaty. It was ordered to 
pay the costs of the action including those of the 
interveners. (Conservation measures-fisheries) 

11.7.80, 150/79 - Commission v Kingdom of Belgium has failed to fulfil its obligations under 
Belgium2 the EEC Treaty. (Social security) 

Disputes between the Community and its staff 

2.7.80, 129/80 R' 

2.7.80, 52/80' 

8.7.80, 29/78 

11.7.80, 103/79' 

11.7.80, 137/794 

• OJ C 199 of 5.8.1980. 
' OJ C 207 of 12.8.1980. 
' OJ C 192 of 30.7.1980. 
• OJ C 204 of 9.8.1980. 

Court of Auditors 

2.3.50. On 3 July the Court of Auditors 
adopted opinions1 on the proposals for Coun­
cil Regulations amending the Council Regula­
tion of 17 May 19762 setting up a ·financial 
mechanism3 and establishing supplementary 
measures in favour of the United Kingdom.5 

These proposals followed the Council conclu­
sions of 30 May on the United Kingdom con­
tribution to the Community budget.5 

Economic and Social Committee 

180th plenary session 

2.3.51. The Economic and Social Commit­
tee held its 180th plenary session in Brussels 

120 

No interim measures to be adopted 

The cases were removed from the register of the 
Coun 

The defendant was ordered to pay the costs 

Application dismissed as inadmissible. Each of 
the panies to bear his own costs 

Application dismissed. The Commission was or­
dered to pay the costs 

on 2 and 3 July with Mr Vanni, the Commit­
tee Chairman, in the chair. 

Mrs Veil, President of Parliament, attended; 
she spoke of the need for Parliament and the 
Economic and Social Committee to work 
together towards strengthening the Com­
munity.6 

' OJ C 233 of 11.9.1980. 
' OJ L 131 of 20.5.1976. 
' OJ C 171 of 11.7.1980. 
• OJ C 169 of 9.7.1980. 
' OJ C 158 of 27.6.1980. 
' Point 2.3.2. 
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Opinions 

Technical ba"iers to trade 

2.3.52. In a unanimous opinion the Com­
mittee approved the three Commission pro­
posals of 6 March for Council Directives on 
the interior fittings of motor vehicles (safety 
belts and seats).• The Committee felt that, by 
extending the scope of the previous Direc­
tives, these proposals would help to increase 
safety. 

2.3.53. The Committee likewise unani­
mously adopted its opinion on the Commis­
sion proposal of 8 February for a Council 
Directive relating to methods of testing the 
biodegradability of non-ionic surfactants. 2 It 
approved the proposal, but wondered why 
provision had been made for a very general 
exemption. 

Protection of public health 

2.3.54. By a large majority the Committee 
delivered a favourable opinion on the draft 
proposal for a Council Directive laying down 
basic measures for the radiation protection of 
persons undergoing medical examinations or 
treatment.3 

Labelling of textile products 

2.3.55. In a unanimous opinion the Com­
mittee welcomed the proposal of 13 February 
for a Council Directive relating to textile 
names. 4 The Committee nevertheless felt that 
information given on iabels 'should always be 
positive'. 

Bull. EC 7/8-1980 
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Agricultural policy 

2.3.56. In two unanimous opmaons the 
Committee approved the Commission pro­
posals of 12 June for Council Regulations (a) 
for the stimulation of agricultural develop­
ment in the less-favoured areas of Northern 
Ireland and (b) on a common measure to 
improve the conditions under which agricul­
tural products in the eggs, poultrymeat, cer­
eals and cattlefeed sectors in Northern Ire­
land are processed and marketed. 5 The Com­
mittee requested the Commission to examine 
means of providing more immediate aid than 
that proposed, given the urgency of the prob­
lems in Northern Ireland. 

Air transport 

2.3.57. The Committee welcomed the 
efforts the Commission had made in its 
memorandum on 'The contribution of the 
European Communities to the development 
of air transport services'6 to give a com­
prehensive survey of air transport issues in 
the Community and provoke serious discus­
sions between the various Community 
institutions. 

Research policy 

2.3.58. In a unanimous opinion the Com­
mittee approved the Commission proposal to 

' OJ C 87 of 9.4.1980; Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.1.7. 
' OJ C 104 of 28.4.1980; Bull. EC 2-1980, point 2.1.6. 
' Bull. EC 12-1979, point 2.1.71. 
' OJ C 63 of 13.3.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.1.34. 
' OJ C 179 of 17.7.1980; Bull. EC 6-1980, point 
2.1.109. 
' Supplement 5/79-Bull. EC. 
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European Investment Bank 

the Council of 21 January for a multiannual 
Community programme of research and 
development in biomolecular engineering 
(indirect action 1981-85).1 The Committee 
felt that it was essential that Europe should 
not fall behind the rest of the world in the 
development of biomolecular technology, 
which could be of great interest both for the 
improvement of industrial techniques and for 
the protection of the environment in the 
Member States. 

Amendment of Rules of Procedure 

2.3.59. The Committee adopted at second 
reading certain changes2 to its Rules of Proce­
dure designed to improve the way in which it 
operated and make the purpose of its work 
clearer. These changes were approved by the 
Council on 22 July and entered into force 
with effect from that date. 

European Investment Bank 

Operations in July and August 

2.3.60. In July and August the loans 
granted by the European Investment Bank for 
investments concerning the Community total­
led 250 million units of accountl of which 
54.2 million u.a. from the New Community 
Instrument (NCI-'Ortoli facility').4 Of the 
total, 157.2 million u.a. was for investments 
in Italy, 55.4 million u.a. in the United King­
dom, 19.4 million u.a. in Ireland and 18 mil­
lion u.a. in Denmark. Outside the Commun­
ity and under the Financial Protocols 
annexed to cooperation or association agree­
ments with Mediterranean countries, the 
Bank granted loans totalling 111 million u.a.: 
104 million u.a. to Turkey, 4 million u.a. to 
Jordan and 3 million u.a. to Lebanon. 
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Finally, 18.9 million u.a. was granted for 
investments in the signatory States of the first 
Lome Convention: 11.5 million for Fiji, 4.4 
million for Guinea and 3 million for the Ivory 
Coast. These loans bring total EIB financing 
during the first eight months of 1980 to 
1 732.6 million u.a. 

Community 

I 

Italy 

2.3.61. Loans worth LIT 95 000 million 
have been granted for energy investments: 
LIT 71 000 million to SNAM SpA of the ENI 
(Ente Nazionale Idrocarburi) group (LIT 
50 000 million from NCI resources and LIT 
21 000 million from the Bank's own funds) 
towards construction of two stretches ( 4 70 
and 370 km each) of the Algeria-Italy gasline 
in Tunisia and in Calabria and under the 
Messina Straits. The Tunisian section, lying 
outside the Community but of direct interest 
to it, was financed on the basis of special 
authorization from the EIB's Board of Gover­
nors (one Minister-usually the Finance 
Minister-from each Member State). 

Two loans have been granted to ENEL (Ente 
Nazionale per I'Energia Elettrica): LIT 
10 000 million will be used to reinforce the 

1 OJ C 28 of 5.2.1980; Bull. EC 1-1980, pomt 
2.1.73. 
2 Bull. EC 1-1980, point 2.3.38. 
' The EIB unit of account is made up in the same 
way as the ECU and the European unit of account. 
The conversion rates at 30 June 1980 used by the 
Bank in statistics for the third quarter were: 1 u.a. 
= DM 2.53, UKL 0.61, FF 5.85, LIT 1 199, HFL 
2.76, BFR 40.24, LFR 40.24, DKR 7.79, IRL 
0.67, USD 1.43. 
• OJ L 298 of 25.10.1978; Bull. EC 10-1978, 
point 2.1.10. 
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electricity network in Sardinia and another 
LIT 10 000 million will be used to convert 
the Brindisi power station from oil- to coal­
firing. A third loan of LIT 4 000 million, for 
rationalizing energy use, has gone to 
UNICEM SpA cement works in Tuscany, 
Emilia Romagna and Piedmont. 

A loan of LIT 58 700 million will be used for 
modernizing and reinforcing the Alitalia fleet 
by the purchase of eight AirbJ.Is A 300 jetlin­
ers. The aircraft will be used on European 
routes and for services to the Middle East. 
Two loans totalling LIT 35 000 million have 
been made for industrial development: the 
Cassa per il Mezzogiorno received LIT 
15 000 million from the NCI and LIT 11 000 
million from the Bank's own funds for 
further expansion of the industrial estate at 
Syracuse, which will include road improve­
ments, water supply and flood prevention 
works. The second loan is for LIT 9 000 mil­
lion to help finance expansion of a paper mill 
of Cartiere del Garda SpA in Trentino-Alto 
Adige. Of this total, LIT 81 000 million car­
ries a 3% interest subsidy under the arrange­
ments adopted when Italy joined the EMS. 1 

United Kingdom 

2.3.62. Loans to finance industrial invest­
ments totalled UKL 18.5 million. This figure 
is made up of UKL 8 million for Michelin 
(Belfast) Ltd to modernize and expand radial­
tyee factories in Belfast and Ballymena; UKL 
5 million for the Cleveland Bridge and 
Engineering Company, Darlington, C~. 
Durham, for the construction and equipment 
of a heavy engineering works; UKL 3 million 
to Proprietors of Hay's Wharf Ltd for a 
whisky blending and bottling plant in Dum­
barton; and UKL 2.5 million for Baker Per­
kins Holdings Ltd in Gateshead, Tyne and 
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Wear, for a new packaging machinery 
factory. 

As a contribution to infrastructure develop­
ment the Bank has lent UKL 7.1 million via 
the National Water Council to the Anglian 
Water Authority to help finance water and 
sewage schemes on South Humberside. A 
loan of UKL 5 million has also been made to 
the Shetland Islands Council for road­
building, housing, water and sewage facilities 
to serve the development of the North Sea oil 
industry. Lastly, a loan of UKL 3 million will 
go towards a new cross-Channel car and 
freight ferry terminal at Ramsgate, Kent. 

Ireland 

2.3.63. In Ireland the EIB has lent IRL 13 
million in the form of two global loans to the 
Industrial Credit Company Ltd. IRL 10 mil­
lion will be on-lent to help set up or expand 
small- and medium-scale industrial ventures. 
The other IRL 3 million will go towards 
financing investment aimed at securing more 
rational use of energy in small- and medium­
scale industrial ventures throughout Ireland, 
either through the substitution of new fuels 
for hydrocarbons, by increasing energy pro­
duction (solar panels, small hydroelectric 
power stations) or by developing heat recov­
ery or insulation systems. This is the first 
example of a global loan by the EIB for the 
purpose of saving energy. 

Denmark 

2.3.64. The EIB has loaned DKR 140 mil­
lion towards financing Unit 5 (610 MW) of 
Asnaes thermal power station on Sjaelland. 

' OJ L 200 of 8.8.1979; Bull. EC 7/8-1979, point 
2.1.2. 
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Originally planned to run on oil, the station 
will be adapted, with the financial assistance 
of the Bank, to run on coal. Besides construc­
tion of the new Unit the loan will help to 
finance a coal harbour to accommodate ships 
of 60 000 tonnes and ancillary fuel storage 
and distribution facilities. 

Outside the Community 

2.3.65. A total of 111 million u.a. has been 
lent to three Mediterranean countries: Tur­
key, Jordan and Lebanon. 

Turkey 

2.3.66. A loan of 60 million u.a. on special 
conditions was made from the Community's 
budget funds to help finance construction of 
a 1 800 MW hydroelectric complex at 
Karakaya on the Euphrates in south-east Tur­
key. Two global loans totalling 40 million 
u.a. have been made from the Bank's own 
resources. One is for 30 million u.a. to the 
Industrial Development Bank of Turkey 
(TSKB) and the other for 10 million u.a. to 
the Industrial Credit and Investment Bank 
(SYKB) as a contribution to private industrial 
investment by small and medium-scale 
industrial ventures. Lastly, a loan of 4 million 
u.a. has been made to the Turkish Govern­
ment to help finance a unit to produce coated 
paper and board and an effluent treatment 
plant at the Dalaman paper mill in western 
Anatolia. 

jordan 

2.3.67. With a loan of 4 million u.a. the 
EIB is helping to finance the extension of an 
electricity transmission and distribution net­
work in the Zerqa region to the north-east of 
Amman. 
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Lebanon 

2.3.68. The Bank has made a loan of 3 mil­
lion u.a. to part-finance two new 125 MW 
generator units for the thermal power station 
at Zouk near Beirut. This loan, like the one 
for Jordan, carries an interest subsidy borne 
by the Community budget. 

ACP States 

2.3.69. Under the first Lome Convention 
the EIB has lent 11.5 million u.a. for the 
development of hydroelectric resources on 
Viti Levu, the largest and most heavily popu­
lated of the Fiji Islands; 4.4 million u.a. will 
go towards modernizing an alumina works at 
Fria-Kimbo, north of Conakry in Guinea; 3 
million u.a. has been lent to finance a flour 
mill, silos and loading and unloading 
facilities in the port of San Pedro in west 
Ivory Coast. All these loans carry an interest 
subsidy financed out of the resources of the 
European Development Fund (EDF). 

Financing Community activities 

Budgets 

General budget 

Adoption of the general 
budget for 1980 

2.3.70. At the 9 July sitting of Parliament 
the President was able to declare, under Arti­
cle 203(7) of the EEC Treaty, that the general 
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budget of the European Communities for 
1980 had been finally adopted.' 

The budget as it now stands is identical with 
the Council draft of 20 Junel except for the 
amendments relating to non-compulsory 
expenditure made by Parliament at its spe­
cial part-session on 26 and 27 June and 
endorsed by the Council. • 

With these amendments the 1980 budget 
comprises some 17 319 million EUA in total 
appropriations for commitments and some 
15 683 million EUA in total appropriations 
for payments, figures which are up by 
12.29% and 8.56% respectively on the 1979 
totals. As far as non-compulsory expenditure 
is concerned, total appropriations for com­
mitments are up by 21.44% despite the 
13.3% maximum rate of increase fixed by 
the Commission in accordance with the Tre­
aty. By contrast total appropriations for pay-
ments are down by 3.48%. 

T abie 2 shows the situation at the main 
stages of the budgetary procedure. 

Preliminary draft budget for 1981 

2.3. 71. On 9 July the Commission adopted 
the preliminary draft budget for 1981.' This 
year's figures are 21 731 806 948 EUA in 
total appropriations for commitments and 
20 051 370 902 EUA in total appropriations 
for payments, increases of 25.48% and 
27.85% respectively by comparison with the 
1980 budget. The rate for the calculation of 
VAT own resources works out at 0.95% as 
against 0.72% in 1980. 

The maximum rate of increase for non­
compulsory expenditure fixed by the Com­
mission in accordance with Article 203(9) of 
the EEC Treaty is 12.2% as against 13.3% in 
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1980; this leaves Parliament with a 6.1% 
margin for manreuvre. 

T abies 3 to 6 show the appropriations for the 
individual institutions and the different sec­
tors covered by Community policies, together 
with estimated revenue. 

2.3. 72. On 11 July Parliament passed a 
resolution on the implementation of the 1979 
budget (financial situation of the Com­
munities as at 31 December 1979).6 

Implementing the compromise 
of 30 May 

Measures in favour 
of the United Kingdom 

2.3.73. On 21 and 22 July the Council dis­
cussed the two proposals' presented by the 
Commission on 12 June for giving effect to 
the general compromise of 30 May on the 
British contribution to the Community 
budget. 8 The guidelines evolved will enable 
the subsidiary Council bodies to continue the 
examination of the proposals pending the 
opinion of Parliament, which is expected in 
September. 

1 Point 1.1.2; OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980; OJ L 242 of 
15.9.1980. 
' Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.3.44. 
1 OJ C 187 of 24.7.1980; Bull. EC 6-1980, points 
2.3.20 to 2.3.24 and 2.3.45. 
• Bull. EC 6-1980, point 2.3.46. 
1 Points 1.1.3 to 1.1.13. 
' OJ C 197 of 4.8.1980. 
' OJ C 169 of 9.7.1980; OJ C 171 of 11.7.1980; Bull. 
EC 6-1980, points 1.2.1 to 1.2.3. 
' OJ C 158 of 27.6.1980; Bull. EC 5-1980, points 1.1.1 
to 1.1.18. 

125 



Financing Community activities Financing Community activities 

Table 2 - 1980 budget: stages of the budgetary procedure 

Prelimmary draft• Councol draft-second reading New draft• Change 1980 budget Change 

Total .1pprops 
% T oral .1pprops % T oral approps % Total approps % Total approps % T oral approps % Total approps % T oral approps % Total approps 

% 
Total approps % 

T oral approps % T oral approps % 
for commitS for payments for comm1ts for payments for commits for payments for commits (5/1) for payments (6/2) for commits for payments for commits (9/5) for payments (10/6) 

I 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 

I. COMMISSION 

A. Intervention approps. 
• Agriculture/fisheries 11 803 486 000' 65.89 11 667 229 000' 71.64 11 702 532 000 70.27 11 585 275 000 75.17 12 061 035 000 67.02 11 943 778 000 73.43 + 257 549 000 + 2.18 + 276 549 000 + 2.37 11 995 526 000 69.26 11 878 269 000 75.73 - 65 509 000 - 0.54 - 52 350 000 - 0.43 

• Social 1 134 022 000 6.33 685 172 000 4.21 899 000 000 5.40 392 950 000 2.55 985 010 000 5.47 444 130 000 2.73 - 149 012 000 - 13.14 - 241 042 000 - 35.18 932 660 000 5.38 402 410 000 2.56 - 52 350 000 - 5.31 - 41 720 000 - 9.39 

• Regional 1 400 000 000 7.81 810 000 000 4.97 1 215 000 000 7.30 782 500 000 5.08 1 700 000 000 9.44 910 000 000 5.59 + 300 000 000 + 21.43 + 100 000 000 + 12.35 1 365 000 000 7.88 603 000 000 3.84 - 376 720 000 - 22.16 - 307 000 000 - 33.73 

• Research, energy, industry, 
transport 665 413 000 3.71 488 774 000 3.00 426 832 000 2.56 372 391 000 2.42 477 647 000 2.65 399 231 000 2.45 - 187 766 000 - 28.22 - 89 543 000 - 18.32 443 432 000 2.56 379 491 000 2.41 - 34 215 000 - 7.1"6 - 55 955 000 - 13.51 

• Development cooperation 837 964 700' 4.68 666 264 700' 4.09 659 096 600 3.96 527 246 600 3.42 978 626 600 5.43 775 826 600 4.77 + 140 661 900 + 16.79 + 109 561 900 + 16.44 803 983 600 4.64 641 633 600 4.09 - 174 643 000 - 9.79 - 308 836 000 - 39.80 

• Other 68 000 000 0.38 68 000 000 0.42 - 68 000 000 - 68 000 000 - - - -
15 908 885 700 88.80 14 385 439 700 88.30 14 902 460 600 89.48 13 660 362 600 88.64 16 202 318 600 90.04 14 472 965 600 88.98 + 293 432 900 + 1.84 + 87 525 900 + 0.61 15 540 601 600 89.73 13 904 803 600 88.66 - 661 717 000 - 4.08 - 568 162 000 - 3.92 

B. Administrative approps. 
• Staff 458 373 000 2.56 458 373 000 2.81 421 404 000 2.53 421 404 000 2.73 424 980 800 2.36 424 980 800 2.61 - 33 392 200 - 7.28 - 33 392 200 - 7.28 421 313 300 421 313 300 - 3 667 500 - 0.86 - 3 667 500 - 0.86 

• Administration 153 123 400 0.85 153 123 400 0.94 140 591 200 0.84 140 591 200 0.91 142 528 400 0.79 142 528 400 0.87 - 10 595 000 - 6.92 - 10 595 000 - 6.92 135 398 100 135 398 100 - 7 130 300 - 5.00 - 7 130 300 - 5.00 
• Information 11 752 500 0.07 11 752 500 0.07 10 202 500 0.06 10 202 500 0.07 11 792 000 0.06 11 792 000 0.07 + 39 500 + 0.34 + 39 500 + 0.34 10 202 500 10 202 500 - 1 589 500 - 13.47. - 1 589 500 - 13.47 

• Aids and subsidies 53 798 050 0.30 53 798 050 0.33 51 160 900 0.31 51160 900 0.33 52 177 250 0.28 52 177 250 0.32 - 1 620 800 - 3.01 - 1 620 800 - 3.01 51 160 900 51 160 900 - 1 016 350 - 1.48 - 1 016 350 - 1.48 

677 046 950 3.78 677 046 950 4.16 623 358 600 3.74 623 358 600 4.04 631 478 450 3.50 631 478 450 3.88 - 45 568 500 - 6.73 - 45 568 500 - 6.73 618 074 800 3.56 618 074 880 3.94 - 13 403 650 - 2.12 - 13 403 650 - 2.12 

C. Reserve 
• Chapter 100 - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -
• Chapter 101 10 000 000 0.06 10 000 000 0.06 5 000 000 0.03 5 000 000 0.03 5 000 000 0.02 5 000 000 0.03 - 5 000 000 - 50.00 - 5 000 000 - 50.00 - - - -
• Chapter 102 3 000 000 0.02 3 000 000 0.02 token entry token entry token entry token entry - 3 000 000 - 3 000 000 5 000 000 5 000 000 - -
• Chapter 103 225 000 000 1.26 120 000 000 0.74 - - - - - 225 000 000 - 120 000 000 - - - -

238 000 000 1.33 133 000 000 0.82 5 000 000 0.03 5 000 000 0.03 5 000 000 0.02 5 000 000 0.03 - 233 000 000 - 128 000 000 

D. Repayments to 
Member States 775 463 000 4.33 775 463 000 4.76 802 363 000 4.82 802 363 000 5.21 834 523 000 4.65 834 523 000 5.13 - 59 060 000 + 7.62 + 59 060 000 + 7.62 834 523 000 4.81 834 523 000 5.32 - -

Commission total 17 599 395 650 98.24 15 970 949 650 98.06 16 333 182 200 98.07 15 091 084 200 97.92 17 673 320 050 98.22 15 943 967 050 98.03 + 73 924 400 + 0.42 - 26 982 600 - 0.17 16 998 199 400 98.15 15 362 401 400 97.96 - 675 120 650 - 3.82 - 581 565 650 - 3.64 

II. OTHER INSTITUTIONS 315 854 781 1.76 315 854 781 1.94 320 695 861 1.93 320 695 861 2.08 320 695 861 1.78 320 695 861 1.97 + 4 841 080 + 1.53 + 4 841 080 + 1.53 320 695 861 1.85 320 695 801 2.04 - -

Grand total 17 915 250 431 100.00 16 286 804 431 100.00 16 653 878 061 100.00 15 411 780 061 100.00 17 994 015 911 100.00 16 264 662 911 100.00 + 78 765 480 + 0.44 - 22 141 520 - 0.14 17 318 895 261 100.00 15 683 097 261 100.00 - 675 120 650 - 3.75 - 581 565 650 - 3.57 

1 Including the first and second letters of amendment to the preliminary draft budget. 
1: The Commission has transferred the appropriations for refunds in respect of 'food aid' and • ACP-India sugar' to Title 9, but in this table rhe:~te appropnations have been included in Titles 6 and 7 to make the different stages in the budgetary procedure comparable. 

Takang into account the letter of amendment. 
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Table 3- Total appropriations for commitments 

Appropriations 1980 Preliminary draft budget 1981 Increase 
I nstitut1on from 1980 

Amount I % Amount I % to 1981 

Parliament 177 391 432 1.02 199 356 650 0.92 + 12.38 

Council 108 557 859 0.63 121 678 425 0.56 + 12.09 

Commission 16 998 199 400 98.15 21 367 683 743 98.32 + 25.71 

Court of Justice 21 707 280 0.13 27 629 460 0.13 + 27.28 

Court of Auditors 13 029 290 0.07 15 458 670 0.07 + 18.55 

Total 17 318 895 261 100.00 21 731 806 948 100.00 + 25.48 

Table 4 - Total appropriations for payments 

Appropriatwns 1980 Preliminary draft budget 1981 Increase 
Institution from 1980 

Amount I % Amount I % to 1981 

Parliament 177 391 432 1.13 199 356 650 0.99 + 12.38 

Council 108 557 859 0.69 121 678 425 0.61 + 12.09 

Commission 15 362 401 400 97.96 19 687 247 697 98.18 + 28.15 

Court of Justice 21 707 280 0.14 27 629 460 0.14 + 27.28 

Court of Auditors 13 039 290 0.08 15 458 670 0.08 + 18.55 

Total 15 683 097 261 100.00 20 051 370 902 100.00 + 27.85 
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Table 5 - Trend in Community expenditure by sector (1980-1981) 

!980 budget Prebmmary draft 1981 Change 

Total approp- Total approp- Total approp- Total approp- Total approp- Total approp-
Sector riattons for % nations for % riations for % riations for % riations for % riations for % 

commitments payments commitments payments commitments payments 

I 2 3 4 5 6 

AGRICULTVRE 
• EAGGF Guarantee (Titles 6 and 7) II 485 510 000 66.31 11 485 510 000 73.23 12 961 467 000 59.55 12 941 467 000 64.54 + 1 455 957 000 + 12.68 + 1 455 957 000 + 12.68 
• EAGGF Guidance (80-85) 447 680 000 2.58 317 150 000 2.02 669 400 000 3.08 490 100 000 2.44 + 221 720 000 + 49.53 + 172 950 000 + 54.53 
• Fisheries (86-89) so 070 000 0.28 64 070 000 0.40 114 364 000 0.53 69 114 000 0.34 + 64 294 000 + 128.41 ·+ 5 044 000 + 7.87 
• Agriculture (31) 12 266 000 0.07 11 539 000 0.07 14 899 000 0.07 13 647 000 0.07 + 2 633 000 + 21.47 + 2 108 000 + 18.27 

Total 11 995 526 000 69.26 11 878 269 000 75.73 13 740 130 000 63.23 13 514 328 000 67.40 + 1 744 604 000 + 14.54 + 1 636 059 000 + 13.77 

SOCIAL 
• Social Fund (50-53) 909 500 000 5.25 j74 300 000 2.38 1 000 000 000 4.60 710 000 000 3.54 + 90 500 000 + 9.95 + 335 700 000 + 89.69 
• ECSC contributions (54) token entry - token entry - token entry - token entry - - - - -
• Disasters (59) 5 000 000 0.02 5 000 000 0.03 6 000 000 0.03 6 000 000 0.03 + 1 000 000 + 20.00 + 1 000 000 + 20.00 
• Miscellaneous (30 and 35) 18 160 000 0.10 23 110 000 0.14 28 163 000 0.13 26 999 000 0.13 + 10 003 000 + 55.08 + 3 889 000 + 16.83 

Total 932 660 000 5.38 402 410 000 2.56 1 034 163 000 4.76 742 999 000 3.71 + 101 503 000 + 10.88 + 340 589 000 + 84.64 

REGIONAL 
• Regional Fund (55, 56) 1 165 000 000 6.72 403 000 000 2.56 1 600 000 000 7.36 770 000 000 3.84 + 435 000 000 + 37.34 + 367 000 000 + 91.07 
• Suppl. measures UK (58) token entry - token entry - 1 074 700 000 4.95 1 074 700 000 5.36 + 1 074 700 000 - + 1 074 700 000 -
• Interest subsidies (570) 200 000 000 1.15 200 000 000 1.27 200 000 000 0.92 200 000 000 1.00 - - - -

Total 1 365 000 000 7.88 603 000 000 3.84 2 874 700 000 13.23 2 044 700 000 10.20 + 1 509 700 000 + 110.60 + 1 441 700 000 + 239.09 

RESEARCH, ENERGY, INDUSTRY, 
TRANSPORT 
• Energy (32) 100 000 000 0.57 77 100 000 0.49 143 000 000 0.66 48 515 000 0.24 + 43 000 000 + 43.00 - 28 585 000 - 37.08 
• Research and investment (33) 312 918 000 1.80 276 709 000 1.76 313 773 000 1.44 291 741 000 1.45 + 855 000 + 0.27 + 15 032 000 + 5.43 
• Industry (370-376) 12 077 000 0.06 6 970 000 0.04 18 150 000 0.08 13 177 000 0.07 + 6 073 000 + 50.29 + 6 207 000 + 89.05 
• TransfJon (378, 379) 1 100 000 0.00 1 100 000 0.00 1 430 000 0.01 1 430 000 0.01 + 330 000 + 30.00 + 330 000 + 30.00 
• Misce laneous (34, 36, 39) 17 337 000 0.10 17 612 000 0.11 23 664 000 0.11 21 597 000 0.11 + 6 327 000 + 36.49 + 3 985 000 + 22.63 

Total 443 432 000 2.56 379 491 000 2.41 500 017 000 2.30 376 460 000 1.88 + 56 585 000 + 12.76 - 3 031 000 - 0.80 
DEVELOPMENT COOPERATION 
• Food aid (92) 395 544 000 2.28 395 544 000 2.52 390 498 000 1.80 390 498 000 1.95 - 5 046 000 - 1.28 - s 046 000 - 1.28 
• Non-associated DCs (93) 145 275 000 0.83 26 775 000 0.17 209 350 000 0.96 74 350 000 0.37 + 64 075 000 + 44.11 + 47 575 000 + 177.68 
• Disasters (95) 43 000 000 0.24 43 000 000 0.27 10 000 000 0.05 10 000 000 0.05 - 33 000 000 - 76.74 - 33 000 000 - 76.74 
• Coop. with third countnes (96) 178 245 000 1.02 137 645 000 0.87 278 178 705 1.28 207 265 659 1.03 + 99 933 705 + 56.07 + 69 620 659 + 50.58 
• Miscellaneous (94, 97, 99) 41 91!1600 0.24 38 669 600 0.24 70 697 500 0.33 66 697 500 0.33 + 28 777 900 + 68.65 + 28 027 900 + 72.48 

Total 803 983 600 4.64 641 633 600 4.09 958 724 205 4.41 748 811 159 3.73 + !54 740 605 + 19.25 + 107 177 559 + 16.70 

e Staff (T1de I) 421 313 300 2.43 421 313 300 2.68 471 908 400 2.17 471 908 400 2.35 + 50 595 100 + 12.01 + so 595 100 + 12.01 
• Admin. (T1de 2 exd. 254, 272, 273 and 28, 29) 135 398 100 0.78 135 398 100 0.86 185 719 500 0.85 185 719 500 0.93 + so 321 400 + 37.17 + so 321 400 + 37.17 
• Information (254, 272, 273) 10 202 500 0.05 10 202 500 0.06 14 045 000 0.06 14 045 000 0.07 + 3 842 500 + 37.66 + 3 842 500 + 37.66 
• Aid subSidies (28, 29) 51 160 900 0.29 51 160 900 0.32 59 858 200 0.28 59 858 200 0.30 + 8 697 300 + 17.00 + 8 697 300 + 17.00 

Total 618 074 800 3.56 618 074 800 3.94 731 531 100 3.37 731 531 100 3.65 + 113 456 300 + 18.36 + 113 456 300 + 18.36 

• Reserves (101, 102) 5 000 000 0.02 5 000 000 0.03 6 000 000 0.03 6 000 000 0.03 + 1 000 000 + 20.00 + 1 000 000 + 20.00 
• Repayments to Member States (40) (Incl. 
special repayments to Greece (49) and UK 
(571) 834 523 000 4.81 834 523 000 5.32 1 053 418 438 4.85 1 053 418 438 5.25 + 218 895 438 + 26.23 + 218 895 438 + 26.23 
• Fmancial mechanism (41) token entry - token entry - 469 000 000 216 469 000 000 2.34 + 469 000 000 - + 469 000 000 -

Commission total 16 998 199 400 98.15 15 362 401 400 97.96 21 367 683 743 98.32 19 687 247 697 98.18 + 4 369 484 343 + 25.71 + 4 324 846 297 + 28.15 

Other anstitutions 320 695 861 1.85 320 695 861 2.04 364 123 205 1.68 364 123 205 1.82 + ••B 427 344 + 13.54 + 43 427 344 + 13.54 

Grand total 17 318 895 261 100.000 IS 683 097 261 100.00 21 731 806 948 100.00 20 051 370 902 100.00 + 4 412 911 687 + 25.48 + 4 368 273 641 + 27.85 
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After a lengthy discussion on the adjustment 
of the financial mechanism of 17 May 19761 

a consensus emerged on several contentious 
points involving the actual interpretation of 
the political compromise reached on 30 May, 
some delegations feeling that the arrange­
ments as expressed in the legal instruments 
were not exactly what had been agreed. The 
Commission's proposal for adapting the 
1976 financial mechanism (which used to be 
called the correcting mechanism)l naturally 
reaffirms the original aim of the mechanism: 
to prevent a situation incompatible with the 
proper functioning of the Community from 
arising where a Member State's economy, 
being in a special situation, would be forced 
to bear a disproportionate burden in the 
financing of the Community budget. The 
proposal would also simplify a number of 
points and remove certain limits which are 
contained in the May 1976 text. 

At the Council meeting on 21 and 22 July the 
points at issue were whether the Regulation 

Table 6 - Estimated revenue 

Type of revenue 

Own resources 
• Customs duties 
• Agricultural levies 
• Sugar levies 

• VAT 

Surplus from previous financial year 

Financial contributions from the Member States 

Other contributions 

Miscellaneous revenue 

Total 
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adjusting the financial mechanism was to 
cover 1980 and 1981 or whether it also 
applied to 1982; whether the removal of the 
limits as proposed by the Commission 
applied to the financial mechanism for the 
three years; whether applicability of the 
financial mechanism (adjusted or not) to 
1982 depended on the results of the examin­
ation to be conducted by the Commission in 
accordance with the mandate on structural 
changes given by the Council on 30 May in 
its conclusions. 

The conflicting interpretations thrown up by 
the discussions and the different 'approaches' 
of some of the delegations necessitated bi­
lateral contacts followed by a meeting of the 
Permanent Representatives Committee, 
whose conclusions were endorsed by the 

' OJ L 131 of 20.5.1976; Bull. EC 5-1976, point 2470. 
2 Bull. EC 6-1980, points 1.2.2 and 1.2.3. 

. (mtllton EUA) 

1980 1981 

15 042.5 19 705.1 
5 667.8 6 274.0 

1 719.2 1 902.1 
504.5 571.1 

7 151.0 10 957.9 

458.6 token entry 

- 180.4 

17.8 19.4 

164.1 146.5 

15 683.1 20 051.4 
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Council in the afternoon of 22 July. The sol­
ution which won acceptance by all the dele­
gations can be summarized as follows: 
(i) the Regulation adjusting the financial 
mechanism of 1976 will apply in 1980 and 
1981. It will also apply in 1982 if, in accord­
ance with the last sentence of Section 7 of the 
Council's conclusions of 30 May, a solution 
based on the one adopted for 1980-81 proves 
necessary for 1982 - in other words if the 
review of the situation which the Commis­
sion is to undertake shows that a Member 
State may again find itself in an unacceptable 
situation; 
(ii) the limits built into the financial 
mechanism will be removed, but only for the 
United Kingdom; 
(iii) the agreement to be finalized will be 
incorporated into the amended Regulation on 
the financial mechanism (including certain 
changes contained in the Commission pro­
posal of last June), when the legal details of 
the solutions have been worked out. 

The Commission's second proposal, which 
deals with the supplementary measures in 
favour of the United Kingdom, is still being 
studied within the Council. 

Own resources 

2.3.74. In response to requests submitted by 
three Member States regarding the calcula­
tion of the VAT own resources basis for 
1979, the Commission authorized the United 
Kingdom (18 July)! and France and the 
Netherlands (22 July):1 

• not to take into account certain categories 
of transaction listed in Annexes E, F and G to 
the Sixth VAT Directive; and 
• to use approximate estimates in other 
categories of transaction referred to in the 
same annexes, 
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where accurate calculation would involve an 
inordinate amount of administrative work 
compared with the effect of the transactions 
in question on the total VAT own resources 
basis of these Member States. 

With these authorizations the VAT Own 
Resources Committee has completed its work 
on the definition of VAT financial compensa­
tions. 

2.3.75 On 1 July the six Member States 
concerned sent to the Commission the first­
ever statement of their actual VAT basis for 
1979, thus enabling the Commission to work 
out the difference between what the Member 
States actually paid each month on the basis 
of estimates and what they should have paid 
by reference to their definitive VAT basis. 
The financial contributions of the other three 
Member States have been adjusted accord­
ingly in order to maintain the original alloca­
tion given in the 1979 budget between VAT 
own resources and financial contributions. 

Financial Regulation 
2.3.76. July and August saw two develop­
ments concerning the Financial Regulation. 

In the first place the Commission amended its 
proposal for the replacement of the EUA by 
the ECU in the various Community financial 
instruments (general budget, ECSC opera­
tions, EDF and certain Community legisla­
tion) presented to the Council on 13 
December 1979.3 

Following certain adjustments to the Com­
mission's initial proposal suggested by Parlia-

' OJ L 222 of 23.8.1980. 
' OJ L 239 of 12.9.1980. 
' OJ C 55 of 5.3.1980; Bull. EC 12-1979, points 2.1.2 
and 2.3.98. 
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ment in an opinion issued on 23 May 19801 

the Commission, acting under the second 
paragraph of Article 149 of the Treaty, duly 
presented to the Council an amended pro­
posal on 4 July. It hopes that the Council will 
act on it as soon as possible, so that the ECU 
can be used in all Community transactions. 

2.3. 77. On 5 August the Commission con­
sulted the other institutions on a draft Regu­
lation amending its Regulation of 30 June 
19752 on measures of implementation of cer­
tain provisions of the Financial Regulation in 
an attempt to bring it into line with the 
Financial Regulation of 21 December 19773 

currently in force. On completion of the con­
sultation exercise, probably before the end of 
the year, the Commission will be in a posi­
tion to finalize the new text of its implemen­
tation measures. 

Projections for the budget 
for 1981, 1982 and 1983 

2.3. 78. Acting under the Council Decision 
of 21 April 197()4 concerning financial fore­
casts covering several years the Commission 
sent the budgetary authority a document, 
attached to its preliminary draft general 
budget for 1981, entitled 'Projections for the 
budget for 1981, 1982 and 1983'. The title 
reflects the serious difficulties inherent in 
compiling meaningful forecasts for the next 
three years under present circumstances. 

The Community is faced with th,e imminent 
exhaustion of its own resources, the need to 
contain EAGGF Guarantee Section expendi­
ture and the desire to give the Community 
budget a greater role to play in bringing the 
economies of the Member States closer 
together. The situation is further complicated 
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by the emergence of a major new item of 
expenditure as a result of the decision of 30 
May to refund to the United Kingdom 
around two-thirds of its scheduled net con­
tributions for 1980 and .1981, by the man­
date given to the Commission on 30 May to 
put forward proposals for restructuring the 
Community budget to ensure that situations 
do not arise which are unacceptable to the 
Member States and by the second enlarge­
ment, which gets under way with the acces­
sion of Greece in 1981. 

This being so, the Commission felt that, until 
its proposals for restructuring the budget 
have taken shape, it could only give 
hypothetical figures for the next three years. 

In its discussion of the EAGGF Guarantee 
Section the document presents three different 
assumptions, corresponding to a 6%, 12% 
and 18% rate of growth of expenditure; this 
will give an idea of the effect of varying 
degrees of success in containing expenditure 
under the common agricultural policy. The 
appropriations for EAGGF Guidance Section 
expenditure on structural improvements are 
determined by the allocation for the five 
years from 1980 to 1984. Two sets of 
assumptions are made for the Social Fund, 
the Regional Fund, energy, research, industry 
and transport. The first starts from the pre­
mise that annual growth is limited to the 
maximum rate for non-compulsory expendi­
ture, established pursuant to Article 203 of 
the EEC Treaty and averaging about 12% in 
1982-83. The second works on a 25% rise, 
which is more in keeping with the needs of 

1 OJ C 147 of 16.6.1980; Bull. EC 5-1980, point 
2.3.11. 
' OJ L 170 of 1.7.1975. 
1 OJ L 356 of 31.12.1977. 
• OJ L 94 of 28.4.1970. 
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the Community. The ordinary kind of struc­
tural expenditure will be supplemented by 
new expenditure under the measures to help 
the United Kingdom in 1981-82. 

Coupled with the forecasts for development 
cooperation, compulsory repayments to 
Member States, the administrative expendi­
ture of the institutions and various other fac­
tors, this would result in an increase in the 
grand total of appropriations for commit­
ment from 21 700 million EUA in 1981 to 
between 23 400 million and 25 400 million 
EUA in 1982. No grand total is given for 
1983 since there are still too many impon­
derables attaching to the issut:s of budgetary 
restructuring and to the possibility that the 
measures in favour of the United Kingdom 
might be extended. 

Appropriations for payment would rise from 
20 000 million EUA in 1981 to between 
22 600 million and 24 400 million EUA in 
1982. Since the total own resources available 
in 1982 will amount to 22 700 million EUA 
if the VAT ceiling is held at 1%, it will not be 
possible to maintain that ceiling unless 
Guarantee Section expenditure is held firmly 
to an annual growth rate of no more than 
6%. 

Financial operations 

ECSC 

Loans raised 

2.3. 79. In July the Commission concluded 
the following borrowing operations: 
(i) a USD 50 million bond issue underwrit­
ten by an international syndicate of banks. 
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The bonds bear interest at the nominal rate 
of 11.25% payable annually over ten years. 
The loan was offered to the public at 
99.75% of the nominal value. Official quota­
tion of the bonds on the Luxembourg 
exchange has been applied for; 

(ii) a number of private placings in Luxem­
bourg francs and German marks totalling 55 
million EUA. 

The following borrowing operations were 
concluded in August: 

(i) a DM 150 million bond issue underwrit­
ten by a syndicate of German banks. The 
bonds bear interest at the nominal rate of 
77 I 8% payable annually over twelve years. 
The loan was offered to the public at par. 
Official quotation of the bonds on the Frank­
furt, Berlin, Dusseldorf, Hamburg and 
Munich exchanges has been applied for; 

(ii) a USD 25 million bond issue underwrit­
ten by an international syndicate of banks. 
The bonds bear interest at the nominal rate 
of 11% payable annually over seven years. 
The loan was offered to the public at par. 
Official quotation of the bonds on the Lux­
embourg and Singapore exchanges has been 
applied for; 

(iii) two private placings in French francs 
totalling 5 million EUA. 

Loans granted 

Loans paid out 

2.3.80. Pursuant to Articles 54 and 56 of 
the ECSC Treaty, the Commission made 
loans in July amounting to 109 290 000 
EUA. 
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Industrial loans 

Industrial loans paid out pursuant to Article 
54 of the ECSC Treaty amounted to 
70 380 000 EUA. They were granted to: 

• Roechling-Burbach GmbH, Volklingen; 

• Sollac, Paris; 

• Usinor, Paris; 

• Charbonnages de France, Paris; 

• Arbed SA, Luxembourg. 

Convenion loans 

Conversion loans paid out pursuant to Arti­
cle 56 of the ECSC Treaty amounted to 
35 340 000 EUA. They were granted-to: 

France 

• Nord/Pas-de-Calais: factory manufactur­
ing gearboxes for motor vehicles; 

• Lorraine: one factory manufacturing 
engines and another manufacturing gear­
boxes. 

Federal Republic of Germany 

• Saar: steel works. 

Loan decisions 

2.3.81. The Commission also approved the 
grant of industrial loans under Article 54 of 
the ECSC Treaty amounting to 66 540 000 
EUA. They were granted to: 

(i) Badische Stahlwerke GmbH, Kehl/ 
Rhein; 

(ii) Saarberwerke AG, Saarbriicken; 

(iii) Round Oak Steel Works, Brierley Hill; 

(iv) Centrale siderurgique de Richemont, 
Richemont. 
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The Commission also obtained the Council's 
approval for conversion loans amounting to 
89 890 000 EUA for the following: 

Federal Republic of Germany 

Global loan for small- and medium-sized 
businesses in North-Rhine Westphalia. 

France 

Global loan for small- and medium-sized 
businesses in a number of regions. 

Rhone-Alpes: a similar global loan for small­
and medium-sized businesses. 

Italy 

Campania: global loan for small- and 
medium-sized businesses. 

Luxembourg 

Factory manufacturing special tools for the 
motor industry. 

Global loan for all small- and medium-sized 
businesses. 

United Kingdom 

Wales: one factory specializing in the manu­
facture of titanium pellets and another com­
pany specializing in coal mining and shale. 

EEC 

Loans raised 

2.3.82. In July the Commission concluded 
the following borrowing operation under the 
Ortoli facility: 
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• a USD 70 million bond issue underwritten 
by an international syndicate of banks. The 
bonds bear interest at the nominal rate of 
11% payable annually over fifteen years. The 
loan was offered to the public at par. Official 
quotation of the bonds on the Luxembourg 
exchange has been applied for. 

Euratom 

Loans raised 

2.3.83. The Commission concluded two 
private placings in Dutch guilders and Ger­
man marks totalling approximately 
23 300 000 EUA. 
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1. Units of account 

Units of account 

ECU/European unit of account 

Values in national cu"encies of one ECUIEUA 

National currency 30 june' 31 july> 29 August' 

Belgian franc and Luxembourg franc 40.2358 40.2032 40.5974 

German mark 2.51583 2.52615 2.52896 

Dutch guilder 2.75780 2.75463 2.75441 

Pound sterling 0.606103 0.602488 0.589946 

Danish krone 7.79476 7.81883 7.83096 

French franc 5.84625 5.85083 5.87692 

Italian lira 1 199.42 1 192.70 1 204.52 

Irish pound 0.671881 0.671891 0.674083 

United States dollar t.430W 1.41735 1.41086 

Swiss franc 2.31819 2.33722 2.32932 

Spanish peseta 100.243 102.049 102.739 

Swedish krona 5.93348 5.91107 5.88496 

Norwegian krone 6.91667 6.93298 6.82925 

Canadian dollar 1.64419 1.65377 1.63236 

Portuguese escudo 69.8603 70.8677 70.1901 

Austrian schilling 17.8691 17.9437 17.9179 

Finnish mark 5.18797 5.18255 5.16373 

Japanese yen 311.690 322.448 308.978 

' OJ C 161 of 1.7.1980. 
OJ C 195 of 1.8.1980. 

' OJ C 222 of 30.8.1980. 
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Units of account 

Representative rates ('green' rates) 

Conversion rates into national cu"encies for the ECU used 
in conneaion with the common agricultural policy 

Amount m nat•onal 
National currency currency for 1 ECU 

(August) 

Belgian franc and 40.7264' 
Luxembourg franc 40.5951' 

40.5191' 

Danish krone 7.72336 

German mark 2.78260' 
2.78341' 
2.81432' 
2.75175' 

French franc 5.56725' 
5.84700' 

' For m1lk products. 
For pigmeat, wine, fish and (for Benelux) seeds. 

1 For other products. 
• For seeds. 
' For wine and fish. 
• For ptgmeat. 
7 For wine. 

N.B. Explanatory notes on the EUA, ECU and 'green' 
rates can be found. in Bull. EC 5-1980, points 3.1.1 to 
3.1.6. 
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Nahonal currency 

Irish pound 

Italian lira 

Dutch guilder 

Pound sterling 

. 

Units of account 

Amount m national 
currency for 1 ECU 

(August) 

0.659274 

1 099.47' 
1 060.73' 
1 157.79' 

2.80821' 
2.79914' 
2.79391' 

0.5877247 

0.618655' 
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2. Additional 
references in the 
Official Journal 

3.2.1. This section lists the titles of legal instru­
ments and notices of Community institutions or 
organs which have appeared in the Official Jour­
nal since the last Bulletin was published but relat­
ing to items appearing in earlier issues of the Bulle­
tin; the references were not available when the 
Bulletin went to press. 

The number of the Bulletin and the point to which 
this additional information refers is followed by 
the title shown on the cover of the Official Jour­
nal, the number of the issue and the date of publi­
cation. 

Bull. EC 3-1980 

Item 2.3.41 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
on a right of residence for nationals of Member 
States in the territory of another Member State 
OJ C 182 of 21.7.1980 

Item 2.3.42 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
amending Directive 77/62/EEC coordinating pro­
cedures for the award of public supply contracts 
OJ C 182 of 21.7.1980 

Item 2.3.43 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
on the approximation of the laws of the Member 
States relating to rear-view mirrors for two- or 
three-wheeled motor vehicles 

Opinion on two proposals for Council Directives 
on the approximation of the laws of the Member 
States relating to fuel consumption of motor vehi­
cles and the engine power of motor vehicles 
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Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
amending, for the fourth time, Council Directive 
76/769/EEC on the approximation of the laws, 
regulations and administrative provisions of the 
Member States relating to restrictions on the mar­
keting and use of certain dangerous substances 
and preparations 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
amending Directive 791113/EEC on the approxi­
mation of the laws of the Member States relating 
to the determination of the noise emission of con­
struction plant and equipment 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
on the approximation of the laws of the Member 
States relating to powered industrial trucks 
OJ C 182 of 21.7.1980 

Item 2.3.44 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
on the major accident hazards of certain industrial 
activities 
OJ C 182 of 21.7.1980 

Item 2.3.45 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Decision 
introducing a Community system for the rapid 
exchange of information on dangers arising from 
the use of consumer products 
OJ C 182 of 21.7.1980 

Item 2.3.46 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the Commission proposals on the fix­
ing of prices for certain agricultural products and 
on certain related measures 
OJ C 182 of 21.7.1980 
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Item 2.3.47 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Regulation 
relating to the zootechnical standards applicable to 
breeding animals of the porcine species 
OJ C 182 of 21.7.1980 

Item 2.3.48 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
laying down technical requirements for inland 
waterway vessels 
OJ C 182 of 21.7.1980 

Bull. EC 4-1980 

Item 2.3.24 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the use of medicine and its effects on 
public health 
OJ C 205 of 11.8.1980 

Item 2.3.25 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
on a special Community certification procedure 
for products originating in third countries 
OJ C 205 of 11.8.1980 

ltem2.3.26 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the regional development programmes 
OJ C 205 of 11.8.1980 
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Item 2.3.27 

Opinion on the Guidelines for the European Com­
munity's Scheme of Generalized Tariff Preferences 
for the post-1980 period 
OJ C 205 of 11.8.1980 

Item 2.3.28 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the communication from the Commis­
sion to the Council concerning food aid program­
mes for 1980 
OJ C 205 of 11.8.1980 

Bull. EC S-1980 

Item 2.1.87 

The Community coal market in 1979 and fore­
casts for 1980 
OJ C 174 of 14.7.1980 

Item 2.3.5 

Decision of the European Parliament of 23 May 
1980 on the discharge to be granted to the Com­
mission in respect of the implementation of the 
budget of the European Communities for the 1978 
financial year and the supplementary and amend­
ing budgets and the report of the Court of 
Auditors 
OJ L 180 of 14.7.1980 

Item 2.3.25 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the Report on European institutions 
OJ C 205 of 11.8.1980 
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Item2.3.26 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the economic situation in the Com­
munity (mid-1980) 
OJ C 205 of 11.8.1980 

Item 2.3.27 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the development of the social situation 
in the Community in 1979 
OJ C 205 of 11.8.1980 

Item 2.3.28 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
on the Community value added tax and excise 
duty procedure applicable to the stores of vessels, 
aircraft and international trains 
OJ C 205 of 11.8.1980 

Item 2.3.29 

Economic and Social Committee 

Opinion on 

- the proposal for a Council Directive on the 
approximation of the laws of the Member States 
relating to roll-over protective structures (ROPS) 
for certain construction plant 
- the proposal for a Council Directive on the 
approximation of the laws of the Member States 
relating to falling-object protective structures 
(FOPS) for certain construction plant 

Opinion on the proposal for a Council Directive 
on the approximation of the laws of the Member 
States concerning electrical equipment for use in 
potentially explosive atmospheres in mines sus­
ceptible to fire-damp 
OJ C 205 of 11.8.1980 
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Item 2.1.10 

Council Directive of 24 June 1980 on the approxi­
mation of the laws of the Member States relating 
to the operating space, access to the driving posi­
tion and the doors and windows of wheeled 
agricultural or forestry tractors 
OJ L 194 of 28.7.1980 

Item 2.1.36 

Amended proposal for a Council Directive on 
information to be published on a regular basis by 
companies whose shares are admitted to official 
stock exchange listing 
OJ C 210 of 16.8.1980 

Item 2.1.75 

Proposal for a Council Decision establishing a 
Community information system for preventing 
and combating hydrocarbon pollution of the sea 
OJ C 200 of 6.8.1980 

Item 2.1.121 

Council Regulation (EEC) No 2209/80 of 27 June 
1980 on the conclusion of the Agreement on 
fisheries between the European Economic Com­
munity and the Government of Sweden 

Council Regulation (EEC) No 2210/80 of 27 June 
1980 on the conclusion of an Agreement between 
the European Economic Community and the Gov­
ernment of Sweden relating to certain measures 
intended to promote the reproduction of salmon in 
the Baltic Sea 

Council Regulation (EEC) No 2211/80 of 27 June 
1980 on the conclusion of the Agreement on 
fisheries between the European Economic Com­
munity and the Government of Denmark and the 
Home Government of the Faroe Islands 
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Council Regulation (EEC) No 2212/80 of 27 June 
1980 on the conclusion of the Agreement between 
the Government of the Republic of Senegal and 
the European Economic Community on fishing off 
the coast of Senegal, of the Protocol, and of the 
exchanges of letters referring theretp 

Council Regulation (EEC) No 2213/80 of 27 June 
1980 on the conclusion of the Agreement between 
the Government of the Republic of Guinea Bissau 
and the European Economic Community on fish­
ing off the coast of Guinea Bissau, and of the two 
exchanges of letters referring thereto 

Council Regulation (EEC) No 2214/80 of 27 June 
1980 on the conclusion of the Agreement on 
fisheries between the European Economic Com­
munity and the Kingdom of Norway 

Council Regulation {EEC) No 2215/80 of 27 June 
1980 on the conclusion of two Agreements in the 
form of an exchange of letters between the Euro­
pean Economic Community and the Government 
of Canada 
OJ L 226 of 29.8.1980 

Item 2.1.136 

Proposal for a Council Directive concerning the 
enforcement, in respect of shipping using Com­
munity ports, of international standards for ship­
ping safety and pollution prevention 
OJ C 192 of 30.7.1980 

Item 2.1.147 

Draft Council recommendation on electricity tariff 
structures in the Community 
OJ C 214 of 21.8.1980 
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3. Infringement 
procedures 

hUtiationofp~ 
for failure to apply directives 

3.3.1. In July and August the Commission sent 
letters of formal notice to Member States for fail­
ure to apply directives in the following twelve 
cases: 
{i) Directive 77/249 of 22 March 19771 to facili­
tate the effective exercise by lawyers of freedom to 
provide services {FR of Germany); 
(ii) Directive 76/207 of 9 February 1976' on the 
implementation of the principle of equal treatment 
for men and women as regards access to employ­
ment, vocational training and promotion, and 
working conditions {Belgium, Denmark, France, 
Italy, United Kingdom, Ireland); 
{iii) Directive 64/433 of 26 June 1964' on health 
problems affecting intra-Community trade in fresh 
meat {Italy); 
{iv) Directive 78/611 of 29 June 19784 on the 
approximation of the laws of the Member States 
concerning the lead content of petrol {Belgium, 
Italy, Luxembourg); 
{v) Directive 73/23 of 19 February 1973' on the 
harmonization of the laws of the Member States 
relating to electrical equipment designed for use 
within certain voltage limits {Denmark). 

Reasoned opinions 

3.3.2. The Commission also delivered seven 
reasoned opinions against four Member States in 
the following cases: 
{i) Infringement of Articles 30 et seq. of the EEC 
Treaty {Italy): ban on the use of the denomination 
'vinegar'; 

{ii) Infringement of Articles 48 and 51 of the 
EEC Treaty and of Council Regulation 1408/71 of 
14 June 1971• {France): residence on French terri­
tory imposed as a condition for payment of sup­
plementary allowance from the National Solidarity 
Fund to nationals of other Member States in 
receipt of invalidity pension or old-age pension; 

1 OJ L 78 of 26.3.1977. 
z OJ L 39 of 14.2.1976. 
I OJ 121 of 29.7.1964. 
4 OJ L 197 of 22.7.1978. 
' OJ L 77 of 26.3.1973. 
• OJ L 149 of 5.7.1971. 
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(iii) Certain measures concerning a public indus­
trial and commercial establishment (the Societe 
d'exploitarion industrielle des tabacs et allumettes 
-SEIT A) that are incompatible with Articles 30 et 
seq. of the EEC Treaty (France); 

(iv) Infringement of Articles 30 et seq. of the 
EEC Treaty (France): requirement of export 
licences or similar documents for trade in various 
products; 

(v) Failure to apply Directive 76/160 of 8 
December 1975' concerning the quality of bathing 
water (United Kingdom); 

(vi) Failure to apply Directive 75/440 of 16 June 
19752 concerning the quality required of surface 
water (United Kingdom); 

(vii) Failure to apply Directive 78/176 of 20 Feb­
ruary 1978' on waste from the titanium dioxide 
industry (Belgium). 

Proceedings in the Court of justice 

3.3.3. In July and August the Commission 
brought two cases before the Court of Justice: one 
against the Italian Republic on 28 July• for failure 
to apply Council Directive 76/769 of 27 July 
1976' relating to restrictions on the marketing and 
use of certain dangerous substances and prepara­
tions; the other against Belgium on 8 August' con­
cerning the Act of 8 July 1935 on butter, mar­
garine, prepared fats and other edible fats, which 
is inconsistent with Community rules. 

3.3.4. The Court gave three judgments in favour 
of the Commission. In cases 152/78,' 32/791 and 
150/799 it held that France, the United Kingdom 
and Belgium respectively had failed to fulfil their 
obligations under the EEC Treaty. Case 49/80,'" 
brought by the Commission against Belgium, was 
removed from the Court's register. 

' OJ L 31 of 5.2.1976. 
OJ L 194 of 25.7.1975. 

I OJ L 54 of 25.2.1978. 
• OJ C 212 of 20.8.1980. 
' OJ L 262 of 27.9.1976. 
• OJ C 219 of 27.8.1980. 

OJ C 196 of 2.8.1980. 
' OJ C 199 of 5.8.1980. 
• OJ C 207 of 12.8.1980. 

"' OJ C 204 of 9.8.1980. 
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4. Eurobarometer 

Public opinion 
in the Community 

3.4.1. The latest Eurobarometer survey was pub­
lished by the Commission in July.' It covers three 
major themes: 

(i) the public mood, meaning how Europeans are 
rcd..:;.;,,g to today's world; 

(ii) public awareness of the Community and its 
problems; 

(iii) attitudes towards Europe, with reference, for 
the first rime, to the imminent accession of Greece. 

The public mood 

3.4.2. The first question-which has been asked 
on many occasions since 1973-attempted to 
establish whether contacts were satisfied or dis­
satisfied with the life they lead. The answers reveal 
wide differences from country to country, As in 
earlier polls, people in the 'small' countries, par­
ticularly Denmark and the Netherlands, are more 
satisfied with life than people in the 'big' coun­
tries. The French and the Italians are the least 
satisfied, but the results showed no significant 
change on previous surveys. 

Things at work are going 'fairly well' on average 
for most Europeans (54%) but 'rather badly' for 
just under a fifth (17%). Here again the Danes and 
the Dutch are the most satisfied (eight in ten ans­
wered 'fairly well' and le!!S than 10% said 'rather 
badly'). Similarly the French are the least satisfied 
('fairly well': 41% and 'rather badly': 34%) 
(Table 1). 

1 Eurobarometer - Publ1c Op1nion '" the European Commun­
rty- No 13, June 1980. 
NB. The numbermg of the tables selected here 1s not the same 
as tn the full Eurobarometer. The figures in the ftnal column of 
each table are weighted averages. 
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Money problems-how to make ends meet-seem 
to loom larger than problems at work; this makes 
sense since the preceding question only affected 
contacts in active employment, who would be 
younger and less exposed to the hardships of the 
crisis. More than half (54%) were having money 

Eurobarometer 

problems; 9% claimed that they could not make 
ends meet and 45% that they just about managed. 
It was the Irish (71 o/o) and -once again-the 
French (64%) who most frequently expressed con­
cern on this issue (Table 2). 

Table 1 - Individual assessments of ;ob-related problems 

(%) 

8 l DK l D l F l IRL l l L l NL l UK l EC 

Consider that for them-
selves (or their spouses) 
things are going: 

- fairly well 49 79 47 41 69 44 66 77 74 54 

- neither well nor badly 36 14 44 25 17 37 25 17 12 29 

- rather badly 15 7 9 34 14 19 9 6 14 17 

Total 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 

Table 2 - Ability to make ends meet 
~ ·------

(%) 

8 I DK I D 
t 

F I IRL l l L 1NL1UK1 EC 

Short of money 3 5 13 8 14 7 4 2 10 9 

just about make ends 
meet 41 47 39 56 57 42 40 24 51 45 

Make ends meet easily 41 30 37 29 19 25 53 56 27 31 

Money to spare 9 16 6 2 8 24 3 14 10 11 

Don't know 6 2 5 5 2 2 4 2 4 

Total 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 
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There is a high correlation between these three 
questions and family income. The next ques­
tion-on general living standards-raised more 
complex problems. This time the Irish are the most 
optimistic: 53% of them feel that general living 
standards in Ireland are improving. The Danes are 
the most pessimistic: 66% of them think that gen­
eral living standards in Denmark are declining 
(Table 3). 

This particular determinant of concern and dis­
satisfaction on the part of a substantial proportion 
of the French population reappears in answer to a 
question, already asked in 1971 and 1977, on the 
likelihood of a third world war (Table 4). On 
average, more than a third (34%) of Europeans 
believe that there is a big risk of war within the 
next ten years and more than half (51%) that the 
risk is slight. The highest proportion of pessimists 
is to be found in the United Kingdom (39%) and 
France (42%), while the highest proportion of 
optimists can be found in the Federal Republic of 
Germany, Denmark, the Netherlands and Lux em-

Table 3 - Living standards 

B 1 DK 1 D 

Believe that in their country 
living standards are: 

-improving 25 8 13 

-declining 35 66 25 

- about the same 34 23 55 

Don't know 6 3 7 

Total 100 100 100 
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bourg (60 to 70%). Far more people are worried 
now than in the autumn of 1977. Only 14% of 
those interviewed then considered war highly 
probable within the next ten years. Women tend 
to fear war more than men, but the main link is 
with aspects of the public mood, especially dis­
satisfaction with the life we lead. 

The last question on the public mood-which is 
asked in every Eurobarometer for analytical pur­
poses-was designed to gauge basic attitudes to 
society. There were three possible answers: (i) 'The 
entire way our society is organized must be radi­
cally changed by revolutionary action'; (ii) 'Our 
society must be gradually improved by reforms' 
and (iii) 'Our present society must be valiantly 
defended against all subversive forces'. 

The answers were phrased in clear-cut terms to 
elicit an unequivocal response (Table 5). 

For the Community as a whole the option most 
frequently chosen was 'reform' (six in ten). The 

(%) 

F liRL I I L I NL I UK I EC 

20 53 29 30 13 33 23 

42 20 44 22 54 39 38 

36 27 25 46 31 27 36 

2 2 2 2 1 3 

100 100 100 100 100 100 100 
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Table 4 - Assessment of the risk of a third world war in the next ten years 

(Out of every 100 expressing an opinion) 

(%) 

8 I DK I D l F IIRL I 1 L I NL I UK I EC 

july 1971 

War certain or more than 
fifty-fifty chance 8 11 12 13 7 11 (12) 

Fifty-fifty chance 9 12 15 8 16 15 (12) 

Less than fifty-fifty chance 
or no risk of war 83 77 73 79 77 74 (76) 

October/November 1977 

War certain or more than 
fifty-fifty chance 21 10 13 14 14 14 11 17 13 14 

Fifty-fifty chance 13 11 10 16 11 9 17 20 11 12 

Less than fifty-fifty chance 
or no risk of war 66 79 77 70 75 77 72 63 76 74 

April 1980 

War certain or more than 
fifty-fifty chance 33 18 25 42 31 32 15 24 39 34 

Fifty-fifty chance 16 19 15 16 17 14 17 10 16 15 

Less than fifty-fifty chance 
or no risk of war 51 63 60 42 52 54 68 66 45 51 
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Table 5 - Basic attitude to society: results by country since 1970 or 1976 

(Out of every 100 expressing an opinion) 

8 I DK I D l F 11RL I I I L I NL 

'The entire way our society 
is organized must be radi-
cally changed by revolution-
ary aaion' 

19'70 February-March ' 4 2 5 8 1 6 
1976 November 6 4 2 14 8 13 2 5 
1977 April-May 7 3 2 15 6 11 3 5 

October-November 5 3 2 8 8 10 5 4 
1978 May-June 4 3 1 9 7 8 3 5 

October-November 7 4 2 12 8 9 9 6 
1979 April 6 2 2 10 8 7 4 5 

October 8 3 3 11 8 9 2 6 
1980 April 11 4 4 11 8 7 8 6 

'Our society must be gradu-
ally improved by reforms' 

1970 February-March 80 76 82 80 70 78 
1976 November 73 55 56 67 67 68 59 60 
1977 April-May 73 55 46 65 66 60 62 61 

October-November 72 56 44 69 62 62 63 57 
1978 May-June 72 53 45 70 66 60 64 58 

October-November 75 65 48 74 69 66 68 67 
1979 April 75 65 56 73 74 66 76 71 

October 67 57 55 68 62 62 72 58 
1980 April 69 58 53 63 69 60 66 55 

'Our present society must ' be valiantly defended 
against all subversive forces' 

1970 February-March 16 22 13 12 29 16 
1976 November 21 41 42 19 25 19 39 35 
1977 April-May 20 42 52 20 28 29 35 34 

October-November 23 41 54 23 30 28 32 39 
1978 May/June 24 44 54 21· 27 32 33 37 

October-November 18 31 50 14 23 25 23 27 
1979 April 19 33 42 17 18 27 20 24 

October 25 40 42 21 30 29 26 36 
1980 April 20 3.8 43 26 23 33 26 39 
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(%) 

I UK I EC 

(5) 
8 8 
9 8 
7 7 
7 5 
5 8 
4 6 
8 7 
6 7 

(79) 
65 64 
63 59 
62 59 
59 59 
68 63 
73 67 
62 62 
60 59 

(16) 
27 28 
28 33 
31 34 
34 36 
27 29 
23 27 
30 31 
34 34 
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'revolutionaries' are now very much in a minority 
(less than one in ten). This option peaked in Italy 
and France in the autumn of 1976 and the spring 
of 1977. It has waned since then, the decline being 
more noticeable in Italy than in France. The pro­
portion of those favouring the third option, who 
might be described as 'reactionaries' in the seman­
tic sense, has been around three in ten for the last 
four years. It was pushed to 54% in the Federal 
Republic of Germany in the winter of 1977/78 by 
anti-terrorist feeling but has since fallen back to 
43%, the 1976 level (which was double the 1970 
figure). 

Public awareness 
3.4.3. The comparatively poor turnout at the 
European elections in a number of countries has 
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re-opened arguments about the lack of popular 
interest in Community affairs and the scarcity of 
information on the subject. A set of questions were 
asked to throw some light on this. 

First came two questions designed to measure 
involvement with the Community: the personal 
interest taken in European affairs and the import­
ance attached to them. There was no significant 
change since the questions were first asked. On 
average, less than a quarter of those interviewed 
claimed to be 'very interested' in the problems of 
the European Community. But almost 80% felt 
that these problems were 'very Important' (32%) 
or 'important' (47%) (see Table 6). There is there-

Table 6- 'Very interested' in Community matters1 

(%) 

8 EC 

1973 September 10 29 31 20 27 21 26 23 23 24 

1975 May 9 22 26 27 24 24 33 16 35 26 

October-November 10 19 23 23 28 27 28 18 28 14 

1976 November 10 25 23 18 21 21 22 20 28 22 

1978 October-November 10 19 16 14 21 24 17 21 19 19 

1980 April 9 17 19 18 21 30 34 22 25 22 

1 ICSA-GALLUP a~ked the !)arne question m Spam m Apnl 1980. There 32°/o !t31d they were 'very mtere!tted' m Commumty affa1r!t~ 
26°/o 'a hnle' and 26°/o 'nor at all'. So even though Spam doe!t not yet belong to the Commumty, mtere!tt there l!t hzgher than m mo!tt 
Member State!». 
! Not mdudmg Northern Ireland m 1973. 
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fore an appreciable gap between awareness of 
what is at stake and personal interest in following 
developments. 

The analysis shows that on average only half of 
those who believed Community affairs to be 'very 
important' took a keen personal interest. The 
proportion of the population which combines 
awareness of the importance of Community affairs 
and a keen interest in them ranges from 25% in 
Luxembourg to only 7% in Belgium. 

Given some idea of the importance of European 
affairs for the future of their own country, most 
felt that they were not sufficiently well informed 
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(65%). But a comparable question on major 
national and international problems, asked earlier 
in the interview, revealed that almost as many peo­
ple (58%) felt the same way about information on 
non-European issues. Subject to further scrutiny 
then, it would appear that, in general, Europeans 
do not have the impression of being less well 
informed on European than on other major prob­
lems. 

NB. Several of the questions d1scussed here were asked on 1ts 

own account by the Gallup InternatiOnal Research Institutes 
(London) group, whoch kondly made rhe relevanr dara avaolable 
to the Comm1ssion. 

Table 7 - Attitudes to membership of the European Community (1973 to 1980') 

(%) 

B I DK I D I F I IRL I I L I NL I UK' I EC 

Think it is 'a good thing' 

1973 September 57 42 63 61 56 69 67 63 31 56 

1975 May 57 36 56 64 50 71 65 64 47 59 

October-November 59 41 61 67 67 75 78 67 50 63 

1978 October-November 66 36 63 59 63 73 63 83 39 60 

1979 April 65 37 66 56 54 78 83 84 33 59 

October 56 39 64 58 58 75 86 78 29 58 

1980 April 57 33 65 51 52 74 84 75 23 55 

Think it is 'a bad thing' 

1973 September 5 30 4 5 15 2 3 4 34 11 

1975 May 3 25 8 4 20 3 7 3 21 9 

October-November 3 27 6 4 12 4 4 3 24 9 

1978 October-November 3 25 4 7 12 3 14 2 31 10 

1979 April 2 25 5 8 14 2 3 2 34 8 

October 3 27 3 6 12 2 3 3 41 12 

1980 April 2 29 5 9 19 3 3 3 49 15 

I F1gures only from !l>urveys ~ondw.:ted on behalf of the CommiSSion of the European Commumne~. 
Not mdudmg Northern Ireland m 1973. 
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Without wishing to vie with in-depth audience 
research (television, radio and the press) con­
ducted in the nine countries, this survey included a 
few questions on the intensity of exposure to the 
information media. The opening question made no 
reference whatsoever to Europe. As might be 
expected, television leads the field: an average of 
60% of those interviewed said that they watched 
the news every day, as against 47% who listened 
to radio news every day and 41% who kept up 
with the political news in the daily papers. What is 
the public's main source of information on Euro­
pean affairs? Television is out in front (74%), fol­
lowed by the daily papers (48%), with radio trail­
ing behind (32%). Here again the only difference 
from country to country is one of degree; national 
patterns are very similar. 

Eurobarometer 

Opinions on the Community 

3.4.4. Support for the unification of Europe is 
still riding high. In the Community as a whole 
73o/o were 'very much for' or 'to some extent for', 
the figure for the original Six going up to 78%. 
But these results represent a slight decline com­
pared with the previous six months in Ireland, 
Denmark and the Netherlands. 

The public's assessment of the value of Commun­
ity membership remains very positive in the 
Netherlands, Italy and the Federal Republic of 
Germany. It is also positive, but to a lesser degree, 
in Belgium, Ireland and France. In Denmark, the 
v1ew that the Common Market is 'a good thing' is 
just slightly ahead of the opposite view (33% as 

Table 8 - Views on Greece's entry into the European Community (Apri/1980) 

(%) 

8 J DK J D l F JIRL l l L J NL J UK J EC 

1. Out of every 100 inter-
viewed 

A good thing 26 22 46 22 35 51 45 40 22 35 

A bad thing 6 20 7 12 6 7 8 8 13 10 

Neither good nor bad 35 25 27 37 23 20 33 30 39 31 

Don't know 33 33 20 29 36 22 14 22 26 24 

Total 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 

2. Out of every 100 ex-
pressing an opinion 

A good thing 39 33 57 32 55 65 52 52 30 47 

A bad thing 10 30 9 16 10 9 10 10 18 13 

Neither good nor bad 51 37 34 52 35 26 38 38 52 40 

Total 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 
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against 29%), while in the United Kingdom the 
gap between the 'pro-Marketeers' and the 'anti­
Marketeers' is widening (23% as against 49%) 
(Table 7). The decline in positive answers since the 
last survey is most noticeable in France ( -7 points) 
and in Denmark, Ireland and the United Kingdom 
(-6 points). 

The Community _is expanding: on 1 january 1981 
Greece will join the Nine. Spain and Portugal will 
probably follow within the next few years. This 
latest survey pursues study of reactions to this 
development within the Community, pending 
extension of our research to the new Member 
States themselves. 

This second enlargement has not made much 
impact: almost half (46%) of those questioned 
were unable to name even one of the three coun­
tries of southern Europe who are seeking to join 
the Community. Those who did answer mentioned 
Spain more often than the others, probably 
because more Community nationals have visited 
Spain than either Greece or Portugal over the last 
ten or fifteen years. 

Support for Greek membership is strongest in 
Italy. The British and the French are equally unen­
thusiastic. But, in the Community as a whole, the 
trend among those who answered one way or 
another (Table 8) is more favourable to enlarge­
ment than it was three and a half years ago. This is 
particularly true in the case of the Netherlands, 
Italy and Luxembourg. 
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De europaeiske 
Faellesskabers publikationer 

lndledning 

Dette katalog omfatter aile titler pA tidsskrifter og 
monografier og serier, udgivet af Faallesskabets institu­
tioner i den omhandlede periods. 

Katalogisering 

Kataloget er inddelt i tre dele, som fllllger: 

I. del - Emnelisten katalogiserer titlerne under 20 
emner (sa nedenfor). Titlerne pA monografier og serier er 
katalogiseret flllrst, alfabetisk i blandet sprogorden; 
tidsskrifterne er dernaast katalogiseret pA samme mAde. 
Den fuldstaandige titel for monografier og serier findes 
kun en gang. I andre tilfaalde henviser fllllgenummeret i 
den venstre margin til den fuldstaendige titel. Disse numre 
blllr ikke anvendes til katalogisering. I emnelisten er titler 
pA tidsskrifter kun optaget med krydshenvisning. Den 
fuldstaandige titel findes i II. de!. 

II. del - Tidsskriftslisten giver detaljerede oplysninger 
om Faallesskabets tidsskrifter, katalogiseret alfabetisk i 
blandet sprogorden. 

Ill. del - Titel- og seriefortegnelsen er ligeledes en 
alfabetisk fortegnelse pA hvert enkelt faellesskabssprog. 
Den er en alfabetisk n!llgle til titlerne pA monografier og 
serier i I. del og kendetegner dam ved f!lllgenummeret. 
Disse fortegnelser er kumulative. 

Hvordan man erhverver publikationerne. Publikation­
erne er enten til salg, gratis eller mad begraensede mod­
tagere. De to sidstnaavnte slags publikationer kan fAs 
direkte fra den ansvarlige institution eller, hvis det drejer 
sig om publikationer, som udgives af informatjonskontor­
erne, direkte fra disse. lnformationskontorernes adresser 
findes pA side 8 og 9. Publikationer mad begraansede 
modtagere er normalt forbeholdt medlemslandenes 
regeringer, faallesskabskontorer eller andre ber111rte myn­
digheder. 

Bestillinger pA publikationer til salg skal sendes direkte til 
salgskontorerne, som er anflllrt pA den sidste side. 

Aile bestillinger skal indeholde den fuldstaendige titel 
sAvel som ISBN- og ISSN-nummer, hvor dette er anflllrt 
flllr prisangivelsen i kataloget. 
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Forkortelser og tegn. De sprag, publikationerne findes 
pA, er angivet ved hjaelp af fllllgende forkortelser 

DA dansk 
EN engelsk 
IT italienisk 
GA irsk 
ES spansk 

DE tysk 
FR fransk 
NL hollandsk 
GR graask 
PT portugisisk 

En kaade af disse tegn, adskilt af skrAstreger, kendetegner 
en publikation, hvor forskellige sprogversioner af samme 
tekst findes i samme bind. 

Forkortelsen »multi« betyder, at teksten er flersproget. 

Pris uden moms er fastsat i de forskellige mfllntenheder 
ved hjaelp af fllllgende forkortelser: 

BFA Belgisk franc 
DKR Dansk krone 
OM Tysk mark 
ORA Drachma 
ESC Escudo 
FF Fransk franc 

Emner 

01 Generelle, politiske 
og institutionelle 
sPfllrgsmAI 

02 Toldunion 
03 Landbrug 
04 Ret 
05 Socials anliggender 
06 Tredje sektorer 
07 Transport 
08 Konkurrence 
09 Skatter og afgifter 
10 0konomisk og mo-

netaar politik 
11 Forbindelser med 

tredjelande 

HFL Nederlandsk gylden 
IRL lrsk pund 
LIT ltaliensk lire 
PES Peseta 
UKL Engelsk pund 
USD Amerikansk dollar 

12 Energi 
13 lndustri 
14 Regionalpolitik 
15 Miljlll- og forbruger-

politik 
16 Forskning og teknik 
17 Kulturpolitik og un-

dervisning 
18 Statistik 
19 Bibliografi og doku-

mentation 
20 Diverse 



VerOffentlichungen der 
Europaischen Gemeinschaften 

Einleitung 

Der Katalog umfaBt aile wahrend des Monats durch die 
Europaischen lnstitutionen neu veroffentlichten Mono­
grafien und Reihen sowie die Zeitschriften des laufenden 
Jahres. 

Gliederung 

Der Katalog besteht aus drei Teilen: 

Teil I - Das Sachverzeichnis liefert eine Klassifizierung 
der Titel, die nach 20 Sachgebieten unterteilt ist (vgl. 
unten). 
In jedem dieser Sachgebiete sind die Titel der Mono­
grafien und Reihen in alphabetischer Ordnung in den 
Originalsprachen angefiihrt, gefolgt von den titeln der 
Zeitschriften in gleicher Ordnung. 
Eine Buchbesprechung fur Monografien und Reihen wird 
nur einmal pro Titel und Sprache gegeben. 
lm gesamten Katalog wird jeweils durch die am linken 
Rand gedruckte Sequenz-Nummer auf diese Katalog­
eintrag hingewiesen. Die im Sachverzeichnis angefuhrten 
Zeitschriften verweisen auf die Katalogeintrag in Teil 2 
des Kataloges. 

Teil II - Die Liste enthalt eine genaue Besprechung 
jeder Veroffentlichung in alphabetischer und sprachlicher 
Ordnung. 

Teillll - Das Register der Titel und Serien ist sprachlich 
unterteilt, alphabetisch geordnet und verweist durch die 
o.a. Sequenz-Nummer auf die Beschreibung des 1. Teiles. 
Die monatlichen lnhaltsverzeichnisse werden jahrlich 
zusammengefaBt. 

Wie bezieht man eine Veroffentlichung7 

Eine Veroffentlichung kann kauflich erworben, gratis 
verteilt werden oder beschrankt verfugbar sein. In den 
belden letzteren Fallen kann sie nur durch die allgemeinen 
Verteilungsstellen der einzelnen lnstitutionen der Euro­
paischen Gemeinschaften bezogen werden. Die Adressen 
dieser Verteilungsstellen sind auf Seite 8 und 9 aufge­
ffihrt. 

1st der Herausgeber einer Veroffentlichung ein Presseburo 
der Europaischen Gemeinschaften, kann diese nur uber 
dieses Buro bezogen werden. 

Es bleibt hervorzuheben, daB die beschriinkt verfugbaren 
VerOffentlichungen im allgemeinen nur den Regierungen 
der Mitgliedstaaten. den Diensten der Europiiischen 
Gemeinschaften und angegliederten Organisationen 
vorbehalten sind. 
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Bestellungen fur Veroffentlichungen, die im Verkauf sind, 
mussen an die Adressen der Verkaufsburos (letzte Seite) 
gerichtet werden. Jede Bestellung muB den vollstiindigen 
Titel und - soweit im Katalog angegeben - die ISBN­
oder ISSN-Nummer enthalten. 

Abkurzungen und ZeichenerkUirung 

Die sprachliche Version einer VerOffentlichung ist durch 
die folgenden Abkurzungen gekennzeichnet: 

DA Diinisch DE Deutsch 
EN Englisch FR Franzosisch 
IT ltalienisch NL Niedertiindisch 
GA Giilisch GR Griechisch 
ES Spanisch PT Portugiesisch 

Ein Schragstrich zwischen mehreren Sprachabkurzungen 
zeigt an, daB derselbe Text in den angegebenen Sprachen 
in einer Ausgabe zusammengefaBt ist. 

Ein Bindestrich zwischen mehreren Sprachangaben 
bedeutet. daB diese Veroffentlichung in sprachlich 
getrennten Ausgaben besteht. 

Die Abkurzung .. multi" steht fur eine Veroffentlichung, die 
verschiedene Texte in verschiedenen Sprachen beinhaltet. 

Die Preise sind die in Luxemburg geltenden Praise. ohne 
Mehrwertsteuer. Sie sind in folgenden Wiihrungen 
angegeben: 

BFR 
DKR 
OM 
DR 
ESC 
FF 

Belgische Franken 
Diinische Kronen 
Deutsche Mark 
Drachmen 
Escudo 
Franzosische Franken 

Sachgebiete 

01 Allgemeine. politi-
sche und institutio-
nelle Fragen 

02 Zollunion 
03 Landwirtschaft 
04 Recht 
05 Soziale Angelegen-

heiten 
06 Dritter Sektor 

(Dienstleistungs-
sektor) 

07 Verkehr 
08 Wettbewerb 
09 Steuerwesen 
1 0 Wirtschaft 

HFL Holllindische Gulden 
IRL lrliindischesPfund 
LIT ltalienische Lire 
PES Peseten 
UKL Englisches Pfund 
USD US-Dollar 

11 Auswartige Bezie-
hungen 

12 Energie 
13 Industria 
14 Regionalfonds 
15 Umwelt - Verbraucher 
16 Wissenschaftliche 

und technische 
Forschung 

17 Kultur- und 
Ausbildungspolitik 

18 Statistiken 
19 Dokumentation 
20 Verschiedenes 



Publications of the 
European Communities 

Introductory note 

This catalogue includes the newly published monographs 
and series issued during the period to which it relates by 
the Institutions of the European Communities, and also 
their current periodicals. 

Arrangement. The catalogue is divided into three parts as 
follows: 

Part I - The classified list provides a subject classifica­
tion of the titles included under 20 headings (see below). 
Under each subject-heading monographs and series are 
listed first, alphabetically by title in mixed language order; 
there then follows a similar list of periodical titles. Full 
entries for monographs and series appear only once; 
otherwise cross-references are given to the full entries, 
identifying them by the sequence numbers appearing in 
the left-hand margins. (Those numbers should not be 
used for ordering purposes.) Periodical titles only appear 
in the classified list as cross-reference entries, full entries 
being found in Part II. 

Part II - The list of periodicals presents full details of 
eac'l current Community periodical listed alphabetically in 
mixed language order. 

Part Ill - The indexes of titles and series, presented 
in separate sequences for each language, provide alpha­
betical keys to the monographs and series included in Part 
I, identifying them by the sequence numbers already 
described. These indexes cumulate throughout the year. 

How to obtain publications. Publications may be priced 
for sale, gratis, or of limited distribution. Those of the last 
two classes may be obtained from the issuing Institutions, 
or, where they are published by the Information Offices of 
the Commission, from those Offices, whose addresses are 
given in the lists on pp. 8 and 9. Publications of limited 
distribution are however generally only for the attention of 
governments of Member States, Community departments 
and other authorities concerned. 

Orders for priced publications should be directed to the 
Sales Offices listed on the last page. 

All orders should quote the full title, as well as the ISBN or 
ISSN where such a number precedes the prices in the 
catalogue. 
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Abbreviations and conventional signs. The text 
languages of publications are indicated by the following 
abbreviations: 

DA Danish 
EN English 
It Italian 
GA Irish 
ES Spanish 

DE German 
FA French 
NL Dutch 
GR Greek 
PT Portuguese 

A string of such symbols separated by diagonal strokes 
denotes a publication in which different language versions 
of the same text appear under one cover. 

The abbreviation 'multi' indicates a publication with a 
mixed multilingual text. 

Prices, which exclude any value-added tax which may be 
chargeable, are fixed in various currencies, using the 
following abbreviations: 

BFA Belgian franc HFL Dutch guilder 
DKR Danish crown IRL Irish pound 
DM German mark LIT Italian lira 
DR Greek drachma PES Spanish peseta 
ESC Portuguese escudo UKL Pound sterling 
FF French franc USD USdollar 

Headings 

01 General, political and 12 Energy 
institutional matters 13 Industry 

02 Customs union 14 Regional policy 
03 Agriculture, forestry 15 Environment and 

and fisheries consumer affairs 
04 Law 16 Scientific and techni-
05 Social affairs cal research 
06 Tertiary sector 17 Education and cultu-
07 Transport ral policy 
08 Competition 18 Statistics 
09 Taxation 19 Bibliography and 
10 Economic affairs documentation 
11 External relations 20 Miscellaneous 



Publications des 
Communautes europeennes 

Introduction 

Ce catalogue comprend les monographies et series 
publiees dans le mois par les institutions des Com­
munautes europeennes ainsi que les periodiques de 
l'annee. 

Structure. Le catalogue est divise en trois parties: 

Partie I - La liste th6matique fournit une classification 
des titres par sujet en 20 rubriques (voir ci-dessous). 
Dans chaque rubrique, les monographies et series sont 
indiquees d'abord par ordre alphabetique, par titre, toutes 
langues confondues. Les periodiques sont ensuite reper­
torh~s de Ia m3me fac;:on. Une notice descriptive complete 
n'est donnee qu'une fois par titre et par langue; partout 
ailleurs, il est fait reference a cette notice, grace au 
numero sequentiel imprim6 dans Ia marge de gauche (ce 
numero ne doit pas Atre utilise pour commander des 
ouvrages). Dans Ia liste thematique, les ref6rences aux 
periodiques renvoient a Ia partie II. 

Partie II - La liste des p6riodiques donne une notice 
descriptive complete pour chaque periodique en cours. 
par ordre alphabetique, toutes langues confondues. 

Partie Ill - Les index des titres et des series sont 
divises par langue. Classes par ordre alphabetique, ils 
renvoient par le numero sequential deja mentionne aux 
notices de Ia partie I. Ces index sont cumules tout au long 
de l'annee. 

Pour obtenir une publication. Une publication peut Atre 
vendue, gratuite ou de diffusion restreinte. Dans les deux 
derniers cas, elle sera obtenue aupres des institutions 
editrices OU, si Ia publication depend d'un Bureau de 
presse de Ia Commission, aupres de ce Bureau. Les 
adresses figurent page 8 et 9 respectivement. Cependant, 
les ouvrages en diffusion restreinte sont en gen6ral 
destines uniquement aux gouvernements des Etats 
membres, aux services des Communautes et aux autres 
organisations concernees. 

Les commandes d'ouvrages en vente doivent Atre 
adressees aux Bureaux de vente mcntionnes en derniere 
page. 

Toute commande doit indiquer le titre complet aussi 
bien que I'ISBN ou I'ISSN au cas ou ce numero est 
indique dans le catalogue. 
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Abreviations et signes conventionnels. La version 
linguistique d'un ouvrage est identifiee par les abrevia­
tions suivantes: 

DA danois 
EN anglais 
IT italian 
GA gaelique 
ES espagnol 

DE allemand 
FR franc;:ais 
NL neerlandais 
GR grec 
PT portugais 

Une set~uence de tels sigles entre barres de fraction 
obliques indique que plusieurs traduction& du mAme texte 
sont rassemblees sous Ia mAme couverture. 

L'abreviation «multi» signale une publication comportant 
des textes different& dans diverses langues. 

Les prix sont des prix publics au Luxembourg, TVA exclue. 
lis sont exprimes dans les monnaies suivantes: 

BFA Franc beige HFL Florin neerlandais 
DKR Couronne danoise IRL Uvre irlandaise 
OM Deutsche Mark LIT U re italienne 
DR Drach me PES Peseta 
ESC Escudo UKL Uvre anglaise 
FF Franc franc;:ais USD USdollar 

Rubriques 

01 Questions generales, 12 Energie 
politiques et institu- 13 Industria 
tionnelles 14 Politique regionale 

02 Union douaniere 15 Environnement et 
03 Agriculture consomm ateu rs 
04 Droit 16 Recherche scientifi-
05 Affaires sociales que et technique 
06 Secteur tertiaire 17 Politique culturelle 
07 Transports et enseignement 
08 Concurrence 18 Statistiques 
09 Fiscalite 19 Bibliographie et do-
10 Economie cumentation 

11 Relations exterieures 20 Divers 



Pubblicazioni 
delle Comunita europee 

lntroduzione 

Questo catalogo comprende sia i titoli delle monografie e 
serie pubblicate nel periodo dl riferimento dalle istituzioni 
delle Comunit6 europee, sia quelli delle pubblicazioni 
periodiche. 

Struttura. II catalogo e diviso in tre parti: 

Parte I - La lista per soggetto classifies i titoli in venti 
rubriche (vedi sotto). In ogni rubrics sono indicati prima le 
monografie e serie in ordine alfabetico e senza tener conto 
della lingua, quindi i titoli delle pubblicazioni periodiche 
secondo lo stesso ordine. Nelle venti rubriche, '• nota 
esplicativa del contenuto delle monografie e serie e 
indicata una sola volta per titolo e per lingua. Nel caso in 
cui .Ia pubblicazione appaia in diverse rubriche, il numero 
di riferimento alia nota esplicativa e indicato a sinistra sui 
margine della lista (tale numero di riferimento non deve 
apparire negli ordini di acquisto). Nella lista per soggetto i 
periodici hanno solo i numeri di riferimento che per­
mettono di trovare nella parte II Ia nota esplicativa del 
contenuto. 

Parte II - La lista delle pubblicazioni periodiche, e 
redatta in ordine alfabetico; essa contiene per ogni titolo 
una nota esplicativa del contenuto. 

Parte Ill - Gli indici dei titoli e delle serie delle 
monografie e serie sono divisi per lingua. 

Tali elenchi in ordine alfabetico permettono di riferirsi alia 
parte I a mezzo dei numeri di riferimento gia citati. Questi 
indici compendiano tutti i titoli e le serie pubblicati 
durante l'anno. 

Come ottenere una pubblicazione. Le pubblicazioni con 
l'indicazione del prezzo sono in vendita. Le altre possono 
essere gratuite o di diffusione limitata e possono essere 
richieste aile istituzioni che le pubblicano o, ove si tratti di 
pubblicazioni degli Uffici stampa e informazione della 
Commissione. a questi uffici. Le liste degli indirizzi di tali 
uffici si trovano a pag. 8 e 9. Le 'pubblicazioni di diffusione 
limitata sono generalmente destinate solo ai governi degli 
Stati membri. ai servizi delle Comunit6 europee e aile altre 
autorit6 interessate. 

Gli ordini delle pubblicazioni con l'indicazione del prezzo 
devono essere inviati agli uffici di vendita, il cui elenco si 
trova nell'ultima pagina. 
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Tutti gli ordini devono indicare il titolo completo e, se e 
indicato in catalogo, anche il riferimento ISBN o quello 
ISSN, che precede il prezzo. 

Abbreviazioni e sagni convenzionali. Le lingue del testo 
delle pubblicazioni sono indicate dalle seguenti abbrevia­
zioni: 

DA danese 
EN Inglese 
IT Italiano 
GA.gaelico 
ES spagnolo 

DE tedesco 
FR francese 
NL olandese 
GR greco 
PT portoghese 

La presenza di vari simboli fra barre di frazione obliqua 
indica che lo stesso volume include lo stesso testo 
tradotto in varie lingue. L'abbreviazione «multi» contrad­
distingue una pubblicazione comprendente contenuti 
diversi in diverse lingue. 

I prezzi sono al netto eli IVA e sono espressi nelle seguenti 
monete: 

BFR 
DKR 
OM 
DR 
ESC 
FF 

franco belga 
corona danese 
marco tedesco 
dracma 
escudo 
franco francese 

Rubriche 

01 Ouestioni generali, 
politiche e istituzio-
nali 

02 Unione doganale 
03 Agricoltura 
04 Diritto 
05 Affari sociali 
06 Settore terziario 
07 Trasporti 
08 Concorrenza 
09 Fiscal ita 
10 Economia 
11 Relazioni esterne 

HFL fiorino olandese 
I Rl sterlina irlandese 
LIT lira italians 
PES peseta 
UKL fiorino olandese 
USD dollaro statunitense 

12 Energia 
13 Industria 
14 Politics regionale 
15 Ambiente - Consu-

matori 
16 Rice rca scientifica e 

tecnica 
17 Politics culturale e 

istruzione 
18 Statistiche 
19 Bibliografia e docu-

mentazione 
20 Diversi 



Publikaties van de 
Europese Gemeenschappen 

lnleiding 

Deze catalogus bevat de monografieen en series welke 
door de instellingen van de Europese Gemeenschappen 
gedurende de periode waarop zij betrekking hebben 
worden uitgegeven, alsmede periodieke publlkaties. 

De catalogus is in drie afzonderlijke delen verdeeld: 

Deel I - De indelingslijst geeft een classificatie naar 
onderwerp der titels, samengevat onder twintig hoofd­
titels (zie onder). Onder iedere onderwerp-titel zijn 
allereerst de monografieen en series - in alfabetische 
volgorde naar taal - opgenomen, gevolgd door een 
overeenkomstige lijst van periodieke publikaties. De 
volledige titels. van monografieen en series worden slechts 
eenmaal vermeld, voor het overige wordt door tref­
woorden verwezen naar de volledige titels, welke door 
middel van in de linker marge afgedrukte, opeenvolgende 
nummers zijn terug te vinden. Bij bestellingen kan niet 
naar deze nummers worden verwezen. De classificatielijst 
vermeldt aileen titelverwijzingen van tijdschriften, de 
volledige titels zijn opgenomen in deel II. 

Deel II - De lijst van tijdschriften geeft een volledig 
overzicht van aile periodieke publikaties van de Gemeen­
schappen en wei in alfabetische volgorde. 

Deel Ill - Het alfabetische register van titels en 
series, eveneens samengevat in afzonderlijke volgorde 
naar taal, geeft alfabetisch trefwoorden van de mono­
grafieen en series in deel I, welke zijn terug te vinden aan 
de hand van de reeds vermelde, opeenvolgende nummers. 
Deze registers worden in de loop van het jaar bijge­
houden. 

Hoe kunnen de publikaties worden verkregen7 De 
publikaties zijn ofwel in de verkoop, ofwel gratis verkrijg­
baar, of worden slechts beperkt verspreid. De beida 
laatste categorieen kunnen bij de publicerende installing 
worden verkregen, of, indien uitgegeven door de infor­
matiediensten van de Commissie, bij de betreffende 
dienst, waarvan de adressen zijn vermeld in de lijst op 
biadzijden 8 en 9. Publikaties die slechts beperkt worden 
verspreid zijn gewoonlijk voorbehouden aan de regeringen 
van de Ud-Staten, diensten van de Gemeenschap of 
instellingen waarop zij betrekking hebben. 

Bestellingen voor publikaties welke ter verkoop worden 
aangeboden, dienen te worden gericht aan de verkoop­
kantoren, opgenomen in de lijst op de laatste bladzijde. 
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Aile bestellingen dienen de volledige titel te vermelden en 
tevens het ISBN- of ISSN-nummer indien dit v66r de 
prijzen in de catalogus is aangegeven. 

Afkortingen en conventional• tekens. De talen waarin 
de publikaties zijn gepubliceerd worden door de volgende 
afkortingen aangeduid: 

DA Deena 
EN Engels 
IT ltaliaans 
GA lers 
ES Spaans 

DE Duits 
FR Frans 
NL Nederlands 
GR Grieks 
PT Portugees 

Een opeenvolging van daze afkortingen, gescheiden door 
diagonale lijnen, heeft betrekking op een publlkatie waarin 
verschillende talen welke hetzelfde onderwerp be­
handelen, in een omslag zijn samengevat. 

De afkorting .. multi" verwijst naar een publikatie welke in 
meerdere talen is afgedrukt. 

De prijzen zijn, zonder BTW, in de verschillende valuta, 
volgens onderstaande afkortingen, aangegeven: 

BFR Belgische frank 
DKR Deense kroon 
OM Duitse mark 
DR Griekse drachma 
ESC Portugese escudo 
FF Franse frank 

Hoofdtitels 

01 Algemene, politieke 
en institutional& 
vraagstukken 

02 Douane-Unie 
03 Landbouw 
04 Recht 
05 Sociale zaken 
06 Derde sector 
07 Vervoer 
08 Mededingingsbeleid 
09 Fiscale zaken 
10 Economische zaken 
11 Buitenlandse betrek-

kingen 

HFL Nederlandse gulden 
IRL lers pond 
LIT ltaliaanse lire 
PES Spaanse peseta 
UKL Engels pond 
USD VS-dollar 

12 Energie 
13 Industria 
14 Regionaal beleid 
15 Milieu - Consumen-

ten 
16 Wetenschappelijk en 

technisch onderzoek 
17 Cultureel beleid en 

onderwijs 
18 Statistieken 
19 Documentatie 
20 Diversen 
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lnstit! tioner - lnstitutionen - Institutions 
lnstitl, tions - lstituzioni - lnstellingen 

EUROPA-I' ~RLAMENTET - EUROPAISCHES PARLAMENT -
EUROPEAI' PARLIAMENT - PARLEMENT EUROPEEN -
PARLAME' TO EUROPEO - EUROPEES PARLEMENT 

Secretari~1 · general du Parlement european 
Direction • 1enerale du greffe et des services generaux 
Bofte po~ ale 1601, Luxembourg 
Tel.: 4 3Q 01 

RADET Fj R DE EUROP.IEISKE F.IELLESSKABER - RAT 
DER EU~ IPAISCHEN GEMEINSCHAFTEN - COUNCIL OF 
THE EURI •PEAN COMMUNITIES - CONSEIL DES COM­
MUNAUT~ i EUROPEENNES - CONSIGLIO DELLE COMU­
NITA EUA )PEE - RAAD VAN DE EUROPESE GEMEEN­
SCHAPPEI 

Secretaria general du Conseil 
Direction :Information et documentation» 
Rue de Ia Loi 170, 1 048 Bruxelles 
Tel.: 736' '9 oo 

KOMMISS :lNEN FOR DE EUROP.IEISKE F.IELLESSKABER -
KOMMISS DN DER EUROPAISCHEN GEMEINSCHAF­
TEN - COl IMISSION OF THE EUROPEAN COMMUNITIES -
COMMISS, N DES COMMUNAUTES EUROPEENNES -
COMMISSI NE DELLE COMUNITA EUROPEE - COMMIS­
SIE VAN C EUROPESE GEMEENSCHAPPEN 

Division I) C-1 
Rue de Ia Loi 200, B-1 049 Bruxelles 
Tel.: 735 40 

735i 040 
7351 030 
736 000 

! i 

DOMSTOU IN FOR DE EUROP.IEISKE F.IELLESSKABER -
GERICHTSiiOF DER EUROPAISCHEN GEMEINSCHAFTEN -
COURT 0~ ,JUSTICE OF THE EUROPEAN COMMUNITIES -
COUR DE !USTICE DES COMMUNAUTES EUROPEENNES -
CORTE Dl GIUSTIZIA DELLE COMUNITA EUROPEE - HOF 
VAN JUS riE VAN DE EUROPESE GEMEENSCHAPPEN 

I 
Service i~ ~rieur 
Plateau d ' Kirchberg 
B?fte pos ale 1406, Luxembourg 
Tel.: 4 7 21 

DET 0KONOMISKE OG SOCIALE UDVALG - WIRT­
SCHAFTS- UNO SOZIALAUSSCHUSS - ECONOMIC AND 
SOCIAL COMMITTEE- COMITE ECONOMIOUE ET SOCIAL­
COMITATO ECONOMICO E SOCIALE - ECONOMISCH 
EN SOCIAAL COMITE 

Division «Presse, information et publications» 
Rue Ravenstein 2, 1000 Bruxelles 
Tel.: 5123920 

DEN EUROP.IEISKE INVESTERINGSBANK - EUROPAISCHE 
INVESTITIONSBANK - EUROPEAN INVESTMENT BANK -
BANOUE EUROPEENNE D'INVESTISSEMENT - BANCA 
EUROPEA PER GLI INVESTIMENTI - EUROPESE INVESTE­
RINGSBANK 

Division information/relations publiques 
BP 2005 Luxembourg 
Tel.: 4379-3145 

DE EUROP.IEISKE F.IELLESSKABERS REVISIONSRET -
RECHNUNGSHOF DER EUROPAISCHEN GEMEINSCHAFTEN­
COURT OF AUDITORS OF THE EUROPEAN COMMUNITIES­
COUR DES COMPTES DES COMMUNAUTES EUROPEENNES­
CORTE DEl CONTI DELLE COMUNITA EUROPEE - REKEN­
KAMER VAN DE EUROPESE GEMEENSCHAPPEN 

29, rue Aldringen 
Borte postale 43, Luxembourg 
Tel.: 4773-1 



lnformationskontorer - Presse- und lnformationsburos 
Information offices - Bureaux de presse et d'information 
Uffici stampa e informazione - Voorlichtingsbureaus 

BELGIQUE- BELGIE GRAND-DUCHE DE LUXEMBOURG CANADA 

Rue Archimede 73 - Centre european Inn of the Provinces 
Archimedesstraat 73 Batiment Jean Monnet B/0 Office Tower 
1 040 Bruxelles - 1 040 Brussel Luxembourg - Kirchberg Suite 1110 
Tel.: 735 oo 40/735 so 40 Tel. 43011 Sparks' Street 350 

Ottawa, Ont. KIA 7S8 
Tel. 238 64 64 

DAN MARK 
NEDERLAND 

Lange Voorhout 29 SCHWEIZ- SUISSE- SVIZZERA 
Gammel Torv 6 Den Haag 
Postbox 144 Tel. 46 93 26 Case postale 195 
1 004 K0benhavn K 37-39, rue de Vermont 
Tlf.: (01) 144140/(01) 145512 1211 Geneva 20 

Tel. 34 97 50 
UNITED KINGDOM 

BR DEUTSCHLAND 
20, Kensington Palace Gardens 

EsPANA London WS 400 

ZitelmannstraBe 22 Tel. 727 8090 Madrid 1 
5300 Bonn Windsor House HOtel Castellana 
Tel. 23 80 41 9/1 5 Bedford Street Paseo de Ia Castellana 57 

Belfast Tel. 41002 00 
Kurfurstendamm 102 
1 000 Berlin 31 Tel. 407 08 

Tel. 8 92 4028 4 Cathedral Road PORTUGAL 
Cardiff CF1 9SG 

35, rua Sacramento a Lapa Tel. 37 1631 
1200 Lisboa 

FRANCE 7 Alva Street Tel.: 66 75 96 
Edinburgh EH2 4PH 

61, rue des Belles-Feuilles Tel. 2252058 
7 57 82 Paris Cedex 1 6 THAILAND 
Tel. so1 sa 85 

AMERICA lATINA 
Bangkok 
Thai Military Bank Bldg 

Avda Ricardo Lyon 1177 34, Phya Thai Road 
GRECE Santiago de Chile 9 Tel. 282 1452 

2. Vassilissis Sofias Chile 

T.K. 1602 Adresse postale: Casilla 1 0093 
TORKIYE 

Athina 134 Tel. 25 05 55 

Tel: 74 39 82/74 39 83/74 39 84 Quinta Bienvenida 13, Bogaz Sokak 

Valle Arriba Kavaklidere 

Calle Colibri Ankara 

Distrito Sucre Tel. 27 61 45/27 61 46 
IRELAND Caracas 

39, Molesworth Street Venezuela 
UNITED STATES 

Dublin 2 Tel. 91 47 07 

Tel. 71 22 44 21 00 M Street, NW 
Suite 707 

NIPPON Washington, DC 20037 
Tel. 862 95 00 

IT ALIA Kowa 25 Building 
8-7 Sanbancho 1 Dag Hammarskjold Plaza 

Via Poli. 29 Chiyoda-Ku 245 East 47th Street 
00187 Roma Tokyo 102 New York, NY 10017 
Tel. 678 97 22 Tel. 239 04 41 Tel. 371 38 04 

9 
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Emneliste - Sachverzeichnis - Classified list - Liste thematique - Elenco 
per argomenti -lndelingslijst 

1 Generelle. polltiske og inatltutionelle 
spergsmil - Allgemeine, politische und 

institutionelle Fragen - General, political and 
institutional matters - Questions generales. 
politlques et inatitutionelles - Queationi generali. 
politiche e istituzlonali - Algemene. politieke en 
institutionele vraagatukken 

MONOGRAFIER OG SERIER - MONOGRAFIEN UNO REIHEN -
MONOGRAPHS AND SERIES - MONOGRAPHIES ET sERIES -
MONOGRAFIE E SERlE - MONOGRAFIEEN EN SERIES 

Anberetnlng - Den Europaaiake lnvesteringabank 
1979 - 92s.; 30cm; bltldt bind; 400g; IDA) 
DE:I0.07-17. EN:I0.07-2. FR:80.07 -19. IT:90.07 -22. 
NL:80.07- 14 
ISBN 92-881-oooo-o: pis. 

2 Annuel report - European IIMIStment Bank 
1979- 92pp.; 30cm; softcover; 400g; (EN) 
DA:90.07 -1. DE:90.07 -17. FR:I0.07-19. IT:80.07 -22. 
NL:80.07- 14 
ISBN 92-881-Q002-7: freeofcha"ge. 

3 Annual Report - Economic and Social Committee 
1979-104 pp.; 3 waphs; 21cm; softcover; 160g; IENI 
DE:80.07 -18. FR:80.07- 20. IT:80.07- 23. Nl:80.07 -16 
EX-3Q-80-184-EN..C ISBN 92-8300022-8: free of ch.-ge. 

4 Collection of the AgrH-concluded by the EuropHn 
Communities 1977 - Council of the European Communities 
n. 7 - xxviil, 1624 pp.; 17 em; har~ 800 g; Annual 
supplement (EN) 
DE:80.07-24. FR:80.07 -21. IT:80.07-18 
RX-28-79..091-EN..C ISBN 92-824-Q034-4 
ISBN 92-825-1527-3: ECU 82,60,1RL 41.60, UKL 37.80, 
USD 86.60. 

5 Le Communeute 8conomlque europ6enne: doaler 
p8dagogique 1 er cycle- Commission des Communsutes 
europ8ennee- Paris- 30p.; 30cm; feuillets mobiles; 170g; Cahier 
de travaux pratiques awe cartes, photos, waphiques (FRI 
FF 5. 

6 Como Funclonam •• In~ cia Comunldada Europeia -
Noiil, E.; Comissio das Comunidades ewopeias- 38 p., 7 iH.; 23 
em; ; 60 g; (PT) 
ES:80.07-7 
cc-28-79-245-PT-c ISBN 92-826-1382-3. 

7 Como funclonan In lnatltuclonea cia Ia Comunidad EuropH­
Noil, E.; ComisiOn de las Communidades -opeas- 38 p., 7 ill.; 23 
em; ; 60 g; (ESI 
PT:80.07-8 
CC-29-79-245-E&-c ISBN 92-826-1380-7. 

8 Europe aktuell - Kommission d.- Europiiachen Gemeinschaften -
242 S., zahlr.(z.T.farb.); 30cm; broschiert; 720g; (DE) 
CB-28-79-881-QE..C ISBN 92-825-0783-1: ECU 6, 
OM 12,60. 

9 Europe nu: Stand van da EuropeH lntegratle- Europeas 
Parlement- xlii, 586blz.; 25 x 17cm; gebrocheerd; 1060g; (NLI 
DE:90.06- 3. EN:90.08- 1. FR:80.07- 11 
AX-28-79-918-NL-c ISBN 92-823-Q024-2: Ecu 12,60, 
HFL 34. 

10 L'Europa oggi: Stato dal'integrazlone europH- Partamento 
europao-xlii, 687 pag.; 25 x 17 em; broasura; 1060g; 1m 

DE:90.08- 3. EN:80.08- 1. FR:80.07- 11. N1.:90.07- 9 
AX-28-79-918-IT..C ISBN 92-823-Q023-4: ECU 12,50, 
LIT 14400. 

11 L'Europe aujourd'hul: Etat cia rlnt6gratlon europ8enne-
Partement III8'0p6en- xlli, 688p.; 26 x 17cm; broch8; 1096g; (FRI 
DE:IO.OII- 3. EN:80.08- 1 
AX-28-79-918-FR..C ISBN 92-823-Q022-8: Ecu 12.60, 
BFR 600, FF 72. 

12 l'Europe pratique- Bureau de presse et d'information- Parts-
2()p.; 11X27cm; awafil; 36g; (FRI (L'Europa en bref- Commlaslon 
des Communeutes ... op8ennee) 
FF 3. 

13 La France dane Ia Comi11UIIIIIIt6 ~- Bureau de 
presse et d'information- Parts- 32p.; 11 x 27cm; awafil; 60g; (FRI 
(L'Europa en bref - Commlaslon des Communeutes e..opHmee) 
FF 3. 

14 Jaarvenlag- Europase lnvesteringabank 
1979- 92 biz.; 30cm; gebrocheerd; 400g; (NL) 
DA:80.07-1. D£:80.07-17. EN:80.07-2. FR:I0.07-18. 
IT:90.07- 22 
ISBN 92-881-()()()6-1: pis. 

16 ....,.,..... - Economisch en Soci8lll Comit8 
1979- 114 biz.; 3 wllf.; 21cm; gebrocheerd; 166g; (NLI 
DE:80.07- 18. EN:I0.07- 3. Fll:80.07- 20. IT:80.07- 23 
EX-30-80-184-NL-c ISBN 92-8300025-0: wat~s. 

16 ~-Wirtschllfte..u Sozialauaschu& 
1979 -1145.; 3 W&Ph· o...,.; 21em; broschiert; 170g; IDE! 
EN:I0.07- 3. FR:80.07- 20. IT:I0.07- 23. Nl.:80.07- 1& 
EX-30-80-184-DE..C ISBN 92-8300021-8: kostenlos. 

17 JalvHIIerlcht - Europlische lnveatitionabank 
1979- 925.; 30cm; broschiert; 400g; (DEl 
DA:90.07- 1. EN:80.07- 2. FR:80.07 -18. IT:80.07- 22. 
NL:90.07- 14 
ISBN 92-881-Q001-9: kostenlos. 

18 Raccolta d ... ~I conc1ua1 della Commun~ europae 
1977 - Consiglio dane Comuniti ...opae 
n. 7- xxviH, 1526 pag.; 17 em; rilegllto; 800 g; Supplemento 
annualelm 
DE:80.07-24. EN:80.07-4. FR:80.07-21 
RX-28-79-091-IT..C ISBN 92-824-Q038-0 
ISBN 92-826-1629-X: ECU 62,60, LIT 74300. 

19 Rapport annual- 8anque europ8enne d'inveatiasement 
1979- 92p.; 30cm; broch8; 400g; (FR) 
DA:80.07 -1. DE:80.07- 17. EN:80.07- 2. IT:90.07 -22. 
NL:80.07- 14 
ISBN 92-881-Q003-6: watuit. 

20 Rapport annue1 - eom~te economlqua ., aoc1a1 
1979- 112p.; 3 waph.; 21em; broch8; 16&g; (FRI 
DE:80.07 -18. EN:80.07- 3. IT:80.07 -23. NL:80.07 -11 
EX-30-80-184-FR-c ISBN 92-8300023-4: watuit. 
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n. 7 - xxvili, 11522 p.; 17 em; ralili; 800 g; Compl6ment annual (FRI 
DE:90.07- 24. EN:90.07- 4. IT:80.07- 18 
RX-28-79-091-FR-c ISBN 92-824-Q036-2 
ISBN 92-825-1628-1: Ecu 62,60. BFR 2600, FF 382. 

22 Relazlone annuale- Banca Europaa par~ lnvastm.lti 
1979- 92 pag.; 30cm; broasura; 400g; 1m 
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NL:80.07- 14 
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23 Relezlone annuale 1979 - Comitato economico e sociale 
1979- 112 pag.; 3 grafici; 21cm; brossura; 155g; 1m 
D£:80.07 -18. EN:80.07- 3. FR:80.07- 20. NL:80.07 -15 
EX-30-80-164-IT..C ISBN 92-830-0024-2: gratuito. 

24 Sammlung der von den Europiiechen Gemelnechaften 
geechloennen Uberelnkiinfte 1977 - Rat der Europiiiechen 
Gemeinechaftan 
n. 7 - xxviii, 1522 S.; 17 em; gebunden; 800 g; Ergilnzungebend 
(DEl 
EN:80.07-4. FR:80.07-21. IT:80.07-18 
RX-28-71Hl91-DE..C ISBN 92-824-0033-6 
ISBN 92-825-1526-5: ECU 62,50, OM 156,30. 
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Bulletin des Com~unaut&s elJI'OI)8ennea. 
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0£:80.07-25. FR:80.07- 29. IT:80.07- 28. NL:80.07- 30 
CB-29-79-417-EN..C : ECU 4,60, IRL 3.10, UKL 2.B5, 
USD 6.40. 

27 Guide pratique pour l'utiliaetion du achima des prlttirences 
terlfeires g6niralls8es des Communautea aurop8ennea; 1 er 
mai 19BO- Commission des Communautis ewop8ennes- 326 p.; 
30 x 21 em; broch8; B50 g; (FR) 
CB-30-BQ-261-FR-C ISBN 92-825-1 B2B-O: Ecu 17, BFR 660, 
FF 9B,50. 

2B Note eapllcative delle Tarlffa doganale delle Comunitii 
europae: 1 6o aggiornamento I 1 • 1 • 1 980)- Commissione delle 
Comunita europee- 140pag.; 30cm; foglio mobile; 350g; OTI 
DE:80.07- 26. EN:80.07- 26. FR:80.07- 29. NL:80.07- 30 
CB-29-79-417-IT..C : ECU 4,60, LIT 5300. 

29 Notes expllcativea du Tarlf douenier des Communautis 
europiennea: 1 &a mise a jour (1. 1.1 9801- Commission des 
Communautes europ8ennes- 140p.; 30cm; feuillets mobiles; 
350g; (FR) 
DE:80.07- 26. EN:80.07- 26. IT:80.07- 28. NL:80.07- 30 
CB-29-79-417-FR-c : Ecu 4,60, BFR 1B6, FF 26,70. 
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350g; (NL) 
0£:80.07-25. EN:80.07- 26. FR:80.07- 29. IT:80.07- 28 
CB-29-79-417-NL..C : Ecu 4,60, HFL 12,60. 
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FF 4. 

32 In etap in Europe: Coordinated agricultural r-ch of the 
European Economic Communhy - Directorate-General Scientific 
and Technical Information and Information Management; Cherry, 
Mary- 42pp.; 15 figures; 23cm; stapled; 100g; (EN) [Agriculture­
Directora.oeneral Agriculture; Commission of the European 
Communities) EUR 6720 
CD-NK-8D-001-EN..C ISBN 92-826-1707-1: ECU 2, IRL 1.40, 
UKL 1.30, USD 3. 
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NL:80.07- 44 
free of charge; limited distribution. 

34 CoUacteclects (updating supplememl: EEC- Tunisia 
euoclation; 31 October 1978- Council of the European 
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Nota asplicativa dalla Tarlffa doganala della Comunit8 
auropaa: 1&oe119iornamanto (1.1.19801 28 
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36 Raccolta di atti la119iornamantol: A11ociaziona CEE -
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DA:80.07-41. DE:80.07-43. EN:80.07-34. IT:80.07-36. 
NL:80.07 • 46 
gretuit; diffusion restreinte. 
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40 SamHng af rataakter (Ajourfarlng): AIIOCiaringan EI!IF -
Marokko; 31 oktober 1978- Radet for De europaiske 
F .. lesskaber- 226 s.; 30 em; lesblad; 570 g; (DA) 
DE:80.07 -42. EN:80.07- 33. FR:80.07- 38. IT:80.07 • 36. 
NL:80.07- 44 
gratis; begratnset oplag. 

41 Samllng af r-ktar (Ajourfaringl: A"ociarlngan EI!IF -
Tunasian; 31 oktober 1978- Ridet for De europlliske 
F .. lesskaber- 200 s.; 30 em; ltlsblad; 500 g; IDA) 
DE:80.07 -43. EN:80.07- 34. FR:80.07- 39. IT:80.07- 36. 
NL:80.07- 46 
gratis; /Jegnlnset oplag. 

Sammlung dar von dan Europliiechen Gamelnechaftan 
gaschlouanan Ubareinkilnfte 1977; n. 7 24 

42 Sammlung von Rachtaaktan (Aktualisiarung): Aaaoziation 
EWG -Marokko; 31. Oktober 1978- Rat der Europiischan 
Gemeinschaften- 226 S.; 30 em; Loseblatt; 570 g; (DEl 
DA:80.07- 40. EN:80.07- 33. FR:80.07- 38. IT:80.07- 35. 
NL:80.07 -44 
kostenlos; beschrinkt wrfiigbar. 
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43 Semmlung von Reohtukten (Aktueli8ierungl: ~ 
EWG- Tunellen; 31. Oktobw 1978- Rat dar Eu-opiiachen 
Gemeinschaften- 200 S.; 30 em; Loeeblatt; 500 g; IDEI 
DA:80.07 -41. EN:80.07- 34. FR:80.07- 39. IT:80.07- 38. 
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Oemnnacheppen: 1 lie Wijzlglngeblad 11.1. 19801 30 
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Mllrokko; 31 oktobw 1978- Read van de Europese 
Gemeenachappen- 226 biz.; 30 em; 1o8 bled; 570 g; INLI 
DA:80.07-40. DE:80.07-42. EN:80.07-33. FR:80.D7-38. 
IT:80.07 • 36 
watia; beperlcte _,.;ding. 
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DA:80.07-41. DE:80.07-43. EN:80.07-34. FR:80.07-39. 
IT:80.07 -38 
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(Studies. Education series: 80/3 -Commission of the European 
Communities) 
DE:80.07 -48. FR:78. 
CB-N0-79-Q03-EN-c ISBN 92-826-1699-0: ECU 2,60, 
IRL 1.70, UKL 1.66, USD 3.45. 
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comunltario, reffronto fra le varia altuazloni nezionall -
Commissione delle Comuniti europee- 110pag.; 30cm; broesura; 
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DE:80.07-61. EN:80.07-54. FR:80.07-60. NL:80.07-53 
CB-24-78-281-IT-c ISBN 92-826-0960-8: ECU 6, LIT 6800. 

48 
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EN:80.07-48. FR:78. 
CB-NQ-79-oD3-0E-c ISBN 92-826-1698-2: ECU 2,50, 
OM 6,16. 

49 L"Europe dee femmes- Bureau de prease et d'information- Peril 
- 24p.; 11)127em; agraf8; 40g; (FRI (L'Europe en braf­
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FF 4. 
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Commission des Communautea europeannes- 110p.; 30cm; 
broc:h8; 300g; (FRI 
DE:80.07-61. EN:80.07-54. IT:80.07-47. NL:80.07-Ii3 
CB-24-78-281-fR-c ISBN 92-826-0949-4: Ecu 6, BFR 240, 
FF 36. 
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Oemelnechaft. Verglelch zwilchen den Mitglledetaeten­
Kommlasion dar Europilachen Gemelnachaften- 1105.; 30cm; 
broechlart; 3()()g; (DEl 
EN:80.07-54. FR:80.07-80. IT:80.07-47. NL:80.07-63 
CB-24-78-281-0E-c ISBN 92-826-0947-8: ECU 6, OM 16. 
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63 

64 
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- 176 S.; 17 tab., 8 IH.; 26em; broschlert; 336g; (DE) [Studien. 
Blldungsreihe: 80/11 - Kommielion der Europilschen 
GemeiniChaften] 
DA:80.07 ·103. EN:80.08- 32. FR:80.07 • 87 
CS-N0-78-011-0E-c ISBN 92-826-1639-7: ECU 4,37, 
OM 11. 

103 Speclalundervlanlngen I Det europllleke F..._kllb-
187a.; 17 tab., 8 ill.; 26cm; bltMit bind; 320g; (DAI [Studier. 
Undervisninglrllkke: 80/11 - Kommillionan for De europlliske 
F•leslklber) 
DE:80.07-102. EN:80.08-32. FR:80.07·87 
C8-N0-78-011-DA-c ISBN 92-826-1638-9: ECU 4,37, 
DKR 34. 

104 Voreohullache Erzlehungln der Europileohen Gemelnaoheft 
- Gouterd, Madeleine; Centre intllmatlonll d'etudes pjdagogiques, 
Sivrw- 129 S., 12 Teb.; 26cm; broaehiert; 266 g; (DEl [Studien. 
8Udungareihe: 80/12- Kommlulon der Europiliscloen 
Gemeinachaften] 
DA:80.07 • 98. EN:80.07- 100. FR:80.07 • 95. 11:80.07 • 98. 
NL:80.07 ·99 
CB-N0-78-012-DE-c ISBN 92-825-1719-6: ECU 3,75, 
OM 9,60. 

TIDSSKRIFTER - ZEITSCHRIFTEN - PERIODICALS - PERIOOIOUES 
- PERIODIC! - TIJDSCHRIFTEN 

Europe-Inform~ filr die Jugendpresse. 

Fiches pjdagogiques "30 jours d'Europe". 

1 8 Statiatlk - Statlatlken - Statiatica -
Statlatlquea - Statiatlche - Statlatleken 

MONOGRAI'IER OG SERIER - MONOGRAFIEN UNO REIHEN -
MONOGRAPHS AND SERIES - MONOGRAPHIES ET sERIES -
MONOGRAFIE E SERlE - MONOGRAFIEEN EN SERIES 

105 Agrerltlltletiach" Jllhrbuch 11715-1178- Stlltietischea Amt 
dar Europiiachen Gemeinschaften [Land- und Foratwirtschaft, 
Fiecherei (griiner Umschleg) - Kommisllon dar EuropiiiChen 
Gemeinschaften) 
1980-xxx, 301 p., 38 ill.; 23 em; broachiert; 6&0g; 
(OE/EN/FR/ITI 
EN:80.07-217. FR:80.07-108. 11:80.07·107 
CA-28-79-972-4A-c ISBN 92-825-1631-1: ECU 12,60, 
DM31. 

108 Annuelre de ltlltlatique egrloole 11715-1178 - Office 
stlltistique des Communautn europ6ennes (Agriculture, foritll et 
pichi (COUVtllture vertel- Commiuion des CommunautH 

-~I 
1980- xxx, 301 p., 36 ill.; 23 em; brochil; 660 g; (DE/EN/FR/ITI 
DE:80.07 ·108. EN:80.07 • 217. 11:80.07 ·107 • 
CA-28-79-972-4A·C ISBN 92-826-1531-1: Ecu 12,60, 
BFR 600, FF 72,80. 

107 Annuerlo ell ltlltletlllll ...... 18715-1878 - lltituto statietico 
delle Comuniti europee [Agricoltura, forestlle pesca (copertina 
-del- Commieelone delle Comuniti europee) 
1980-xxx, 301 p .. 36 iH.; 23 em; broaaura; 660g; (DE/EN/FR/m 
01!:80.07 • 106. EN:80.07 • 217. FR:80.07 • 108 
CA-28-79-972-4A-c ISBN 92-826-1631-1: ECU 12,60, 
LIT 14300. 

108 BeleMH dn pelementa: Ventlletlon g6ogrephlque 
1874-1878 - Office atstiatique des CommuneUIH europ6ennes -
169 p.; 30 em; brocM; 460 g; (EN/FRI [Comptlll nationeux, 
finance• et bllancal des paiementll (~ violettii)­
Commluion des CommuneutH europiennea) 
DA:80.07 • 110. DE:80.07 • 218. EN:80.07 ·109. 11:80.07- 112. 
NL:80.07-111 
CA-30.8D-100.2A-c ISBN 92-825-1868-2: Ecu 20, 
BFR 800, FF 118. 

109 Belen- of peymentl: Geogrephiclll brMkdown 
1874-1878 - Stlltietical Office of the Europeen Communities- 189 
pp.; 30 em; loftcover; 450 g; CEN/FRI [National eccountll, finance 
and balence of paymenta (vlolet _,_ Commiulon of the 
European Communities) 
DA:90.D7·110. DE:80.07·218. FR:80.07·109. 11:80.07-112. 
NL:80.07 • 111 
CA-30-8D-100.2A-c ISBN 92-821i-1868-2: ECU 20, 
IRL 13.60, UKL 12, USD 28. 

110 lletlllngabelancer: Geograflak forderllng1874-1178- De 
europllilke F•leslkabers stetistilka Kontor- 189 a.; 30 em; bltMit 
bind; 450 g; (OA/NLI [Nation&llregnlkebw, finllneer og 
betlllingabalenQr (vlolet omalag) - Kommiuionen for De europtlilke 
F .. lesskaber) 
DE:80.07 -218. EN:80.07 ·109. FR:80.07 ·109. 11:80.07 ·112. 
NL:8D.07-111 
CA-3D-Bo-100.2G-c ISBN 92-826-1869-0: ECU 20, 
DKR 166. 

111 l1t11Ungebelenlen: Geogreflache verdellng1174-1878-
sur ... voor de Stetistiek der Europeee Gemeenschappen- 189 biz.; 
30 em; gebrochlerd; 450 g; (OA/NLI [Nationele rlkeningen, 
flnanciin en betalingabalanean (p-ss omllag) - Commisaie van de 
Europeae Gemeenachappan) 
DA·80.07 • 110. DE:80.07 • 218. EN:90.07 • 109. FR:90.07 • 108. 
IT:90.07 • 112 
CA·3~100.2G-c ISBN 92-825-1868-0: Eeu 20, HFL 515. 

112 Silence del pegementi: Ripertizlone geograflca 1974-1878 
- lstotuto statistlco clalle Comunita europee - 189 pag.; 30 em; 
broaaura; 460 g; (DE/IT) [Conti nezionali, flnenzs a bilancie del 
pagamenti (copertina viola) • Commiasione delle Comunita europee) 
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DA:80.07 -110. DE:80.07 -218. EN:80.07 ·109. FR:80.07 ·109. 
Nl:80.07- 111 
CA-3o-Bo-100.2F..C ISBN 92-825-1857-4: ECU 20, 
LIT 23800. 

Compth natlonaux SEC- Agr8gata 1180-1178- Office 
statistique des Communautes europ8ennas- ix, 178 p.; 30 em; 
brochll; 550 g; (EN/FR/NL) [Comptas nationaux, finances at 
balances des paiements (couwrture violettel - Commission des 
Communautie europllennes) 
DA:80.07- 121. DE:80.D7- 218. EN:80.07- 119. IT:80.07- 114. 
Nl:80.07 -120 
CA-29-79-336-3D-C ISBN 92-825-1709-8: Ecu 10, BFR 400, 
FF 57,80. 

Conti nazlonali SEC- Aggraptl 1180-1178- lstituto 
atatistico delle Comunita auropea- ix, 178 pag.; 30 em; br011ura; 
550 g; (OA/DE/m [Conti nazionali, finanze e bHancia dei pagamenti 
(copertina viola) - CommoiSione delle Comunita europea) 
DA:80.07-121. DE:80.07-2UI. EN:80.07-119. FR:80.07-113. 
NL:80.07- 120 
CA-29-79·336-3E-<: ISBN 92-825-171o-1: ECU 10, 
LIT 11400. 

Le donne nella Comunlti europb: Azloni • llvello comunltarlo, 
raHronto fra le varia lltuazlonl nazlonell 4 7 

Enquite par aondage eur 111 torch de travail 
1 173-1 175-1177 - Office atatiatique des Communautes 
europ8ennas- 197p.; 30cm; brochi; 530g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
[Population at conditiona sociales (couverture jaune) - Commiaaion 
des Communautie europllennes] 
DA:80.07-215. DE:80.07 -214. EN:80.07 -118. IT:80.07- 118. 
NL:80.07- 213 
CA-29-79-425·6A..C ISBN 92-826-1536-2: Ecu 12,50, 
BFR 500, FF 72. 

Lh femmh It Ia Communautlt europltenne: Actlona 
communeutalrh, eltuatlone natlonalee comparltee 50 

Ole Frauen und dla Europilecha Gemelnachllft: Aktlonen dar 
Gemllnechllft, Verglalch zwlachen den Mltglledataaten 51 

lndagina per camplona aulle forze dl lavoro 
1973-11711-1177 -latituto lltatistico delle Comuniti europea-
197p.; 30cm; brosaura; 530g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
[Popolazlone a condizionlaociali (copertina gillle) - Commisalone 
delle Comuniti europea) 
DA:80.07·215. DE:80.07-214. EN:80.07-118. FR:80.07-115. 
Nl:80.07-213 
CA-29-79-425-&A-<: ISBN 92-825-1636-2: ECU 12,50, 
LIT 14400. 

lndiclteura aoclllux pour Ill Communaute europltenne 
1 180-1 178 - Office statiatique des Communautie europllennea -
234 p.; 30 em; brochll; 620 g; (EN/FRl [Population at conditions 
aocialea (couwrture jaune)- Commission des Communautie 
europeennes) 
EN:80.07-212 
CA-28-79-102-2A-C ISBN 92-825-1596-6: Ecu 20, BFR 600, 
FF 115,60. 

Labour forcaumple aurvay 1173-1976-1177- Statiatical 
Office of the European Communitiea- 197p.; 30cm; softcover; 
530g; (OA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) (Population and social conditions 
(yellow cover)- Commisaion of the European Communities) 
DA:80.07-215. DE:80.07-214. FR:80.07-115. IT:80.07-118. 
NL:80.07 -213 
CA-29-79-425-6A..C ISBN 92-625-1636-2: ECU 12,50, 
IRL 8.30, UKL 8, USD 18. 

Nlltlonalaccounta ESA- Aggregate• 1180-1978- Ststiatical 
Office of the European Communities- ix, 178 pp.; 30 em; 
softcover; 550 g; (EN/FR/NLl [National accounts, finance and 
balance of payments (violet cover) - Commiasion of the European 
Communities] 
DA:80.07 ·121. DE:80.07 -216. FR:80.07 -113. 11:80.07-114. 
NL:80.07- 120 
CA-29-79-336-30-<: ISBN 92-825-1709-8: ECU 10, 
IRL 6.70, UKL 6.10, USD 13.80. 
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120 Netlonele rekeningen ESER • Totelen 1980-1178 -Bureau 
voor de Statistiak dar Europeae Gemeensc:happan- xi, 178 biz.; 30 
em; gebroch-d; 550 g; (EN/FR/NLl [Nationale rekeningen, 
financiin en betalingebalensen (paarse omsleg)- Commiasie van de 
Europeae Gemeanschappen) 
DA:80.07·121. DE:80.07-216. EN:80.D7-11S. FR:80.07-113. 
IT:80.07- 114 
CA-29-79-336-3D-C ISBN 92-825-1709-8: Ecu 10, HFL 27. 

121 Nationalragneklber ENS - T oteler 1 980-1 178 - De 
europllilke F•lessklbare statistiake Kontor- x, 178 a.; 30 em; 
bladt bind; 550 g; (DA/DE/m (Nationalragnakaber, finan- og 
betsllngabalancer (violet omsleg) - Kommiasionen for De europlliske 
F .. lesakaber] 
DE:80.07- 218. EN:80.07 -119. FR:80.07 -113. 11:80.07-114. 
NL:80.07- 120 
CA-29-79-336-3E-<: ISBN 92-825-171o-1: ECU 10, 
DKR 76,80. 

122 NIMEXE 1 171: AnalytiCIII tablea of foreign trade - Statistical 
Office of the European Communities [External trade (red cover) -
Commillion of the European Communities) 
n.A 01-24: Live animals and animal and vegetable products; fats 
and oils, foodstuffs, beveragea and tobacco- xvii, 820p., xix-xlii; 
30cm; softcover; 1670g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07 • 184. DE:80.07- 150. FR:80.07- 178. IT:80.07 -192. 
Nl:80.07- 136 
CA·NC-8o-001-7A-<: ISBN 92-826-1816-9: set: ECU 393,76, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-825-1802-7: volume: ECU 50, IRL 33,20, UKL 29.60, 
USD 63. 

123 NIMEXE 1 171: Analytical tablh of foreign trade - Ststistical 
Office of the European Communities [External trade (red cover) -
Commisaion of the European Communities) 
n.A-Z- microfiche; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -185. DE:80.07 -151. FR:80.07 -179. IT:80.07 -193. 
NL:80.07 -137 
CA-79-8o-001-7A·A ISBN 92-825-1839-6: set: ECU 75, 
IRL 49.70, UKL 44.60, USD 95; CompiiJteHrifi. 

124 NIMEXE 1178: Analytical tables of foreign trade- Ststistical 
Office of the European Communities [External trade (red cover) -
Commission of the European Communities) 
n.B 25-27: Mineral products- xviii, 121p., xix-xlii; 30cm; 
softcovar; 420g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 • UIB. DE:80.07 • 152. FR:80.07- 180. IT:80.07- 194. 
Nl:80.07- 136 
CA-NC-8o-Q02-7A-<: ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,76, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-625-1803-5: volume: ECU 10, IRL 6.66, UKL 5.90, 
USD 12.70. 

125 NIMEXE 1871: AnalytiCIII tablea of foreign trade- Ststistical 
Office of the European Communities [Extsrnal trade (red cover) -
Commiasion of the European Communities) 
n.C 26-38: Products of the chemical and allied industries- xviii, 
811p., xix-xlli; 30cm; softcover; 1650g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07-187. OE:80.07 -153. FR:80.D7 -181. IT:80.07 -195. 
NL:80.07 • 139 
CA·NC-8o-003-7A..C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,75, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-626-1804-3: volume: ECU 50, IRL 33.20, UKL 29.60, 
USD 63. 

126 NIMEXE 1 978: Analytical tlblea of foreign trade- Ststistical 
Office of the European Communltiea [External trade (red cover) -
Commiseion of the European Communities) 
n.D 39-43: Pleatica, rubber, raw hides and skins, leather, furakins 
and articles thereof, l8ddlery and herneas; morocco leather goods, 
travel goods- xviii, 293p., xix-xlii; 30cm; softcover; 860g; 
(OA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07- 168. DE:80.07- 164. FR:80.07- 182. IT:80.07- 198. 
NL:80.07- 140 
CA-NC-8o-Q04-7A..C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,76, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-826·1805-1: volume: ECU 25, IRL 16.80, UKL 14.80, 
USD 31.60. 
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127 NIMEXE 1979: Analytical tables of foreign trade- Statistical 
Office of the E~Wopaan Communities [Extamal trade (red cover) -
Commission of the EIM'opa8n Communities] 
n.E 44-49: Wood, COil<, paper, paperboard and articles thereof, 
manufactures of plaotlng materials and basketware- xviii, 217p., 
xix-xliii; 30cm; softcover; 660g; (OA/DE/EN/FR/IT /Nll 
DA:80.07 -189. D£:80.07 -156. FR:80.07 -183. IT:80.07 -197. 
NL:80.07-141 
CA-NC-80-005-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,75, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 928251806X: volume: ECU 25,1Rl 16.60, UKL 14.80, 
USD 31.60. 

128 NIMEXE 1979: Analytical tables of foreign trade- Statistocal 
Office of the E~Wopaan Communities [External trade (red coveri­
Commission of the European Communotoes) 
n.F 50-67: Textiles and textile articles, shoes, headgear, umbrellas 
and sunshades ... - xvio, 736p., xix-xlii; 30cm; soltcover; 1960g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /Nll 
DA:80.07- 170. D£:80.07- 168. FR:80.07- 184. IT:80.07 -198. 
NL:80.07- 142 
CA-NC-80-006-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,75, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-825-1807-8: volume: ECU 60,1Rl 39,60, UKL 35.50, 
USD 76. 

129 NIMEXE 1979: analytical tables of foreign trade- Statistical 
Office of the European Communities [External trade (red coveri­
Commission of the European Communities] 
n.G 68-72: Articles of stone, of plaster, of cement, ... , ceramics; 
glass and glassware, pearls, precious stones, jewellery, coins- xviii, 
219p., xix-xlii; 30cm; softcover; 670g; (OA/DE/EN/FR/IT/Nll 
DA:80.07 -171. D£:80.07 -157. FR:80.07 -186. IT:80.07 -199. 
N1.!80.07- 143 
CA-NC-8Q-007-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,75, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-825-1808-6: volume: ECU 25,1Rl 16,60, UKL 14.80, 
USD 31,60. 

130 NIMEXE 1979: Analytical tables of foreign trade- Statistical 
Office of the European Communities [External trade (red coveri­
Commission of the E~Wopean Communities] 
n.H 73: Iron and steel- xviii, 321 p.; xix-xlii; 30cm; softcover; 
850g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07- 172. D£:80.07- 168. FR:80.07- 188. IT:80.07- 200. 
Nl:80.07 -144 
CA-NC-8o-oo8-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,75, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-B25-1809-4: volume: ECU 30,1Rl 19.90, UKL 17.75, 
USD 38. 

131 NIMEXE 1979: Analytical tables of foreign trade- Statistical 
Office of the European Communotoes [External trade (red coveri­
Commission of the E~Wopean Communities) 
n.l 74-83: Base metals (except oron and steel) and articles thereof­
xviii, 264p., xix-xlii; 30cm; soltcover; 780g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /Nll 
DA:80.07 -173. D£:80.07 -159. FR:80.07 -187. IT:80.07 -201. 
Nl:80.07 -145 
CA-NC-8Q-009-7A-C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,75, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-825-1810-8: volume: ECU 25,1Rl 16.60, UKL 14.80, 
USD 31,60. 

132 NIMEXE 1979: Analytical tables of foreign trade- Statistical 
Office of the E~Wopaan Communities [External trade (red cover) -
Commission of the European Communities] 
n.J 84-85: Machinery and mechanical appliances, electrotechnical 
apparatus- xviii, 1060p., xix-xlii; 30cm; softcover; 930g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /Nl) 
DA:80.07 -174. DE:80.07 -160. FR:80.07- 188. IT:80.07 -202. 
NL:80.07- 146 
CA-NC-80-010-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,75, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-825-1811-6: volume: ECU 82,50, IRL 54.70, 
UKL 48.80, USD 104. 

133 NIMEXE 1979: Analytical tables of foreign trade- Statistocal 
Office of the E~Wopean Communities [External trade (red coveri­
Commission of the European Communities) 

n.K 86-89: Means of transportation- xviii, 183p. xox-xlii; 30cm; 
soltcover; 580g; (OA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
DA:80.07 -176. 0£:80.07-181. FR:80.07 -189. IT:80.07- 203. 
Nl:80.07- U7 
CA-NC-80-011-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,75, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-825-1812-4: volume: ECU 14,75, IRL 10.80, 
UKL 9.60, USD 20.50. 

134 NIMEXE 1979: Analytical tables of foreign trade- Statistical 
Office of the E~Wopean Communities [External trade (red cover) -
Commission of the European Communities] 
n.L 90-99: Optical, photographic, cinematographic and medical 
instruments, •.. arms and ammunition, miscellaneous articles - xviii, 
423p., xix-xlii; 30cm; soltcover; 1060g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/Nll 
DA:80.07- 178. D£:80.07- 182. FR:80.07- 190. IT:80.07- 204. 
Nl:80.07- 148 
CA-NC-80-012-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 3g3,75, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-825-1813-2: volume: ECU 47,50,1RL 24.90, 
UKL 22.20, USD 47.50. 

135 NIMEXE 1979: Analytical tables of foreign trade - Statistical 
Office of the E~Wopaan Communities [External trade (red coveri­
Commission at the E~Wopaan Communities] 
n.Z: Countries-Products- xxx, 273p.; 30cm; softcover; 800g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
DA:80.07 -177. D£:80.07 -183. FR:80.07 -191. IT:80.07 -206. 
Nl:80.07- 149 
CA-NC-80-013-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: set: ECU 393,75, 
IRL 261, UKL 233, USD 497 
ISBN 92-825-1814-0: volume: ECU 50, IRL 33.20, UKL 29.60, 
USD 63. 

136 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiacha taballen van de buitenlandse 
handel - B~Weau voor de Statistiek dar Europese Gemeenschappen 
[Buitenlandee handel (rode omslag) - Commissie van de Europese 
Gemeanschappen) 
n.A 01-24: Lavanda dieren on produkten van hat dieren-en 
plantenrij(, vatten en oliin, levensmiddalan, dranken en tabak- xvii, 
620p., xix-xlii; 30cm; gebroch-d; 1670g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI 
DA:80.07- 184. DE:80.07- 160. EN:80.07 -122. FR:80.07 -178. 
IT:80.07- 192 
CA-NC-8Q-001-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: geheal: 
Ecu 393,75, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-825-1802-7: deel: Ecu 50, HFL 136,50. 

137 NIMEXE 1979: Analytische tabellen van de buitenlandae 
handel - Bureau voor de Statistiek dar Europese Gemeenechappen 
[Buitenlandee handel (rode omslag) - Commissie van de E~Wopese 
Gemaenschappen) 
n.A-Z- microsteekkaart; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
DA:80.07-186. D£:80.07-161. EN:80.07-123. FR:80.07-179. 
IT:80.07- 193 
CA-79-80-001-7A-A ISBN 92-825-1839-6: gehael: Ecu 75, 
HFL 205; Percomp/etessrie. 

138 NIMEXE 1979: Analytische taballen van de buitenlandse 
handal- Bureau voor de Statistlek dar Europess Gemeenschappen 
(Buitenlandse handel (rode omslag) - Commissie van de Europese 
Gemeenschappen] 
n.B 25-27: Mineraleprodukten-xviii, 121p., xix-xlii; 30cm; 
gabrochaerd; 420g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
DA:80.07- 188. D£:80.07- 152. EN:80.07- 124. FR:80.07 -180. 
IT:80.07- 184 
CA-NC-8Q-002-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: gaheel: 
Ecu 393,75, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-825-1803-5: deel: Ecu 10, HFL 27,30. 

139 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiache tabellen van de buitenlandse 
handel - Bureau voor de Statistiek dar Europese Gemeenschappen 
[Buitenlandee handel (rode omslag)- Commissie van de Europese 
Gemaenschappen) 
n.C 28-38: Produkten van de chemische an van de aanverwante 
industriein - xviii, 611p., xix-xlii; 30cm; gabrocheard; 1650g; 
(OA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 



DA:80.07 -167. OE:80.07 -153. EN:80.07 -125. FR:80.07 -181. 
IT:80.07- 195 
CA-NC-8Q-003-7A..C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: geheel: 
Ecu 393,75, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-825-1804-3: deel: Ecu 50, HFL 136,60. 

140 NIMEXE 1979: Analytlsche tabellen van de buitenlandae 
handel'- B,.eau voor de Statistiek dar Europeaa Gemeenschappen 
[Buitenlandee handel (rode omslag) - Commissie van de Europeaa 
Gemeenschsppen) 
n.O 39-43: Kunstmatige plastischa stoffen, rubber, huiden, vellen, 
Ieder en pelterijen, lederwaren en bontwerk, fijne lederwaran, 
zadelmakarswerk en raisartikelan - xvin, 293p., xix-xlii; 30cm; 
gabrochaard; 850g; (OA/OE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07 -168. DE:80.07 -154. EN:80.07 -126. FR:80.07 -182. 
IT:80.07- 196 
CA-NC-8()-()()4-7 A..C ISBN 92-825-1816-9: gehsel: 
Ecu 393,76, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-825-1805-1: deel: Ecu 25, HFL 68,25. 

141 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiache tabellen van de buitenlandse 
handel - B,.eau voor de Statistiek der Europesa Gemeenachappen 
[Buitanlandee handel (rode omslagl- Commissie van de EuropBIB 
Gameenschappan] 
n.E 44-49: Hout, kurk, papiar- en karton, papiar en kartonwaran, 
viechtwark en mandanmakarswark- xviii, 217p., xix-xiiii; 30cm; 
gebrochaard; 660g; IOA/OE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -169. DE:80.07 -166. EN:80.07 -127. FR:80.07 -183. 
IT:80.07 -197 
CA-NC-8Q-005-7 A..C ISBN 92-825-1816-9: gehael: 
Ecu 393,75, HFL 1074 
ISBN 928251806X: deel: Ecu 26, HFL 68,26. 

142 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiache tabellan van de buitenlandn 
handel - Bureau voor de Statistiek der Europesa Gemeenschsppen 
[Buitenlandse handel (rode omslag) - Commissie van de Europ818 
Gemeenschappen] 
n.F 50..67: Textielstoffen en textielwaren, schoeisel, hoofddeksels, 
paraplu's en parasols ... - xvii, 736p .. xix-xlii; 30cm; gebrochaard; 
1960g; (OA/OE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -170. DE:80.07 -156. EN:80.07 -128. FR:80.07- 184. 
IT:80.07- 198 
CA-NC-8o-oo&-7A..C ISBN 92-825-1816-9: geheel: 
Ecu 393,76, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-826-1807-8: deel: Ecu 60, HFL 164. 

143 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiache tabellan van de buitanlandn 
handel- Bureau voor de Statistiek dar Europese Gemeenschsppen 
(Buitenlandse handel (rode omslag) - Commissie van de Europesa 
Gemeenschappen] 
n.G 68-72: Warken van steen, van gips, van cament, ... , keramische 
produkten, glas en glaswerk, parels, edelstenan, bijouteriean, 
munten- xviii, 219p., xix-xiii; 30cm; gebrochaard; 670g; 
(OA/OE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -171. DE:80.07 -167. EN:80.07 -129. FR:80.07 -185. 
IT:80.07- 199 
CA-NC-8Q-007-7A..C ISBN 92-825-1816-9: geheel: 
Ecu 393,76, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-825-1808-6: deal: Ecu 26, HFL 68,25. 

144 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiache tabellen van de buitenlandse 
handel - Bureau voor de Statistiek dar Europeaa Gemaanschappen 
[Buitenlandse handel (rode omslag) - Commissia van de Europesa 
Gemeenschappen] 
n.H 73: Gietijzer, ijzar en staal- xviii, 321p.; xix-xlii; 30cm; 
gabrocheerd; 860g; (OA/OE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -172. DE:80.07 -158. EN:80.07 -130. FR:80.07 -186. 
IT:80.07- 200 
CA-NC-BQ-008-7 A-C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: geheel: 
Ecu 393,75, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-825-1809-4: deel: Ecu 30, HFL 82. 

145 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiachetabellen van de bultenlandse 
handel- Bureau voor de Statistiek der Europ818 Gameenschappen 
[Buitenlandsa handel (rode omslag) - Commissie van de Europesa 
Gemeenschappan] 
n.l 74-83: Onadale metalen (met uitzondenng van gietijzar, ijzar en 
staal) en produkten daarvan- xviii, 264p., xix-xlii; 30cm; 
gabrocheerd; 780g; (OA/OE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 

DA:80.07 -173. DE:80.07 -159. EN:80.07 -131. FR:80.07 -187. 
IT:80.07- 201 
CA-NC-8Q-009-7A..C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: gehsel: 
Ecu 393,75, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-825-181 Q-8: deal: Ecu 25, HFL 68,26. 

146 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiache tabellen van de bultenlandsa 
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handel - Bureau voor de Statistiek dar Europesa Gemeenschappan 
[Buitenlandee handel (rode omslag) - Commissia van de Europesa 
Gemeenschappen) 
n.J 84-85: Machines, toastellan en mechanischa an elektrischa 
warktuigen - xviii, 1 060p., xix-xlii; 30cm; gebrochaard; 930g; 
(OA/OE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -174. DE:80.07 -180. EN:80.07 -132. FR:80.07 -188. 
IT:80.07- 202 
CA-Nc-Bo-01Q-7A..C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: gehaal: 
Ecu 393,75, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-826-1811-6: deel: Ecu B2,50, HFL 226. 

147 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiache tebellan van de buitenlandsa 
handel- Bureau voor de Statistiek darE~ Gemeanachappan 
[Buitanlandee handel (rode omslag) - Commissia van de Europesa 
Gameenschappan] 
n.K 86-89: Vervoermatariael- xvni, 183p. xix-xlii; 30cm; 
gebrochaard; 680g; (OA/OE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07-175. DE:80.07-161. EN:80.07-133. FR:80.07-189. 
IT:80.07- 203 
CA-Nc-8o-011-7A..C ISBN 92-826-1B15-9: geheel: 
Ecu 393,76, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-B25-1812-4: deel: Ecu 14, 75, HFL 44,60. 

148 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiache tabellan van de buitanlandae 
handel - Bureau voor de Statistiek dar Eui-opesa Gemeenschappen 
[Buitanlandsa handel (rode omslag) - Commissia van de E,.opesa 
Gameenschappen] 
n.L 9o-99: Optischa instrumenten, apparaten an toastellan, 
instrurnantan, apparatan en toestellen voor de fotografia en de 
cinematografie, medtscha en chirurgische instrumenten, ... wapens 
an munitie, diverse produkten- xviii, 423p., xox-xlii; 30cm; 
gebrochaard; 1060g; (OA/OE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07 -176. DE:80.07- 162. EN:80.07- 134. FR:80.07- 180. 
IT:80.07- 204 
CA-NC-80..012-7A..C ISBN 92-825-1B15-9: gehaal: 
Ecu 393,75, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-826-1B13-2: deel: Ecu 47,60, HFL 102,50. 

149 NIMEXE 1979: Analytische tabellen van de buitanlandae 
handel - B .. eau voor de Statistiak dar Europesa Gemeenschappen 
[Buitenlandee handel (rode omslag) - Commissie van de Europesa 
Gemeenschappen) 
n.Z: Lanclan-Produkta n- xxx, 273p.; 30cm; gebrochaard; 800g; 
(OA/OE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07 -177. DE:80.07 -163. EN:80.07 -136. FR:80.07 -191. 
IT:80.07- 205 
CA-NC-80..013-7A..C ISBN 92-825-1816-9: gehsel: 
Ecu 393,76, HFL 1074 
ISBN 92-825-1814-0: deal: Ecu 50, HFL 136,60. 

150 NIMEXE 1979: Analytiache Ubersichten des Au&anhandels 
- Statistischss Amt der Europiiischan Gemeinachaften [Au&anhendel 
(rotar Umachlag) - KommiSSion dar Europiiischen Gemeinschaften) 
n.A 01-24: Lebende Toare und Waren tierischan und pflanzlichen 
Ursprungs, Fette und Ole, Lebensmittel, Gatriinke und Tabak- xvii, 
620p., xix-xlii; 30cm; broschiart; 1670g; (OA/OE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07- 164. EN:80.07- 122. FR:80.07- 178. IT:80.07 -192. 
NL:80.07- 136 
CA-NC-8Q-001-7A-C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: Satz: 
ECU 393,75, OM 984 
ISBN 92-826-1802-7: Band: ECU 50, OM 125. 

161 NIMEXE 1979: Analytlache Ubersichten des Aulenhandela 
- Statistisches Amt der E~ischan Gemeinachaften [Au&anhandel 
(rotar Umschlag) - Kommission dar Europilischan Gemeirischaften) 
n.A-Z- Mikrofiche; (OA/OE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07- 165. EN:80.07- 123. FR:80.07- 179. IT:80.07 -193. 
NL:80.07- 137 
CA-79-8Q-001-7A-A ISBN 92-825-1839-6: Satz: ECU 75, 
OM 187,50; VollstiindigerSatz. 
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152 NIMEXE 1171: Analytl8ohe Ob.niohten dH Au&enhandala 
- StltiatiachH Amt der Europiiachan Gamem.chaften [AuBanhandel 
(roter Umschlegl- Kommieeion dar Europlischan Gemelnschaftan) 
n.B 25-27: Mineralilcha Stoffe- xviii, 121p., xix-xlii; 30cm; 
broachiert; 420g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
DA:80.07- 11111. EN:80.07- 124. FR:80.07- 180. IT:80.07 -194. 
NL:80.07- 131 
CA-NC-B0.002•7A-C ISBN 92-B25·1B15-9: Satz: 
ECU 393,75, DM 9B4 
ISBN 92-B25-1B03-5: Band: ECU 10, DM 25. 

153 NIMEXE 1171: A11111ytlache Ubanlchtan dH Au&anhandala 
- StatistiachH Amt dar Europfiachan Gamem.chaften [AuBanhandel 
w- Umschleg)- Kommielion der Ewopiiachan Gemeinschaften) 
n.C 28-3B: Erzeugni- dar chemischan lnduetrie und verwandter 
lnduetrien-xviii, 611p., xix·xlii; 30cm; broschiert; 1650g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
DA:I0.07 ·187. EN:80.07- 126. FR:80.07 ·181. IT:80.07 • 185. 
NL:I0.07 -139 
CA-NC-6().()()3-7A-C ISBN 92-B25-1B15-9: Satz: 
ECU 393,75, DM 9B4 
ISBN 92-825-1804-3: Band: ECU 50, OM 125. 

154 NIMEXE 1178: Analytlache Ubanlchten dH Au&enhandela 
- StatistiachH Amt dar Europllischan Gameinschafien [AuBanhandel 
w- Umschlagl- Kommisaion der Europliischan Gameinachlften) 
n.D 39-43: Kunatatoffe, Kautachuk, Hilute, Felle, Leder, Pelzfalle 
und Waran ueua, Settler- und Tlschnerw.an, R~el- xviii, 
293p., xix·xiii; 30cm; broschiert; B50g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI 
DA:80.07 ·1118. EN:80.07·128. FR:80.07 ·182. IT:80.07 -198. 
NL:80.07- 140 
CA-NC-80-004-7A-C ISBN 92-B25-1B15-9: Satz: 
ECU 393,75, DM 9B4 
ISBN 92-825-1805-1: Band: ECU 25, OM 62,50. 

155 NIMEXE 1871: Analytllche Ubarllchtan del Au&enhendela 
- Statlatischn Amt dar Eurcplischen Gameinlchaften [AuBanhandel 
(roter Umlchlagl - Komminion der Eurcpilschan Gemeinschaften) 
n.E 44-49: Holz, Kork, Papier, Pappa und Waren deraua, Flecht­
und Karbmacherwaren- xviii, 217p., xix·xiiii; 30cm; broschiert; 
860g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
OA:80.07 -1119. EN:80.07 -127. FR:80.07-183. IT:80.07 -197. 
NL:80.07- 141 
CA-Nt.ao-oos-7A-C ISBN 92-B25-1B15-9: Satz: 
ECU 393,75, DM 9B4 
ISBN 92B2151808X: Band: ECU 25, OM 62,50. 

156 NIMEXE 1171: Analytlache Ubaraichten del Au&enhandall 
- Stltietischal Amt dar Eurcpilischen Gameinlchaftan [Au&enhandel 
(roter Umschlagl- Komminion der Ewopiiachan Gemeinlchaftan) 
n.F 50-B 7: Spinnatofle und Waren darlua, Schuha, 
Kopfbedeckungen, Regen- und Sonnanlchirme ••• - xvii, 738p., 
xix·xlii; 30cm; broschiert; 1960g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07- 170. EN:80.07- 128. FR:80.07 -184. IT:80.07 • 1118. 
NL:80.07- 142 
CA-NC-8().()()8.7A-C ISBN 92-B25-1B15·9: Setz: 
ECU 393,75, DM 9B4 
ISBN 92-825-1807-B: Band: ECU iiO, DM 150. 

157 NIMEXE 1178: A1111lytlache Ubaralchten dH Au&anhandala 
- Stltiltischea Amt der Europiischan Gameinlchaftan [AuBanhandel 
(rater Umschlagl- Kommiaaion der Ewopliischan Gemeinschaften) 
n.G 68-72: Waren - Steinan, Gipa, Zement ••• , Karamik, Gin und 
Glsawaran, Perlen, Edellteine, Schmuck, Miinzen - xviii, 219p., 
xix·xiii; 30cm; broschiert; 670g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
DA:80.07 ·171. EN:80.07-129. FR:80.07 -186. IT:80.07 -199. 
NL:80.07 • 143 
CA-Nt.ao-oo7-7A-C ISBN 92-B26-1B15-9: Setz: 
ECU 393,75, OM 984 
ISBN 92-825-1808-6: Band: ECU 25, DM 62,50. 

15B NIMEXE 1178: Analytlsche Ubaralchtan dee Au&enhandala 
- Stl1istiachel Amt der Eurcplischan Garneinschaften [AuBanhandel 
(rater Umschlegl- Kommieeion der Ewopilischen Gemeinschaften] 
n.H 73: Eisen und Stahl- xviii, 321p.; xix-xtii; 30cm; broschiert; 
B50g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI 

DA:80.07- 172. EN:80.07- 130. FR:80.07- 188. IT:80.07 • 200. 
NL:80.07 • 144 
CA-NC-6().()()8-7A-C ISBN 92-B25·1B15-9: Setz: 
ECU 393,75, DM 984 
ISBN 92-825-1809-4: Band: ECU 30, OM 75. 

159 NIMEXE 1878: Analytiache Uberalchten dH Au&anhllndall 
- StltistiachH Amt der Europliachen Gameinschaften (AuBanhandel 
(roter Umschl8;1· Kommiallion der Ewopliiachen Gameinschaften] 
n.l 74-B3: Unadle Mllelle (-g. Eisen und Stahl) und Wanan der­
- xviii, 264p., xix·xlli; 30om; broschiert; 760g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
DA:80.07 -173. EN:I0.07- 131. FR:80.07- 187. IT:80.07- 201. 
NL:80.07- 145 
CA-NC-80-008-7A-C ISBN 92-B25-1B15-9: Setz: 
ECU 393,76, DM 984 
ISBN 92-825-1B10-B: Band: ECU 26, DM 62,50. 

180 NIMEXE 1979: Analytlscha Obanlchtan dH Au&anhllndall 
- Statiatischel Amt der EurcpliiChan Gameinlchaftan [AuBanhandel 
(roter Umschleg) - Kommielion der Europfiachan Gameinlchaftan) 
n.J B4-86: Maschinan, Apparata und mechanischa Gerllte, 
elektrctachnische Waran - xvili, 1080p., xix-xlii; 30cm; broschiert; 
930g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
DA:I0.07 -174. EN:80.07- 132. FR:80.07 • 188. IT:80.07- 202. 
NL:80.07 • 148 
CA·NC-80-01G-7A-C ISBN 92-825-1B115·9: Satz: 
ECU 393,75, DM 984 
ISBN 92-825-1811-B: Band: ECU B2,50, DM 206. 

161 NIMEXE 1179: A11111ytlacha Ubaralchtan dH Au&enhandall 
• StltiltiachH Amt der Eurcplliachen Gameinlchaftan (AuBanhandel 
w- Umschlag) - Kommielion der Europfiachan Gameinschaften) 
n.K B6-B9: BIRlrclerungemit tel- xviii, 183p. xix-xiU; 30cm; 
broschiert; 560g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07 -171. EN:80.07 -133. FR:80.07 ·188. IT:80.07 -203. 
NL:80.07 • 147 
CA-NC-80-011·7A-C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: Satz: 
ECU 393,75, OM 984 
ISBN 92-825-1812-4: Band: ECU 14,75. 

162 NIMEXE 1971: Analytlscha Obanichtan dH Au&anhandall 
- Statiatischal Amt der Ewopliiachan Gemeinschaftan [AuBanhandel 
(roter Umlchlag)- Kommielion der Ewopliiachen Gameinlchlften) 
n.L 9o-99: Optiacha, photographiache, kineml1ographische und 
medizinischa lna1rllmenta, .•• Waffen und Munition, verschiedene 
Waren- xviii, 423p., xix-xHI; 30cm; broschiert; 1060g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI 
DA:80.07 -178. EN:80.07- 134. FR:I0.07 -190. IT:80.07 ·204. 
NL:I0.07 -148 
CA·NC-80-012-7A-C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: Satz: 
ECU 393,75, DM 984 
ISBN 92-825-1B13-2: Band: ECU 47,50, OM 94. 

163 NIMEXE 1179: A11111ytlacha Obanichten dee Au&anhendall 
- StltiltiachH Amt der Ewopliiachen Gameinschaften [AuBanhandel 
(roter Umschl8;1- Kommielion dar Ewopliischen Gameinlchaftan] 
n.Z: Lllnder-Wanan- xxx, 273p.; 30cm; broschiert; 800g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI 
OA:80.07 -177. EN:80.07 -135. FR:80.07 -191. IT:80.07 -205. 
NL:80.07 • 148 
CA·NC-BD-013-7A-C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: Setz: 
ECU 393,715, DM 984 
ISBN 92-825-1814-0: Bend: ECU 50, OM 125. 

164 NIMEXE 1971: Alllllytiake taballar verdr•rende 
udanrlgahatidal- De ewoplliske F•lesakabera atatiatiske Kontor 
(Udenriglhandel (rlldt omalagl - Kommissionen for De europeiske 
F .. leaakeber) 
n.A 0 1·24: Levende dyr og varer af animalsk eller vegatabilak 
opnndelsa fedltofler og oiler, n.-ingemidler, tike og tab*- xvii, 
620p., xix-xlil; 30cm; I»Wdt bind; 1670g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/lllll 
DE:80.07- 180. EN:80.07- 122. FR:80.07- 178. IT:I0.07- 192. 
NL:80.07 -138 
CA-NC-B().()()1-7A-C ISBN 92-825-1815-9: nts: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3052 
ISBN 92-825-1802·7: bind: ECU 50, DKR 388. 



185 NIMEXE 1978: A11111ytiek1 tebeller verdrerende 
udenrlgahendel - De N"QPIIilke Flllleelklbera atatietilke Kantor 
[Udenrlgahendel (rlldt ornsleg)- Kommillionen for De europtlilka 
F .. leelkeber) 
n.A-Z- microfiche; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
OE:80.07 ·151. EN:80.07 ·123. FR:80.07 ·179. IT:80.07 -193. 
Nl:80.07. 137 
CA-79-80-001-7A-A ISBN 92-826-1839-8: uta: ECU 76, 
DKR 581; Kompt.t ur.. 

186 NIMEXE 1878: Anelytlake tebeller verdr.,.ende 
udenrlgahendel- De N"QPIIilke flllleeekabers atatiltilke Kontor 
[Udenrigahendel (rfdt omeleg) - Kommiuionen for De europtlilke 
F .. lellkaber) 
n.B 26-27: Mi-allke etcffer- xviii, 121p., xix-xlii; 30cm; blfdt 
bind; 420g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
OE:80.07 ·152. EN:80.07 ·124. FR:90.07 -190. IT:90.07 • 194. 
Nl:80.07. 138 
CA-NC-80-002-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1816-9: uta: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3052 
ISBN 92-825-1803-5: bind: ECU 10, DKR 77,50. 

187 NIMEXE 1879: A11111ytieke tebe11er V«dr.,.ende 
udenrlgehendel - De N"QPIIilke F•leeskabers statiltiake Kontor 
[Udenrigahandel (rfdt ornlleg) - Kommilaionen for De N'OPIIilke 
F .. leelklber) 
n.C 28-38: Proc!IA<tar fra den kemiakeinduatri 0f1 harmed 
beel~~gtade induatrier- xviii, 811p., xix-xlii; 30cm; bllldt bind; 
1850g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
OE:80.07 -163. EN:80.07 -125. FR:90.07 -181. IT:80.07 -1&5. 
NL:80.07 -138 
CA-NC-80-003-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: uta: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3052 
ISBN 92-825·1804-3: bind: ECU 50, DKR 388. 

188 NIMEXE 1878: A11111ytlake tabeller verdrerende 
udenrlgahendel- De europtliake F_.lealkabers statistilke Kontor 
[Udenrigahandel (rtdt omlleg) - Kommiuionan for De europ .. ake 
F_.leelkaber) 
n.D 39-43: Kunatatoffer, gummi, huder,lkind, lllder, pelalkind 0f1 
varer fremltlllet heraf, udelmegerarbejder, rejuartikler- xviii, 
293p .. xix-xlii; 30cm; bledt bind; 860g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
OE:80.07 • 164. EN:80.07 ·128. FR:90.07 • 182. IT:80.07- 198. 
NL:80.07 • 140 
CA-NC-80-004-7A-c ISBN 92-826-1815-9: uta: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3052 
ISBN 92-826-1805-1: bind: ECU 25, DKR 194. 

189 NIMEXE 1879: Alllllytlake tebeller verdrerende 
udenriglhanclel- De N"QPIIilke F8lleelkabers ltltistilke Kontor 
[Udenrigahendel (rfdt omaleg) - Kornmissionen for De europtlilke 
F_.leelkaber) 
n.E 44-49: Tr•. kork, papir, pap Ofl v- fremstillet heraf, flette- 0f1 
kurvernegererbejder- xviii, 217p., xix-xliii; 30cm; bledt bind; 880g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
OE:80.07 -165. EN:80.07 ·127. FR:80.07 ·183. IT:80.07 -197. 
NL:80.07 ·141 
CA-NC-8().()()5-7 A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: uta: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3052 
ISBN 928261808X: bind: ECU 26, DKR 194. 

170 NIMEXE 1878: A11111ytisk1 tebeller verdr.,.ende 
udenrlglhandel - De europtlilke F•lealkabera statistilke Kontor 
[Udenrigehendel (redt ornsleg) - Kommillionen for De europtliake 
F•lleelkaber) 
n.F SQ-87: Tlkltiler 0f1 verer frernstiliet heraf, ako, 
hovedbekl8dning, pereplyer 0f1 paraaoller ... - xvii, 738p., xix-xlil; 
30cm; bledt bind; 1980g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 
DE:80.07 ·158. EN:80.07 ·128. F11:80.07 ·184. IT:80.07 • 198. 
NL:90.07 • 142 
CA-NC-80-006-7 A-c ISBN 92-826-1815-9: sata: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3062 
ISBN 92-825-1807-8: bond: ECU 80. DKR 465. 

171 NIMEXE 1978: A1111lytlake tebeller verdrerende 
udenriglhendel - De europtliake F•leelkabers atatistlake Kontor 
(Udenrigehandel (redt ornaleg) - Kornmiuionan for De europlliake 
F•lealkaber I 
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n.G 88-72: Varer af stan glps, cernant ... , karamlk; glls 0f1 gluvarar, 
perler,8delst-. smykker, m1111tar- xviil, 219p .. xix-xlii; 30cm; 
blfdt bind; 870g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DE:80.07 -1117. EN:80.07 ·129. FR:80.07 ·188. IT:80.07 -11111. 
NL:80.07 • 143 
CA-NC-8().()()7-7A-c ISBN 92-826-1816-9: uta: 
ECU 393,76, DKR 3062 
ISBN 92-825-1808-8: bind: ECU 25, DKR 194. 

17 2 NIMEXE 1878: Anelytlake tebelllr vardrerendl 
udenrlgahendel- De europtliake Flll1ealkabers ltltiatieka Kontor 
[Udenrlgshendel (rlldt ornaleg) - Kommiuionan for De europtliake 
F_.lealkaber) 
n.H 73: Jern Ofl etil- xviii, 321p.; xix-xlii; 30cm; bledt bind; 860g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI 
DE:80.07- 158. EN:80.07- 130. FR:80.07 • 188. IT:80.07- 200. 
NL:80.07- 144 
CA-NC-8().()()8-7A-c ISBN 92-826-1816-9: uta: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3062 
ISBN 92-826-1809-4: bind: ECU 30, DKR 232,50. 

173 NIMEXE 1878: A11111ytieke tebeller V«drerende 
udenrlgehandel - De N"oplliake Flllleeakebere statistiake Komar 
[Udenrigehendel (rlldt omsleg) - Kommillionln for De europtlilke 
F .. leelklber) 
n.l 74-83: Ulldle meteller (oklkl. jern 0f1 still 0f1 varar frernstillet 
heraf - xviii, 284p., xix-xlii; 30cm; bledt bind; 78()g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DE:90.07 -1118. EN:80.07 ·131. FR:80.07 -187. IT:80.07-201. 
Nl:90.07 ·148 
CA-NC-80-009-7A-c ISBN 92-826-1816-9: uta: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3062 
ISBN 92-826-1810-8: bind: ECU 26, DKR 194. 

174 NIMEXE 1879: AlllllytlaketebellerV«drerende 
udenrlgehlndel- De europllilke F•leaeklbera atatiltiake Kontor 
[Udenrigahendel (rlldt ornaleg) - Kommiuionen for De europllilke 
F.neelkeber) 
n.J 84-86: Malki-. epperatar 0f1 mlkaniake racllklber, 
ellktrotaknlake verer - xvili, 1 080p .. xix-xlii; 30cm; bledt bind; 
930g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DE:80.07 • 180. EN:80.07- 132. FR:80.07 ·188. IT:80.07 • 202. 
NL:80.07 • 148 
CA-NC-8Q-01Q-7A-c ISBN 92-826-1816-9: uta: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3062 
ISBN 92-825-1811-8: bind: ECU B2.60, DKR 840. 

176 NIMEXE 1979: Anelytiskl tebeller verdrerendl 
udenrlgehendel- De europtlilkl Flllleeakllbera atatiltiake Kontor 
[Udenrlgehandel (rlldt omllag) - Kornmilaionen for De europtliake 
F .. leesklber) 
n.K 86-89: Trenaportrnidler- xviii, 183p. xix-xlti; 30cm; bledt bind; 
580g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI 
DE:80.07 • 1111. EN:80.07 ·133. FR:80.07 -189. IT:80.07- 203. 
NL:80.07 • 147 
CA-NC-8Q-011-7A-c ISBN 92-826-1816-9: uta: 
ECU 393,76, DKR 3062 
ISBN 92-826-1812-4: bind: ECU 14,75, DKR 128. 

178 NIMEXE 1878: Anelytilke tebelllr V«dr.,.endl 
udenrlgahendel- De europllilke Flll1ealkabers ltStiatiska Kontor 
[Udenriglhandel (rlldt omlleg) - Kommillionan for De europllilke 
F .. lealklber) 
n.L 9Q-99: Optilkl, foto9-lfiake, kinernat<~Waflake 0f1 mediclnlke 
instrumentar. apper- 0f1 redlklber, .... veben 0f1 ammunition, 
di-H varer- xviii, 423p., xix-xlii; 30cm; bledt bind; 1080g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DE:90.07 • 182. EN:80.07 • 134. FR:80.07 ·190. IT:80.07- 204. 
NL:80.07 • 148 
CA-NC-8Q-012-7A-c ISBN 92-826-1815-9: uta: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3052 
ISBN 92-826-1813-2: bind: ECU 47,60, DKR 291. 

177 NIMEXE 1878: A11111ytiske tebllllr verdrerende 
udenrlgehendll - Ds europtliake F•leeskabera atatiltiake Kontor 
[Udenrigshendel (rlldt omaleg) - Kommissionen for De europtlilke 
F811eelkabsr I 
n.Z: Lende-Verer • xxx, 273p.; 30cm; bledt bind; 800g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI 



28 

DE:80.07 -163. EN:80.07 -136. FR:80.07 -191. IT:80.07- 206 
Nl:80.07- 149 
CA-NC-80-013-7A-t ISBN 92-825-1815-9: sats: 
ECU 393,75, DKR 3052 
ISBN 92-825-1814-0: bind: ECU 50, DKR 388. 

178 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytiquea du commerce 
extirleur - Office statistique des Communautis europiiennas 
[Commerce axtiirieur (couvertura rouge)- Commission des 
Communautis europiiennas) 
n.A 01-24: Animaux vivants et produits des rignas animal ou 
v8g8tal, waissas et huiles, aUments, boissons et tabacs - xvii, 
620p., xix-xlii; 30cm; brochii; 1670g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07 -164. DE:80.07 -160. EN:80.07 -122. IT:80.07- 192. 
Nl:80.07- 136 
CA-NC-80-001-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 15750, FF 2266 
ISBN 9:Z..825-1802-7: volume: Ecu 50, BFR 2000, FF 288. 

179 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytiques du commerce 
extiriaur - Office statistique das Communautis europiiennes 
[Commerce extiineur (couverture rouge) -Commission des 
Communautis europiiennas) 
n.A-Z - microfiche; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -165. DE:80.07 -151. EN:80.07 -123. IT:80.07 -193. 
Nl:80.07- 137 
CA-79-80-001-7A-A ISBN 92-825-1839-6: ensemble: Ecu 75, 
BFR 3000, FF 432; Par jeu complet 

180 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytlques du commerce 
extirieur - Office statistique das Communautis europisnnes 
[Commerce extiirieur (couverture rouge) -Commission des 
Communautis europiiennss] 
n.B 25-27: Produits miniiraux- xviii, 121p., xix-xlii; 30cm; broche; 
420g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -166. DE:80.07 -162. EN:80.07 -124. IT:80.07 -194. 
Nl:80.07- 138 
CA-NC-80-002-7A-t ISBN 92-825-1815-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 15750, FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1803-5: volurns: Ecu 10, BFR 400, FF 57,50. 

181 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytiques du commerce 
extirleur - Office statistique des Communautis europeennss 
[Commerce exterieur (couvarture rouge) -Commission des 
Communautiis europisnnas] 
n.C 28-38: Produits das industrias chimiquas et das industries 
connexas- xviii, 611 p., xix-xlii; 30cm; broche; 1650g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -167. DE:80.07 -153. EN:80.07 -125. IT:80.07 -195. 
Nl:80.07 -139 
CA-NC-80-003-7 A-t ISBN 92-825-1815-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 15750, FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1804-3: volume: Ecu 50, BFR 2000, FF 288. 

182 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytiques du commerce 
extirieur - Office statistique des Communautis europiiennes 
[Commerce extiirieur (couvarture rouge)- CommosSKln des 
Communautis europiiennss] 
n.D 39-43: Mati8res plastiques artificielles, caoutchouc, peaux, 
cuirs, pelleteries et ouvreges en cas matieres, maroquinerie, articles 
de sellerie et de voyage- xviii, 293p., xix-xloo; 30cm; brochii; 850g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -168. DE:80.07 -154. EN:80.07 -126. IT:80.07- 196. 
Nl:80.07- 140 
CA-NC-80-004-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 15750, FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1805-1: volume: Ecu 25, BFR 1000, FF 144. 

183 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytiques du commerce 
exterleur - Office statistique das Communautis europeennes 
[Commerce extiirieur (couvarture rouge)- Commission des 
Communautes europisnnes] 
n.E 44-49: Bois, li8ge, papier, cartons et ouvrages en cas matiiores, 
ouvrages de sperterie at de vannerie- xviii, 217p., xix-xliii; 30cm; 
brochii; 660g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 

DA:80.07 -169. DE:80.07 -155. EN:80.07 -127. IT:80.07 -197. 
Nl:80.07 -141 
CA-NC-80-005-7A-t ISBN 92-825-1815-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 15750, FF 2266 
ISBN 928251B06X: volume: Ecu 25, BFR 1000, FF 144. 

184 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytiquea du commerce 
exterleur - Office statistique das Communautis europisnnss 
[Commerce exteroeur (couvarture rouge)- Commission das 
Communautes europisnnes] 
n.F 50-67: Mati8res textiles et ouvrages an cas mati8res, 
chaussuras, coiffures, parapluias at parasols ... - xvii, 736p., xix-xlii; 
30cm; brochii; 1960g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -170. DE:80.07 -156. EN:80.07 -128. IT:80.07 -198. 
Nl:80.07- 142 
CA-NC-80-006-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 15750, FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1807-8: volume: Ecu 60, BFR 2400, FF 345. 

185 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytiquea du commerce 
exterieur - Office statistique das Communeutis europisnnas 
[Commerce extiorieur (couverture rouge) -Commission des 
Communeutis europiiennas) 
n.G 68-72: Ouvrages en pierres, plitre, ciment, ... , produits 
ciiramiquas, varre et ouvrages en varre, paries finas et pierres 
gammas, bijoux, monnaies- xviii, 219p., xix-xlii; 30cm; broche; 
670g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07 -171. DE:80.07 -157. EN:80.07 -129. IT:80.07 -199. 
NL:80.07~ 143 

CA-NC-80-007-7A-t ISBN 92-825-1815-9: enaernbla: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 15750, FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1808-8: volume: Ecu 25, BFR 1000, FF 144. 

186 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytlquea du commerce 
extirieur - Office statistique des Communautis europisnnss 
[Commerce axtiorieur (couverture rouge) -Commission des 
Communauiis europisnnss] 
n.H 73: Fonte, fer et acier- xviii, 321p.; xix-xlii; 30cm; brochii; 
850g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07- 172. DE:80.07 -168. EN:80.07- 130. IT:80.07- 200. 
Nl:80.07- 144 

CA-NC-80-008-7A-t ISBN 92-825-1815-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 15750. FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1809-4: volume: Ecu 30, BFR 1200, FF 173. 

187 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytiquea du commerce 
extirleur - Office statistique des Communautis europiiennes 
[Comme;.:e extiorleur (couverture rouge) -Commission des 
Communeutis europiiennes) 
n.l 74-83: Mittaux communs (sauf fonte, fer et acier) et ouvrages en 
cas matiiores- xviii, 264p., xix-xlii; 30cm; broche; 780g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /Nll 
DA.80.07-173. DE:80.07-159. EN:80.07-131. IT:80.07-201. 
NL:80.07- 145 
CA-NC-80-009-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 15750, FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1810-8: volume: Ecu 25, BFR 1000, FF 144. 

188 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytlquea du commerce 
extirleur - Office statistique das Communautis europisnnes 
[Commerce extirieur (couvartura rouge) -Commission des 
Communautis europisnnes] 
n.J 84-85: Machines, appareils et engins mitchaniques et 
81ectriquas- xviii, 1060p., xix-xlii; 30cm; brochii; 930g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -174. DE:80.07 -160. EN:80.07 -132. IT:80.07- 202. 
Nl:80.07- 146 
CA-NC-80-010-7A-c ISBN 92-825-1815-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 15750, FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1811-6: volurns: Ecu 82,50, BFR 3300, FF 475. 

189 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux enalytlquea du commerce 
extirleur - Office statistique des Communautis europiiennes 
[Commerce extilrieur (couvarture rouge) -CommiSSIOn des 
Communautis europisnnes] 
n.K 86-89: Materiel de transport- xviii, 183p. xix-xlii; 30cm; 
brochit; 580g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 



DA:80.07 -176. DE:80.07 -181. EN:80.07 -133. IT:80.07 -203. 
NL:80.07- 147 
CA-NC-80-011-7A-C ISBN 92-825-1816-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, 8FR 15760, FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1812-4: volume: Ecu 14,75, 8FR 660, FF 93,50. 

190 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux enalytiques du commerce 
extltrieur - Office stetistique des Communautes etM"opeannes 
[Commerce exterietM" (couverture rouge) -Commission des 
Communaut&s europeannes) 
n.L 90-99: Instruments at appareils d'optique, de photographie, de 
cinltmatographie, appareils mltdico-chirurgicaux, ... armes at 
munitions, produits divers- xviii, 423p., xix-xtii; 30cm; broche; 
10B0g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07 -176. D£:80.07- 182. EN:80.07- 134. IT:80.07- 204. 
NL:80.07- 146 
CA-NC-80-012-7A-C ISBN 92-826-1B15-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,75, BFR 16760, FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1B13-2: volume: Ecu 47,50, BFR 1500, FF 216. 

191 NIMEXE 1979: Tableaux analytlquea du commerce 
extltrieur - Office statistique des Communautes 81M"opSennes 
[Commerce exterieur (couverture rouge)- Commission des 
Communautes europeannes) 
n.Z: Pays-Produits- xxx, 273p.; 30cm; broche; BOOg; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -177. DE:80.07 -163. EN:80.07 -136. IT:80.07- 206. 
NL:80.07- 149 
CA-NC-B0-013-7A-C ISBN 92-B26-1B15-9: ensemble: 
Ecu 393,76, BFR 15750, FF 2266 
ISBN 92-825-1B14-0: volume: Ecu 50, BFR 2000, FF 2BB. 

192 NIMEXE 1979: Tavole analitlche del commercio estero-
lstituto statistico delle Comunita europee [Commercia estero 
(copertina rossa) -Commissions delle Comunitl europae) 
n.A 01-24: Animali vivi a prodotti del regno animale o vegetale; 
grassi e oli; alimenti, bevande e tabacchi- xvii, 620p., xix-xlii; 
30cm; brossura; 1670g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -164. DE:80.07 -160. EN:80.07 -122. FR:80.07 -178. 
NL:80.07 -136 
CA-NC-B0-001-7A-C ISBN 92-B25-1B15-9: bozza: 
ECU 393,76, LIT 453900 
ISBN 92-825-1B02-7: volume: ECU 50, LIT 67600. 

193 NIMEXE 1979: Tavole analhiche del commerclo estero-
lstituto statistico delle Comunita europae [Commercia estero 
(copertina rossa) -Commissions delle Comunita europee) 
n.A-Z - microschede; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -165. DE:80.07 -151. EN:80.07 -123. FR:80.07 -179. 
NL:80.07- 137 
CA-79-B0-001-7A-A ISBN 92-B25-1B39-6: bozza: ECU 75, 
LIT B6500; La serie comp/eta. 

194 NIMEXE 1979: Tavole analitiche del commercia estero-
lstituto statistico delle Comunitl etM"opae [Commercia estero 
(copertina rossa) -Commissions delle Comunita europee) 
n.B 25-27: Prodotti minerali- xviii, 121p., xix-xtii; 30cm; brossura; 
420g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07- 166. DE:80.07- 152. EN:80.07- 124. FR:80.07- 180. 
NL:80.07- 138 
CA-NC-B0-002-7 A-C ISBN 92-B25-1B15-9: bozza: 
ECU 393,75, LIT 453900 
ISBN 92-B25-1B03-5: volume: ECU 10, LIT 11500. 

195 NIMEXE 1979: Tavole analitiche del commercia estero-
lstitu1o statistico delle Comunita eiM"opee [Commercia estero 
(copertina rossa) -Commissions delle Comunit8 europae) 
n.C 2B-3B: Prodoni delle industria chimiche a delle industria 
connesse-xviii, 611p .. xix-xlii; 30cm; brossura; 1650g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -167. DE:80.07 -153. EN:80.07 -125. FR:80.07 -181. 
NL:80.07- 139 
CA-NC-B0-003-7 A-C ISBN 92-825-1B15-9: bozza: 
ECU 393,75, LIT 453900 
ISBN 92-B25-1B04-3: volume: ECU 50, LIT 57600. 

196 NIMEXE 1979: Tavole analitlche del commerclo estero-
lstituto statlstico delle Comunita europae [Commercia estero 
(copertina rossa)- Commissions delle Comunita europee) 
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n.D 39-43: Materia plastiche artificiali, gomma, petli, cuoio, peHi da 
pellicceria a lavori di tali materia, marocchineria, articoli da sellaio e 
da viaggio- xviii, 293p., xix-xtii; 30cm; brossura; B60g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07- 168. DE:80.07 -164. EN:80.07- 126. FR:80.07 -182. 
NL:80.07 -140 

CA-NC-B0-004-7A-C ISBN 92-826-1B15-9: bozza: 
ECU 393,75, LIT 453900 
ISBN 92-B25-1B05-1:volume:ECU 25,LIT 2BBOO. 

197 NIMEXE 1979: Tavole analitlche del commerclo estero-
lstituto stetistico delle Comunita europae [Commercia estero 
(copertina rossa) -Commissions delle Comunitl 81M"op&e) 
n.E 44-49: Legno, sughero, certa, cartoni elavori in tali msterie 
lsvori da intreccio, da panieraio a da stuoiaia - xviii, 217p., xix-xliii; 
30cm; brossura; 660g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07-169. DE:80.07-156. EN:80.07-127. FR:80.07-193. 
NL:80.07 -141 

CA-NC-90-005-7A-C ISBN 92-825-1B15-9: bozza: 
ECU 393,76, LIT 453900 
ISBN 92B251806X: volume: ECU 25, LIT 28800. 

19B NIMEXE 1979: Tavole analitlche del commercia estero-
lstituto statistico delle Comunit8 81M"opae [Commercia estero 
(copertina rossa) - Commissione delle Comunitl europae) 
n.F 50-67: Materia tassili a loro manufant, calzature, cappelli, 
copricapi ad altre acconciature; ombrelli Ida pioggia ada sole) ... -
xvii, 736p .. xix-xlii; 30cm; brossura; 1960g; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -170. DE:80.07 -166. EN:80.07 -128. FR:80.07 -184. 
NL:80.07- 142 
CA-NC-80-006-7A-C ISBN 92-826-1B15-9: bozza: 
ECU 393,75, LIT 453900 
ISBN 92-B26-1B07-8: volume: ECU 60, LIT 69200. 

199 NIMEXE 1979: Tavole analltlche del commercia estero-
lstituto statistico delle Comunita etM"opee (Commercia estero 
(copertina rossa) -Commissions delle Comunita europae) 
n.G 68-72: Lavori di pietra, gesso, cemento .... , prodotti della 
ceramica, vetro a suoi lsvori, perle fini a pietre prezlose (gemma), 
gioielli, monete-xviii, 219p., xix-xlii; 30cm; brossiM"a; 670g; 
IDA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) 
DA:80.07 -171. DE:80.07 -167. EN:80.07 -129. FR:80.07 -186. 
NL:80.07- 143 
CA-NC-80-007-7A-C ISBN 92-825-1B15-9: bozza: 
ECU 393,75, LIT 453900 
ISBN 92-825-1B08-6: volume: ECU 25, LIT 2BBOO. 

200 NIMEXE 1979: Tavole analitiche del commerclo estero-
lstituto ststistico delle Comunitl etM"opae [Commercia estero 
(copertina rossa) - Commissione delle Comunita etM"opae) 
n.H 73: Ghisa, ferro e acciaia- xviii, 321 p.; xix-xtii; 30cm; brossura; 
B50g; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL) 
DA:80.07- 172. DE:80.07 -158. EN:80.07- 130. FR:80.07 -186. 
NL:80.07- 144 
CA-NC-BO-OOB-7 A-C ISBN 92-825-1B15-9: bozza: 
ECU 393,75, LIT 453900 
ISBN 92-B25-1B09-4: volume: ECU 30, LIT 34600. 
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gratuito. 

P 19 Bollettino della acquieizioni della Bibliotece delle Comuniti 
europee - Direzione ganerale Personale e amministrazione; 
Commissions delle Comunit8 europee- 30cm; 
(DA/DE/E N/FR/IT /NLI - mensile. 
DA:80.07- P16. DE:80.07- P292. EN:80.07- P218. FR:80.07 -P33. 
NL:80.07-P215 
ISSN 0378-3464: abbonamento: ECU 30, LIT 33500. 

P20 Bollattino delle Comuniti europee- Commissions delle 
Comunita europee- 25cm; indica 1m- undici numeri per anno. 
DA:80.07- P36. DE:80.07- P32. EN:80.07 -P37. ES:80.07- P17. 
FR:80.07-P34. NL:80.07-P38 
ISSN 0378-3685: abbonamento: ECU 27.50, LIT 30700; 
Vandita a/ numero. 

P21 Bollettlno di documentazlone A - Oirezione ganerale Personale 
e arnministraziona; Cornmissione delle Comunita europee - 30cm; 
(OA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI- irregolare. 
DA:80.07 -P69. DE:80.07- PBO. EN:80.07 -P52. FR:80.07- P29. 
NL:80.07-P57 
ISSN 0378-441 X: abbonarnento: ECU 27 ,50, LIT 30700; 
L 'abbonamento compnsnde anciHJ g/i edizioni 8 e C. 

P22 Bollettino di documentazione C - Direzione ganerale Personale 
e amministrazione; Commissione delle Comunit8 europee - 30cm; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI - irregolare. 
DA:80.07-P62. DE:80.07-P61. EN:80.07-P64. FR:80.07-P31. 
NL:80.07- P&B 
ISSN 0379-2250: abbonarnento: ECU 27 ,50, LIT 30700; 
L 'abbonamento compnsnde anc/re gli edizioni A e 8. 

P23 Bollettlno menelle del commercio estero - latituto atatistico 
delle Comunit8 europee; Commissione delle Comunit8 europee -
30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI- mensile. 
DA:80.07-P218. DE:80.07-P227. EN:80.07-P228. 
FR:80.07-P36. NL:80.07-P217 
ISSN 0378-3723: abbonamento: ECU 45, LIT 50300. 
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P24 Bulletin - Wirtschafts-und Sozialausschu&- Bruxelles-Brussel -
21 em; (DEl - monatlich. 
DA:80.07- P25. EN:80.07- P26. FR:80.07- P27 IT:80.07- P18 
NL:80.07- P28 

kostenlos. 

P25 Bulletin - Det 11Jkonomiske og Sociale Udvalg- Bruxelles-Brussel 
- 21 em: (DAl - manedhg. 
DE:80.07- P24 EN:80.07- P26 FR:BO 07 -P27. IT:80.07 -P18. 
NL:80.07- P28 

gratis. 

P26 Bulletin - Economic and Soc1al Committee - Bruxelles-Brussel -
21 em; lEN)- monthly. 
DA:BO 07-P25. DE:80.07-P24. FR 80.07-P27. IT:80.07-P18. 
NL:80.07- P28 

free of charge. 

P2 7 Bulletin - Comite econom1que et social - Bruxelles-Brussel - 21 
em; (FR)- mensual. 
DA:80.07 -P25 DE:80.07- P24 EN:80.07 -P26. IT:80.07 -P18 
NL:BO 07- P28 

gratu1t. 

P28 Bulletin- Economisch en Soc1aal Com1te - Bruxelles-Brussel - 21 
em; (NL) - maandelijks. 
DA:80.07 -P25. DE:80.07- P24. EN:80.07- P26. FR:80.07- P27. 
IT:80.07- P18 

gratis. 

P29 Bulletin de ranseignamant documanteire A- Direction 
g8nerale Personnel et administration; Comm1ssion des 
Communautes europi>ennes- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/iT /Nll -
irregulier. 
DA:80.07-P59. DE:80.07-PBO. EN:80.07-P52. IT:80.07-P21. 
NL:80.07- P57 

ISSN 0378-441X: abonnement: Ecu 27,50, 8FR 1100, FF 160; 
L 'abontHJment comprend egalement /es editions Bet C. 

P30 Bulletin de ranaaignamant documantaira B - D~rection 

g8n8rale Personnel et administration; Commissoon des 
Communautes europi>ennes- 30cm; (FR) - irregulier. 
EN:80.07- P53 

ISSN 0378-4428: abonnernent: Ecu 27,50, BFR 1100, FF 160; 
L 'abontHJment comprend ega/ernent /es editions A etC 

P31 Bulletin de renseignamant documantaira C - Direction 
gilnerale Personnel et administration; Commission des 
Communautes europeennes- 30cm: (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL)­
irreguher. 
DA:80.07-P62. DE:80.07-P61. EN:80.07-P54. IT:80.07-P22. 
NL:80.07- P58 

ISSN 0379-2250: abonnernent: Ecu 27,50, BFR 1100, FF 160; 
L 'abontHJment comprend egalement /es editrons A et B. 

P32 Bulletin dar Europiischan Gemeinschaften - Kommission der 
Europiischen Gemeinschaften- 25cm; Register (DEl - elfrnal 
jlihrlich. 
DA:80.07- P35. EN:80.07- P37. ES:80.07 -P17. FR:80.07- P34. 
IT:80.07- P20. NL:80.07- P38 

ISSN 0378-3707: Abonnement: ECU 27 .50, OM 69; Verlcauf 
von Einzelnummern. 

P33 Bulletin des acquisitions de Ia Bibliothequa da Ia CCE -
Direction g8nerale Personnel et administration; Commission des 
Communautes europi>ennes- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) -
mensual. 
DA:80.07- P16. DE:80.07- P292. EN:80.07- P216. IT:80.07- P19. 
NL:80.07-P215 

ISSN 0378-3464: abonnement: Ecu 30, BFR 1200, FF 175. 

P34 Bulletin des Communautes europ&ennes- Commission des 
Communautes europ8ennes - 25cm; index (FR) - onze numeros par 
an. 
DA:80.07-P35. DE:80.07-P32. EN:80.07-P37. ES:80.07-P17. 
IT:80.07- P20. NL:80.07- P38 

ISSN 0377-9181: abonnement: Ecu 27,60, BFR 1100, FF 160; 
vente de num6ros iso/8s. 

P35 Bulletin for De europaske fellesakaber- Kommissionen for 
De europtliske Fellesskaber- 25cm; indeks (DA) - elleve gange om 
iret. 
DE:80.07-P32. EN:80.07-P37. ES:80.07-P17. FR:80.07-P34 
IT:80.07- P20. NL:80.07- P38 

ISSN 0378-3716: abonnement: ECU 27.50, DKR 198; Solgpr. 
nummer. 

P36 Bulletin mensual du commerce exterieur - Office statistiqua 
des Communautes europi>ennes; Commission des Communautes 
europeennes- 30cm; (OA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL)- mensual. 
DA:80.07-P218. OE:80.07-P227. EN:80.07-P228. 
IT:80.07- P23. Nl.:80.07- P2 17 

ISSN 0378-3723: abonnernent: Ecu 45, BFR 1800, FF 262. 

P37 Bulletin of the European Communities- Commission of the 
European Communities- 26cm; index (EN)- eleven times a year. 
DA:80.07- P35. DE:80.07- P32. ES:80.07- P17. FR:80.07- P34. 
IT:80.07- P20. NL:80.07- P38 
ISSN 0378-3693: subscription: ECU 27,60, IRL 18.25, 
UKL 16.70, USD 37.60; Smg/enurnbsrsonsale. 

P38 Bulletin van de Europese Gemeenschllppen- Commissie van 
de Europese Gemeenschappen- 25cm; register (Nll -elf maal per 
J8&r. 
DA:80.07-P35. DE:BO 07-P32. EN:80.07-P37. ES:80.07-P17. 
FR:80.07- P34. IT:80.07- P20 
ISSN 0378-3685: abonnement: Ecu 27 .50, HFL 75,50; Verlcoop 
pernummer. 

P39 Charbon: bulletin mensual- Office statistiqua des 
Communeutes europ8ennes: Commission des Communautes 
europi>ennes- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR) -mensual. 
DE:80.07-P206. EN:80.07-P40 

ISSN 0378-367X: abonnernent: Ecu 7,5, BFR 300, FF 43,50. 

P40 Coal: monthly bulletin - Statistical Office of the European 
Communities; Commission of the European Communities- 30cm; 
(DE/EN/FR)- monthly. 
DE:80.07- P206. FR:80.07- P39 

ISSN 0378-357X: subscription: ECU 7,6, IRL 6.00, UKL 4.65, 
USD 10.25. 

P41 Committee Reports of the European Parliament- European 
Parliament- 30cm; (EN)- irregular. 
DA:80.07 -P222. FR:80.07- P56. IT:80.07- P55 
subscription: ECU 28,75, IRL 19.10, UKL 17.50, USD 39.60; 
Subscription from March 1980 to Fabruary 1981. 

P42 Communaute europeenne: Lettra d'information du Bureau 
de Geneva - Commission des Communaut8s europ8ennes - Genive 
- 30 em; (FR) - habdomadeire. 
gratuit. 

P43 Communautlt Europeanne Informations- Commission des 
Communeutes europ8ennes- Paris- 31cm; (FR)- mensual. 
ISSN 0223-3053: abonnament: FF 70; Reduction de prix pour 
abontHJrnents groupes. 

P44 Comunidad europaa - Direcci6n General de InformaciOn; 
Comisi6n de las Communidedes europees - Bruxelles-Brussel - 30 
em; (ES)- .. 

P45 Comunidades Europeies: lnformac;io- Comissio des 
Comunidades europeies- Lisboa- 30cm; (PT) - •. 

P46 Comunita europea - Commissions della Comunita europee -
Roms- 30 em; Un - mensile. 
gratuito. 

P4 7 La courrier: Afrique-Caraibes -Pacifique- Communautlt 
auropltenne- Durieux, J.; Commission des Communeutes 
europi>ennes- Bruxalles- 8russal- 30 em; (FRI- bimestrial. 
grstuit. 

P48 Crop production - Statistical Office of the European 
Communities; Commission of the European Communities- 30cm; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) - quarterly. 



DA:80.07 • P287. DE:80.07 • P236. FR:80.07 • P260. 
IT:80.07-P251. NL:80.07-P238 
ISSN 0378-3688: subscription: ECU 22,50, IRL 14.96, 
UKL 13. 70, USD 30.80. 

•49 Debate• of the European Parliament· European Parliament· 
30cm; index (EN) ·irregular. 
DA:80.07-P170. FR:80.07-P60. IT:80.07-P61. NL:80.07·P185 
ISSN 0378-6041: subscription: ECU 36, IRL 23.25, UKL 21.26, 
USD 48; SubscriptiOn from March 1980 to February 1981. 

~60 Debita du Parlamant european· Parlflment europ8an • 30cm; 
index (FR) • irregulier. 
DA:80.07-P170. EN:80.07-P49. IT:80.07·P51. NL:80.07·P185 
ISSN 0378-5017:abonnement:Ecu 35,BFR 1400,FF 204; 
Abonnement de mars 7 980 a fivrier 7 98 7. 

P6 1 Dl•cu11ioni del Parlamanto auropao - Parlamento europao -
30cm; indica (IT) - irragolare. 
DA:80.07 -P170. EN:80.07 • P49. FR:80.07 • P50. NL:80.07 • P185 
ISSN 0378-5114: abbonamento: ECU 35, LIT 39100; 
Abbonemento da marzo 7 980 a febbraio 7 98 7. 

P62 Documentation bulletin A- Directorate-General Par10nnel and 
Administration; Commission of the European Communities - 30cm; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL)- irregular. 
DA:80.07-P59. DE:80.07-P80. FR:80.07-P29. IT:80.07-P21. 
NL:80.07 -P57 
ISSN 0378-441X: subscription: ECU 27,50,1RL 18.25, 
UKL 16. 70, USD 37 .60; The subscription cowre also -ies Band 
c. 

P6l~ Documentation bulletin 8 -Directorate-General Personnel and 
Administration; Commission of the European Communities - 30cm; 
(EN)- irregular. 

P54 

P56 

P57 

~58 

•69 

FR:80.07 • P30 
ISSN 0378-4428: subscription: ECU 27,50,1RL 18.25, 
UKL 16.70, USD 37.60; Thesubscriptioncowreeltlo--Aand 
c. 

Documentation bulletin C - Directorate-General Personnel and 
Administration; Commission of the European Communities - 30cm; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL)- irregular. 
DA:80.07-P82. DE:80.07·P81. FR:80.07-P31. IT:80.07-P22. 
NL:80.07 • P68 
ISSN 0378-2250: subscription: ECU 27,50, IRL 18.25, 
UKL 16. 70, USD 37 .60; The subscription cowrs also -ies A and 
B. 

Documanti di saduta del Parlamanto -opao- P.-lamento 
auropao - 30cm; un -irregolare. 
DA:80.07- P222. EN:80.07- P41. FR:80.07 • P56 
abbonamento: ECU 28, 75, LIT 32200; Abbonamento da marzo 
7 980 8 febbraio 1981. 

Document• de 18ance du Parlamant european- Parlement 
europ&en- 30cm; (FR)- irregulier. ' 
DA:80.07-P222. EN:80.07-P41. IT:80.07-P66 
abonnement: Ecu 28,75, 8FR 1160, FF 167,50; Abonnamentde 
rnsrs 1980afivrier 1981. 

Dokumantatlabullatin A - Directoraat-generaal 
Peraonaelszaken en algemean bah-; Cornmissie van de Europesa 
Gemaanschappan- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL)- onragalmatig. 
DA:80.07 -P&II. DE:80.07- PBO. EN:80.07- P52. FR:80.07 • P29. 
IT:80.07 • P21 
ISSN 0378-441 X: abonnement: Ecu 27 ,50, HFL 76,60; H.t 
sbonnement omvst oolc de uitgaven B en C. 

DokumantatiabuHatin C • Dlrectoraat-generaal 
Personealazaken en algemean bahear; Commisaia van de Europeaa 
Gemeanschappan- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) • onregelmatig. 
DA:80.07-P62. DE:80.07-P81. EN:80.07·P54. Fft:80.07-P31. 
IT:80.07 • P22 
ISSN 0379-2250: abonnemant: Ecu 27,60, HFL 75,50; H.t 
abonnement omvst oolc de uitgaven A en B. 

Dokumantatlon•bullatin A - Generaldirektoret Per~onale og 
ldministration; Kommissionen for Da auropllillke Flllleallkaber -
30cm; (OA/DE/EN/FR/IT /Nll- uregelmasig. 

DE:80.07-P80. EN:80.07·P52. FR:80.07-P29. IT:80.07·P21. 
NL:80.07 • P67 
ISSN 0378-441X: abonnament: ECU 27,50, DKR 198; 
Abonnementet inlcluderer ogsA Bog C~ven. 

P60 Dokumantationabullatln A - Generaldiraktion Personal und 
Verwaltung; Kommi11ion der Europilischan Gemainschaften -
30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL)- unregelmiiBig. 
DA:80.07·P69. EN:80.07-P52. FR:80.07-P29. IT:80.07·1'21. 
NL:80.07 • P57 
ISSN 0378-441X: Abonnement: ECU 27,50, OM 69; Das 
Abonnement umfll&t euch die Auagsben B und C. 

P61 Dokumantatlonabullatln C- Generaldiraktion Personal und 
Verwahung; Kommission der Europilischan Gemeinschaften -
30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) • unregelmilig. 
DA:80.07-P82. EN:80.07·P54. FR:80.07-P31. IT:80.07·P22. 
NL:80.07 • P58 
ISSN 0379-2250: Abonnement: ECU 27,50, OM 69; Ou 
Abonnement umfll&t such die Auagsben A und B. 

P62 Dokumantatlonebullatln C • Generaldirllktorat Peraonale og 
administration; Kommissionen for De auroplllllke F•leallkaber-
30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL)- uregelm ... ig. 
DE:80.07·P61. EN:80.07·P64. Fft:80.07-P31. IT:80.07·P22. 
NL:80.07 • 1'58 
ISSN 0379-2260: abonnement: ECU 27,50, DKR 198; 
Abonnementet inlcluderer ogd A og B ~ven. 
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P63 Dokumenta und Publlkat~- Kommission der EuropiiiChan 
GemelniChaftan • Bonn- 30 em; (DE) - monatilch. 
kostenlos. 

P64 Donna d·Europa - Bollatlno dllnformulone - Dlrazione 
generale dell'intormazione; Cornmissiona delle Cornuniti auropae -
Bruxelles • 8ruaaal - 30cm; (m - bimlltrale. 
DA:80.07 • P131. DE:80.07 • P173. Fft:80.07 ·1'1114 
gretuito. 

P65 La doaalar de •·europa - Direction g8nerale Groupe du 
porta-parole et direction ginftlll dll'informetion; Commission des 
Communautes europMnnes- 30cm; (FR)- bimeneual. 
DA:80.07 • P111. EN:80.07 • P140. IT:80.07 ·P281. 
NL:80.07 ·1'229 
ISSN 0379-3109: gratuit. 

P66 EC-egrloultu,.l priQ indlnl (Output and Input)· Statistical 
Office of the European Cornmunitiel; Commission of the Europaen 
Communitiea- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/m- qu.-ter~y. 
DE:80.07 ·P83. Fft:80.07 ·1'188. IT:80.07 ·P189 
ISSN 0250.5967: subscription: ECU 15, IRL 10, UKL 9.10, 
USD 20.50. 

P67 EC Trlda with the ACP etate. and the Iouth 
Medltar,.nean &11181- Stetiltical Office of the European 
Communities; Commission of the European Communities - 30cm; 
(EN/FRI- quarterly. 
FR:80.07 • 1'88 
ISSN 0379-3466: lubiCription: ECU 3,76,1Rl. 2.50, UKL 2.30, 
USD 5.20. 

P68 La1 eohanga1 dala CE 8Vec 181 Etata ACP at lea Etata de Ia 
M6dltarrenea Sud • Office statistique des Cornmuneut81 
eurQP8ennes; Commission del Cornmunautes aurop8ennea- 30cm; 
(EN/FR)- trimaetrial. 
EN:80.07 • P67 
ISSN 0379-3486: abonnernent: Ecu 3,76, 8FR 150. FF 22. 

P69 Eoonomla auropea - Direziona generale Afferi economici e 
finanziari; Cornmissione delle Comuniti europea - 30cm; (m -
quadrimestrale. 
DA:80.07·P123. DE:I0.07·P117. EN:I0.07·P134. 
FR:80.07 • P75. NL:80.07 ·P143 
ISSN 0379-1017: abbonllmento: ECU 26. LIT 28000. 

P70 Economla auropaa: urla oompl- daleupplamanti- 30cm; 
- 25 nurneri. 
DA:80.07 -P124. DE:I0.07 • P118. EN:80.07 • P131. 
FR:I0.07- 1'78. NL:I0.07 • P144 
abbonamento: ECU 20, LIT 22400. 
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P71 Economle europea- Supplemento- Serle A: Tendenza 
oongiunturall - Direzione ganerale Afferi economici a finenziari; 
Commissione delle Comunit8 8IM'op88 - 30cm; un -undici numeri 
perenno. 
DA:80.07- P125. D£:80.07- P119. EN:80.07- P136. 
FR:80.07-P77. NL:80.07-P145 
ISSN 0379-2064: abbonamento: ECU 10, LIT 11700. 

P72 Eoonomle auropee- Supplemento- Serle a: Proapettlva 
oonglunturali: Rl8ultetl delle lnchleeta nell'induetrla - Direzione 
generale Afferi economici e finenziari; Commissions delle Comunita 
europee - 30cm; 1m - undici numeri par anno. 
DA:80.07- P126. DE:80.07- P120. EN:80.07 -P137. 
FR:80.07- P7B. NL:80.07- P146 
ISSN 0379-2129: abbonamento: ECU 11,25, LIT 12600. 

P73 Eoonomle europee- Supplemento- Serle C: Proepettlva 
oonglunturaA: Riaultetl della inchlelte praaao I conaumatorl -
Direzione generale Affari economici e finanziari; Commissione delle 
Comunit8 europee - 30cm; 1m - quadrimeetrale. 
DA:80.07 -P127. DE:80.07 -P121. EN:80.07 -P138. 
FR:80.07 -P79. NL:80.07- P147 
ISSN 0379-2188: abbonamento: ECU 5, LIT 5600. 

P74 Economla europee e aupplementl A a C- 30cm; - 28 numeri. 
DA:80.07- P128. D£:80.07- P122. EN:80.07- P138. 
FR:80.07- P80. NL:80.07- P146 
abbonamento: ECU 37,5, LIT 41900. 

P75 Economle europ8enna- Direction g8nerale Affaires 
8conomiques It finenciires; Commillllion des Communautes 
tlllfOIIiennes- 30cm; (FR)- quadrirnestriel. 
DA:80.07-P123. DE:80.07-P117. EN:80.07-P134. 
IT:80.07 -P68. NL:80.07 -P143 
ISSN 0379-0983: abonnement: Ecu 25, BFR 1000, FF 145,50. 

P76 Economia europ8enne: nrla complete daa supplements-
30cm; - 25 numeros. 
DA:80.07- P124. DE:80.07- P118. EN:80.07- P135. 
IT:80.07- P70. NL:80.07 -P144 
abonnement: Ecu 20, BFR 800, FF 116,50. 

P77 Economle aurop8enna- Supplement- Serle A: Tandencaa 
oonjoncturellee - Direction ginirale Affaires economiques et 
financiires; Commission des Communautes europ8ennes- 30cm; 
(FR)- onze numeros par an. 
DA:80.07- P125. D£:80.07 -P118. EN:80.07- P136. 
IT:80.07- P71. NL:80.07- P145 
ISSN 0379-2021: abonnement: Ecu 10, BFR 400, FF 5B,50. 

P78 Eoonomle auropeanne- Supplement - Serie a: Parapectlvea 
eoonomlquas: Reaultata dH enquitea aupru des chm 
d' antraprlaa - Direction ginerale Affaires economiques et 
financiires; Commission des Communautea europ6ennes- 30cm; 
(FR)- onze numiros par en. 
DA:80.07 -P126. D£:80.07 -P120. EN:80.07 -P137. 
IT:80.07 -P72. NL:80.07- P146 
ISSN 0379-2080: abonnement: Ecu 11,25, BFR 450, FF 65,50. 

P79 Economla auropeenna- Supplement- Serle C: 
Perspectivas eoonomlquea: RNultets dee anquitea aupria 
des conaommateura - Direction ginerale Affaire& economiques at 
financiiras; Commission des Communautea europ8ennes- 30cm; 
(FR) - quadrimastriel. 
DA:80.07-P127. DE:80.07-P121. EN:80.07-P138. 
IT:80.07-P73. NL:80.07-P147 
ISSN 0379-2145: abonnement: Ecu 5, BFR 200, FF 29,50. 

PSO Economle europ6enna at lea aupplementa A a C - 30cm; -
2Bnumeros. 
DA:80.07 -P128. DE:80.07 -P122. EN:80.07 -P138. 
IT:80.07- P74. NL:80.07- P148 
abonnement: Ecu 37 ,5, BFR 1500, FF 218,50. 

P81 EF-eviaen - KommiBBionen for De europlliske F•llasskaber -
Kfbenhavn- 29 x 40cm; (DA) - halvmanedlig. 
gratis. 

PB2 EF dokumantatlon - Kommissionen for De europlliske 
F_.leaskaber - Kebenhavn - 21 em; (DA) - halvminedlig. 
gratis. 

P83 EG-Agrarpralalndizea (Output und Input)- Stetistisches Amt 
der Europiiischan Gemeinschaften; Kommission der Europiischan 
Gemainschaften- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/m- vierteljihrlich. 
EN:80.07 -P68. FR:80.07- P188. IT:80.07 -P188 
ISSN 0250-5967: Abonnernent: ECU 15, OM 37,50. 

PB4 EO Magazin - Kommission dar Europllischen Gemeinschaftan -
Bonn- 27em; (DE)- monatlich. 
Abonnement: OM 12 
Einzelpraise: OM 1,50. 

PB5 EIB-Informetlon -European Investment Bank - 30 em; (EN) -
quarterly. 
ISSN 025Q-3B91: frea of charge. 

P86 EIB-Informatlon - Den Europeiske lnvesteringsbank - 30cm; 
(DA) - kvartalsvis. 
ISSN 0250-3875: gratis. 

P87 El8-lnformatlonan- Europiiische lnvestitionsbank- 30 em; 
(DEl - vierteljllhrlich. 
ISSN 025Q-3BB3: kostenlos. 

PBS El8 Medadelingan- Europese lnvesteringebank- 30 em; (NL)-
driemaandelllts. 
ISSN 0250-3913: gratis. 

P89 Elnkaufapreiee dar aetrlabamlttel- Stetistisches Amt der 
Europiischan Gernainschaften; Kommiasion der Europllischen 
Gemainschaftan- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/m - vierteljihrlich. 
EN:80.07- P254. FR:80.07- P246. IT:80.07- P241 
ISSN 0378-8692: Abonnernent: ECU 2,2, OM 56,20. 

P90 Eleen und Stahl: Monataberlcht - Statistisches Amt der 
Europiiischan Gemainschaften; Kommission der Europiiischen 
Gemainschaften - 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/m - monatlich. 
EN:80.07- P200. FR:80.07- P276. IT:80.07- P272 
ISSN 0378-7559: Abonnernent: ECU 11,25, OM 28. 

P91 Eleen und Stahl: Vlartlljahreahaft - Statistisches Amt der 
Europiiischan Gemeinschaften; Kommission der Europiiischen 
Gemainschaften- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/m- viarteljihrlich. 
EN:II0.07- P202. FR:80.07- P278. IT:80.07- P274 
ISSN 0378-7672: Abonnernant: ECU 30, OM 75. 

P92 Eleen und Stahl: Vlarteljahreahafta und Monatabarichta-
30cm; - 16 Hefte. 
EN:80.07 -P201. FR:80.07 -P277. IT:80.07 -P273 
Abonnament: ECU 37 ,50, OM 93,50; Sarnmelabonnernent. 

P93 Electrlclll-gy: monthly bulletin - Statistical Offics of the 
European Communities; Commission of the Europeen Communities 
- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR)- monthly. 
D£:80.07- P84. Fll:80.07 - P96 
ISSN 0378-3661: subscription: ECU 7 ,5, IRL 5.00, UKL 4.55, 
USD 10.25. 

P94 Elektrlzltit: MonetabuUetin - Stetiltisches Amt der 
Europiiischan Gerneinschaftan; Kommission der Europiiischan 
Gemeinschaften- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR) - monatlich. 
EN:80.07- P83. Fll:80.07- P86 
ISSN 0378-3661: Abonnement: ECU 7,5, OM 18,75. 

P95 Enargla 6lectriqua: buHetln maneual - Office ststiltique des 
Communaut8a europ6ennes; Commission des Communaut8a 
europeannes- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR) - maneuel. 
DE:80.01- P94. EN:80.07- P93 
ISSN 0378-3581: abonnement: Ecu 7,5, BFR 300, FF 43,50. 

P96 Energiaatetietlk: Monetabulletln a) Kohla, b) 
Kohlanwuaeretoffa, c) Elaktrizitit- 30cm; - monatflch. 
EN:80.07-P87. FR:80.07-P279 
Abonnement: ECU 27,50, OM 69; Sarnmelabonnernent 

P97 Energy atetiatlca: Monthly bulletin a) Coal, b) 
Hydrocarbons. c) Elactrlclll-gy- 30cm; -monthly. 
DE:80.07-P98. FR:80.07-P278 
subscription: ECU 27,50,1RL 1B.25, UKL 16.70, USD 37.80; 
Combined subscription. 

P98 Eoruc811- Baile Atha Clieth- 30 em; (GAl- .. 



P99 Ergebniese der Konjunkturbefregung bel den 
Unternehmern In der GemelniChllft - Generaldirektion 
Wortschaft und Finanzen; Kommission der Europiischen 
Gemeinschaften - 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI- monatlich. 
DA:80.07- P260. EN:60.07- P262. FR:80.07- P261. 
IT:80.07- P263. NL:80.07- P269 
ISSN 0378-4479: Abonnement: ECU 4~,25, OM 103. 

P100 Euro-Abstracts. Section 1 -Euratom and EEC Research. 
Scientific and technical Publications and Patents -
Directorate-General Scientific and T echnicallnformation and 
Information Management; Commission of the European 
Co'Tlmunities- 30cm; (EN)- monthly. 
ISSN 0014-2352: subscription: ECU 37 ,50, IRL 25.00, 
UKL 22.80, USD 51.50. 

P101 Euro-Abstracta. Section II: Charbon- Acier- Scherff, H.L. 
(redac181Mi; Jay, 8. (redscteull; Direction generale Information 
scientifique at technique at gestion da !"information; Commission 
das Communautils europ8ennas- 30cm; index (DE/EN/FRI -
men-1. 
DE:80.07- P103. EN:80.07 -P102 
ISSN 0378-3472: abonnament: Ecu 50, 8FR 2000, FF 291. 

P102 Euro-Abstracta. Section II: Coal- Steel- Scherff, H.L. 
(editotl; Jay, 8. (editOI); Directorate-General Scientific and Technical 
Information and Information Management; Commission of the 
European Communities- 30cm; index (OE/EN/FRI- monthly. 
DE:80.07 -P103. FR:80.07- P101 
ISSN 0378-3472: subscription: ECU 50, IRL 33.25, UKL 30.50, 
USD 68.50. 

P103 Euro-Abstracta. Sektlon II: Kohle- Stahl- Scharff, H.L. 
(Heraus~; Jay, B. (Heraus~; Generaldirektion 
Wissenschaftliche und technische Information und 
lnformationsmanagement; Kommission der Europiischen 
Gemeinschaften- 30cm; Register (DE/EN/FRI - monatlich. 
EN:80.07 -P102. FR:80.07- P101 
ISSN 0378-3472: Abonnement: ECU 50, OM 125. 

P 104 Euroforum - Direction g8n8rale Groupe du porte-parole et 
direction g8n8rale da !"information; Commission das Communautes 
europeennes- 30cm; (FR) - bimensual. 
DE:80.07 -P108. EN:80.07 -P106. IT:80.07- P107. 
NL:80.07- P106 
ISSN 0379-3052: gratuit. 

P105 Euroforum- Directorate-General Spokesman's Group and 
Directorate-General for Information; Commission of the Europesn 
Communities- 30cm; (EN)- twice monthly. ~ 
DE:80.07 -P108. FR:80.07- P104. IT:80.07- P107. 
NL:80.07- P106 
ISSN 0379-3079: fres of charge. 

P 106 Euroforum - Directoraat-genaraal Bureau van de woodvoerder 
en directoraat- generaal voorlichting; Commissie van da Europese 
Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (NLI - twee maal per mand. 
DE:80.07- P108. EN:80.07- P105. FR:80.07- P104. 
IT:80.07-P107 
ISSN 0379-3095: gratis. 

P107 Euroforum- Direziona generale Gruppo del portavoce e 
Direziona generale dall"informaziona; Commissione delle Comunita 
europes- 30cm; un- qUindicinale. 
DE:80.07- P108. EN:80.07- Pt06. FR:80.07 -P104. 
NL:80.07- P106 
ISSN 0379-3087: gratuito. 

P 108 Euroforum - Generaldirektion Sprechergruppe und 
Generaldirektion Information; Kommission dar Europliischen 
Gemeinscheften- 30cm; (DEl - vierzehntagig. 
EN:80.07 -P106. FR:80.07 -P104. IT:80.07 -P107. 
NL:80.07- P106 
ISSN 0379-3060: kostenlos. 

' P 1 09 Euronet Diane N-• - Directorate-General Scientific and 
T echnicallnformatoon and Information Management; Mastroddo, F. 
(editOtl- 30 em; (EN)- quarterly. 
fres of charge. 
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P 110 Europe-lnformatlonen flir die Jugendpr-e- Kommission 
der Europiischan Gemeinschaften- Bonn- 30cm; (DE)- monatlich. 
kostenlos. 

P 111 Europe-noter- Generaldirektorat Talamandena gruppe og 
generaldirektoratet for information; Kommissionen for Da 
europaaiske Fellesskaber- 30cm; (DAI - helvminedlig. 
EN:80.07- P140. FR:80.07- P65. IT:80.07- P269. NL:80.07- P229 
ISSN 03 79-315X: gratis. 

P 112 Europa-Parlamentet- Europa-Parlarnantet- 30 x 43cm; (DAI 
- uregelomassig. 
DE:80.07- P116. EN:80.07- P141. FR:80.07- P233. 
IT:80.07 -P232. NL:80.07- P142 
gratis. 

P 113 Europa van morgen- Commossie van de Europese 
Gemesnschappen- Dan Haag- 30cm; (NL) - wekalijks. 
gratis. 

P 114 Ewope verde: Note rapicle - Direziona genarale Personale e 
amministreziona; Commissiona dalle Comunit8 europee- 30cm; UTI 
- undici numeri per anno. 
DA:80.07 -P179. DE:80.07 -P183. EN:80.07 ·P177. 
FR:80.07 -P132. NL:80.07 -P181 
abbonamento: ECU 6, LIT 5600. 

P 115 Europa verde: Notlzie aulla polltlca agricola comune -
Direziona genarale Personale e amministraziona; Commissions delle 
Comunit8 europes - 30cm; (m - undici numeri per anno. 
DA:80.07-P180. DE:80.07-P184. EN:80.Q7-P178. 
FR:80.07-P133. NL:80.07-P182 
abbonamento: ECU 5, LIT 5600. 

P 116 Dae Europiiiacha Parlament - Europiisches Parlarnant -
30 x 43cm; (DEl - unragelmil&ig. 
DA:80.07- P112. EN:80.07- P141. FR:80.07- P233. 
IT:80.07- P232. NL:80.07- P142 
kostenlos. 

P 117 EuropiiiChe WlrtiChllft - Generaldlrektion Wirtschaft und 
Finanzen; Kommission der Europiischen GemeinSchaften- 30cm; 
(DE) - dreimal jihrlich. 
DA:80.07 -P123. EN:80.07-P134. FR:80.07 -P75. IT:80.07 -P69. 
NL:80.07- P143 
ISSN 0379-1033: Abonnement: ECU 25. OM 62,50. 

P 118 Europilacha Wlnschaft: genmte Serle Belhefte- 30cm; -
25 Hefte. 
DA:80.07-P124. EN:80.07-P135. FR:80.07-P711. IT:80.07-P70. 
NL:80.07 -P144 
Abonnamant: ECU 20, OM 50. 

P 119 EuropliiiCha Wlrtachaft - Belhllfte - Serle A: 
Konjunkturtandenzen - Generaldirektion Wortschaft und Finanzen; 
Kommission dar Europiischen Gemeinschaften - 30cm; (DE) -
elfmal jihrlich. 
DA:80.07-P126. EN:80.07-P138. FR:80.07-P77. IT:80.07-P71. 
NL:80.07- P145 
ISSN 0379-2048: Abonnament: ECU 10, OM 25. 

P 120 EuropiiiChe Wirtachaft - Belhafta - Serle B: 
Konjunkturaunichten: Ergebnlne dar Umfraga bel den 
Unternahmern - Generaldirektion Wortschaft und Finenzan; 
Kommission der Europiischen Gemeinachaften - 30cm; (DEl -
elfrnal jilhrllch. 
DA:80.07-P126. EN:80.07-P137. FR:80.07-P78. IT:80.07-P72. 
NL:80.07- P146 
ISSN 0379-2161: Abonnement: ECU 11,25, OM 28. 

P 121 Europillacha Wlrtechllft - Belhllfte- Serle C: 
Konjunkturauaalchten: Ergebnlase der Verbraucherumfraga­
Generaldirektion Wortschaft und Finenzen; Kommission dar 
Europiischen Gemeinschaften - 30cm; (DEl - dreimal jlihrlich. 
DA:80.07- P127. EN:80.07- P138. FR:80.07- P79. IT:80.07- P73. 
NL:80.07- P147 
ISSN 0379-2161: Abonnement: ECU 5, OM 12,50. 

P 122 Europliiache Wirtachllft und Balhefte A B C- 30cm; - 28 
Hefte. 
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DA:80.07 -P128. EN:80.07- P138. FR:80.07- P80. IT:80.07- P74. 
NL:80.07- P148 
Abonnement: ECU 37,5, OM 93,50. 

P123 EuropiiiH fllkonomi • Generaldirektorat 0konomiske og 
finanaielle IPtrgamal; Kommisaionen for De e..-oplliske 
Fllllesakaber - 30cm; (DA) - firminedlig. 
DE:80.07-P117. EN:80.07-P134. FR:80.07-P75. IT:80.07-P88. 
NL:80.07-P143 
ISSN 0379-1009: abonnement: ECU 25, DKR 180. 

P1 24 Europlliak fllkonomi: den komplette nrle tillllg- 30cm;-
25 numre. 
DE:80.07- P118. EN:80.07- P135. FR:80.07- P78. IT:80.07- P70. 
NL:80.07- P144 
abonnement: ECU 20, DKR 144. 

P 125 Eurpp~~iak fllkonoml - Tlllllg - Rlllcke A: Den ekonomleke 
udvlkling - Generaldirektorat fllkonomiske og finansielle &Ptrgamil; 
Komm1saionen for De e..-oplliske F•llesakaber- 30cm; (DA)­
elleve ganga om iret. 
DE:80.07- P118. EN:80.07- P138. FR:80.07- P77. IT:80.07- P71. 
NL:80.07- P145 
ISSN 0379-203X: abonnement: ECU 10, DKR 72. 

P 126 Europllilk fllkonoml - TIIIIIQ- R•kke B: fllkonomlake 
udalgter: Reaultaterne ef konjunkturundereegelaen hoe 
vlrkaomhedaledera i Flllleaaklbet- Generaldirektorat 
fllkonomiske og finansielle sptrgam61; Kommisaionen for De 
auroplliskl Fllllesakaber - 30cm; (DA) - elleve ganga om arat. 
DE:80.07 • 1'120. EN:80.07 -P137. FR:80.07- P78. IT:80.07- P72. 
NL:80.07 -P148 
ISSN 0379-2099:abonnement:ECU 11,25,DKR 81. 

P 127 EuropiiiH fllkonoml- Tlllllg- R•k• C: fllkonomlake 
udllgter: ftuulteterne ef konjunkturundereegeleerne blendt 
de europllilke forbrugere - Genaraldlrektorat fllkonom1ske og 
finanaielle sptrgsmil; Kommisslonan for De e..-oplliske 
Flllleaskaber- 30cm; (DA) - firminadlig. 
DE:80.07-P121. EN:80.07-P138. FR:80.07-P78. IT:80.07-P73. 
NL:80.07- P147 
ISSN 0379-2153: abonnament: ECU 5, DKR 36. 

P 128 Europllilk fllkonoml og tllltlg ABC- 30cm; - 28 numre. 
DE:80.07- P122. EN:80.07- P139. FR:80.07- P80. IT:80.07- P74. 
NL:80.07- P148 
abonnement: ECU 37,5, DKR 270. 

P 129 De Europlliake Flllleaakebera Tldende, C-delen: 
Meddelelaer op oplyanlnger - Aile inatitutioner - 30cm; (DA) -
kvasi dagllg. 
DE:80.07- P7. EN:80.07- P230. FR:80.07- P203. IT:80.07- P174. 
NL:80.07- P252 
ISSN 0379-7001: abonnament: ECU 100, DKR 700; 
Abonnetnenlltt omfrltlltr L-delen og C-delen. 

P 130 De Europllilke Fllllnaklbera Tldende. L-delen: 
fteteforlkrlfter- Aile institutioner- 30cm; (DA) - kvasi deglig. 
DE:80.07 • PB. EN:80.07- P231. FR:80.07- P204. IT:80.07- P175. 
NL:80.07- P263 
ISSN 0378-6994: abonnement: ECU 100, DKR 700; 
Abonnell'lftnt omfrltlltr L-delen og C-delen. 

P 131 Europa• Kvinder -lnformetlonlbulletln- Generaldirektoratet 
for information; Kommilsionan for De .... oplliske Fllllesskaber -
BruxeHea- Brusael- 30cm; (DA) - tominedlig. 
DE:80.07-P173. FR:80.07-P184. IT:80.07-P84 
gratis. 

P 1 32 Europe vane: Notes rapldaa - Direction g8n8rale Peraonnel et 
administration; Commission des Communeutis .... op8ennas-
30cm; (FR) - onze num8ros par an. 
DA:80.07 -P178. DE:80.07 -P183. EN:80.07 -P177. 
IT:80.07 -1'114. NL:80.07- P181 
abonnement: Ecu 5, BFR 200. FF 29,50. 

P 133 Europa vena: Nouvelle• dela politiqua egrlaole commune 
- Direction g8n8rele Peraonnel at admimstration; Commilsion des 
Communautu europloennea- 30cm; (FR) - onze numeroa par an. 

OA:80.07- P180. EN:80.07 -P178. IT:80.07- P115. 
NL:80.07 -P182 
abonnement: Ecu 5, BFR 200. FF 29,50. 

P 134 Europnn Economy- Directorate-General Economic and 
Financial Affairs; Commission of the European Communities-
30cm; (EN)- three times a year. 
DA:80.07-P123. DE:80.07-P117. FR:80.07-P75. IT:80.07-P89. 
NL:80.07- P143 
ISSN 0379-Q991: subacription: ECU 25,1RL 16.60, UKL 15.25, 
uso 34.25. 

P 135 Europnn Economy: complete aerlea of aupplementa-
30cm;- 25 isauea. 
DA:80.07 -P124. DE:80.07 -P118. FR:80.07 -P78. IT:80.07 -P70. 
NL:80.07 -P144 
subscription: ECU 20,1Rl 13.30, UKL 12.15, USD 27.35. 

P 136 Europnn Economy- Suppl-em- Sarin A: R-nt 
economic trenda - Directorate-General Economic and Financial 
Affairs; Commisaian of the E..-opeen Communitiea- 30cm; (EN) -
eleven times a year. 
DA:80.07-P125. DE:80.07-P119. FR:80.07-P77. IT:80.07-P71. 
NL:80.07 -P145 
ISSN 0379-2056: subscription: ECU 10, IRL 6. 70, UKL 6.10, 
USD 13.70. 

P 137 Europnn Economy- Supplement - Series B: Economic 
proapecta: Bualnen survey raaulta - Directorate-General 
Economic and Financ1al Affairs; Commilsian of the E..-opean 
Communities- 30cm; (EN)- eleven tim11 a year. 
DA:80.07-P128. DE:80.07-P120. FR:80.07-P78. IT:80.07-P72. 
NL:80.07- P148 
ISSN 0379-2110: subscription: ECU 11,25,1Rl 7.50, 
UKL 6.85, USD 15.50. 

P 138 Europnn Economy- Supplemem- Sarles C: Economic 
proapecta: Consumer aurvay results - Directorate-General 
Economic and Financial Affairs; Commisaion of the E..-opean 
Communitiea- 30cm; (EN)- three times a year. 
DA:80.07-P127. DE:80.07-P121. FR:80.07-P78. IT:80.07-P73. 
NL:80.07- P147 
ISSN 0379-217X: subscription: ECU 5, IRL 3.30, UKL 3. 10. 
USD 6.90. 

P139 Europnn Economy and aupplemama ABC- 30cm;- 28 
isauea. 
DA:80.07- P128. DE:80.07- P122. FR:80.07- P80. IT:80.07- P74. 
NL:80.07- P148 
subscription: ECU 37,5,1Rl 25.00, UKL 22.80, USD 51.50. 

P140 European File- Directorate-General Spokesman's Group and 
Directorate-General for Information; CommiSSion of the E..-opean 
Communities- 30cm; (EN)- twice monthly. 
DA:80.07-P111. FR:80.07-P86. IT:80.07-P289. NL:80.07-P229 
ISSN 0379-3133: free of charge. 

P14 1 Europnn Parliament- E..-opean Parliament- 30 x 43cm; 
(EN )-irregular. 
DA:80.07 -P112. DE:80.07 -P118. FR:80.07 -P233. 
IT:80.07-P232. NL:80.07-P142 
free of charge. 

P142 Europees Parlament- E..-opees Perlement- 30 x 43cm; (Nl) 
- onregalmatig. 
DA:80.07-P112. OE:80.07-P118. EN:80.07-P141. 
FR:80.07-P233. IT:80.07-P232 
gratis. 

P 143 Europeae Economie - Directoraat-genaraal Econorni~ en 
financiile zakan; Commissie van de Europeee Gemeenachappen -
30cm; (Nl)- drie meal per jaar. 
DA:80.07-P123. DE:80.07-P117. EN:80.07-P134. 
FR:80.07- P75. IT:80.07- P89 
ISSN 0379-1025: abonnement: Ecu 25, HFL 68,50. 

P 144 Europne Economie: de complete reek• aupplementen-
30cm; - 25 nummers. 
DA:80.07-P124. DE:80.07-P118. EN:80.07-P136. 
FR:80.07- P78. IT:80.07- P70 
abonnemant: Ecu 20, HFL 54, 75. 



P 145 Europese Economle- Supplement- Serle A: Recente 
economische ontwlkkellngen - Dorectoraat-generaal Economische 
en financiiile zaken; CommiSSI8 van de Europese Gemeenschappen-
30cm; (NL)- elf maal per 1aar. 
DA:80.07 -P125. DE:80.07 -P119. EN.80.07 -P136. 
FR:80.07- P77. IT:80.07- P71 
ISSN 0379-2072: abonnement: Ecu 10, HFL 27,50. 

P146 Europese Economie- Supplement- Serle B: 
Vooruitzlchten voor de economische ontwlkkeling: 
Resultaten ven de enqu8te bij hat bedrljfsleven -
Directoraat-generaal Economische en financiiile zaken; Commissie 
van de Europese Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (NL)- elf maal per 1aar. 
DA:80.07- P126. OE:80.07- P120. EN:80.07- P137. 
FR:80.07- P78. IT:80.07- P72 
ISSN 0379-2137: abonnement: Ecu 11,25, HFL 31. 

P147 Europese Economie- Supplement- Serle C: 
Vooruiuichten voor de economiache ontwikkeling: 
Resultaten van de enqu8te bij de verbruikers -
Directoraat-generaal Economische en financiiile zaken; Commissie 
van de Europese Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (NL) - drie maal per 
J&ar. 
DA:80.07 -P127. DE:80.07- P121. EN:80.07 -P138. 
FR:80.07-P79. IT:80.07-P73 
ISSN 0379-2196: abonnement: Ecu 5, HFL 13,70. 

P 148 Europese Economie met supplementen A B C- 30cm; - 28 
nummers. 
DA:80.07 -P128. DE:80.07- P122. EN:80.07- P139. 
FR:80.07- PBO. IT:80.07- P74 
abonnement: Ecu 37 ,5, HFL 103. 

P 149 Eurostat-Mitteilungen- Statistisches Amt der Europiiischen 
Gemeinschaften; Kommission der Europiiischen Gemeinschaften-
23cm; (DE) - v1erteljiihrlich. 
EN:80.07 -P150. FR:80.07 -P194 
ISSN 0378-505X: kostenlos. 

P 150 Eurostet-news- Statistical Office of the European 
Communities; Commission of the European Commumties- 23cm; 
(EN)- quarterly. 
DE:80.07- P149. FR:80.07- P194 
ISSN 0378-4207: free of charge. 

P 151 Eurostatistiche: Dati per l'anallsi della congiuntura: A • B 
- 30cm; - undici numeri per anno. 
DA:80.07 -P167. DE:80.07 -P160. EN:80.07 -P153. 
FR:80.07 -P162. NL:80.07- P156 
abbonamento: ECU 37,5, LIT 41900; Sorroscrizionecombinara. 

P152 Eurostatistiche: Dati par l'analisi della congiuntura: B-
lstituto statistico delle Comunit8 europee; Commissione delle 
Comunita europee- 30cm; (DA/EN/Jn - und1ci numeri per anno. 
DA:80.07-P158. EN:80.07-P154 
ISSN 0250-3921: abbonamento: ECU 20, LIT 22400 
prezzi unitari: ECU 2,5, LIT 2800. 

P 153 Eurostatistics: Data for short term economic analysis: A • 
B- 30cm; - eleven times a year. 
DA:80.07-P157. DE:80.07-P160. FR:80.07-P162. 
IT:80.07- P151. NL:80.07- P156 
subscription: ECU 37 ,5, IRL 25, UKL 22.80, USD 51.50; 
Combined subscription: A & B. 

P 154 Eurostatistlcs: Data for short-term economic analysis: B -
Statistical Off1ce of the European Communities; Comm1ssion of the 
European Communities- 30cm; (DA/EN/Jn -eleven times a year. 
DA:80.07 -P158. IT:80.07 -P152 
ISSN 0250-3921: subscription: ECU 20,1RL 13.30, UKL 12.15, 
USD 27.35 
stngle copies: ECU 2,5, IRL 1.60, UKL 1.50, USD 3.40. 

P 155 Eurostatistieken: Gegevens voor conjunctuuranalyses: A-
Bureau voor de Stattstiek der Europese Gemeenschappen; 
Commissie van de Europese Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (OE/FR/NL) 
- elf maal per jaar. 
DE:80.07 -P159. FR:80.07- P161 
ISSN 0250-393X: abonnement: Ecu 20, HFL 54,75 
per nummer: Ecu 2,5, HFL 6,85. 
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P 156 Eurostatistieken: Gegevens voor conjunctuuranalyses: A 
• B - 30cm; - elf maal per jaar. 
DA:80.07- P157. DE:80.07 -P160. EN:80.07 -P153. 
FR:80.07- P162. IT:80.07 -P151 
abonnement: Ecu 37,5, HFL 103; Gecombineerdabonnemenr. 

P 15 7 Eurostatistik: Data til konjunkturanalyse: A • B- 30cm; -
elleve gange om aret. 
DE:80.07 -P180. EN:80.07 -P153. FR:BO 07- P162. 
IT:80.07-P151. NL:80.07-P156 
abonnement: ECU 37 ,5, DKR 270; Samlsr abonnemenr: A & B. 

P 158 Eurostetistik: Data til konjunkturanalyse: B - De europaoiske 
Feellesskabers statistiske Kontor; Kommissionen for De europeetske 
Feellesskaber- 30cm; (DA/EN/IT)- elleve gange om tiret. 
EN:80.07 -P154. IT:80.07- P152 
ISSN 0250-3921: abonnement: ECU 20, DKR 144 
for enkelte numre: ECU 2,5, DKR 18. 

P 159 Eurostatistlken: Daten zur Konjunkturanalyse: A-
Statisttsches Amt der Europiiischen Gemeinschaften; Kommiss1on 
der Europiiischen Gemeinschaften - 30cm; (OE/FR/NL) - elfmal 
jiihrlich. 
FR:80.07 -P161. NL:80.07 -P155 
ISSN 0250-393X: Abonnement: ECU 20, OM 50 
Einzelpreise: ECU 2,5, OM 6,25. 

P 160 Eurostatistiken: Daten zur Konjunkturanalyse: A • B -
30cm; - elfmal jiihrlich. 
DA:80.07 -P157. EN:80.07 -P153. FR:80.07- P162. 
IT:80.07-P151. NL:80.07-P156 
Abonnement: ECU 37,5, OM 93,50; Sammelllbonnemenr: A & B. 

P161 Eurostatistiques: Donnus pour I' analyse dela 
conjoncture: A- Office statistique des Communauttis 
europeennes; Commission des Communauttis europ8ennes- 30cm; 
(DE/FR/NL) - onze numeros par an. 
DE:80.07 -P159. NL:80.07 -P155 
ISSN 0250-393X: abonnement: Ecu 20, BFR 800, FF 116,50 
a l'untte: Ecu 2,5, BFR 100, FF 14,60. 

P 162 Eurostetistlquea: Don nus pour I' analyse de Ia 
conjoncture: A • B - 30cm; - onze numeros par an. 
DA:80.07- P157. DE:80.07- P180. EN:80.07- P153. 
IT:80.07 -P151. NL:80.07 -P156 
abonnement: Ecu 37,5, BFR 1500, FF 218,50; Abonnement 
groupe: A & B. 

P 163 Faglig Uddannelse: lnformationsbullatin- Det europeetske 
Center for udvikling af Erhvervsuddannelse; Kommissionen for De 
europeeiske Feellesskaber- 30cm; (OA) - kvartalsvis. 
DE:80.07-P15. FR:80.07-P171. IT:80.07-P172. Nl:80.07-P14 
ISSN 0378-5084: abonnement: ECU 13,75, DKR 99. 

P 164 Femmes d'Europe- Bulletin d' information- Direction 
generale de l'information; Commission des Communauttis 
europeennes- Bruxelles- Brussel- 30cm; (FR) - bimestnel. 
DA:80.07-P131. DE:80.07-P173. IT:80.07-P64 
gratuit. 

P 165 Fichea pedagogiques "30 joura d'Europe• -Commission des 
Communauttis europeennes- Paris- 30cm; (FR) - onze numeros par 
an. 
abonnement: FF 20; Reduction de prix pour abonnemenrs groupes. 

P 166 Fischerei: Menge und Wert der Anlandungen in dar EG -
Statistisches Amt der Europiiischen Gemeinschaften; Kommission 
der Europiiischen Gemeinschaften- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) -
vierteljiihrlich. 
OA:80.07-P168. EN:80.07-P167. FR:80.07-P234. 
IT:80.07- P235. NL:80.07- P293 
ISSN 0379-0029: Abonnement: ECU 15, OM 37,50. 

P167 Fisheries: Quantity and value of landings in the EC-
Statisttcal Office of the European Commumttes; Commission of the 
European Communities- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL)- quanerly. 
DA:80.07- P168. DE:80.07- P166. FR:80.07- P234. 
IT:80.07- P236. Nl:80.07- P293 
ISSN 0379-0029: subscription: ECU 15,1RL 10, UKL 9.10, 
USD 20.50. 
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P 168 Fiskarl: Fangstar landet I EF-~~~~~ngdar og v111rdier- De 
europtliske F•tesskabers statistiske Kontor; Kommissionen for De 
europeiske F_.lesskaber- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FA/IT /NL) -
kvartelsvis. 
DE:80.07 -P166. EN:80.07- P167. FR:80.07- P234. 
IT:80.07 -P236. NL:80.07- P293 
ISSN 0379-Q029: abonnement: ECU 15, DKA 108. 

P 169 Fontes at sclera: Prix de base- document de base 
situation au 1er janvier et emendements - Direction g8nerale 
Marcht!i intt!irieur at effaires industrielles; Commission des 
Communautt!is europt!iennes- 30cm; feuillets mobiles; 
(DA/DE/EN/FA/IT /Nl) - mensual. 
DA:80.07 -P266. DE:80.07- P264. EN:80.07- P237. 
IT:80.07-P176. NL:80.07-P266 
ISSN 0378-4460: abonnement: Ecu 150, BFA 6000, 
FF 873,50. 

P 170 Forhandlinger I Europe-Parlamentet - Europa-Parlamentet -
30cm; indeks (DA) - uregelmll88ig. 
EN:80.07-P49. FR:80.07-P60. IT:80.07-P51. NL:80.07-P186 
ISSN 0378-5033: abonnement: ECU 35, DKA 252; Abonnement 
fra marts 1980 til februar 1981. 

P 171 Formation profesalonnelle: Bulletin d'informatlon -Centre 
europt!ien pour Ia dt!iveloppement de Ia formation professionnelle; 
Commission des Communautt!is europt!iennes- 30cm; (FA) -
trimestriel. 
DA:80.07- P163. DE:80.07- P16. IT:80.07- P172. NL:80.07- P14 
ISSN 0378-5092: abonnement: Ecu 13,75, BFA 550, FF 80. 

P172 Formazione profesaionale: Bollettlno d'informazione-
Centro Europeo per lo sviluppo della formazione professionale; 
Commission& delle Comunita europee - 30cm; UD - trimestrale. 
DA:80.07-P163. DE:80.07-P16. FR:80.07-P171. NL:80.07-P14 
ISSN 0378-5076: abbonarnento: ECU 13, 75, LIT 15400. 

P173 Frauen Europes -lnformationsbulletln- Generaldirektion 
Information; Kommission dar Europiiischen Gemeinschaften­
Bruxelles- Brusael- 30cm; (DE) - sechsmal jiihrlich. 
DA:80.07-P131. FR:80.07-P164. IT:80.07-P64 
kostenlos. 

P 17 4 Gazzetta ufflciele delle Comunit8 europee, parte C: 
Comunicazioni ad informazioni- Tutte Ia 1Stituz1oni- 30cm; (IT) -
quasi-quotidiano. 
DA:80.07- P129. DE:80.07- P7. EN:80.07- P230. FR:80.07 -P203. 
NL:80.07- P262 
ISSN 0378-701X: abbonamento: ECU 100,LIT 113000; 
L 'IJbbonamento comprende 1e due parti L e C. 

P 175 Gazzetta ufficiale della Comuniti europee, parte L: 
Legislazione- Tutte Ia istituzioni- 30cm; (IT) - quasi-quotidiano. 
DA:80.07-P130. DE:80.07-P8. EN:80.07-P231. FR:80.07-P204. 
NL:80.07- P263 
ISSN 0378-7028: abbonamento: ECU 100,LIT 113000; 
L 'Bbbonamento comprende le dw parti L e C. 

P 176 Ghise ad Acciai: Prezzi base - documento base aituazione 
el1 o gennaio e variazionl- Direz1one ganerale Mercato interne e 
affari industriali; Commissione delle Comunita europee - 30cm; 
foglio mobile; (DA/DE/EN/FA/IT/NL)- mens1le. 
DA:80.07- P256. DE:80.07- P264. EN:80.07- P237. 
FR:80.07- P169. NL:80.07- P266 
ISSN 0378-4460: abbonamento: ECU 150,LIT 167600. 

P 17 7 Green Europe: N-sletter In brief - Directorate-General 
Agriculture; Commissoon of the European Communities- 30cm; 
(EN) - aleven times a year. 
DA:80.07- P179. DE:80.07- P183. FR:80.07- P132. 
IT:80.07 -P114. NL:80.07 -P181 
subscription: ECU 5, IAL 3.30, UKL 3.10, USD 6.90. 

P 178 Green Europe: N-sletter on the Common Agricultural 
Policy- Directorate-General Agriculture; Commission of the 
European Communities- 30cm; (EN)- eleven times a year. 
DA:80.07 -PIBO. DE:80.07- P164. FR:80.07- P133. 
IT:80.07- P115. NL:80.07- P182 
subscription: ECU 5, IAL 3.30, UKL 3.10, USD 6.90. 

P 179 Det gr.,.na Europe: Kortfattede meddelelser-
Generaldirektorat Personale og administration; Kommissionen for 
De europtliske Fellesskaber - 30cm; (DA) - elleve ganga om aret. 
DE:80.07 -P183. EN:80.07 -P177. FR:80.07 -P132. 
IT:80.07 -P114. NL:80.07- P181 
abonnement: ECU 5, DKA 36. 

P 180 Det grtmne Europa: Maddalalaer om den fellea 
landbrugspolitlk - Generaldirektorat Personale og administration; 
Kommissionen for Ds europtliske F•lesskaber - 30cm; (DA) -
elleve ganga om iret. 
DE:80.07-P184. EN:80.07-P178. FR:80.07-P133. 
IT:80.07 -P115. NL:80.07 -P182 
abonnement: ECU 5, DKA 36. 

P 181 Gra... Europe: In het kort - Directoraat-generaal Landbouw; 
Commissie van de Europese Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (NL) -elf 
maal per jaar. 
DA:80.07 -P179. DE:80.07 -P183. EN:80.07 -P177. 
FR:80.07-P132. IT:80.07-P114 
abonnement: Ecu 5, HFL 13. 70. 

P 182 Groen Europe: Landbouwbulletln- Directoraat-generaal 
Landbouw; Commissie van de Europese Gemeenschappen - 30cm; 
(NL)- ell maal per jaar. 
DA:80.07 -P180. DE:80.07- P184. EN:80.07- P178. 
FR:80.07-P133. IT:80.07-P116 
abonnernent: Ecu 5, HFL 13, 70. 

P 183 Grlines Europe: Kurzinformetlonen- Generaldirektion 
Landwirtschaft; Kommission der Europiischen Gerneinschaften -
30cm; (DE) - ellmal jiihrlich. 
DA:80.07-P179. EN:80.07-P177. FR:80.07-P132. 
IT:80.07- P114. NL:80.07- P181 
Abonnement: ECU 5, OM 12,50. 

P 184 Grilnes Europe: Mitteilung zur gemelnsamen Agrarpolitik 
- Generaldirektion Landwirtschaft; Kommission dar Europilischen 
Gerneinschalten- 30cm; (DE) - elfmal jiihrlich. 
DA:80.07 -P180. EN:80.07 -P178. FR:80.07 -P133. 
IT:80.07-P116. NL:80.07-P182 
Abonnement: ECU 5, OM 12,50. 

P 185 Handellngen van hat Europese Perfement- Europeee 
Parlement- 30cm; register (NL) - onregelmatig. 
DA:80.07-P170. EN:80.07-P49. FR:80.07-P60. IT:80.07-P61 

ISSN 0378-5025: abonnement: Ecu 35, HFL 96; Abonnement 
vsn maart 1980 tot februari 1981. 

P 186 Hydrocarbures: bulletin menauel - Office statistique des 
Communautt!is europt!iennes; Commission des Communautt!is 
europt!iennes- 30cm; (DE/EN/FA) -mensual. 
DE:80.07- P207 
ISSN 0378-3731: abonnernent: Ecu 15, BFA 600, FF 87,50. 

P 187 lndicateurs conjoncturels de l'industrie- Office statistique 
des Communautt!is europt!iennes; Commission des Communaut8s 
europt!isnnes - 30cm; (FA) - mensual. 
DE:80.07- P208. EN:80.07- P180 
ISSN 0378-7427: abonnement: Ecu 12, BFA 500, FF 73. 

P 188 Indicae CE dee prix agricolee (Output et Input)- Office 
statistique des Communautt!is europt!isnnes; Commission des 
Communautt!is auropt!isnnes- 30cm; (DE/EN/FA/ID - trimastrial. 
DE:80.07-P83. EN:80.07-P66. IT:80.07-P189 
ISSN 0250-5967: abonnernent: Ecu 15, BFA 600, FF 87 ,50. 

P 189 lndlcl CE del prezzi agricoli (Output elnput) - lst1tuto 
statistico delle Comurnt& europee; Commisaione delle Comunita 
europee- 30cm; (DE/EN/FA/ID - trimastrale. 
DE:80.07- P83. EN:80.07- P66. FR:80.07- P188 
ISSN 0250-5967: abbonamento: ECU 15, LIT 16800. 

P 190 Industrial short-term trende - Statistical Office of the 
European Commumties; Commission of the European Communities 
- 30cm; (EN)- monthly. • 
OE:80.07- P208. FR:80.07- P187 
ISSN 0378-7877: subscription: ECU 12,5,1Al 8.30, UKL 7.60, 
USD 17.00. 



P 191 lnformatie betreffende het Hot van Juetltie van de 
Europase GemeeniChappan- Hof van Justitia van de Europese 
Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (NLI - driamaandeliJ<s. 
DA:80.07 -P192. DE:80.07- P228. EN:80.07- P193. 
FR:80.07- P195. 11:80.07- P199 
gratis. 

P192 Information om De europeiake Fellesskabers Dometoi-
Domstolan for de Europtliaks Fetlesskaber- 30cm; (DAI -
kvartalsvis. 
DE:80.07 -P228. EN:80.07 -P193. FR:80.07 -P196. 
11:80.07- P199. NL:80.07 -P191 
gratis. 

P 193 Information on the Court of Juetlce of the European 
Communities- Court of Justice of the European Communities-
30cm; (EN)- quarterly. 
DA:80.07- P192. DE:80.07- P226. FR:80.07- P196. 
11:80.07- P199. Nl:80.07- P191 
frea of charge. 

P 194 Informations de I'Euroetat - Office statistique des 
Communautes surop8ennas; Commission des Communautes 
europeennas- 23cm; (FRI - trimastriel. 
OE:80.07- P149. EN:80.07- P160 
ISSN 0378-360X: gratuit. 

P 196 Informations sur Ia Cour de justice des Communautes 
europaennea - Cour de justice des Communautes surop8ennas -
30cm; (FRI- trimastriel. 
DA:80.07- P192. OE:80.07- P228. EN:80.07- P193. 
11:80.07-P199. Nl:80.07-P191 
gr81uit. 

P 196 lnformazioni - Commissions delle Comunitil suropee - Roma -
30 em; (IT) - irrsgolare. 
gratuito. 

P 197 lnformazloni document!- Commissions delle Comunita 
europes- Roma - 30 em; (IT)- irregolars. 
gratuito. 

P 198 lnformazloni rassegna periodlca - Commisaione delle 
Comunita europee- Rome- 30 em; (IT)- irregolare. 
gratuito. 

P 199 lnformazioni sulle Corte dlgiustlzia delle Comunit8 
europee - Corte d1 g1ustizia delle Comunita Europee - 30cm; (IT) -
trimestrale. 
OA:80.07 -P192. DE:80.07- P226. EN:80.07- P193. 

1P FR:80.07-P196. Nl:80.07-P191 
gratuito. 

P200 Iron and eteel: monthly bulletin- Statistical Office of the 
European Communities; Commission of the European Communities 
- 30cm; (OE/EN/FR/ITI- monthly. 
DE:80.07- P90. FR:80.07- P276. 11:80.07- P272 
ISSN 0378-7659: subscription: ECU 11,25,1RL 7.50, 
UKL 6.85, USD 15.50. 

P20 1 Iron and steel: quarterly and monthly bulletins- 30cm; -
16 issues. 
OE:80.07- P92. FR:80.07- P277. 11:80.07- P273 
subscription:ECU 37,50,1RL 25, UKL 22.80, USD 51.50; 
Combined subscription. 

P202 Iron and eteel: quarterly bulletin- Statistical Office of the 
European Communities; Commission of the Ew-opean Communities 
- 30cm; (OE/EN/FR/ITI- quartarly. 
DE:80.07 -P91. FR:80.07 -P278. 11:80.07 -P274 
ISSN 0378-7672:subscriptton: ECU 30, IRL 19.90, UKL 18.20, 
USD 41. 

P203 Journal official dea Communautn europeennes, aerie C: 
Communications et informations - 1outas institu1ions - 30cm; 
(FR) - queai-quotidian. 
OA:80.07-P129. DE:80.07-P7. EN:80.07-P230. 11:80.07-P174. 
NL:80.07- P252 
ISSN 0378-7052: abonnernent: Eeu 100, 8FR 4000, FF 580; 
L 'sbonneiTI6nt comprend les deux series L etC. 
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P204 Journal official des Communautn aurop8annea, aerie L: 
Legislation- Toutas institutions- 30cm; (FR)- quaekplotidian. 
DA:80.07- P130. OE:80.07- PS. EN:80.07- P231. 11:80.07 -P175. 
Nl:80.07- P253 

ISSN 0378-7060: abonnement: Eeu 100, 8FR 4000, FF 580; 
L 'sbonnem6nt comprend lea deux series L et C. 

P206 Juriaprudentle van het Hot van Justitia - Hof van Justitia 
van de Ew-opeaa Gemeenachappen- 23cm; (NL) - onregelmatig. 
DA:80.07 -P287. OE:80.07 -P288. EN:80.07 -P258. 
FR:80.07- P267. 11:80.07- P266 

ISSN 0378-7567: abonnement: Ecu 50, HFL 137. 

P206 Kohle: Monatabulletln- Statistischas Amt der Europiischen 
Gemeinschaften; Kommission der Europliischen Gemeinachaften -
30cm; (DE/EN/FR) - monatlieh. 
EN:80.07- P40. FR:80.07- P39 

ISSN 0378-357X: Abonnement: ECU 7,5, OM 18,75. 

P207 Kohlenwaneretoffe: MonatabuHetln- Statistisches Amt der 
Ew-opiiischen Gemeinschaften; Kommission der Europiiachen 
Gemeinscheften- 30cm; (OE/EN/FR)- monattich. 
FR:80.07- P188 
ISSN 0378-3731: Abonnement: ECU 15, OM 37,50. 

P208 Konjunkturlndikatoran filr die Industria - Statistlschas Amt 
der Europiiischen Gemeinschaften; Kommission der Ew-opiischen 
Gemeinschaften- 30cm; (DE) - monatlieh. 
EN:80.07 -P190. FR:80.07- P187 
ISSN 0378-8008: Abonnement: ECU 12,5, OM 31,20. 

P209 Landbouwmarkten: Dlerlljke produkten: Prijzen-
Directoraat-generaal Lendbouw; Cornmissie van de Europese 
Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI- maandeliJ<s. 
OA:80.07-P212. DE:80.07-P3. EN:80.07-P4. FR:80.07-P220. 
11:80.07 -P224 
ISSN 0378-4444: abonnement: Eeu 37,5, HFL 103. 

P210 Lendbouwmarkten: Plantaardlge produkten: Prijzen-
Director881-generaal Landbouw; Commissia van de Europese 
Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (OA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI- maandelijks. 
DA:80.07-P214. OE:80.07-P1. EN:80.07-P8. FR:80.07-P221. 
11:80.07-P226 
ISSN 0378-4436: abonnement: Ecu 37,5, HFL 103. 

P211 Landbouwmarkten: Prijzen: Diarlljke an plantaerdige 
produkten- 30cm; - maandelijks. 
DA:80.07-P213. DE:80.07-P2. EN:80.07-P5. FR:80.07-P219. 
11:80.07-P223 
abonnement: Ecu 60, HFL 164,50; Gecombineerdsbonnement 

P212 Landbrugemarkedar: Anlmalska produkter: Priaer-
Generaldiraktorat Lendbrug; Kommissionen for De europtliaka 
Fllliaeskaber- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL)- manedlig. 
OE:80.07- P3. EN:80.07- P4. FR:80.07- P220. 11:80.07- P224. 
Nl:80.07- P209 
ISSN 0378-4444: abonnement: ECU 37,5, DKR 270. 

P213 Landbrugamarkeder: Priaer: Animalake og vegetabilake 
produkter - 30cm; - manedlig. 
OE:80.07-P2. EN:80.07-P6. FR:80.07-P219. 11:80.07-P223. 
NL:80.07-P211 
abonnement: ECU 60, DKR 432; Samlet sbonnement 

P214 Landbrugsmarkeder: Vegetabllake produkter: Priaer-
Generaldirektorat Landbrug; Kommissionen for De europlliska 
F.Uasskaber- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI- m8nadlig. 
DE:80.07- P1. EN:80.07- PB. FR:80.07- P221. 11:80.07 -P226. 
NL:80.07 -P210 
ISSN 0378-4436: abonnement: ECU 37 ,6, DKR 270. 

P215 Lijet van aanwlneten van de Bibllotheek van de EEG-
Directora81-generaal Peraoneelszaken en algemeen baM«; 
Commissie van de Ew-opeaa Gemeenschappen- 30cm; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL)- maendeliJ<s. 
DA:80.07-P18. DE:80.07-P292. EN:80.07-P216. FR:80.07-P33. 
11:80.07- P19 
ISSN 0378-3464: abonnement: Eeu 30, HFL 82,20. 
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P216 List of additions to the Library of the CEC-
Directorate-General Personnel and Administration; Commission of 
the European Communities- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) -
monthly. 
DA:80.07- P16. DE:80.07 -P292. FR:80.07- P33. IT:80.07- P19. 
NL:80.07- P216 

ISSN 0378-3464: subscriplion: ECU 30,1RL 19.90, UKL 18.20, 
USD 41. 

P217 Maandbulletin van de buitenlandae handel- Bureau voor de 
Statistiek der Europese Gemaenschappen; Comm1ssie van de 
Europese Gemeenschappen - 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) -
maandeliJts. 
DA:80.07-P218. DE:80.07-P227. EN:80.07-P228. 
FR:80.07- P36. IT:80.07- P23 
ISSN 0378-3723: abonnemen1: Ecu 45, HFL 123,50. 

P218 Mlinedlig bulletin over udenrigshandelen - De europaske 
Fellesskabers statistiske Kontor; Kommissionen for De europaske 
Fellesskaber- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) - manedlig. 
DE:80.07- P227. EN:80.07- P228. FR:60.07- P36. IT:60.07- P23. 
Nl:80.07- P217 
ISSN 0378-3723: abonnement: ECU 45, DKR 324. 

P219 Marches agricoles: Prix: Produits animaux at vegetaux-
30cm; -mensual. 
DA:80.07-P213. DE·80.07-P2. EN:80.07-P5. IT:80.07-P223. 
NL:80.07- P211 

abonnement: Ecu 60, BFR 2400, FF 349,50; Abonnement 
groupe. 

P220 Marchn agricoles: Produita animaux: Prix - D1rect1on 
ginerale Agriculture; Commission des Communautes europeennes -
30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL)- mensual. 
DA:80.07- P212. DE:80.07- P3. EN:80.07- P4. IT:80.07- P224. 
NL:80.07 -P209 
ISSN 0378-4444: abonnement: Ecu 37,5, 8FR 1500, 
FF 218,50. 

P221 Marches agricoles: Produits veg8taux: Prix- Direction 
generale Agriculture; Commission des Communau18s europeennes -
30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL)- mensual. 
DA:80.07-P214. DE:80.07-P1. EN:60.07-P6. IT:80.07-P225. 
NL:80.07-P210 
ISSN 0378-4436: abonnement: Ecu 37,5, BFR 1500, 
FF 218,50. 

P222 Mededokumenter i Europa-Parlamentet-
Europa-Parlamentet - 30cm; IDA) - uregelmessig. 
EN:80.07-P41. FR:80.07-P56. IT:80.07-P55 
abonnement: ECU 28, 75, DKR 207; Abonnement fra marts 1980 
til februar 1981. 

P223 Mercati agricoll: Prezzl: Prodotti animali a vegetall - 30cm; 
- mensile. 
DA:80.07-P213. DE:60.07-P2. EN:80.07-P5. FR:80.07-P219. 
NL:60.07 -P211 
abbonamento: ECU 60, LIT 67000; Sottoscrizione combmata. 

P224 Mercati agricoli: Prodotti anlmali: Prezzi - Direzione 
generale Agncoltura; Commission& delle Comunila europee- 30cm; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL)- mensile. 
DA:80.07-P212. DE:60.07-P3. EN:SO 07-P4. FR:80.07-P220. 
NL:80.07 -P209 
ISSN 0378-4444: abbonamento: ECU 37,5, LIT 41900. 

P225 MercatlagricoU: Prodotti vegetali: Prezzi- Direzione 
generale Agricoltura; Commission& delle Comunitil europee- 30cm; 
IDA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) - menslle. 
DA:60.07-P214. DE:80.07-P1. EN:80.07-P6. FR:80.07-P221. 
NL:60.07-P210 
ISSN 0378-4436: abbonamenlo: ECU 37,5, LIT 41900. 

P226 Mitteilungen iiber dan Garichtshof dar Europiiischan 
Gemelnachaften - Gerichtshof der Europiiischen Gemeinschaften -
30cm; IDE) - vierteiJijhrtich. 
DA:60.07- P192. EN:80.07- P193. FR·80.07- P196. 
IT:60.07- P199. NL:80.07- P191 
kostenlos. 

P22 7 Monatabulletin dar Au&anhendelaatatistik - Sta11stisches 
Amt der Europii1schen Gemeinschaften; Komm1ss10n der 
Europiiischen Gemeinschaften- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL) -
monatlich. 
DA:60.07- P218. EN:80.07- P228. FR:80.07- P36. IT:80.07- P23. 
NL:60.07-P217 

ISSN 0378-3723: Abonnement: ECU 45, OM 112,50. 

P228 Monthly external trade bulletin- Statistical Office of the 
European Communities; Commission of the European Communities 
- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL)- monthly. 
DA:80.07- P218. DE:60.07- P227. FR:60.07- P36. IT:60.07- P23. 
NL:60.07-P217 

ISSN 0378-3723: subscnption: ECU 45,1RL 29.90, UKL 27.40, 
USD 61.50. 

P229 Notities over Europa - Dtrectoraat-generaal Bureau van de 
woodvoerder en directoraat- generaal voorbchting; Commissie van 
de Europese Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (NL) - twee maal per mand. 
DA:80.07- P111. EN:80.07- P140. FR:60.07- P66. IT:80.07- P269 
ISSN 0379-3117: grat1s. 

P230 Official Journal of the European Communities, series C: 
Information and Notices- All Institutions- 30cm; lEN) -
approximately daily. 
DA:60.07- P129. DE:80.07- P7. FR:80.07- P203. IT:80.07- P174. 
NL:80.07- P262 

ISSN 0378-6986: subscription: ECU 100,1RL 66.40, UKL 61, 
USD 137; Subscription comprises series L and C. 

P23 1 Official Journal of the European Communities, series L: 
Legislation- All Institutions- 30cm; lEN)- approximately daily. 
DA:80.07- P130. DE:60.07- P6. FR:80.07- P204. IT:60.07- P176. 
NL:60.07- P263 
ISSN 0378-6978: subscription: ECU 100,1RL 66.40, UKL 61, 
USD 137; Subscription comprises series L and C. 

P232 II Parlamento europeo- Parlamento europeo- 30 x 43cm; 
un- irregolare. 
DA:80.07-P112. DE:80.07-P116. EN:80.07-P141. 
FR:80.07 • P233. NL:80.07- P142 
gratuito. 

P233 La Parlement european- Partement europilen- 30 x 43cm; 
IFR)- irrilgulier. 
DA:60.07-P112. DE:60.07-P116. EN:80.07-P141. 
IT:60.07- P232. Nl:80.07- P142 

gratuit. 

P234 Pkha: Quantites at valeura des debarquaments dans Ia 
CE - Office statist1que des Communautes europilennes; Commission 
des Communautes europilennes- 30cm; IDA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL)­
trimestriel. 
DA:80.07- P168. DE:60.07- P186. EN:60.07- P167. 
IT:80.07- P236. NL:80.07 -P293 
ISSN 037!Hl029: abonnement: Ecu 15, BFR 600, FF 87,50. 

P235 Peace: Quantlta a valorl dagll abarchl nella CE- lstituto 
statistico delle Comunita europee; Commissions delle Comunita 
europee- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL)- trimastrale. 
DA:80.07 -P188. DE:80.07 -P186. EN:60.07- P167. 
FR:80.07- P234. NL:60.07- P293 

ISSN 0379..()()29: abbonarnento: ECU 15, LIT 16800. 

P236 Pflanzllche Erzeugung- Statlstisches Amt der Europii1schen 
Gemeinschaften; Kommission der Europiiischen Gemeinschaften -
30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NL)- vierteljiihrlich. 
DA:80.07-P287. EN:60.07-P48. FR:60.07-P260. 
IT:60.07-P261. NL:80.07-P238 

ISSN 0378-3588: Abonnement: ECU 22,50, OM 56,20. 

P237 Pig-irons and steels: Basic prices- basic document 
situation as of 1 January and amendmanta- Directorate-General 
Internal Market and Industrial Affairs; Commission of the European 
Communities- 30cm; loose leaf; IDA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NL)- monthly. 
DA:80.07 -P258. DE:60.07 -P264. FR:60.07 -P169. 
IT:60.07-P176. NL:80.07-P266 

ISSN 0378-4460: subscription: ECU 150, IRL 99.60, UKL 91, 
USD 205. 



P238 Plantaardlge produktia- Bureau voor de Statistiek der 
Europese Gemeenschappen; Commissie van de Europese 
Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /Nll­
driemaandelijks. 
DA:80.07-P287. DE:80.07-P236. EN:80.07-P48. 
FR:80.07-P250. IT:80.07-P251 
ISSN 0378-3588: abonnement: Ecu 22,50, HFL 61,60. 

P239 Points da repere: supplement i 30 joura d'Europe-
Commission des Communautes europ8annss- Paris- 30cm; (FRI -
mensual. 
abonnement: FF 30; R8ducrion de prix pour abonnements groiJP8s. 

P240 Pre .. Release- Commission of the European Communities-
london- 30cm; (ENI- irregular. 
free of charge. 

P241 Prezzl d'acquiato dei mazzi di produzione- lstituto statistico 
delle Comunit8 europee; Commissione delle Comunita europee -
30cm; (DE/EN/FR/tn- trimestrale. 
DE:80.07- P89. EN:80.07- P254. FR:80.07- P246 
ISSN 0378-6692: abbonamento: ECU 2,2, LIT 25200. 

P242 Prezzi di vendita del prodotti agricoli: Prodotti vegetali e 
animali- 30cm; - trimestrale. 
DE:80.07- P289. EN:80.07- P245. FR:80.07 -P247 
abbonamento: ECU 25,LIT 28000; Sottoscrizione combinara. 

P243 Prazzi di vendita del prodotti animali - lstituto statistoco delle 
Comunita europee; Commissions delle Comunita europee- 30cm; 
(DE/EN/FR/ITI- trimestrale. 
DE:80.07 -P291. EN:80.07 -P270. FR:80.07- P248 
ISSN 0378-6722: abbonamento: ECU 15,LIT 16800. 

P244 Prezzi di vendita del prodotti vegetali- lstituto statistico 
delle Comunita europee; Commissions delle Comunita europee-
30cm; (DE/EN/FR/ITI- trimestrale. 
DE:80.07-P280. EN:80.07-P271. FR:80.07-P249 
ISSN 0378-6714: abbonamento: ECU 15,LIT 16800. 

P245 Prices of agricultural products sold: Vegetable and animal 
products - 30cm; - quarterly. 
DE:80.07-P289. FR:80.07-P247. IT:80.07-P242 
subscription: ECU 25,1Rl 16.60, UKL 15.25, USD 34.26; 
Combined subscription. 

P246 Prix d'achat des moyans de production- Office statistique 
des Communautes europeennes; Commission des Communautes 
europ8ennss- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/ITI- trirnestriel. 
DE:80.07 -P89. EN:80.07 -P254. IT:80.07 -P241 
ISSN 0378-6692: abonnement: Ecu 2,2, 8FR 900, FF 131. 

P24 7 Prix da vente de produits agricoles: Produits vegetaux et 
animaux- 30cm; - trirnestriel. 
DE:80.07- P289. EN:80.07 -P245. IT:80.07- P242 
abonnement: Ecu 26, 8FR 1000, FF 146,50; Abonnemenr 
groupe. 

P248 Prix de vente da produits animaux- Office statistique des 
Communautes europ8annes; Commission des Communautes 
europ8annes- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/tn - trimestriel. 
DE:80.07- P291. EN:80.07 -P270. IT:80.07- P243 
ISSN 0378-6722: abonnement: Ecu 15, BFR 600, FF 87,60. 

P249 Prix de vente de produits v8g8taux- Office statistique des 
Communautes europeennes; Commission des Communautes 
europ8annes- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/ITI- trimestriel. 
DE:80.07-P280. EN:80.07-P271. IT:80.07-P244 
ISSN 0378-6714: abonnement: Ecu 15, BFR 600, FF 87 ,50. 

P260 Production v8g8tale - Office statistique des Communautes 
europ&ennss; Commossion des Communautes europeennes- 30cm; 
IDA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI- trimestriel. 
DA:80.07-P287. DE:80.07-P236. EN:80.07-P48. 
IT:80.07-P251. NL:80.07-P238 
ISSN 0378-3588: abonnernent: Ecu 22,50, BFR 900, FF 131. 

P251 Produzlone vagetale - lstituto statistico delle Comunota 
europea; Commissions delle Comunitil europee- 30cm; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /Nll- trimestrale. 

DA:80.07-P287. DE:80.07-P236. EN:80.07-P48. 
FR:80.07- P250. NL:80.07 -P238 

! 

ISSN 0378-3588: abbonamento: ECU 22,50, LIT 25200. 
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P252 Publlkatleblad van de Europase Gemeanachappan. sarle 
C: Mededelingen en bekendmaklngen- Aile instellingen - 30cm; 
(Nll - bijna dagelijks. 
DA:80.07-P129. DE:80.07-P7. EN:80.07-P230. FR:80.07-P203. 
IT:80.07-P174 
ISSN 0378-7079: abonnement: Ecu 100, HFL 273; Her 
ebonnemenr omver de serie L en C. 

P253 Publikatieblad van de Europese Gemeenachappen. aerie L: 
Wetgeving -Aile instellingen- 30cm; (Nll- bijna dagelijks. 
DA:80.07-P130. DE:80.07-P8. EN:80.07-P231. FR:80.07-P204. 
IT:80.07- P176 
ISSN 0378-7087: abonnement: Ecu 100, HFL 273; Her 
abonnemenr omver dtJ serie L en C. 

P254 Purchase prices of the means of production- Statistical 
Office of the European Communities; Commission of the European 
Communities- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/ITI- quarterly. 
DE:80.07-P89. FR:80.07-P248. IT:80.07-P241 
ISSN 0378-6692: subscription: ECU 2,2.1Rl 14.95, 
UKL 13.70, USD 30.80. 

P255 Raccolta della giuriaprudenza della Corte -Corte di giustizia 
delle Comunita Europee- 23cm; UTI- irragolare. 
DA:80.07-P267. DE.80.07-P268. EN:80.07-P268. 
FR:80.07-P267. NL:80.07-P205 
ISSN 0378-7575: abbonamento: ECU 50, LIT 65900. 

P256 Rajern og atil: Basiapriser- Basladokument. Situation pr. 
1 januar og supplementer - Generaldirektorat Det interne marked 
og industroen; Kommissionen for De europlliake Faallesskaber -
30cm; l111sblad; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/Nll- minedlig. 
DE:80.07- P264. EN:80.07- P237. FR:80.07- P169. 
IT:80.07- P176. NL:80.07- P266 
ISSN 0378-4460: abonnement: ECU 150, DKR 1079. 

P25 7 Recuell de Ia Cour de justice- Cour de justice des 
Communautes europ&ennes- 23cm; (FRI- irregulier. 
DA:80.07-P267. DE:80.07-P268. EN:80.07-P258. 
IT:80.07-P266. Nl:80.07-P206 
ISSN 0378-7683: abonnernent: Ecu 50, BFR 2000, FF 291. 

P258 Reporta of Cases before the Court of Justice- Court of 
Justice of the European Communities- 23cm; (ENI- irregular. 
DA:80.07 -P267. DE:80.07 -P268. FR:80.07 -P267. 
IT:80.07-P255. NL:80.07-P206 
ISSN 0378-7591: subscription: ECU 50, IRL 33.25, UKL 30.50, 
USD 68.50. 

P259 Rasultaten van de conjunctuuranquite bij hat 
bedrijfsleven in de Gemeanachap - Directoraat-generaal 
Economische en financiiile zaken; Commissie van de Europese 
Gemeenschappen- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /Nll- maandelijks. 
DA:80.07-P280. DE:80.07-P99. EN:80.07-P262. 
FR:80.07-P261. IT:80.07-P263 
ISSN 0378-4479: abonnement: Ecu 41,25, HFL 113. 

P260 Reaultaterne af konjunkturunderaegelsen hoe 
vlrksomhedaledere i Fellesskebet - Generaldirektorat 
0konomiske og finansielle 8plllrg&mal; Kommissionen for De 
europtliske Fllllesekaber- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/Nll­
minedtig. 
DE:80.07-P99. EN:80.07-P262. FR:80.07-P261. IT:80.07-P263. 
Nl: 80.07 - P259 
ISSN 0378-4479: abonnement: ECU 41,25, DKR 297. 

P261 Reaulteta del'anquite da conjoncture auprea des chefa 
d' entraprlae de Ia Communeute - Direction g8n8rale Affaires 
economiques at financiires; Commission des Communaut8s 
europeennes- 30cm; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI- mensual. 
DA:80.07-P280. DE:80.07-P99. EN:80.07-P262. 
IT:80.07- P263. NL:80.07- P259 
ISSN 0378-44 79: abonnement: Ecu 41,25, BFR 1660, FF 240. 
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P262 Result& of the bum-eurvey e~~rrled out among 
managements in the Community- Directorate-General Economic 
and Financial Affairs; Commiaaion of tha European Communities -
;30c:m; (DA/DE/EN/FR/IT /NLI- monthly. 
DA:B0.07- P280. D£:80.07- P99. FR:90.07- P281. 
IT:80.07- P283. NL:80.07- P259 
ISSN 0378-4479: subscription: ECU 41,25,1RL 27.40, UKL 25, 
USD 56.50. 

P263 Ri8ultati dell'inchl- conglunturala effettuata preaao gil 
imprenditorl della Comuniti - Dlrezione generale Affari economici 
e flnenziari; Commiaaione delle Comunit8 europea - 30c:m; 
(DA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI- menaile. 
DA:B0.07- P280. D£:90.07- P99. EN:80.07- P282. 
FR:90.07-P281. NL:80.07-P259 
ISSN 0378-44 79: abbonamento: ECU 41,25, LIT 46100. 

P264 Rohliiaen und Stahlarzeugniae: Grundpreiae-
Grunddokum- 1. Januer und NKhtrige- Generaidirektion 
Binnenm811<t und gawerbliche Wll'tachaft; Kommiaaion der 
Europiischan Gemeinschaften - 30cm; Losebiatt; 
IDA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI- rnonatlich. 
DA:80.07- P258. EN:90.07- P237. FR:90.07- P169. 
(T:80.07- P178. NL:80.07 -P265 
ISSN 0378-4460: Abonnement: ECU 150, OM 374,50. 

P265 Ruwljzer- en ataalprodukten: BaMprijzen-
Buledoku-~ vanaf 1 januarlen addendum­
Directoreat-ganeraai Interne m811<t en industrie; Commissie van de 
Europeaa Gemeensc:happen- 30cm; loll blad; 

IDA/DE/EN/FR/IT/NLI- maendeliJts. 
DA:I0.07- P258. DE:I0.07- P284. EN:80.07- P237. 
FR:90.07 -P189. IT:90.07 -P178 
ISSN 0378-4460: abonnement: Ecu 150, HFL 411. 

P266 Seleires et revenue- Note rapide- Office statistiqua des 
Communautis europ8ennes; Commission des Communaut8s 
europ8ennas- 30cm; (FRI - irr8gulier. 
watuit. 

P267 SemUng ef Dometolens AfgllreiMr- Domstolan for de 
Europfliske Fllllesekaber- 23cm; (DA)-~· 
DE:I0.07- P258. EN:90.07- P258. FR:80.07- P257. 
IT:80.07 -P255. NL:80.07 -P205 
ISSN 0378-7605: abonnernent: ECU 50, DKR 360. 

P268 Semmlung der Rechtaprechung des Gerichtahofes-
Gerichtshof der Europiischan Gemeinschaften - 23cm; (DEl -
unregelmiiBig. 
DA:80.07 -P287. EN:80.07 -P258. FR:80.07-P257. 
IT:80.07- P265. NL:80.07- P205 
ISSN 0378-7613: Abonnement: ECU 50, OM 125. 

P269 Scheele europee - Direzione generale Gruppo del portavoce a 
Direzione generale dall'informazione; Commiaaione delle Comunita 
europae- 30cm; 1m- quindicinale. 
DA:90.07-P111. EN:80.07-P140. FR:90.07-P85. Nl:80.07-P229 
ISSN 0379-3125: watuito. 

P270 Selling prices of enimel products- Statistical Office of the 
European Communities; Commission of the European Communities 
- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/m- quarterly. 
DE:80.07- P291. FR:80.07- P248. IT:90.07- P243 
ISSN 037!1-8722: subscription: ECU 15, IRL 10.00, UKL 9. 10, 
USD 20.50. 

P271 Selling pricn of vegetable products- Statistical Office of the 
European Communities; Commiaaion of the European Communities 
- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/m- quarterly. 
DE:90.07- P290. FR:80.07- P249. IT:80.07 -P244 
ISSN 0378-6714: subscription: ECU 15, IRL 10.00, UKL 9.10, 
USD 20,50. 

P272 Slderurgie: bollettlno m08ile- lstituto statistico delle 
Comunitii europae; Commissione delle Comunit8 europaa- 30cm; 
(DE/EN/FR/m - mensile. 
DE:80.07 -PBO. EN:80.07 -P200. FR:80.07 -P275 
ISSN 0378-7559: abbonsmento: ECU 11,25, LIT 12600. 

P273 Siderurgie: boUettlno menalla e trlmutrele- 30cm;- 16 
numari. 
DE:80.07-P92. EN:80.07-P201. FR:90.07-P277 
abbonsmento: ECU 37 ,50, LIT 41900; Sottoscriions combinate. 

P274 Siderurgle: bollettino trlmeetrela -lstituto statistico delle 
Comunit8 europea; Commiaaione delle Com unite europae- 30cm; 
(DE/EN/FR/m - trimestrale. 
DE:80.07- P91. EN:80.07- P202. FR:90.07- P278 
ISSN 0378-7672: abbonamento: ECU 30, LIT 33500. 

P275 Slderurgla: bulletin meneuel- Office statistique des 
Communaut8s europ8ennas; Commiaaion des Communaut8s 
europltennes- 30c:m; (DE/EN/FR/m- mensual. 
DE:80.07 -PBO. EN:80.07 -P200. IT:80.07 -P272 
ISSN 0378-7559: abonnernent: Ecu 11,25, BFR 450, FF 66,50. 

P276 SidWurgie: bulletin trimeetrlal- Office statistiqua des 
Communaut8s europ8ennes; Commiaaion des Communautes 
europ8ennes- 30cm; (DE/EN/FR/m- trimestrial. 
DE:80.07- P91. EN:80.07- P202. IT:80.07 -P274 
ISSN 0378-7672: abonnement: Ecu 30, BFR 1200, FF 176. 

P277 Sicl8rurgle: bulletins meneuels et trimeetriels- 30cm; - 16 
numeros. 
DE:80.07- P92. EN:80.07 -P201. IT:80.07- P273 
abonnement: Ecu 37,50, BFR 1600, FF 218,50; Abonnement 
groupe. 

P278 Sitzungadokumente des Europilschen Perlamenta-
EuropiiiChea Pariament- 30cm; (DE) - unregalmiiBig. 
DA:80.07-P222. EN:80.07-P41. FR:80.07-P58. IT:80.07-P55 
Abonnement: ECU 28, 76, OM 72; Abonnement 1011 Milrz 1980 
bis Februllr 1981. 

P279 Stetiatlque del'energie: BuUetln meneuel a') charbon, b) 
hydrOCIIrbures, C) energle eJectrlque - 30c:m; - menauai. 
DE:80.07- P98. EN:90.07- P97 
abonnement: Ecu 27,50, BFR 1100, FF 160; Abonnement 
groupe. 

P280 Stlchwort Europe- Generaldirektion Sprechargruppe und 
Generaldirektion information; Kommiaaion der Europiischen 
Gemeinachaften- 30cm; (DEl - vlerzehntigig. 
DA:80.07-P111. EN:90.07-P140. FR:80.07-P86. 
IT:80.07- P289. NL:80.07- P229 
ISSN 0379-3141: kostenlos. 

P281 Suppl8ment eu JourMI officlel des CommuMutlls 
europllennea, Mrle S- Toutes institutions- 30cm; Publication 
des avis de marcll8a publics de travsux et de fournitures, at des avis 
d' appal d' offres du Fonds european de d8veloppement (FRI -
quasi-quotidian. 
ISSN 0378-7230: abonnement: Ecu 42,60, BFR 1700. FF 260. 

P282 Supplam- op het Publilultiebled van de Europese 
Gemeenacheppen, aerie S - Aile insteilingen - 30cm; Publikatie 
van de aankondigingen inzake overheidaopdrachten voor uitvoering 
van werken en voor leveringen, en berichtan van aanbestadingen 
van hat Europaes Ontwikkelingsfonds (NL) - bijna dagetijks. 
ISSN 0378-7267: abonnement: Ecu 42,60, HFL 117. 

P283 Supplem- til De Europoalllke F•laaakabers Tidende, 
8-delen - Aile inatitutioner - 30cm; Offantliggerelaa af meddalelssr 
angi.ende offentliga bygge- 011 anlllgsarbejdar 011 ind<8bsaftaler 011 
af meddelelaa om udbud fra Den europoaiske Udviklingafond (DA) -
kvasi dagiig. 
ISSN 0378-7265: abonnement: ECU 42,50, DKR 300. 

P284 Supplem- to the Official Journal of the European 
Communities, aeries S - AH Institutions- 30cm; Publication of 
notices of public works contracts and public supply contracts and 
invitations to tender of the European Development Fund (EN)­
approximately daily. 
ISSN 0378-7273: subscription: ECU 42,50, IRL 28, UKL 26, 
USD 58.20. 



P286 Supplement zum Amtsblatt dar Europiischen 
Gemainachaftan, TellS- Aile lnstitutionen- 30cm; 
Veriiffentllchung dar 8ekanntmachungen von Offentlichan 8au-und 
Lieferauftriigen und der Ausschreibungen des Europiischen 
Entwicklungsfonds IDE) -fast tiiglich. 
ISSN 0378-7222: Abonnement: ECU 42,50, OM 108. 

P286 Supplemento alia Gazzatta ufflciala della Comunlta 
auropea, pane S- Tutte le istituzioni - 30cm; Pubblicazione dei 
bandi di gera per appalti di lavori pubblici e appalti pubblici di 
forniture e bandi di gera del Fondo europeo di sviluppo lin -
quasi-quotidlano. 
ISSN 0378-7249: abbonamanto: ECU 42,50, LIT 48500. 

P287 Vagetabilak produktion- De europaeiske Fllllesskabers 
statistiske Kontor; Kommissionen for Da europtliske F•llesskaber -
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